


The Regulation of International Trade

The conclusion of the GATT Uruguay Round negotiations, as well as the emergence of
regional trading arrangements, has underlined the significance of international trade
regulation in global politics and economics. As new trade issues emerge and we look into
the future of the world trading system it is important that we understand its basic working.

The Regulation of International Trade introduces the rules and institutions that govern
international trade. The authors examine the theory and functioning of international legal
regimes, including those of GATT/WTO (World Trade Organization), the NAFTA (North
American Free Trade Agreement), as well as some aspects of the European Union.
Attention is also given to the rise of protectionism through the use of internal trade remedy
laws, including a detailed comparative analysis of the application of trade remedies to
dumping and subsidies in Canada, the USA and the European Union.

The book also contains individual chapters on trade in agricultural products, trade and
development, and technical standards. In addition, it contains a detailed discussion of ‘new
era’ trade issues, such as trade and investment, intellectual property rights, trade and
environment, trade and labour standards, and trade and competition policy.

Throughout insights of classic and contemporary economics and political economy are
related to current issues facing the world trading system. As a comprehensive text The
Regulation of International Trade will be an invaluable guide to students of economics, trade,
politics and international relations.

Michael J.Trebilcock is a University Professor and Robert Howse an Associate
Professor in the Faculty of Law, University of Toronto. They are co-authors, with Marsha
Chandler, of Trade and Transitions, also published by Routledge. 
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Preface, first edition

This book is intended to introduce serious students of law, economics, politics, and public
policy to the institutions and rules that govern trade between sovereign states. Although we
are legal academics, we have not written a traditional legal treatise. Instead, we have sought
to bring to bear on our analysis of rules and institutions a wide range of disciplinary
perspectives. This includes not only perspectives from the various branches of economics
(whether trade theory itself or the theory of finance and industrial organization), but also
from contemporary political and ethical philosophy and the international relations and
political economy literatures.

Although we do discuss extensively the domestic legal regimes of some of the major
trading states, most of the law dealt with in this book is international law. There is, of
course, an age-old debate as to whether international law is really law in the true sense of
the word, as it is not subject to authoritative enforcement by a sovereign. The GATT/
WTO, the main legal and institutional framework for multilateral free trade, has frequently
been judged against a domestic law benchmark and found wanting. Some theorists of
international relations question whether rules and institutions matter at all, except as
reflections of much more fundamental power relationships.

Our own perspective is that rules, norms and institutions matter a great deal. We see their
function as the provision of a framework or structure that permits long-term mutually
beneficial cooperation between states. Hence, we tend to take a neo-liberal or new liberal
institutionalist view of international relations. This book is not, however, intended as an
application or vindication of this particular theory of international relations, which would
require a sustained discussion of the theory of international economic cooperation not well
suited to an introductory text. Still, in examining the function and evolution of particular
rules and norms, we have not hesitated to take stances based on a neo-liberal view nor to be
critical of alternative policy stances premised on power-based realist or positivist views of
international economic relations.

In general, we see the evolution and maintenance of an open, liberal trading order as to
the mutual benefit of states. This view is not premised upon a naïve or unquestioning
adherence to the economic theory of the gains from trade. On the contrary, throughout our
analysis we are highly sensitive to the qualifications to and limits on the case for free trade,
as well as the complexities involved in determining the domestic interest in these matters—
including concerns about unemployment, worker adjustment, the quality of life and values
of human rights and environmental protection. We examine, in a wide range of areas, the



multiple challenges that increased economic integration and interdependence pose for
domestic and international policymaking. While we frequently see the need to evolve new
rules and institutions, or to clarify existing rules and strengthen existing institutions, we
also conclude that the basic building blocks of the liberal trading order are not
fundamentally defective, and that a protectionist retreat from an open system is likely to
reduce both domestic and global welfare.

Compared to the immediacy and directness of the concerns that often result in demands
for protectionism—whether job loss within a community or outrage at another state’s
environmental policies—the basic rules and norms of the global trading order that constrain
protectionist responses often appear arcane or obscure. This applies as well to the
jurisprudence that has evolved, especially in the GATT, to interpret those rules and norms.
We believe that this impression is inaccurate and that in fact there is considerable clarity and
coherence to the rules, with interpretation and application to diverse and rapidly changing
circumstances being no more difficult and no easier than with respect to other areas of law.
But this impression has partly been created because of the often unnecessarily inaccessible
and complex presentation of the rules and jurisprudence by trade law experts and officials,
and their frequent lack of interest in reaching a broader intellectual and policy community.
Ernst-Ulrich Petersmann notes comments by non-experts that ‘anyone who reads the
GATT is likely to have his sanity impaired’ and that there are ‘only ten people in the world
who understand the GATT and they are not telling’.1 This book is a modest attempt to show
that, to the contrary, international trade law is no more impenetrable or obscure than any
other sophisticated body of contemporary law, when it is clearly explained in terms of
fundamental concepts, principles and rules.

The topics covered and general organization of this book reflect a number of years’
experience in co-teaching an introductory course in international trade regulation at the
University of Toronto. The course has typically attracted senior undergraduates both in law
and in economics, and we have also been fortunate to have the participation of graduate
students in both disciplines, many of whom bring perspectives from undergraduate studies
and work experience in a wide variety of countries, both developed and developing.
Without this sustained and on-going dialogue with a very diverse and demanding group of
students, this book would not have been possible.

We wish to acknowledge excellent research assistance from a number of students or
former students at the Faculty of Law, University of Toronto, including Evan Atwood, Ari
Blicker, Richard Braudo, John Loukidelis, Karen Powys-Lybbe, Presley Warner, Dan
Markel, Julie Soloway, and Jason Levine. In addition, on particular chapters, several
colleagues and students read earlier drafts or otherwise assisted us with their reflections and
advice. In particular, we wish to thank Isis Calder, Kevin Davis, Gary Horlick, Brian
Langille, James Odek, Elie Perkins, Craig Scott and Diane Varleau. In the production of the
second edition of this book, we benefited from the superb administrative and secretarial
skills of May Seto and Margot Hall. 
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1
The evolution of international trade theory

and policy

AN INTELLECTUAL HISTORY OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE
THEORY AND POLICY1

The central question that must be confronted at the outset of any study of international
trade is: why do we need a theory of international trade at all? Why is the analysis of the
economic, political and social implications of exchange between traders in two national
markets different from the analysis of the implications of exchange between traders within a
single national market?

Early thinking on foreign trade

In a marvellously accessible and illuminating intellectual history of free trade, Against The
Tide,2 Douglas Irwin traces views on the virtues and vices of foreign trade back to early
Greek and Roman writers. Their views generally reflected a high degree of ambivalence
about trading with foreigners, mainly for non-eco-nomic reasons. First, merchants or
traders of whatever origins were often regarded as of an inferior social class. This general
hostility to merchants and commercial activity was accentuated in the case of foreign traders
where contact with strangers could disrupt domestic life by exposing citizens to the bad
manners and corrupt morals of barbarians. On the other hand, some early writers (such as
Plato) acknowledged the gains from specialization or division of labour, although they were
reluctant to extend the implications of this acknowledgement explicitly to foreign trade.

Other writers (such as Plutarch) took the view that God created the sea, geographic
separation and diversity in endowments in order to promote interactions through trade
between the various peoples of the earth. This doctrine of universal economy was
developed by philosophers and theologians in the first several centuries AD, although
dominant strands in medieval scholastic thought (reflected, for example, in the writings of
St Thomas of Aquinas) continued to be suspicious about commercial activity and to worry
that contact with foreigners would disrupt civil life. Natural law philosophers of the
seventeenth and eighteenth centuries (such as Grotius) sought to resurrect the doctrine of
universal economy, justifying a largely unconstrained freedom to trade on the law of nations
(jus gentium).3 



Mercantilism

However, none of these early views on international trade were primarily based on economic
arguments, although (as we will see) they have continued to recur in one form or another
even in contemporary debates over free trade. In the seventeenth and eighteenth centuries a
school of thought often referred to as mercantilism emerged in Britain and the Continent
that was explicitly economic in its foundations. While not hostile to commercial activity
generally or to international trade in principle, mercantilists argued for close government
regulation of international trade for two principal reasons: (1) to maintain a favourable
balance of trade, which argued for aggressive export but restrictive import policies
(although how foreigners were to pay for imports without the ability to export was never
adequately explained); and (2) to promote the manufacturing of raw materials at home,
rather than importing manufactured goods, which would displace domestic production and
employment; hence arguments for export taxes on exported raw materials and import
duties on imported manufactured or luxury goods.

The origins of the economic case for free trade

These two central tenets of mercantilist theories of international trade were fundamentally
attacked and undermined, at least as a matter of theory, if not as a matter of policy, in the
second half of the eighteenth century. The first argument for restricting foreign trade
reflected a concern that international trade may give rise to an inadequate supply of
circulating monetary gold as a result of balance of payment deficits. Silver and gold were
mainstays of national wealth and essential to vigorous commerce. Hence the appropriate
policy goal was perceived to be the maintenance of a continuing surplus in the balance of
payments, i.e. sell more to foreigners than one buys from them. Imperial rivalries also led
to political concerns about the transfer of specie into foreign hands and in part explains
colonization efforts in the eighteenth and nineteenth centuries where colonies were seen as
a source of raw materials and an outlet for manufactured goods. However, David Hume, in
1752, demonstrated that through the price-specie-flow mechanism, international trade was
likely to maintain an equilibrium in the balance of payments. If a country found itself with
surplus currency, domestic prices would tend to rise relative to prices of foreign
commodities, and money would flow out of the country. If a country found itself with a
shortage of currency, domestic prices would become depressed and would attract foreign
currency until the shortage had disappeared.4

Adam Smith, in the Wealth of Nations (1776), mounted a broader assault on mercantilist
theories, in particular the commodity composition argument for restricting trade, and
argued that the case for gains from specialization in domestic economic activities applied
equally to specialization in international trade:

What is prudence in the conduct of every private family can scarcely be folly in that
of a great kingdom. If a foreign country can supply us with a commodity cheaper than
we can make, better buy it of them with some part of the produce of our own
industry.5
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Thus, to take some simple examples, if countries with tropical climates can produce
bananas or pineapples more cheaply than countries with temperate climates, the latter
should purchase these products from the former. Conversely, if countries with
industrialized economies can produce hydro-electric generators or telephone systems more
cheaply and of better quality than those that could be produced by countries that enjoy a
cost advantage in producing tropical produce, the latter should buy these products from the
former. In domestic economic activities, most of us accept that it makes no sense for an
individual to try and produce all his or her own food, clothing, medical services, dental
services, home construction services, etc., but rather to specialize in producing some goods
or services for others and perhaps for some limited subset of his or her own needs, while
purchasing requirements to meet remaining needs from others who specialize in their
production. It is equally easy to appreciate the force of this argument for free trade within
nation states. For example, in a large federal state like the US, Michigan specializes in
producing automobiles (inter alia), Florida citrus fruit and tourism, Texas oil and beef, and
California wine and high technology products. If each state of the US were to have
attempted to become self-sufficient in these and all its own needs, the US would today be
immeasurably poorer. It equally follows, on Smith’s theory, that similar specialization is
likely to generate mutual gains from trade in international exchanges—the division of
labour is limited only by the extent of the market. It is important to note that on Smith’s
theory, unilateral trade liberalization would be an advantageous policy for a country to
pursue, irrespective of the trade policies pursued by other countries.

The theory of comparative advantage

A central question left open by Smith’s Theory of Absolute Advantage (as it came to be
called) was: what if a country has no absolute advantage over any of its potential trading
partners with respect to any products or services? Is international trade of no relevance or
value to it? David Ricardo, in his book The Principles of Political Economy published in 1817,
answered this question with a shattering insight that continues to form the basis of
conventional international trade theory today. His insight has come to be called the Theory
of Comparative Advantage. He advanced this theory by means of a simple arithmetic example.
In his example, England could produce a given quantity of cloth with the labour of 100
men. It could also produce a given quantity of wine with the labour of 120 men. Portugal,
in turn, could produce the same quantity of cloth with the labour of 90 men and the same
quantity of wine with the labour of 80 men. Thus, Portugal enjoyed an absolute advantage
over England with respect to the production of both cloth and wine, i.e. it could produce a
given quantity of cloth or wine with fewer labour inputs than England. However, Ricardo
argued that trade was still mutually advantageous, assuming full employment in both
countries: when England exported to Portugal the cloth produced by the labour of 100 men
in exchange for wine produced by 80 Portuguese, she imported wine that would have
required the labour of 120 Englishmen to produce. As for Portugal, she gained by her 80
men’s labour cloth that it would have taken 90 of her labourers to produce. Both countries
would be rendered better off through trade.

TRADE THEORY AND POLICY 3



Another way of understanding the same intuition is to imagine the following simple
domestic example.6 Suppose a lawyer is not only more efficient in the provision of legal
services than her secretary, but is also a more efficient secretary. It takes her secretary twice
as long to type a document as the lawyer could type it herself. Suppose, more specifically,
that it takes the lawyer’s secretary two hours to type a document that the lawyer could type
in one hour, and that the secretary’s hourly wage is $20, and that the lawyer’s hourly rate to
clients is $200. It will pay the lawyer to hire the secretary and pay her $40 to type the
document in two hours while the lawyer is able to sell for $200 the hour of her time that
would otherwise have been committed to typing the document. In other words, both the
lawyer and the secretary gain from this exchange. These examples, in an international trade
context, generalize to the proposition that a country should specialize in producing and
exporting goods in which its comparative advantage is greatest, or comparative disadvantage
is smallest, and should import goods in which its comparative disadvantage is greatest.

An unfortunate semantic legacy of Ricardo’s demonstration of the gains from
international trade that has been perpetuated in the terminology of much subsequent trade
literature and debate is that in international trade countries are trading with each other. This,
of course, is rarely the case. As in purely domestic exchanges, private economic actors (albeit
located in different countries) are trading with each other. In its most rudimentary form, all
that international trade theory seeks to demonstrate is that free international trade
dramatically broadens the contract opportunity set available to private economic actors and
hence the mutual gains realizable from exchange as parties with different endowments of
specialized resources or skills are able to reap the gains from their differential advantages
and disadvantages through trade.

It may be argued that in international exchanges, in contrast to domestic exchanges, part
of the gains from exchange are realized by foreigners, and that a country would be
advantaged by capturing all the gains from exchange for itself. However, this raises the
question of whether the domestic gains foregone by foreign trade are greater or less than
the additional gains from purely domestic exchange. As a matter of simple economic
theory, the gains to domestic consumers from foreign trade will almost always be greater than
the additional gains to domestic producers from purely domestic trade. This is so because
higher domestic than foreign prices will entail a transfer of resources from domestic
consumers to domestic producers (arguably creating matching decreases and increases in
welfare), but in addition some domestic consumers will be priced out of the market by the
higher domestic prices and will be forced to allocate their resources to less preferred
consumption choices, entailing a dead-weight social loss. An alternative way in which to
conceive of the net domestic loss from foregone foreign exchange opportunities is to ask
what compensation domestic producers would need to offer domestic consumers to render
them indifferent to these forgone opportunities. Presumably only domestic prices that
matched foreign producers’ prices would achieve this end.

The factor proportions hypothesis

While Ricardo’s theory of comparative advantage still constitutes the underpinnings of
conventional international trade theory, his theory has been refined in various ways by
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subsequent analysis. Ricardo’s theory, for example, assumed constant costs at all levels of
production which led to the conclusion that a country would specialize completely in the
goods where its comparative advantage was greatest (wine in the case of Portugal) or its
comparative disadvantage smallest (cloth in the case of England), but this hypothesis rarely
seemed to fit the facts. For example, Portugal produced both wine and some cloth.
Ricardo’s theory was thus modified to take account of increasing opportunity costs. For
example, by releasing resources from cloth-making it would not necessarily follow that the
addition of these labour inputs to wine-making would continue to increase wine production
in constant proportions, especially if the factor proportions in the two activities were
different e.g. cloth-making is labour intensive while wine-making is land intensive. In other
words, once more than one factor of production was taken into account, it became obvious
that combining land and labour at ever increasing levels of output would not necessarily
entail similar costs, as the land brought into production at higher levels of output may well
(and typically would) be less productive and require more intensive use of labour. On the
other hand, the opposite phenomenon may sometimes be true, that is that decreasing costs
may be associated with increased scale of operations or levels of output, and may lead to
complete international specialization.

Recognition of these considerations led to a reformulation of Ricardo’s theory of
comparative advantage—often referred to as the Factor Proportions Hypothesis (or the
Heckscher-Ohlin Theorem, after two Swedish economists who formulated the theorem in
the 1920s). According to the Factor Proportions Hypothesis, countries will tend to enjoy
comparative advantages in producing goods that use their more abundant factors more
intensively, and each country will end up exporting its abundant factor goods in exchange
for imported goods that use its scarce factors more intensively.

While the Factor Proportions Hypothesis seems to explain adequately patterns of
international specialization in many activities, particularly agriculture and natural resources,
it tends to provide a less satisfactory explanation of patterns of specialization in
manufacturing activities in modern industrialized economies, where it is common to
observe countries specializing in different segments of the same or closely analogous product
markets, and simultaneously exporting and importing products in these sectors. Intra-
industry trade has accounted for a very high percentage of the total increase in international
trade in recent decades.7 The Factor Proportions Hypothesis assumes that all countries have
access to identical technologies of production and that the list of goods which are traded is
somehow exogenously given and unaltered by economic activity. However, patterns of
specialization and comparative advantage are not exclusively exogenously determined, but
are likely to turn in part on a number of endogenous variables, such as savings and capital
accumulation rates in different countries; the levels and patterns of investment in specialized
human capital, reflecting the country’s commitment to investments in education and
research and development; and public infrastructure such as transportation and
communication systems, which again reflect patterns of collective investments. On this
view, comparative advantage is a much more dynamic notion than the static notion implicit
in the original formulation of the Factor Proportions Hypothesis, and moreover recognizes
the role that governments can play, through a variety of public policies, in shaping
comparative advantage over time.

TRADE THEORY AND POLICY 5



It is also important to note that classical trade theory, as described above, assumed that
physical output from production was (subject to transportation costs) mobile across nations
but that factors of production, while in most cases mobile within countries, were immobile
across nations. While this obviously remains true of land, it has become dramatically less
true of financial capital, technology, human capital, and even people, in large part because of
advances in communication and transportation technologies. Thus, trade theory has
historically focused on international trade in goods (a focus reflected in the initial
preoccupations of the GATT), and not international mobility of services, capital or people.
This focus has been increasingly challenged, as reflected in a rapidly changing trade policy
agenda.

The product cycle theory

Largely reflecting the less static, and more dynamic conception of comparative advantage,
noted above, in the 1960s Raymond Vernon of the Harvard Business School formulated a
Product Cycle Theory of trade in manufactured goods to explain patterns of international
specialization in manufacturing.8 According to Vernon’s Product Cycle Theory, the USA
and other highly developed and industrialized economies, reflecting their superior access to
large amounts of financial capital and highly specialized forms of human capital, would enjoy
a comparative advantage in the research and development intensive stage of product
innovation. This stage would focus initially on servicing a small, domestic, custom-oriented
market. The second stage in the product cycle would see production expanded to cater to a
mass domestic market. The third stage would see products exported to other countries and
perhaps parent companies setting up subsidiaries in other countries to undertake
manufacture there (the phenomenon of the Multinational Enterprise). A further stage in the
product cycle would see the production technology becoming highly standardized and
adopted by producers in other countries, particularly countries with lower labour costs, and
products perhaps then being exported by these countries back to the USA or other
countries where the innovations had originated. According to Vernon, quasi-rents could be
earned by domestic firms early in the product cycle, but these rents would be dissipated as
the product moved to later stages in the cycle, and comparative advantage shifted to other
countries.

The Product Cycle Theory of international trade in manufactured goods seems to explain
reasonably well patterns of specialization observable in many countries in the 1950s and
1960s. It has become less compelling over the last two decades, as an increasing number of
countries, like Japan and other newly industrializing countries (NICs) have acquired many of
the same comparative advantages as the older industrialized economies in early stages of the
product cycle, through access to large domestic and international sources of capital that
have become increasingly mobile, and through investments of their own in the human
capital required to achieve a comparative advantage in the early stages of product innovation
and manufacture.

The increasing recognition that comparative advantage is not exclusively ordained by
nature but is in significant part, at least in manufacturing and services, the product of
deliberate government policies, has led to an increased focus in many domestic policy
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settings on issues of so-called industrial policy, and at an international level, concerns and
accusations over whether foreign governments’ domestic policies are unfairly shaping or
distorting comparative advantage.9 These are issues that we take up in more detail in
various contexts later in this book. However, beyond these issues, several long-standing
qualifications to the case for free trade, in both economic and non-economic terms, should
be briefly noted at this juncture.

Qualifications to the case for free trade

Reciprocity

While classical trade theory emphasized the advantages of unilateral trade liberalization over
the protectionist base case, taking the trade policies of trading partners as a given, it is
obviously the case that a country is likely to realize additional economic advantages from
trade liberalization if it can persuade its trading partners also to liberalize their trade
policies, thus generating benefits on both the import and export sides. This raises complex
strategic issues for the first country. The modern trade literature distinguishes two kinds of
reciprocity—passive and aggressive reciprocity.10 Pursuing a strategy of passive reciprocity,
a country might simply decline to reduce any of its existing trade restrictions until its
trading partners agree to reduce some of their trade restrictions. However, if the trading
partners appreciate that it is in the first country’s interests to liberalize trade whatever the
former do, they may choose to withhold any concessions in the hope of gaining the benefits
of the first country’s trade liberalization for free. This is a classic Prisoner’s Dilemma
problem, which may inhibit trade liberalization and lead to an inefficient outcome in which
everyone is worse off. On the other hand, the trading partners may realize that it could be
difficult from a political standpoint for the first country to liberalize on the import side
without being able to enlist the support of its export-oriented producers and moderate the
effects of contraction in its import-sensitive industries with growth in its export industries.
In this case, a strategy of passive reciprocity may produce a mutual agreement on trade
liberalization.

A strategy of aggressive reciprocity might take any of several forms.11 Where two
countries have previously negotiated a reciprocal trade agreement, in the absence of a
supranational authority with the ability to enforce the agreement, the threat of retaliation for
breach of or defection from the agreement may be the only effective means of ensuring that
the agreement is effectively self-enforcing.12 Retaliation here is likely to entail withdrawal of
previous concessions in the hope that this (or the threat thereof) will induce the breaching
country to fulfil its prior commitments. Where countries must deal with each other
indefinitely, this tit-for-tat strategy may solve repeated Prisoner’s Dilemma games by
ensuring cooperation rather than defection.13

More controversial forms of aggressive reciprocity (unilateralism) entail threats by one
country to withdraw previous concessions or impose new trade restrictions if trading
partners persist in engaging in policies that are perceived by the first country to impact
unfairly on its interests—e.g. subsidies in the case of imports, or distribution tie-ups in the
case of exports. Adam Smith himself was prepared to contemplate retaliatory reinstatement
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of previous trade restrictions where foreign countries were maintaining restrictions on
imports, although he was concerned that where there was no certainty that retaliation
(‘revenge’) would induce removal of the restrictions, retaliation would simply impose
unnecessary costs on domestic consumers.14 The most prominent contemporary example of
such a strategy is the discretionary retaliation provisions of the so-called ‘Super 301’ regime
adopted by the USA in the Omnibus Trade and Competitiveness Act of 1988 which may be
invoked where a foreign country’s policies are found by the US Trade Representative to be
‘unreasonable or discriminatory’ and to burden or restrict United States Commerce.15 Here
the threat of retaliatory trade restrictions is primarily designed to induce foreign countries
to modify policies or practices that the US government believes are unfairly impeding US
exports into foreign markets (the so-called ‘crow-bar’ theory of trade policy). A major
problem with this form of aggressive reciprocity (unilateralism) is that it often reflects very
divergent understandings of existing obligations—on the one hand, that a foreign country is
cheating on at least the spirit of previous reciprocal commitments, or on the other hand,
that the country threatening retaliation is attempting to coerce new unreci-procated trade
or other concessions from foreign countries and is itself cheating on prior commitments by
threatening their withdrawal. While in some circumstances the threat of retaliation may
involve ‘cooperative’ solutions to trade disputes, in other cases ‘feuds’ (counter-retaliation)
or ‘stalemates’ may ensue.16 Where cooperative solutions do emerge, they are likely to
reflect bilateral ‘deals’ that are antithetical to a non-discriminatory international trading
order and may conduce to ‘collusive’ or managed forms of trade that diverge substantially
from the liberal trade ideal. However, some authors argue that once we take into account
the transaction costs entailed in monitoring for cheating on, and ensuring compliance with,
complex international agreements that lack an effective third-party enforcement mechanism,
these arrangements may be the best that can be achieved. While falling short of the
(unattainable) first-best liberal trade ideal, they may prevent the world trading system from
degenerating into total autarchy or anarchy.17

In any event, while reciprocity in any of its various forms played a marginal role in the
classical economic theory of trade, it is absolutely crucial to understanding the evolution of
the institutional arrangements, both domestic and supranational, that govern international
trade, which are reviewed later in this chapter.

The optimal tariff

A second qualification to the case for free trade, recognized at a relatively early stage in the
evolution of trade theory, is the concept of the so-called Optimal Tariff. On this theory,
countries that account for a very high proportion of international demand for a certain good
may, through their governments acting as ‘cartel’ managers for consumers, possess a
significant degree of monopsony power, which they can exercise to their advantage by the
imposition of a tariff which changes the terms of trade by forcing firms in exporting
countries to reduce the price of their products and in effect absorb the tariff. Consumers in
the importing countries continue to pay the same price for the goods, but their
governments capture additional revenue from foreign exporters through the tariff. While in
theory the concept of the optimal tariff may be correct from a national (although not a

8 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



cosmopolitan or global) perspective, the empirical evidence suggests that there are few
cases where importing countries possess the degree of monopsony power in international
markets necessary to implement effectively such a policy.

Infant industries

A third and equally long-standing qualification to the conventional case for free trade
pertains to the case of infant industries.18 As John Stuart Mill argued,19 along with other
writers like Alexander Hamilton in the USA in the late eighteenth century and Friedrich
List in Germany in the late nineteenth century, in the early stages of a country’s economic
development there may be a case for the imposition of protective tariffs or quotas to allow
infant industries, in particular infant manufacturing industries, to develop, by servicing a
protected domestic market, to a scale and level of sophistication that will subsequently
permit them to compete both with imports and even more desirably to become effective
exporters in their own right. This argument has exerted a significant and enduring influence
on international trade theory and policy over the past century and a half. It was centrally
relied on by the USA and Canada in maintaining a high tariff policy throughout most of the
nineteenth century and the first quarter of the twentieth century. It has been relied on by
less developed countries (LDCs) in the post-Second World War era to justify ‘special and
differential status’ under the GATT in protecting their domestic markets and promoting
import substitution policies. It is also, more controversially, claimed to have been a central
strategic element in the rise of Japan as a major industrial power. In part, the infant industry
argument rests on the proposition that an advanced, mature economy cannot be
predominantly dependent upon agriculture or natural resources for its exports, but requires
a substantial manufacturing base, partly in order to diversify its economic activities and
employment base and reduce the risks associated with excessive reliance on a narrow base
of commodity exports, which may be subject to high price (and income) volatility and
deteriorating terms of trade relative to manufactured imports, and partly for noneconomic
reasons associated with national pride in being on the technological frontier along with
other advanced countries and providing a concomitant number and range of challenging
employment opportunities to its more highly educated or trained citizenry. However, it
bears pointing out that some countries have sustained high standards of living without
substantial manufacturing sectors, e.g. New Zealand and Denmark through agriculture,
Middle Eastern oil-producing states through natural resources. Moreover, it has proven
extraordinary difficult to specify with analytical rigour the key parameters of the infant
industries exception—why private capital markets cannot identify long-term opportunities;
why governments are better able to do so; whether there are externalities from investments
in infant industries that are not captured in private investment calculi; whether
governments are likely to be vulnerable to capture by rent-seeking special interests in the
initial decision to promote, and subsequent decisions to sustain, an infant industry.20

TRADE THEORY AND POLICY 9



Strategic trade theory

A contemporary variant on the infant industry argument entails an elaboration on, and
application to, the international trade context of the concept of imperfect competition initially
developed by Edward Chamberlin and Joan Robinson in the 1930s. Here, it is argued that
many modern manufacturing industries fall somewhere between the polarities of the neo-
classical economic concepts of monopoly and perfect competition, i.e. essentially
oligopolistic industries where prices do not necessarily reflect costs and where quasi-rents
can be realized by firms (and hence countries) able to acquire strategically dominant
positions in industries in which increasing returns to scale imply that there is room for only
a handful of firms in the global market. In this respect, it is argued that an important role
can be played by domestic governments through research and development subsidies,
export subsidies, procurement policies, related industrial policies, and import restrictions
designed to allow a firm to realize economies of scale initially in a protected domestic
market, in promoting so-called Schumpeterian industries. This has led to the emergence of
Strategic Trade Theory,21 where it is argued that governments can promote their national
interests by assisting firms to establish pre-emptive, first-mover, positions in markets, and
to realize learning-curve advantages, in part by maintaining entry barriers to potential
competitors. Again, this is a highly controversial aspect of modern international trade
theory. Subsequent research has revealed that strategic theory is highly sensitive to a
number of key variables: the number of firms in the domestic industry, ease of entry,
whether firms choose prices rather than quantities in order to maximize profits, whether
targeted industries draw upon a common critical factor of production, the extent of
foreign ownership in targeted sectors, and the potential reactions of governments of foreign
countries and competitors or potential competitors based there.22 Nevertheless, the
dramatic growth of export sectors in many of the so-called Asian ‘Tigers’ is often attributed
to strategic trade policies.

Revenue-raising considerations

Another long-standing qualification to the case for free trade relates to the revenue-raising
potential of customs duties. In many industrialized countries, it was not until early in this
century that income taxes (direct taxes) provided the primary source of government
revenues. Until this time, customs duties and to a lesser extent, export taxes were a major
source of government revenues. Even today, in developing countries with large informal
economies where internal income taxes are difficult or impossible to administer and collect,
import and export taxes constitute a major source of government revenue-raising
capabilities.

National security considerations

A long-standing non-economic qualification to the case for free trade relates to national
security considerations. These may arise on both the import and export sides. With respect
to imports, it is argued that there may sometimes be a case for restrictions in order to
protect domestic industries which, even though not internationally competitive, may be
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required in the event of war or other international disruption. Thus, industries such as the
steel and ship-building industries have often been protected on this basis, although the
concept of national security has proven highly elastic, being invoked to justify restrictions
on such unlikely imports as clothes pegs from Poland on the grounds that domestic
productive capabilities in clothes pegs would be required in the event of hostilities with the
(former) Communist Bloc countries. On the export side, national security considerations
have sometimes been invoked to restrict exports of strategically sensitive products or
military materiel to ‘unfriendly’ foreign countries.

Objections to free trade

Apart from the foregoing qualifications to the case for free trade, a number of other more
general objections are often raised to free trade: (1) job displacement and wage depression;
(2) lowest common denominator effects on domestic social policies; (3) cultural
homogenization; and (4) loss of domestic political sovereignty. These will each be briefly
considered, drawing primarily, by way of example, on the Canadian experience. Between
1947 and 1986, Canada’s merchandise imports grew in value by 552% in real terms and
merchandise exports by 564% in real terms. For Canada, post-war multilateral trade
liberalization under the GATT has to a large extent entailed bilateral trade expansion with
the USA. What have been the effects of this increased trade dependency? 

Impact on wages and employment

From 1947 to 1986, per capita GDP in Canada rose in real terms from $7,402 to $19,925
(1986 $) (an increase of 169.2%). Total employment grew from 4,821,000 in 1947 to 12,
295,000 in April 1988 (an increase of 155.0%), with manufacturing employment rising 88.
7% from 1,131,750 to 2,136,000 during this period. At the same time, of course, Canadian
consumers (the silent majority in free trade debates) have enjoyed dramatically wider
product choices and lower product prices because of imports. While it would be naïve to
suggest that these increases in jobs and incomes are wholly or even primarily attributable to
trade liberalization and expansion, at least the opposite proposition so often asserted—that
continued trade liberalization is likely to reduce real incomes and employment—is revealed
as unfounded. While trade liberalization can have negative impacts on jobs and wages in
particular domestic sectors which are vulnerable to imports, the net effect on jobs and
wages economy-wide has been strongly positive. For workers in sectors adversely impacted
by imports, generous and well-conceived domestic adjustment assistance programmes,
rather than trade protection, can often deal more cost-effectively with transition costs (as
we will argue more fully in a later chapter).23

Contemporary expressions of concern over the effects of trade liberalization on jobs and
wages in developed economies tend to focus on competition from low-wage developing
countries (the so-called ‘pauper labour’ argument). However, as Hufbauer and Schott point
out,24 between 1975 and 1990, the dollar value of two-way trade between OECD
countries and low-income countries tripled from $59 billion to $200 billion. Yet the per
capita income gaps between OEGD countries and low-income countries actually increased
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over this period (from 30 times higher to 58 times higher), reflecting the higher
productivity of labour in developed economies. While empirical evidence suggests rising
income inequalities and higher levels of unemployment amongst unskilled workers in many
developed countries, few of these effects seem attributable to increased trade with
developing countries (but rather factors such as technological change).25

Impact on social policies

Not only has the post-war period of trade liberalization seen these enormous increases in
real incomes and employment in Canada, it has also simultaneously witnessed the
emergence of the modern welfare state. Public expenditures in Canada on education rose
from $147 per capita in 1947 to $1,237 per capita in 1983–4 in real terms (1986 $), or
from 1.99% of GDP to 6.79%. Public expenditures on health care rose from $54 per capita
in 1947 to $1,202 per capita in 1985 in real terms (1986 $), or from 0.72% of GDP to 6.
18%. Direct financial benefits paid to Canadians under various social welfare programmes
amounted to $49,136 million in 1985, compared with 1947 expenditures of $3,838 million
on all ‘public welfare’ programmes (including health) (1986 $). Federal transfer payments
to the provinces rose from the equivalent of 0.12% of GDP in 1947 to 4.04% in 1986.
Public expenditures on cultural activities have risen from negligible amounts in 1947 to 0.
74% of GDP in 1984–5. Over the same period, greatly increased regulatory attention has
also been paid to occupational health and safety, consumer protection and environmental
issues. Trade liberalization and trade expansion have not been inconsistent with these
redistributional, social and cultural policies. History again reveals this fear as unfounded.
Indeed the simple truism is often over-looked that only relatively prosperous countries can
afford generous social policies. Impoverished third world countries do not have such
policies, not because they lack commitment to them in principle, but because they do not
have the wealth to afford them. Creating wealth is a precondition to redistributing it.

Thus, nothing in the theory or history of trade liberalization and expansion is inconsistent
with increasing real incomes and employment or compassionate and civilized social and
cultural policies. In fact, there is every reason to believe that only by exploiting our
comparative advantage to the fullest can we sustain increasing prosperity and the social
policies that prosperity makes possible. Nevertheless, it is important to acknowledge that
concerns that international competition will force countries to the lowest common
denominator (a ‘race to the bottom’) in terms of domestic policies pertaining to, for
example, workplace safety laws, employment standards, and environmental laws have
recently provoked considerable discussion and debate in the European Union and North
America. This is again an issue we return to later in this book, in the context of debates
over trade and labour standards26 and trade and the environment.27

Impact on cultural diversity

Another perspective, which figured prominently in the Canada-US free trade debates in the
late 1980s, emphasizes the dangers to national cultural identity presented by free trade and
international mobility of labour and capital. Distinctive ways of life and cultural values are
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seen as threatened by the homogenizing effects of economic and technological imperialism.
This point of view finds expression in the critique by Rousseau and the nineteenth-century
political romantic movement of classical political economy, and also in the Jeffersonian
alternative to the commercial republic, as well as in the views of some of the Ancients
referred to earlier in this chapter. Even authors like Fukuyama,28 who have recently
proclaimed the triumph of economic and political liberalism and ‘the end of history’, worry
about the blandness, homogeneity, and materialism that this may presage.

One cannot help but find somewhat ominous the romanticized ‘closed community’
conception held by contemporary critics of economic liberalism. Traditional closed
societies may have preserved distinctive customs and beliefs against external influences, but
only at the cost of racial, religious, and ideological intolerance, and of significant limits on
individual self-development. If we were really to avoid the consequences of contemporary
cosmopolitanism, trade barriers would hardly be enough—we would need strict censorship,
exit visas, limits on ethnic diversity, and other measures aimed at maintaining the
‘closedness’ of the community.

In any event, during the post-war decades in which Canada has witnessed such enormous
increases in international trade, particularly bilateral trade, it has also simultaneously
witnessed the flowering of Quebec nationalism and the increasingly confident assertion of a
distinctive French-Canadian cultural and linguistic iden-tity. In the post-war period, Canada
has also witnessed an enormous influx of immigrants from a great diversity of cultural
backgrounds that has immeasurably enriched Canada’s multicultural mosaic, rendering
Canada one of the most vibrant and tolerant cosmopolitan societies in the world. This is not
the traditional Canada that George Grant so nostalgically recalled in Lament for a Nation,29

but nor have Canadians become part of a homogenized, universalistic American culture as
he portended. Canada is and will remain a profoundly different society, as a comparison of
daily life in Windsor and Detroit or Toronto and Buffalo should convince the doubtful
reader. There are surely deeper measures of a society’s cultural evolution than how many
minutes are occupied by which country’s soap operas on local commercial television
networks. While liberal trading policies cannot claim direct credit for our increased
cultural diversity and distinctiveness, a close intellectual concomitant of liberal trading policies
—more liberal immigration policies—clearly can claim substantial credit. It is not
philosophically consistent to urge open and liberal immigration policies but to advocate at
the same time closed and illiberal trade policies that deprive potential immigrants of
economic opportunities in their home countries, thus leaving them with no option but to
sever their roots and emigrate.

Nevertheless, more narrowly focused concerns over the impact of trade and investment
liberalization on a country’s cultural sectors (e.g. film, television, radio, newspapers,
magazine and book publishing) continue to exert considerable influence in international
economic relations as reflected in general or qualified exceptions (often contentious) for
such sectors in domestic and international policy instruments.
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Impact on domestic political sovereignty

All international treaties, whether relating to nuclear disarmament, human rights, the
environment, the law of the sea, or trade, constrain domestic political sovereignty through
the assumption of external obligations. But unless anarchy in international relations is
preferred as an alternative, in most cases we accept that the benefits of the reciprocal
obligations involved outweigh the costs associated with any loss of political sovereignty. In
the trade context, the additional argument is sometimes made that increased economic
interdependence constrains political sovereignty in unacceptable ways in that countries—
especially smaller countries with major trading relationships with larger countries, such as
Canada and the USA—will be concerned that adopting independent foreign policies, for
example, may antagonize the larger trading partner and lead to forms of economic
‘blackmail’ designed to induce policy conformity. This risk cannot be altogether gainsaid.
However, trade treaties that structure relations by reference to durable, well-defined
substantive norms and objective dispute resolution procedures reduce the risks of larger
countries exploiting raw economic power to bully smaller countries, by subjecting power
relations to some form of legal ordering. In addition, smaller countries typically stand to
gain disproportionately from trade liberalization. This is due to the simple fact that
liberalization will provide access to a larger set of potential new trading relationships than in
the case of the larger country gaining enhanced access to the smaller country’s market.
Nevertheless, sweeping claims for international harmonization of many domestic policies in
the name of trade or investment liberalization do legitimately engage concerns over
excessive constraints on political sovereignty and democratic accountability by privileging
competitive markets over competitive politics (an issue we return to in the final chapter).30

Public choice theory and the politics of trade liberalization

Over the last three decades or so, economists have developed an increasing interest in the
positive analysis of politics. The basic economic model of politics that has been developed—
commonly referred to as ‘public choice’ theory—models the political process as an implicit
market with demanders (voters or interest groups) of government policies exchanging
political support in terms of votes, information/propaganda, campaign contributions or
other material forms of assistance for desired policies. Government (politicians and their
agents, bureaucrats and regulators) will supply policies that maximize the governing Party’s
prospects of re-election (or in the case of opposition Parties, election). This view of the
political process contrasts with that conventionally assumed hitherto by economists, which
sees governments as attempting to maximize some social welfare function by correcting for
various forms of market failure (monopoly, public goods, externalities, etc.). Implicit in the
public choice approach is the view that neither the effect nor intent of most government
policies is to advance the common good, but rather to construct minimum winning
coalitions, often through redistributional policies, even though the impact of such policies will
often, perhaps primarily, be to reduce aggregate social welfare.

Applying the public choice model, Downs31 and subsequently Olson32 argued that
narrow producer interests would tend to dominate thinly-spread consumer interests in the
political process. This is largely a function of the differential mobilization and hence
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lobbying costs faced by producer and consumer interests. The larger the per capita stakes in
an issue, the stronger will be the incentives to overcome information and transaction costs
in organizing; and the fewer the affected stake-holders the easier it will be to overcome the
free-rider problem that afflicts large interest groups whose individual members have small
per capita stakes in the relevant issues. This framework would tend to suggest that highly
concentrated industries with few firms, perhaps also highly geographically concentrated,
and possibly with highly unionized work-forces, are likely to be able to organize most
effectively and, therefore, are most likely to secure favourable policies from government,
including trade protection.

A major theoretical difficulty with this model is that it appears to imply no equilibrium in
the political process, at least in the context in which it purports to apply, short of a corner
solution entailing infinite protection for the affected industries (a total ban on imports).
This is manifestly not what we typically observe, even in concentrated industries, which is
sufficient to raise some prima facie doubts about the subtlety of the model. As Destler and
Odell point out,33 the weakness in the model is its simplistic assumptions that, on the one
hand, domestic producers, who are easily mobilized politically, uniformly favour
protectionism and that, on the other, the sole or principal cost-bearers are ultimate end-
users or lay consumers, who are politically disabled. More specifically, the model first
ignores the fact that imports will often be intermediate inputs into another industry, for
example, textiles and clothing, steel and automobiles, and that the industry purchasing the
inputs will normally find it rational to resist cost-increasing policies. Second, the model
ignores the fact that export-oriented industries may have reason to fear retaliation by
foreign countries to restrictions on their exports in the form of reciprocal trade restrictions,
thus creating an incentive for such industries to resist domestically imposed trade
restrictions. Moreover, the potential for growth in export-oriented sectors is likely to
moderate the adjustment costs faced by import-impacted sectors, thus reducing the political
resistance to trade liberalization. Third, the model overlooks the fact that importers of final
goods—distributors and large retail chains that import and sell large quantities of imports—
constitute a major producer constituency that will be disadvantaged by trade restrictions.
Fourth, while it is true that consumers may face information costs, transaction costs, and
strategic impediments to effective group mobilization, as individuals they still possess votes
which constitute a resource that firms, whatever their other political resources, by
definition do not possess. The determinants of the political rate of exchange between various
political currencies, for example, votes and financial resources, are not well addressed in
the public choice model of the political process. Finally, the model fails to disaggregate
what may be complex competing interests within firms. As Milner argues, domestic firms
with strong international ties often face difficult choices as to whether to support or oppose
protection. Protectionist measures which may benefit the firm in a sector where it produces
domestically could lead to retaliation by foreign trading partners that could harm the firm’s
exporting or foreign investment interests.34 Milner also points out that large, multinational
firms have more ability to pursue their own adjustment policies, by moving assembly or
other activities offshore to counter any wage-price advantages maintained by foreign
competitors. On the other hand, such firms may demand trade restrictions as a kind of
‘stick’ with which to threaten foreign trading partners to open up their markets, although
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the evidence that using trade restrictions in this manner can procure significant market
opening is quite ambiguous.35 In sum, the behaviour of firms will often be motivated by
complex interests that do not necessarily point to a pro-protectionist rent-seeking outcome.

Various non-public choice models of the trade policy process identified by Baldwin,36 in
contrast to the behavioural assumption of short-run economic self-interest adopted by the
public choice models, admit of diverse factors: long-run pursuit of self-interest by economic
agents and political actors, autonomous behaviour by public officials who are not simply
intermediaries acting on the wishes of the electorate or some part of it, and altruism on the
part of public and private actors concerned about the welfare of individuals who may be
affected by import competition. Conversely, these public and private actors may arguably
be concerned about the welfare of individuals in foreign countries, especially poorer
developing countries, disadvantaged by denial of access to domestic markets for their
goods.

The difficulty with these latter models as positive frameworks for predicting trade policy
decisions is that their behavioural assumptions are so vague as to be largely untestable, and
are likely to provide a positive rationalization for almost any conceivable set of trade
policies (and thus predict or explain nothing).

The empirical evidence on most postulated political determinants of trade protection is
as ambiguous as the positive theories that underlie the postulates.37 This ambiguity applies
to industry concentration, geographic concentration, industry size (in terms of number of
employees), labour intensity, and extent of unionization. Most studies, however, find a
positive correlation between protectionism and low-wage, low-skilled industries.

Baldwin concludes that an eclectic approach to understanding this behaviour is the most
appropriate one currently. Until the various models are differentiated more sharply
analytically and better empirical measures for distinguishing them are obtained, it will be
difficult to ascertain the relative importance of different motivations of government officials
under various conditions.38

An ‘eclectic approach’ is, of course, no model at all in terms of yielding testable
implications or predictions at the level of positive analysis, and in terms of normative
implications, provides very little purchase on those features of the policymaking process
which, if modified, are likely to yield superior policy outcomes. Perhaps what can be said is
that the evidence does not suggest an iron law of politics that inexorably drives
governments, in particular sets of circumstances, to the adoption of particular trade
restricting policies.

AN INSTITUTIONAL HISTORY OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE
POLICY

The advent of free trade

Trading relationships between merchants from different nation-states go back to the dawn of
recorded history. Trade was important to many ancient and medieval powers: Athens,
Ptolemaic Egypt, the Italian city-states of Venice, Florence, and Genoa, and the German
Hanseatic League. Trade regulation through the imposition of tolls (a major source of state
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revenue) has almost as long a history, as do trade agreements between nation-states—a
commercial treaty between the Kings of Egypt and Babylonia existed in 2500 Bc.39

However, a functional understanding of modern international trade policy on an
institutional level necessarily involves some appreciation of the broader forces at work for
free trade in the European economies during the late eighteenth and early nineteenth
centuries. From this perspective, international trade institutions need to be seen as one
aspect of a more general process leading to access to larger, more unified markets, such that
by the mid-nineteenth century only national frontiers remained as effective barriers to trade.40

This process included the repeal of laws banning the export of certain materials previously
considered essential to national welfare, the abolition of local regulations regarding
manufacturing techniques, the adoption of (national) standards in weights and measures,
and the end of restrictions on personal economic freedom (continuing bans against unions
being a conspicuous exception to the general trend). Nation-building itself was in part an
effort to ensure free trade within domestic borders where such had not existed before: the
dismantling of internal tolls and levies was an essential precondition to industrial
development in the European economies.41

By the mid-nineteenth century, then, most of the advanced European countries had
established free trade within their borders. But many nations continued to practice
internationally what they had eschewed internally: protection (trade barriers) continued
between nations as they vied for wealth and power in international relations. The first
major break with these mercantilist-protectionist policies of the past came in Britain with the
repeal of the Corn Laws in 1846, spear-headed by Prime Minister Sir Robert Peel, a late
convert to the cause of trade liberalization, and Lord Cobden. The repeal of these laws was
in part promoted by the increasing intellectual currency of the ideas of Smith and especially
Ricardo, and partly by the practical urgency of responding to the desperation of the Irish
Famine. Political agitation fed by the wealth and power of commercial and manufacturing
interests also played a role, as it would elsewhere in Europe later in the century.42 The
repeal of the Corn Laws was quickly followed by the unilateral removal or reduction of
hundreds of tariffs on most imported goods, ushering in, in Britain, a period of resolute
commitment to the principle of free trade that extended into the early years of the
twentieth century.

While British trade policy reflected the insights of classical trade theory that unilateral
trade liberalization enhanced national welfare over the protectionist base case, Britain also,
over the course of the century, negotiated a number of free trade treaties with other
countries, beginning with the Cobden-Chevalier Treaty of 1860 with France.43 France in
turn, in 1862, negotiated a comprehensive trade treaty with the Zollverein, the German
Customs Union, as well as with a host of other European nations in the following decade.44

These treaties were notable for their espousal of the Most Favoured Nation (MFN)
principle, which later became the cornerstone of the GATT. Under this principle, countries
negotiating trade concessions with one another agreed that they would extend to each other
any more favourable concessions that each might subsequently negotiate with third
countries. The MFN principle encouraged multilateralism while discouraging trade
discrimination, and because of its presence in most French treaties, free trade swept Europe
during the 1860s.45
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Treaties were not the only institutional results of trade policy in this period. At the same
time that countries were negotiating cuts in tariffs, they signed conventions, mainly in the
realm of transportation and communication, which helped to facilitate trade in other ways.
For example, in 1868 the Rhine was declared a free way for ships of all nations, thus greatly
facilitating the transport of goods throughout central Europe.46 Trading nations also
promoted international commerce by setting up organizations to sell domestic products
abroad. Commercial attachés date from this period, as do state-run international chambers
of commerce. Exhibitions were arranged to show off national wares, and commercial
museums were set up to inform manufacturers of the requirements and tastes of foreign
markets.47

However, the heyday of free trade was relatively brief and peaked over the period from
about 1850 to 1885. In the 1870s Europe suffered a severe and sustained recession, and also
found itself facing increasing competition from non-European grain producers. In 1879,
Germany retreated from the principle of free trade, when Bismarck raised tariffs
substantially on a number of imported items, partly in response to the economic stringencies
of the time, and partly in response to the intellectual influence of writers like Friedrich List,
who had returned from the United States persuaded of the virtues of a high tariff policy,
particularly in manufacturing sectors, in order to promote infant industries. Germany’s
retreat from free trade was quickly followed by France and a number of European
countries, with Britain alone remaining emphatically committed to free trade.48

It is perhaps prudent to reflect here on the character of European free trade during the
nineteenth century in light of its sudden decline with the advent of hard times. It is
important that the history of international trading institutions is not seen as the inevitable
result of economic rationality and the triumph of superior economic thought. On the one
hand, free trade did not disappear completely after 1879. Germany continued to negotiate
trade treaties, although now economic ends tended to be subordinated to those of foreign
policy. But perhaps this was no great change of course—free trade was always as much a
tool of foreign policy as of economic development. Prussian attempts to establish the
Zollverein were at least partly motivated by its nation-building aspirations. Similarly,
historians have noted that Germany’s treaties with France were part of a policy to isolate
Austria (Prussia’s main competitor for hegemony in the German world), and an attempt to
gain French neutrality with respect to Germany’s disputes with Denmark.49 The Cobden-
Chevalier treaty may also have been a product of foreign policy desiderata. It was intended,
at least in part, to mollify Great Britain over French meddling on the Italian peninsula.50

Moreover, if it is a mistake to see treaties as motivated primarily by considerations of
economic efficiency, so too would it be wrong to understand the pursuit of markets solely
through the instrumentality of trade treaties. Throughout the nineteenth century, the
European powers had pursued colonial acquisitions as a means of exploiting the gains from
trade.51 With the onset of depression, and the collapse of the free trade treaties in the late
1870s, this policy was pursued with a vengeance.52

The world thus began the present century with the European powers, with the exception
of Britain, preferring in large part to reap the gains from trade other than through free trade
with other advanced economies. The story had rarely ever been otherwise in the United
States. There, with considerable variations over time, a high tariff policy generally prevailed
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through the nineteenth century, largely promoted by the Republican Party and influenced
by the thinking and writings of prominent Americans like Alexander Hamilton, who had
vigorously promoted the infant industry rationale for trade protection, in addition to
revenue-raising considerations which for much of the nineteenth century were an important
function served by tariffs.

The decline of the international trading order

As the world entered the twentieth century, Britain found its economic hegemony rapidly
diminishing, and hence its ability to impress the case for free trade on its major trading
partners. The advent of the First World War massively disrupted international trading
relationships, and the terms of settlement of the war in part contributed to a general
outbreak of beggar-thy-neighbour policies in the 1920s, including competitive exchange
rate devaluations and trade restrictions.53 The Most Favoured Nation system of trade
treaties fell into disuse, and trading powers dealt with each other bilaterally instead. In the
late 1920s, as the Great Depression set in, many domestic economies, and the world
economy at large, largely collapsed. The economic privations of the time prompted many
countries to adopt extreme forms of trade protectionism in an attempt to preserve domestic
production and employment. The most notorious of such attempts was the enactment by
the US Congress of the Smoot-Hawley Tariff in 1930, which raised duties on imports to an
average of 60%, and quickly provoked similar retaliatory measures by most of the USA’s
major trading partners. In the view of most economic commentators, this seriously
exacerbated the conditions of the Great Depression, as international trade ground to a
virtual standstill.54 However, a major shift in policy was signalled by the US Administration
in 1934, when President Roosevelt was successful in persuading Congress to pass the
Reciprocal Trade Agreements Act, which authorized the Administration to negotiate trade
liberalizing agreements on a bilateral basis with its trading partners. In the ensuing years, 31
such agreements were concluded. However, the outbreak of the Second World War
decisively shattered visions of a more cooperative international trading environment.55

By 1944, it had become reasonably clear to the Allies that the war would shortly be won,
and policy-makers, particularly in Britain and the USA, turned their minds to strategies for
reconstructing the world economy after the war. Hence, in 1944, in Bretton Woods, New
Hampshire, USA, an agreement bearing that name was concluded between Britain and the
USA that was designed to lay the groundwork for a cooperative international economic
environment following the war. The Bretton Woods Agreement envisaged the creation of
three key new international institutions: The International Monetary Fund (IMF), which
would be charged with maintaining exchange rate stability, and assisting countries facing
balance of payment crises to deal with those crises through access to special drawing rights
to be provided by the IMF, rather than by resorting to trade restrictions; the International Bank
for Reconstruction and Development (IBRD), commonly referred to as the World Bank,
whose mandate initially was to provide reconstruction capital from countries like the USA
whose economies had not been devastated by the war to the shattered economies of Europe
and Japan; the success of the Marshall Plan that the USA subsequently adopted in promoting
this objective meant that the World Bank was able quickly to redefine its focus as providing
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development capital to less developed countries; and the International Trade Organization
(ITO), whose mandate was to oversee the negotiation and administration of a new
multilateral, liberal world trading regime.56

The formation and evolution of the GATT57

Following the end of the war, the IMF and the World Bank were duly created, but the ITO
did not come into existence, largely as a result of opposition in the US Congress, which was
concerned that both the Organization and many provisions in the Havana Charter that
would have created it would excessively constrain domestic sovereignty.58 Instead, a
provisional agreement, negotiated in 1947 among some 23 major trading countries in the
world as a prelude to the ITO and the adoption of the Havana Charter, i.e. the General
Agreement on Tariffs and Trade (GATT), in fact became the permanent institutional basis
for the multilateral world trading regime that has prevailed to this day.59 Under the GATT,
some eight negotiating rounds have now been successfully concluded, the latest round (the
Uruguay Round) involving more than 100 countries, being concluded in December 1993.60

The first six of these rounds, concluding in 1967 with the Kennedy Round, focused
primarily on reciprocal negotiation of tariff concessions. These negotiations were extremely
successful and have led to the reduction of average world tariffs on manufactured goods
from 40% in 1947 to 5% today. The Tokyo Round that ended in 1979, while also entailing
substantial tariff cuts, for the first time directed substantial attention to various non-tariff
barriers to trade, such as government procurement policies, subsidy policies, customs
valuation policies, and technical standards. In all of these areas, Collateral Codes to the
GATT were negotiated on a conditional MFN basis, meaning that only signatories to the
Codes were subject to the rights and obligations created by the Codes.61 The Tokyo Round
closed with the world economy and many domestic economies under increasing pressure
from a number of sources, including two oil price shocks, a major world recession in the
early 1970s and another beginning in the early 1980s, and the rise of Japan, and other newly
industrializing countries (NICs), such as Singapore, Hong Kong, Taiwan, South Korea and
Brazil, as major competitive threats in manufactured products. These pressures provoked
the rise of the so-called ‘New Protectionism’ beginning in the early 1970s with countries
increasingly resorting to non-tariff barriers to trade, such as quotas, voluntary export
restraint agreements, orderly marketing agreements, industrial and agricultural subsidies,
and more aggressive unilateral invocation of trade remedy laws, particularly antidumping
and countervailing duty laws. In addition, the Short Term Agreement on Cotton Textiles
that had been initiated by the USA in 1961 had, by 1973, been generalized to the Multi-
Fibre Arrangement (MFA), which permitted countries to negotiate bilateral agreements
with exporting countries restricting exports of both natural and synthetic textiles and
clothing. This arrangement has been particularly burdensome for many NICs and LDCs
which had viewed textile and clothing manufacture, drawing on large pools of unskilled
labour and relatively standardized technology, as an attractive entry point into the process
of industrialization.

Throughout this period, LDCs in general have played a marginal role in GATT
negotiations, which many viewed as a rich man’s club. In 1964, LDCs formed the United
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Nations Commission on Trade and Development (UNCTAD), to address what were
perceived to be the special and distinctive economic needs of the LDCs. In 1968, in
response to UNCTAD recommendations, Part IV was added to the GATT, providing for so-
called ‘special and differential status’ for LDCs and in particular exempting LDCs from any
obligation of reciprocity with respect to trade concessions of developed countries while at
the same time urging developed countries to provide unilateral trade concessions to LDCs
on trade items of export interest to them. This in turn led to the adoption of the
Generalized System of Preferences, where developed member countries of the GATT from
the early 1970s onwards granted special trade concessions to LDCs, without seeking
reciprocal trade concessions. The special and differential status secured by LDCs under the
GATT reflected then widely prevalent thinking in many developing countries that import
substitution policies (in effect infant industry promotion policies) were essential to the
economic development of these countries, in order to diversify their economic base,
provide expanding sources of employment, and reduce dependency on often highly volatile
international commodity markets for primary products. With respect to the latter,
UNCTAD also promoted the adoption of a variety of international commodity agreements
in sectors such as coffee, cocoa, rubber, and tin, in an attempt to stabilize commodity prices
and mitigate what were perceived to be deteriorating terms of trade with respect to the
exchange of LDC commodities for industrialized countries’ manufactured goods.62

The Uruguay Round of multilateral trade negotiations under the GATT, which lasted
from 1986 to 1993, has proved the most difficult, contentious and complex round of
negotiations to have taken place under the auspices of the GATT, in part because of the
increasing strains on the world trading system noted above and in part because of the
breadth of the negotiating agenda. The Uruguay Round, for the first time, attempted
seriously to address the issue of liberalizing international trade in agriculture which had
hitherto largely escaped GATT discipline. In addition, the Uruguay Round also sought to
reverse the pattern of protectionism with respect to textiles and clothing that had evolved
under the Multi-Fibre Arrangement. In addition, several new issues that had previously
been viewed as falling outside the ambit of the GATT were for the first time addressed,
including in particular international trade in services, trade-related intellectual property
issues (TRIPs), and trade-related investment issues (TRIMs).63

In a recent extensive review64 of the evolution of patterns of comparative advantage and
international trade policy in the post-Second World War period, Ostry points out that the
US as the hegemonic economic power following the war was initially prepared to accept
asymmetric tariff reductions as part of its contribution to post-war reconstruction.
However, with the resurgence of Western Europe and Japan, the US began to insist on
more symmetry in tariff concessions (in the Kennedy and Tokyo Rounds). With rapid and
continuing rates of technological diffusion, a declining share of world trade, a loss of
comparative advantage in some mass production and technology-intensive sectors, and
rising trade deficits with Japan and other NICs, the US in recent years has become
increasingly concerned about what it perceives as a lack of reciprocity in international
trading relations, and hence has evinced a greater willingness to pursue strategies of
unilateralism and regionalism in addition to or instead of exclusive commitments to the
multilateral system. In particular, ‘system frictions’, involving different traditions of
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government intervention in domestic economies and of forms of industrial organization,
have increasingly redirected the focus of international trade policy and conflicts beyond or
within the borders of nation states and to divergences in domestic policies that arguably
create ‘unfair’ forms of comparative advantage (or ‘unlevel playing fields’). With tariffs now
in many cases reduced to minimal levels, the new issues addressed in the course of the
Uruguay Round likely portend an increasing and broader focus in the future on domestic
policy divergences as potential distortions of international trade—a very different agenda
from that which initially pre-occupied the founders of the GATT.

The formation of regional trading blocs

Running parallel with the evolution of the multilateral trading system under the GATT in
the post-war period has been another institutional development of considerable significance
—the rise of regional trading blocs. While a significant number of these arrangements have
been created, to date by far the most important has been the European Union. The
European Union finds its genesis in the Marshall Plan adopted by the USA for the
reconstruction of war-torn Europe, motivated not only by economic objectives but also
importantly by political concerns to promote a degree of economic integration that would
make the devastating military conflicts of the first half of the twentieth century less likely to
recur. Efforts at formal economic integration began with the European Coal and Steel
Community, which was formed in 1952 and was charged with promoting the rationalization
and integration of the European steel industry. In 1957, the Treaty of Rome, which
contemplated a much more ambitious agenda of economic integration, was entered into,
initially by six member countries: France, Germany, Italy, The Netherlands, Belgium and
Luxembourg; and subsequently by the United Kingdom, Denmark, Greece, Ireland,
Portugal and Spain. In the early years, attention was principally focused on the removal of
border impediments to trade, especially tariffs and quotas, but over time the European
Union has increasingly committed itself to a much more substantial level of economic and
political integration, which would provide for the free movement of goods, services,
capital, and people within the Community. In 1986, the Community adopted the Single
European Act, which set out an ambitious agenda of policy measures with a view to
realizing a single European market by 1992.65 The Maastricht Treaty, ratified in 1993,
provides for further forms of economic and political integration. Apart from the European
Union, the European Free Trade Association (EFTA) was formed in 1959, with its initial
membership comprising Austria, Denmark, Norway, Sweden, Switzerland and the United
Kingdom. The UK and Denmark subsequently joined the European Union, recently
followed by Austria, Sweden and Finland. The remaining members of EFTA have pursued a
policy of mutual and substantial tariff reductions, although EFTA has had much more
modest ambitions, in terms of degrees of economic integration, than the European Union.
With the recent collapse of the centrally-planned economies in Eastern Europe, a number
of these countries now also aspire to eventual membership in the EU.

On the other side of the Atlantic, the conclusion of the Canada-US Free Trade
Agreement (FTA) in 1988 marked an important step in the development of an American
regional trading bloc. While the FTA is much less integrating than the European Union, it
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does provide for the removal of all tariffs over a ten year period as well as most other
border measures, for largely unrestricted movement of capital and direct investment, and
for the liberalization of some trade in services. In 1992, largely building on and superceding
the FTA, a North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA) was concluded by the USA,
Mexico and Canada (subsequently ratified in all three countries and subsequently, in
adapted form, adopted by Canada and Chile), and President Bush spoke of his vision of a
trading bloc of the Americas stretching from Anchorage to Tierra del Fuego.

Other regional trading blocs have emerged or are beginning to emerge in Latin America
(Mercosur), the Caribbean (CARICOM), Asia and the Pacific Rim (APEC), and Eastern and
Southern Africa (COMESA).

The rise of regional trading blocs in the post-war period, alongside the evolution of the
multilateral system under the GATT, raises major conceptual and policy issues which will
be pursued in greater detail later in this book.66 While some analysts believe that these
trading blocs and the multilateral system can be viewed as complementary and mutually
reinforcing, other analysts view regional trading blocs as inherently discriminatory and as a
major threat to the future stability and integrity of the multilateral system and to the vision
of a cooperative and non-dis-criminatory world economic order that animated the
architects of the Bretton Woods Agreement at the end of the Second World War. Tensions
between unilat-eralism, regionalism, and multilateralism recur in various contexts that are
addressed throughout this book. 
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2
The basic elements of the GATT/WTO, the

North American Free Trade Agreement, and
the European Union

This chapter is intended to provide a brief orientation to, or topography of, the GATT/
WTO (the heart of the multilateral world trading regime), and the two major regional
trading blocs in the world: the North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA) between
the USA, Canada and Mexico, and the European Union. The intention of the chapter is
merely to highlight the principal elements of these arrangements, and not to explore them
in detail. A number of subsequent chapters in this book will pursue a more detailed analysis
of many of these elements. However, given the complexity of these arrangements, there is
virtue in having a general road map at hand before embarking on detailed analyses of particular
principles or provisions.

THE GENERAL AGREEMENT ON TARIFFS AND TRADE
(GATT)1

The original GATT of 1947 has now become the GATT of 1994 and the WTO Agreement
is an umbrella agreement, establishing the WTO structure, including GATT 1997 and many
other Agreements to which all Member States (no longer ‘Contracting Parties’) must, with
few exceptions, subscribe.

Tariffs

The preamble to the GATT commits Members to enter into ‘reciprocal and mutually
advantageous arrangements directed to the substantial reduction of tariffs and other barriers
to trade and to the elimination of discriminatory treatment in international commerce’.
Article XXVIII bis further provides that

members recognize that customs duties often constitute serious obstacles to trade
and that negotiations on a reciprocal and mutually advantageous basis, directed to the
substantial reduction of the general level of tariffs are of great importance to the
expansion of international trade.

Members commit themselves under this article to sponsoring such negotiationsfrom time
to time either on a selective product-by-product basis or by the application of such
multilateral procedures as may be accepted by the Members.



Once tariff concessions are agreed to in a particular set of negotiations, these become ‘tariff
bindings’ which are set out in particular Members’ tariff schedules that constitute an Annex
to the GATT. By virtue of Article II of the GATT, all Parties must adhere to these ‘tariff
bindings’ by not imposing customs duties in excess of those set forth in each country’s tariff
bindings schedule. This is subject to an exception provided for in Article XXVIII, where at
scheduled three yearly intervals, any Member that has made previous tariff concessions can
reopen these concessions with other Members who have a substantial interest in the concession
with a view to modifying or withdrawing the concession, but in that event other
concessions must be offered so that a general level of reciprocal and mutually advantageous
concessions not less favourable to trade than those existing between the Parties prior to
such reopening is maintained.

Obviously, for tariff concessions to be credible, some agreed customs valuation,
classification, and administration system is necessary, otherwise a country in agreeing to
reduce, for example, a 20% tariff on imports of a particular category to 10%, could negate
the concession by arbitrarily revaluing imported goods of this category upwards by 100%, or
by reclassifying them into a higher tariff category, or by imposing administrative charges
pertaining to the processing of inbound goods that may operate as a de facto tariff. Article
VII of the GATT requires that the value for customs purposes of imported merchandise
should be based on the ‘actual value’ of the imported merchandise which in turn is defined
as the price at which such merchandise is sold or offered for sale in the ordinary course of
trade under fully competitive conditions. This definition proved vague and easy to
circumvent, and a special Customs Valuation Code was negotiated during the Tokyo Round
(and modestly revised during the Uruguay Round) which stipulates that in the ordinary
course of events the ‘transaction value’ as between an exporter and an importer shall be the
value for customs purposes, subject to some limited exceptions where the Parties are not
dealing with each other at arms length. Similarly, most of the Members have agreed to
harmonize their systems of customs classification (the HS), based on the Brussels
Nomenclature, which reduces room for ambiguity or debate as to the proper tariff
classification of a particular good. Finally, Article VIII of the GATT restricts the imposition
of fees or charges relating to the administrative processing of inbound goods to the
approximate cost of services rendered, which shall not represent an indirect protection to
domestic products or a taxation of imports for fiscal purposes.

The principle of non-discrimination

The principle of non-discrimination—often viewed as the cornerstone of the GATT—is
referred to in the preamble to the GATT and is amplified in two key provisions: Article I,
adopting the Most Favoured Nation principle; and Article III, adopting the principle of
National Treatment. 

The Most Favoured Nation (MFN) principle

Under Article I of the GATT, with respect to customs duties or charges of any kind
imposed by any country on any other member country, any advantage, favour, privilege, or
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immunity granted by such country to any product originating in any other country shall be
accorded immediately and unconditionally to a like product originating in the territories of
all other Members. Thus, notwithstanding that tariff concessions may be principally
negotiated between country A and country B, which may be the principal suppliers and
purchasers of the products in question respectively, if either country A or country B makes
a binding tariff concession to the other, it must extend exactly the same concession to all
other member countries of the GATT, without being able to demand quid pro quos as a
condition for this extension of the concession, at least if these were not part of the initial
negotiations. However, the MFN principle is subject to some important exceptions. Article
I itself in effect grandfathers preferences that were in force between certain member
countries at the time of the inception of the GATT, subject to a rule that freezes the margin
of preference, so that it cannot subsequently be increased. This exception has become less
important over time as MFN rates have been negotiated down and differences between the
preferential rates and the MFN rates progressively reduced.

A second exception is much more important. Article XXIV permits the formation of
regional trading blocs, either in the form of custom unions or free trade areas, subject to two
basic conditions: namely that the general incidence of duties after the formation of such an
arrangement not be higher than the average levels of duties prevailing on the part of member
countries to such an arrangement prior to its formation, and that duties and other
restrictions on trade must be eliminated with respect to substantially all the trade between
the constituent members of the regional trading bloc. It is under this provision that the
European Union, the Canada-US Free Trade Agreement, and NAFTA find their legitimacy.
By definition, these arrangements would otherwise violate the MFN principle, because they
clearly contemplate more favourable duty and related arrangements amongst constituent
members than with respect to external trading partners.

Various regional arrangements either in existence or contemplated at the time of the
formation of the GATT, including the possible emergence of a European Economic
Community, compelled the initial Contracting Parties to recognize this major exception to
non-discriminatory multilateralism. As we will see in later chapters, one view of regional
trading arrangements is a pragmatic and positive one: that if full multilateral trade
liberalization is not immediately possible, partial forms of trade liberalization on a regional
basis may be better than nothing, in that they may sustain or nurture over time forward
momentum on trade liberalization. This is often referred to as the ‘bicycle theory’ of trade
liberalization. A contrary view argues that partial trade liberalization may be worse than no
trade liberalization at all. This view emphasizes a crucial distinction between trade diversion
and trade expansion. A simple example will illustrate the distinction. Suppose at one point
in time country A maintains a tariff of 20% on textile imports from both countries B and C.
Suppose that some of country C’s textile producers are 25% more efficient than A’s, and
that some of country B’s textile producers are 15% more efficient than A’s. In this scenario
C’s more efficient textile producers will successfully surmount A’s 20% tariff barrier and sell
textiles into A’s market 5% cheaper than A’s producers. B’s producers, on the other hand,
will find that the 20% tariff more than neutralizes their 15% efficiency advantage over A’s
producers and renders their product 10% dearer in A’s market than textiles produced in C.
If countries A and B at a subsequent point in time agree to form a free trade area and to
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abolish all tariffs between them but to maintain tariffs against external Parties, including the
20% tariff on textiles that A formerly had in place against C, C finds itself in a position
where it can still sell textiles 5% more cheaply than A’s producers, but they are now 10%
dearer than those produced by B.Conversely, B’s producers can now sell textiles into A’s
market 15% cheaper than A’s producers, and 10% cheaper than C’s (in effect the tariff
retained by A against C neutralizes the efficiency advantage that C’s producers enjoy over
B’s of 10% and imposes a further 10% penalty on C relative to B). The result of the
formation of a free trade area in this example is that production of textiles will shift from C,
the most efficient producer amongst the three countries, to a less efficient producer, B. In
other words, trade has been diverted from C to B, despite C’s comparative advantage over
both B and A. In this example, partial trade liberalization has actually further distorted the
efficient allocation of resources.

In considering institutional arrangements to promote regional economic integration, it is
useful to think of an integration continuum. First, there are Free Trade Areas (like
NAFTA), where two or more countries agree to remove border restrictions on goods
amongst themselves but each reserves the right to maintain whatever external trade policy
it wishes with respect to non-member countries. A particular problem raised by this kind of
arrangement is importation of goods through low tariff member countries and trans-
shipment to higher tariff member countries, which can only be resolved with complex rules
of origin. Second, there are Customs Unions where in addition to removing border
restrictions on trade in goods amongst member countries, member countries also agree to
harmonize their external trade policies vis-à-vis non-member countries. Third, there are
Common Markets or Economic Unions (like the European Union), where in addition to
removing border restrictions on trade in goods amongst member countries and harmonizing
external trade policy, free trade in or free movement of services, capital, and people, as
well as perhaps a common monetary policy, might be contemplated. Fourth, there are
Federalist structures, like the USA, Canada, Australia, and Germany, where economic units
form a single state, with the central government being vested with the dominant jurisdiction
over economic functions, but with some agreed division of economic powers between the
central and subnational levels of government, with constitutional or other arrangements
designed to guarantee internal free movement of goods, services, capital, and people, and
minimization of internal barriers to trade. Finally, there are Unitary States, where over a
given geographic region, one government, to all intents and purposes, possesses exclusive
jurisdiction over all significant economic functions, so that problems of inter-governmental
coordination of economic policies within the geographic area are eliminated. 

The National Treatment principle

The MFN principle set out in Article I of the GATT is designed to constrain discrimination
by Members amongst different foreign exporters, i.e. playing favourites among foreigners.
The principle of National Treatment set out in Article III of the GATT addresses another
form of discrimination, namely where a Member adopts internal or domestic policies
designed to favour its domestic producers vis-à-vis foreign producers of a given product,
even though the latter may all be treated in a uniform way. Article 111:4 provides that the
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products of the territory of any Contracting Party imported into the territory of any other
Contracting Party shall be accorded treatment no less favourable than that accorded to like
products of national origin in respect of all laws, regulations and requirements affecting
their internal sale. In effect, what the principle of National Treatment dictates is that once
border duties have been paid by foreign exporters, as provided for in a country’s tariff
schedules, no additional burdens may be imposed through internal sales taxes, differential
forms of regulation, etc. on foreign exporters where domestic producers of the same
product do not bear the same burden. The particular application of the National Treatment
principle to given situations has been the source of a number of important GATT panel
decisions, where difficult decisions arise as to whether a domestic law, regulation or
administrative policy, which may be neutral on its face, nevertheless has either the intent or
effect of imposing differential burdens on foreign exporters. A specific example of this
problem has been addressed in the GATT Code on Technical Standards, initially negotiated
during the Tokyo Round, and substantially elaborated in separate WTO Agreements on
Technical Barriers to Trade and Sanitary and Phytosanitary Measures during the Uruguay
Round, which attempt to promote harmonization of domestic product standards that might
otherwise discourage international trade.

An explicit exception to the National Treatment principle is contained in Article 111:8
of the GATT, which permits government agencies to favour local producers in purchasing
goods for governmental purposes and not with a view to commercial resale. However, this
provision is now subject to a detailed government procurement code initially negotiated
during the Tokyo Round and expanded during the Uruguay Round that require many
departments and agencies of government (although in federal systems, not sub-national levels
of government) with regard to government procurement contracts over a certain size to
respect the National Treatment principle, and avoid preferences in favour of local
producers or unreasonable tendering processes that unfairly disadvantage foreign producers
from tendering on government contracts.2

Quantitative restrictions

The original framers of the GATT contemplated that the GATT would heavily constrain
most border restrictions on trade other than tariffs, so that border restrictions would
principally take the form of tariffs which could then be negotiated down over time. In
particular, Article XI of the GATT prohibits the use of quotas or import or export licences
(i.e. quantitative restrictions) on the importation or exportation of goods into or out of any
Member state. Quantitative restrictions on imports clearly protect domestic producers.
Less obviously, restrictions on exports may provide local producers for the domestic
market with privileged access to ‘captive’ inputs, or protect local processing plants if
exportation of raw materials is constrained. The theory behind Article XI was that if
quantitative border restrictions could be avoided, the greater transparency and
commensurability of tariffs relative to quantitative restrictions would make their reduction
through successive rounds of negotiation more tractable. However, Article XI was
markedly unsuccessful in this ambition, and increasingly so over time.
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Exceptions to Article XI

First of all, Article XI itself, until recently, contained a major exception for quantitative
restrictions on agricultural imports where these are maintained in order to protect domestic
supply management or agricultural marketing board schemes. Under the WTO Agreement
on Agriculture, these restrictions must be converted into tariff equivalents which in turn are
subject to minimum required levels of reduction over a six-year period. In addition, Article
XII permits the imposition of quantitative restrictions (albeit, by virtue of Article XIII, on a
non-discriminatory basis) if a country is facing serious balance of payments problems.
Article XVIII of the GATT also permits less developed countries (LDCs) to impose
quantitative restrictions either for balance of payments reasons or infant industry reasons
against a very relaxed set of criteria. Finally, a major defining characteristic of the rise of the
so-called New Protectionism has been the dramatic escalation in the use of quantitative
restrictions, typically negotiated on a bilateral basis under threat of unilateral action, and in
clear violation of either the letter or spirit of Article XI and Article XIX (relating to
safeguard actions, discussed below). These proliferating forms of quantitative restrictions
have occurred under the Multi-Fibre Arrangement (the MFA), and on a more ad hoc basis
through voluntary export restraint agreements (VEAs) or orderly marketing agreements
(OMAs) in sectors such as steel and automobiles. Under the WTO Agreement on Textiles
and Clothing, special restrictions on textile and clothing imports are subject to reduction
over specified time periods.

The safeguard provision

Under Article XIX (often referred to as the safeguards or escape clause), if as a result of
unforeseen developments and of the effect of obligations incurred by a Member under the
GATT, including tariff concessions, any product is being imported into the territory of that
Member in such increased quantities or under such conditions as to cause or threaten
serious injury to domestic producers of like products in that territory, the Member is
entitled to suspend or modify obligations or concessions on a temporary basis in order to
alleviate the injury. However, where safeguard action is taken, either in the form of
reinstatement of a tariff or the imposition of quantitative restrictions, it must be taken on a
non-discriminatory (i.e. non-selective) basis, and the Party taking such action must offer
compensation (in the form of offsetting trade concessions) acceptable to other Parties whose
trade is prejudiced by such action, failing which the latter may retaliate by imposing trade
restrictions of equivalent value on exports from the country invoking the safeguard clause.
Article XIX was initially envisaged as a kind of safety valve permitting Members to buy
temporary breathing-space to moderate adjustment costs when confronted with unexpected
surges of imports that were causing serious injury to domestic producers. However, the
requirements that action be taken on a non-discriminatory basis and be accompanied by
compensating concessions has rendered it an unattractive option for Members with import-
impacted sectors relative to bilateral arrangements like the MFA, VERs, and OMAs,
extracted under threat of unilateral action, principally through the imposition of
antidumping or countervailing duties or in the case of the USA unilateral action under
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section 301 of the Omnibus Trade and Competitiveness Act of 1988. Article XIX has been
substantially refined and elaborated in the WTO Agreement on Safeguards.

Trade remedy laws

Article VI of the GATT recognizes the right of Members to take unilateral action under
domestic trade laws where domestic industries are being materially injured because of
unfair foreign trading practices, specifically either dumping or subsidization.

Dumping occurs in its most typical form where foreign producers are selling goods into
another country’s market at prices below those which they would normally charge in their
home market (perhaps because they have a protected home market). Where this pricing
practice is causing material injury to domestic producers of like products, antidumping
duties in the amount of the difference between the export market price and the home
market price may be imposed on the imported goods. Many Members of the GATT have
enacted antidumping laws, and over the late 1970s and 1980s, such laws were invoked with
increasing frequency, especially by such countries as the USA, Canada, Australia, and the
EC. Article VI has now been amplified by an antidumping code initially negotiated during
the Kennedy Round and modestly revised in the course of the Tokyo and Uruguay Rounds.

In the case of countervailing duties, the complaint is not the private pricing practices of
foreign producers, but rather that foreign governments are unfairly subsidizing the
production of foreign exports, artificially advantaging them in importing countries’
markets. Where foreign government subsidization of foreign exports is causing material
injury to a domestic industry producing like products, domestic trade laws enacted in many
countries permit the unilateral imposition of countervailing duties on the subsidized imports
so as to offset or neutralize these foreign subsidies. Again, over the late 1970s and 1980s, as
a characteristic of the New Protectionism, countervailing duties, along with antidumping
duties, began to be more frequently invoked, although in the case of countervailing duties
almost exclusively by the USA. A special code on subsidies was initially negotiated during
the Tokyo Round and extensively revised during the Uruguay Round, partly with a view to
disciplining the invocation of countervailing duty laws and partly with a view to providing
an alternative multilateral dispute resolution track for adjudicating disputes over all forms
of subsidies that may have trade effects.

The issue of subsidies is one of the most sensitive and complex subjects in international
trade law. At one level, objections to subsidies are obvious, in that a subsidy can be devised
to replicate the effects of almost any tariff. For example, if country A agrees to reduce
tariffs on country B’s widget exports from 20% to 10%, and binds itself to this concession,
this concession can effectively be undermined by country A then providing subsidies to its
own domestic producers of widgets in the amount of 10% of production costs. Conversely,
if country A declines to negotiate a reduction of its 20% tariff on country B’s widget
exports, but country B seeks to undermine the reciprocal bargaining process contemplated
for tariff reductions under Article XVIII bis by unilaterally subsidizing its exports of widgets
into country A’s market in the amount of 10% of production costs, country A’s right to
elect which tariffs to bind itself to would be undermined. On the other hand, given that almost
all significant domestic policies of governments, e.g. investments in physical infrastructure,
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education, health, research and development, telecommunications, law and order, directly
or indirectly affect the pattern of economic activities that evolve in each country, and by
extension the pattern of international trade activities to which each country contributes, the
charge of unfair subsidization has no natural limits. A burgeoning political discourse has
emerged over the last few years surrounding the notion of ‘fair’ (or ‘unfair’) trade, or ‘level
playing fields’. Professor Jagdish Bhagwati has described the rise of fair trade discourse as
‘the truly greatest threat since the 1930s’ to the world trading system.3

Article XVI of the GATT requires a Member that grants or maintains any subsidy which
has the effect of increasing exports or reducing imports to notify the Members of the nature
and extent of the subsidization and its likely effects on trade, and where serious prejudice is
caused or threatened to the interests of any other Member to discuss with that Party the
possibility of terminating the subsidization. With respect to export subsidies, Article XVI
provides that where export subsidies are granted on a primary product, these should not
result in the exporting country gaining ‘more than an equitable share of world export trade
in that product’, relative to pre-existing shares. With respect to export subsidies on
nonprimary products, a number of signatories agreed to forsake these where such a subsidy
would result in export sales at lower prices than domestic sales. The new WTO Subsidies
Agreement attempts to provide much more precise definitions of prohibited, actionable,
and non-actionable subsidies.

For clarity of understanding, it is helpful to keep in mind a basic taxonomy of subsidy
scenarios. The first scenario is one where country A subsidizes its exports into country B’s
market. This is the scenario which has classically attracted the potential for countervailing
duties under Article VI and complementary domestic trade remedy laws. These subsidies
could relate exclusively to exports or to all domestic production, wherever consumed. The
second scenario is where country A subsidizes its exports into country C’s market, and in so
doing displaces country B’s exports from country C’s market. In this scenario, the
subsidized goods are not moving from country A to country B and thus cannot be countervailed
by country B, so that country B is remitted to a complaint under the WTO Subsidies
Agreement for resolution under the multilateral dispute resolution process. The third
subsidy scenario is the case where country A is subsidizing its domestic producers to service
principally country A’s own domestic market, and in so doing displaces country B’s exports
from country A’s market. Again, as in scenario two, the subsidized goods are not moving
from country A to country B so as to attract possible countervailing duties in country B, so
that country B is again remitted to the multilateral dispute resolution process.

The considerable, and apparently growing, attraction of antidumping and countervailing
duties for import-impacted sectors, relative to the safeguard regime contemplated by
Article XIX, reflects the fact that selective (i.e. discriminatory) action is permitted, no
compensation is required in the form of counterbalancing trade concessions, and the duties
are imposed automatically by administrative rather than political decision (unlike safeguard
actions which ultimately require executive political action, typically following discussions
and negotiations with affected foreign country governments).
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State trading enterprises

Under Article XVII of the GATT each Member undertakes that its state trading enterprises
shall, with respect to purchases or sales involving either imports or exports, act in a non-
discriminatory manner and make such purchases or sales solely in accordance with
commercial considerations. This provision does not apply to imports of products for
immediate or ultimate consumption in governmental use and not otherwise for resale.

This provision recognizes that state trading enterprises have the potential for distorting
international trade through explicit or implicit subsidy policies or artificial pricing
strategies. For example, a state enterprise selling into export markets may artificially
subsidize its exports. Conversely, a state enterprise in its purchasing policies may explicitly
or implicitly favour domestic producers over foreign producers of the same products.
Article XVII, in its initial conception, was principally addressed to a significant number of
state-owned enterprises or state-sanctioned monopolies that existed in the jurisdictions of
Members at the time of the formation of the GATT, even though these countries were
largely committed to market economies. Article XVII is not nearly as well equipped to
address the systemic problems of countries which are members of the GATT, or aspire to
be, that are predominantly centrally-planned or command economies, or which are in the
process (as with Eastern European countries and China) of transition from command to some
form of market economy. In these countries, because prices, input costs and wages have
traditionally been set by command or administrative fiat, determining, as is required by
Article XVII, whether a state enterprise is operating according to ‘commercial
considerations’ involves the intractable counterfactual exercise of determining what the
country in question would import or export if there were fully functioning markets.

In consequence, where in the past command economies have participated in the GATT,
they have done so on special terms that have involved either specific commitments to increase
imports from non-Communist countries, or have entailed expectations of partial
liberalization of the trade and payments system. Special arrangements of this nature have
applied in the case of Poland, Hungary and Romania, and to a much more limited extent to
the former Yugoslavia.4 As well, in many instances, Members have not granted full MFN
status to these countries despite their membership in the GATT, and the terms of accession
in the case of some of these command economies have permitted imposition of discriminatory
safeguards or quantitative restrictions, which were frequently invoked by European
Community countries in particular.

With the fall of the Communist bloc, the issue of normalizing the GATT/WTO
membership of the former command economies has come to the fore. As well, the question
of the admission of Russia and other former Soviet republics looms large, as does the
application for re-admission of Communist China, which continues to remain in many
important respects a command economy.

Less developed countries

‘Special and differential status’ is accorded to LDCs under the GATT both with respect to
actions which they are permitted to take and with respect to actions that developed
countries are expected to take towards them. Under Article XVIII, LDCs have been given
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broad latitude to impose restrictions on imports, typically through quantitative restrictions
such as quotas and licences, for balance of payments reasons or in order to foster infant
industries. Under Part IV of the GATT, added in 1964, Article XXXVI:8 provides that
developed Members do not expect reciprocity for commitments made by them in trade
negotiations to reduce or remove tariffs and other barriers to the trade of less developed
Contracting Parties. Article XXXVII in turn provides that developed countries commit
themselves to according high priority to the reduction and elimination of barriers to
products currently or potentially of particular export interest to less developed Members.
These latter provisions led to the introduction of the Generalized System of Preferences in
the early 1970s and the unilateral adoption of special preferences by industrial countries
with respect to some exports of less developed countries. The degree of success of either of
these two elements of the special and differential status accorded to LDCs under the GATT
will be the subject of a more detailed discussion in a later chapter.5 For the moment, it is
sufficient to note that with respect to the first element in this status i.e. authorization of
import substitution— infant industry promotion policies by LDCs—this reflects a debate
going back to John Stuart Mill about the case for protectionism in this context (discussed in
the previous chapter). The second element in the special and differential status, i.e. non-
reciprocal trade concessions by developed countries, raises the strategic question of
whether countries will find themselves willing to engage in unilateral trade liberalization,
and reflects the long-standing debate about the virtues of unilateral trade liberalization
relative to reciprocal trade liberalization.

General exceptions to GATT obligations

Under Article XX of the GATT, a number of dispensations from GATT obligations are
provided with respect to the adoption or enforcement by Members of measures, for
example, necessary to protect public morals; necessary to protect human or animal health
or life; necessary to secure compliance with laws or regulations which are not inconsistent
with the GATT; imposed for the protection of national treasures; necessary for the
conservation of exhaustible natural resources, provided that none of these measures are an
arbitrary or unjustifiable discrimination between countries where the same conditions prevail
or a disguised restriction on international trade.6 Under Article XXI of the GATT, various
national security exceptions are provided for that permit a Member to take any action which
it considers necessary for the protection of its essential security interests relating to
fissionable materials and traffic in arms and munitions or which reflect the exigencies of war
or other emergency in international relations.7 Article XXV(5) provides that in exceptional
circumstances not otherwise provided for in the Agreement, the Members may waive an
obligation imposed on a Member by the GATT, provided that any such decision is approved
by a two-thirds majority of the votes cast and such majority comprises more than half of the
Members. This waiver provision has been invoked on a number of important occasions,
including the 1955 US agricultural waiver application and the Canada-USA Auto Pact in
1965.
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The federal state clause

International trade commitments entered into by federal states, such as the USA, Canada,
Australia and Germany, have posed a problem in international trade law to the extent that
commitments made by national levels of government do not constitutionally bind sub-
national levels of government who, of course, are not direct signatories of the GATT.
Unitary states see this problem as resulting in an unfair form of asymmetry in reciprocal
commitments. Article XXIV(12) of the GATT provides that ‘each Member shall take such
reasonable measures as may be available to it to ensure observance of the provisions of this
Agreement by the regional and local governments within its territories’. This clause has
been strictly interpreted in several GATT panel decisions and provides very limited grounds
for excuse for non-compliance by federal states.8

The governance of the WTO

With the failure of the initial Members to endorse the creation of the International Trade
Organization and the Havana Charter of which it was part, the GATT, at least on its
surface. was born with an anaemic institutional structure relative to many other
international organizations, such as the International Monetary Fund and the World Bank.
These other organizations were seen as largely addressing and coordinating matters of
external economic and political relations, while the ITO and Havana Charter were
perceived as possessing the potential for constraining many domestic policies and hence
trenching, to a greater extent, upon domestic political sovereignty. However, over the
course of time, various institutional structures have evolved that appear to have proven
reasonably serviceable in the management of the GATT. A committee of ministers of trade
from member countries met periodically, although most of the effective collective decision
making was channelled through the Council of Representatives, which met on a monthly
basis in Geneva, and was drawn from permanent GATT delegations of member countries,
with each country entitled to one vote. The Council of Representatives was supplemented
by various specialized committees and working parties as well as dispute resolution panels
appointed on an ad hoc, case-by-case basis. The full-time staff of the GATT/WTO is headed
by a Director-General, appointed on a fixed-term basis by consensus of the Contracting
Parties. Article XXV(4) of the GATT provides that decisions of the Members shall be taken
by a majority of the votes cast, except as otherwise provided for in the Agreement. Article
XXXIII provides for the accession of new members, if supported by a vote of a two-thirds
majority of all Members. Article XXX provides for amendments to the GATT provisions.
Part I of the Agreement containing the Most Favoured Nation principle and the principle of
tariff bindings may only be amended by consent of all the Members. Other provisions may
be amended by a two-thirds majority of all the Members, but amendments become binding
only with respect to those Members which accept the amendment. Under the WTO
Agreement establishing the World Trade Organization (WTO), governance of the GATT will
henceforth be vested in the WTO. A Ministerial Conference composed of representatives
of all Members must meet at least every two years. Otherwise governance issues are vested
in the General Council of the WTO (replacing the Council of Representatives), which also
functions as the Dispute Settlement Body and the Trade Policy Review Body.
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With respect to specific disputes between Members (which it must be emphasized are
governments, not private parties), Article XXII imposes an obligation on Members to
accord sympathetic consideration to complaints of other Parties and adequate opportunity
for consultation with such Parties. If the Members cannot resolve a dispute through mutual
discussions, perhaps assisted by mediation of a third Party, including the Director-General
of the GATT or his or her staff, the dispute must then be addressed within the framework
of Article XXIII, now substantially elaborated in the WTO Understanding on Rules and
Procedures Governing the Settlement of Disputes. Under this Article, if a Member
considers that any benefit accruing to it directly or indirectly under the GATT is being
‘nullified or impaired’ by a policy or practice of another Member, the complaining Party
can refer its complaint to the Members as a group, previously the Council of
Representatives, now the General Council of the WTO acting as the Dispute Settlement
Body, which will appoint a panel to investigate the complaint and make recommendations
to the Council for resolution of the dispute. Panels typically comprise three individuals,
drawn from countries other than the disputing Parties, who meet privately with the
disputing Parties to ascertain the facts and the precise nature of the allegations, and if
possible to resolve the dispute informally. If this is not possible, the panel will make
recommendations to the Council as to the resolution of the matter. The Council makes
decisions on panel recommendations on a consensus basis, previously requiring consensus in
favour of adoption of a panel’s recommendations but now under the Uruguay Round
Dispute Settlement Understanding requiring consensus in favour of rejection. Under the
Understanding, panel decisions may now be appealed on matters of law to a standing
Appellate Body of seven members. If the Council adopts the recommendations of a panel or
the Appellate Body then a Member is required to modify or withdraw its policy or practice
to bring itself into conformity with the Council’s decision. If it fails to do so, the Council
will authorize retaliatory action by the aggrieved Party in the form of a suspension of trade
concessions or other obligations the level of which is subject to arbitration. Despite a
number of seemingly odd features of this dispute resolution process, when compared with
domestic adjudication processes, in many respects it has worked reasonably well over the
years. Several hundred complaints have been investigated since the inception of the GATT,
as we will see in a later chapter. There has been a high compliance rate with panel
recommendations and Council decisions, despite the hypothetical ability of losing Parties
(until recently) to veto adoption of adverse panel recommendations. Moreover, aggrieved
Parties have almost never found it expedient to pursue retaliatory action against Parties
adversely affected by panel or Council decisions.

The WTO Agreements

On 19 December 1993, member countries of the GATT reached a wide-ranging and
ambitious agreement on many trade and related issues, after seven years of negotiations
which were characterized by much higher levels of rancour and controversy than any of the
previous MTN rounds. While the Uruguay Round seemed often at the point of collapse, the
WTO Agreement eventually reached signifies substantial progress on a number of important
issues.

36 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



With respect to goods, substantial average cuts in tariffs (of about 38%) were agreed to.
In the case of agricultural products—a key area of controversy—the EU agreed to
significant cuts over time in export subsidies, and member countries agreed to abandon
quantitative restrictions, which are to be replaced by tariffs. In the case of textiles and
clothing, the MFA will be dismantled by degrees, with quantitative restrictions again being
replaced by tariffs, which are to be reduced over time. The general safeguard regime has
been significantly strengthened by adoption of firm time limits for safeguard measures and
for limiting their re-adop-tion; by improving multilateral notification and surveillance; and
by requiring existing grey-area measures to be brought into compliance with the new
regime or terminated. A modestly revised Antidumping Agreement was also negotiated,
as well as a much more fully elaborated Subsidies Agreement. A revised Government
Procurement Agreement provides for somewhat greater coverage of government
contracting than the Tokyo Round Code. With respect to intellectual property, substantial
harmonization of domestic intellectual property regimes around norms prevailing in the
USA and a number of other industrialized countries was agreed to.

With respect to international trade in services, a process for liberalization on a sector-by-
sector basis, governed by a conditional MFN principle and an effects-based National
Treatment principle, has been set in motion. With respect to trade-related investment
measures, local sourcing and minimum export requirements as conditions for approval of
foreign investments have been prohibited.

With respect to the governance of the GATT, a World Trade Organization (WTO), now
with about 130 members, has been created to oversee an integrated dispute settlement
regime and to undertake a pro-active trade policy surveillance role. In addition,
membership of the WTO now entails commitment to most of the GATT Agreements,
which are fully integrated into the GATT/WTO, and no longer operate on a conditional
MFN basis as was the case with most of the Tokyo Round Codes where only signatories to
each code were subject to its obligations and entitled to its benefits.

We pursue many of these issues in much greater detail later in this book. Recent
estimates suggest that by the year 2002, net world welfare may be around $US270 billion
higher, in current prices, than it would be if current levels of protection remained
unchanged.9

THE CANADA-US FREE TRADE AGREEMENT10 AND THE
NORTH AMERICAN FREE TRADE AGREEMENT11

History

Canada and the USA have a long and tangled history of bilateral arrangements pertaining to
trade. In 1854, both countries agreed to the Reciprocity Treaty which provided for a measure
of free trade with respect to Canadian exports of certain agricultural products and natural
resources and US access to Canadian inshore fisheries. However, the USA cancelled this
treaty in 1865, in part reflecting US unhappiness with what was perceived to be Canadian
complicity with Britain in supporting the Confederacy side in the US Civil War, and in part
due to opposition by US agricultural interests. In 1879, Prime Minister John A.MacDonald
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announced the National Policy, which entailed high levels of tariff protection for
manufacturers in central Canada, complemented by policies to support western settlement
and provide markets for their goods, which would be encouraged through the development
of a national transportation system. In 1911, the Liberal government led by Sir Wilfred
Laurier negotiated a tentative free trade agreement with the USA, partly in response to
dissatisfaction by farmers in western Canada with the high cost of domestically produced
farm implements. However, debate in Parliament forced Laurier to call an election, during
which the Conservatives strongly opposed a free trade agreement with the USA on the
grounds that this would mean increased competition for Canadian farmers because of the
earlier US growing season, would jeopardize relations with Britain, and would risk import-
ing US economic difficulties such as unemployment. The Liberals lost the election, and the
agreement was never ratified. In 1934, the US Congress, on the initiative of President
Roosevelt, enacted the Reciprocal Trade Agreements Act and in 1935 pursuant to this Act a
Canada-US bilateral agreement was negotiated which provided for some modest tariff
reductions. In 1948, Canadian and American negotiators negotiated a comprehensive
bilateral free trade agreement, but Prime Minister William Lyon Mackenzie King refused to
present the agreement to Parliament for adoption on the grounds that it would lead
ultimately to union with the USA and separation from Britain. In 1965, Canada and the USA
negotiated the Auto Pact which provided for conditional duty-free trade between Canada
and the USA in original equipment, auto parts, accessories, and most types of motor
vehicles. In a 1975 report entitled Looking Outward, the Economic Council of Canada
proposed that Canada contemplate substantial trade liberalization with the USA. In 1978,
the Senate Committee on Foreign Affairs took a similar position. In 1983, the Department
of External Affairs issued a Review of Foreign Trade Policy that recommended that the
government consider the advisability of sectoral free trade with the USA in urban transport
equipment, textiles, agricultural equipment and petro-chemicals. In 1986, the Macdonald
Royal Commission on the Economic Union and Development Prospects for Canada, after
undertaking an extensive review of all of Canada’s trade policy options, strongly
recommended that Canada initiate negotiations with the USA to secure a comprehensive
bilateral trade agreement. The Mulroney Conservative government, which was elected in
1984, initiated formal negotiations with the USA in 1986. Negotiations culminated in the
Canada-US Free Trade Agreement, which was signed by the two countries on 2 January
1988 and subsequently ratified by the legislative bodies in both countries. As of 1988, two-
thirds of Canada’s imports came from the USA and three-quarters of its exports went to the
USA. About one-fifth of US imports came from Canada and one-quarter of US exports
went to Canada. The trading relationship between Canada and the USA is the largest
bilateral trading relationship in the world. Subsequent to the FTA, the USA, Canada, and
Mexico entered into negotiations to secure a North American Free Trade Agreement
(NAFTA), in large part by extending the Canada-US FTA to Mexico. An agreement was
reached on 12 August, 1992 and subsequently ratified in all three countries. Because the
FTA is now largely subsumed in NAFTA, we will confine our overview to the latter.
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Trade in goods

Most tariffs between the three countries will be eliminated over a ten-year period, in
accordance with stipulated phase-out schedules, with a few products subject to a fif-teen-
year transition period. Most import and export restrictions, in particular quotas and import
licences, will be eliminated (Chapter 3, Article 300) Canada-US bilateral tariffs will
continue to be phased out under the ten-year FTA schedule. Only goods originating within
the three countries are entitled to the benefit of the reduced tariffs provided for by NAFTA.
Goods which are wholly obtained in either or both countries are deemed to originate in the
country from which they are exported and are entitled to NAFTA treatment (Article 401).
Goods incorporating third-country materials generally qualify for NAFTA treatment
provided sufficient processing has occurred to cause them to have a tariff classification
different from that of the component materials (Article 402). In other cases, special content
rules must be satisfied as well (Article 402). With respect to automobiles, 62.5% of NAFTA
content (rather than 50% under the FTA) is required to qualify for preferential treatment
(Article 403). Textiles and clothing must be produced from yarn spun in North America or
from fabric made from North American fibres to qual-ify for preferential treatment
(Chapter 4). There are some limited exceptions to these latter rules, through a system of
Tariff Rate Quotas (TRQs), which allows preferential treatment of exports up to agreed
ceilings even though the rules of origin are not met. The textile and clothing provisions of
the Agreement also contain a safeguard mechanism that enables a country to impose trade
restrictions to provide temporary relief during a transition period. These rules of origin in
the auto, textile and clothing sectors have particular potential for creating trade diversion
rather than trade expansion and seem principally motivated by concerns that in their
absence foreign firms would use Mexico, with its low-cost labour, as a platform to access the
North American market.

With respect to agriculture, the USA and Mexico have agreed to eliminate all non-tariff
barriers to trade and to convert these to tariffs or TRQs (Chapter 7, Section A). Tariffs will
be eliminated over ten years. Extended periods are provided in the case of sensitive
products, such as corn and dry bean exports to Mexico, and orange juice and sugar exports
to the USA. Canada and Mexico have agreed to remove all tariff and non-tariff barriers to
agricultural trade over ten years except with respect to dairy products, poultry, eggs and
sugar. The agricultural provisions also contain a special safeguard provision that can be
invoked during the first ten years of the Agreement if imports exceed specified trigger
levels. The use of export subsidies for agricultural products is generally discouraged and
permitted only in response to non-NAFTA country subsidies, but subject even in this event
to consultation procedures. The Agreement provides for efforts at harmonization of grade
and quality standards with respect to agricultural products.

Sanitary and phytosanitary (SPS) measures maintained or introduced by any NAFTA
country are permitted provided they are not a disguised form of trade restriction and are
based on scientific principles and a risk assessment (Chapter 7, Section B). Where possible,
NAFTA countries commit themselves to using relevant international standards and to
working towards equivalent SPS measures without reducing any country’s chosen level of
protection of human, animal or plant life or health.
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NAFTA members can undertake safeguard action during the transition period if NAFTA
imports are a substantial cause or threat of serious injury to a domestic industry (Chapter 8,
Article 801). Safeguard action can only be taken once and for a maximum period of three
years (Article 801(21)). Where a country takes a multilateral (GATT) safeguard action,
NAFTA partners must be excluded unless their exports account for a substantial share of
total imports (among the top five suppliers) and contribute importantly to the serious injury
or threat thereof (Article 802).

With respect to government procurement (Chapter 10), National Treatment obligations
are adopted with respect to purchases by government departments or agencies over $US50,
000 of goods and services and over $US6.5 million for construction services. With respect
to federal government enterprises, these thresholds are raised to $US250,000 and $US8
million respectively. Each country must give sufficient notice of procurement opportunities
to ensure equal competitive conditions for foreign and domestic firms and must set up bid-
challenge procedures to enable suppliers to challenge awards.

Trade in services

With respect to trade in services (Chapter 12), both the National Treatment and Most
Favoured Nation principles are adopted. The Agreement provides that no local presence is
required to provide covered services. A number of reservations have been entered with
respect to which services are covered and which are not (Article 1206). With respect to
licensing and certification of professionals, the Agreement provides that entry requirements
should be related solely to competence and endorses a qualified mutual recognition
principle (Article 1210). In the case of land transportation services, the Agreement provides
for full access to each country’s rail services and for cross-border provision of bus and
trucking services to be phased in over a transitional period (Annex 1212). Coastal shipping
restrictions are exempted from the Agreement.

The Agreement recognizes the right of establishment with respect to banking, insurance,
securities, and other financial services, and adopts the National Treatment and Most
Favoured Nation principles with respect to financial services generally (Chapter 14).
Canada commits itself to extending the FTA exemption from the 25% non-resident
ownership restriction rule in the case of the US to Mexico and the exemption from the
aggregate asset ceiling on foreign banks operating in Canada. Mexico has reserved the right
to impose aggregrate and individual market share limits on foreign firms in the financial
services sector during a transitional period expiring in the year 2000.

North American firms will have access to and use of public telecommunications
networks and services on a reasonable, non-discriminatory basis including the right to have
private lines, attach terminal equipment, interconnect private circuits, perform switching,
signalling and processing functions, use operating protocols of the user’s choice, and
operate private intracorporate communications systems (Chapter 13). Foreign ownership
restrictions in voice-mail and other value-added services will be eliminated.

Cross-border trade with Mexico in electricity and natural gas is substantially liberalized
under NAFTA although the Mexican state monopoly in the petroleum industry is
maintained (although relaxed with respect to some petrochemicals). Energy trade between
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Canada and the US continues to be governed by the FTA. Exceptions to free trade in energy
relate to conservation, price stabilization and natural security, but permitted restrictions
must be applied on a proportional sharing basis between the two countries so as to ensure
that the burden of restrictions applies equally to domestic and foreign markets (Chapter 6).

The Agreement also provides for a regime of temporary entry visas for business persons
into any NAFTA country (Chapter 16).

Investment

Both the National Treatment and Most Favoured Nation principles are adopted
(Chapter 11). Performance requirements of foreign investors are generally prohibited
(Article 1106). A NAFTA member may not expropriate investments of a NAFTA investor
except for a public purpose and on payment of compensation reflecting fair market value
(Article 1110). Canada has reserved the right to continue reviewing foreign investments
above a $150 million threshold as provided in the FTA. Mexico is committed to raising its
foreign investment review threshold to $150 million within ten years of the implementation
of the Agreement. The investment provisions do not apply to Mexico’s petroleum, basic
telecommunications and rail sectors, US airlines and radio communications, or Canada’s
cultural industries. The Agreement also provides that no NAFTA country should lower its
environmental standards in order to attract investment (Article 1114). NAFTA investors
may seek binding arbitral determinations in international fora for violations of these
investment obligations and enforce arbitral awards in domestic courts (Chapter 11, Section
B).

Competition policy, monopolies, and state enterprises

Each country commits itself to maintaining laws regulating anti-competitive practices
(Chapter 15). In the case of state enterprises and domestic monopolies, these enterprises
are not to discriminate against other NAFTA firms or citizens in buying or selling goods and
services and are to follow normal commercial considerations in their contractual activities
(Article 1502). A tri-lateral committee is to be created to review the relationship between
competition laws and trade matters, including presumably trade remedy laws (Article
1504). A side-accord initiated by Canada commits the member countries to attempting to
negotiate new legal regimes on dumping, subsidies and countervailing duties within two
years of the implementation of the Agreement.

Intellectual property

The Agreement has an extensive set of provisions protecting patent, copyright and
trademark rights, and providing for their effective enforcement (Chapter 17). These
provisions largely parallel the Uruguay Round Agreement on Trade-Related Aspects of
Intellectual Property Rights. 
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Institutional arrangements

The Agreement provides for the creation of a NAFTA Trade Commission, to be supported
by a full-time Secretariat, and complemented by various working groups and committees
(Chapter 20). Dispute resolution provisions provide that five person binational panels
drawn from a roster of nominees from the disputing countries will adjudicate on disputes
between two member countries of the NAFTA, with the third member reserving the option
of either participating in the proceedings or pursuing its own process of consultation and
dispute resolution (Chapter 20, Section B). In an interesting innovation, disputing countries
must select panellists from the other disputing country’s roster of nominees (Article 2011).
Where complaint procedures are open to a NAFTA country either under the GATT or
NAFTA, a complainant country is entitled to choose which regime it pursues its complaint
under, except where the complaint pertains to health, safety, or environmental standards,
where the respondent country can insist on dispute resolution under NAFTA (Article
2005). In this event, the Agreement provides for the creation of scientific boards to provide
expert evidence to panels adjudicating on questions pertaining to health, safety and
environmental standards.

The NAFTA renders permanent a special and temporary dispute resolution process
initially adopted under the FTA for antidumping and countervailing duty determinations.
Under this mechanism, if an aggrieved party so demands, binational panels must be struck
as an alternative to pursuing domestic judicial review processes. These binational panels,
which comprise five experts drawn from permanent lists provided by each Party (two from
each Party with agreement normally on a fifth person as chairperson) may only review final
antidumping and countervailing duty determinations for consistency with applicable
domestic laws using domestic standards of judicial review. The decision of a panel is binding
on the Parties, except for a limited right to request a three-person ‘Extraordinary
Challenge’ committee comprising judges or former judges from the countries in dispute to
review a panel’s decision. Each Party reserves the right to change or modify its antidumping
or countervailing laws, provided that any such amendment expressly stipulates that it shall
apply to goods from the other Party. Where a Party complains that such an amendment is
inconsistent with the other Party’s obligations under the GATT or with the object and
purpose of the NAFTA, that Party may request that the amendment be referred to a panel
for a declaratory opinion. Where the declaratory opinion reports an inconsistency, the
Parties must consult and seek a mutually satisfactory solution to the dispute, including
remedial legislation with respect to the statute of the amending Party. If remedial legislation
is not enacted within nine months from the end of the ninety day consultation period
provided for and no other agreement has been reached, the complaining Party may take
comparable executive or equivalent legislative action, or terminate the Agreement with
regard to the amending Party on sixty days written notice. 

Side-Accords on environmental and labour standards

Subsequent to the negotiation of NAFTA, the current US Administration initiated a further
set of negotiations on environmental and labour standards that resulted in trilateral side-
accords that set up an elaborate institutional machinery to ensure that existing
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environmental and labour laws in each of the three countries are effectively enforced with
the possibility of fines and trade sanctions as penalties for non-com-pliance. The Accords
also provide for consultative mechanisms designed to promote a higher degree of
harmonization of standards in these areas in the future.

THE FRAMEWORK OF ECONOMIC INTEGRATION IN THE
EUROPEAN UNION12

The ‘constitution’ of the European Union is the Treaty Establishing the European
Community, usually known as the Treaty of Rome.13 It states the basic principles of
economic union—the free movement of goods, persons, services and capital— and
contains a variety of legal norms aimed at the realization of these freedoms. In addition to
provisions that prohibit customs duties on imports from Member States, quantitative
restrictions and ‘equivalent measures’ are prohibited (Article 30), as are certain State aids to
industry.

The Treaty imposes constraints on Member States’ governments as well as positive
obligations. However, even where the Treaty of Rome requires further positive action in
the form of cooperation between governments, this is much more than a ‘best efforts’
exhortation. In fact, it has the status of a juridical norm. To those accustomed to Anglo-
American understandings about the rule of law, this may at first appear strange, since court
action is not generally available to force governments to bring into being positive policy
measures. It is, however, quite consistent with continental notions of constitutional law as
embodying the most general legal norms. In turn, these norms are realized by the enactment
of secondary or derivative norms by governments.

The Treaty of Rome establishes several institutional mechanisms for the realization of the
Treaty norms: the European Court of Justice, the European Commission, The Council of
Ministers, and the European Parliament. Some of the most important ‘economic union’
provisions in the Treaty of Rome are directly enforceable by the European Court. These
provisions allow a citizen (or in some instances a corporation) in a Member State to apply to
the judiciary for relief against measures of her own or another State that violate provisions of
the Treaty. While direct enforceability or application only exists for some aspects of the
Treaty, it has been of major importance in making the Union something more than a
common market or customs union. In most free-trade agreements, dispute settlement is an
intergovernmental process. As a result, dispute settlement has strong political and
diplomatic dimensions. By contrast, the Treaty of Rome is in significant respects a
supranational constitution, conferring enforceable legal rights on Union citizens.14 

In addition, a number of provisions of the Treaty are explicitly enforceable by the
European Commission, but are subject to judicial review. This is, in particular, the case
with competition policy and the prohibition of State aids (subsidies) that distort competition
within the Union. The Commission is an executive body consisting of representatives
appointed from the Member States, but obliged by law to act inde-pendently of their
governments. Appointments must be acceptable to all Member States.15 The Commission
must always have a Member from each Member State. Decisions of the Commission must
be approved by a simple majority of the Members. In practice, where the Commission
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makes decisions in individual cases with respect to subsidization, it depends to a large
degree on the advice of an extensive technical staff of European civil servants. Decisions of
the Commission (e.g. with respect to State aids) are directly binding on Member States, and
do not require any kind of political approval or agreement by the governments of the
Member States of the Union. The Member States may, however, by unanimous vote,
override Commission decisions on some matters (a highly unlikely occurrence).

With respect to harmonization of regulatory regimes through European law, the
Commission plays a crucial role, as does the Council of Ministers. The Council consists of
political representatives from all major States. It makes regulations and directives upon the
initiative of the Commission. Regulations are directly binding in the legal systems of the
Member States, whereas implementation of directives requires domestic legislation.
Directives allow some flexibility as to the manner of implementation by the Member States,
although there is some protection against the possibility that Member States will mis-
implement or fail to implement them. In those circumstances, the directive may become
directly enforceable in court, even by an individual or firm, if it is adequately specific to
give rise to a determinate legal meaning.16 In addition, the Commission or another Member
State can take a recalcitrant Member State to the European Court to force it to implement a
directive properly. In some instances, the key issue will be whether the domestic
implementing legislation adequately achieves the result intended by the directive. The
important point is that directives are not just exhortations to national political authorities to
make ‘best efforts’, but are legally binding with respect to result. Whether a given domestic
statute achieves a result is a question of law to be determined by independent supranational
authorities.

Directives generally no longer require unanimous approval of the Council. Instead,
under the Single European Act of 1986 they must be endorsed by a weighted majority of
votes. Harmonization through unanimous agreement between Member States proved to be
difficult because of hold-out problems.17

We now turn to the substantive law and policy of economic integration developed in the
European Union.

Non-discrimination norms vs legitimate public purposes

The major legal limits to non-tariff barriers with respect to goods are contained in Articles
30 and 34 of the Treaty of Rome. They prohibit quantitative restrictions and ‘all measures
having equivalent effect’ on imports and exports. Article 36, in turn, provides specific
derogations from these strictures, based on public objectives related to health and safety,
public security, and morality, and protection of national cultural treasures, among others.18

Early in the jurisprudence of the Union, the scope of Articles 30 and 34 was extended
beyond measures that discriminated on their face against non-domestic products to those
that merely had a disparate impact. Thus, in the Cassis de Dijon case,19 the Court held that a
German law that prohibited the sale of the liqueur cassis with less than 25% alcohol content
violated Article 30. It prevented the import of French cassis which had an alcohol content
below 20%. However, the Court suggested that where measures are not facially
discriminatory but have a disparate impact, they may be saved if they are ‘necessary in order
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to satisfy mandatory requirements relating in particular to the effectiveness of fiscal
supervision, the protection of public health, the fairness of commercial transactions, and the
defence of the consumer’.

The test of necessity involves consideration of whether alternative measures less
restrictive of intra-Union trade might adequately satisfy the ‘mandatory requirements’ at
issue.20 Hence, if the goal was to ensure that consumers were not misled by an assumption
about the domestic product into thinking that the foreign product contained an equivalent
amount of alcohol, labelling requirements would suffice. Similarly, in the German Beer
Standards21 case, the Court impugned a German law which required any product sold with
the label ‘Beer’ in Germany to meet German purity standards. The Court reasoned that
consumers could be informed of the difference between beers through the use of
appropriate labelling requirements. Where health risks are claimed as a basis for content
requirements that affect trade, and where less stringent requirements are in place elsewhere
in the Union, the Court places some burden on the defendant Member State to produce
empirical evidence of the risks in question.

State aids

State aids (e.g. subsidies) are dealt with under a separate regime from that in Articles 30,
34, and 36 of the Treaty of Rome. The major relevant provision is Article 92(1) which
prohibits ‘any aid granted by a Member State or through State resources in any form
whatsoever which distorts or threatens to distort competition by favouring certain
undertakings, in so far as it affects trade between Member States’. Certain derogations are
permitted, including aid to underdeveloped areas or ‘to remedy a serious disturbance in the
economy of a Member State’.22 Article 93 makes the Commission responsible for
monitoring and enforcement of the State aid prohibitions. A process is mandated whereby
the Commission must be informed of any new State aid with sufficient advance notice to
determine its consistency with the Treaty. Moreover, it can require the subsidizing State to
amend an aid programme to make it consistent with the Treaty. Decisions of the
Commission are reviewable by the Court.

Placing review of State aid measures in the hands of the Commission reflects the fact that
an approach which emphasizes legal rules and orders is unsuited to dealing with the complex
subsidy and tax incentive programmes of advanced, mixed economies. Furthermore, the
procedure of ex ante review takes into account the possible consequences for workers and
other relatively vulnerable constituencies if an existing aid programme were suddenly to be
declared invalid by the court. Finally, the possibility of adjustment to an aid programme
through negotiation between the Commission and the granting State allows for positive-sum
solutions. These solutions might involve, for instance, aid earmarked to sustain existing
production in a surplus capacity sector being modified in the direction of a managed exit
approach.
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HARMONIZATION

The ‘Europe 1992’ initiative, launched by the coming into force of the Single European Act
in 1987, reflects the fundamental recognition that negative constraints on government
actions that impede economic mobility are far from sufficient to achieve economic union.
An essential thrust of the move towards completion of the internal market by 1992 is the
harmonization of regulatory regimes with respect to financial services, securities, insurance,
company law, and telecommunications, as well as community-wide standards with respect
to product safety, technical specifications, etc. The importance of this aspect of 1992 is
well-illustrated by Hufbauer:

Differing national technical and licensing regimes create major obstacles to a unified
market. These are by far the most important barriers, for they restrict market entry
on a grand scale. The Cecchini Report puts the gains from opening market entry, and
the consequent intensification of competition and realization of scale economies, at
about $240 billion. Differing product standards and certification procedures hamper
the Europe-wide acceptance of numerous items ranging from autos to
pharmaceuticals to packaged cereals.23

Various initiatives of the harmonization enterprise being undertaken appear to fall short of
truly centralized regulation, in that they involve a process of mutual or reciprocal
recognition. In this process, if a firm, product or service complies with domestic regulatory
requirements in the Member State which is its ‘home’, it is allowed into the market of
other Member States without being subject to further or different regulatory requirements
by the other States. While this approach allows regulatory control to be retained at the
level of Member States, a sine qua non is the setting of minimum, community-wide
standards for regulation. Depending on the area, this can entail quite detailed Community-
level regulatory requirements. Moreover, as disputes or concerns emerge whereby the
receiving State is dissatisfied with the degree of regulatory protection afforded by the ‘home
country’ regime, an on-going institutional mechanism exists to promulgate new or better
defined Community-level standards or rules. The endpoint of the process of mutual
recognition may indeed be detailed, unified regulation. This is consistent with the fact that
mutual recognition was regarded as a means of speeding up harmonization by generating,
from the bottom up, the requirements of harmonization rather than engaging in predicting
all the requirements of a uniform regulatory regime.

The Maastricht Treaty and the Treaty of Amsterdam

The Treaty on European Union,24 better known as the Maastricht Treaty, was signed by
the heads of government of the European Union in February 1992 and has now been ratified
by all Member States. It is intended as a blueprint for a fundamental deepening of European
integration. Undoubtedly the most radical and ambitious aspect of Maastricht is the
framework for creation of a single European currency by the end of this century, to replace
national currencies of the Member States, including the establishment of a European
Central Bank (ECB). The plan for European Monetary Union envisages as a prerequisite for
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a single currency the alignment of macroeconomic policies of Member States, including the
achievement of price stability (low inflation) and the elimination of excessive budget deficits
(Article 109j).

As well, the Maastricht Treaty calls for the creation of a common European foreign and
security policy (Title V). Where the Council takes a common position on foreign policy,
individual Member States are to be bound by it in their own conduct (Title V, Article J.2).
However, this requirement is of limited significance, since unanimity is required for
Council decisions on foreign policy (Article J.8.2).

Another important feature of Maastricht is a strengthening of the social agenda of the
Union, with the Council being given the explicit mandate to adopt directives binding on
Member States with respect to working conditions, occupational health and safety, and
equality in employment. Importantly, qualified majority voting is to apply with respect to
adoption of these directives by the Council (Protocol on Social Policy, Article 2.2).
However, with respect to social security, protection of workers in the case of termination of
employment, and the work conditions of Gastarbeiter the unanimity rule will apply (Article
2.3).

As well, the Treaty would establish immigration policy (i.e. with respect to immigration
into Community countries from outside the EC) as a matter of common interest, with
measures implementing joint action on these matters to be adopted by the Council according
to the qualified majority voting rule (Title VI, Articles K.1, K.3).

Finally, the Maastricht Treaty envisages a number of institutional changes that address
(albeit in a rather modest way) concerns about the Union’s ‘democratic deficit’. An Office
of Ombudsman is to be established under the aegis of the European Parliament to address
citizen complaints about ‘maladministration’ by non-judicial Union institutions and officials
(Article 138(e)). Also, the Parliament is given a specific mandate to be pro-active—it can
request the Commission to submit a proposal to it on any matter where Union action is
required to implement the Treaty. In addition, the number of matters on which co-decision
(i.e. approval by the European Parliament) is required, as opposed to mere consultation
between the Commission and the Council, has been somewhat expanded.25

A number of obstacles have emerged to implementing the Maastricht Treaty. First of all,
Britain only agreed to Maastricht on condition that it was able to opt out of the social policy
and monetary union provisions of the Treaty. Particularly on the single currency and
monetary union, this opt out represented a calculated wager that a more pro-European
stance would emerge in Britain, and the opt out would thus be temporary.

Perhaps more importantly, the virtual collapse of the existing arrangements for
coordination of exchange rates within the European Union (the EMS, European Monetary
System)26 in the autumn of 1992 and the summer of 1993, in the presence of over-heated
speculative market activity anticipating currency realignments, cast a shadow on the
capacity to move forward with much more radical plans for monetary integration. While
some supporters of European Monetary Union saw these crises in the EMS as reinforcing
the logic of moving to a single currency in order to eliminate exchange rate instability,
many observers have viewed the crises as suggesting that the political pressures on
individual countries to adopt different monetary policies remained too great to allow the
degree of common macroeconomic policy discipline needed to sustain fixed exchange rates,
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let alone a single currency.27 In fact, Monetary Union is proceeding, as discussed in the
chapters on Trade, Exchange Rates, and The Balance of Payments.

Furthermore, the initial rejection of the Maastricht Treaty in a referendum in Denmark
in the Spring of 1992, and its near rejection in a French referendum in September 1992,28 have
slowed the pace of ratification, although the Union authorities seem determined to find a
way around these setbacks. For instance, a set of modifications and qualifications with
respect to Denmark’s obligations under Maastricht eventually succeeded in securing
Denmark’s ratification of the Treaty. But the populist backlash against deepening of
European integration has led to sober second thoughts in European political circles more
generally about the appropriate pace of deepening. One range of concerns that deserves
noting is that the provisions respecting immigration policy in the Maastricht Treaty have
served as a flashpoint for rejection by the right and far-right in a number of European
countries, most notably France and Germany, where immigration is already an extremely
sensitive political issue. Some commentators worry that the possibility of loss of national
control over immigration policies raised by Maastricht might serve to fuel growing anti-
immigrant and racist sentiment in some EC Member States.29

It should be emphasized that while Maastricht has become the main focus for public anti-
Union sentiment, less public attention has been paid to the increasing activism of the
European Commission and Council in implementing the Europe 1992 agenda of
harmonization of regulations and standards in many important areas of economic activity
(e.g. financial services). An increasing number of harmonization measures, in matters such
as product standards and environmental control, are being justified as necessary for the
completion of the internal market. The principle of subsidiarity, as explicitly recognized in
the Maastricht Treaty, is that the Union should only act where ‘the objectives of the
proposed action cannot be sufficiently achieved by the member states’ (Article 3b).
However, this principle is only to apply to matters that do not fall within the ‘exclusive
competence’ of the Union, and therefore does not limit the scope of Union action with
respect to completion of the internal market.

The Treaty of Amsterdam (signed in October 1997) provides mechanisms to allow sub-
groups of members of the EU to conclude agreements among themselves and also contains
some measures to deal with the ‘democratic deficit’, including an expansion of the co-
decision role of the European Parliament. The Treaty also incorporates the Schengen
Agreement, whereby all EU members except the UK and Ireland eliminated their border
controls within their common area (the UK and Ireland may continue to impose border
controls). 
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3
Dispute settlement

INTRODUCTION

The legacy of the GATT

As explained in Chapter 2, the General Agreement on Tariffs and Trade was originally
intended as only one element of what was supposed to be a much more ambitious
institutional structure. By 1950 it was clear that the US Congress would not accept the
International Trade Organization, with the result that the only international organization
left for the regulation of world trade was a provisional agreement never intended as a
framework for such an organization.1

From the beginning, then, the GATT was characterized by temporary measures and ad
hoc solutions to emerging problems. Administrative services for the GATT were provided
by the Interim Commission of the ITO and responsibility for oversight and direction was
taken on by regular meetings of the Contracting Parties, with Geneva as the de facto site.2

In contradistinction to the ITO draft charter, the 1947 GATT made no provision for
formal, juridical dispute settlement, nor was there any explicit provision for recourse to the
International Court of Justice in resolving disputes.3 The emphasis was on diplomatic
methods of consultation and consensus. Article XXII provided for consultations where
representations were made by one Contracting Party to another ‘with respect to any matter
affecting the operation of this Agreement’. Article XXIII provided for the possibility of an
investigation, recommendations, and rulings by the CONTRACTING PARTIES (in effect,
the GATT Council consisting of all Member States) in the case where a Contracting Party
considered that a benefit under the GATT was nullified and impaired. This applied not only
in the case where the nullification and impairment flowed from a violation of a provision of
the GATT, but in other circumstances as well (which gave rise to what are referred to as
non-violation nullification and impairment complaints, discussed later in this chapter).
Article XXIII also permitted the CONTRACTING PARTIES to authorize a Contracting
Party to suspend concessions under the GATT with respect to another Contracting Party,
where it considered that ‘the circumstances are serious enough to justify such action’. It is
on the legal foundation of these provisions that dispute settlement practice in the GATT
was built throughout its history, and they remain in the 1994 GATT as a basis for the WTO
Dispute Settlement Understanding (hereinafter, DSU), which, however (along with various



Agreement-specific provisions, discussed below), governs dispute settlement practice not
only with respect to the 1994 GATT but all the ‘covered agreements’ under the WTO
umbrella.

The first complaints to come before the GATT were referred to the Chairman of the
Contracting Parties at the Second Session in 1948 (without any warrant for such a
procedure in the GATT itself), who gave a ruling on the legality or otherwise of the
measures complained of.4 At that same session, a ‘working party’ was set up for the first
time to report on a dispute between the USA and Cuba regarding the latter’s textile
regulations. The working party, which consisted of GATT representatives from Canada,
India, The Netherlands, Cuba and the USA, was to investigate the matter ‘in the light of the
factual evidence’ and to recommend a ‘practical solution’ to the Contracting Parties. Three
days of meetings led to a compromise satisfactory to both of the disputing parties.5 In
contrast to the ‘rulings’ given by the Chairman, the working parties were really a forum for
encouraging negotiation. This was not a third-party investigation for the purpose of coming
to objective conclusions on the merits: such a function was precluded by the participation of
the disputants, and the fact that the other representatives were acting on the instructions of
their respective countries.

The Third Session, in 1949, saw the advent of something like third-party panel dispute
resolution. Chile complained to the Contracting Parties about the practices of Australia
with respect to fertilizer subsidies. A working party was established, and the report drafted
by the neutral countries of the working party was accepted by the Contracting Parties
notwithstanding the dissent of the Australian represen-tative.6 But it was not until the
Seventh Session, in 1952, that the Contracting Parties resorted to the panel procedures
which have now become the standard means of dispute resolution within the GATT.7 The use
of panels marked an important shift for the GATT. They no longer included representatives
from the disputing parties; major trading nations like the UK and the USA were not
automatically panel members; and the panel and the GATT Secretariat worked together to
develop more formal procedures for the functioning of panels.8 The GATT Secretariat, in a
report to the Contracting Parties, identified this move to panel procedures as an attempt to
instil greater objectivity in dispute resolution.9 One GATT insider has called the institution
of panels a Secretariat ‘conspiracy’ to enhance its influence, and lessen that of the larger
countries which tended to dominate working parties.10 Whatever the real reasons for their
creation, panels marked a move away from the GATT as an institution for facilitating
negotiation towards a greater emphasis on third-party adjudication.

But the move towards third-party adjudication was not written in stone. No sooner had
the panel process been instituted than it fell into a degree of disfavour with GATT nations.
During the 1960s, very few disputes were brought before panels—there were only six panel
complaints in this period—and from 1963 to 1970 no panels were set up at all. Countries
resorted to consultation to resolve disputes, and the more contentious issues were dealt
with by working groups, which issued reports with recommendations rather than rendered
court-like judgments.11 Several reasons have been suggested for this move away from
legalism in procedure.12

The 1960s witnessed a growing perception among GATT countries that the rules of the
Agreement were becoming outdated. This period also saw the emergence of the EU, Japan,
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and several less-developed countries as important trading powers within the GATT. No one
in this group found legalism particularly salutary to their interests: strict interpretations of
the Agreement would have interfered with domestic programmes designed to manage
international trade in various key sec-tors.13 Seen in this light, the legalism of the 1950s was
probably more a result of the GATT’s domination by the USA than some deeply-felt
commitment on the part of GATT Members in general. Moreover, the 1960s was a period
which saw declining compliance with the spirit of GATT through the use of non-tariff
barriers (even as tariffs fell dramatically after the Kennedy Round), and sectoral agreements
which effectively managed trade.14 Faced with trade restrictions that challenged the very
assumptions of the GATT, its dispute resolution mechanisms appeared increasingly
inadequate to the task of ensuring compliance with the Agreement. The 1970s would see a
revival of the use of panel procedures, but this was largely the result of a new aggressiveness
on the part of the USA.15 The real challenges facing the GATT implied the need for new
rules.

The Tokyo Round was initiated in part to deal with contentious forms of nontariff
barriers. The USA also hoped to use the Round to strengthen the panels by elaborating their
procedures and increasing the predictability of their outcomes. The USA did achieve an
important codification of existing practice, and a renewed commitment from GATT
countries to use the Agreement’s dispute resolution mechanisms.16 As well, some of the
subsidiary codes negotiated during the Tokyo Round included their own dispute settlement
provisions, which set deadlines for dispute settlement and allowed resort to dispute
settlement as of right.17 But US efforts towards an even greater emphasis on legalism, for
example through the imposition of stricter deadlines, were blocked.18 In the Tokyo Round,
an Understanding on Dispute Settlement (DSU) was negotiated, which in many respects
codified and clarified GATT practice as it had evolved to that point, with some relatively
minor reforms that addressed some of the concerns that had been raised about the
effectiveness of the process. These are summarized by Hudec:

The Understanding on Dispute Settlement rejects the practice of defendants linking
the complaint to resolution of other related issues. It also authorizes the Secretariat
to maintain a standing roster of potential panel members, exhorts parties to respond
to Secretariat nominations of panel members within seven working days, exhorts
parties to ‘not oppose nominations except for compelling reasons’, and sets a ‘normal’
time period for the establishment of panels of not more than thirty days after
authorization by Council decision.19

Finally, in the Uruguay Round a comprehensive agreement on dispute settlement
procedures was achieved, including an Appellate Body. 

Perspectives on dispute settlement

In order to understand the achievements of the DSU agreed to in the Uruguay Round, it is
necessary to examine briefly the various achievements and limitations of dispute settlement
practices as they evolved in the GATT on the basis of Articles XXII and XXIII. As noted,
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often the debate over these practices was cast in terms of ‘rules’ vs. ‘diplomacy’, with some
Contracting Parties, particularly the United States, arguing for greater legalism, and some
other countries, as well as important voices in the global trade policy élite, arguing the
advantages of diplomatic flexibility. The demand for legalism usually signalled a concern that
panel processes be governed by time limits, that adequate reasons be offered for rulings,
and that the adoption of a ruling should not depend on a consensus of all the Contracting
Parties (including the Parties complained against), as was considered to be the case under
Article XXIII. Those who preferred elements of diplomatic flexibility tended to emphasize
the inherently political nature of trade arrangements, and the need for safety valves if the
commitment to the system by individual Member States was not to be undermined by dispute
outcomes they considered (or their domestic constituencies) considered to be illegitimate.
Dispute resolution reform was an important item on the agenda during the Uruguay Round
and has resulted in a new Understanding on Rules and Procedures Governing the
Settlement of Disputes20 that largely ratifies, on a permanent basis, the Mid-term Review
Agreement, adopted on an interim basis in 1988 during the Uruguay Round negotiations.

Our own perspective on dispute settlement, on which we will elaborate throughout our
discussion of the DSU, reflects a modification of the neo-liberal view of the multilateral
trading order as a regime whose basis is a mutually self-interested bargain among states.
Sustaining such a bargain requires institutions that are capable of identifying and sanctioning
(or at least authorizing sanctions against) cheating21 on the cooperative equilibrium which this
bargain represents. Diplomatic, power-based solutions to disputes are unlikely to generate
the normative benchmarks necessary to distinguish conduct consistent with the bargain from
cheating, and are therefore unlikely to sustain a cooperative equilibrium over time. It is
impartial, rules-based dispute settlement that can best perform this function. This is what
G.R. Shell in a seminal article on dispute resoluton and international relations theory refers
to as the ‘Regime Management’ model of dispute settlement.22 However, as we note in
several of the chapters of this book, there are elements of the multilateral trading system as
it is evolving that are superimposing on a domestic and global welfare-maximizing optimal
bargain to constrain protectionism— one that is welfare-maximizing whatever the policy
choices individual states adopt on non-trade matters23—a supranational regulatory regime
that embodies certain substantive trade-offs between free trade and other values. Here, we
have in mind the TRIPs Agreement, which prescribes minimum standards for national
intellectual property laws and regulations, as well as elements of the GATS and the
Technical Barriers Agreement that go beyond National Treatment to place constraints or
conditions on non-discriminatory national regulatory outcomes. As well, when dispute panels
have had to weigh environmental and related justifications for largely nondiscriminatory
measures that have been found GATT-illegal (such as the Process and Production Method-
based requirements in the Tuna/Dolphin dispute), they have ended up making implicit or
explicit trade-offs between the trade liberalization values of the GATT regime and the values
that underpin other international and national regimes (in the case of Tuna/Dolphin,
biodiversity values). Increasingly, in these kinds of situations, dispute settlement may entail
more than the evolution and application of a set of norms to identify and distinguish
‘cheating’ from legitimate state behaviour, and may require a direct regulation of national
and international public policy outcomes that implicate diverse values and constituencies. In
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these circumstances, the regime management goal of sustaining a cooperative equilibrium
through the sanctioning of cheating becomes intertwined with the need to produce rulings
that have legitimacy with a range of stakeholders whose interests are affected by the way that
policy trade-offs are made in interpreting the GATT and the other WTO Agreements. This
need is reflected in what Shell calls the Trade Stakeholders Model, which ‘views trade dispute
resolution as part of a wide-ranging deliberative process by which an emerging global social
system can set its priorities.’24 Shell has very broad global democratic aspirations for this
model, which he sees as a means of achieving republican democracy on a world scale.
Whether one shares his utopianism or not, the basic idea is a logical consequence of a world
where the enforcement of trade norms no longer leaves national (and sub-national) polities,
as well as supranational non-trade regimes, unconstrained in their policy autonomy,
provided they do not engage in trade discrimination. Since dispute rulings directly25

impinge on the constituencies that affect the legitimacy of states themselves, the
commitment to a cooperative equilibrium by those states will depend not only on the
appropriate sanctioning of ‘cheating’, but also on how dispute settlement is perceived by
constituencies to affect their own bargain with the state, or the domestic welfare calculus.
Thus, we see the Stakeholder Model as a logical implication of the application of the Regime
Management Model to the ‘beyond the border’ trade regime of the present and future. The
implication of the Model is that the WTO dispute resolution process should be open ‘to all
groups with a stake in the outcomes of trade decisions’.26 This need not mean, and indeed
we would not endorse, standing for all affected actors to bring complaints to the WTO.
What it does imply is transparency and publicity in the process, the possibility of
intervention through written or oral submissions by affected non-governmental and
transnational organization actors, and decisions with clear reasons for factual and legal
findings, which can then be subject to meaningful debate by experts and affected groups,
both national and supranational.

The DSU negotiated in the Uruguay Round reflects a response to many criticisms of the
GATT dispute settlement process,27 some of which have obvious salience from either a
Regime Management or Trade Stakeholder perspective, or both. These criticisms included
the following:

1 delay and uncertainty in the process, given the absence of a right to a panel (this
remaining at the discretion of the CONTRACTING PARTIES) and the absence of hard
time limits on consultations, responses to requests for panels, and panel proceedings
and rulings;

2 an absence of legal rigour and clarity in the panels’s rulings;
3 the uncertainty of a panel ruling being adopted, given the consensus rule for adoption

(which demanded the consent of the losing party);28

4 delay in and partial or non-complete compliance with panel rulings.

Interestingly, from a Regime Management perspective, despite these various shortcomings,
the GATT dispute settlement process proved relatively successful through most of the
GATT’s history in actually achieving compliance, and thereby sustaining a cooperative
equilibrium through disciplining, or being seen to discipline, cheating.
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From 1947–85, it took about two years to resolve a dispute from the time a complaint was
lodged to the implementation of remedial measures.29 Only ten cases have taken longer
than two years, and only one was very protracted indeed.30 More importantly, a recent
detailed review of all GATT disputes between 1948 and 1989 by Hudec et al.31 finds a
success rate for valid complaints (resulting in full or partial satisfaction of the complaint) of
88%. While the success rate declined somewhat in the 1980s, the compliance record still
stood at 81 %. Other trends of note that emerge from the Hudec study are: (1) the
explosion of complaints in the 1980s—more than half of all GATT complaints were
brought in the last of the four decades of GATT history; (2) for the entire 42-year period,
73% of all complaints were filed by the USA, the EU and its present members, Canada, and
Australia. The USA, the EU and its members, Canada, and Japan accounted for 83% of all
appearances as defendants. Ninety-two per cent of all complaints involved either the USA
or the EU (or its members) as a Party; (3) for the entire period, 52% of all complaints
related to NTBs, 21% to tariffs, 16% to subsidies, and 10% to antidumping/countervailing
duty measures. Over time, NTBs and AD/CVDs have increased as a percentage of
complaints while tariffs have sharply declined; (4) in the 1950s only 23% of all complaints
involved agriculture while for the period 1960–84, one-half of the complaints involved
agricultural trade measures, many relating to the EU’s Common Agricultural Policy.
However, compliance rates with rulings in agricultural and non-agricultural complaints are
roughly the same; (5) according to the authors, the most important finding of their study is
the disproportionate level of non-compliant behaviour by the USA, espe-cially in the 1980s.

There is clearly a link between the increasing ineffectiveness of GATT dispute settlement
in the 1980s, defined in terms of perceived or actual compliance (which gives Parties to the
bargain the confidence needed to sustain their commitment to it), and the rise in the
proportion of disputes related to normative baselines for trade-impacting national (e.g.
subsidies) policies. Because some complaints stood on the margins of the text of the GATT
itself, the inability of the dispute settlement process to resolve them arguably in those cases
reflected the need to evolve the terms of the bargain itself in light of changed circumstances
that affected, or arguably affected, the original balance of concessions. Of course, the idea
of non-violation nullification and impairment contained in Article XXIII provided a means of
adjusting this balance through dispute settlement itself, where despite the absence of a clear
violation of the text of the GATT, the behaviour of a Contracting Party undermined the
original expectation of benefits. But there were obvious limits to dispute panels playing such
a role, given that arguments about expectations often related to controversies over what
normative baselines for domestic policy Contracting Parties may have assumed in
formulating their expectations of benefits.

But the increasing ineffectiveness of the panel process in the 1980s (despite the
appearance of increased legalism defined in term of referring to previous panel decisions as
precedents and lengthy reasons for rulings) relates also to the practices in dispute
settlement that impeded a transition from a conventional Regime Management Model to a
Trade Stakeholder model. These included secrecy in panel proceedings and the way in
which panel rulings were developed and drafted, as well as long delays in the derestriction
of the rulings and related documents.
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In general, panellists under the GATT system were not experts in international trade law,
or distinguished jurists of any kind, but rather junior to middle-level trade diplomats, or
retired trade diplomats, mostly without formal legal training. These individuals were
expected to take advice from the GATT legal Secretariat. The Secretariat, in almost all
cases, not only provided the panel with a statement of the Parties’ pleadings, but analysis of
the merits of each Party’s case, and also drafted the panel’s decision itself.32 While
commentators close to the process, such as Plank,33 insist that the rulings nevertheless
reflected the panels’ own analysis of the issues, one can imagine that non-lawyer junior or
middle-level diplomats would not often explicitly challenge the ‘professional’ advice of the
Secretariat as to how a matter should be decided. Also, the Secretariat played a crucial role
in the selection of names for appointment to panels, another means of influencing outcomes
— for junior and middle-level diplomats, and even perhaps for some academics, service on
a panel is an honour or perk, and one can easily imagine that some individuals would not
wish to jeopardize their chances of serving more than once in this capacity through a run-in
with the Secretariat. Thus, while in appearance, a practice of impartial, disinterested
juridical decision-making by a panel of experts, the dispute settlement process was, largely,
in reality, dominated by a small, closely knit technocratic élite with a professional interest in
the maintenance of the GATT as a regime dominated by liberal trade values. As Keohane
and other neo-liberal theorists have pointed out, such élites can play an important positive
role in regime maintenance, and as long as the task was that of identifying ‘cheating’
(explicit or hidden protectionism), the Secretariat’s domination of the panel process
worked reasonably well from a Regime Management perspective. Academics and
independent jurists were unwilling to engage in very much open and critical scrutiny of
panel rulings, in part because they believed that to do so would undermine the legitimacy of
a process that was effective for Regime Management, and give various protectionist
interests with a stake in disrupting the cooperative equilibrium an opportunity to do so. As
well, and less idealistically, a further means of control over the system by the Secretariat
was epistemic. Because panel reports were only derestricted once adopted, and usually not
deristricted if not adopted, by the Contracting Parties, and even if derestricted, often only
published in the official reporting service (BISD) much later, many academics and other
independent jurists were dependent on good relations with members of the Secretariat to
obtain documents critical to timely analysis. In the 1980s, and especially after the Tuna/
Dolphin I panel ruling, a great deal of pressure was placed on the GATT by the United States
to remedy the unavailability of documentation. Various groups began publishing bootleg
versions of still restricted panel rulings on the Internet—such versions now regularly show
up in Inside U.S. Trade and have apparently also sometimes been posted on the web site of
the United States Trade Representative.

These developments reflect the fact that once the panels were put in the position of not
simply sanctioning ‘cheating’ but explicitly making trade-offs between different values, the
Secretariat-dominated panel process experienced a legitimacy crisis. Faced with such a
challenge in the Tuna/Dolphin case, which concerned trade sanctions to enforce a regime to
protect dolphins for biodiversity purposes (and which applied domestically as well), the
response of the system was to approach the problem purely from the professional interest in
the maintenance of the liberal trade regime, and view the measures as either covert
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protectionism (‘cheating’ disguised as action for non-trade purposes), or unwarranted
‘noise’ or interference in a self-contained, single value-based regime. In ways that are
described in detail in Chapter 15 on trade and the environment, the law and jurisprudence
of the GATT were manipulated in order to make the value of liberalized trade trump the
value of biodiversity. Ironically, the system had thought that what it was doing was
protecting the integrity and coherence of the liberal trading regime, while what it actually
provoked was a legitimacy crisis in a crucial element of the system from a Regime Management
perspective—dispute settlement. This crisis was, however, diffused (at least temporarily)
by the ability of the United States to prevent the adoption of the reports of the panels in
Tuna/Dolphin I and II.

THE WTO DISPUTE SETTLEMENT UNDERSTANDING (DSU)

In light of this critical and analytical history of GATT dispute settlement, we now examine
the reforms initiated in the Uruguay Round and consider the potential of these reforms to
allow the transition from a Regime Management model of dispute settlement to a Trade
Stakeholder model, a transition which, as we have suggested, is implied by the very
objective of Regime Management, since the multilateral trade regime is increasingly
implicated in prescribing and constraining national and international regulatory choices and,
consequently, in trade-offs between liberal trade and other policy values. Already
numerous panel and Appellate Body (AB) decisions have interpreted provisions of the DSU,
and the fol-lowing commentary incorporates these interpretations. 

Scope of the DSU: Relationship to Articles XXII and XXIII of
the GATT 1994 and other WTO Agreements (Articles 1 and 3

and Appendix 2)

The ‘rules and procedures’ of the DSU apply to all the ‘covered’ Agreements of the WTO
(Article 1) that are listed in Appendix 1 to the DSU. This list is reproduced below.

a Agreement establishing the World Trade Organization
b Multilateral Trade Agreements
Annex la: Multilateral Agreements on Trade in Goods
Annex 1b: General Agreement on Trade in Services
Annex lc: Agreement on Trade-related Aspects of Intellectual Property Rights
Annex 2: Understanding on Rules and Procedures Governing the Settlement of

Disputes
c Plurilateral Trade Agreements
Annex 4: Agreement on Trade in Civil Aircraft
Agreement on Government Procurement
International Dairy Agreement
International Bovine Meat Agreement
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The DSU applies subject to any certain provisions in dispute settlement in particular
covered agreements—in the event of a conflict between a provision of the DSU and a
dispute settlement provision of a covered agreement the latter is to prevail (Article 1.2). A
list of the relevant provisions of the covered agreements is provided in Appendix 2 to the
DSU. This list is reproduced below.

Agreement Rules and Procedures
Agreement on the Application of Sanitary and Phytosanitary Measures 11.2
Agreement on Textiles and Clothing 2.14, 2.21, 4.4, 5.2, 5.4, 5.6, 6.9, 6.10, 6.

11, 8.1 through 8.12
Agreement on Technical Barriers to Trade 14.2 through 14.4, Annex 2
Agreement on Implementation of Article VI of GATT 1994 17.4 through 17.7
Agreement on Implementation of Article VII of GATT 1994 19.3 through 19.5,

Annex II 2(f), 3, 9, 21
Agreement on Subsidies and Countervailing Measures 4.2 through 4.12, 6.6, 7.2

through 7.10, 8.5, footnote 35, 24.4, 27.7, Annex V
General Agreement on Trade in Services XXII:3, XXIII:3 
Annex on Financial Services 4
Annex on Air Transport Services 4
Decision on Certain Dispute Settlement
Procedures for the GATS 1 through 5

The list of rules and procedures includes provisions where only a part of the provision may
be relevant in this context. There are some agreement-specific provisions not on this list;
these do not take precedence over the general provisions of the DSU.

In the event that a dispute concerns more than one covered agreement, and the
agreement-specific dispute settlement provisions of the various agreements conflict, the
Parties must themselves agree on which rules and procedures apply, failing which the
Chairman of the Dispute Settlement Body will decide on the applicable rules, following the
principle that the rules of the DSU itself should be used in order to obviate conflict.

Dispute Settlement Body (Article 2)

Article 2 of the DSU establishes the Dispute Settlement Body (DSB), which is the
collectivity of WTO Members acting in their dispute settlement capacity and has a role parallel
to that of the GATT Council in the pre-WTO multilateral dispute settlement
arrangements. Thus, the DSB ‘shall have the authority to establish panels, adopt panel and
Appellate Body reports, maintain surveillance of implementation of rulings and
recommendations, and authorize suspension of concessions and other obligations under the
covered agreements.’ (Article 2.1).
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Consultations and Other Alternatives to Panel Dispute
Settlement (Articles 4 and 5)

Reflecting criticisms that the GATT practice with respect to consultations often permitted a
Party to delay inordinately the commencement of dispute settlement proceedings, Article 4
provides a set of strict time limits. for consultations. A Member must reply to a request for
consultations within 10 days of receiving it, and enter into ‘consultations in good faith’ within
30 days thereafter. If a Member of whom consultations have been requested fails to comply
with either deadline then the Member so requesting may ‘proceed directly to request the
establishment of a panel’. If consultations fail to resolve the dispute within 60 days of the
receipt of the request for consultations, the complaining Member may request the
establishment of a panel. A panel may be requested before this 60-day period has expired
where both the complainant and the responding Member consider that consultations have
failed to solve the dispute. The role of consultations was noted by the Appellate Body in
Underwear,34 where it held that a Member could not backdate the application of Transitional
Safeguards under the Agreement on Textiles and Clothing (ATC) to the date of request of
consultations. One reason the AB gave for this finding was the need to protect the
effectiveness of consultations as a means of resolving disputes. However, the consultations
here were undertaken under specific provisions of the ATC and not Article 4 of the DSU.
Para. 4.8 provides for an accelerated timetable for consultations in ‘cases of urgency.’ In
such cases, consultations are to be entered into within 10 days of the receipt of the request,
and if these fail a panel may be requested after 20 days of receipt of the request. In one of the
first disputes under the WTO, concerning imposition of tariff surcharges on Japanese
automobiles by the US, Japan requested that the matter be treated as a case of urgency
within the meaning of 4.8. Japan’s argument was that the measures would have an almost
immediate impact upon Japanese trading interests.35 Normally, consultations are requested
after a measure has been implemented and trade effects are already being felt—if Members
had intended cases of urgency to extend even to instances where measures have not yet
been adopted, but are imminent, then they would have been better advised to make the
timetable for urgency the normal timetable. Indeed a non-urgent matter, on the basis of
Japan’s reasoning, would be a case where the imposition of the measures would be in the
non-immediate future—where if anything the action might not be ripe. The reference to
‘perishable products’ in 4.8 suggests that, in fact, cases of urgency are those where
irreparable harm would be caused by delay, something akin to the criterion for granting an
interlocutory injunction in many domestic legal systems. With respect to ripeness, the DSU
does not state what circumstances may give rise to a right to request consultations.

Establishment and Terms of Reference of Panels (Articles 6
and 7)

Article 6 provides that a panel shall be established at the latest at the DSB meeting following
the meeting at which the request first appears as an item on the agenda; a Member may
request the convocation of a DSB meeting for these purposes, and one shall be held within
15 days of the request for the meeting, subject to a 10-day advance notice requirement. The
DSB may only refuse to establish a panel on the basis of unanimity—since this would mean
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the very Member requesting the panel would have to object to its establishment, the effect
is to create a right to a panel, once the applicable time periods for consultations have
elapsed. The DSU does not explicitly state on what substantive grounds such a right may be
invoked. However, a reading of the general provisions of Article 3, which refer in several
places to concepts such as prima facie nullification and impairment where a provision of a
covered agreement is claimed to have been violated, and various other provisions (including
Article 11, which refers to the panel’s role in determining conformity of measures with the
covered agreements and Article 26, which deals with non-vio-lation nullification and
impairment) suggests that the substantive grounds are those provided in Article XXIII of the
GATT, as interpreted in GATT practice. With respect to ripeness, it should be noted that
Article XXIII suggests that the breach of an obligation and/or nullification and impairment
of benefits is a condition precedent for recourse to panel dispute settlement. In the Bananas
case, the Appelate Body considered a challenge by the EC to the United States participating
in the panel as a complaining party, on the grounds that public international law requires
that a state have a ‘legal interest’ in order to have standing before an arbitral tribunal. The
EC claimed that in this instance no such legal interest existed, because the United States had
never exported a single banana to the EC. The AB found that the various sources of public
international law invoked by the EC did not contradict the recourse to a treaty itself to
determine the issue of standing to commence an action under the dispute settlement
provisions of that treaty.36 The AB then referred to the ‘chapeau’ of Article XIII of the
GATT, which refers to the right to bring a matter before the CONTRACTING PARTIES
when a Member ‘considers’ that there has been, inter alia, a violation and also to Article 3.7
of the DSU, which states that ‘Before bringing a case, a Member shall exercise its
judgement as to whether action under these procedures would be fruitful.’ From this
language, the AB drew the inference that ‘a Member has broad discretion in deciding to
bring a case against another Member under the DSU… a Member is expected to be largely
self-regulating in deciding whether any such action is “fruitful”’ (para. 135). Despite this
emphasis on self-regulation, the AB went on to find that the United States was ‘justified’ in
bringing its claims because it was a producer of bananas and thus the US could have a ‘potential
export interest’ (para. 136). It is unclear whether the AB was here merely endorsing, in
obiter dicta, the manner in which the US was regulating itself pursuant to Article 3.7, or was
implying that despite the large element of self-regulation, there is never-theless a de minimus
requirement of objective justification. The request for a panel must ‘identify the specific
measures at issue and provide a brief summary of the legal basis of the complaint sufficient
to present the problem clearly’ (Article 6.2). In Bananas, the AB upheld the panel’s view
ruling that, to meet the specificity requirement in Article 6.2, it is sufficient

for the Complaining Parties to list the provisions of the Agreements alleged to have
been violated without setting out detailed arguments as to which specific aspects of
the measures at issue related to which specific provisions of those agreements. In our
view, there is a significant difference between the claims identified in the request for
establishment of a panel, which establish the panel’s terms of reference under Article
7 of the DSU, and the arguments supporting those claims, which are set out and
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progressively clarified in the first written submissions, the rebuttal submissions and
the first and second panel meetings with the parties (para. 141).

A complaining Member may either request special terms of reference for the panel, in
which case the proposed terms are to be included in its request for a panel, or accept a
standard set of terms, which essentially authorize the panel to consider any relevant
provisions of covered agreements in relation to the matter referred to in the request for the
panel. More typically specific terms of reference are agreed on the basis of consultation
between the Parties, as foreseen by Article 7.2. In the Desiccated Coconut case, the AB
attributed a very important status to the terms of reference of a panel, holding that

A panel’s terms of reference are important for two reasons. First, terms of reference
fulfil an important due process objective—they give the parties and third parties
sufficient information concerning the claims at issue in the dispute in order to allow
them an opportunity to respond to the complainant’s case. Second, they establish the
jurisdiction of the panel by defining the precise claims at issue in the dispute.37

In Desiccated Coconut, the AB also held that in order for a claim to come within a panel’s
terms of reference, it must have been referred to in the request for a panel (p. 22). A
logical implication of the view that the terms of reference establish the panel’s jurisdiction is
that it may not consider claims of violations that are not mentioned in the terms of
reference.38 However, a panel is not required to restrict itself to the arguments raised by
Parties in the proceedings, and may develop its own legal reasoning.39 In order for a panel
to be capable of adjudicating a claim that a particular provision of a covered agreement has
been violated, the specific provision, and not merely the agreement itself or other provisions
of that agreement, must be mentioned in the terms of reference (Indian Patents, para. 92).
Article 7.2 of the DSU states that ‘Panels shall address the relevant provisions in any
covered agreements or agreements cited by the parties to the dispute.’ In Shirts and
Blouses,40 the AB held that ‘[a] panel need only address those claims which must be addressed
in order to resolve the matter in issue in the dispute’ (p. 19). However, in this case the
argument that the panel was required to address a particular claim was made under Article
11 of the DSU, discussed below, and not Article 7.2. The AB reasoned that another
provision of the DSB provided Members with an avenue to seek an authoritative
interpretation of a provision of a covered agreement, even where a panel had found it
unnecessary to interpret the provision in order to settle a particular dispute (Article 3.9).
The AB also emphasized that the DSU does not prohibit a panel from interpreting
provisions in addition to those strictly necessary to resolve the dispute. Such remarks would,
however, be considered as obiter dicta, and might not be subject to appellate review—thus
in Shirts and Blouses, a statement by the panel relating to the powers of the Textile
Monitoring Body was regarded by the AB as ‘purely a descriptive and gratuitous comment’
and not subject to appellate review.
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Composition of Panels (Article 8)

Panels are to be composed of three panellists, based on nominations from the Secretariat
from its rosters. WTO Members may from time-to-time propose additional names of
qualified persons to add to the rosters. However, a Party to a dispute may not challenge the
Secretariat’s choice of panellists, except for ‘compelling reasons’ (8.6). Panellists are to be
‘well-qualified governmental and/or non governmental individuals’. These may include
persons who have served as diplomatic officials at the GATT, in the Secretariat, or as senior
trade officials in national governments. The only non-governmental category explicitly
mentioned is that of persons who have ‘taught or published on international trade law or
policy’. Ironically, given that these criteria are heavily weighted to the traditional trade
policy élites, the DSU also states that, in addition to independence, panel members should
be selected with a view to ensuring ‘a sufficiently diverse background and a wide spectrum
of experience’ (8.2). From the perspective of achieving a transition from a Regime
Management to a Trade Stakeholder model of dispute settlement, these provisions are
largely disappointing. The Secretariat retains almost complete control over the composition
of panels and as already mentioned, despite the language on diversity and wide experience,
is given an explicit basis to continue choosing persons who come from the traditional
governmental trade policy élites. Activists, business persons, and individuals with expertise
in substantive public policy areas that now interface with international trade rules are not
even mentioned as possible candidates for the rosters. One qualification is that in some of
the covered agreements, expertise in a substantive public policy area may be an additional
criterion relevant to the establishment of the rosters— for instance, the Decision on Certain
Dispute Settlement Procedures for the General Agreement on Trade in Services provides that a special
roster of panellists be established for dispute settlement under the GATS, comprising
persons who have expertise related to trade in services ‘including associated regulatory
matters’ (Article 3).

Procedures for Multiple Complaints (Article 9)

Article 9 deals with a situation where more than one Member wishes to complain about ‘the
same matter’. In this situation a single panel may be struck to examine the multiple
complaints ‘taking into account the rights of all Members concerned’. The proceedings are
to be organized so that all Members enjoy the same rights they would have had in the case
of separate panels being struck (9.2). A particular difficulty arises where a Member or
Members seek to join a complaint as an additional Party or Parties, one the panel as been
struck on the basis of an individual complaint. In such a case, as discussed above, the Terms
of Reference will have been determined through the original individual complaint. Thus, in
order to join a complaint and still enjoy the right to raise claims not initially raised by the
original individual complainant, the other Members would appear to have to do so before
the panel’s Terms of Reference (its ‘jurisdiction’) have been determined. However, while a
panel cannot amend its own Terms of Reference (Bananas), the DSB can. Thus, in
Reformulated Gasoline, when Brazil requested a panel on US measures which were already the
subject of a complaint by Venezuela, the DSB established new Terms of Reference for the
joint panel. In this case, it was a particularly straightforward matter, since the original panel
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had standard Terms of Reference, i.e. not limiting the panel’s consideration of any
provision in a covered agreement relevant to disposing of the complaint.41 In cases of a joint
complaint, the panel may issue multiple reports, each of which addresses the particulars of
the complaint of a single Member (as for example occured in Bananas) (Article 9.2). It is to
be emphasized that there is no requirement that complaints by two or more Members
concerning the same or similar measures of another Member be consolidated in the same
panel proceeding. It is an interesting question as to whether the DSB can insist on joinder,
even if one or more complainants object—arguably, if joinder were only at the consent of
all Parties, then there would not have been the need to protect the rights of each Party in
the event of joinder, since a Party who thought their rights would be compromised could
simply insist on a separate proceeding. In Hormones, there were parallel proceedings by
Canada and the United States against the EC. In the case of parallel proceedings, the DSU
provides that ‘If more than one panel is established to examine the complaints related to the
same matter, to the greatest extent possible the same persons shall serve as panelists on each
of the separate panels and the timetable for the panel process in such disputes shall be
harmonized.’ In Hormones, Canada and the US participated in each other’s panels as third
Parties (a status discussed in the next section of this chapter). An interesting issue arose from
decisions taken by the members of the panels with a view to rationalizing the parallel
proceedings: a joint meeting was held with scientific experts, all the information provided
in the Canadian proceeding was provided to the United States, and vice versa, and the United
States was invited to attend and even speak at the second meeting of the Canadian panel. On
appeal, the EC objected to all these decisions, claiming that they exceeded the normal rights
of third parties in WTO panel proceedings. The AB treated all but the last of these
decisions not in terms of third-party rights, but rather as related to ‘economy of effort’ in a
situation of parallel proceedings concerning the same matter. Referring to the language in 9.
3 of the DSU concerning ‘harmonization of timetables’, the AB noted ‘we can see a relation
between timetable harmonization…and economy of effort’ (Hormones, para. 153). The AB
further observed: ‘Having access to a common pool of information enables the panel and
the parties to save time by avoiding duplication of the compilation and analysis of
information already presented in the other proceeding [footnote omitted]’. Article 3.3 of the
DSU recognizes the importance of avoiding unnecessary delays in the dispute settlement
process and states that the prompt settlement of a dispute is essential to the effective
functioning of the WTO (para. 153) With respect to the granting to the US of a right to be
present at the second substantive panel meeting, the AB deferred to the judgment of the
panel that the relationship of this meeting to the joint scientific experts’ session was such as
to provide a due process case for the US presence there; ‘this decision falls within the sound
discretion and authority of the panel, particularly if the panel considers it necesssary for
ensuring to all parties due process of law’ (para. 154).

Intervenors (Third Parties) (Article 10)

Article 10 affords intervenor status to any Member ‘having a substantial interest in a
matter’(102). Such intervenors (‘third parties’) have the right to make both oral and
written submissions to the panel, and to obtain the submissions of the Parties to the dispute
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to the first meeting of the panel. ‘Third party submissions are to be provided to the parties
to the dispute and shall be reflected in the final report’ (10). From the perspective of the
Trade Stakeholder model, these provisions are highly inadequate, as they provide no
intervention rights whatever to non-governmental organizations, or indeed to other
international organizations (e.g. in the environmental or health and safety areas) to
intervene, even through written submissions. However, pursuant to Article 13 of the DSU,
to be discussed further in the next section, panels themselves have wide discretion to obtain
and consider information and opinions beyond those contained in the submissions of the
complainants and third parties. Now, Article 11 requires the panel to make an ‘objective
assessment of the matter before it’. In our view, Article 11 would be breached if a panel
were to be completely arbitrary in the manner in which it decides to consider or reject
information or opinions available to it from sources other than the Parties—it is difficult to
see how findings based on such arbitrary selectivity could constitute ‘an objective
assessment of the matter’. Thus, in our view, the decision made by the Turtles panel simply
not to consider documents provided by non-governmental organizations was not consistent
with a panel’s responsibilities under Article 11.42 In this case, the panel made the bizarre
assertion that ‘Accepting non-requested information from non-governmental sources would
be, in our opinion, incompatible with the provisions of the DSU as currently applied’ (para.
7.8). It is not surprising that the panel did not here cite any provision of the DSU or any
interpretation of the DSU, either in dispute settlement proceedings or any other context, to
support the assertion—the finding is simply without any foundation and was rightly rejected
by the AB on appeal. While the AB was less clear on whether amieus briefs could be
received at the appellate level unless attached to a party’s submissions, in fact, the AB did in
practice receive and accept one such unattached submission in the Turtles case itself. Perhaps
the AB quite reasonably considered the ability to accept such material as implicit in the very
notion of appellate jurisdiction, which would be consistent with general appellate court
practice. Of course, perfectly consistently with its obligation of ‘objective assessment’ in
Article 11, a panel may decide that information is not relevant and therefore not consider it
for purposes of making an ‘objective assessment’. But the finding of irrelevancy will itself be
a finding of law, subject to appellate review (Harmones, para. 143). Wanton disregard of
such information may be a violation of the duty to make ‘an objective assessment’.

The Jurisdiction and Mandate of Panels (Articles 3, 11, 13,
and 19)

Article 11, which we have just discussed with respect to intervenors, is a fundamental
reference point for the jurisdiction and mandate of the panel. It states in part:

The function of panels is to assist the DSB in discharging its responsibilities under this
Understanding and the covered agreements. Accordingly a panel should make an
objective assessment of the matter before it, including an objective assessment of the
facts of the case and the applicability of and conformity with the relevant covered
agreements, and make such other findings as will assist the DSB in making the
recommendations or in giving the rulings provided for in the covered agreements.
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The broadness of this mandate is of course qualified by the constraints imposed on the panel
by its Terms of Reference, as discussed above. Also relevant to the panel’s mandate with
respect to legal interpretation is Article 3.2 which states in part: ‘Recommendations and
rulings of the DSB cannot add to or diminish the rights and obligations provided in the
covered agreements.’ Article 19.2 states in turn that: ‘In accordance with paragraph 2 of
Article 3, in their findings and recommendations, the panel and the Appellate Body cannot
add to or diminish the rights and obligations provided in the covered agreements.’ The
significance of these provisions for interpretation will be discussed below in the section on
principles of interpretation. The reference to ‘covered agreements’ throughout raises the
issue of how the panel may deal with a situation where a party or third party invokes an
agreement other than a covered agreement as relevant to the dispute. In the Bananas case,
for instance, among the issues in dispute was the consistency with the GATT waiver for
Lomé preferences of certain measures by the EC. The legal question was whether the
measures fell within the waiver because, in the language of the waiver, they were ‘required’
by the EC’s obligations under the Lomé Convention. The EC argued that, the Lomé
Convention not being a covered agreement, the panel should have deferred to the views of
the signatories of the Lomé Convention as to what it ‘required’. The AB upheld the view of
the panel that the Lomé waiver, inasmuch as it incorporated a reference to the Lomé
Convention itself, required the panel to examine the provisions of the Lomé Convention, to
determine whether in fact the EC measures were ‘required’ by it. (paras 167–8). While the
AB was probably correct to reject a stance of total deference towards the interpretation of
the Lomé Convention by states parties, it went on to interpret the Convention largely
without reference to the practice surrounding this treaty, which suggests a rather narrow
view of the interaction of other international legal regimes with the WTO. As Petersmann
notes, in the WTO Agreements there are

numerous references to other international agreements and general international law
rules such as the UN Charter, the International Monetary Fund Agreement,
international environmental agreements like the International Plant Protection
Convention, international ‘standards’ promulgated by other ‘relevant international
organizations open for members to all (WTO) Members’, international services
agreements, e.g., on international air transport and international
telecommunication, worldwide agreement on intellectual property rights.43

The coherence of the international legal system would be put at risk if WTO panels and the
Appellate Body were to apply or interpret provisions of other agreements referenced in
WTO agreements in abstraction from the practice surrounding those agreements, including
dispute rulings, views of the institutional organs associated with the treaty, and the opinions
of jurists. From the perspective of the evolution of WTO dispute settlement towards a
Trade Stakeholder model, since the references to other agreements often relate to
benchmarks that are relevant where the panels are dealing with trade-offs between values of
liberalized trade and other substantive policy values, the way in which the benchmarks in
these other regimes have been evolved by and in response to regime-specific constituencies
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must be taken into account to ensure an outcome that does not unduly privilege liberal
trade over other relevant policy values.

1.
Burden of Proof and Standard of Review

The issue of burden of proof is not directly addressed in the DSU, except for Article 3.2 which
is a statement of prior GATT practice, as developed in numerous panel rulings: ‘In cases
where there is an infringement of the obligations assumed under a covered agreement, the
action is considered to constitute a case of prima facie nullification or impairment. This
means that there is normally a presumption that a breach of the rules has an adverse effect
on other Members parties to that covered agreement, and in such cases, it shall be up to the
Member against whom the complaint has been brought to rebut the charge.’ The Appellate
Body has observed that

various international tribunals, including the International Court of Justice, have
generally and consistently accepted and applied the rule that a party who asserts a
fact, whether the claimant or the respondent, is responsible for pro-viding proof
thereof [footnote omitted]. Also, it is a generally-accepted canon of evidence in civil
law, common law and in fact, most jurisdictions, that the burden of proof rests with
the party, whether complaining or defending, who asserts the affirmative of a
particular claim or defence. If that party adduces evidence sufficient to raise a
presumption that what is claimed is true, the burden then shifts to the other party ,
who will fail unless it adduces sufficient evidence to rebut the presumption [footnote
omitted] (Shirts and Blouses, p. 14; applied by the AB in Hormones and Indian Patents).

There are some provisions of the WTO Agreements which are in the nature of affirmative
defences. These provisions are invoked by the Party complained against. The panel will
consider such defences once it has determined that there is a violation of some other
provision of a covered agreement (Reformulated Gasoline, p. 16), the burden of proof for
establishing which is on the complaining Party. After the violation of the other provision is
thus established, the burden of proof shifts to the Party complained against to prove the
affirmative defence. While in Shirts and Blouses, the AB gave the obvious example of GATT
Article XX as an instance of an affirmative defence, what constitutes an affirmative defence
may not always be so obvious. In Hormones, the AB noted: ‘The general rule in a dispute
settlement proceeding requiring a complaining party to establish a prima facie case of
inconsistency with a provision…before the burden of showing consistency with that
provision is taken on by the defending party, is not avoided by simply describing that same
provision as an “exception’” (Hormones, para. 104). In Hormones, the panel had made an
interpretation of the Sanitary and Phytosanitary (SPS) Agreement which suggested that the party
complained against generally bore the burden of proof that its measures complied with the
Agreement, unless they were based on international standards. This would have had the result
of making the resort to SPS measures as such a prima facie violation of WTO law, unless
these measures conformed to international standards. The AB rightly found that such a
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reading was inconsistent with the text and structure of the SPS Agreement, which indicate
that the Agreement establishes alternative sets of disciplines on Members’ SPS measures,
depending on whether or not they are based on international standards. The AB noted that
according to the SPS Agreement, Members have an ‘autonomous right’ to introduce measures
that establish a higher level of protection than provided for by international standards,
subject to the disciplines contained in the Agreement, logically, then, the burden of proof
rests on the com-plainant to establish a violation, by showing that these disciplines have not
been complied with. Once a provision has been characterized overall as an affirmative defence,
it appears that the burden of proof is shifted to the defending party with respect to all the
legal and factual tests in that defence (barring explicit textual language to the contrary).
Thus, in Reformulated Gasoline, the AB found that with respect to Article XX the burden of
proof of showing that a measure is not an abuse of an exception falls on the defending Party,
even after that Party has established that the measure qualifies under one of the specific
heads of Article XX (p. 22). The AB, however, gave no explicit justification for this finding
—one could as easily have argued that once a measure is shown to be in an exculpating
category, the burden of demonstrating that it is being used abusively shifts back to the
complaining Party, based upon the notion that Members of the WTO should not generally
be subject to a rebuttable presumption that they are abusing rights acquired under WTO
law. The AB may need to revisit this finding in light of its later observation in Hormones that
the characterization of a provision as an ‘exception’ does not in itself exhaustively allocate
all the burden of proof within that provision to the defending Party. The issue of standard of
review arises where a panel is examining the domestic law of a Member as interpreted by
domestic authorities and tribunals to determine whether the law, or the actions of those
authorities and tribunals (including fact-finding), or both are in compliance with provisions
of the covered agreements. Only the Antidumping Agreement addresses explicitly the issue
of standard of review. A certain degree of deference to findings of fact by domestic
authorities in antidumping matters is provided in Article 17.6 of the Agreement, which
states in part that ‘If the establishment of the facts was proper and the evaluation was
unbiased and objective, even though the panel might have reached a different conclusion,
the evaluation shall not be overturned.’ In Hormones, the AB suggested that the appropriate
standard of review for a panel lay somewhere between de novo review of the facts at issue
before the domestic authorities and ‘total deference to national authorities’, and referred to
the Article 11 responsibility of the panel to make an objective assessment of the facts. It is
difficult to see how the AB was able to understand Article 11 as illuminating with respect to
where on the spectrum between de novo review and total deference the appropriate
benchmark is to be found. In the Indian Patents case, the AB considered an argument by
India that domestic law had to be proven as a fact by the complainant in a WTO panel
proceeding, and furthermore that India should be given the benefit of the doubt with
respect to whether, under its domestic legal system certain administrative instructions
would provide the legal security required by the provision of the TRIPs Agreement in issue,
and that, at least, India’s guidance in interpreting these administrative instructions should
have been sought (para. 64). The AB appeared to take the view that when examining a
Member’s domestic law solely for the purpose of determining whether it complies with a
covered agreement, no particular deference to domestic interpretations of that law is

66 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



warranted (para. 66). This is, however, rather too simplistic, for in this particular case the
very determination of whether India was in compliance with the TRIPs Agreement entailed
an assessment of whether the administrative instructions would survive a domestic legal
challenge under the Indian Patent Act. This entails a predictive judgment about how a
particular country’s domestic tribunals would understand the interaction between
particular administrative decrees and a domestic statute, and it is difficult to see how the AB
was able to uphold a panel finding on this matter that was not based on evidence by Indian
legal experts on Indian administrative and intellectual property law and how it is applied in
the Indian courts. Instead, the AB reviewed the panel’s finding as if it were reviewing an
ordinary panel intepretation of a WTO provision itself.

2.
Findings of Fact

The DSU does not explicitly provide for factual discovery between the Parties prior to the
commencement of panel proceedings. However, in Indian Patents, the AB suggested that
consultations concerning the Terms of Reference should be viewed as, in part, fulfilling this
function. The AB noted:

Parties engaged in dispute settlement under the DSU must be fully forthcoming from
the beginning both as to the claims involved in a dispute and as to the facts relating to
those claims. Claims must be stated clearly. Facts must be disclosed freely. This must
be so in consultations as in the more formal setting of panel proceedings. In fact, the
demands of due process that are implicit in the DSU make this especially necessary
during consultations. For the claims that are made and the facts that are established
during consultations do much to shape the substance and the scope of subsequent
panel proceed-ings. If, in the aftermath of consultations, any party believes that all
the pertinent facts relating to a claim are, for any reason, not before the panel, then
that party should ask the panel in that case to engage in additional fact-finding (para.
94).

Here the AB was responding to a US argument that the panel should be able to adjudicate a
claim not contained in the Terms of Reference, since only on the basis of facts disclosed later
did it make sense for the United States to advance that claim—the AB held that it could not
go beyond its Terms of Reference, even to remedy such a situation. It added: ‘It is worth
noting that, with respect to fact-finding, the dictates of due process could better be served
if panels had standard working procedures that provided for appropriate factual discovery at
an early stage in panel proceedings’ (para. 95). In addition to the submissions of the Parties
and third Parties, a panel may, as already noted, ‘seek information and technical advice from
any individual or body which it deems appropriate’, subject to certain notification and
confidentiality conditions (Article 13.1) and also may ‘seek infor-mation from any source
and may consult with experts to obtain their opinion on certain aspects of the matter’. This
may entail the establishment of an expert review group (Article 13.4). The procedures
governing such groups are contained in Annex 4 of the DSU. The panel’s fact finding is to
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be guided by the requirement in Article 11 to ‘make an objective assessment of the matter
before it, including an objective assessment of the facts of the case’. Various of these
provisions were considered by the AB in Hormones. According to the AB,

The duty to make an objective assessment of the facts is, among other things, an
obligation to consider the evidence presented to a panel and to make factual findings
on the basis of that evidence. The deliberate disregard of, or failure to consider, the
evidence submitted to a panel is incompatible with a panel’s duty to make an
objective assessment of the facts. ‘Disregard’ and ‘distortion’ and
‘misrepresentation’ of the evidence, in their ordinary signification in judicial and
quasi-judicial processes, imply not simply an error of judgment in the appreciation of
evidence but rather an egregious error that calls into question the good faith of the
panel [footnote omitted] (para. 133).

However, with respect to statements of experts, the panel has ‘a substantial margin of
discretion as to which statements are useful to refer to explicitly’ (para. 138). Moreover,
not every inaccuracy in the panel’s representation of statements by experts will ‘amount to
the egregious disregarding or distorting of evidence before the Panel’ (para. 144). From the
perspective of a Trade Stakeholder model of dispute settlement, Article 11 as interpreted in
Hormones offers some real protection against manipulation of panel proceedings by the
Secretariat. The panel cannot simply read out of the record or misrepresent information
from diverse constituencies—environmental, health, or otherwise—once these have been
brought before the panel. In the Thai Cigarette case, for instance, which is discussed in
Chapter 15 on trade and the environment, the panel chose to ignore a report of the World
Health Organization, which dealt with the challenges developing countries face in dealing with
increased incidence of cigarette smoking in their populaces; inasmuch as what the panel was
doing in Thai Cigarette was deciding that the report was irrelevant, this would now be
viewed as a legal finding subject to appellate review; inasmuch as the panel, was not making
such a legal finding but wilfully disregarding relevant evidence, it would have been
prohibited from so doing under Article 11. In Periodicals, the AB held that a panel’s legal
conclusions must be based upon adequate factual analysis, based on the evidence on the
record before it, and that it must be logically possible to reach the conclusions of law based
upon the evidence. Here, the AB did not rely on Art. 11 of the DSU. Rather, it suggested
that in cases where the legal test itself is highly contextual, such as the application of the
‘like product’ concept in Art. III, inadequate factual analysis could mar a panel’s legal
reasoning. In some jurisdictions domestic administrative law may similarly extend review
for errors of law to these situations where there is a ‘mixed’ question of law and fact.
(Canada—Certain Measures Concerning Periodicals, Report of the Appellate Body, 30 June
1997, WT/DS31/AB/R, pp. 22–3.)
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3.
Findings of Law

Sources of Law

It is obviously the role of panels to apply and interpret the legal provisions of the ‘covered
agreements’. There are, however, many WTO legal instruments that are not ‘covered
agreements’, but which bear on their interpretation, including at least one Understanding
(on commitments in financial services) and numerous Ministerial Decisions and
Declarations, as well as Waivers, i.e. agreed derogations from the obligations in covered
agreements. Decisions on Waivers in force prior to the entry into force of the WTO are,
however, deemed to be part of the GATT 1994, which is a ‘covered agreement’ (GATT
1994, 1 (b)(iii)), as are ‘other decisions of the CONTRACTING PARTIES to GATT 1947’
effective prior to the entry into force of the WTO Agreement. Whether the Ministerial
Decisions taken at the end of the Uruguay Round constitute Decisions in this sense is
uncertain: they would arguably have had to have entered into force prior to the entry into
force of the WTO Agreement, by virtue of the fact that they were viewed as preparatory to
the establishment of the WTO. Under the WTO Agreement a Decision of the Ministerial
Conference and General Council will only constitute an authoritative interpretation of a
covered agreement where such a decision is taken upon recommendation of the Council
responsible for overseeing the agreement in question, and is adopted by three-quarters of
the Members (WTO Agreement, IX(2)). By virtue of being authoritative, such an
interpretation is obviously binding on panels (and the Appellate Body) and is therefore to be
regarded as a superior source of law. Another source of law is other international
agreements mentioned or referenced in the ‘covered agreements’—as noted above, in
Bananas the Appellate Body seemed to be suggesting that these should be applied by panels
in the same manner as if they were covered agreements themselves. Finally, Article 3.2 of
the DSU states that the purpose of dispute settlement is to clarify the provisions of the
WTO Agreements ‘in accordance with customary rules of international law’.

Palmeter and Mavroidis suggest that 3.2, along with Article 7, which refers to relevant
provisions of the covered agreements, has the effect of bringing into the WTO the sources
of law stated in Article 38(1) of the Statute of the International Court of Justice.44 These
are: international conventions, where ‘expressly recognized by the consenting states’;
custom; general principles of law; judicial decisions and teachings of publicists as ‘subsidiary
means’ of interpretation. In Reformulated Gasoline and Alcoholic Beverages45 the Appellate Body
held that Articles 31 and 32 of the Vienna Convention on the Interpretation of Treaties46

constituted ‘customary rules of interpretation of public international law’ for purposes of
DSU 3.2. Article 31 of the Vienna Convention, which requires the use of certain interpretative
canons and sources, begins with the general prescription that ‘A treaty shall be interpreted
in good faith in accordance with the ordinary meaning to be given to the terms of the treaty
in their context and in the light of its object and purpose’ (31.1). ‘Context’ here includes an
agreement concluded between the Parties in connection with the treaty and any instrument
‘made by one or more parties in connexion with the conclusion of the treaty and accepted
by the other parties as an instrument related to the treaty’ (31.2(a) (b)). ‘Taken together
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with the context’, the following shall also be taken into account: subsequent agreements
‘between the parties’ on treaty interpretation or application; subsequent practice in
application of the treaty; ‘any relevant rules of international law applicable in the relations
between the parties’ (31.3(a)-(c)). Article 32 of the Vienna Convention permits (but does not
require) recourse to the preparatory work for a treaty (travaux preparatoires), either to
confirm an interpretation based on the sources prescribed in Article 31, or to determine
meaning where there is ambiguity or obscurity, or where the meaning derived from
interpretation based on Article 31 sources ‘leads to a result which is manifestly absurd and
unreasonable’. Clearly, many WTO or GATT Decisions, Declarations, and Understandings
—if not part of covered agreements—would constitute ‘context’ for the interpretation of
covered agreements within the meaning of 31.2. Other instruments, however, might be
viewed as ‘subsequent’ agreements or ‘subsequent practice’ within the meaning of 31.3.
Thus, depending on the circumstances, one might view a particular WTO legal instrument
that is not a covered agreement either as law that panels must apply by virtue of the legal
structure of the WTO itself (see above) or as interpretive sources, to be applied by virtue
of the Vienna Convention rules, applicable to dispute settlement both by virtue of Article 3.2
of the DSU and independently, simply by virtue of their status as customary international
law.47 The AB has applied elements of Articles 31 and 32 in a number of its decisions. One
very important interpretative principle that it has crafted out of Article 31.1 is that
‘interpretation must give meaning and effect to all the terms of the treaty. An interpreter is
not free to adopt a reading that would result in reducing whole clauses or paragraphs of a
treaty to redundancy or inutility’ (Reformulated Gasoline, p. 22; applied in Alcoholic Beverages
and Hormones). Here the AB has responded to the tendency of panels to overlook exact
textual wording in order to give effect to what they see as the ‘object and purpose’ of the
treaty as a whole. Such a tendency could be seen in the past as quite consistent with the
Regime Management model of dispute settlement—the text being understood as a means
of constraining cheating on a bargain to reciprocally reduce trade barriers, a too literal
interpretation might fail to catch forms of cheating that could undermine the bargain (since
it is extremely difficult to specify in advance all behaviours that may constitute ‘cheating’ on
a cooperative equilibrium). Loose interpretation by a professional élite sure of its
understanding of the overall purpose of the regime, using what one trade economist
colleague described as a ‘sniff test for protectionism’, may well serve Regime Management
goals, by closing ‘loopholes’ or gaps that could undermine confidence in the bargain by a
means less cumbersome than amendment or decision-making by the Parties. If, however,
the text of an agreement constitutes or reflects a painstakingly negotiated set of tradeoffs
between liberal trade values and interests and other policy values and interests—hence
between diverse, legtimate constituencies or stakeholders—attention to the exact text is
essential to preserve the balance of the bargain. Thus, under the Trade Stakeholder model
of dispute settlement, the AB’s insistence on careful attention to the exact text appears
highly desirable. Indeed, the need for such an approach seems reflected in Article 19.2,
which states (as already noted) that ‘the panel and Appellate Body cannot add to or diminish
the rights and obligations provided in the covered agreements’. Nevertheless, having
insisted correctly that a purposive interpretation should not lead to neglect of the text, the
AB has on occasion perhaps been too inclined to identify textual fidelity with literal or
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positivistic textual analysis. If a purposive reading does not mean disposing with textualism,
textualism should not mean a neglect of inquiry into purpose and object, when considering the
exact words of the text. In the Hormones case, the AB considered the application of rules of
international law in the interpretation of a covered agreement (the SPS Agreement). The
EU claimed that the panel should have taken into account the precautionary principle in
determining whether its measures with respect to hormone-fed meat were based on a
scientific risk assessment; this refers to the notion that in cases where uncertainty surrounds
the probability or seriousness of a risk, regulators should take precautions in order to avoid
possible harm. The AB held that, while the precautionary principle might have crystallized
into a rule of international environmental law, there was considerable uncertainty about
whether it had yet attained the status of general or customary international law (para. 123).
However, having found that the precautionary principle was, at least, part of international
environmental law, the AB ought to have considered the relevance of the precautionary
principle, pursuant to 31.3(c) of the Vienna Convention, which refers not only to customary
or general principles but to ‘any relevant rules of international law applicable in the relations
between the parties’. From the perspective of a Trade Stakeholder model on dispute
settlement, the openness of the panels and Appellate Body to the use of non-trade
international law will be of considerable importance, in bringing the relevant diverse values
and constituencies into dispute settlement, where the dispute relates to the interface
beween the liberal trade regime and other policy regimes, both national and international.
From this perspective, we fully endorse the concerns of Palmeter and Mavroidis about the
rationale for rejecting as irrelevant international environmental treaties given by the Tuna/
Dolphin II panel. The panel suggested that these agreements were irrelevant, because they
were not concluded among the Contracting Parties to the General Agreement, and that
they did not apply to the interpretation of the General Agreement or the application of
its provisions,48 suggesting that the GATT was a self-contained regime, sealed off from the
norms and rules of other international regimes and the values and constituencies that these
reflect. As Palmeter and Mavroidis note, this reasoning is clearly inconsistent with 31.3(c)
of the Vienna Convention, which as noted refers to the relevance of ‘any’ relevant rules
applicable between the parties.49 In Turtles, the AB applied International environmental law
(including soft law) in order to interpret the scope of the expression ‘exhaustible natural
resources’ in Art. XX(g) of the GATT. The AB rightly adopted a dynamic approach to
Treaty interpretation, recognizing that developments in International environmental law
were relevant to giving meaning to words drafted more than fifty years ago. This dynamic
approach is clearly consistent with the structure of the Vienna Convention—Art. 31, which
deals with obligatory sources of Treaty interpretation includes law developed subsequent to
the drafting of a treaty, while Art. 32—which deals with optimal and secondary sources of
interpretation—refers to evidence of original intent. In Alcoholic Beverages, the AB
considered the status of adopted panel reports as a source of WTO law. With Article IX of
the WTO Agreement in mind, which as noted above gives the Ministerial Conference and
General Council the exclusive authority to adopt interpretations of covered agreements, the
AB held that adopted panel reports could not have the status of binding precedents with
respect to interpretation of the agreements, even if as Decisions they are binding on the
Parties to the dispute. Nevertheless, past adopted panels ‘create legitimate expectations
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among WTO Members, and, therefore, should be taken into account where they are
relevant to any dispute’ (p. 14). The AB endorsed the panels condusion that unadopted
panel reports ‘have no legal status in the GATT or WTO system’ although on occasion they
might provide ‘useful guidance’ to a panel (p. 15). In Argentina—Measures Affecting Imports of
Footwear, Textiles, Apparel and Other Items, the AB, however, criticized the panel for relying
on unadopted panel rulings as legal authority (Report of the Appellate Body, Adopted 22
April 1998, WT/DS56/AB, R). In a number of contexts, panels may be required to refer
to or interpret municipal law, and indeed review the manner in which that law has been
interpreted and applied by the internal tribunals and authorities—this is most obviously the
case with respect to the TRIPs Agreement and the Subsidies and Antidumping Agreements,
which specify certain standards which a Member’s domestic law and legal proceedings must
meet. The issues surrounding interpretation of domestic law, or its invocation in
interpretation of covered agreements, have been canvassed in the section above on standard
of review.

Panel Procedures (Articles 12–15, 18, and 20)

There are few rules of evidence or formal due process that govern panel procedures. Article
12.2 of the DSU emphasizes the importance of ‘flexibility’ to obtain high-quality panel
reports. Some detailed Working Procedures are set out in Appendix 3 of the DSU but these
are mostly of a logistical nature. There are normally two meetings between the panel and
the Parties and at least two opportunities for Parties to make written submissions.
Normally, the complaining Party makes its first submission before that of the responding
Party, so that the latter party’s submission can contain a response to that of the former.
Reversing the panel, the AB held in Bananas that ‘There is no requirement in the DSU or in
GATT practice for arguments on all claims…to be set out in a complaining party’s written
submission to the panel’; omissions can be corrected in subsequent submissions (paras. 145–
6). Perhaps most disappointing from the perspective of a Trade Stakeholder model of
dispute settlement, is that the DSU continues GATT practice that panel deliberations are
confidential (Article 14). The Rules of Conduct50 with respect to settlement of disputes go
beyond even this language, and refer not only to the confidentiality of dispute settlement
deliberations, but also of proceedings. Worse still, Article 18.2 provides that ‘written
submissions to the panel or the Appellate Body shall be treated as confidential’. While
Members may disclose publicly their own position and demand of the other Party a
summary of its position for public consumption, stakeholders have no direct access
whatever to submissions on disputes that affect them This, of course, falls far short of the
transparency and publicity norms of many municipal legal systems. Concern about these
shortcomings, particularly on the part of the United States, has produced some modest
progress towards greater publicity and transparency, as reflected in the Decision on Procedures
for the Circulation and Derestriction of WTO Documents.51 At least, now, panel reports are to be
derestricted rapidly; as well, through the WTO web site (www.wto.org), stakeholders
have immediate and free access to documents such as requests for consultations and panels,
and the Terms of Reference of the panels. This at least allows for publicity concerning what
measures are or may be challenged in dispute settlement and the nature of the complaining
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Party’s legal claims (if not the detailed arguments of the Parties). Also, through the web site
there is free access to all adopted panel and AB decisions, and many other now derestricted
documents related to dispute settlement—in the past, even unrestricted material was often
difficult to obtain without contacts in the Secretariat, and was frequently not published in
accessible form until long after being in theory publicly available. Rightly, the United States
is pressing for further action on this front; thus, on 19 February 1998 it communicated to
the General Council of the WTO its desire to put transparency on the Council’s current
agenda, in order to review progress in implementing the derestriction decision, as well as to
raise additional issues with respect to transparency.52 Normally, panel procedings are not to
exceed in duration a period of six months from the date of composition of the panel to
issuance of the final report to the Parties (or three months in cases of urgency). An
extension of up to three months is possible in non-urgent cases (Article 12.8–9). The
practice of circulating an interim report to the Parties for comment, prior to the drafting of
a final report, is reflected in Article 15.

Representation of Parties

Traditionally, in GATT practice, only governmental officials represented the Parties before
panel proceedings, although some Parties had resort to outside counsel for opinions and
advice. This placed developing countries, who were unlikely to have large armies of in-
house expert trade counsel, at a considerable disadvantage in pursuing complaints.
However, there was no textual basis for this practice. In Bananas, the AB held it could find
no legal basis, either in WTO treaty law, or in customary international law for interfering
with the choice of a Member as to who represents it before the AB (para. 10) Nevertheless,
the AB stressed that it was not deciding the issue of representation in panel proceedings, which
had not been appealed. It is difficult to believe that the same principles would not,
however, apply to panel proceedings and in the Indonesian Autos case the panel so found
(Indonesia—Certain Measures Affecting the Automobile Industry, Report of the Panel, 2 July 1998,
WT/DS 54, 55, 59, 64/R). Opening up the process to non-governmental counsel is a
positive development from the perspective of the Trade Stakeholder model; it reduces
somewhat the control by governmental and diplomatic élites over the process, and also may
erode somewhat the logic of confidentiality, since it is not easy to bind private lawyers to
confidentiality of a type to which they are not accustomed, unlike diplomats and
bureaucrats.

Relief

A panel, when it concludes that a measure violates a covered agreement ‘shall recommend
that the Member concerned [footnote omitted] bring the measure into conformity with that
agreement’ (Article 19.1). As well, a panel may suggest ways in which the Member
concerned could implement the recommendations. It is an important issue whether a
recommendation that a measure be brought into conformity can encompass a
recommendation for specific relief, for example the refunding of antidumping or
countervailing duties collected in contravention of the provisions of a covered agreement. As
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Petersmann notes, five GATT panel reports have recommended this kind of relief, which he
refers to as ‘restitution in kind’.53 Given that Article 3.4 of the DSU states that
‘Recommendations or rulings made by the DSB shall be aimed at achieving a satisfactory
settlement of the matter’, and that the principles of GATT Article XXIII dispute settlement
are affirmed in Article 3.1, it would be surprising if the language in Article 19 had been
intended to narrow the scope of alternatives already available to a panel to achieve a
‘satisfactory settlement’ under pre-existing GATT practice.

Adoption of Panel Reports (Article 16)

Panel reports are to be adopted by the DSB within 60 days of circulation to Members, unless
a consensus exists against adoption. Since such a consensus would normally include the winning
Party, this amounts to adoption as of right. This is a radical reversal of the GATT practice
prior to the WTO, which required a consensus in favour of adoption of panel reports.
Curiously, Article 16 does not specify how soon after circulation to the Parties of a final
report it must be circulated to Members. Article 12.7 merely states that the panel shall
submit its findings to the DSB ‘in the form of a written report’ when the parties have failed
to develop a mutually satisfactory solution. This however is arguably subject to Article
20, which stipulates, ‘Unless otherwise agreed to by the parties to the dispute, the period
of the date of establishment of the panel by the DSB until the date at the DSB considers the
panel or appellate report for adoption shall as a general rule not exceed nine months where
the panel report is not appealed or 12 months where the report is appealed.’

Appellate Review (Article 17)

Article 17 provides for the establishment of a standing Appellate Body, comprised of seven
‘persons of recognized authority, with demonstrated expertise in law, international trade,
and the covered agreements generally’, a major innovation in dispute settlement. These
individuals are appointed for a four-year, once renewable term, and hear appeals in panels of
three. If notice of appeal is not filed prior to adoption by the DSB, the panel report will
become the binding settlement of the dispute— thus, notice must be filed within 60 days
following the circulation of the final report to Members. The AB is to complete its review
within 60 days from the filing of the notice of appeal, with the possibility of extension to 90
days. Detailed procedures relating to submissions, hearings and such are contained in the
AB’s Working Procedures for Appeal.54 This also contains rules of conduct for AB
members concerning, inter alia, conflict of interest. Proceedings of the Appellate Body are
confidential (DSU 17.10). The ‘appeal shall be limited to issues of law covered in the panel
report and legal interpretations developed by the panel’ (17.6). As already discussed, issues
of law may include whether the panel conducted its own operations in accordance with the
requirements of the DSU and of the relevant WTO law, and not only panel findings related
to claims that the responding Party was in violation of provisions of covered agreeements.
Thus, in Hormones, the AB reviewed the treatment by the panel of the factual record, and
certain of its findings of fact, for consistency with the obligation of ‘objective assessment of
the facts’ in Article 11 of the DSU. In Hormones as well, the AB determined that a decision
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to exclude evidence on the basis of non-relevancy is reviewable for error of law (para. 143)
A panel’s interpretation of a Member’s municipal law for purposes of determining whether
that law conforms with the provisions of a required agreement is also reviewable (Indian
Patents, para. 68). The Appellate Body ‘may uphold, modify or reverse the legal findings and
conclusions of the panel’. As Petersmann notes, this does not include ‘(explicit) power for
remanding the case back to the panel’.55 Such remands would not normally be consistent
with the concern that pervades the DSU for timeliness in the settlement of disputes;
however, where the AB has found that the panel’s treatment of the factual record did not
conform to the requirements of the DSU, a remand might be an appropriate alternative to
merely quashing the panel’s findings and any resultant recommendations; in recent cases,
such as Periodicals and Turtles, the AB has instead resorted to what it calls ‘completing the
analysis’, applying its own interpretation of the law to the factual record. Appellate Body
reports are to be adopted on the basis of the same negative consensus rule applicable to
panel reports, within 30 days of circulation to Members. From a Trade Stakeholder
perspective, the AB may be the most important innovation in the dispute settlement
system. Appeals make panel decisions contestable and they subject those decisions to
scrutiny against juridical norms, making the panel process much less susceptible to
manipulation by an inside professional élite. In this connection, it is important that the DSU
stipulates that AB members may not be affiliated with any government, and that they are
appointed directly by the DSB, without nomination by the Secretariat. Further, the AB has
its own legal support services, at least formally separate from those in the Secretariat who
advise the panels.

Implementation (Article 21)

Within 30 days of the adoption of a panel or AB report, the losing Party must inform the
DSB of the steps it intends to take to implement the recommendations and rulings adopted.
Where immediate compliance is ‘impracticable’, a Member may have a ‘reasonable period
of time’ to bring itself into conformity. A reasonable period of time may be determined by
the DSB on the basis of proposals from the losing Party, or by agreement between the
Parties, or through binding arbitration. Disagreements over whether implementation
measures are adequate are to be referred back to the original panel wherever possible,
which is to circulate its report within 90 days of the referral. The Barings case has raised some
difficult interpretive issues related to how this procedure interacts with procedures for
suspension of concessions in Article 22.

Compensation and Suspension of Concessions (Article 22)

Compensation and suspension of concessions are available to the complaining Party if the
adopted panel or AB report is not implemented within a reasonable period of time.
Compensation is a voluntary alternative to implementing a ruling; suspension of
concessions requires authorization by the DSB, subject to a number of conditions and
criteria listed in 22.3 and related provisions of this Article.
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Exclusivity of WTO Procedures (Article 23)

Article 23 requires Members to resort exclusively to WTO dispute settlement procedures
to seek ‘redress’ for a violation of a covered agreement. In some instances, a complaint may
be brought under both WTO procedures and the procedures of some other trading regime,
such as NAFTA, in respect of the same measures. Since NAFTA incorporates many
provisions of the GATT and (prospectively) some in the WTO,56 an issue arises as to
whether a Member is prohibited from raising issues related to these provisions in a
complaint under NAFTA dispute set-tlement procedures. This issue is further complicated
by the NAFTA’s own choice of forum rules, which will be discussed later in this chapter. 

Non-Violation Nullification and Impairment (GATT Articles
XXIII(l)(b), DSU Article 26)

Under Article XXIII(l)(b) of the GATT, as interpreted in GATT practice, a Contracting
Party could have recourse to dispute settlement even where no violation of a specific
provision of the GATT was complained of, if a benefit was considered to be nullified or
impaired by the conduct of another Member. This served the Regime Management goal of
maintaining a cooperative-equilibrium over time, through vindicating the reasonable
expectations of Contracting Parties concerning the benefits obtained from reciprocal
concessions even where the conduct threatening to undermine them was not specified
explicitly and prohibited in the GATT. This logic is articulated in a general statement
concerning non-viola-tion nullification and impairment in the Oilseeds panel:

The idea underlying [non-violation nullification and impairment] is that the improved
competitive opportunities that can legitimately be expected from a tariff concession
can be frustrated not only by measures proscribed by the General Agreement but also
by measures consistent with that Agreement In order to encourage contracting
parties to make tariff concessions they must therefore be given a right of redress
when a reciprocal concession is impaired by another contracting party as a result of
the application of any measure, whether or not it conflicts with the General
Agreement.57

It follows from this that to invoke non-violation nullification and impairment, the
complaining Party must be able to identify a specific tariff concession or concessions and a
benefit flowing from these concessions, or reasonably expected to flow, that has been
undermined as a consequence of the measures complained of. Article 26 of the DSU stipulates
that in the case of non-violation nullification and impairment complaints, ‘the complaining
party shall present a detailed justification in support of any complaint’ and that where non-
violation nullification and impairment has occurred there is no requirement to withdraw the
measure; instead the panel or Appellate Body is to recommend a ‘mutually satisfactory
adjustment’.
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DISPUTE SETTLEMENT IN THE NAFTA

Background: the Canada-US FTA

The Canada-US Free Trade Agreement (FTA or ‘the Agreement’) provided two main
avenues for the resolution of disputes between its signatories. Chapter 18 of the Agreement
set up a Commission to resolve disputes; Chapter 19 detailed procedures for resolving
problems in antidumping and countervailing duty cases. The Chapter 18 and 19
mechanisms involved the use of consultation, negotiation, and panels—all of which
resembled dispute resolution mechanisms in the GATT under Article XXIII(2). The
Agreement also appears to have benefited from experience under the GATT, and to have
adopted some of the improvements which were introduced into its procedures post-Tokyo
Round.58

Chapter 18

Article 1801 of the FTA stated that Chapter 18 is for the ‘avoidance or settlement of all
disputes regarding the interpretation or application of this Agreement’ except insofar as any
dispute relates to the provisions of Chapter 17 (Financial Services) or Chapter 19
(Antidumping and Countervailing Duty Cases).59 It established the Canada-US Trade
Commission (‘the Commission’) to supervise the implementation of the Agreement, to
resolve disputes under it, ‘to oversee its further elaboration, and to consider any other
matter that may affect its operation’.60

Articles 1803–4 laid down the procedures for notification and consultation regarding
actual or proposed measures that might materially affect the operation of the FTA. The FTA
required the Parties to notify each other of such measures in advance of implementation or
as soon thereafter as possible. It also gave each Party the right to ask the other for
information regarding these measures.61 Article 1804 allowed each Party the right to
consultations regarding any measures or any other matter material to the FTA, and it
exhorts the Parties to make every effort to reach mutually agreed upon solutions to
problems that arise in these consulta-tions.62 If consultations did not allow the Parties to
resolve their differences within 30 days, then Article 1805 permitted either Party to request
a meeting of the Commission, which was to convene within 10 days (unless otherwise
agreed) to attempt ‘to resolve the dispute promptly’.63

If a dispute was not resolved within 30 days of being referred to the Commission, that
Commission must in the case of a dispute over safeguard actions or64 (in the case of other
actions) may refer the dispute to binding arbitration,65 failing which either Party had the
right to request the establishment of a panel of experts ‘to consider the matter’.66 The panel
was to be drawn ‘wherever possible’ from nominated lists of unaffiliated individuals who
have been chosen by each country on the basis of their expertise, objectivity, reliability, and
sound judgment.67 A panel would have five members, two from each country and a chair
chosen by agreement between Parties, failing which the Commission could intervene. If the
Commission could not agree, the chair would be chosen by lot from the roster.
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A panel would determine its own procedures, subject to the requirement of at least one
oral hearing, as well as the right to present written submissions and rebuttal arguments.
Proceedings were confidential and the panel was required to base its decision solely on
submissions (unless otherwise agreed by the Parties).68

Once the Commission received the final report, it was to agree on a resolution of the
dispute in question ‘normally’ in conformity with the recommendations of the panel.69

‘Whenever possible’, this resolution was to be the non-implementa-tion or withdrawal of
measures not conforming with or causing nullification or impairment of benefits accruing
under the FTA.70 If the Commission could not reach agreement within 30 days of the
receipt of the final report, or if a Party refused to comply with the findings of a panel under
the binding arbitration provisions of Article 1806, then the other Party could suspend the
application of equivalent benefits to that Party.71

During the lifetime of the FTA, only fine disputes were remitted to panels under
Chapter 18: one relating to Canadian salmon and herring landing requirements; another
relating to the treatment of non-mortgage interest on land or plant and machinery for
purposes of rules of origin; another relating to whether exports of durum wheat to the USA
by the Canadian Wheat Board were occurring below acquisition cost; another relating to
the adoption of regulations in Puerto Rico that precluded continuing sales of ultra-high
temperature (UHT) milk by a Quebec producer to Puerto Rican consumers; and another
which concerned a US ban on ‘undersized’ lobsters.

Chapter 20 of NAFTA

Chapter 20 of NAFTA incorporates the essential structure of dispute settlement provided in
Chapter 18 of the FTA. Under the FTA, disputes that fell under Article 18 arising under
that Agreement and the GATT could be settled in either forum at the discretion of the
complaining Party, although once an election had been made, this excluded the alternative
dispute settlement process (Article 1801). Under NAFTA, however, where disputes relate
to environmental and conservation matters or sanitary and phytosanitary measures the
responding Party may insist that a complaint be heard by a NAFTA, rather than GATT
panel (Article 2005). In such cases, a disputing Party may request, or a panel on its own
initiative may solicit, a written report of a scientific review board on any factual issue
concerning such matters (Article 2015). There is an interesting issue of how these rules
interact with the provisions of exclusivity of WTO dispute settlement procedures in Article
23 of the DSU, discussed above. Under Vienna Convention principles, the DSU might be
argued to modify or prevail over the NAFTA provisions, as an agreement later in time. If
this is so, then a NAFTA Party would be prohibited from pursuing its WTO claim in the
NAFTA process by virtue of the DSU; this would mean that, by virtue of the election rules,
it would be deemed to have chosen the WTO forum, and thereby would not be able to
pursue its NAFTA claim at all, since the WTO dispute settlement procedures do not
provide panels with the jurisdiction to consider violations of NAFTA provisions (however,
since many GATT provisions are incorporated into NAFTA, but for the DSU, a Party might
have been able to pursue both sets of claims in NAFTA Chapter 20 dispute settlement).
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Other changes from the FTA in NAFTA Chapter 20 include: (1) instead of separate
national rosters of respective panellists, as provided under Chapter 18 of the FTA, the
NAFTA contemplates a consensus roster of up to thirty persons acceptable to all member
countries; (2) instead of disputing Parties selecting nominees from the roster who are their
own nationals, NAFTA calls for a process of reverse selection, by which Parties must select
from the other country’s nationals on the roster; (3) unlike the FTA, NAFTA permits third
country and non-member country nationals to serve as a chair of a panel; (4) unlike the
FTA, disputes regarding financial services are fully subject to dispute settlement, through
specialized procedures designed to ensure appropriate panel expertise (Chapter 14); and (5)
under the investment provisions of NAFTA (Chapter 11) any NAFTA investor who alleges
that a host government has breached an obligation of the investment chapter may invoke an
arbitral tribunal to hear the matter. Investment obligations include requirements for
National Treatment and Most Favoured Nation treatment, as well as certain disciplines on
specified performance requirements, rules against restricting transfers, and against
expropriation without compensation. Procedures may be based on ICSID or its Additional
Facility, or on the UNCITRAL Rules for such arbitrations. Procedures are provided to enable
consolidation of cases, to avoid procedural harassment, and for the intervention of
governments responsible for the Agreement both individually before the arbitral tribunal or
collectively through the issuance of Commission interpretations of the Agreement on
questions that may be before the arbitral tribunal. Awards for monetary damages are
directly enforceable in the domestic courts of the NAFTA members as if they were
domestic court judgments. Thus, in the investment context, private Parties are given direct
access to international dispute resolution mechanisms for the first time in an international
trade treaty. So far, Article 20 procedures in NAFTA have only been invoked in one case,
the Agricultural Tariffication panel, discussed in Chapter 10 on trade in agriculture in this
book; a case that was brought under the investment arbitration procedures, the Ethyl case,
is briefly discussed in Chapter 13 on trade and investment.

Chapter 19 of the FTA and NAFTA

As a middle power whose main trade partner is the United States, Canada long relied on the
rules and processes of international trade law—including the process of GATT dispute
settlement—to constrain American protectionism. With the rise of administered protection
in the 1970s and 1980s—particularly in the form of harassment of Canadian exporters by
countervailing duty and antidumping actions—the multilateral legal framework appeared
increasingly incapable of maintaining open borders between Canada and the United States,
despite conventional tariffs having been reduced to low levels in the GATT negotiations.
Curbing these forms of administered protection was stated to be a central concern of
Canada’s FTA negotiators.72

In the event, the United States did not accept any substantive limitation whatever on the
application of trade remedy laws within North America. The Americans did agree to a
process of review of domestic countervail and anti-dump determinations by ad hoc binational
panels, which in the context of American trade authorities, would replace appellate review
by the US Court of International Trade (CIT). Canadian trade analysts generally viewed the
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CIT as extremely deferential to the determinations of the US agencies, the International
Trade Administration (ITA) of the Department of Commerce and the International Trade
Commission (ITC).73 Binational review would at least subject these agency decisions to
scrutiny against basic US administrative law standards of reasonableness and the
requirement to base one’s decision on substantial evidence from the record. This binational
procedure is set out in Chapter 19 of the FTA and NAFTA.

Article 1904 of the FTA provides that binational panels shall replace judicial review of
the ‘final determinations’ of domestic trade authorities of the two countries in countervail
and antidumping cases.74 At the request of either Party, a panel may consider and issue a
binding decision as to whether such a final determination is in conformity with the domestic
trade remedy law of the importing country. The standard of review is that laid down by the
relevant statutes (as amended from time to time) of each Party, and by ‘the general legal
principles that a court of the importing Party would otherwise apply’. Requests for panels
must be made within 30 days of the issuance of a final determination. While only a Party
may request a panel, Article 1904:5 allows interests that would normally be enti-tled to
judicial review under domestic law to petition as of right their government to establish a
panel. This means that, in practice, the panel process is largely driven not by governments
but private litigants, with producer interests in both countries heavily represented by
counsel throughout the process.

In the case of US countervail and antidumping decisions the panel’s standard of review is
largely derived from the general principles of US administrative law. The standards require
that agency determinations represent reasonable interpretations of US law (i.e. not necessarily
correct but at least defensible as one of several possible reasonable interpretations of the law)
and that findings of fact be supported by substantial evidence on the record, i.e. enough
evidence that would allow a reasonable person to draw the inference in question.75

Where a binational panel deems that a finding is not in accordance with a reasonable
interpretation of the law, or is not supported by substantial evidence on the record, its
powers are limited to remanding the matter to the domestic agency that made the original
determination, to reconsider its findings in light of the panel’s recommendations. Thus, the
binational panel itself is powerless to remove duties, it can only order the domestic authorities in
question to redetermine the matter. Where dissatisfied with a redetermination, the only
recourse of an exporter is to have its government request yet another panel. In a number of
cases two or three panels have been necessary before the domestic agency in question
brought its decision in line with the law (or gave up on finding adequate evidence to
support it) and removed or reduced duties.

Panel decisions are made by majority vote, and reasons (majority, concurring,
dissenting) are provided in writing. Panellists are chosen from rosters of trade experts
provided by the two countries, with two of the five members chosen by each country and
the fifth by agreement between them, and in the case of an inability to agree, the fifth
panellist may be selected by the two others, or if that fails, by lot from the entire roster.
(As will be discussed in Part III, the criteria for panellists have changed with NAFTA.)

Article 1904 of the FTA (13) provides for an ‘Extraordinary Challenge’ mechanism,
whereby a panel ruling may be appeared to an Extraordinary Challenge Committee (ECC),
composed of three persons, who must be judges or former judges of a US federal court or a

80 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



court of superior jurisdiction in Canada. The grounds for an extraordinary challenge are: (a)
a panel member was guilty of gross misconduct, (b) the panel seriously departed from a
fundamental rule of procedure, or (c) the panel manifestly exceeded its powers, authority
or jurisdiction as set forth in Chapter 19. Only, however, where the ECC determines that
the panel’s decision has been materially affected by one or more of these defects and the
integrity of the binational review process is threatened will an Extraordinary Challenge
succeed. (As will be discussed in Part III, the grounds of an Extraordinary Challenge have
been substantially broadened in NAFTA.)

Experience with the binational review process to date

The early prognosis for the capacity of binational panel review to constrain US
protectionism was largely positive. Reviewing several years experience with the process,
Trebilcock and Boddez found, in 1993, that ‘the panels will use the substantial evidence test
in such a way as to reduce barriers by placing greater restrictions on the administrative
discretion exercised by the ITC and ITA.’76 Other, earlier studies reached similar
conclusions.77 In a more recent study, up to and including the Softwood Lumber case (but
published before its final aftermath), John Mercury found that ‘Canadian exporters realized
substantial reduction in duties following appeal to binational panels while US exporters
enjoyed no such success.’78 According to Mercury, ‘the reduction of duties in nine out of
fourteen AD/CVD cases is a significant accomplishment for Canadian exporters’, and the
average reduction from the initial duty imposed was substantial, amounting to 28.20%.79

However, what portion of this number can be attributed to binational panel review, as well
as how the figure was derived, remain unclear. It should also be noted that the 28.20%
average assumed that the impact of removal of 100% of duty in Softwood Lumber would not be
affected through American legislative action as it has been.

While this seems impressive, it may conceal several major limitations in the success of
the process. First of all, while the 28.20% figure appears substantial, it should be
remembered that even a reduction of this amount will not necessarily substantially increase
market access; even when lessened by this much, depending upon the nature of the market,
and elasticities of supply and demand, countervail and antidumping duties will provide
producers with a substantial price advantage over imports. The best test of the success of
the process from the point of view of Canadian exporters is the extent to which their sales
in the US market have increased due to the reduction in price advantage to domestic US
producers attendant upon reduction in duties. None of the studies, including Mercury’s and
the earlier work of Trebilcock and Boddez, examines the success of the binational review
process against this criterion.

Second, even where victorious, the complainant to a binational panel must pay its own
legal costs. Mercury and Trebilcock and Boddez fail to provide data on these costs, or to
estimate the extent to which they mitigate the gains from reduction in duties. Michael
P.Ryan, an analyst associated with the Brookings Institution, has estimated costs in the
typical case as between US$200,000 and US$300,000 per litigant,80 although this would
presumably be much higher in complicated, multi-stage disputes like Pork and Softwood
Lumber. Senior practitioners have provided estimates of around US$500,000-US$600,000.
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But this is anecdotal evidence. As Mercury himself notes, in a number of major cases it has
taken two or more remands before the US agencies actually removed the duties. Thus,
while panel review is touted as a much more timely process than appeal to the US Court of
International Trade, in fact in many of the more controversial cases, including the Carbon
Steel and Softwood Lumber cases, the delay has been almost as great as or greater than the CIT
historic average of 734 days.81 Moreover, costs and delays are exacerbated by the
requirement that separate panels review determinations of the existence of subsidization or
dumping and determinations of injury. Thus, in the Softwood Lumber case, where there were
three remands on injury and two on the issue of subsidization, five separate proceedings
were implicated in a single dispute.

Binational panels have become impatient with the failure of the US agencies to respond
adequately in remand determinations to failures in their initial analysis, or alternately, to
shift the ground, either legal or evidentiary or both, of their decision to impose duties, so as
merely to evade the panels’ criticisms. Thus, in several cases, including Softwood Lumber,
they have essentially said to the agency that the process cannot go on forever, and that, since
the agency has repeatedly failed to support its findings on the basis of law and evidence, it must
remove duties. This practice was unanimously upheld in Extraordinary Challenges in the
Pork and Live Swine cases. However, this practice has also led to criticism of the process by
politicians and producer interests in the United States.

More importantly, whatever the ultimate significance of the early success that Canadian
exporters achieved with the binational panel process, this very success has led to
considerable criticism of the process in the US. Much of this criticism has centred on the
supposedly undeferential treatment of US agency decisions by the panels. It was thought that
the trade experts on the panels, insufficiently impressed with the analysis of the ITA and
ITC, were taking the opportunity to use their special knowledge to redo or relitigate as it were
the original decisions, rather than merely insuring that they were reasonable in legal
interpretation and supported by some factual evidence. At least until Softwood Lumber,
Extraordinary Challenge panels were unanimous in rejecting the view that a panel’s
interpretation of the standard of review could easily become a basis for finding that it had
man-ifestly exceeded its jurisdiction, although these decisions did leave the door open, in
egregious cases, to finding excess of jurisdiction where a panel clearly misstated the
administrative law of the country whose ruling is appealed against, or where it failed to
‘conscientiously apply’ that law. However, a panel’s conscientious, good faith
interpretation of the law even where contrary interpretations would also be reasonable, was
clearly a mere ‘legal issue’ and not a grounds for finding manifest excess of jurisdiction.
Despite these weaknesses, it is certainly true that in the more routine cases, binational
panels have disposed of appeals more expeditiously than the CIT, and the quality of legal
and economic analysis employed by the panels has been high. 

Changes to the binational panel review process in NAFTA

During the NAFTA negotiations and especially in their final phases, a concerted assault was
launched on the binational panel process in the US Congress, focusing on the absence of
deference to US agencies and the supposed incorrect application of US law by several
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panels.82 While much of this criticism clearly represents ‘sour grapes’ due to the number of
cases which US domestic producer interests had lost, several genuine concerns about the
legitimacy and coherence of the process were also in play. First of all, it is generally
acknowledged by those with a knowledge of both systems, that the Canadian and American
administrative law standards for judicial review of agency determinations are different. This
asymmetry is built into the panel process itself, of course, such that where US interests are
challenging a Canadian agency determination, the panel must apply the Canadian
administrative law standard, as embodied in the Federal Court Act, which is one of
significantly greater deference to agency decision-making than the US standard. While error
of law is a basis for overturning a Canadian agency decision, with respect to errors of fact
the threshold is very high indeed: the finding must have been made in a perverse or
capricious manner without regard to the evidence before the agency or tribunal. This
standard has been interpreted in recent Supreme Court decisions as requiring a very high
level of deference to agency decisions.83 By contrast, it will be recalled, American law
requires that any finding not based on substantial evidence on the record be overturned.
Thus, American interests do not have equal opportunity to have adverse Canadian agency
findings reversed by panels as do Canadian interests with respect to US agency findings. A
second area of legitimate concern has been that since each panel is an ad hoc decision-maker
in a particular dispute, approaches of different panels to legal issues need not be consistent.
This leads to lack of legal certainty; ironically, arbitrariness in agency legal interpretation
may now be replaced by inconsistent panel rulings. The most obvious case of inconsistency
has been panel interpretation of the specificity test in US countervailing duty law, and
particularly whether all of a number of factors that go to de facto specificity must be
considered by the Agency: the Magnesium panel considered that this was not necessary,
while one of the Softwood Lumber panels, which was ruling almost at the same time,
answered that all factors must be weighed. And the Extraordinary Challenge procedure
does not provide a means of clarifying inconsistent panel rulings so as to produce legal
coherence for the future.

A third, related concern that has some legitimacy is that even if the panels are applying
the US standard of review in an acceptable manner, they are nevertheless evolving the law
in a somewhat different fashion than are the US courts with respect to countervail and
antidumping actions that apply to all other countries. At one level, this may be the result of
a misunderstanding of the process because, at least in theory, any future binational panel
would be bound by the rulings of the US courts in cases dealing with NAFTA non-parties as
one aspect of the ‘law’ that it must apply. Nevertheless, in practice, the fact that two very
different kinds of institutions are evolving the US law as it applies to different countries,
suggests the potential for some lack of legal coherence.

The changes that US negotiators insisted on in NAFTA reflect the weight attached by the
US Congress and the Administration to these various concerns. The grounds for
Extraordinary Challenge review have now been extended to include failure ‘to apply the
appropriate standard of review’.84 This is, in fact, a very broad rubric, going far beyond the
notion in the Swine and Pork that Extraordinary Challenge review may be available where the
standard of review has clearly been incorrectly articulated or not applied conscientiously,
i.e. not in good faith. ‘Appropriate’ is a vague legal category, and leaves ample room for
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voicing objections to just about any panel ruling. In this respect, it is significant that unlike
the FTA, the NAFTA provisions on Extraordinary Challenges explicitly invite the
Extraordinary Challenge Committee, in effect, to re-open the whole case through
‘examination of the legal and factual analysis underlying the findings and conclusions of the
panel’s decision’ (Annex 1904.13(3)). To permit the Extraordinary Challenge Committee
the opportunity to re-examine the whole case, the period for Extraordinary Challenge
review has been tripled from 30 to 90 days. The Ways and Means Committee of the US
House of Representatives all but suggests that these changes will turn the Extraordinary
Challenge procedure into another kick at the can:

By expanding the period of review and requiring ECCs to look at the panel’s
underlying legal and factual analysis, the changes to Annex 1904 clarify that the
ECC’s responsibilities do not end with simply ensuring that the panel articulated the
correct standard of review. Rather, ECCs are also to examine whether the panel
correctly analyzed the substantive law and underlying facts.85

Finally, with respect to the primary panels themselves, the roster of panellists is to ‘include
sitting or retired judges to the fullest extent practicable’ (Annex 1901.2(1)). This
represents a major change from the FTA, which allowed for rosters to be dominated by
experts in international trade law and economics. The full import of this change can only be
understood when one recognizes that the kind of errors in US agency determinations
identified by binational panels, especially as they relate to the ‘substantial evidence’ standard
of review, involve the examination of complex methodologies, empirical economic studies,
including econometric modelling, and sometimes, dozens of specific calculations. Counsel
for these cases are usually highly experienced experts from the trade bar, supported by teams
of consulting economists and econometricians.86

Softwood Lumber: the binational panel review process at the
brink

The Softwood Lumber case may be considered as a kind of acid test of the binational panel
review process. Very significant exports (several $billion per annum) were at stake in an
industry of considerable importance to the Canadian economy. The high trade politics of
the dispute were precisely of the kind that require diffusing by a rules-based impartial
transnational dispute settlement process, as illustrated by the fact that an early initial US
agency ruling in Canada’s favour was reversed after enormous Congressional pressure
(although, of course, it is impossible to prove such a causal relationship). Yet instead of
demonstrating the value of the binational panel review process where major Canadian
export interests are at stake and protectionist pressures below the border are high, the Softwood
Lumber case illustrates its fragility, and perhaps futility in such ‘high stakes’ trade disputes.
And indeed the result of the Extraordinary Challenge has been to create a legitimacy crisis
for the whole process—ironically, and perhaps characteristic of Canadian timidity—this
crisis is mainly located in the United States, whereas the fact that years of hardwon
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Canadian panel victories have been reversed politically should be leading Canadians to
question the worth of the whole exercise.

To appreciate the significance of Softwood Lumber, a brief overview of the history of the
dispute is necessary.

Since the early 1980s, the American softwood lumber industry has claimed that the
stumpage fees payable by the Canadian logging companies to the government are set below
the resource rents that would be payable in a competitive market, thereby constituting a
‘subsidy’ that results in lower log costs for lumber producers than would prevail under
competitive market conditions.

In 1983, the US industry brought a countervailing duty action against softwood lumber
imports from Canada. In this action, the ITA found that there was no countervailable
subsidy in Canadian stumpage programmes. This was based largely on the finding that the
programmes were not ‘specific’ within the meaning of US domestic trade law (the 1983
proceeding is known as Lumber I). It is a longstanding rule of US domestic trade law that
only ‘specific’ subsidies are countervailable. The distinction, at its most obvious, is between
subsidies directly targeted to particular industries and enterprises (for instance the bail-out
of a firm) and generally available benefits (such as education or health care).

The industry re-opened the case in 1986, claiming that it had new evidence that, through
administrative discretion exercised by provincial authorities, Canadian stumpage
programmes were being explicitly targeted to producers of softwood lumber and therefore
‘specific’.

In the 1986 proceeding, the Commerce Department did in fact reverse itself and found
that the ‘subsidy’ was specific within the meaning of US law, and therefore countervailable
(this proceeding is generally referred to as Lumber II). This reversal was based less on any
new evidence of targeting than on a different approach to the law than had been adopted in
Lumber I). Duties, however, were never imposed since the Canadian government came to a
negotiated arrangement with the United States whereby an export tax of 15% would be
imposed on softwood lumber exports to the US. This arrangement is referred to as the
Memorandum of Understanding (MOU). A 1987 amendment to the MOU exempted British
Columbia, on the basis of BC’s decision to increase stumpage fees (the Atlantic provinces
were exempted on slightly different grounds).

Under pressure from US domestic industry interests, Congress in 1988
explicitly expanded the definition of ‘specificity’ to include subsidies that, although not
directly or on their face targeted to specific industries or firms, in fact benefit only a small
number of industries or firms. The Commerce Department’s own internal rules for the
application of these statutory requirements [hereinafter, the Proposed Regulations] contain a
four-factor test for specificity, which encompasses an inquiry into both de jure specificity (or
targeting) as well as de facto specificity. This test is as follows:

In determining whether benefits are specific,…[Commerce] will consider, among
other things, the following factors:

(i) The extent to which a government acts to limit the availability of a program;
(ii) The number of enterprises, industries, or groups thereof that actually use a

program;
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(iii) Whether there are dominant users of a program, or whether certain
enterprises, industries, or groups thereof receive disproportionately large benefits
under a program; and

(iv) The extent to which a government exercises discretion in conferring benefits
under a program.

In 1991, Canada unilaterally terminated the MOU, and shortly thereafter the Commerce
Department itself initiated a new proceeding against Canadian lumber exporters, which is
known as Lumber III. The ITA’s final positive determination on subsidy [hereinafter, Find
Determination] was issued on 28 May 1992, following a preliminary positive determination in
March. The ITA found that the stumpage programmes in the various provinces conferred an
average subsidy of 2.91% (ranging from 1.25% for Alberta to 5.95% for Ontario).

The Canadian provinces and lumber industry requested review of the positive
determination by a binational panel, which issued its decision on 6 May 1993. The panel
remanded numerous matters for redetermination or clarification by the ITA. On a number
of issues, the panel found that the ITA had misapplied US law, and on other issues it found
that there was no evidentiary basis for choices the ITA made with respect to economic
methodology, or the conclusions it drew from economic evidence. On yet other matters,
the panel found that the legal standard the ITA was applying was unclear, ambiguous or
unarticulated. On 23 September, the ITA released its Determination on Remand, finding, in
fact, even higher rates of subsidization than had been found in the initial determination.

Specificity

In its Final Determination, the ITA had found that the Canadian stumpage programmes were
specific based solely on the second factor, i.e. small number of users. The Canadian complainants
had argued, on the basis of classifying the range of products manufactured from softwood
lumber, that 27 industries and 3,600 firms benefited from the programme. The ITA,
however, took the view that only two or three industries or industry groups benefited.
Nevertheless, the ITA ruled that, even on the Canadian view that 27 industries benefited,
this was still a small enough number to justify a finding of de facto specificity.

The panel, in its original Decision, accepted that there could be some extreme cases
where the limited number of users would be, in itself, sufficient to find specificity (such as
where only one or two companies were users of a programme). Nevertheless, the panel
held that ‘Clearly, the 3600-odd stumpage users in this case, representing between two and
twenty-seven industries (depending on the definition of industry being used), do not fall
into the category of extreme cases’ (at 38). Thus, the panel made a remand to the ITA
requiring it consider and weigh all four factors in the specificity test in determining whether
the stumpage programmes were specific. The panel also held that it was appropriate for the
ITA to take into account the extent to which the number of users was merely a function of
the ‘inherent characteristics of the industry’.

In its Determination. on Remand, the ITA actually attacked the panel’s interpretation of the
specificity test. The test, according to the ITA, could be applied sequentially, so that once
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one of the four factors pointed to specificity it was not necessary to consider the others.
With reluctance, the ITA did go on to consider the other three factors.

In weighing the four factors, the ITA found that the evidence of statutory limitation of
the programmes to the lumber industry and of administrative discretion was not sufficient
as to be dispositive on its own of a finding of specificity. By contrast, the number of users
and the dominant/disproportionate user factors pointed much more clearly to a finding of
specificity. In particular, ‘evaluation of the disproportionality factor provides compelling
evidence that stumpage is specific to the softwood lumber industry’ (at 48).

Market distortion

In its Final Determination, the ITA also rejected a Canadian argument that the existence of a
market distortion was a legal requirement for a finding of countervailable subsidy. The ITA
criticized one of the economic studies that the Canadian complainants relied on arguing that
no market distortion existed. The two studies the Canadians relied on were the Nordhaus
Study and the Nordhaus-Litan Study.

The Nordhaus-Litan Study performed a regression analysis to determine the effect on the
quantity of trees harvested when, pursuant to the amended Memorandum of Understanding
in 1987, British Columbia actually substantially increased its access fees for stumpage. The
study found an elasticity close to zero — i.e. increased access fees had not resulted in a
statistically significant decrease in the quantity of timber harvested.

In its original Decision, the panel reversed the ITA and found that, on a correct
interpretation of US law, the existence of market distortion was a legal precondition for a
finding of countervailable subsidy. As well, the panel found that the ITA’s rejection of the
Nordhaus Study was not supported by ‘substantial evidence on the record’. In particular,
the specific criticisms of the Nordhaus Study were based upon misunderstandings or
misinterpretation of what the Study said and of Dr Nordhaus’s testimony. Moreover, the
ITA had not produced any competing expert testimony or competing empirical studies of
significance.

Finally, the panel described the Nordhaus-Litan Study as the only empirical evidence
offered by either side on the issue of market distortion. and noted that the ITA had not even
mentioned, let alone rebutted this study.

In its Determination on Remand, the ITA stated criticisms of the Nordhaus Study similar to
those that the panel had already found not to be supported by ‘substantial evidence on the
record’. It also put forward what it described as an alternative theory of market distortion—
marginal cost theory. And finally, it made some criticisms of the Nordhaus-Litan Study and
attempted to perfect that Study by altering some of the variables.

Instead of leaving matters there, the ITA chose—apparently randomly—to change or
alter some of the variables in Nordhaus’s study and rerun the regressions. It appears that the
ITA, without explanation, simply decided to add the size of the harvest as a variable, and
with this change it was found that as stumpage access fees decrease, output increases. The
complete arbitrariness in the choice of variable gives rise to the suspicion that the ITA was
simply prepared to select anything that would give it the result it wanted when it reran the
regressions.
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After the Determination on Remand, the panel was once again convened to examine the
ITA’s findings. On specificity, the panel found that the ITA had failed to articulate any
rational, objective benchmark to sustain the conclusion that the subsidy was specific because
there were ‘too few’ users. In effect, the ITA had not gleaned from the case law any set of
legal or economic principles that could provide a benchmark for the meaning of ‘too few’,
and its own tests were inconsistent and based on highly debatable classifications of the
industries and firms who benefited from the alleged subsidy. With respect to the market
distortion argument of the Canadians, the panel found that the ITA continued to reject this
argument without there being any meaningful economic evidence in the record to refute it,
and furthermore, that the ITA’s reworking of the Canadian empirical study so as to yield a
result that suggested that price and output might be affected by the subsidy was not based
on a rational methodology. A majority of the panel, the three Canadian panellists, remanded
with the instruction that duties be removed, since the ITA had been already afforded ample
opportunity to furnish reasons and evidence for its conclusions and had failed to do so. In
vigorous dissenting judgments, the US panellists—one of whom was the distinguished Yale
international law professor Michael Reisman—criticized the Canadian majority for
misapplying the US administrative law standard of review. Particularly on the specificity
issue, the dissent claimed that determining whether the number of users of a subsidy is too
many or too few is inherently a judgment call that is based on accumulated agency
experience and expertise, and as long as the result reached is not manifestly irrational, it
defeats the intention of Congress to demand that such determinations be justified against
strict objective standards or benchmarks. The dissent relied heavily on a recently decided
US trade case, the Daewoo decision, which emphasized that the role of appellate review is not
to perfect an agency’s economic methodologies. The majority viewed Daewoo as simply
restating the existing standard of review, and insisted that what was at issue in Softwood
Lumber was not imperfection in US agency methodologies but manifest gaps in reasoning and
evidence, such that the ITA’s conclusions could not reasonably follow from the record.

Not surprisingly, Softwood Lumber III was the subject of an Extraordinary Challenge by the
United States, both on grounds of undisclosed conflicts of interest with respect to two of
the Canadian panellists and also on grounds that the standard of review was misunderstood
and/or incorrectly applied by the panel majority. Following the approach in the Pork and
Swine Extraordinary Challenges, the two Canadian members of the ECC rejected the
argument concerning standard of review, stating that what was at stake were differences of
view about the US law, not the failure to apply the correct standard of review conscientiously.
In any case, there was no threat to the integrity of the binational panel process. The
majority also applied the test of whether an appellate court could have reached the same
conclusion as the panel, and suggested it could. The ECC also rejected the US claim based
on conflict of interest.

The American member of the ECC, Judge Wilkey launched a broadside attack not only
on the panel and the ECC Canadian majorities but on the binational panel process itself. He
claimed that ‘the Binational Panel Majority opinion may violate more principles of appellate
review of agency action than any opinion by a reviewing body which I have ever read.’87

Judge Wilkey went further, suggesting that this was symptomatic of a systematic and
apparently incurable failure of Canadian panellists to understand US administrative law. The
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implication was that a binational panel process simply cannot work on the basis that it is
established in the FTA and NAFTA which, of course inherently involves Canadian panellists
applying US law in any case where US agencies are at stake.

Judge Wilkey’s dissent did not fall on deaf ears in Congress, which in effect reversed
Canada’s victory by changing the law on specificity and market distortion so that it
conformed to the US agency interpretation of the pre-existing law.88 In light of these
changes, Canada felt compelled to negotiate anew voluntary restraints on the export of
softwood lumber to the United States, which are now once again in place.

After Softwood Lumber, the future of the binational panel process appears uncertain. As
one of us has recently argued, the better forum for many these disputes at least with respect
to countervailing duty matters may be the WTO, especially given that many of the
requirements of US law against which agency decisions are reviewed by binational panels
now appear as binding WTO law in the WTO subsidies agreement; in this sense, the WTO
process is more secure, since a ruling by a panel cannot be ‘repealed’ by changes to
domestic legislation. At the same time, as an excellent recent study by William Davey
suggests, the Chapter 19 process has been quite effective and produced outcomes widely
viewed as legitimate by both Canadian and American interests in antidumping matters.89 

CONCLUSION

The WTO dispute settlement system represents an enormous advance towards the rule of
law in international trade and indeed perhaps in the evolution of international law more
generally. The entitlement of a complainant to dispute settlement, with or without the
consent of the other Party, and the effectively automatic adoption of rulings as legally
binding between the Parties, represent important gains over the previous practice of the
GATT. Perhaps no advance is more significant, however, than the establishment of a
standing Appellate Body, which reviews the legal reasoning of dispute panels. Throughout
the GATT’s history—admittedly more in earlier than later years—panels, under the wing
of the Secretariat, treated the law of the GATT’ rather freely, in order to obtain outcomes
that were thought to be diplomatically viable and to be helpful in sustaining the overall trade
liberalization baigain. As the GATT increasingly found itself in a position of deciding
matters that entailed a balance of competing or diverse policy values, for example in the
trade and environment area, such an approach threatened a legitimacy crisis. Disciplining
the activity of panels by requiring a rigorous approach to the legal texts themselves, and the
appropriate use of interpretive techniques and sources in public international law (which
apply across diverse normative fields touched by international law, whether environment,
health and safety, or human rights) is part of the answer to this legitimacy challenge.
Unfortunately, another part of the answer—non-governmental stakeholder access to the
dispute settlement system—has yet to be put in place. However, the AB has now ruled
(Turtles) that there is nothing in the text of the Dispute Settlement Understanding that
excludes the possibility of a panel using its rather broad powers of inquiry and investigation
to allow and consider appropriate submissions by nongovernmental organizations and other
stakeholders, for instance international organizations in other regimes such as international
environmental law.
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Dispute settlement under the FTA and NAFTA, by contrast, has become increasingly
problematic or ineffective. Very few cases have been brought under the general dispute
settlement provisions, partly because due to overlap between many FTA/NAFTA and
GATT/WTO provisions it made more sense to pursue dispute settlement at the WTO.
With respect to binational panel review of domestic agency determinations on
countervailing duty and antidumping matters, the Softwood Lumber dispute has displayed the
fragility of the Chapter 19 review process in cases where genuine normative conflict
underlies the dispute and represents a legitimacy crisis for that process of considerable
proportions. Particularly since the WTO Subsidies Code incorporates legal disciplines on
the imposition of countervailing duties as a matter of international law that are similar to the
constraints imposed in domestic law (which must be based on WTO obligations), review of
these matters is likely to increasingly occur as well under the WTO dispute settle-ment
procedures. In our view, this is as it should be—it obviates the danger of competing
interpretations of similar or overlapping legal rules and norms by different dispute
settlement bodies, and would reflect the basic thrust of Article 23 of the WTO Dispute
Settlement Understanding, which provides for the exclusivity of WTO procedures, where
WTO rules are at issue. 
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4
Trade, exchange rates, and the balance of

payments

INTRODUCTION

The theory of comparative advantage that we outlined in Chapter 1 suggests that it will
benefit a country to produce domestically those products in which it has a comparative
advantage and import those in which other countries have a comparative advantage. While
the theory shows how a country that does not have an absolute advantage in anything will
still be able to export and benefit from trade, it by no means demonstrates that the value of
a country’s exports of products in which it has a comparative advantage will equal the value
of imports in which it has a comparative disadvantage.

To return to the Ricardian example of the exchange of wine and cloth between England
and Portugal, what if England’s wine imports yield Portugal £100 a year, yet the English
cloth it requires costs £200? In this example, to maximize the gains from trade, Portugal
must draw down its national reserves of wealth (e.g. gold) in order to obtain the additional
£100 it needs to purchase English cloth. It thus seems that the mercantilist objection that liberal
trade could reduce accumulated national wealth has not really been met by the theory of
comparative advantage.

The philosopher David Hume is thought to be the first to have developed a theory of the
balance of payments that could meet this objection.1 In essence, the theory suggests that
since the demand for a country’s currency depends on demand for its exports, where the
latter rises, so will the former. Where a country has a trade surplus, the extra demand for
its exports will increase the value of its currency and therefore make its exports more
expensive and its imports cheaper. This, in turn, will reduce the surplus, as demand for
exports goes down in response to their relatively higher cost, whereas demand for imports
goes up due to their relatively lower cost. In theory, an equilibrium will eventually be
reached where trade and payments are balanced at a given exchange rate.

This ‘market equilibrium’2 view of exchange rates and the balance of payments is
fundamental to understanding the interface between the legal order of international trade
and the international monetary system. The post-war Bretton Woods arrangements
contemplated a system of fixed exchange rates tied to the gold standard. Under this system,
a country would in theory be required to hold sufficient reserves of gold to back the
quantity of its currency in circulation. Where a temporary imbalance of payments occurred
(i.e. where a country could not meet payments for imports with its receipts of foreign



currency from export sales without selling gold for foreign currency), this would be
financed by a country bor-rowing from the International Monetary Fund.3 In the case of a
structural or persistent imbalance, a country would devalue its currency under the
supervision of the IMF, which might recommend domestic policy adjustments to ensure
that further devaluations were not required in order to maintain the balance of pay-ments.4

In the case of a country running a persistent trade surplus, foreign demand for its currency,
i.e. by purchasers of its exports, would eventually exceed the amount of its currency that
could be backed by gold reserves, therefore calling for a revaluation of the exchange rate
and/or domestic policy changes to dampen exports and/or boost imports.

Paul Volcker has said of the Bretton Woods system of IMF-managed fixed exchange
rates: ‘The irony is that no sooner did it become mechanically operative than worries about
its sustainability began. Nor was it purely a coincidence that the first sign of stress appeared
about the same time the system began to blossom’.5 When the European currencies became
convertible in the 1950s, the United States was running an enormous trade surplus with its
trading partners. However, this was balanced by large outflows of dollars in the form of
development assistance to Europe and Japan. As the European and Japanese economies
began to recover, the US trade surplus started to decline, while outflows of US currency due
to foreign aid and investment continued to increase. By 1960, the United States no longer
had sufficient gold reserves to cover all of the dollar holdings abroad, and for the first time
there was a crisis of confidence in the US dollar. During the 1960s, and particularly in the
early 1970s, the Johnson and Nixon administrations, respectively, largely refused—
contrary to what was contemplated by the founders of Bretton Woods—either to devalue
the dollar or to alter US domestic policies so as to reduce the payments deficit. Devaluation
would have increased the costs of foreign borrowing to finance the Vietnam War, and the
appropriate domestic policy changes (tighter macroeconomic policies to dampen US
consumer demand for imports) were considered politically infeasible. At the same time,
Germany and Japan did not wish to revalue their currencies, since this would dampen trade
expansion by making exports from these countries to the United States more expensive.
Finally, in 1971 the United States unilaterally refused to back the dollar with gold any longer,
and proposed that a new system of floating exchange rates be negotiated to replace the
Bretton Woods system. The dominant position of the United States in the world economy,
as well as the extent of foreign dollar holdings, permitted this unilateralism. In effect, if
other countries did not agree to the new system, the crisis in confidence in the dollar would
be disastrous for them as well as the United States, since their dollar holdings were
enormous and their exports to the United States were a very important source of economic
growth. Although between 1971 and 1973 an attempt was made to manage floating rates
within a fixed margin or band, by the mid-1970s any attempt at multilateral management of
exchange rates was abandoned, although since then there have been occasional negotiated
realignments of exchange rates through central bank intervention on the currency markets
and through some coordinated adjustment of domestic policies among the major monetary
powers, the so-called G-7 (e.g. the Plaza Agreement of 1985 and the Louvre Accord of
1987).6
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What are the implications for the international trading order of the key relationships
between trade, exchange rates, and the balance of payments as they have played themselves
out in the post-war period under both fixed and floating rate systems?

First of all, while a decline in the exchange rate seems a logical way to correct a trade
deficit (i.e. by making imports more costly and exports less costly), this may be not without
significant cost to other pressing domestic policy objectives. In many instances, higher costs
for imports may have socially unacceptable effects— for instance, in the case of developing
countries, a falling exchange rate could make imported medicines, foodstuffs and other
essential requirements prohibitively expensive. More generally, as Fisher notes, ‘a
depreciation directly affects domestic inflation by raising the prices of imports. Further by
increasing the profitability of exports and increasing aggregate demand, depreciation affects
wage claims and thereby indirectly increases the inflation rate.’7 On the other hand, in the
case of a country that is running a trade surplus, an appreciation in the value of its currency
will lead to unemployment at least in the short run, as sales of exports decline and imports
increase—a consequence that may be politically unacceptable.

These are just two illustrations of why countries may be unprepared to accept
adjustments to exchange rates in order to move towards a balance of payments equilibrium.
A further concern, however, is liquidity. Even if countries were prepared to accept the
domestic consequences of the indicated adjustments, there is, of course, an assumption that
until the adjustment takes place the country running the deficit in trade will have sufficient
reserves of wealth, such as gold or the currency of its trading partners, to meet demands for
currency to purchase imports that exceed its foreign currency receipts from exports.

Where liquidity is thin, an imbalance of payments inevitably leads either to import
restrictions or to limits on the convertibility of currency (exchange controls). Both such
measures represent a fundamental threat to liberal trade, and yet may be seen as an
unavoidable outcome of free trade between countries that lack reserves of foreign currency
or gold.

An equally fundamental challenge to liberal trade is the presence of a variety of factors quite
apart from the trade balance that affect exchange rates, such as the movement of capital
across national boundaries for investment reasons, remittances of expatriate workers, and
speculation on the future value of currencies by currency traders. As Kenen notes:

The rapid growth of international transactions have [sic] been reflected in an even
faster growth of foreign-exchange trading. In 1980, daily trading in American
currency markets averaged less than $18 billion; in 1986, it averaged almost $60
billion; and in 1992 it averaged more than $190 billion. Daily trading in London, the
world’s largest currency market, averaged $300 billion in 1992.8

By contrast, the annual value of world trade in goods was $US2,035 billion in 1980 and
$US3,506 billion in 1991.9

Taken together, the implication of these figures is clear; today the bulk of foreign
exchange transactions is not accounted for by payment for traded goods. Indeed, it has been
suggested that comparative advantage in trade can easily be wiped out, at least in the short
run, by changes in exchange rates due to these non-trade factors.10 There are several
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dimensions to the problem. The first is that the volatility of floating exchange rates threatens
to upset the cost and price calculations of exporters and importers, making trade more risky
than purely domestic economic activity that does not involve exchange of currencies. The
second, mentioned above, is that non-trade domestic macroeconomic objectives, such as
the control of inflation, may deter a country from adjusting its currency so as to permit the
achievement of an equilibrium in trade. Lack of macroeconomic policy coordination
between major currency countries can thus place considerable strain on the commitment to
liberal trade (this is often referred to as the problem of misalignment).

Third, the actual experience of the United States in the mid-1980s, when it allowed the
dollar to fall in order to redress its trade deficit, puts in question whether Hume’s
equilibrium theory still applies in contemporary circumstances. Briefly, an apparently
substantial decline in the value of the dollar did not result, even after the required time
period for adjustment in consumers’ expectations, in a significant reduction in the US trade
deficit.11 Among the reasons often given is that upward pressure on the dollar from high US
interest rates (a reflection of the financing requirements of the US budget deficit) made it
virtually impossible for the dollar to fall to the point where adjustment in the prices of US
imports and exports respectively would lead to an elimination, or significant reduction, of
the trade deficit.12

It is sometimes argued that a return to fixed exchange rates (where governments
determine exchange rates in accordance with economic fundamentals) would help to
resolve the instability and imbalance in trade attributable to floating rates. However, in the
past, fixed exchange rates co-existed with a financial system where private actors did not
trade currency except, largely, to pay for imports and exports. A return to fixed or
managed rates would probably entail a reimposition of exchange controls, at least on the
capital account (thereby entailing a retreat from the globalization of capital markets). As
was demonstrated in the crisis in the European Monetary System in 1992–3 (discussed later
in this chapter) even an open-ended commitment by governments to intervene in the
markets to sustain fixed rates in the presence of market forces that threaten to destabilize
them may not be enough under conditions of free capital flows, where speculators are free
to make their own assessment of the credibility and sustainability of these interventions.

A final challenge to liberal trade is much more straightforward—the substitutability of
currency restrictions for protectionism. Imposing a quota or tax on the sale of foreign
currency to purchase an import is likely to have a similar protectionist impact as imposing a
quota or tariff on the import of the product itself. Effectively maintaining bargains about the
elimination or reduction of tariffs and quotas, therefore, also implies some rules to
constrain parallel currency measures. A different but related issue is that of transaction costs
on trade payments that occur due to government policies that are not motivated by
protectionism (for instance, requirements that foreign exchange transactions be reported to
the authorities).

Having sketched in brief some of the key relationships between trade and money, and the
challenges they present to maintenance of liberal trade, we turn to the legal rules that have
been devised to deal with these various challenges.
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LIQIUIDITY, ADJUSTMENT AND SUBSTITUTABILITY

Liquidity was viewed from the outset of the Bretton Woods system as a fundamental
challenge. Few countries had the reserves necessary to be able to wait until a devaluation
brought imports and exports back into balance. Therefore, the system had to be designed to
permit temporary imposition of both trade restrictions and currency controls in order to
manage a balance of payments crisis. At the same time, it was important to ensure that these
measures were temporary and did not lead to permanent protectionism. This would involve
supervision of a process of domestic policy adjustment with a view to balancing of exports
and imports, encompassing domestic policy reforms and/or including exchange rate
adjustment.

The legal rules of both the GATT and the IMF, and the institutions of the latter, were
designed to reflect this approach to liquidity.

The GATT

Articles XII to XIV of the GATT elaborate a complex code designed to govern and
discipline the use of trade restrictions for balance of payments purposes. Article XII: 1
states the basic right of any Contracting Party to impose quantitative restrictions in
derogation from Article XI ‘in order to safeguard its external financial position and its
balance of payments’. Article XII:2 establishes that such restrictions shall be limited to what
is ‘necessary: (i) to forestall the imminent threat of, or to stop, a serious decline in
monetary reserves, or (ii) in the case of a Contracting Party with very low monetary
reserves to achieve a reasonable rate of increase in its reserves’. As well, such restrictions must
be progressively relaxed as the balance of payments improves.

Furthermore, Contracting Parties ‘undertake, in carrying out their domestic policies, to
pay due regard to the need for maintaining or restoring equilibrium in their balance of
payments on a sound and lasting basis’ (XII:3). At the same time, no Contracting Party is
obligated to take domestic balance of payments measures that would threaten the objective
of full employment (i.e. contracting the domestic money supply to dampen demand for
imports, XII:3(d)). A process of consultations is envisaged with the GATT Council
concerning any new restrictions or increase in restrictions, with periodic review of the
necessity of the trade measures and their consistency with Articles XII—XIV In addition,
Article XII contains provisions on dispute settlement, including the authorization of
retaliation where a Party persists in trade restrictions that have been found by the
Contracting Parties to violate the GATT. Articles XIII and XIV contain respectively the
requirement that measures taken pursuant to Article XII: 1 be implemented on a non-
discriminatory basis and certain narrow exceptions to this non-discrimination requirement,
e.g. where discriminatory exchange controls have been authorized by the IMF (see the
discussion of substitutability below).

In the case of developing countries, there is a much broader exemption for balance of
payments-based trade restrictions. Hence, Article XVII:2(b) states the principle that
developing countries should have additional flexibility ‘to apply quantitative restrictions for
balance of payments purposes in a manner which takes full account of the continued high
level of demand for imports likely to be generated by their programmes of economic
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development’. What this suggests is that even though a developing country could address its
balance of payments difficulties through exchange rate adjustments or tighter macroeconomic
policies, it should not be expected to do so given the harm to development that may come
from the resultant decline in needed imports. It is recognized that quantitative restrictions
will allow a developing country to conserve its limited foreign currency resources for
purchases of imports necessary for development—whereas an exchange rate devaluation
would result in all imports becoming more expensive. In this connection, it bears emphasis
that balance of payments restrictions in general may be discriminatory with respect to
products although not with respect to countries. Indeed, it is explicitly stated that ‘the
contracting party may determine (the) incidence (of restrictions) on imports of different
products or classes of products in such a way as to give priority to the importation of those
products which are more essential in the light of its policy of economic development’
(XVIIIB(10)). Finally, Article XV:2 provides for deference to the IMF in the determination
of what constitutes a balance of payments crisis as well as other financial issues involved in
the application of Articles XII and XVIII.

There have been few invocations of Article XII by developed countries since the 1960s.13

One of the most anomalous features of Article XII is its application to quantitative
restrictions exclusively, rather than to re-imposition of tariffs (as contemplated by Article XIX
Safeguards against import surges, for example). Perhaps this exclusive emphasis on
quantitative restrictions may be in part explained by the assumption that re-imposition of
tariffs would not operate rapidly enough to stem a drain on foreign exchange reserves. In
the event, Contracting Parties turned out to be more inclined to use import surcharges (i.e.
tariff-like measures) than to invoke Article XII explicitly in response to balance of payments
difficulties. In some cases, the surcharges were made consistent with the GATT through an
explicit waiver. In others, they were simply tolerated as a kind of de facto expansion of Article
XII.14 

Finally, in 1979 the Contracting Parties, without formally amending the General
Agreement, made the ‘Declaration on Trade Measures taken for Balance-of-Payments
Purposes’15 which expanded the ambit of Articles XII—XIV and XVIII beyond quantitative
restrictions to include ‘all import measures taken for balance of payments purposes’. The
Declaration also imposes an obligation on Contracting Parties taking such measures to ‘give
preference to the measure least restrictive of trade’, which, as Petersmann suggests, would
usually involve a preference for tariffs and surcharges over the quantitative restrictions
explicitly mentioned in Article XII.16

Through much of the history of the GATT, balance of payments-based trade restrictions
were not subject to much direct scrutiny. Developing countries, in particular, made liberal
use of such restrictions. However the increasing invocation of these restrictions in the wake
of the LDC debt crisis, combined with a new emphasis on the importance of trade
liberalization to development in more recent thinking on the subject, had led to increasing
concern by the mid-1980s, particularly on the part of the United States and some other
developed countries.17 Another, in some sense, almost opposite source of concern was the
continued maintenance of restrictions by countries that were growing rapidly, e.g. the
Asian NICs. Thus, in a 1989 case, the United States complained that South Korea continued
to impose Article XVIIIB restrictions on imports of beef despite improvements in its balance
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of payments position.18 The approach of the GATT panel was quite straightforward—it
deferred to the conclusion of the GATT Balance of Payments Committee, in its 1987
consultation with Korea, that the country’s current and prospective balance of payments
was such that continued restrictions could not be justified. The Committee in turn had
acted on the advice of the International Monetary Fund, in accordance with Article XV:2.

The Understanding on the Balance of Payments Provisions of the General Agreement on
Tariffs and Trade 1994, incorporated in the Uruguay Round Final Act, is aimed at
improving GATT/WTO discipline of trade measures taken for balance of payments
purposes. Members commit themselves to publish, as soon as possible, time-schedules for
the removal of such trade measures. Such schedules may, however, be modified ‘to take
into account changes in the balance-of-pay-ments situation’ (Article 1). Further (and perhaps
the most important modification of the existing GATT regime) Members commit
themselves to give preference to trade measures of a price-based nature, such as tariff
surcharges, and only to resort to new quantitative restrictions where ‘because of a critical
balance-of-pay-ments situation, price-based measures cannot arrest a sharp deterioration in
the external payments position’ (Articles 2, 3). The Understanding further sets out an
elaborate set of procedures for review by the Committee for Balance-of-Payments
Restrictions of both the time-schedules for elimination of existing restrictions and
notifications of any new restrictions. The overall intent appears to be that of placing balance-
of-payments trade restrictions under on-going scrutiny, with a view to their elimination as
soon as possible. This is consistent with the original GATT regime, where such restrictions
are envisaged as temporary, and not an appropriate longer-term solution to payments
imbalances. It is also, however, something of a retreat from the more permissive approach
to such restrictions reflected in the Tokyo Round declaration.

Pursuant to the Understanding, on 31 January 1995, the WTO General Council
established the WTO Committee on Balance-of-Payments Restrictions.19 From its
inception through 1997, the Committee has conducted consultations with numerous
Members20 concerning the existence and possible reduction and phase-out of their balance-
of-payments restrictions, including Brazil, South Africa, Slovakia, Poland, Sri Lanka, India,
Egypt, Turkey, Tunisia, Hungary, Nigeria, Bangladesh and the Philippines, the Czech
Republic, and Bulgaria. In most cases, Members made commitments to eliminate or reduce
the restrictions in question, which satisfied the Committee. In some instances, with respect
for example to India and Tunisia, there was some controversy within the Committee itself as
to how rapidly the balance-of-payments situation of the country would reasonably permit
the removal of measures. In other instances, such as Bangladesh, the precariousness of the
balance-of-payments situation was easily agreed in the Committee. In several cases,
including those of Hungary, the Czech Republic, and Brazil, the Committee considered new
measures introduced by Members. The Czech measure, a requirement that importers post a
deposit that does not bear interest, was regarded by a majority of the Committee as
inappropriate, and was eliminated a month after the Committee made this observation. In
general, the Committee appears to be an effective vehicle for scrutinizing bal-ance-of-
payments restrictions, although equally clearly there are differences of view on how to
interpret situations where the Member’s economy has been subject to rapid change. In light
of this, it seems appropriate that the Committee has relied upon IMF studies in some
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controversial cases, and has granted observer status to a number of specialized international
organizations, including the European Bank for Reconstruction and Development, the
OECD, UNCTAD and the World Bank.

While Articles XII-XIV and XVIII of the General Agreement deal with trade restrictions
taken to address a balance of payments crisis, Article XV concerns the trade effects of
currency and other monetary restrictions. Here a fundamental concern is the substitutability
of exchange measures for trade restrictions. Thus, Article XV:4 states that Contracting
Parties shall not ‘by exchange action frustrate the intent of the provisions of this
Agreement, nor, by trade action, the intent of the provisions of the International Monetary
Fund’. Contracting Parties are required to obtain membership in the IMF, or alternatively,
to negotiate a ‘special exchange arrangement’ with the GATT. Article XV:4 is subject to
the proviso that any exchange measures explicitly authorized by the IMF are to be
considered consistent with the General Agreement (XV:9).

The IMF

The provisions of Article XV of the GATT, taken together, suggest considerable reliance on
the IMF to ensure an open payments system that sustains liberal trade. At the time the
General Agreement was negotiated and came into effect, however, currency controls were
pervasive not only in developing but also in most developed countries. As mentioned earlier
in this chapter, the Bretton Woods system was designed in such a way as to permit
countries eventually to stabilize their balance of payments without resort to such measures,
through lending from the IMF’s own resources to sustain liquidity, and through Fund-
approved adjustments of exchange rates in connection with appropriate domestic policy
reforms. However, it was considered that this state of affairs would not occur, for most
countries, until after a considerable transition period.

Countries were therefore provided with an option of accepting the full convertibility
obligations of Article VIII of the Fund Articles of Agreement, or joining the Fund through
the transitional provisions of Article XIV of the Articles of Agreement. Even the
convertibility obligations of Article VIII still permitted a member of the Fund to impose
exchange controls with Fund approval.

Thus, Article VIII:2(a) prohibits ‘restrictions on the making of payments and transfers for
current international transactions’ without Fund approval. The expression ‘current
international transactions’ certainly encompasses all import or export sales, but does not
include, for example, many forms of foreign investment, securities transactions, etc. In this
respect, it is important to note that most developed countries maintained, consistent with
Article VIII, restrictions and controls on the capital account until the 1980s.21 Article VIII
does not provide any explicit criteria for the authorization of current account restrictions by
the Fund, nor does any other provision of the IMF Articles.22 Article XIV allows a member
of the Fund to impose exchange restrictions in ‘the post-war transitional period’ provided
the member declares to the Fund its intent to do so. The Fund may decide that any such
measure is no longer necessary, i.e. that the transition period has elapsed, but must in the
first instance give the member country ‘the benefit of the doubt’ (Article XIV:5).
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Particularly during the LDC debt crisis, the Fund played an important role in sustaining
liquidity in LDC debtor countries and preventing the economic collapse of the debtor
states. However, the Fund insisted on macroeconomic and trade policy reforms as a
condition for liquidity assistance, thereby forcing painful domestic adjustment as the
appropriate response to the crisis in the balance of payments. Similarly, today the Fund
encourages the Newly Liberalizing Countries (NLCs) of Central and Eastern Europe to
move rapidly towards liberalization of trade and payments. Much of Western assistance is
premised on the need for liquidity support to underpin these rapid policy shifts. However
liquidity is only part of the problem—the domestic adjustment costs are the other part and
these can be enormous.

Interaction between the GATT and IMF rules

A number of legal issues have arisen concerning interaction between GATT rules on trade
restrictions for balance of payments purposes and IMF rules concerning exchange controls
and monetary restrictions. One such issue is the characterization of measures that can be
plausibly viewed as one or the other. This issue was raised but not resolved by a GATT
panel in a 1952 case that involved a Greek tax on foreign exchange for imports, which
varied depending on ‘the usefulness and necessity of the products imported’.23 Eventually,
largely through a decision of the IMF Directors, it was clarified that a measure will be
considered an exchange restriction if the technique used involves restricting access to foreign
exchange, even though the principal intent and effect is to restrict imports.24 Under this
approach, the Greek tax would have been deemed an exchange restriction and therefore
subject to IMF as opposed to GATT discipline, despite the fact that it was quite directly
targeted at imports.

There is some evidence that Contracting Parties have sought to minimize IMF scrutiny of
trade measures, by advocating a narrow interpretation of Article XV:4, which would limit
the IMF’s role to that of providing statistical findings concerning a balance of payments
crisis.25 However, in the Korean Beef Import case discussed above, a GATT panel took a more
expansive view of the IMF’s role, deferring to a finding based not just on facts provided by
the IMF, but also upon the Fund’s ‘advice’. In addition, as noted above, the IMF itself, as a
condition of assistance, may well impose a requirement that trade restrictions, not just
exchange restrictions, be lifted. The overall effect of these developments is that today,
whether a Contracting Party chooses to enact trade restrictions or currency measures to
address a balance of payments crisis, it will find its actions subject to a similar level and kind
of scrutiny by the IMF.

The OECD Invisibles Code

The OECD Code on Liberalisation of Current Invisible Transactions is intended to go
beyond the obligations of Article VIII of the IMF Articles in seeking to eliminate all
restrictions on ‘current invisible transactions and transfers’ between OECD member
countries. Indeed, members are encouraged to extend the benefit of the Code to all IMF
members (Article I(d)). Whereas Article VIII of the Fund Articles applies only to restrictions
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on payments and transfers themselves, such as rationing of access to foreign currency, the
Code applies also to taxes and charges, as well as administrative requirements imposed on
the actual transactions required to make payments and transfers abroad. These measures fall
between the cracks of the GATT and IMF rules, in that they apply neither to imports and
exports of products nor do they directly restrict payments on the current account.
Obligations under the OECD Code on Invisibles are subject to various reservations filed by
individual member states. However, in recent years reservations have been reduced and the
Code strengthened.26

VOLATILITY

As mentioned earlier in this chapter, the original Bretton Woods arrangements were
intended to function with fixed exchange rates. A country would be permitted to adjust
these fixed rates in order to correct ‘a fundamental disequilibrium’.27 The intent of these
arrangements was that exchange rate changes would occur only occasionally, and would be
supervised by the IMF to ensure that they did not cause undue harm to the trading or other
economic interests of other countries, i.e. that they reflected changes in the terms of trade
rather than constituting an attempt unilaterally to alter those terms in favour of the
devaluing country. Thus a country would be permitted to devalue where its exports had
been declining relative to imports, but not in order to create a trade surplus where its
existing trade was not in disequilibrium (i.e. competitive, beggar-thy-neighbour exchange
rate devaluations that characterized the inter-war period).

Under the system of floating rates that emerged in the 1970s after the collapse of the
Bretton Woods fixed rate system, what determines exchange rates is supply and demand
with respect to the various currencies. Central banks can and do intervene in the market to
alter the value of their countries’ currency, in accordance with domestic policy objectives.
However, because currencies are no longer fixed in value as against a common, objective
standard (such as the price of gold), or subject to adjustment only in accordance with
internationally agreed criteria (‘fundamental equilibrium’), volatility is much greater.

Blame is often placed on the US for undermining the fixed rate system and thereby
introducing fundamental volatility into exchange rates.28 However, greater volatility was
arguably inevitable. With the terms of trade changing rapidly, and moreover with
globalization of capital markets, enormous and rapid shifts in capital flows would have
probably required very frequent adjustments to exchange rates even under a fixed rate
system—or, alternately, curbs on globalization itself. As Spero notes, during the 1980s,
‘most developed countries…abolished or relaxed exchange controls, opened domestic
markets to foreign financial institutions, and removed domestic regulatory barriers. A
revolution in telecommunications, information processing, and computer technologies
made possible a vastly increased volume, speed, and global reach of financial transactions.’29

Those who advocate a return to fixed rates with a view to addressing volatility and
sustaining the gains from trade thus also tend to argue for deglobalization, and reimposition
of controls on the import and export of capital.30 However, this perspective fails to
consider the extent to which liberalized capital flows themselves contribute to the
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expansion of trade through globalization of production (Foreign Direct Investment), and the
exploitation of comparative advantage in the financial services sector.

There is a serious empirical issue as to the extent to which exchange rate volatility has
negatively affected trade.31 Sophisticated actors on world markets can hedge the foreign
exchange risk from their trade transactions by buying and selling in a variety of currencies,
or by actively trading in currencies themselves. Nevertheless these possibilities are
significantly less open to smaller traders, and there are always transaction costs entailed in
the hedging of currency risks. In order to reduce volatility, it has been proposed that a tax
be placed on foreign exchange transactions. The tax would be set low enough that it would
not affect trade in goods and services but would impose a high cost on ‘short term in-and-
out transactions’ of a speculative nature.32 However, this kind of proposal presumes that
speculation is the driving force behind exchange rate volatility—if, however, such volatility
is endemic to globalized capital markets, then short-term transactions may be critical to
hedging endemic foreign exchange risk, and therefore the tax may be fundamentally self-
defeating.33

MACROECONOMIC POLICY COORDINATION AND
PROPOSALS FOR MANAGED EXGHANGE RATES

Under the system of fixed exchange rates that prevailed until 1971, changes in
macroeconomic policies did not automatically result in changes to exchange rates and
thereby did not directly affect the trade interests of other countries or the demand for
protection in the country making the policy change. Under the system of flexible rates,
however, no rules or institutions have been created for the international management and
supervision of macroeconomic policies.

These policies continue to put considerable pressure on the liberal trading order.
Occasionally the G-7 countries, i.e. those nations with the major international currencies
including the United States, Germany and Japan, have agreed on certain targets and goals.
But Germany and Japan, for instance, have often been very reluctant to stimulate spending
and expand their money supply so as to increase imports from the United States. At the same
time they have been disinclined to revalue their currencies, because this would make their
exports more expensive and threaten jobs. The United States, by contrast, has refused to
act unilaterally to raise taxes to finance its deficit rather than resort to further foreign
borrowing. This has meant continued upward pressure on the US dollar, further
exacerbated by interest rates that have reflected a tight monetary policy. The consequence
is that US exports remain expensive in terms of other currencies and imports into the USA
relatively cheap, creating unremitting pressures for selective trade protection. One recent
positive sign, however, is the commitment of the Clinton Administration to reduce
significantly the US budget deficit.

Some economists—most notably John Williamson34 have developed proposals for
targeting zones for exchange rates. This does not represent a return to fixed rates and strict
domestic controls on the movement of capital. Rates are still set by supply and demand in
the currency markets. Should, however, rates move outside the target zone, countries
commit themselves,35 through central bank intervention and/or policy adjustments, to a
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return within the zone. This kind of solution seems to offer a number of advantages. First of
all, unlike a return to fixed rates, it appears to avoid the kind of limits on financial market
liberalization that would be entailed by the (re)imposition of controls on capital movements
or restrictions on the markets. In theory, at least, governments sustain the target zones not
by constraining the markets but by playing them. Second, since the zones are established by
some kind of objective standard, such as a current account target, i.e. what a country’s
account should look like given a number of external (e.g. trade) and internal (e.g. inflation)
factors, the indeterminacy that characterizes open-ended discussions on policy coordination
would appear to be avoided. 

The problem is, as Cooper notes, that ‘the setting of current account targets would be an
intrinsically arbitrary exercise in a world of high capital mobility and open markets in goods
and services’.36 Given the multiplicity of reasons why money flows in and out of countries—
investment, repatriation of earnings, capital markets transactions such as the purchase and
sale of bonds and other securities—how does one begin to determine the balance between
in-flows and out-flows that a given country should maintain at a given point in time? A
further difficulty, in the absence of exchange controls, is that governmental commitments
to maintain the zones must be credible to speculators—otherwise governments will find
themselves in the almost impossible position of fighting the expectations of the market.
When speculators believe that governments’ commitments to their domestic interests are
sufficiently pressing that they will not be able to sustain in future their internationally-
agreed exchange rate targets, the collapse of the targets can easily become a self-fulfilling
prophecy. In sum, without either a return to controls or a move forward to macroeconomic
policy harmonization and the kind of supranational control of domestic policies envisaged in
the Maastricht blueprint for European monetary union, ‘coordination’ is likely to remain at
the level of a very occasional adjustment in rates which reflects a saw-off between
conflicting interests of the major financial powers, or perhaps even more likely, the
unilateral threat of protection from the USA if exchange rates are not adjusted
appropriately.

More generally, despite the fact that economists still speak of over or under-valuation, it
may even be difficult for a country to determine its optimal exchange rate from the
perspective of domestic interests. For example, until recently the Canadian government has
maintained a tight monetary policy to fight inflation, and thereby sustained high interest
rates and consequently a high Canadian dollar. As a result, freer trade with the United
States has yielded relatively fewer gains for Canadian producers and has resulted in
considerable unemployment in Canada. Should the Canadian government have let the
Canadian dollar fall against the US dollar, at the cost of lower interest rates and some
inflation? (It is important to note that popular discontent with high unemployment was
directed at free trade much more than at the government of the day’s tight monetary
policy.)

With respect to developing or transitional economies, the collapse of the Mexican peso
in 1994–5 and the concomitant outflow of foreign short-term capital,37 and the 1997–8
crisis in Asian capital markets, have led some economists to question whether liberalizing
capital controls is a sound policy except at a very mature stage of economic development.
Jagdish Bhagwati, for example, draws a sharp distinction between the robust case for
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liberalization of trade and the much more questionable case for free movement of capital.38

According to Bhagwati,

economists properly say that there is a correspondence between free trade in goods
and services and free capital mobility: interfering with either will produce efficiency
losses. But only an untutored economist will argue that, therefore, free trade in
widgets and life insurance policies is the same as free capital mobility. Capital flows
are characterized,…by panics and manias.39

While Bhagwati recognizes the importance of foreign capital to economic development, he
believes that foreign direct investment (FDI) is the appropriate vehicle for this, and thinks
that there is little evidence that FDI depends on liberalizing capital flows. The IMF points to
factors such a ‘inadequate financial sector supervision, poor assessment and management of
financial risk, and the maintenance of relatively fixed exchange rates’ as causes of the Asian
crisis.40 The common ground between Bhagwati’s diagnosis and the lessons from Asia
proposed by those, like the Fund, who have promoted capital mobility for developing and
transitional economies may be this: it appears that liberalization of capital flows should be
sequenced after various governance-oriented reforms that assure the kind of regulatory
protections against financial instability typical of those mature economies that have learned
from managing their own crises. An additional lesson may be that crisis behaviour can result
where governments attempt to maintain relatively fixed exchange rates while
simultaneously liberalizing capital controls. Without capital controls, if investors no longer
have confidence in the government’s ability to sustain its currency at a given exchange rate
or within a given zone, they can take flight within hours. Indeed, as will be discussed in the
next section of this chapter, the crisis in the European Monetary System in 1992 can in part
be explained in terms of the risks of maintaining managed exchange rates once capital
controls have been removed.

An interesting compromise solution to the debate over free movement of capital is
advocated by Haas and Litan. They suggest that, instead of either laissez-faire or heavy
handed re-regulation, a penalty should be imposed on all foreign lenders in an IMF bailout
after a financial crisis in developing country markets—these lenders would face some loss
of principal when they refuse to roll over or extend their loans. This, Haas and Litan argue,
would better internalize the risk of crisis into the price of credit, and provide investors with
greater incentives to monitor borrowing countries for soundness of governance practices
and adequacy of financial data.41

THE EUROPEAN MONETARY SYSTEM (EMS)

The European Monetary System (EMS) provides an interesting case study of the difficulties
of maintaining a system of managed or fixed exchange rates under conditions of increased
liberalization and globalization of financial markets and in the absence of an agreed common
macroeconomic policy approach.42 Established in 1978, the EMS applied to many but not
all of the members of the European Union (for instance, the UK chose to stay out until
quite recently). The core of the EMS was an agreement to maintain currencies within a ±2.
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25% band of a fixed rate against the ecu, the common EU currency. This agreement was
made possible, it is generally thought, by the presence of Germany in the system as a
hegemonic financial power. If other members of the system engaged in substantially looser
monetary and fiscal policies than the traditionally conservative Bundesbank, confidence in
their currencies would weaken, with investors switching their holdings into
Deutschemarks. Eventually, to sustain the exchange rate within the 2,25% band, these
other countries would have to alter their monetary policies so as to conform with those
dictated by the Bundesbank.

In fact, however, this happened only to a limited degree. Until the full liberalization of
financial markets in the EU in 1992, a number of the countries with weaker currencies
continued to maintain exchange controls. Through these controls, the countries concerned
(e.g. Italy) were able to maintain looser macroeconomic policies than those of Germany,
since they could limit outflow of capital in response to higher interest rates and a stronger
currency in Germany. As well, the system had permitted the fluctuation of some currencies
outside the ±2.25% band. In addition, some devaluations and revaluations of currencies
actually did occur, despite the commitment in principle to fixed rates. These (albeit
infrequent) realignments would eventually create further pressure on the system, by
inducing in currency traders and speculators the expectation that at a certain point, where
particularly currencies in the system were under sustained pressure, the EMS members
would act to realign the fixed rates. The expectation of a devaluation would intensify sale of
the currencies already under pressure, and therefore increase that pressure enormously
(especially after the lifting of capital controls).

The breakdown of the EMS in September 1992 can be attributed to the interaction of the
above factors.43 In the 1990s, Germany’s macroeconomic policies could no longer be
considered an adequate benchmark for economically sound price stability goals. Instead,
they reflected Germany’s special needs to finance German reunification. Because of the
politically-motivated refusal of the Chancellor to raise taxes to finance unification, the
Bundesbank was required to raise German interest rates beyond a level required by
macroeconomic fundamentals, in order to finance unification by borrowing. Under these
circumstances, with capital controls removed, other EMS members faced extreme pressure
on their currencies. They did not want to raise interest rates to match those set by
Germany’s extraordinary borrowing requirements for reunification, because this would
worsen the recession in their countries. At the same time, the French did not want to
devalue the Franc, because a strong Franc was viewed as necessary to maintain investor
confidence in the French economy.

One logical solution would have been revaluation of the Deutschemark. Revaluation
would, of course, have reduced Germany’s exports and increased its imports, therefore
countering at least to some extent the effects on other currencies of capital in-flows to
Germany.44 And, indeed, such a solution was favoured by the Bundesbank—thereby
creating speculation on the markets that currency realignments were imminent. However,
the German Chancellor rejected revaluation, probably for political reasons (it will be
recalled that, in the short term, revaluation costs domestic jobs, as exports decline and
imports rise). Finally, one important factor that continued to hold the system together, and
dampen somewhat investor speculation that it was under fundamental threat, was the
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expectation that the Maastricht plan for a single European currency, once it shifted into full
gear, would result in greater coordination of macroeconomic policies in the transitional
phase of moving to a single currency, thereby restabilizing the system, or perhaps more
accurately putting it on a new, surer footing. 

In September 1992, with expectations that Maastricht might be rejected in the French
referendum running high, with capital controls now completely removed, and with no
resolution in sight to the problem of German interest rates, there was a speculative run on a
number of the other currencies in the EMS. Perhaps even more ominous than the
speculative run itself, was the discovery by governments and central banks that—with the
end of exchange controls—the possibilities of restabilizing their currencies through
intervention were dramatically reduced. Even overnight increases in interest rates in the
hundreds of percentage points did not succeed, and several countries, including Britain, had
to withdraw from the Exchange Rate Mechanism (ERM) of the EMS.

The breakdown of the EMS initially created considerable doubt as to whether plans to
proceed with a single currency, as envisaged in Maastricht, are at all feasible. As well,
numerous proposals exist for putting the EMS back together again, at least in the short run.
However, with the French referendum result narrowly supporting the Maastricht Treaty,
and Denmark’s eventual acceptance of the Treaty, the project for monetary union received
renewed momentum. As for the EMS, it was rehabilitated in a much weakened form by an
August 1993 decision to allow currencies to float within a 15% band (Germany and The
Netherlands nevertheless undertook to keep their currencies within a 2.25% band).45

Finally, it is arguable that the crisis of the EMS reinforces rather than undermines the
Maastricht approach of monetary union, which requires as a prerequisite to the movement to
a single European currency a substantial degree of harmonization of macroeconomic
policies. For example, in order for a country to enter the monetary union it must, inter alia,
have a relatively low rate of inflation, it must not be running an ‘excessive’ budget deficit,
and its interest rates must not exceed a norm based upon the interest rate performance of
the three EU countries with the lowest inflation rates.46

In part due to the possibility that an insufficient number of Member States would satisfy
these various criteria on time, in December 1995 the European Council moved back the
starting date for the final stage of transition to a single currency from 1997 to 1999. By
1997, it was evident that all the countries intending to join the EMU (the UK, Sweden, and
Denmark decided to opt out) had largely met the convergence criteria related to inflation,
public finances, interest rates, and exchange rates, with the partial exception of Greece.47

Thus, on 2 May 1998 the Council made a final decision to proceed with the final phase of
transition in 1999, including the creation of a European Central Bank (ECB), to supervise a
common monetary policy.48 However, the project for the EMU remains fraught with
tensions—in fact, the 2 May decision was only able to proceed due to a compromise on
who would be the first head of the ECB. The Maastricht Treaty stipulates an eight-year term,
but France’s insistence on its own candidate resulted in a bizarre compromise whereby the
choice of other member states, Wim Duisenberg, made a statement that he would
voluntarily end his term early (thus paving the way for a French candidate to serve the
remainder of the eight years). This permitted a successful outcome to the 2 May
discussions.
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Europeans continue to debate whether the loss of macroeconomic policy autonomy is a
too high price to pay for currency union. Many believe that Member States have been
already constrained in their ability to address the social and eco-nomic challenges of
unemployment and redesign of the welfare state by the need to meet the convergence
criteria for inflation and deficits. While the ECB will only control monetary, and not fiscal,
policy, at German insistence the Council has pressed ahead with the ‘stability and growth
pact’, which would limit budget deficits to 3% of GDP on pain of fines. As The Economist
suggests, it is arguable that this ‘foolishly constrains fiscal policy at a moment when the loss
of an independent monetary policy argues for more, not less fiscal flexibility’; however,
violating the pact does not jeopardize membership in the EMU, and the penalty fines if
levied might simply not be paid.49 Further concerns centre on the lack of democratic
legitimacy of the ECB, which might further compound the general problem of the EU’s
‘democratic deficit’. It is sometimes speculated that the so-called ‘euro-11’, the informal
grouping of finance ministers of the 11 Member States participating from the outset in the
EMU, may become a kind of political counterbalance to the unelected bureaucrats at the
ECB. This, however, has not allayed fears that a democratic nationalist backlash against
monetary union could further fuel the rise of anti-European right-wing populist
movements.50

CONCLUSION

An examination of the rules and institutions that govern the inter-relationship between
trade and finance suggests that despite the ‘casino’ of currency speculators and globalized
capital markets, the Bretton Woods rules and institutions did in many respects prove well-
adapted, or at least adaptable, to sustaining a relationship between trade and money
conducive to liberal trade. The liquidity and balance of payments adjustment problems are
increasingly being addressed through IMF assistance, conditioned upon acceptance of an
open trade and payments system. While the LDC debt crisis represented a serious setback,
its end result is more rather than less liberalization of trade by the LDCs affected.
Moreover, the GATT and IMF rules and the institutional arrangements of the IMF have
proven effective in addressing the substitutability problem, whereby countries attempt to
undercut trade concessions by resorting to currency measures. With respect to volatility
under floating rates, and the corresponding increase in the riskiness of trade transactions,
the system has proven less effective in explicitly addressing the challenge. However, in the
end it may turn out that hedging techniques are a relatively effective means of private actors
themselves reducing foreign exchange risk in trade, although smaller and less sophisticated
actors have less access to these strategies. Where the system has been least effective is in
addressing the trade pressures that result from and/or intensify conflicts over domestic
macroeconomic policies. Yet the major powers have nevertheless avoided a spiral of beggar-
thy-neighbour devaluations, even if they find it impossible to agree on a positive strategy for
tar-geting exchange rates. 
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5
Tariffs, the MFN principle, and regional

trading blocs

THE ECONOMIC EFFECTS OF A TARIFF

The economic effects of a tariff on both importing and exporting countries are best
understood by first examining the case of a prohibitive tariff—that is a tariff that is so high
that it prevents all imports. Here we draw on an example provided by Ruffin and Gregory.’

With a prohibitive tariff, the prices paid for shirts in each country are determined by the
supply and demand curves in each country. To compare prices, we assume that $US2=£1.
If there were no tariff, prices would be the same in the two countries. The prohibitive tariff
in America raises the price in America from $US6 to $US9. Consumers lose area A+B, but
producers gain area A. The net loss to America is area B. In Europe, prices fall from £3 to
£2, and producers lose area C+D, while consumers gain C. The gain to consumers is less
than the loss of producers. The net loss to Europe is area D.

One can next consider a non-prohibitive tariff, which does not preclude all imports of
the product. Ruffin and Gregory graph this example as in Figure 5.2. Before the non-
prohibitive tariff, the price of the product is P . The tariff raises

Figure 5.1 The costs of a prohibitive tariff
Source. Ruffin and Gregory, Principles of Economics.



the price to Pw+t; that is, the world price plus the amount of the duty. Consumers lose area
N+R+T+V Producers gain N. The government gains the tariff revenue T, which equals the
tariff per unit times the quantity of imports. The net loss is R+V The tariff lowers imports
from (q4—q1) to (q3—q2).

It is also important to note certain economic characteristics of tariffs that contrast with
other policy instruments that governments might invoke to protect domestic industries. For
example, governments in importing countries may seek to protect domestic industries by
quantitative restrictions (or quotas). As protectionist devices, these have the virtues of
definitively limiting the volume of imports that will be permitted, and thus provide
stronger assurances to domestic producers of protected market shares. On the other hand,
they exhibit the corresponding vice, depending on their design, of insulating domestic
producers from most forms of foreign competition and thus encouraging inefficiency. In
contrast, with a non-pro-hibitive tariff highly efficient foreign producers may be able to
surmount the tariff and still compete effectively with domestic producers, thus creating some
incentives for the latter to enhance their productive efficiency. Another difference between
tariffs and quotas relates to who collects the scarcity rents that they engender. With tariffs,
governments in importing countries collect revenues from non-pro-hibitive tariffs. With
quotas, depending on how they are allocated, domestic holders of import quotas or licences
may collect scarcity rents (rather than the government collect tariff revenues). If the quotas
are allocated to foreign exporters, these firms will collect scarcity rents by charging more
for their goods in the protected market, without being under any obligation to pay customs
duties on the imports.

Tariffs should also be distinguished from production subsidies designed to make domestic
industries artificially competitive with imports. Such subsidies will distort domestic
production decisions by attracting resources into the subsidized activity, but will not
necessarily (depending on how they are financed) distort domestic consumption decisions,

Figure 5.2 The effects of a non-prohibitive tariff

Source: Ruffin and Gregory, Principles of Economics.
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in that the goods in question will still trade at world prices. Tariffs, in contrast, distort both
domestic production and consumption decisions, first by attracting resources into the
protected sector and second by raising prices to consumers above world prices, which in
general reflect least cost means of production, thus inducing consumers to allocate their
resources to less preferred forms of consumption.

As noted in Chapter 2, these characteristics of alternative instruments of protection find
rough analogues in the provisions of the GATT. The GATT in Article XI purports to take a
strong prohibitory approach towards quantitative restrictions. On subsidies, Article XVI
reflects a much more ambivalent position, and while the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code and
Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement (especially the latter) take a somewhat less equivocal
stance, only a narrow range of subsidies are subject to outright prohibition. Tariffs are not
presumptively good or bad and there is no obligation under the GATT to reduce them,
although Article XXVIII bis contemplates periodic negotiations on a reciprocal and mutually
advantageous basis directed to the substantial reduction over time of the general level of
tariffs.

THE MOST FAVOURED NATION PRINCIPLE

The Most Favoured Nation principle, found in Article I of the GATT, has its clearest
application to tariff concessions. Under Article I, any concession made by one country to
another must be immediately and unconditionally extended to like products originating
from other Contracting Parties. While, as indicated in Chapter 1, the Most Favoured
Nation principle has a long history, controversy still surrounds the purposes served by the
principle.2

Schwartz and Sykes3 argue that in designing an institutional framework in which joint
gains may be realized from the exchange of concessions, three considerations need to be
taken into account: (1) uncertainty with respect to future changes in trade barriers that may
affect the value of current concessions; (2) the free rider problem where participants in
multilateral negotiations may refrain from making concessions in the hope that they can take
advantage of concessions by others without offering quid pro quos (but at the risk that if every
party reasons similarly no concessions will occur); (3) the political weight that attaches to
different constituencies and the effects on their interests from trade diversion when nations
discriminate in their trade policies. The MFN principle protects expectations of participants
in multilateral bargaining by forbidding subsequent more favourable treatment of other
participants and avoids the dead-weight loss of trade diversion, but at the cost of preventing
nations from discriminating when it might be valuable to benefit certain politically powerful
producer interests, and at a cost of substantial incentives for participants in multilateral
negotiations to attempt to free ride. Schwartz and Sykes argue that the safeguard regime
(Article XIX) may be an appropriate response to the first of these problems and that Article
(XXIV) (free trade areas/customs unions) may be an appropriate response to the second
problem. Thus, the MFN principle needs to be viewed in a broader institutional context.

The political centrality of the concept of reciprocity in multilateral tariff negotiations is
illustrated by the ritual which has followed each previous Round of negotiations, where
major participants have announced, principally for domestic political consumption, the
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balance-sheet on the value of tariff concessions given and received, typically representing
that a net gain has been realized. The method commonly employed for calculating the value
of concessions has no economic foundation. For example, if country A obtains a 10% tariff
cut on widget exports to country B that in previous years have averaged $US10 million, this
concession will be valued at $US1 million. But this assumes a demand elasticity in country B
of unity, i.e. for every one percentage decline in price, quantity demanded will increase by
1%. This may or may not bear any resemblance to reality. Moreover, to value the
concession accurately from country A’s perspective requires some knowledge of how other
suppliers of widgets are likely to react to these new opportunities. That is to say, without a
firm knowledge of these underlying demand and supply elasticities, simply calculating the
value of a tariff concession by reference to trade coverage is next to meaningless.

While these political dimensions of the concept of reciprocity are clearly important to
the optics of trade policy, we have also acknowledged in Chapter 1 that reciprocity may be
an economically rational strategy—while unilateral trade liberalization may be welfare
enhancing, reciprocal trade liberalization may generate even greater welfare gains. In any
event, for both political and economic reasons, reciprocity has been central to most tariff
reductions under the GATT.

A number of important exceptions or qualifications to the MFN principle should be
noted at this point.

1 Historical preferences in force at the time of coming into effect of the GATT are
grandfathered under Article I of the GATT, although subject to the requirement that
the margin of preference cannot subsequently be altered in such a way as to exceed the
difference between the MFN rate and preferential rates existing as of 10 April 1947.
The provision contemplates that the absolute, not proportional difference between
MFN and preferential rates must be maintained when MFN rates are reduced or
raised. For example, if the MFN rate is 20% and the preferential rate 10% on
imported widgets, and the MFN rate is subsequently reduced to 15% (a 25%
reduction), the preferential rate can be reduced to 5% and not merely 7½% (which
would be a 25% reduction).

2 The Generalized System of Preferences (GSP) provided for in Part IV of the GATT in
favour of developing countries obviously entails preferences that would otherwise
violate the MFN principle.

3 Antidumping and countervailing duties imposed by importing countries pur-suant to
Article VI of the GATT clearly involve duties that are selective and discriminatory.

4 Quantitative restrictions imposed pursuant to Article XII or Article XVIII of the GATT
for balance of payment reasons may, by virtue of Article XIV,  temporarily deviate
from the principle of non-discrimination in respect of ‘a small part of a country’s
external trade’ where the benefits to that country substantially outweigh any injury
which may result to the trade of other countries.

5 National security exceptions, recognized in Article XXI of the GATT, may justify the
imposition of trade restrictions on a discriminatory basis.
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6 Where retaliation is authorized under the nullification and impairment provision of the
GATT (Article XXIII) or the safeguard provision (Article XIX), such measures will
typically be selective and hence discriminatory.

7 The various non-tariff codes negotiated during the Tokyo Round were typically
negotiated on a Conditional MFN basis, meaning that only Contracting Parties who
were prepared to become signatories to the codes and thus accept the obligations so
entailed were entitled to the correlative benefits. Under the Uruguay Round
Agreement, most collateral Codes or Agreements will be fully integrated into the
GATT, and membership in the WTO will entail adherence to them.

8 By far the most important exception to the MFN principle is the authorization of
customs unions and free trade areas under Article XXIV of the GATT, provided that
two basic conditions are met, i.e. trade restrictions are eliminated with respect to
‘substantially all the trade’ between the constituent territories, and customs duties
shall not be higher thereafter than the duties prevailing on average throughout the
constituent territories prior to the formation of a customs union or free trade area.
Subject to these two conditions, constituent territories are permitted to establish more
favourable duty and other arrangements amongst themselves than pertain to trade with
nonmember countries. This exception is so important that the third part of this
chapter is devoted to a discussion of the relationship between regional trading blocs
and the multilateral system.

A final comment on the principle of non-discrimination requires a mention of how the
National Treatment principle, enshrined in Article III of the GATT, bears on tariff
concessions. In the absence of this principle, negotiated tariff concessions could be easily
sabotaged. For example, if country A agreed to reduce its tariffs on imported widgets from
20% to 10%, and then imposed differential domestic sales taxes on domestic and imported
goods of 5% and 15% respectively, the tariff concession would effectively have been
negated. More subtle forms of discriminatory treatment of imports relative to domestically
produced goods may equally nullify or impair the benefit of previous tariff concessions to
exporting countries and provoke a complaint under Article XXIII.

ALTERNATIVE BARGAINING STRUCTURES

Product-by-product negotiations

In the five negotiating rounds under the GATT prior to the Kennedy Round (1964–7),
tariff concessions were negotiated on a product-by-product basis. Under the Principal
Supplier rule that was adopted by the participants, countries who were principal suppliers of
goods into international markets would prepare ‘request’ lists of goods where they were
seeking tariff concessions from importing countries. Countries preparing request lists would
at the same time prepare offer lists indicating products on which they were prepared to
make concessions. Because of the MFN principle, requests and offers were typically
directed by principal suppliers to principal importers, thus essentially bilateralizing tariff
negotiations. A principal supplier would have no interest in directing a request to a minor
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importer because trade concessions negotiated with such a country, while entailing MFN
obligations on the latter’s part, would entail no such obligations on the part of major
importers. Similarly, the principal supplier of product X would have no interest in making
concessions on imports of product Y from a minor exporter, where this concession would
have to be generalized to major exporters without being able to extract from these
exporters major concessions on products of which the importing country was the principal
supplier. According to Finger,4 product-by-product negotiations achieved very high
internalization rates, in the sense that the benefits of trade concessions were confined, to a
very large extent, to Parties offering countervailing trade concessions, with very little free-
riding (pursuant to the MFN principle) on the part of exporters who offered no reciprocal
concessions. To the extent that there were likely to be significant spill-overs benefiting non-
recip-rocating Parties from tariff concessions, typically product-by-product negotiating
rounds concluded with a settling-up session where concessions previously tentatively
negotiated were subject to threats of withdrawal or revision unless non-reciprocating
countries agreed to offer concessions as well.

While this process may have led to deeper tariff cuts on items that were subject to
negotiations, it arguably substantially restricted the range of products with respect to which
active negotiations occurred, thus restricting the coverage of the resulting tariff reductions.
Product-by-product negotiations had other limitations: first, small exporting and importing
countries were largely frozen out of the negotiating process; second, by focusing
negotiations on particular products, domestic producer constituencies were encouraged to
become active in resisting tariff concessions on products in which they were interested;
third, the negotiating process was highly transaction cost intensive because of its focus on
line-item negotiations.

Linear-cuts with exceptions

In the Kennedy and Tokyo Rounds, the Contracting Parties chose to substitute for product-
by-product negotiations a linear-cutting formula, with a provision for exceptions lists where
countries could take products out from the linear-cuts and negotiate, as before, on a
product-by-product basis. Obviously, with this approach, the coverage of products
embraced by tariff reductions was likely to be much larger, although the degree of
internalization of concessions exchanged was likely to have been lower, and according to
Finger would have created incentives for shallower cuts. Finger refers to this as the
internalization—coverage trade-off. In fact, both the Kennedy and Tokyo Rounds produced
average tariff cuts of about 35% well in excess of tariff reductions negotiated in the four
Rounds that had intervened between the initial GATT negotiations and the Kennedy
Round. However, linear-cutting formulae present problems of their own. Now,
negotiations must focus on the appropriate formula, and in both Rounds these negotiations
proved problematic in various respects. For example, countries that already had low tariffs
on average argued that it was unreasonable to expect them to cut these tariffs by the same
percentage as high tariff countries, the reasoning being that, for example, a 50% cut of a
60% tariff would still leave a 30% tariff in place, which if one assumes that the initial tariff
contained a lot of ‘water’, might still be largely prohibitive of imports, while a country
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cutting a 10% tariff to 5% might well find that this would have a significant impact on the
volume of imports.

In both Rounds, formulae were finally agreed to which required, in one respect or
another, larger cuts of higher tariffs than of lower tariffs. Another problem with the linear-
cutting approach was the risk that countries would abuse the right to take items out from
the linear-cutting formula and place them on an extravagant exceptions list where they
would be subject only to product-by-product negotiations. Indeed, a number of countries
with import sensitive sectors like textiles, clothing and footwear adopted this expedient.
Also, countries primarily engaged in the exportation of agricultural products or natural
resources, where tariffs were in many cases quite low but whose manufacturing sectors
were highly protected (like Canada) viewed product-by-product negotiations as more
advantageous than linear-cuts and in the Kennedy Round were entirely exempted from the
linear-cut-ting process, but not in the Tokyo Round although subject to extensive
exceptions lists. Notwithstanding these problems, as noted above, between linear-cuts and
product-by-product negotiated tariff reductions, the average level of tariffs was substantially
reduced in the course of both Rounds.

Sector-by-sector negotiations

In both the Kennedy and Tokyo Rounds, efforts were made to negotiate reductions in trade
barriers in selected sectors, such as steel, chemicals and forest products. Canada was a
prominent proponent of this approach. It was largely a failure. The reasons are not hard to
identify. To focus negotiations on a particular sector (e.g. steel), is likely to engage the
interest principally of producer interests in this sector and rather than reducing or
eliminating trade restrictions instead runs the risk of a managed trade arrangement
effectively entailing cartelization of the global industry. Alternatively, because negotiations
amongst producer interests in the same sector in different countries tend to have a zero-sum
quality to them, no agreement at all will be possible. While a code on trade in civil aircraft
and components was successfully negotiated during the Tokyo Round and did reduce some
trade barriers, and while the Agreement on Agriculture negotiated during the Uruguay
Round will significantly liberalize trade in agriculture, the Multi-Fibre Arrangement that
emerged in the 1970s is a stark example of the protectionist scenario. More generally, by
attempting to negotiate trade liberalization within sectors, the political room for manoeuvre
in cross-product or cross-sectoral exchanges of concessions, as entailed in product-by-
product or linear-cutting negotiations, is dramatically reduced.

Non-reciprocal concessions

As recognized in Part IV of the GATT, developing countries are not expected to offer
reciprocal commitments in trade negotiations, and developed countries are expected, to the
fullest extent possible, to accord high priority to the reduction of barriers to products of
particular export interest to developing countries. Pursuant to these provisions, in the early
1970s many industrialized countries adopted the Generalized System of Preferences (GSP),
and unilaterally extended preferential tariff rates on certain items of export interest to
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developing countries. However, these preferential tariffs typically were not bound, usually
entail escape clause provisions that permit the termination or reduction of the preferences
in the event of import surges, and contain graduation provisions whereby developing
countries lose their preferences when in the view of the country extending them they have
reached a state of development where they no longer require them. As well, GSP
preferences have typically not been extended on items produced by politically sensitive
domestic sectors such as textiles, clothing, and footwear, even though these are of major
export interest to many developing countries early in the process of industrialization.
Moreover, as MFN rates have declined as a result of subsequent multilateral negotiations,
the margin of preference between GSP and MFN rates has contracted.5

OUTSTANDING TARIFF ISSUES

While the first seven Rounds of tariff negotiations under the GATT since the Second World
War dramatically reduced world tariffs on average (from about 40% on manufactured
goods in 1947 to about 5%), Laird and Yeats6 identified a number of tariff issues that
remained outstanding at the outset of the Uruguay Round Multilateral negotiations. First,
despite low average tariffs, most countries still maintained very substantial tariffs on
particular products. Moreover, there was still a good deal of unevenness in tariff levels from
one industrialized country to the other with respect to particular items, suggesting that the
low tariff-high tariff debate in negotiating modalities for reducing these disparities had not
yet been fully resolved (see Table 5.1).

Second, many national tariffs were still not legally bound; this applied particularly to GSP
tariffs and also to tariffs in many developing countries. Third, there were different and
adverse effects of specific tariffs on developing countries’ exports (i.e. a fixed charge per
unit), as opposed to ad valorem tariffs (a percentage of value). Specific tariffs were still quite
common. Fourth, the cost-insurance-freight (CIF) as opposed to free-on-board (FOB)
procedures for customs valuation continued to discriminate against geographically
disadvantaged developing countries, particularly those that are least developed and land
locked. Fifth, a serious problem still existed        as to how to liberalize tariffs for products
that are also simultaneously covered by non-tariff barriers (such as quotas). Sixth, developed
countries still commonly applied escalating tariffs to imports depending on their stage of
processing, in order to protect domestic processing industries, often at the expense of
developing countries who would derive substantial advantages from being able to engage in
value-added processing of what otherwise are purely commodity or raw materials exports.

The Uruguay Round tariff negotiations

In the Uruguay Round tariff negotiations,7 Contracting Parties were free to apply any
method of reducing tariffs, provided the reduction would be at least equivalent to the over-
all reduction achieved in the Tokyo Round (about one-third of prevailing duties).
Substantial reductions were in fact achieved. The trade weighted ad valorem reductions in
tariffs on industrial products were close to 40 percent. In addition, duty-free trade will be
assured for 44% of developed economies’ exports of industrial products. Significant

114 TARIFFS, MFN PRINCIPLE, REGIONAL BLOCS



T
ab

le
 5

.1
 P

os
t-

To
ky

o,
 a

p
p

li
ed

 a
nd

 G
SP

 t
ar

if
fs

 in
 s

el
ec

te
d

 d
ev

el
op

ed
 c

ou
nt

ri
es

So
ur

ce
: C

al
cu

la
ti

on
s 

on
 t

he
 b

as
is

 o
f t

he
 G

A
TT

 T
ar

if
f S

tu
d

y 
an

d
 U

N
C

TA
D

 S
er

ie
s 

D
 T

ra
d

e 
Ta

p
es

.

THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE 115



116 TARIFFS, MFN PRINCIPLE, REGIONAL BLOCS

So
ur

ce
: C

al
cu

la
ti

on
s 

on
 t

he
 b

as
is

 o
f t

he
 G

A
TT

 T
ar

if
f S

tu
d

y 
an

d
 U

N
C

TA
D

 S
er

ie
s 

D
 T

ra
d

e 
Ta

p
es

.



THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE 117

So
ur

ce
: C

al
cu

la
ti

on
s 

on
 t

he
 b

as
is

 o
f t

he
 G

A
TT

 T
ar

if
f S

tu
d

y 
an

d
 U

N
C

TA
D

 S
er

ie
s 

D
 T

ra
d

e 
Ta

p
es

.



progress was also made on reducing escalating tariffs on processed goods. After
implementation developed countries’ tariffs on industrial products will thus fall from 6.3 to
3.8% on average (one-tenth of the average tariff level before the entry into force of the
GATT in 1947). Moreover, 99% of developed economies’ tariff lines of industrial products
will be bound compared with 78% before the Round. Seventy-three per cent of developing
countries tariff lines will be bound compared to 21 % before the Round. These numbers
are, of course, aggregates or averages, and tariffs will continue to be higher in several
categories, including textiles and clothing; leather, rubber, footwear and travel goods; fish
and fish products; and transport equipment. For example, with respect to textiles and
clothing, many tariffs remain in the 15 to 35% range. In the case of agricultural products, as
part of the broader Uruguay Round Agreement on Agriculture (discussed in Chapter 10),
quantitative restrictions must be converted into tariff equivalents (sometimes running to
several hundred percent) and lowered by an equivalent of 36% in six years in the case of
developed countries, with a minimum reduction of 15% for each tariff line) (24% overall for
developing countries over ten years).

Subsequent to the close of the Uruguay Round, the WTO Ministerial Declaration on
Trade in Information Technology Products (ITA) was agreed to at the close of the first
WTO Ministerial Conference in December 1996 in Singapore. The ITA provides for
participants to eliminate customs duties and other duties and charges on information
technology products by the year 2000, on an MFN basis. Six main categories of products are
covered: computers, telecommunications equipment, semiconductors, semiconductor
manufacturing equipment, software, and scientific instruments. However, implementation
was contingent on expanding ITA participation to cover approximately 90% of world trade
in IT products by 1 April 1997. On 26 March 1997 participants agreed that this criterion
had been met. They also established a Committee as the Expansion of Trade in Information
Technology Products, which will monitor the implementation of the ITA. 

There are currently 43 parties to the ITA, accounting for 93% of world trade in IT
products. The ITA provides for the ‘staging’ of tariff cuts in four equal rate reductions of
25% each year from 1997 to the year 2000. In addition to regular customs duties, the ITA also
provides for the elimination of other duties and charges.

The ITA does not currently cover consumer electronic goods. A further round of
negotiations is underway to extend the coverage of the Agreement to computer-based
scientific and analytical equipment and other products.

DOMESTIC ADMINISTRATION OF TARIFFS

Each country’s customs authorities are responsible for administering the country’s customs
laws. Primarily their task involves calculating the duties owed by the importer, completing
the required paperwork, and collecting the payments. However, calculating import duties
involves a number of tasks: valuing the imported goods; locating the goods in the
appropriate product classification; and identifying the goods’ country of origin. Each stage of
the process, from the valuation system to the paperwork and administrative fees, is a potential
barrier to trade; domestic administration can increase the level of protection afforded by tariffs
or even make the importing process prohibitively complicated. As someone is once reputed
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to have remarked: ‘Let me write the Administrative Act and I care not who writes the rates
of duty.’8 In the areas of customs valuation and classification there has been general
acceptance of harmonized rules, but little progress has been made on rules of origin, and
administrative fees still remain at each country’s discretion. Under Article X of the GATT,
every Contracting Party is obligated to publish in accessible form all laws, regulations,
rulings, etc., pertaining to classification, valuation, and customs administration and to
institute a system of judicial or quasi-judicial review to enable prompt review and
correction of administrative actions relating to customs matters. In Canada, tariff schedules
are set out in great detail in the Customs Tariff, running into several thousand items. Five
major tariff rates often exist for a given item: (1) the MFN tariff rate; (2) the FTA or
NAFTA rate; (3) the General rate (for non-GATT members); (4) the British Preferential
rate (for some Commonwealth countries); and (5) the GSP rate for some developing
countries. In turn the Customs Act creates the domestic admin-istrative machinery for the
collection of duties through the Department of National Revenue. Internal appeal
mechanisms within the Department on classification, valuation and related issues are
provided for. Appeals from final Departmental determinations may be made to the
Canadian International Trade Tribunal and thence, on matters of law, to the Federal Court
of Appeal.

Valuation9

Most tariffs today are ad valorem, requiring the importer to pay a certain percentage of the
good’s value in duty.10 Hence, the value of the imported goods is an important determinant
of the ultimate import duty: ‘any advance in value is accompanied by a commensurate
increase in both duties collected and in the level of protection’.11 It is in the interest of all
countries that valuation techniques be uniform and predictable. A system that is
unpredictable or unfair to exporters serves as a non-tariff barrier to trade and undermines
the effects of tariff reductions. Further, differences in valuation methods make tariff
negotiations more complex.12 In negotiations, a country must take into account the different
effects of tariffs due to the different valuation techniques employed to ensure that it is
receiving reciprocal trade concessions.

The current international rules on the valuation of goods for customs purposes are found
in the Uruguay Round Agreement on Implementation of Article VII of the GATT.13 A
Customs Valuation Code was initially negotiated during the Tokyo Round in order to
‘provide a uniform, neutral valuation system that conforms to commercial realities and
prohibits arbitrary values for duty’.14 A slightly revised Agreement was negotiated during
the Uruguay Round.15 Prior to this, the rules were found in Article VII of the GATT.
Article VII was intended to ensure that signatories used fair systems of valuation that
conformed with certain principles. It requires that Parties to the Agreement base ‘value for
customs purposes of imported merchandise…on the actual value of the imported
merchandise… not…on the value of merchandise of national origin or on arbitrary or
fictitious values’.16 Actual value is defined as the ‘price at which…such or like merchandise
is sold or offered for sale in the ordinary course of trade under fully competitive
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conditions’. The article does not specify the valuation method to be used and it gives the
importing country discretion over the time and place for determining price.

Prior to the Tokyo Round negotiations over one hundred countries (including Japan and
the countries of the EU) had adopted the valuation system called the Brussels Definition of
Value (BDV).17 However, two major GATT trading nations retained separate systems of
valuation: Canada and the United States. Because of the Protocol of Provisional Application
(the Grandfather Clause),18 many of the signatories to the GATT were only bound to apply
its Articles to ‘the fullest extent not inconsistent with existing legislation’. Along with the
general nature of Article VII, this provision allowed the perpetuation of very different,
sometimes unfair, systems of valuation. For example, the United States used, in part, the
American Selling Price (ASP) method of valuation which was viewed as ‘a device to keep
the American public from seeing in all its nakedness the exorbitant level of duties
contemplated by rampant protectionism’.19 The American system was made up of nine
different methods of valuation and was ‘stupefying in its complexity’.20 In addition,
Canada’s valuation system was long considered to be inconsistent with Article VII of the
GATT.21 Countries which traded with the USA and Canada raised the issue of customs
valuation in the Tokyo Round negotiations in an attempt to have them abandon their
systems.22 The original intention of countries using the BDV was that it would become the
worldwide system but a compromise was reached with the USA.23 The Customs Valuation
Code that was concluded in 1977 was based in part on the US system and was accepted by
the major trading nations.24 Signatories were obliged to render their legislation consistent
with the Code by 1 January 1981 but many countries, including Canada, reserved the right
to postpone implementation in order to ensure the maintenance of tariff protection at pre-
code levels.25

A major objective of the Code was to constrain the exercise of administrative discretion.
Both the Tokyo and Uruguay Round Codes establish ‘transaction value’ as the primary
standard of valuation.26 Transaction value is the price paid or payable for the goods when
sold for export to the country of importation, plus certain additions such as the cost of
packaging and the value of various items provided to the buyer free of charge in connection
with the sale of the goods (assists). There are also some items that can be deducted from the
price such as the cost of transportation, handling and insurance from the place of direct
shipment. The transaction value can only be used for the purposes of valuation in certain
circumstances. It can be used if there are no restrictions on the disposition or use of the
goods other than those that are imposed by law or that restrict the resale area or that do not
substantially affect the value of the goods.27 In addition, to use transaction value the price of
the goods cannot be subject to any conditions or consideration, such as an undertaking by
the buyer to buy more goods at a later date. Sales between related persons (generally
officers of each other’s companies, partners, direct or indirect controlling interests) are
eligible for use of transaction value provided it is demonstrated that the relationship did not
affect the price.28 There are a number of valuation methods outlined in the current
Customs Valuation Agreement to be used in the event that the transaction value cannot be
used. Authorities must resort to these methods in a particular order; for example, only if
the first and second cannot be used can resort be made to the third. In the prescribed order,
they are:
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• transaction value of identical goods exported to the same country of importation at
approximately the same time;

• transaction value of similar goods exported to the same country at approximately the
same time;

• deductive value based on resale price in the country of importation; and
• computed value based on the cost of production of the imported goods.29

In many cases, the use of one of the alternate methods of valuation will be inappropriate
because of information limitations or difficulties in calculation. Generally, resort will be
made to the third or fourth methods when the price is affected by the relationship between
the Parties to the transaction or when there is no selling price at the time of importation.

Certain methods of valuation are expressly prohibited in the Agreement, such as the use
of arbitrary or fictitious values, and the use of the selling price in the country of importation.30

In the Canadian and American legislation, customs officials are authorized to apply one of
the above methods flexibly if goods cannot be valued under any of the above methods; this
is the residual or alternative method. Part II of the Agreement also provides for the
establishment of a Customs Valuation Committee comprising representativcs of all members
that is responsible for furthering the objectives of the Agreement and facilitating
consultation and dispute resolution with respect to the valuation system.

Classification

Because there is wide variation in the level of tariffs from product to product, goods must
be located in the correct product category to receive proper tariff treatment. As with
valuation, the problem with classification for customs purposes is that it can be used as a
protectionist device. A country that has agreed to reduce its tariffs in exchange for
reciprocal concessions can use the classification system to ensure that the benefit is only
received by the reciprocating country, This selectivity can be achieved if the product’s
classification can be subdivided so that the goods from the reciprocating country are in a
distinct category. Then the tariff on the distinct category of goods can be reduced and other
countries that would normally receive the benefit of the reduction through Most Favoured
Nation treatment receive no ben-efit.31 This same technique of product classification is also
used to reduce the tariffs on inputs for domestic manufacturers and processors while
maintaining the overall level of protection.32

The Customs Cooperation Council was established in 1950 and given a mandate to
develop and harmonize customs systems of the world. The result of the committee’s work
is the Harmonized Commodity Description and Coding System. The Harmonized System
(HS) was open for signing in 1984 and was implemented in some countries by 1987.33 The
basis of the Harmonized System is that goods should only be classified by their essential or
intrinsic nature (i.e. by what they are and not how they are used) and should only fall into
one category.34 In Canada’s previous classification system it was not uncommon to find the
same good in several different categories carrying different rates of duty.35 The
nomenclature consists of a mandatory six digit classification system that is used by all
signatories. Countries who find the classification too imprecise for their needs may use up
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to four more digits, as Canada has done.36 Along with the numbers and descriptions, the
system includes legal notes that are binding on the signatories. The notes provide definitions
of terms and phrases essential to the classifications and set boundaries on the goods to be
included in each. In addition, the notes list specific goods to be included or excluded in each
category and give directions for locating the appropriate classification for excluded goods.
Finally, there are extensive explanatory and interpretive notes.

Rules of origin

The final task in calculating the appropriate duty on imported goods is establishing the
country of origin of imports. Tariff treatment is often dependent on the country of origin of
the imports. As noted earlier, in Canada there are five major tariff treatments. In order to
qualify for a particular tariff treatment an importer must establish the product’s origin.
Establishing origin is often difficult: goods may be processed, assembled, packaged or
finished in a variety of different countries, or shipped to the importing country via another
country where they may or may not enter the commerce of that country.

There are presently no comprehensive multilateral rules that govern determinations of
rules of origin. Moreover, in many countries, rules of origin are not internally harmonized.
That is, there are different rules for establishing origin within the country depending on the
context, for example, for tariff purposes or during a dumping investigation. This can pose a
difficulty for exporters: a good that originated in country A may pay the tariff rate for
country B, where it was processed, but face antidumping duties levied against goods from
country A.

The Uruguay Round Agreement on Rules of Origin adopts the following approach with
respect to rules of origin. First, the Agreement sets out plans for transition to a harmonized
system of origin determination to be developed by a Committee on Rules of Origin and a
Technical Committee assisting it within three years of the acceptance of the Agreement.
The first step requires all countries to harmonize their own rules of origin.37 During this
period the rules applied by each country must be based on a positive standard (i.e. what confers
origin, not what does not confer origin). Once this harmonization is achieved countries will
be required to base determinations of origin either on the country where the good was
wholly obtained or the country where the good underwent its last substantial
transformation. The rule of last substantial transformation is not fully defined in the
Agreement38 but it combines a change in tariff classification with supplementary criteria
based on percentage of value added or specific manufacturing or processing operations. The
Committee on Rules of Origin has reported substantial progress in its ongoing programme
aimed at harmonizing non-preferential rules of origin to be applied by all Member States.
The NAFTA also contains a number of new and complex rules of origin designed to clarify
and harmonize determinations of content.39 Goods are deemed to originate in the territory
of a NAFTA Party if they are wholly produced or obtained in any of the three NAFTA
countries. They may contain offshore materials or components if they are transformed
within a NAFTA country so as to be subject to a change in tariff classification. Special
regional content rules apply in the case of automobiles, textiles and clothing and some other
products.
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Customs fees

Aside from the calculation of duties on imported goods, customs authorities are also
responsible for processing documentation and collecting duties and administrative fees from
importers. Both fees and documents may be barriers to trade. Documentation requirements
can make the importation process more costly or prohibitively burdensome. In 1952 a Code
of Standard Practices for Documentary Requirements was accepted by the GATT. The
Code’s main purpose is to restrict the kind and number of documents required. The result
of the Code was the abolition in many countries of consular invoices which were previously
a heavy burden on international trade.40 

With respect to fees, there is no international agreement beyond the basic provisions of
the GATT. Article VIII provides that:

All fees and charges of whatever character imposed by contracting parties on or in
connection with importation or exportation shall be limited in amount to the
approximate cost of services rendered.

The terms of Article VIII are vague and do not significantly constrain domestic practices.
For example, importing countries often charge fees equal to a set percentage of the value of
imports, leading to total charges far in excess of the cost of services rendered; the
protective effect of such fees can be significant.41 At present, domestic authorities retain a
great deal of discretion in this area of customs administration.

MULTILATERALISM VERSUS REGIONALISM

The emergence of regional trading blocs, most prominently the European Union and the
Canada-US FTA, and now NAFTA, in the post-war period, collateral to the evolution of
the GATT and sanctified by Article XXIV of the GATT, constitutes easily the most
important exception to the MFN principle of non-discrimination embodied in the GATT
and on that account requires an extended discussion.

While the record of the GATT in reducing tariffs on manufactured products has been
impressive, it is also true that it has proven less effective in disciplining tariffs on primary
products and non-tariff border measures, especially quantitative restrictions, let alone most
other forms of trade-distorting policies of its members. If the reference point against which
the GATT is to be judged is the deep integration being realized in the EU, with integration
being pursued with respect to not only goods, but also services, capital, and people,
coordination of exchange rate and monetary policies, and harmonization of a plethora of
domestic fiscal and regulatory policies, it is impossible not to adopt a relatively gloomy
prognosis for the future of the GATT.42 However, it is important to be explicit about the
premise on which this prognosis rests. Only with a hegemonic pro free trade presence in
the case of the multilateral system, or heavily centralized policy-making institutions in the
case of the EU, is it likely that deeper economic integration can be achieved.

Thus, in the case of the GATT/WTO, now with a declining US hegemonic influence and
with 130 Members (compared to 23 at the outset) in very different stages of economic
development and with widely differing political, economic and cultural orientations—a
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heterogeneity that is likely to be increased in the future with the admission of countries in
transition from command to market economies —it is difficult to imagine the emergence of
centralized integrating institutions to whom Member States are prepared to surrender
major aspects of their political sovereignty. Thus, if one insists on viewing the GATT, as
traditional liberal institutionalists do, as a system of international legal rules designed to
constrain domestic self-interest, which system can only be reinvigorated by stressing the
importance of a global vision, of farsighted statesmanship that places global welfare and
common interest over immediate domestic self-interest and of the importance of the global
rule of law,43 the GATT is now and will always be a disappointment.

However, a somewhat more optimistic (and realistic) view of the GATT is possible.
Sometimes referred to as the new liberal institutionalist approach,44 this view stresses that
multilateralism should rather be seen as a decentralized framework for the negotiation and
maintenance of mutually advantageous bargains among states. Liberal internationalists seek
ways for designing or re-designing processes that, by reducing information, transaction,
surveillance and verification costs, will facilitate Pareto-superior deals between or among
states that are largely self-enforcing contracts. Performance of these contracts is promoted
by reputation effects and tit-for-tat retaliation strategies that tend to solve the Prisoner’s
Dilemma problem in multi-period games.45 This is precisely what describes the greatest
achievement of the GATT—the dramatic reduction in tariffs, but it bears recalling, over a
40year period and over eight successive bargaining rounds.

While it has become fashionable to talk of a ‘borderless’ world economy, the growth of
global federalism, the decline in the significance of the nation state, and the rise of
consumer sovereignty,46 it is as plausible to view the rapidly integrating world economy as
overlain with ‘a splintering world polity’.47 The rise of regional trading blocs arguably
reflects this latter trend. Over 80 regional arrangements have been notified to the GATT
under Article XXIV since 1947. Many arose during the 1960s, and a second generation
during the 1980s and 1990s.48 Apart from the EU and NAFTA, other prominent or
emerging regional trading blocs include: Mercosur (Argentina, Brazil, Paraguay, and
Uruguay) in Latin America; APEC (Asia Pacific Economic Co-operation) in Asia and the
Pacific Rim,49 and CARICOM (the Caribbean Common Market). There is also a
commitment in principle to extending NAFTA throughout the Western Hemisphere no
later than 2005 (a Free Trade Area of the Americas—FTAA),50 and preliminary discussion
of a Transatlantic Free Trade Area between the US and the EU.51

Regional trading blocs have generally enjoyed a bad press from trade econo-mists.52 The
reasons are straightforward enough. At a political or foreign policy level, they necessarily
entail playing favourites and risk reducing international relations to mutually destructive
factionalism of the kind that was so dramatically evidenced in the 1930s. From an economic
perspective, regional trading blocs, whatever their trade expansion properties with respect
to intra-regional trade, almost necessarily also entail some measure of trade diversion (in
the sense that lower-cost producers outside the regional trading blocs are discriminated
against), thus distorting the efficient global allocation of resources and hence reducing
global welfare.53 But this said, the question must be asked, ‘compared to what?’ Compared
to complete, undistorted global free trade, regional trading blocs are clearly second-best.
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But compared to the world trading system that actually prevails, or is likely to prevail in the
foreseeable future, the case against regional trading blocs is not so clear.54 

In this second-best world, Lawrence and Litan55 provide a balanced assessment of their
strengths and weaknesses. In the end, their assessment is cautiously positive. Central to this
assessment is, on the one hand, their view that regional trading blocs may be able to achieve
a deeper degree of economic integration than the multilateral system—negotiations
typically involve a much smaller number of ‘like-minded’ nations, and (less explicitly
claimed) the necessary centralized or federalizing policymaking and enforcement
institutions (as with the EU) are more likely to emerge—and on the other hand, their view
that the trade diversion potential of regional trading blocs is often over-stated, given both
the size of inherent intra-regional trade flows already involved, at least in the EU and
NAFTA,56 and the empirical evidence on the importance of extra-regional trade to all of the
major regions that might conceivably become involved in regional trading blocs. That is, it
is reasonable to assume (or hope) that regional trading blocs will remain ‘open’, rather than
become ‘closed’.57

We are less confident about both sides of this coin. With respect to the trade diversion
argument, it is easy to be persuaded of the opposing view. For example, Stoeckel et al.58

point out that the EU has been remarkably unforthcoming about how it plans to standardize
external Non-Tariff Barriers (NTBs), especially quantitative restrictions, in 1992 or
thereafter. Some member countries have relatively liberal import policies towards, for
example, textiles and automobiles; others much more restrictive policies. On the
assumption that the EU adopts a compromise between the Union-wide average protection
level for each group of manufactures and the ‘lowest common denominator’ (the most
restrictive), Stoeckel et al. project that this would lead to a contraction of imports of $US34
billion per year. In addition, because the EU would lose competitiveness due to higher cost
imports, exports would fall by $US58 billion per year (9%). Overall, GNP of the EU would
fall by over 1% or $US52 billion.59

Now, one might argue, as Lawrence and Litan implicitly do, that it would be
economically irrational for the EU to constrain extra-regional trade when this has such self-
destructive properties. But this can equally be said of most of the plethora of protectionist
policies that have ever been adopted by any country anywhere. In the case of the EU,
history suggests that economic rationality has not been the only force at play in the
evolution of the Common Market. The Common Agricultural Policy (CAP) has
transformed the EU at high cost over the post-war period from the world’s largest importer
of temperate zone agricultural products to the world’s second largest exporter, with
massive trade diversionary effects.60 The rise of the New Protectionism (especially
quantitative restrictions) in recent years has been particularly pronounced in both the EU
and the USA, both of which figure most prominently in discussions of present or
prospective regional trading blocs, as the graph from Stoeckel et al.,61 showing the growth
in proportion of imports covered by trade restrictions, amply demonstrates (Figure 5.3).

Jagdish Bhagwati, in a recent trenchant critique of regional trading blocs (which he
prefers to call Preferential Trade Agreements) entitled ‘Fast Track to Nowhere’62 points to
evidence that Mexico’s losses from trade diversion due to NAFTA (and its highly restrictive
rules or origin) could be as high as US$3 billion a year. The World Bank has estimated that
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approximately 36% of Caribbean exports to the US will be subject to potential
displacement.63 Bhagwati argues that as PTA’s spread, the world trading system comes to
look like a ‘spaghetti-bowl’ of ever more complicated trade barriers, each depending on the
supposed ‘nationality’ of products (determined by ever more complex and arbitrary rules of
origin).

Even if the existence of a hegemonic power is a necessary condition to the maintenance of
a liberal trading regime, it clearly is not a sufficient condition—as exemplified by the
historical role of the Soviet Union in Eastern Europe and the non-leadership role of the USA
in the first third of this century.64 Similarly, while it may also be the case that the existence
of strong centralized institutions in a regional trading bloc is a necessary condition for deep
economic integration, it would seem equally hazardous to assume that it is also a sufficient
condition.

But this leads us to the first of the two reasons offered by Lawrence and Litan for their
relatively positive view of regional trading blocs as conducive to deeper economic
integration—negotiations occur among fewer and more like-minded countries than in the
multilateral system. Under these circumstances, countries will be more willing to cede the
kind of political sovereignty to federalizing central institutions that is required for deeper
economic integration. Then presumably once these regional trading blocs have achieved a
high degree of economic integration, it is assumed that negotiations between a handful of
major trading blocs, all oriented towards progressive trade liberalization, will be conducive
to inter-regional economic integration. We are less sanguine than the authors about this
scenario.

First, as they would acknowledge, many actual or potential regional trading blocs offer
very small prospects for intra-regional trade expansion, even setting aside their effects on
external trade. This is true for many actual or potential trading blocs in Africa, Latin
America, the South Pacific and the Caribbean, where similarity of natural endowments

Figure 5.3 Trends in non-tariff barriers in the three regions

Source: Stoeckel el al., Western Trade Blocks: Game, Set or Match for Asia Pacific and the World Economy?
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often sharply limits the potential mutual gains from trade, although the rapid growth in
intra-Asian trade suggests more potential for regional trade in manufactured goods. 

Second, once one then contemplates more ambitious regional trading blocs, it is difficult
to imagine scenarios where a trading bloc is not dominated by one major economic power—
either the USA or Japan. It is superficially attractive to characterize the multilateral system
as afflicted by the ‘convoy problem’ in which ‘the least willing participant determines the
pace of negotiations—the speed of the convoy moving toward free trade is limited by the
speed of the slowest ship’.65 This can be contrasted with the regionalist alternative evoked
by Lawrence and Litan through the more appealing metaphor of a geese migration, with the
USA (or Japan) as head goose flying in a V-formation with a gaggle of other smaller
countries in the same formation eagerly striving to keep up the pace towards at least
regional economic integration. But as citizens of one of the smaller countries in such a
formation, our judgement, after observing the ferocity of political debates in Canada over
adoption of the Canada-US Free Trade Agreement in 1988, is that this entirely ignores
political sensitivities to loss of sovereignty. If the virtue of regional trading blocs is their
capacity for achieving a deeper degree of economic integration than the multilateral system,
this view, as noted earlier, is premised either on a hegemonic theory of trade liberalization
or strong federalizing central policy-making and enforcement institutions.

To take the Canada-US or Canada-US-Mexico case, we cannot imagine Canadians (or
Mexicans) tolerating an arrangement whereby the USA is free to impose a common set of
policies on all three countries across the spectrum of issues being addressed by the EU in its
drive to integration (e.g. possibly a common currency, centrally coordinated monetary
policy, regulatory and directive powers over many domestic fiscal and regulatory policies).
On the other hand, it is equally difficult to imagine the USA accepting a set of federalizing
central institutions in which member countries are accorded equal or nearly equal standing
(recall the demise of the Havana Charter and the ITO). Thus, we conclude, as the Canada-
US FTA and NAFTA largely corroborate, that most regional trading blocs will not be
conducive to deep economic integration. We believe the EU is a sui generis case. Partly
because of the much greater symmetry in size and resources of the participating countries
(perhaps about to be tested by the role of a reunified Germany), and partly because of
special historical and political considerations largely related to the ravages of recurrent
wars, member countries have been prepared to cede significant political sovereignty to
federalizing central institutions. Even in the case of the EU, intense internal debates and
divisions over the implications for domestic political sovereignty of the Maastricht Treaty
suggest growing reservations about this trend.

Third, even if we are wrong, we believe that it is highly speculative to assume that following
deep regional integration, regional trading blocs will then readily move to inter-regional
economic integration through negotiations with other trading blocs. It is easy to assume that
if political forces within each of these blocs have been amenable to regional trade
liberalization and perceive the economic gains associated therewith, they would as readily
perceive the virtue of just keeping on going, so to speak, and integrating inter-regionally.
But the problem here is that regional patterns of integration and specialization that develop
may (depending on how much trade diversion is created) significantly exacerbate the
adjustment costs of subsequent inter-regional integration, where different patterns of
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integration and specialization may be entailed.66 Moreover, regional trading blocs
unquestionably place a premium on foreign investment relative to foreign trade (partly
because of its domestic employment-enhancement effects), and as foreign firms, principally
MNEs, establish substantial presences in each of the major trading blocs, a major political
force for broader trade liberalization is attenuated (so-called ‘cooperative protectionism’).67

Fourth, one should not underestimate the sequencing problems in maintaining an ‘open’
regional trading bloc,68 in the sense of it remaining open to membership by subsequent
Parties. First-movers in such an arrangement face considerable uncertainty in determining
the value of the preferences they are receiving in return for putatively deep concessions of
their own, when these preferences may be eroded by subsequent admissions to the bloc.
This will lead countries to be more reluctant to enter into a bloc in the first place, or to
make deep concessions if they do, at least without a right of veto on new memberships
(creating hold-out problems). Alternatively, negotiations with all prospective members will
need to occur simultaneously, but in this event the large numbers problem said to afflict
negotiations in the multilateral system will tend to re-emerge.

Canada had to confront these issues in deciding on its role in the US-Mexico free trade
negotiations. The strategy adopted in this case may set the mould for future free trade
negotiations between the USA and other Latin American countries. The risk to Canada in
staying out of such negotiations was that its preferences in the US market under the FTA
would be eroded by similar preferences extended by the USA to Mexico while gaining
nothing in return (in contrast to the USA) in terms of enhanced access to Mexico’s market
for exports and foreign investment. These effects would be exacerbated with each new
bilateral agreement that the USA negotiates with another country—in the limiting case, a
free trade area from Anchorage to Tierra Del Fuego, in President Bush’s words. In turn,
there will be strong incentives for export-oriented firms to invest in operations in the USA,
relative to other Parties to these bilateral (hub-and-spoke) agreements, because this will
assure them of unrestricted access to all affected markets.69 In recognition of these
considerations, Canada joined the negotiations that led to the North American Free Trade
Agreement (NAFTA).

The reservations noted above about the economic implications of regional trading blocs
constitute strong reasons for being slow to abandon or attenuate the commitment to the
non-discriminatory multilateral world trading regime envisaged by the founders of the
GATT. Rather, we need a reconceived role (and a more patient set of expectations) for the
GATT in promoting Pareto-superior and largely self-enforcing deals between countries on
NTB’s and other trade distortions in successive bargaining rounds modelled as closely as
possible on the tariff-reduction bargaining process that GATT has so successfully facilitated
in the past. Reducing most trade distortions to a common metric—a tariff equivalent or
effective rate of protection—would be an important first step in pursuing this strategy. 
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6
Trade policy and domestic health and safety

regulation and standards

INTRODUCTION

There has been a dramatic shift in the focus of trade policy concerns from the barriers that
lie at the border to the barriers which exist ‘within the border’.1 The GATT/WTO and
many other trading arrangements have been largely successful in reducing both the levels of
tariffs worldwide and the scale of other border measures such as quotas. This has revealed a
new and more subtle category of measures which restrict trade—the numerous
commonplace regulations which governments enact to protect the health and safety of their
citizens and the environment in which they live. Such regulations vary tremendously across
borders: one nation’s bunch of grapes is another nation’s repository of carcinogenic
pesticide residue. This effort to protect citizens from the hazards of everyday life has
become a virtual minefield for trade policy-makers, as such differences can often be
manipulated or exploited to protect domestic industry from international competition.2

Even when there is no protectionist intent on the part of lawmakers, through a lack of
coordination, mere differences in regulatory or standard-setting regimes can function to
impede trade. It has thus become increasingly difficult to delineate the boundaries between
a nation’s sovereign right to regulate and its obligation to the international trading
community not to restrict trade gratuitously. The question of how to address this problem
has received increasing attention from trade scholars. As Miles Kahler states, ‘the decades-
long process of lowering trade barriers resembles the draining of a lake that reveals
mountain peaks formerly concealed or (more pessimistically) the peeling of an onion that
reveals innumerable layers of barriers.’3

There has been a steady growth in the regulations that pertain to health, safety, consumer
protection and the environment over the past three decades. In many respects, these
regulatory trends can be viewed as part of the elaboration of the modern welfare state in
much of the industrialized world, reflecting in part the proposition that greater safety, a
cleaner environment, etc. can be thought of as normal economic goods, the demand for
which rises as income levels rise, so that greater prosperity (in significant part engendered by
trade liberalization) has been accompanied by increased demands for these kinds of
domestic policies. As trade liberalization, at least with respect to border measures, has
continued to advance, these ‘within the border’ regulatory measures require new



disciplines under international trade rules, particularly in a globalizing economy which, it is
argued, has a low tolerance for ‘system frictions’.4

The allegation that regulations ostensibly designed to protect consumer health and safety
are often trade barriers has substantially heightened both domestic and international
political conflicts, as trade policy and domestic policy become increasingly linked in
domains previously thought to lie outside the arena of trade policy. Regulation in areas
which seem purely domestic, such as food inspection, product labelling and environmental
policy can all affect how goods cross borders. This has resulted in a polarization of domestic
political interests and has drawn new domestic political constituencies into debates over
trade policies in the form of consumer and environmental groups or other non-
governmental organizations (NGOs) who seek to resist the imposition of constraints on
domestic political sovereignty by international trade agreements. As David Vogel notes,

free trade advocates want to limit the use of regulations as barriers to trade, while
environmentalists and consumer advocates want to prevent trade agreements from
serving as barriers to regulation. While the trade community worries about an
upsurge of ‘eco-protectionism’—the justification of trade barriers on environmental
grounds—consumer and environmental organizations fear that trade liberalization
will weaken both their own country’s regulatory standards and those of their nation’s
trading partners.5

This has become a concern in both exporting and importing countries. Domestic producer
interests in countries of destination often argue that lax health and safety regulation in
countries of origin constitute an implicit and unfair subsidy to foreign producers which should
be neutralized, e.g. by countervailing duties or by insistence on foreign countries adopting
policies similar to those that obtain in countries of destination.6 This insistence of across-the-
board equivalence raises a number of normative difficulties. How can trade in all goods
worldwide really be expected to occur on a level playing field? This proposition seems to be
at odds with the theory of comparative advantage which is centrally predicated on nations
exploiting their differences (not similarities) in international trade. Few international trade
theorists believe any longer that comparative advantage is exclusively exogenously
determined, but is significantly shaped by endogenous government polices, including health
and safety regulation. Exploiting differences in government policies is no less legitimate
than exploiting differences in natural endowments.7

A further and at least as potentially a divisive political fault line relating to many of these
issues has emerged between developed and developing countries. Many interests in
developed countries see the much laxer health and safety standards that often prevail in
developing countries as a threat to their more stringent standards by precipitating a race to
the bottom. On the other hand, many interests in developing countries see the insistence by
interests in developed countries on developing countries adhering to the generally more
stringent regulations that prevail in many developed countries (a race to the top) as
discriminatory, and an assault on essential features of their international comparative
advantage. 
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This phenomenon has resulted in a number of potential conflicts. For example, the US
Delaney Clause bars the approval of any food additive found to be carcino-genic. This ‘zero-
tolerance’ approach extends to the pesticide DDT. However, DDT is currently approved
for use under the Codex Alimentarius, the international body responsible for establishing
standards benchmarks. If Codex levels are exceeded, prima facie presumptions that the
standard is unduly trade-restricting will arise. The implication is that the US regulation may
now be found to be inconsistent with US obligations under the GATT/WTO. This may
compel the United States either to allow contaminated food into its market or possibly face
retaliatory sanctions.8 Likewise, labelling has become a sensitive issue, whereby very
specific product standards are often required before a specific label can be used, sometimes
leading to perverse results. Such was the case when a British sausage maker, wishing to
export to Germany, was required to label its product ‘pork-filled offal tubes’ rather than
the more appetizing (and more marketable) title of ‘sausages’.9 Labelling concerns are
currently at issue between North America and the EU, particularly in the area of genetically-
modified agriculture (biotechnology). Canada and the United States, global leaders in the
area, have invested massive resources in the development of this technology which has
allowed for large productivity gains. Yet EU markets remain for the most part closed to
such products. The EU has further threatened to impose discriminatory labelling schemes,
despite the existence of the growing European biotechnology industry.10

Within North America, Mexico has recently succeeded in partially overturning an 82-
year US ban on Mexican avocados because of the eradication of alleged pests which inhabit
the avocado pits. Now imports of Mexican avocados are limited to 19 Midwestern and
Northeast states during the winter months only, at the same time that California avocado
producers are in low-season. Likewise, Mexican tomatoes have had ongoing difficulties with
US market access. Florida’s tomato industry has not fared well in the new competitive
environment under NAFTA and consequently several actions have been taken to deny
Mexican tomatoes access to the US market, including health and safety barriers stemming
from concerns relating to irrigation and mulching practices.

From an economic perspective, there is much at stake. The US Department of
Commerce recently estimated that in 1993 almost two-thirds of the $465 billion in US
merchandise exports worldwide were affected by foreign technical requirements and
standards.11 Market access issues threaten to reduce the gains made in the Uruguay Round
in the area of agriculture. The US Department of Agriculture maintains that over 12% of
the total $60 billion in US agriculture exports was subject to ‘unjustified’ trade restrictions
involving SPS measures in 1996.12 Smaller export-driven economies are particularly
vulnerable as they lack the resources necessary to comply with multiple regulatory
requirements in multiple export markets. The value of a trade agreement and its potential
for economic integration is ultimately dependent on the legal and institutional structures
that support it. It is now useful to consider how the international legal system has evolved to
address these concerns.

This chapter first reviews the legal and jurisprudential foundations to these issues and
then explores some of the future policy concerns. Although the focus of this chapter is
domestic health and safety standards, environmental issues overlap to some degree with the
issues presented. However, this chapter does not deal directly with environmental
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regulation. For a full discussion of trade and environmental issues, see Chapter 15 of this
book.

LEGISLATIVE HISTORY

Successive international trade agreements have attempted to address the issue of standards
as non-tariff barriers through increasingly sophisticated legal frameworks. The relevant
provisions of three international agreements will be discussed here: GATT/WTO, the
NAFTA and the EU. As a starting point, some early work of the OECD is instructive.
Although not a trade agreement, the OECD represents the world’s major trading economies,
and helps to situate the issue in an historical context.

The OECD

The growth in legal instruments addressing the issue of standards in international trade has
been relatively recent. Despite this, the Organization for Economic Cooperation and
Development (OECD) recognized this as an issue as early as 1972, in the context of
environmental regulations in its Guiding Principles Concerning the International Economic Aspects
of Environmental Policies. These principles have more generally informed trade policy
approaches to technical standards. Although these principles do not represent binding legal
commitments, they are an early example of attempts to balance the imposition of standards
which relate to the valid environmental protection measures of a country on the one hand with
the corresponding impacts on trade that measures may have on the other. The principles
recognize that valid reasons for divergent standards exist, such as different social objectives
or levels of industrialization. The principles also recognize that harmonization, while
desirable, would be difficult to achieve in practice. The language in the principles seem to
foreshadow the issues that are prominent on the trade agenda today,

Where valid reasons for differences do not exist, Governments should seek
harmonization of environmental policies, for instance with respect to timing and the
general scope of regulation for particular industries to avoid the unjustified
disruption of international trade patterns and of the international allocation of
resources which may arise from the diversity of national environmental standards.

Measures taken to protect the environment should be framed as far as possible in
such a manner to avoid the creation of non-tariff barriers to trade. 

Where products are traded internationally and where there could be significant
obstacles to trade, governments should seek common standards for polluting
products and agree on the timing and the general scope of regulations for particular
products.

It is highly desirable to define in common, as rapidly as possible, procedures for
checking conformity to product standards established for the purpose of
environmental control. Procedures for checking conformity to standards should be
mutually agreed so as to be applied by an exporting country to the satisfaction of the
importing country.
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The GATT/WTO

The original GATT as adopted in 1947 does not contain provisions that directly restrict the
Contracting Parties’ freedom to adopt environmental, health and safety standards.13

GATT’s provisions of general application, however, still apply to such measures. The
national treatment provisions found in Article 111(4) obligates Parties to treat ‘like
products’ alike within the borders of the importing country. This would thus prevent the
discriminatory application of standards between domestic and imported goods, for
example, a regulation requiring that milk products be pas-teurized regardless of their place
of origin would be consistent with the national treatment obligation. But an outright ban on
imports of unpasteurized milk products would seemingly conflict with Article XI which
prohibits quantitative restrictions against imports. This potential conflict is addressed in the
Note to Article III which states that ‘any of the measures listed in paragraph 1 which applies
to both an imported product and to the like domestic product is to be regarded as an
internal measure even if it is collected or enforced in the case of imports at the time or
point of importation.’14 The Note thus resolves this problem by allowing non-
discriminatory regulations to apply at the border, essentially making the application of Article
III and Article XI mutually exclusive.15 This implies that an internal regulation which
prohibited the sale of unpasteurized milk which had the effect of an absolute ban on imports
would be consistent with GATT obligations.

More problematic are the subtle forms of discrimination—those rules which apply
equally to foreign and domestic products but discriminate by placing a disparately larger
burden on imports. Such de facto discrimination is inconsistent with the national treatment
obligations under Article 111(1), which reads, ‘Internal… regulations…should not be
applied to imported or domestic products so as to afford protection to domestic
production.’ This provision suggests that the complaining Party will bear the onus of
proving that a regulation was established to protect domestic industry. This will be a
difficult case to make, given the lack of criteria offered to make such a determination.
While a violation of Article III(4) is clearly justiciable, it is doubtful whether Article III(1)
on its own can be used as a basis for complaint before a GATT panel.16

In the event, however, that a regulation is inconsistent with a provision of the GATT,
Article XX provides a number of exceptions to such obligations. The portion of Article XX
relevant to environmental, health and safety standards reads,

Article XX

Subject to the requirement that such measures are not applied in a manner which
would constitute a means of arbitrary or unjustifiable discrimination between
countries where the same conditions prevail, or a disguised restriction on
international trade, nothing in this Agreement shall be construed to prevent the
adoption or enforcement by any contracting party of measures:

(b) necessary to protect human, animal or plant life or health; [or]
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(g) relating to the conservation of exhaustible natural resources is such measures
are made effective in conjunction with restrictions on domestic production or
consumption[.]

GATT case law distinguishes between the chapeau language found at the beginning of this
text and the areas of substantive exception below it. The purpose of the chapeau language is
to prevent Parties from taking undue advantage of the exceptions noted in Article XX, and
the burden of proving compliance with the Party relying on such an exception.17 In general,
Article XX has been interpreted narrowly to limit the extent of trade-restrictive
environmental, health and safety regulations.18 In the context of environmental, health and
safety regulations, the ‘necessary’ provision has been interpreted to permit trade-restrictive
policies only if no ‘less-GATT inconsistent’ regulation could be imposed.19 Esty has
commented that this sets a very high hurdle for such policies ‘because a policy approach that
intrudes less on trade is almost always conceivable and therefore in some sense “available’”.
Esty goes so far as to conclude that the strict interpretation of Article XX has effectively
eviscerated it as a meaningful exception.20

The Tokyo Round

In response to the general perception that the GATT regime was inadequate in dealing with
the growing problem of trade distortions arising from disparate national regulations21, an
Agreement on Technical Barriers to Trade, or the ‘Standards Code’ was adopted in 1979 at the
Tokyo Round of Multilateral Trade Negotiations22 but ratified by only thirty-nine
countries.23 The Standards Code established and elaborated on the principles first
introduced in the OECD Guiding Principles above. The Standards Code applied to ‘all
products, including industrial and agricultural products’.24 It reiterated the national
treatment (non-discrimina-tion) obligations of the Contracting Parties in this context and
further sought to ensure that technical regulations and standards were not adopted ‘with a
view to creating obstacles to international trade’.25 Contracting Parties were urged to work
toward the international harmonization of standards26 and were obligated to adopt such
internationally accepted standards, unless inappropriate for reasons which included national
security, the protection of human, animal and plant health, technological problems, and
climatic and geographical factors.27 This provision thus shifted the onus of justifying any
standard different from the internationally established benchmark to the Contracting Party.
Also worthy of note was the obligation to specify standards in terms of their ‘performance
rather than design or descriptive characteristics’.28 This provision sought to avoid the
potential creation of artificial distinctions based on the intricacies of product design rather
than their actual effect.29 In the event that a Contracting Party did choose to adopt a
standard which differed from an international standard or where no such international
standard existed, and that standard may have affected trade, notification was required
through the GATT Secretariat.30 With respect to conformity assessment, the Standards
Code provided that ‘imported products should be accepted for testing under conditions no
less favourable than those accorded to like domestic or imported products’ and that such
procedures should not be more complex or time-consuming than such treatment accorded
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to like domestic prod-ucts.31 The Standards Code also strongly encouraged Parties to adopt
a ‘mutual recognition’ policy, wherever possible, for test results, certificates, and marks of
conformity of other Parties.32

The Standards Code offered a clear articulation that standards which ‘create an
unnecessary obstacle to international trade’ are not permitted. Such wording implies that
there may exist necessary obstacles to trade but no set of criteria was offered in order to
determine the dividing line between necessary and unnecessary obstacles to trade. Thus
although the Standards Code may be viewed as a helpful first step to reducing the trade-
restricting effect of divergent domestic standards, regulations and conformity assessment
procedures, its effectiveness was weakened by the fact that it did not address the issue of
what exactly constitutes an unacceptable standard. This meant that the complaining Party
had the formidable onus of either having to prove ‘deliberate protectionist intent, or to
demonstrate that the measure went beyond what was “necessary”’.33 From this legacy came
the momentum to make as an objective of the Uruguay Round the development and
extension of this legal framework.

The Uruguay Round

The Uruguay Round elaborated the Tokyo Round Standards Code into two new
agreements governing standards. The Agreement on Sanitary and Phytosanitary Measures34 (SPS
Agreement) addresses measures designed to protect human, animal and plant life, and
health. The Technical Barriers to Trade Agreement35 (TBT Agreement) covers other technical
standards and measures not covered by the SPS Agreement. Under the ‘umbrella’ provisions
of the WTO, all Parties to the GATT are obligated to adhere to both of these
Agreements.36 This expanded the number of global imports subject to trade disciplines by
approximately $182 billion, according to one estimate.37

Agreement on Technical Barriers to Trade

The issues created by technical barriers to trade were recently explored by the US National
Research Council. Concerned that standards-related issues were undermining potential
gains from trade in the United States, a group of experts were convened to undertake a
comprehensive study of the issue. The group, led by prominent trade economist Gary
Hufbauer, concluded that ‘there is evidence to indicate that significant barriers to global
trade are embedded in existing standards and will continue to grow in complexity.’38 These
conclusions were based on the following observations of the group:

(1) standards that differ from international norms are employed as a means to protect
domestic producers; (2) restrictive standards are written to match the design
features of domestic products, rather than essential performance criteria; (3) there
remain unequal access to testing and certification systems between domestic producers
and exporters in most nations; (4) there continues to be a failure to accept test
results and certifications performed between domestic producers and exporters in
most nations; (4) there continues to be a failure to accept test results and
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certifications performed by competent foreign organizations in multiple markets; and
(5) there is a significant lack of transparency in the systems for developing technical
regulations and assessing conformity in most countries.39

The TBT Agreement is designed to address such issues. It applies to all products, including
industrial and agricultural products, but does not include SPS mea-sures.40 It covers
technical regulations, standards and conformity assessment procedures, as defined in Annex
1 of the Agreement.41 This could include, for example, regulations governing packaging,
recycling or disposal of products, ecolabelling criteria, water or electrical efficiency criteria
for household appliances, product noise regulations, and specifications for children’s toys.
In terms of affirming the right of members to set such standards at the levels they deem
appropriate, the preamble to the TBT Agreement contains rather equivocal language.42 And
although there is no positive affirmation of this freedom in the text of the Agreement,
members do remain free to choose the level of standards they deem most appropriate,
subject to the discipline of the TBT Agreement.

The TBT Agreement is really a more expansive formulation of Article XX, influenced by
modern policy concerns and the body of jurisprudence which has interpreted this section.
Article 2.1 reiterates a commitment to the cornerstone principles of MFN and national
treatment. Article 2.2 of the TBT Agreement states that technical regulations should not be
‘prepared, adopted or applied with a view to or with the effect of creating unnecessary
obstacles to international trade’. Article 2.2 further states that such regulation should not be
‘more trade-restrictive than necessary to fulfill a legitimate objective, taking account of the
risks non-fulfilment would create’. This language builds on Article XX by including an open-
ended list of permissible legitimate objectives that include inter alia the ‘protection of
human health or safety, animal or plant life or health, or the environment’. To some degree,
this amplifies the limited nature of listed exceptions to Article XX. In terms of assessing the
risks referred to in the paragraph, Article 2.2 states that ‘relevant elements of consideration
are, inter alia: available scientific and technical information, related processing technology
or intended end-uses of products’. This represents a significant departure from the
questionable notion in the Tuna/Dolphin rulings that National Treatment does not apply to
production of these methods (see Trade and Environment chapter), as it may allow
differentation based on how a product is made, as opposed to the final product itself. Recall
that the national treatment and MFN principles apply to ‘like’ products. Under these rules,
therefore, a country could not discriminate based on place of origin between a package of
8½ × 11" white paper from country A and a package of the same paper from country B.
Therefore if an importing country imposed an ‘ecotax’ on paper manufactured with
chlorine bleach, in order to discourage its use and limit the associated harmful
environmental effects, it would seemingly be inconsistent with these principles. But Article
2.2 now includes factors for consideration that go beyond the Tuna/Dolphin view of
determining whether products are ‘like’ or not, thereby supporting an argument that
measures which distinguish between products on the basis of production processes could be
now validly justified as national treatment as well.43

Members are encouraged to use relevant international standards where they exist, unless
such a standard ‘would be an ineffective or inappropriate means for the fulfilment of legitimate
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objectives’.44 If a Member adopts an international standard, a rebuttable presumption is
created that the standard does not create an unnecessary obstacle to trade.45 Whenever a
relevant international standard does not exist or the technical content of a proposed
regulation is not in accordance with the relevant international standard and if the technical
regulation may have a significant effect on trade of other Members, Members are obligated
to publish a notice in a publication at an early stage so as to enable interested parties and
other Members to become acquainted with it and to provide opportunities for other
Members to make comments in writing on the proposed regulation.46 Members must also
allow a reasonable interval between the publication of technical regulations and their entry
into force in order to allow time for producers in exporting countries to adapt their
products or methods of production to the requirements of the importing Members.47

The TBT Agreement also introduces new obligations in the area of conformity
assessment, such as procedures for product testing and inspection and
laboratory accreditation.48 These include the rules that govern who may permissibly certify
that a product conforms to certain standards, such as an organization responsible for
certifying that a given appliance is deserving of an ‘energy efficient’ label, or that a given
medicine is safe and effective. It is in this area where costs to manufacturers and exporters
are most likely to grow in the coming years.49 There are numerous examples where
indefinite delays and/or refusal to certify products, or the lack of recognition of competent
laboratory testing in foreign countries has proven to be a significant source of frustration to
exporters. This has added needless transaction costs and undermined the goals of economic
integration.50 Many such examples have persisted to serve a protectionist agenda, yet others
exist due to a lack of coordination or a lack of effort to address the issue. Articles 5 to 9 set
out the basic requirements in this area, and are similar to the obligations described above
for technical regulations. Notable is the language encouraging Members to harmonize and/
or recognize each others’ results of conformity assessment procedures. The effectiveness of
such provisions will ultimately depend on their interpretation in the event that a country’s
conformity assessment procedures are challenged before a panel. One commentator has
noted the potential difficulty in interpreting Article 6 which requires ‘whenever possible,
that the results of conformity assessment procedures in other Members are accepted, even
when those procedures differ from their own, provided they are satisfied that those
procedures offer an assurance of conformity’.51

There are a number of key concerns raised by the TBT Agreement. First, there is a
concern among consumer groups that such legislation functions to constrain the ability of
Members to set technical regulations and standards at levels they deem appropriate, thereby
undermining national political sovereignty and policy autonomy.52 The TBT Agreement
strives to promote international policy convergence, the welfare implications of which are
highly ambiguous in many cases.53 Second, the TBT Agreement does not effectively address
the issue of how exactly a panel could go about delineating a validly different standard from
a trade-restricting one. While the benchmark of an international standard is clearly given,
the subject of risk assessment is not addressed, unlike the comprehensive provisions
outlined in the SPS Agreement. This means that if a Member adopts a standard which is
more stringent than the international standard it is not required to be justified based on
scientific evidence.
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It is worth noting, however, that there are benefits of international standardization that
go beyond reducing trade frictions. A recent study found that standardization increased
technical efficiency, as it made it easier to ‘mix and match’ among different firms’ products.54

The study also found that allocative efficiency could be increased through standardization, as
it reduced information asymmetries between buyers and sellers, and that standardization
promotes product compatibility, thereby allowing for increased economies of scale and
scope.55 Moreover, the study found that, based on modern growth theory, standards
harmonization ‘can offer a competitively neutral form of information exchange capable of
promoting cycles of innovation and long-term growth’.56 

Agreement on Sanitary and Phytosanitary Standards

The WTO Agreement on Agriculture will reduce tariff barriers by an average of 36% over
the six years from its inception.57 This has, and will continue to, increase global trade in
agricultural products.58 As a result, there may be an increase in the number of disputes in
the SPS area, because as tariffs continue to fall, there will likely be a corresponding reliance
on SPS measures as a source of protection for domestic producers. This underscores the
need for a legal framework which can address the fundamental issue of whether a measure
validly exists to protect consumers or is merely a sham to protect domestic producers. The
SPS Agreement was designed to address this need, and is used primarily as a tool to regulate
SPS measures as non-tariff barriers.59 SPS measures are a highly controversial area of
regulation as they concern for the most part the safety of a nation’s food supply and
consequently have been the focus of intense NGO lobbying efforts. Central SPS issues such
as scientific justification and allowable risk are difficult to arbitrate and lie at the heart of a
country’s sovereignty.

The SPS Agreement adopts the basic structure seen previously in the TBT Agreement
and Article XX. It defines an SPS measure to be any number of measures that protect
human, animal or plant life or health from pests, contaminants, toxins, disease-carrying
organisms, etc.60 Article 2 sets out the basic rights and obligations of Members. Article 2.1
affirms the right of Members to adopt SPS measures. Members are responsible for ensuring
that an SPS measure is applied ‘only to the extent necessary’ and is based on scientific
principles and evidence. Article 5.7 provides a provisional exception to this rule when
‘relevant scientific evidence is insufficient’, allowing Members to adopt SPS measures ‘on
the basis of available pertinent information’. Where a Member acts on the basis of Article 5.
7, it is required to seek a more objective evaluation based on fuller evidence within a
reasonable time. Members are further responsible for ensuring that such measures do not
arbitrarily or unjustifiably discriminate against members and that such measures are not
applied in a way that would constitute a disguised restriction on trade.

Other provisions amplify the obligations in Article 2.2 and 2.3. Article 3 requires that, to
facilitate harmonization, Members base their SPS measures on ‘international standards,
guidelines or recommendations’ wherever possible. Significantly, Article 3.3 makes it clear
that a higher level of protection requires scientific justification to be GATT-consistent,
whereas any other kind of difference from international standards (i.e. inferior protection)
shall be deemed to be GATTconsistent. Measures which conform to international standards
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will be presumed to be valid. In the absence of harmonization, Article 4 obligates Members
to accept the SPS measures of other Members as equivalent, if the exporting Member
demonstrates that its measures achieve the same purpose. Article 5 requires that all sanitary
and phytosanitary measures be based upon risk assessments that take into account ‘risk
assessment techniques developed by the relevant international organizations’ (Article 5.1).

Many of these concepts pose potential problems in their interpretation and application.
First, the requirement that Members may adopt more stringent measures if they are based
on ‘sound science’ seems to imply a ‘rigorous cause-and-effect nexus between the empirical
evidence and the national regulatory measure chosen’.61 It is a vague provision which
assumes that there exists one objective and correct view of any scientific issue. Science is
not a static entity but rather an evolving dialogue within various international communities.
As one commentator noted, ‘it is by no means obvious…that “good science” can be defined
with precision in the abstract’.62 Further, the policy rationale behind many public health
measures is precautionary: where there is a small but serious risk, regulators will err on the
side of caution.63 For example, in the United States and Canada, lead was removed from
gasoline before the harmful effects were conclusively substantiated with scientific evidence.
More recently, there has been strong controversy over BSE disease in cattle and the extent
to which measures can be based on tentative scientific evidence. The Economist recently
noted in reference to this issue that ‘responding to a previously unknown disease brings a
dilemma. Over-reaction risks diverting scarce resources from real and soluble problems.
Under-reaction risks an epidemic.’64

The second related area of concern is the distinction between risk assessment and risk
management. Measures must take into account international risk assessment
methodologies, and be based on scientific research to establish the probability of harm. But
the decision on how to manage those risks is more controversial and it is not clear how the
SPS Agreement constrains a Member’s freedom to make that choice. What constitutes an
allowable risk will ultimately reflect the social values of a particular society at a particular
stage of development. Is an ‘appropriate risk’ of a toxic substance one which allows cancer
to develop in one out of a thousand, a hundred thousand or one million people? Or should
it be zero? Article 5.3 of the SPS Agreement adds a further complication by injecting an
economic ‘cost-benefit’ test into the risk assessment process by taking into account relevant
economic factors such as ‘the potential damage in terms of loss of production or sales…and
the relative cost-effectiveness of alternative approaches to limiting risk’.65 This seems to
venture into an uncomfortable area of weighing the value of human health or the
environment against more readily measurable economic concerns.66

A third concern emanating from environmental and consumer groups relates to the fear
that the harmonization process will function to force standards down to the ‘lowest
common denominator.’67 Vogel has challenged this proposition, stating that the opposite
dynamic can occur, and that trade liberalization has more often functioned to strengthen
consumer health and safety standards rather than weaken them.68 This has been labelled by
Vogel as the ‘California Effect’, referring to the influence that relatively powerful and
wealthy green jurisdictions such as California have had in raising health and safety standards
through trade. However, the TBT and SPS Agreement strive toward as much harmonization
as Members can achieve in an effort to mitigate negative trade effects, which may in fact
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draw standards downwards. At the very least, high transaction costs are imposed on a
country that wishes to pursue a more stringent—or perhaps different—set of regulatory
measures that may validly reflect local concerns and tastes. Esty cites the argument that as a
matter of political theory, ‘decisions should be made at the most decentralized level
possible to give maximum scope to local citizens’ priorities and preferences…those who
argue for decentralized decision making believe that access to policymakers and the ability
to hold elected officials accountable for their actions is sacrosanct—and lacking in
international bodies’.69 From a welfare perspective, if there are large variances in
preferences and the cost of such variance is small (a determination which could be made on
a case by case basis), different standards may indeed be welfare-maximizing.70 Thus the
present degree of emphasis on harmonization raises difficult normative issues.

A general characterization of the TBT and SPS Agreements is that they provide a more
sophisticated formulation of the principle of non-discrimination contained in Article III of
the GATT and a more elaborated set of justifications that must be offered in cases of
disparate impact presently dealt with in the exceptions contained in Article XX of the
GATT/WTO. While these rules clearly constrain the ability of countries of destination to
adopt regulations that have a disparate impact on imports from other countries, they
nevertheless leave substantial room for the exercise of national political sovereignty and
policy autonomy both in choosing policy objectives (as long as these are not a sham) and
policy instruments (as long as these are not disproportionate to the objective, given their
effect on trade).71 In short, if countries generally feel committed to adopting more
stringent health, safety, consumer protection, environmental or conservation standards for
legitimate (non-trade related) reasons, they remain largely free to do so, subject to
demonstrating that there is some rational scientific basis for their actions beyond the impact
on international trade, and that such measures do not gratuitously encumber international
trade when other less restrictive policy instruments are available to achieve the same
objectives.

The NAFTA

The NAFTA provisions with respect to standards are closely similar to the Uruguay Round
TBT and SPS Agreements.72 There are a few important differences, which can be accounted
for by the political context in which NAFTA entered into force. The adoption of NAFTA
was stalled for two years in an effort to address the concerns of the increasingly powerful
NGO community of the United States, particularly consumer, environmental and labour
groups.73 To some extent, the differences that exist between the two agreements reflects
the varying degrees of power of the United States in two different trade negotiation
contexts. In the trilateral NAFTA negotiations, the United States was by far the dominant
economic power, whereas in the case of the multilateral WTO negotiations, its economic
power was relatively more balanced. This fact is reflected in the NAFTA as compared to the
WTO Agreement, which affords greater latitude to the parties to set health and safety
standards at levels they deem appropriate, despite possible trade restricting effects.74 
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TBT Code

NAFTA’s TBT Code is found in Chapter 9 and largely reiterates the rights and obligations
found in the Uruguay Round TBT Agreement. The right to establish measures ‘relating to
safety, the protection of human, animal or plant life or health, the environment or
consumers’ is positively established in Article 904. NAFTA Parties are free to establish the
level of protection deemed appropriate and are not obliged to harmonize. This would allow
countries to vary in their level of allowable risk.75 Parties are prevented from establishing
standards with a view to, or having the effect of, creating an unnecessary obstacle to trade
(Article 904(4)). An unnecessary obstacle to trade will not be deemed to be created where
the purpose of the measure is to achieve a legitimate objective, which is defined to include
sustainable development as well as the protection of human, animal and plant life, and
health. This provides stronger protection for disparate standards than its Uruguay Round
counterpart, which states that whenever a technical regulation is created for a legitimate
objective and is in accordance with relevant international standards, it ‘shall be rebuttably
presumed not create an obstacle to trade’.76 This also represents a departure from the
comparable FTA language which used the term ‘legitimate domestic objective’. This
provision may have been added to permit extraterritorial protection measures, a subject of
controversy under the GATT.77

The NAFTA TBT Code differs from the Uruguay Round TBT Agreement in that it does
not contain an express ‘least trade-restrictive’ requirement. Both the NAFTA TBT Code
and the Uruguay Round TBT Agreement differ from the SPS disciplines in that they permit
national regulations to be more stringent than international standards without requiring that
those standards be justified by scientific evidence. Article 907 uses permissive language—a
Party ‘may’ take into account available scientific evidence, etc. Again, Article 905 places a
premium on the use of international standards by presuming them to be consistent with the
obligations under this section.

SPS Code

Trade in agriculture within North America is large and rapidly growing.78 There is a heavy
reliance on the SPS disciplines to facilitate this growth, making the NAFTA model an
interesting test case. NAFTA’s SPS Code in general contains the same disciplines as outlined
above for the SPS Agreement, save for a few exceptions. NAFTA provides a more forceful
articulation of the freedom of Parties to adopt such levels of protection as they see fit.
Article 712(1) establishes the positive right of a Party to adopt any SPS measure necessary
for the protection of human, animal or plant life or health, including measures more
stringent than international standards. This is supported by Article 712(2) which states that
notwithstanding any other provision, Parties remain free to establish ‘appropriate levels of
protection’. This has been interpreted as a clear statement that NAFTA countries are not
obligated to harmonize their standards.79 Article 712 contains national treatment language
along with the obligation that SPS measures are to be ‘applied only to the extent necessary
to achieve its appropriate level of protection’ and that they may not be applied ‘with a view
to, or with the effect of, creating a disguised restriction on trade between the Parties’.
Article 712(3) requires that SPS measures be based on scientific principles and risk
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assessment and Article 715 lists the factors that NAFTA countries must take into account
when assessing risk and determining appropriate levels of protection. Like the WTO SPS
Agreement, Parties are obligated to take international risk assessment methodologies into
account along with other scientific considerations. NAFTA also introduces a cost-benefit
analysis into the assessment of risk. If a NAFTA Party adopts standards based on
international ones, such standards are presumed to be consistent with Article 712 and
Parties are obligated to participate in international standardizing organizations. NAFTA 715
(3) states that Parties shall ‘avoid arbitrary or unjustifiable distinctions’ in establishing levels
of protection. Article 714 states that the Parties shall, to the greatest extent practicable,
pursue equivalence in their SPS measures, as long as levels of protection are not reduced.

NAFTA institutions

NAFTA further established a trilateral intergovernmental institutional structure to support
and facilitate the application of the TBT and SPS Codes. A number of committees,
subcommittees and working groups meet regularly in order to discuss issues that arise in the
context of North American trade.80 Groups that deal regularly with standards related issues
include an SPS Committee and its associated nine technical working groups (including one
on pesticides), a Committee on Agricultural Trade and a Committee on Standards-Related
Measures with associated subcommittees in the area of land transportation.

The European Union

The Treaty of Rome’s central provision with respect to the import restrictions is found in
Article 30 which provides that ‘quantitative restrictions on imports and all measures having
an equivalent effect shall, without prejudice to the following provisions, be prohibited
between Member States.’ Measures having equivalent effect include trading rules which
hinder or have the potential of hindering intra-Community trade.81 This provision is not
absolute—two categories of exceptions exist. First, Article 36 of the Treaty permits
exceptions on a number of grounds, including the protection of health and life of humans,
animal and plants so long as the measures do not constitute a means of arbitrary
discrimination or a disguised restriction on trade. It is possible that this list could be
extended to include environmental measures subject to the condition that such measures
apply equally to domestic and imported products.82 Measures which rely on the Article 36
exception must be ‘necessary’, which has been interpreted in the case law of the European
Court of Justice to mean ‘that there must be a causal relationship between the measure
adopted and the attainment of the objective pursued, and the measure must be the least
restrictive method of attaining that purpose’.83 This requirement thus appears to presage
the comparable requirements of the WTO and NAFTA.

The second exception, referred to as the ‘rule of reason’, is found in the early
jurisprudence of the EU.84 It illustrates how the scope of the Treaty of Rome was extended
beyond measures that discriminated on their face against non-domestic products to those
that merely had a disparate impact. In its 1979 Cassis de Dijon deci-sion,85 the European
Court of Justice held that a German law that prohibited the sale of the liqueur Cassis with less
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than 25% alcohol content violated Article 30 of the Treaty. It prevented the import of
French cassis which had an alcohol content below 20%. However, the Court suggested that
where measures are not facially discriminatory but have a disparate impact, they may be
saved if they are necessary in order to satisfy mandatory requirements related in particular
to the effectiveness of fiscal supervision, the protection of public health, the fairness of
commercial transactions, and the defence of the consumer. The test of necessity involves
consideration of whether alternative measures less restrictive of intra-Union trade might
adequately satisfy the mandatory requirements at issue. Hence, if the goal was to ensure
that consumers were not misled by an assumption about the domestic product into thinking
that the foreign product contained an equivalent amount of alcohol, labelling requirements
would suffice. Similarly, in its 1987 German Beer Standards decision,86 the Court impugned a
German law which required that any product sold with the label ‘beer’ in Germany meet
Germany purity standards. The Court reasoned that consumers could be informed of the
difference between beers through the use of appropriate labelling requirements. Where
health risks are claimed as a basis for content requirements that affect trade, and where less
stringent requirements are in place elsewhere in the Union, the Court places some burden
on the defendant Member State to produce empirical evidence of the risks in question.

STANDARDS SETTING BODIES

All of the trade agreements listed above rely heavily on the work of international
standardizing organizations. As they largely immunize domestic standards from attack, their
work is extremely important. The stringency of a country’s chosen standard vis-à-vis the
comparable international standard is key to an initial determination of whether such a
measure is or is not consistent with the given trade agreement. This naturally puts such
hitherto ‘back room’ organizations in a new light. How are such institutions governed? To
whom are they accountable? To what extent do they permit public participation? How are
their standards actually developed?

The international standards system

There are a number of international standardizing bodies mentioned in the text of the trade
agreements. In the case of SPS measures, both the NAFTA and WTO refer to the Codex
Alimentarius Commission. the International Office of Epizootics, and the international and
regional organizations operating within the framework of the International Plant Protection
Convention. In the case of TBT measures, both the NAFTA and WTO refer to the
International Organization for Standardization (ISO), the International Electrotechnical
Commission (IEC), Codex Alimentarius Commission, the Food and Agricultural
Organization (FAO) and the World Health Organization (WHO).

The most important non-governmental international standards development institution is
the International Organization for Standardization (ISO), a worldwide federation of
national standards bodies from over 100 countries.87 It was founded in 1946 and has been
the most prolific author of international standards to date, generating standards in almost all
areas except for electrical standards, which is governed by the International
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Electrotechnical Commission (IEC).88 ISO members are comprised of the national bodies
‘most representative of standardization in its country’. The technical work of the ISO is
highly decentralized and is carried out by over 2,700 technical committees, subcommittees
and working groups which are coordinated by a central secretariat located in Geneva.

Within the ISO, each member body has the right to be represented on a committee if it
has an interest in a subject. Standards are developed by a consensus process in order to be
inclusive of the views of all stakeholders. They represent industry-wide interests, seek to
promote global solutions and are voluntary. Standards are developed according to a six-step
process. The ISO has developed these rules, on the whole, without controversy. But despite
the wide membership, Esty notes that there are only ‘limited opportunities for public
involvement’ and often the only people at the meetings are business representatives from
industry. This view is supported by Audley who additionally notes that the fact that only
one organization per country can be represented at the meetings compounds NGO efforts
‘to overcome technical and financial constraints that already greatly limit their participation
in meetings’.89

Some difficulties associated with ISO are apparent with the work of ISO 14000,
responsible for setting standards for industry environmental management systems. The ISO
14000 certification process requires a combination of adherence to national standards as
well as compliance with voluntary standards, as enforced by a third party auditor. Audley
notes that the information provided to those auditors ‘is not necessarily available to the
public, thereby restricting interest groups from access to performance data normally used to
watchdog industry performance’.90

The lack of public participation has encouraged discussion in other multilateral fora
which may shape the work of ISO, thereby improving the process.91 A recent trilateral
meeting of stakeholders in the ISO process outlined the concerns associated with the ISO
process, which mainly centred around the ability of developing countries to comply or
adapt to standards. International standards are perceived to be largely driven by multinational
enterprises, eager to establish global standards and take advantage of decentralized global
production processes. Developing countries are particularly concerned that such
standardizing processes not be used in a way that excludes them from participation in the
global marketplace, noting that ‘developed countries are capable of formulating demanding
requirements since they have more chances of observing them’ and that ‘norms in
developing countries are a mutilated copy of standards prepared in developed countries; and
therefore, they do not project the real possibility for implementing them.’92 There is
further concern that the extra costs of the technology that developing countries require to
comply with standards and related certification process may increase the price of their
products and undermine comparative advantages.93 The ‘right’ of a country to choose its
own standards as enunciated in a trade agreement must be evaluated in the context of the
economic realities that surround it. As a simple reality of participating in the global
marketplace, countries may be forced to standardize to gain market access or because
customers and suppliers demand it. Smaller and less economically significant nations will in
essence become ‘regulation takers’, thereby supplanting their own choice of domestic
regulation in favour of the dominant market’s choice.94

144 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



The Codex Alimentarius Commission was established in 1962 as a joint undertaking of
the UN Food and Agricultural Organization (FAO) and the World Health Organization
(WHO). It has over 130 Member States and is responsible for ‘protecting the health of the
consumers and ensuring fair practices in the food trade’ as well as preparing and
coordinating all food standards undertaken by international governmental and non-
governmental organizations.95 A recent report by the OECD noted that ‘the Codex is
believed to become the focal point for regulatory design in the agro-food sector’ which has
led to an increased interest on the part of firms seeking to promote their own interests.96

The Codex has been criticized for its closed-door policy and its lack of ‘established
protocols for ensuring a rational outcome based on scientific evidence’.97 Codex has
evaluated more than 187 pesticides, 523 food additives, and 57 food contaminants. It has
also established over 3,019 maximum residue limits for pesticides, many of which are
significantly less stringent in the United States, creating a potentially fertile source of trade
con-flict.98 In the recent Beef Hormones dispute, the Codex standards were key to the ruling
against the EU, despite the fact that the Codex standard for hormones ‘was adopted by a
vote of 33–29 with seven abstentions, [h]ardly a ringing endorsement of the safety of eating
hormone-processed meat’.99

SELECTED CASE-LAW

Given the increased linkage between trade policy and domestic policy, trade panels are now
forced to grapple with issues beyond conventional trade problems in areas such as scientific
evidence. Only a fraction of disputes that involve stan-dards-related issues actually reach the
panel stage where other avenues have failed such as intergovernmental negotiations or
diplomatic intervention, and often involving large industries who are able to devote
significant resources to such conflicts.

One particular difficulty is the application of the ‘least trade restrictive’ test. This
question was considered in the GATT panel case of Thai Cigarettes, where the Thai
government imposed a ban on foreign cigarettes in order to protect the health of its
citizens, while allowing the sale of domestic cigarettes through a state-owned industry. In
this case, the panel ruled against the Thai government, and found that the same policy goal
could be achieved with instruments less restrictive of trade that did not discriminate
between domestic and foreign goods.100 The panel suggested that a ban on advertising or an
increase in prices could possibly have been less objectionable policy alternatives to an
outright ban. This decision sparked concerns about a GATT panel ‘second-guessing’ the
Thai government’s decision about what policy was most appropriate to reduce smoking
among its citizens.

The difficulties that can arise in operationalizing a least trade restrictive means or
proportionality test are illustrated by the Danish Bottles case, where the European
Commission challenged a Danish regulation established in 1981 requiring that all beer and
soft drinks be sold in returnable containers that could be refilled.101 These containers had to
be pre-approved by the Danish environmental protection agency, in order to ensure that
they were suitable for recycling and that a sufficient proportion of the returned containers
would actually be reused.
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Following complaints by firms in other Member States denied market access for non-
compliance with this regulation, the Commission encouraged Denmark to change its laws.
In 1984, Denmark permitted non-approved containers on the condition that the total non-
complying containers not exceed 3,000 hectolitres annually per firm and that a deposit and
return system was established. This legislation also failed to satisfy the Commission, which
declared that the deposit and return scheme as well as the agency approval scheme was
incompatible with Article 30 of the Treaty of Rome as it ‘constituted a measure having an
equivalent effect to a quantitative restriction’.102

On appeal to the European Court of Justice (ECJ), the Court in September 1988 found
Denmark’s requirements regarding the mandatory disposal and recycling of empty
containers to be legal. The ECJ applied the Cassis de Dijon reasoning and ruled the recycling
scheme as ‘an indispensable element of a system intended to ensure the reuse of containers
and therefore…necessary to achieve the aims pursued by the contested rules. That being
so, the restrictions which it imposes on the free movement of goods cannot be regarded as
disproportionate.’103 Here the ECJ effectively sidestepped the issue of discrimination and a
consideration of whether the rule of reason extended to measures that although facially
neutral placed a larger burden on foreign firms.104

However, the ECJ found the restriction of 3,000 hectolitres per year per firm to be
inconsistent with Article 30, stating that although the system for Danish containers offered
superior environmental protection, the non-conforming containers were still
‘environmentally-friendly’ as they were subject to a deposit and return scheme as well.
Accordingly, the ECJ applied a ‘least trade restrictive’ test and found that this restriction
failed, as a less trade restrictive alternative existed. One commentator noted that this ruling
does not achieve the same high level of envi-ronmental protection as the more trade-
restrictive alternative, Thus the ECJ seems to have conducted an implicit balancing test
between the two objectives of environmental protection and the free movement of goods,
resulting in a lower level of protection than originally chosen by the country.105 

The Danish Container case finds close echoes in Canada. Following two GATT panel
decisions106 holding various aspects of Canadian (mostly provincial) regulation of liquor
distribution (mostly beer) in violation of Article XI, Article III, and Article II of the GATT
and not saved by any of the exceptions in Article XX, the Ontario government in April
1992 announced the imposition of a ten-cent per container tax on non-refillable (albeit
recyclable) beer containers, in order ostensibly to promote the use of refillable containers
(bottles), which were asserted to be more environmentally congenial. As a background fact,
about 90% of Canadian beer is sold in bottles, while about 90% of US beer is sold in
containers and in terms of access to the Canadian market, the ability of US breweries to
export beer into Canada in cans was crucial to their ability to compete effectively with
domestic breweries. The imposition of the can tax provoked a highly acrimonious dispute
between the Canadian and US governments, leading the US government to impose retaliatory
tariffs on exports of Canadian beer to the US and the Canadian government to counter-
retaliate by imposing tariffs on US beer exports into Canada. The dispute was finally
resolved through a negotiated agreement, and thus the can tax was never challenged before
a GATT panel. Had it been, any such panel would have faced very similar issues to those
which arose in the Danish Container case, although given the long history of disputes between
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the EU and the US on the one hand, and Canada on the other, over protectionist policies
adopted by Canadian federal and provincial governments towards the brewing industry in
Canada, one might have been more readily inclined to conclude that the measure was a
‘sham’ or ‘colourable’, in the absence of compelling evidence that recyclable cans (which
were already subject, like bottles, to a deposit and return system) were less
environmentally friendly than refillable bottles—a proposition that is appar-ently not
scientifically obvious.107 It further raises questions about the extent to which policy
consistency within an administration is an appropriate factor to consider in making this
judgment, as a similar requirement was not imposed on pop or juice aluminum cans, whose
numbers far outweigh beer cans in Ontario.

The WTO Appellate Body has recently dealt with the question of whether a health
regulation was discriminatory as applied to foreign firms in the context of reformulated
gasoline. In a recent effort to reduce air pollution, the United States established two
gasoline programmes under the auspices of the Clean Air Act. The programmes provided that
in specific high pollution areas as measured by ozone concentration, only ‘clean’
reformulated gasoline could be sold, which meant that it had to be blended with ethanol, a
cleaner burning octane enhancer produced from corn. This required a significant capital
expense on the part of reformulated gasoline producers, so an interim standard was allowed
over a five-year phase in period until a fixed standard became effective. This interim
standard was calculated using a formula that began with a 1990 baseline and would reduce
the amount of olefines (an ozone producing chemical) yearly on a percentage basis.108

Foreign producers, however, were not permitted to use their 1990 baseline, but a statutory
baseline, which often imposed a stricter burden on them Venezuela and Brazil, the leading
exporters of gasoline to the United States, filed a complaint with the GATT/WTO claiming
that the regulation violated Article III as it treated like products differently, based on their
country of origin. With respect to the economic and environmental stakes, the Venezuelan
company stood to lose $150 million year, after it had undergone significant capital expenses
based on previous US regulations in order to be able to export to the United States. As
well, the regulation was only moderately effective in achieving the stated standard—clean
air.109 In this way, an ‘end-means’ test begins to enter into the jurisprudence, which
questions the actual efficiency and effectiveness of a regulation in achieving its stated goal.

The WTO panel found that the US regulation violated Article 111:4 of the GATT by
treating foreign gasoline less favourably than domestic gasoline. Interestingly, the panel
declined to rule on whether the US had violated Article III: 1, in reply to the argument
advanced by Venezuela and Brazil that the measure was ‘applied so as to afford protection to
domestic production.’ This seems to highlight the reluctance of trade panels to impute male
fides on the part of an offending country. In considering whether the measure was ‘saved’ by
the exceptions of Article XX, the panel first examined Article XX(b) and the question of
whether the measure was ‘necessary’ to protect animal and plant life. The panel regarded
its task as asking the question of whether there were less trade-restrictive alternatives
available in achieving the policy goal, rather than the necessity of the environmental goal. It
found that there were more flexible ways of determining a baseline level for foreign
producers than a statutory standard, and hence there were indeed less-trade restrictive
alternatives available to the United States in achieving its stated policy goal. In considering

HEALTH AND SAFETY STANDARDS 147



Article XX(g), and whether the measure ‘related to the conservation of exhaustible natural
resources’, the panel used the ‘primarily aimed at’ test as enunciated in the 1987 decision
on Herring and Salmon. The panel found ‘no direct connection between less favourable
treatment of imported gasoline that was chemically identical to domestic gasoline and the US
objective of improving air quality in the United States’ and therefore were ‘not primarily
aimed at the conservation of natural resources.’ The panel found it unnecessary at that point
to consider whether the measures were inconsistent with the TBT Agreement.

The Appellate Report largely upheld the panel’s findings. It did, however, take issue with
its legal reasoning under Article XX(g) stating that ‘the phrase “primarily aimed at”’ is not
itself treaty language and was not designed as a simple litmus test for inclusion or exclusion
from Article XX(g), thereby calling into question the precedential value of the Herring and
Salmon case.

The first decision by a WTO panel on the SPS Agreement entailed the longstanding
dispute between the US and the EU in the Beef Hormones case.110 In this case, the United
States initially filed a complaint against the EU under the GATT Tokyo Round Standards
Code, alleging that a 1988 EU Directive banning the sale of hormone-fed beef in the EU had
no basis in scientific evidence of a health danger from human consumption of the hormones.
The EU viewed the ban as a legitimate response to public concerns about use of hormones
as growth stimulants, while admitting that there was little scientific support for these
concerns. The more technical legal disagreement surrounded whether the Code applied
to standards which were not product standards in the strict sense but applied to the ‘process
or production method’ (PPM) by which a product was produced (clearly, the ban on
hormone-fed beef went to the method of production of the beef). The EU claimed that the
Code did not apply to PPMs. The United States, however, invoked a provision of the Code
that suggested PPMs would be covered in circumstances where their effect was to
circumvent the primary obligations of the Code not to create ‘unnecessary obstacles to
trade.’ A technical panel under the Code was never established to decide the matter, since
the EU refused to accept its jurisdiction, arguing that the Code did not apply at all to the
kind of measure at issue. The EU was prepared to have a special panel of legal experts
address the threshold issue of the Code’s jurisdiction over the dispute, but this was
unacceptable to the United States.

The US subsequently revived the complaint under the new SPS Agreement. A WTO
panel upheld its complaint in an important decision in September 1997.111 The panel held
that for five of the six growth hormones in dispute, international (Codex) standards existed,
which the EU ban did not conform to, casting the burden of proof on the EU to
demonstrate that its more stringent standards were based on a scientific risk assessment,
which it failed to do. In the case of the sixth hormone, for which an international standard
did not exist, the panel similarly held that the EU ban was not based on a scientific risk
assessment. The panel concluded that the EU measure was unjustified, as it violated three
separate provisions of the SPS Agreement: (1) the measure was not based on a risk
assessment; (2) the measure was inconsistent in its application as it allowed a chemical with
similar effects to be used for swine thereby tolerating a difference in risk levels; and (3) the
measure was not based on an international standard.112
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Charnovitz is critical of this decision, stating that the panel essentially rein-forced all the
negative stereotypes about the GATT/WTO and the environment, stating that

[i]nstead of nudging the [EU] Commission, the Hormone Panel bludgeoned it [as it
complained about] the EU’s legislative process, cast doubt on whether zero risk
would ever be permitted under SPS, accused the Commission of disguised
protectionism, and contrasted hormone regulation with the regulation of other
carcinogens. Such broad criticism increases the number of people who will find fault
with the panel’s analysis.113

The recent Appellate Body decision in this case largely upheld the findings of the panel
report and does not change the finding that the ban was inconsistent with the provisions of
the SPS Agreement. However, one commentator noted that the areas where the Appellate
Body did reject the findings of the original panel ‘could make it more difficult for countries
to successfully challenge sanitary measures that were stricter than international
standards’.114

The Appellate Body addressed the issue of burden of proof, a point not clearly resolved
in the SPS Agreement, yet ‘pivotal to the U.S. government’s victory’.115 The panel
essentially regarded the failure to use international standards as a prima facie violation of the
SPS Agreement, with the burden of proof then shifting to the party taking the measures to
justify them pursuant to one of the two routes available. On this point, the Appellate Body
found that there was no basis in the SPS Agreement text for giving the various provisions in
question this structure. Rather, the Appellate Body noted the language which suggests that
harmonization is not a self-standing obligation under the SPS Agreement, but rather it
creates a balance between the legitimate rights of states to maintain regulatory diversity or
distinctiveness and the need to reduce the trade-distort-ing impact of regulatory diversity.
The Appellate Body suggested that the panel had not properly appreciated this balance—for
instance, by holding that measures based on international standards must conform to such
standards. The language ‘based on’ implies, as the Appellate Body correctly suggested, a
greater scope for diversity in the detailed measures themselves than the notion of
conformity, implying something closer to full-blown harmonization. Finally, the Appellate
Body corrected the overly narrow notion of risk assessment adopted by the panel in its
interpretation of the SPS Agreement; risk assessment can include real world considerations,
such as the degree of risk that may occur due to improper handling or precautions, or
ineffective regulatory control of abuses. The Appellate Body stated that,

[i] It is essential to bear in mind that the risk that is to be evaluated in risk assessment
under Article 5.1 is not only risk ascertainable in a science laboratory under strictly
controlled conditions, but also risk in human societies as they actually exist, in other
words, the actual potential for adverse effects on human health in the real world
where people live and work and die.116

Ultimately, the Appellate Body found that there must be a reasonable relationship between
risk assessment and the measures undertaken, a notion that allows for some deference to
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complex social trade-offs within the risk regulation process and differences of scientific
opinion, while at the same time imposing a requirement that there be some rational
relationship between the risks identified, however broadly conceived, and the measures
adopted. The Appellate Body concluded, however, that the European Community had in
fact not provided a risk assessment related to risks from inadequate control of abuses, and so
these considerations could not justify its measures.

In regard to Article 5.5 which speaks to consistency in the application of an SPS measure,
the Appellate Body reversed the findings of the panel. The panel had ruled that the EU had
violated Article 5.5 in applying the SPS measure inconsis-tently. In order to establish a
violation of Article 5.5, three elements have to be proved. The first is that the Member
establishing the measure must have done so in several situations. The second is that ‘those
levels of protection must exhibit arbitrary or unjustifiable differences in their treatment of
different situations’ and the third element is that these differences result in a disguised
restriction of international trade.117 These elements were not established by the US. 

The Beef Hormones decision raises a number of concerns relating to difficulties in the
adjudication of scientific issues. Wirth writes,

Social value choices necessarily intrude into the analysis of physical phenomena by
means of risk assessment methodologies through the selection of inferences and
assumptions. Consequently, there is unlikely to be a single, unique way to analyze
even the purely scientific significance of much empirical data. As a result, in a
regulatory context science may be least helpful when there is a genuine scientific
dispute.118

He further notes that scientific questions do not always lend themselves to a ‘yes’ or ‘no’
answer that is demanded by an adversarial adjudication process. At issue is also the fact that
technical questions are not necessarily fully understood or appreciated by trade panels,
which are often composed of diplomats and lawyers.

Absent full harmonization, the issue of equivalency and mutual recognition becomes
especially salient. The problem of mutual recognition of SPS measures was dealt with in the
UHT Milk case in 1992, where Canada initiated an action against the United States under
Chapter 18 of the FTA regarding ultra-high temperature milk.119 After 14 years of trouble-
free exports to Puerto Rico, UHT milk from Quebec was denied entry on the basis that it
did not comply with recently adopted Puerto Rican health and safety standards. The
Canadian government claimed that these standards, at least as applied to the facts in issue,
were a sham, and were more properly characterized as a barrier to trade and an outright
violation of the FTA. The US government claimed that it was free to set its own health and
safety standards, and that its obligations under the FTA did not diminish that freedom.

In an effort to increase milk sales, Puerto Rico had adopted new regulations requiring
that milk originating outside of Puerto Rico must either comply with specific pasteurizing
requirements or have been processed under ‘substantially similar regulations’ and be
inspected by a state official certified by the US Food and Drug Administration (FDA).
Submissions were made to the FDA demonstrating that the technical standards under which
UHT milk from Quebec was produced was at least equivalent to the new Puerto Rican
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regulations. The FDA denied this request for equivalency and revoked the licence of the
Canadian firm which exported the milk on the basis of non-compliance. The FDA was
unwilling to conduct an equivalency study and certify Canadian inspectors unless such a
study formed part of a broader solution to dairy trade between Canada and the United States.
The FDA did not feel that it was able to justify the expense involved to provide relief to
only one Canadian firm.120 Numerous diplomatic and intergovernmental interventions
followed. The issue was discussed at the Technical Working Group on Dairy, Fruit, Vegetable and
Egg Inspection and a ‘UHT Subcommittee’ was even established under the auspices of this
technical working group to consider issues relating to equivalency. These efforts were
ultimately unsuccessful.

Canada argued that the regulation violated national treatment, as although the
regulations applied equally to domestic and imported milk, the failure to allow
a demonstration of equivalency made it impossible for Quebec producers to meet the
requirements easily met by US producers.121 Canada also noted that Puerto Rico failed in
its obligation to facilitate trade by establishing equivalency, pursuant to its obligations under
the FTA which requires the parties to ‘facilitate trade in agricultural products’ by working
together ‘to improve access to each other’s markets through the elimination or reduction of
import barriers’. Canada further argued that Article 708.1 was breached by the failure to
‘make equivalent their respective technical regulatory requirements and inspection
procedures’ where harmonization was not feasible and by the failure of Puerto Rico to
‘establish equivalent accreditation procedures for inspection systems and inspectors’ by its
insistence that only FDA certified inspectors could be employed to evaluate Quebec UHT
milk. Finally, Canada argued that the regulation was a disguised restriction on trade
designed to protect domestic UHT production.122

The United States argued that it had the right to maintain and upgrade technical
regulations for the protection of human, animal and plant life and it is the responsibility of
the foreign producer to comply with such legitimate health regulations. The United States
further argued that the upgrading of standards does not make them a restriction on trade
and the safety and quality of the milk supply is a legitimate policy objective. Alternatively, if
the FTA had been breached, then the GATT Article XX(b) exception for health and safety
was applicable. The United States further argued that the denial of a licence was fully
consistent with national treatment as standards do not vary between imported and domestic
product and that equivalency rests with the discretion of the Puerto Rican authorities.123

The panel prefaced its remarks by affirming that the setting of standards is a significant
prerogative of states and stated that the central issue was one of determining equivalency
and the appropriate standard by which equivalency should be judged. The panel ruled that
Article III should not be examined on gen-eral GATT principles, but rather the case should
be decided on the more specific FTA provisions. Consequently, the panel abstained from
determining whether national treatment had been violated. The panel rejected Canada’s
argument that the United States had failed to work together to facilitate access to each
other’s markets as only a best efforts type obligation was imposed on the Parties, the
observance of which is fundamentally a matter of acting in good faith, the absence of which
was not demonstrated. The panel further noted that as no time limits are specified in the
FTA for the resolution of either harmonization or equivalency, the rules are not strictly
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mandatory. The panel concluded that the Puerto Rican rules did not constitute an arbitrary
or unjustified restriction on trade, because in the absence of an equivalency study it was
unclear whether any other measure would provide the level of health protection sought by
those rules. However, somewhat surprisingly, the panel concluded by finding that there had
been ‘non-violation nullification and impairment’ of Canada’s reasonably expected benefits
under FTA Article 2011 and recommended that an equivalency study be conducted within a
reasonable period (preferably two months), with sharing of costs, and that Quebec UHT
milk be readmitted to the Puerto Rican market if Quebec standards were found to have the
same effect as the Puerto Rican standards. Interestingly, again, the panel sidestepped the
issue of determining whether the measures afforded ‘protection to domestic production’ or
were a ‘disguised restriction on trade’, perhaps out of concern for embarrassing a party to
the dispute.

One commentator has argued that although the question before the panel related to
substantive equivalency and comparison of the standards governing the production of milk,
this was not the legal issue before the panel.124 Rather, the panel ‘had to consider only the
narrower issue of whether an opportunity to prove equivalency had been offered at an
appropriate time and in an appropriate manner’.125 Thus the question before the panel was
one of legal process (were the rules followed?) rather than one of substance (are the
production methods equivalent?). While it was not for the panel to make technical
determinations, the Panel still failed to determine whether the process differences, that is,
the failure to grant equivalency in a timely manner, constituted a violation of national
treatment obligations. In the case of the obligations imposed on the Parties under Articles
703 and 708 (the provisions which obligate the Parties to work together to achieve market
access through harmonization, mutual recognition, etc.), the panel made its decision on the
narrowest interpretation possible, supporting the contention that because certain
obligations are not ‘hard’, they are therefore virtually non-existent. The Parties are under a
reasonable duty to facilitate trade under these Articles, despite the absence of specific time
limitations. This affords wide latitude to Parties in the imposition of health and safety
measures which could be barriers to trade. Under such an interpretation, Parties could
effectively use stalling tactics, and delay equivalency studies in the name of consumer
protection.

FUTURE POLICY DIRECTIONS

Apart from being an issue addressed by the legal texts and jurisprudence of international
trade agreements, the interface between trade and domestic regulation has been receiving
increasing attention from the international policymaking community. The OECD recently
completed a comprehensive two-year project designed to study how countries may address
these problems through regulatory reform in a number of areas, including domestic health
and safety standards.126 Such reform is considered to be necessary to enhance competition
and reduce regulatory costs, which will in turn ‘boost efficiency, bring down prices,
stimulate innovation, and help improve the ability of economies to adapt to change and
remain competitive’.127
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The report provides a review of the net negative effects on an economy and on trade that
standards and conformity assessment procedures may have. Those issues which call for
policy consideration include three categories of the domestic regulation and trade interface:
regulations which are excessively trade-restrictive; divergences in regulatory requirements;
and regulations biased toward domestic interests. The discussion and analysis of the trade
and domestic regulation interface largely build upon and elaborate the principles (i.e.,
national treatment, least-trade restrictive measures, policy transparency) discussed in this
chapter. The report classifies recent approaches to reform into four categories: (1)
standards development and conformity assessment procedures; (2) surveillance mechanisms
for standards-related measures; (3) development of mutual recognition agreements
(MRAs); and (4) increased business concerns and emerging initiatives.128 From this analysis,
a number of policy recommendations were set forth for consideration and subsequent
implementation on the part of the OECD ministers.

With respect to the first category, a number of initiatives have emerged in the standards
development process in an effort to reduce regulatory inefficiencies, one of which is the
proliferation of voluntary standards. The report notes that ‘although voluntary standards
run a greater risk of being captured by private interests than mandatory standards (which
calls for domestic and international surveillance), they are by nature more market driven
and more capable of flexibility in the face of technological development’.129 Consequently,
the report recommends that countries periodically review standards development processes
according to efficiency criteria.

The report also recommends increased use of harmonization to avoid trade friction,
accompanied by an ongoing rigorous review of international standards. The report notes the
possible efficiency gains and the increased transparency of a harmonization strategy, which
may be appropriate on a case-by-case basis. The report further proposes a rationalization of
conformity assessment procedures, urging that countries regulate in proportion ‘to the
intensity of the social concern or the risk involved’ and engage in either pre-market or post-
market surveillance according to the relative risk of the product. For example, sensitive
medical devices or pharmaceuticals may require approval before entering a market, while
lower risk products, such as electrical safety regulations for appliances, may be more
appropriately regulated by post-market surveillance mechanisms. The report also
recommends increased vigilance regarding anti-competitive actions in the area of
conformity assessment procedures. This concerns primarily the accreditation of the
laboratories that certify various products, etc. In the past, national accreditation bodies have
had a virtual monopoly on the right to test and certify products, to the exclusion of any foreign
competition.

With respect to the second category, international oversight of standards-related
measures, the report calls for a strengthening of such regimes. International oversight is
another term for the TBT and SPS Agreements currently in place under the WTO. It has
been referred to by Sykes as ‘policed decentralization’ which means that ‘national
authorities are largely free to pursue their own policy objectives but must do so subject to a
set of broadly applicable legal constraints’.130 Increased surveillance could be undertaken by
ensuring that such agreements are fully implemented; by extending the scope of measures
covered; by clarifying obligations of the parties; and by encouraging the active participation
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of stakeholders in the process, particularly business stakeholders.131 The report further
encourages increased multi-stakeholder domestic surveillance of the trade impacts of
standards and procedures.

The third category, the development of MRAs, is one of the more promising solutions to
the tension between trade and domestic regulation. An MRA can apply to standards,
conformity assessment or testing data. They have not been widely used to date, and
consequently the report recommends the ‘expanded recognition of conformity assessment
of other jurisdictions through arrangements such as MRAs’.132 One policy option for MRAs
is the adoption of the principle ‘once approved, accepted everywhere’. This is a quasi-MFN
approach: once a product is deemed to be in compliance with a relevant standard in one
country, that product could move freely without further restrictions or requirements.

The report describes the expected benefits of the increased use of MRAs with respect to
conformity assessments to include improved trade opportunities and efficiencies as well as
the streamlining of domestic regulatory systems. Concerns related to MRAs include the
possibility that trade with non-participants will be impeded, and that MRAs will lead to a
‘race to the bottom’ as countries seek to gain competitive advantages through lax regulatory
enforcement.133 The mutual recognition approach has been a cornerstone principle in the
EU’s quest for a single market, which has been largely successful, albeit among relatively
homogeneous nations. Efforts beyond the EU have been limited as such agreements have
been for the most part bilateral and confined to a specific product. The financial
implications are significant—the US Department of Commerce forecasts a savings of over
$100 million per year if planned MRAs with the EU are imple-mented.134 Indeed,
comprehensive draft texts of MRAs are already well underway in various fora. The EU,
building on its experience within the single market, has either concluded or is in the process
of negotiating MRAs with Canada, the United States, Japan, Australia and New Zealand.135

The draft MRA text between the US and the EU covers in comprehensive detail inter alia
electrical safety, recreational craft, pharmaceutical good manufacturing processes, and
medical devices.136 Likewise, within the prospective Free Trade Area of the Americas
(FTAA), a Working Group has been established to consider the development of future
MRAs.137 Within Asia Pacific Economic Cooperation (APEC), the Osaka ‘Action Agenda’
included MRAs as one of its non-binding goals, in part to respond to the increasing problem
of divergent health and safety stan-dards.138 This has resulted in the completion of a pilot
project which has produced the ‘APEC Mutual Recognition Arrangement for Foods and
Food Products’. Next on the agenda for APEC MRAs is electronic equipment safety
arrangements.139

Last, there is potential for reform through emerging initiatives within business sectors.
The report notes that ‘as product life cycles are shortened by rapid technological
development and trade opportunities are expanded by globalization, obstacles arising from
product standards and conformity assessment have increased business concerns’.140 This
observation, along with the transparency issues arising from the decentralization of the
standards development process and the fact that firms themselves often are the sole owners
of specialized technical expertise, have led to the proposition that firms rather than
governments may be in a better position to pioneer regulatory reform. Such a dynamic is
evidenced by the Trans-Atlantic Business Dialogue (TABD), established in 1995, which has
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made contributions to the reform process by, for example, developing recommendations
toward the ‘functional equivalence of regulatory standards’.141

CONCLUSIONS

To some extent, the legal texts reviewed in this chapter obscure the difficulties that a panel
will be required to make when adjudicating legal questions. Supranational panels will face a
number of challenges in ruling on the issues posed in this chap-ter. Such challenges lie at the
heart of trade panels’ competence and legitimacy. There are essentially three fundamental
‘tests’ that a panel may apply when deciding whether a domestic health or safety measure is
consistent with a country’s international trade obligations.

One central test seen throughout this chapter is the question of whether the measure
under consideration is a valid attempt to promote a legitimate policy objective or whether it
is really a disguised restriction on trade. This has been more succinctly referred to by Sykes
as the ‘sham’ test. In adjudicating this question, a panel is put in the awkward situation of
making a rather brutal characterization— that the country with the offending standard has
intended to adopt a policy in bad faith. This raises issues relating to ‘diplomatic manners’. As
was seen in the UHT Milk case, the panel was reluctant to conclude that the US measure was
a sham, resulting in a ‘non-violation nullification and impairment’ ruling in what was
arguably a clear case of regulatory protectionism. Panels will further be required to
subjectively assess what the ‘real intention’ of a government was. In many cases, a
government’s intention will be difficult to discern. Often a unified intent does not exist
given the way modern policy is created. This would require evaluating interest group
influences, political log-rolling, etc.

A second test is the evaluation of whether a measure is based on a scientific risk
assessment. This has the initial appeal of being more objective than the sham test as it relies
on hard science rather than softer intuitive judgments regarding intent. But as was seen in
this chapter, scientific inquiry is riddled with value judgments. While there has been some
success in separating scientific fact from scientific judgment in the trade agreements by
distinguishing between risk assessment and risk management, the separation is by no means
water-tight. Scientific risk assessments are by nature uncertain and even the choice of
methodology necessary to conduct a risk assessment requires to some degree a normative
judgment. The result is that trade panels are put in the position of adjudicating conflicting
scientific evidence. Needless to say, the lawyers and diplomats that compose these panels do
not generally possess the expertise to understand the complex intricacies of such issues,
much less rule on them. Thus, what at first seems to be a clear and objective test to guide
the panellists seems more likely to strain the limits of adjudicative competence.

A third test is the requirement that panels rule on whether a particular form of domestic
intervention is proportionate to the stated regulatory goal, essentially determining whether
the ‘right fit’ exists between the policy instrument chosen and the stated objective (the so-
called proportionality test). As the legal test for evaluating whether a measure is ‘necessary’
is based on whether a least trade-restrictive measure has been employed, a panel will be
required to engage in what may be a very complex policy inquiry into the various policy
alternatives and their viability in achieving the stated policy goal. In answering these
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questions, panellists are drawn into an uncomfortable area of second-guessing expert
domestic regulators. In the case of, for example, air quality standards, one wonders
whether, for example, a diplomat from New Zealand or Sweden is really in the position to
second guess the high-level scientific expertise and peer review process of the US
Environmental Protection Agency. The attitude of trade panels to these problems so far is
not encouraging, a prime example being the Thai Cigarette ruling,142 where the panel relied
entirely on its own axiomatic reasoning that alternatives less restrictive than banning
imported cigarettes would be available to achieve the health objectives of the Thai
government, without considering the various constraints, including institutional and fiscal,
on implementation of the less restrictive alternatives, such as regulation of advertising and
marketing. The question of proportionality can easily extend into an inquiry about the
validity of the stated goal itself, as was seen in the Danish Bottles case when in answering this
question, the ECJ essentially ratcheted down the level of environmental protection chosen
by Denmark through its balancing test.

In designing institutional processes in an international context in which these concepts
can be rendered justiciable and operational, more attention needs to be given than hitherto
to relative burdens of proof. As a tentative proposition, we would argue that a complainant
should bear the burden of proving that a domestic policy measure of another country has a
disparate and substantial impact on international trade. If this can be proven, it seems to us
that the burden of proof should then shift to the respondent country to demonstrate that
notwithstanding this, the policy measure both genuinely engages a legitimate policy
objective—the sham principle (and here we would contemplate a much longer list of
legitimate policy objectives than is presently embodied in Article XX, reflecting in part, for
example, the legitimate policy objectives for domestic subsidies formerly contained in
Article 11 of the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code)—and that no less trade restrictive policy
instrument is reasonably available for vindicating these policy objectives as effectively—the
least trade restrictive means or proportionality principle (‘effectively’ being understood
here to mean both the extent of attainment of the objective in question and the cost to the
country in question of achieving it through one instrument rather than another).

As to what constitutes adequate discharge of the burden of proof on these latter issues,
there is an important consequential issue of the standard of judicial or panel review to be
applied. This has been a bitterly contentious issue in a somewhat analogous context with
respect to FTA and NAFTA binational panel reviews of ITA and ITC determinations in the
US in antidumping and countervailing duty cases.143 One view (reflecting a ‘correctness’
standard) would require that the respondent country bear the burden of adducing substantial
evidence on the record that the challenged policy is necessary for the attainment of a
legitimate policy objective and that no less trade restrictive means is available to achieve this
purpose (arguably a difficult negative to prove). An alternative view (reflecting a ‘patently
unreasonable’ standard) would be substantially more deferential to the country whose
domestic policies are under challenge and would simply require that the evidence adduced
be sufficient to suggest that the policy choice is not patently unreasonable or a grossly
disproportionate adaptation of means to ends, or put otherwise is a plausible means of
attempting to achieve the legitimate policy objective in question, even if the reviewing body
could itself imagine superior instruments. We favour something close to the latter approach
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(perhaps a ‘clearly unreasonable’ standard) because it seems to us more respectful of
domestic political sovereignty and policy autonomy than the former view which invites
supranational panels to second-guess the domestic policy choices of democratically elected
and accountable governments by applying a strict de novo cost-benefit analysis of their own.
Moreover, by substantially limiting the ability of one country to challenge the domestic
policy choices of another in quasi-judicial fora, the ‘threat point’ of the former in political
negotiations over possible policy convergence is sharply reduced, thus also reducing the risk
of coerced forms of harmonization reflecting asymmetric bargaining power, or worse,
coerced forms of discriminatory managed trade arrangements.

Another way of dealing with the problem of institutional competence in applying
proportionality or least trade-restrictive means tests is to rely upon opinions or advice from
expert international organizations. Here, also the Thai Cigarette case is instructive of the
traditional institutional culture of the multilateral trading order the panel simply refused to
consider empirical work by the World Health Organization. Even where, as noted above,
WTO legal instruments link the work of specialized international bodies to trade norms, as
in the case of ISO, there is very little sustained cooperation and dialogue between the WTO
and the institutions in question.144 In fact, there may be too great a gap between the
diplomatic, rules-based trade culture of the WTO and the hands-on, technically-oriented
culture of some of the specialized organizations to easily allow for the emergence of deep
and effective links. As an organization that has both a rules-based free trade orientation and
also a policy cooperation orientation, the OECD may need to reconceive itself as a kind of
bridge between these different cultures. But as the current controversy surrounding
multilateral investment negotiations at the OECD suggests, a serious problem is posed by
the limited membership of the OECD, which excludes most developing countries. This may
argue for eventually making the OECD into a truly multilateral body, perhaps beginning
with different classes or levels of membership for countries at different levels of economic
development. These factors highlight the risk of allowing harmonization efforts to get too
far ahead of the institutional structures available to sustain it in a legitimate, as well as an
efficient. fashion. 
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7
Antidumping laws

INTRODUCTION

Among the trilogy of trade remedy regimes—countervailing duty, safeguard and
antidumping actions—antidumping actions are by far the remedy of choice. By the end of
1989, twenty-eight countries had adopted antidumping laws.1 Nearly 1,200 actions were
initiated between July 1980 and June 1988.2 Four countries’ actions accounted for 97.5% of
all actions brought: 30% were brought by producers in the United States; 27% were
brought in Australia; 22% in Canada; and 19% in the European Union. The targets of these
actions are more diverse. The EU was the largest single target, defending 27% of the
actions, while Canada, the USA and Australia in total were targeted in fewer than 14% of
the actions. The second most targeted group of countries were the Newly Industrialized
Countries (NICs), representing 18% of the defenders. The actions against the NICs were
most often initiated by the USA and Australia, who, along with the EU, also initiated 106
actions against Japan. The EU’s main targets were the socialist countries of Eastern Europe,
who defended 15% of the world’s actions. Overall, western industrialized countries
accounted for 58% of the targets and developing countries (other than NICs) only 9%.
Finally, of the actions initiated by the major users, the success rate ranged from 44% for
Australia to 71 % for the EU. More recent GATT data suggest some interesting new
trends, with Brazil and Mexico joining the list of major users of antidumping laws.3

In antidumping proceedings, the following substantive issues are central (a) whether the
foreign exporter is engaged in ‘dumping’ goods into the importing country’s market.
Determining whether dumping is occurring and what the margin of dumping is entails
comparing a foreign firm’s export prices in the importing country’s market with either
prices charged by the exporter in its home market in the ordinary course of trade, or where
insufficient transactions exist in the home country to yield a reliable set of home market
prices, with the exporter’s average total costs including overheads and a reasonable margin
of profit; (b) if dumping is occurring, whether it is causing material injury to domestic
producers of like products, which in turn requires interpretations of ‘domestic producers’,
‘like products’, ‘material injury’ and causation. 

In this chapter, we review the GATT/WTO provisions on dumping and the domestic
dumping regimes in Canada, the USA and the EU. We then develop a fundamental critique



of dumping laws and argue for their replacement with harmonized domestic competition
laws that focus on cross-border predation.

THE GATT PROVISIONS ON ANTIDUMPING

Article VI of the GATT contains general rules governing the application of antidumping and
countervailing duties. The first paragraph of the Article condemns export sales below
normal value when they

cause or threaten material injury to an established industry in the territory of the
Contracting Party or materially retard the establishment of a domestic industry.

In addition, the Article describes the basis for determining when sales are below normal
value: when the export price is less than ‘the comparable price, in the ordinary course of
trade, for the product when destined for consumption in the exporting country’.4 When
these criteria are satisfied the importing country is entitled to levy an antidumping duty
equal to the difference between the normal value and the export price.

However, the wording of the Article is vague in important respects, leading to
inconsistent interpretations and applications of the provision. Moreover, two of the biggest
users of antidumping duties—Canada and the USA—did not consider themselves bound by
its terms because their domestic antidumping laws pre-dated the GATT and to the extent of
any inconsistencies were arguably ‘grandfathered’ under the Protocol of Provisional
Application.5

The Kennedy Round Antidumping Code

In the Kennedy Round negotiations, beginning in 1963, many concerns about Article VI
were addressed. The result was the 1967 Agreement on the Implementation of Article VI
(the Antidumping Code) which laid out detailed criteria and procedures for the invocation
of antidumping actions.6

Among the procedural rules contained in the Code was the requirement in Article 10(a)
that provisional duties only be imposed following a preliminary finding of both dumping and
injury. The imposition of retroactive duties was restricted by Article 11 of the Code, and
Article 6 established rules of confidentiality and evidence. Finally, a notable feature of the
Code is that it stated a preference for the imposition of a duty that is less than the dumping
margin when the lesser duty will alleviate the injury.7

With respect to substantive issues, the first problem with Article VI is that it does not
define the ‘industry’ whose injury justifies imposing antidumping duties. Article 4(a) of the
1967 Code clarified this issue, defining industry as ‘the domestic producers as a whole of
the like products or…those of them whose collective output of the products constitutes a
major proportion of the total of those products’. A like product was defined in Article 2(b)
as
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identical, i.e., alike in all respects to the product under consideration, or in the
absence of such a product, another product which, although not alike in all respects,
has characteristics closely resembling [the dumped product].

These two definitions in combination identify a relatively narrow group of producers which
must be injured in order for an action to be successful.

A second ambiguity in Article VI is in the requisite causal link between the dumping and
the injury. The 1967 Code specified that the dumping had to be ‘demonstrably the principal
cause’8 of the injury.

The Tokyo Round Antidumping Code

Signatories to the Antidumping Code in 1967 committed themselves to ensuring that their
domestic trade legislation was rendered consistent with the Code. For the USA this task
posed a substantial problem. The Code’s test for causality was quite stringent and
inconsistent with the US Antidumping Act.9 The inconsistency between the Code and the Act
led to unwillingness on the part of Congress to amend its laws or restrict the discretion of
the administering authorities.10 While the USA claimed that its applications were not
inconsistent with the Code, the wording of the domestic law remained unchanged.11 Having
adopted the Code’s definitions, the EU sought to ensure compliance by the USA and
insisted on reopening the Code during the Tokyo Round.

The main revisions to the 1967 Code related to causality and injury determination.
Rather than requiring that the dumping be ‘demonstrably the principal cause’, the 1979
Code only specified that any ‘injuries caused by other factors must not be attributed to the
dumped imports’,12 making it more consistent with the US position. The EU also now
supported a relaxation of the causation requirements. With respect to injury, the factors to
be used in evaluating the impact of the dump-ing were explicitly laid out, i.e.:

actual and potential decline in output, sales, market share, profits, productivity,
return on investments, or utilization of capacity;…effects on cash flow,…wages,…
growth.13

Also, the rules on the acceptance and administration of price and quantity undertakings
were expanded in the 1979 Code (although their thrust remained the same). Finally, the
Code required that except under special circumstances a proceeding should be completed
within one year and that the rules permitting retroactive duties be more restricted. 

The Uruguay Round Antidumping Agreement14

The 1979 Code left unresolved a number of problems and ambiguities.15 The
incompleteness of the Code resulted in inconsistent antidumping practices and procedures
throughout the world. The Antidumping Code received further attention in the recent
Uruguay Round negotiations. The main changes reflect a growing tension between
developed countries, especially the USA and the EU, which bring a substantial percentage
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of all antidumping actions, and NICs and developing nations who are typically defenders
rather than complainants.

Article 2 of the Uruguay Round Antidumping Agreement defines products as being
dumped if the export price is less than the comparable price, in the ordinary course of trade,
for the like product when destined for consumption in the exporting country. Where there
are no sales of the like product in the ordinary course of trade in the domestic market of the
exporting country or when because of the particular market situation or the low volume of
the sales in the domestic market of the exporting country (a sufficient quantity must
normally constitute 5% or more of the sales of the product to the importing country) such
sales do not permit a proper comparison, the margin of dumping shall be determined by
comparison with a comparable price of the like product when exported to an appropriate third
country or with the cost of production in the country of origin plus a reasonable amount for
administrative, selling and general costs and for profits. Sales in the domestic market of the
exporting country below per unit (fixed and variable) costs of production plus
administrative, selling and general costs may be disregarded in determining normal value if
made for an extended period of time (normally one year) in substantial quantities (more
than 20% of transactions). Thus, all export sales, whether above or below total costs will be
averaged to obtain the export price while generally only domestic sales above total costs
will be averaged, increasing the likelihood of a finding of dumping.

The existence of margins of dumping shall normally be established on the basis of a
comparison of weighted average domestic sale prices and weighted average export market
prices or by a comparison of domestic prices and export prices on a transaction-to-
transaction basis. This precludes comparing isolated low-priced export transactions with
weighted average domestic prices to establish dumping.

Where there are no home market or third country sales on which to base price
comparisons, constructed value may be used which includes materials and labour costs and
an amount for selling, general and administrative expenses (SG&A) plus profit. These latter
costs—SG&A and profit—must now be based on actual data pertaining to production and
sales in the ordinary course of business by the exporter. This precludes inclusion of home
market sales at a loss in the calculation of the exporter’s profits. In the absence of firm-
specific data on SG&A and profits, the weighted average of the amounts incurred or realized
by other exporters may be used, thus penalizing more efficient foreign producers. Where
non-recur-ring start-up costs are incurred by new facilities, costs should be adjusted to
reflect the costs at the end of the start-up period (Article 2.2.1.1).

In determining injury, Article 3.3 permits the investigating authority in the importing
country to assess cumulatively the effects of imports from more than one country where
they are subject to simultaneous investigation if the level of imports from each country is
more than de minimis and if it is appropriate to do so. Article 3.5 provides that the
demonstration of a causal relationship between the dumped imports and the injury to the
domestic industry shall be based on an examination of all relevant evidence, including any
known factors, other than the dumped imports, which at the same time are injuring the
domestic industry, and the injuries caused by these other factors must not be attributed to
the dumped imports. Factors which may be relevant include inter alia the volume and prices
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of imports not sold at dumped prices and the magnitude of the margin of dumping (Article
3.4).

Article 5 expands the procedural rules that govern the initiation and investigation of a
dumping action. Article 5.8 requires that an investigation should be terminated when a
dumping margin is de minimis (less than 2% of the normal value) or when the volume of
dumped products is negligible (i.e. if the volume of dumped imports from a particular
country accounts for less than 3% of imports of the like product in the importing country
unless countries that individually account for less than 3% of imports collectively account for
more than 7% of imports). The rules on evidence (Article 6) are also expanded providing
for assurances of disclosure and improved opportunities to make a full defence or
argument, while still preserving essential confidentiality. Article 6.12 requires that in cases
where the product is commonly sold at retail, industrial users and consumer organizations
be given an opportunity to provide relevant information regarding dumping, injury and
causality. Evidence provided by foreign Parties shall not be disregarded even if it is not clear
in all respects (Annex II). Article 11 includes a ‘sunset review’ clause which limits, subject
to review, the duration of duties to five years from their imposition. Article 9.5 requires
the individual assessment of exporters who did not export during the period of
investigation. This treatment replaces the prior application to uninvestigated exporters of
the highest duty levied in a case. Articles 7 and 10 place restrictions on the imposition of
provisional and retroactive duties

Under Article 8, proceedings may be suspended or terminated on receipt of a satisfactory
voluntary undertaking from any exporter to revise its prices or to cease exports at dumped
prices. Price undertakings may not be sought or accepted unless preliminary determinations
of dumping and injury have been made and even if then sought and accepted, the exporter
may elect to have the investigation completed. In the event of a negative determination,
undertakings lapse. Under Article 12, public notification is required of the initiation of an
investigation and of any preliminary or final determination along with findings and
conclusions reached on all issues of fact and law considered material by the investigating
authorities. Article 13 requires countries with antidumping regimes to maintain judicial,
arbitral or administrative tribunals for reviewing initial determinations.

Member countries were unable to agree on provisions to prevent circumvention of
antidumping duties by exporters subject to duties on given products setting up local
assembly plants using imported inputs to make the same products (‘screw-driver plants’);
this issue has been remitted to the Committee on Antidumping Practices, set up under the
Agreement, for resolution. 

Complaints over non-compliance with the Agreement may be referred to the integrated
Dispute Settlement Body established by the broader Uruguay Round Agreement. Under
Article 17.6, dispute resolution panels shall determine whether domestic agencies’
establishment of the facts were proper and whether their evaluation was unbiased and
objective. However, deferring to US concerns, Article 17.6 then provides that if the
establishment of the facts was proper and the evaluation was unbiased and objective, the
evaluation shall not be overturned even though the panel might have reached a different
conclusion. Also, where a panel finds that a provision of the Agreement admits of more than
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one permissible interpretation, the panel shall find the agency’s determination to be in
conformity with the Agreement if it rests upon one of these permissible interpretations.

In 1992, a GATT panel was established to consider the legality of an antidump-ing duty
imposed on imports of fresh and chilled Atlantic salmon from Norway.16 The panel found
inconsistencies with the United States’ obligations under the GATT Antidumping Code
with respect to the methodology for calculating margins of dumping. However, these
inconsistencies did not result in the panel recommending that the duties be repealed, as the
panel was not able to conclude that a correct application of the methodology would have
resulted in a determination that no dumping had occurred. According to Norway, this
represented a departure from previous panel decisions, where, at a minimum,
recommendations pertaining to reduced duty margins were made in response to a finding of
error in methodologies for calculating duties. Also that year, a panel was established at the
request of the United States to consider the imposition of antidumping duties on polyacetal
resins from the United States.17 Here the primary issue was that the Korea Trade
Commission had failed to provide adequate evidence in support of its determination of
present injury and future threat of injury, according to the GATT Antidumping Code. In
this case, the panel recommended that Korea bring the measure under dispute in
conformity with its obligations under the Antidumping Code. It is significant that the panel
declined to recommend that Korea bring its law into conformance with its obligations
under the Code, as the United States had requested. The panel preferred to limit its
jurisdiction to the ‘law as applied’ by Korea, rather than the law itself. In 1995, a panel was
convened to consider the legality of EC antidumping duties on cotton yarn from Brazil.
Brazil contended that the EC had violated a number of provisions of the Code. In a lengthy
and comprehensive decision, the panel dismissed all of Brazil’s substantive arguments. In
1997, Mexico requested the establishment of a dispute settlement panel regarding
Guatemala’s decisions to initiate an investigation into allegations of dumping of portland
cement from Mexico. The panel ruled in Mexico’s favour, requesting that Guatemala bring
its action into conformity with its obligations under Articles 5.3 and 5.5 of the Antidumping
Code and revoke its anti-dumping measures on imports of Mexican cement. Guatemala
appealed the decision. However, the Appellate Body did not consider any of the substantive
issues in the case because it was found that the dispute was not properly before the panel.
The measure at issue was not properly identified and thus the panel was not entitled to
examine any of Mexico’s claims.18 

ANTIDUMPING LAWS: CANADA, THE UNITED STATES AND
THE EU19

Canada amended its Customs Tariff in 1904 to provide for antidumping duties and in so doing
became the first country in the world to establish an antidumping regime.20 The current
legislation is set out in the Special Import Measures Act 1985 (the SIMA).21 The first
specific American antidumping statute, which is still in force, is known as the Antidumping
Act of 1916.22 Because of the onerous predatory intent requirement, there has never been
either a successful prosecution or a civil judgment under this Act. This parallels experience
under predatory pricing provisions in domestic antitrust laws where convictions or
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successful civil suits are rare. The US Congress enacted the Antidumping Act of 192123 to
provide complainants with a greater scope for relief than the 1916 Act. The current
American legislation is embodied in Title VII of the Tariff Act of 1930. Institutions of the
European Union have had the authority to take action against dumped imports since 1968.24

In Canada and the USA, the institutional responsibilities for determining ‘dumping’ and
‘material injury’ are separated. ‘Dumping’ determinations are made by the Deputy Minister
of National Revenue (DMNR) in Canada25 and by the International Trade Administration of
the Department of Commerce (DC) in the United States. ‘Material injury’ determinations
are made by the Canadian International Trade Tribunal (CITT) and by the US International
Trade Commission (the ITC). The institutional arrangements in the EU are very different
from those in the USA and Canada. The principal institution involved in the administration
of the EU antidumping system is the Commission, specifically Directorate C in the
Directorate-General in Charge of External Relations of the Union, which has the primary
responsibility for the enforcement of the antidump-ing regime. It is responsible for all
stages of the investigation, including the decision to initiate a proceeding. Following an
investigation, the Commission can impose provisional duties or submit proposals for
definitive action to the Council. It also has the authority to accept undertakings by the
exporter and terminate the proceeding. Finally, the Commission makes recommendations
to the Council with respect to antidumping legislation.

The Council’s main role is to approve the provisional determinations of the Commission
and to order the collection of the imposed duties. It also has legislative responsibility for the
antidumping regulation. The role has usually been a pro forma one.

An advisory committee made up of a Commission representative and an official from
each member state is consulted by the Commission at various stages in the investigation.
The committee’s primary involvement is in determining the appropriate relief to be granted
for an injury. An undertaking from the exporter cannot be accepted if there is not complete
agreement from the Member States. Through their customs authorities, the Member States
also help to ensure that duties are collected. Again, in practice the Committee’s role is
largely pro forma.

In certain circumstances the Court of Justice has the authority to review antidumping
decisions. It can review the legality of Commission or Council determinations and redress
‘manifest errors’ in the assessment of facts or violations of procedural rules, although in
practice the Court exercises its review function with restraint.

Finally, the European Parliament has an advisory role and issues non-binding opinions on
EU legislation. In addition, its Committee on External Economic Relations serves as a forum
for discussion of the administration of the antidump-ing system.

In Canada, once the CITT has determined material injury it may consider the potential
effect of antidumping duties on ‘the public interest’.26 If the CITT is of the view that
imposing antidumping duties would be contrary to the public interest, it must both publish
a report in the Canada Gazette and report to the Minister of Finance, who has the discretion
to lower or remove the duty.27 The provision reflects the concern that ‘concentration on
producer interests alone is too narrow a focus and the consumer interest must be
considered’.28 In practice, however, only three public interest hearings29 have been
convened since the provision was enacted in 1985, and consumer groups did not initiate or
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participate in any of the hearings. The United States does not have a public interest
provision. The EU regulations provide that duties should only be imposed when doing so
serves the Union’s interest,30 but the typical reason for invoking the clause is to avoid
domestic producers paying more for dumped inputs.31

While the CITT’s decision is ‘final and conclusive’,32 the CITT may review its own
findings if it is satisfied that such a review is warranted.33 There are also appeals to the
Federal Court of Appeal34 and the Supreme Court of Canada, principally on issues of law.35

In the United States, an appeal lies to the Court of International Trade from both DC and
ITC decisions and then to the Court of Appeals for the Federal District.36 The EU system
has a limited right of appeal. As previously noted, the Court of Justice is reluctant to review
Commission determinations in this area. The EU antidumping system has been
characterized by discretion and secrecy; the reluctance of the Court to review the
Commission’s determinations increases the appearance (at least) of unfairness in the
system’s administration.37 Arguably, the odd bifurcation of institutional functions in Canada
and the US serves a similar obfuscatory function.

Under Chapter 19 of the Canada—US Free Trade Agreement and now under
Chapter 19 of NAFTA, appeals from final determinations by domestic agencies in
antidumping and countervailing duty proceedings may be taken to binational dispute
settlement panels. This has proved an important innovation, with implications for the
potential scope and role of the dispute resolution processes under the Uruguay Round
Antidumping Agreement. It should be noted that Chapter 19 of the FTA was premised on
an agreement that the current means of dealing with AD and CVD disputes are
unsatisfactory. Article 1906 of the FTA called for an agreement within five years (with the
possibility of a two-year extension) on a code between Canada and the USA regarding AD
and CVD matters. The Article contemplated the possibility that the Agreement could be
terminated (on six months notice by either Party) if no accord was reached on a new regime
for resolving disputes in this contentious area.38 Thus, Chapter 19 was, on its face, a
temporary expedient.

It begins with two other important limitations on its power and scope. The fol-lowing
Articles refer to NAFTA, but are largely identical to their predecessor sections in the FTA.
Article 1901:1 states that the Article 1904 provisions outlining the procedures for the
review of ‘final determinations’ in AD and CVD cases apply only to goods which the
relevant authority in the importing Party has determined come from the other Party.
Moreover, Article 1902 reserves the power to apply and amend domestic AD and CVD law
to each Party respectively.39 However, Article 1902 imposes limits on the capacity to
modify existing AD and CVD law: Parties must notify and consult each other about such
changes; for changes to apply to the other Party it must be named; and no change can be
inconsistent with relevant GATT provisions or ‘the object and purpose of this Agreement
and this Chapter’.40 These restrictions are not as significant as originally anticipated. They
had been seen as an attempt to ensure some degree of bilateral accountability in this area.
This view is supported by the Softwood Lumber case, where the US Congress effectively
repealed the decision by legal amendment, in apparent contradiction with the intent of
these provisions.
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Articles 1903 and 1904 both are designed to allow bilateral review of the amendment
and application of AD and CVD law. Article 1903 allows a Party to request that a panel be
set up to examine an amendment to determine whether it is consistent with relevant GATT
and FTA provisions, or whether, in addition, it ‘has the function and effect of overturning a
prior decision’ made under Article 1904.41 If the panel decides that an amendment is in fact
objectionable, the Parties are then to enter into consultations to remedy the situation within
90 days, and if remedial legislation is not enacted within nine months of the end of this
consultation period then the other Party is entitled to take comparable action or terminate
the Agreement.42

Article 1904 provides a set of procedures allowing binational panels to replace judicial
review of the ‘final determinations’ of administrative agencies in AD and CVD cases.43 At
the request of either Party, a panel can review such determinations and issue a binding
decision as to whether they conform to the AD and CVD law of the importing country
subject to a procedure for an extraordinary challenge of a panel’s decision to a binational
panel of retired judges on various grounds (such as gross misconduct, bias or conflict of
interest).44 The standard of primary panel review is that laid down by the relevant statutes
(as amended from time to time) of each Party, and by ‘the general legal principles that a
court of the importing Party would otherwise apply’.45 Requests for panels must be made
within 30 days of the publication of a final determination.46 Only the Parties have the right
to request a panel, but Article 1904:5 provides that a Party must ask for a panel when
petitioned by a person otherwise entitled by domestic law to redress via judicial review.47

The administrative agency whose determination is being reviewed has the right to be
represented by counsel before the panel, as do all other persons entitled by domestic laws
to standing before a court reviewing such determinations.48 The panel reaches its decision
by a majority vote of its members, and it issues its reasons (majority, concurring, and
dissenting) in a written report.49 If a panel finds an error in a final determination it may remand
the determination to the relevant domestic administrative agency for ‘action not inconsistent
with the panel’s decision’.50

Chapter 19—its committees and panels—is supported and administered by a Secretariat
established under Article 1908. It has three branches, each run by a Secretary, one Canadian
(located in Ottawa), one American (located in Washington, DC) and one Mexican (located
in Mexico City). The Secretariat operates as a division of the general NAFTA Secretariat, as
established by Article 2002 and is responsible for servicing the meetings of panels and
committees, and providing general administrative assistance.51 It is also charged with the
task of receiving and filing all official papers connected with the operation of Chapter 19.52

This institutional feature may enhance the quality and consistency of panel decisions.
The final salient feature of Chapter 19 is its elaborate provisions regarding the

composition of panels. Annex 1901.2 sets out the method of choosing these panels, and the
pool from which they are to be drawn. A roster is established by consultation between the
three Parties of 75 unaffiliated individuals—25 from each country—who are chosen for
their good character, reliability, and objectivity.53 The roster shall also ‘include judges or
former judges to the fullest extent practica-ble’.54 A panel is composed of five members, a
majority of whom must be lawyers. Each Party must choose, in consultation with the other
Party, two members; each Party is allowed four peremptory challenges; and if panellists are
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not chosen within 30 days of the request for a panel, or alternative panellists are not chosen
within 45 days then a panellist will be chosen by lot from the Party’s candidates on the
roster.55 A fifth member must be chosen within 55 days of the request by the Parties, or, if
they cannot agree, within 60 days by the already chosen panellists, or, if they cannot agree,
by lot (on the 61st day).56 The Chair of the panel is picked from among the lawyers by a
majority vote of the panellists; if there is no majority vote then the Chair will be chosen by
lot.57

Early critics of the FTA argued that the provisions did not go far enough to prevent
administrative harassment of exporters by domestic competitors. The critics argued that no
effective limits had been placed on the discretion of administrative trade agencies, and that
panels would be as ready to defer to these agencies in reviewing their determinations as had
been the US Court of International Trade and the Canadian Federal Court of Appeal.58 But
the experience with the mechanisms to date suggests that they do represent a significant
improvement over what they replaced.

According to a study by Mercury,59 between 1989 and 1995, when the FTA was largely
subsumed into NAFTA, 49 requests for binational panel review were initiated. Panels as of
1995 had rendered decisions in 32 cases (most binational determinations are being appealed
to binational panels). About two-thirds of US agency determination that were appealed to
binational panels resulted in panel remands to agencies for redeterminations (compared to a
remand rate by the Court of International Trade of about one-third). Canadian agency
determinations were subject to a markedly lower remand rate, reflecting in part the more
deferential standard of judicial review of specialized agency decisions under Canadian
domestic law. Panel decisions were mostly unanimous (with a few high profile exceptions
where panels divided on national lines) and mostly met the time limits prescribed by
Chapter 19. However, delays have occurred as a result of the inability of panels to order
relief but only remand matters to domestic agencies for redetermination, sometimes
resulting in multiple remands. There have been three Extraordinary Challenges to panel
rulings, all initiated by the US, and all unsuccessful. These results have been largely confirmed
by Davey, who has found the Chapter 19 process to work on the whole ‘reasonably well’.60

In the experience under the FTA, the great majority of appeals to binational panels have
been of US agency decisions, originally initiated by US Parties. However in 1993, there was
a surge in the review of Canadian agency decisions.61 The Mexicans have been increasingly
active, responsible for initiating 12 of the 35 actions under NAFTA to date.

In most respects, the panel procedures under FTA were preserved and made permanent
by NAFTA. But two important changes carry the potential to reinstate the more traditional
and deferential standard of judicial review that applied prior to the creation of the
binational panel review process under the FTA. First is the requirement that the roster
include judges, rather than international trade lawyers, economists, or other experts
(Annex 1901.2). Second, the Extraordinary Challenge procedure pertaining to panel
decisions has been extended to permit a challenge in a case where a panel has failed to apply
the appropriate standard of review (Article 1904(13)). Indeed Davey has written in the case
of NAFTA panel reviews of US antidumping decisions that, ‘while the degree of deference
accorded to Commerce seems to have varied somewhat from panel to panel, none of the
panels appear to have been overly intrusive in their reviews.’62 This contrasts with the
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review of Canadian decisions where ‘panel review has probably been somewhat more
intrusive than judicial review’.63

The second round of bilateral negotiations contemplated by the Canada-US Free Trade
Agreement on new rules for antidumping, subsidies, and countervailing duties appeared
initially to have been abandoned. In their place, NAFTA provides that the trilateral Free
Trade Commission shall establish a Working Group on trade and competition to make
recommendations to the Commission within five years of the coming into force of the
Agreement ‘on relevant issues concerning the relationship between competition laws and
policies and trade in the free trade area’.64 The Parties further agree to consult on ‘(a) the
potential to develop more effective rules and disciplines concerning the use of
governmental subsidies; and (b) the potential for reliance on a substitute system of rules for
dealing with unfair transborder pricing practices and government subsidization’.65 A
trilateral side-accord of 2 December 1993 committed the three governments to establishing
a working group on subsidies and antidumping duties which was to complete its work by 31
December 1995. This working group failed to reach a consensus on a reform agenda. 

THEORETICAL RATIONALES FOR ANTIDUMPING LAWS

Economic rationales for antidumping laws

There are three ways in which dumping can be characterized: as international price
discrimination, as predatory pricing, or as intermittent dumping. These characterizations, if
well-founded, each give rise to possible economic justifications for the existence of
antidumping laws.

International price discrimination

Canada was the first country in the world to enact antidumping legislation and there is some
evidence that this was prompted by fears of international price discrimination. According to
Jacob Viner, Canada’s first antidumping legislation was a response to the US Steel
Corporation’s practice of selling its exports at prices substantially below its domestic prices.66

US antidumping laws are also often characterized as a means of responding to international
price discrimination.67

Both Canadian68 and US69 antitrust laws prohibit various forms of domestic price
discrimination. These laws have intricate and detailed requirements which make the legal
definition of price discrimination complex. However, a standard economic definition of
price discrimination is as follows:

It is discriminatory to charge significantly different product prices to two or more
customers when there are no significant differences between the costs to the seller of
supplying those customers.70

A seller thus price discriminates when selling an identical product in different markets for
different prices. The seller must have some degree of control over the market price (or
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‘market power’) to be able to price discriminate, and the seller will only have market
power under conditions of imperfect competition.71

There are essentially two arguments for prohibiting domestic price discrimina-tion.72

First, a monopolist’s73 total output may decrease when it shifts from a single-price policy to
a discriminatory pricing policy. Because a monopolist sells less output than is optimal, a
further decrease in its output might exacerbate the scarcity and impose greater welfare
losses on society. Once the monopolist price discriminates between the two markets, some
existing customers will be forced out of the higher priced market, and new customers will
be attracted to the lower priced market. The total output produced and sold will decrease if
the higher priced market forces out more customers than the lower priced market attracts.

The second argument against allowing price discrimination reflects two forms of social
cost imposed on society. The first costs are those that the monopolist incurs in segregating
its markets and computing its customers’ elasticities of demand. If price discrimination
were prohibited, resources invested in administering the price discrimination scheme could
be put to socially beneficial uses such as product innovation, plant expansion or research and
development. Second, according to Posner,74 the lure of monopoly profits induces
competing sellers to seek monopolies. Sellers compete with each other to obtain, for
example, licences and protectionist legislation in the hope of achieving a monopoly. In the
monopoly contest, sellers may invest resources up to their expected monopoly profits. The
monopoly rents gained by the ultimate victor may be wholly offset by the socially wasteful
expenditures of the competing sellers. If price discrimination is allowed, expected
monopoly profits will be higher, sellers will invest more resources in achieving monopolies,
and resulting social costs would be higher than under a nondiscriminatory pricing policy.

These traditional arguments for prohibiting price discrimination are inconclusive. Among
antitrust scholars there is no consensus on whether domestic price discrimination should be
prohibited.75 First, whether output will increase or decrease under price discrimination is
an empirical question.76 In a wide range of perhaps most—circumstances, a monopolist is
likely to maximize profits by price discriminating in a way that increases output over that
obtaining with a single monopoly price—indeed a perfectly discriminating monopolist will
charge each consumer his or her reservation price and produce the competitive output
(appropriating all consumer surplus in the process). However, perfect price discrimination
is rarely feasible because it entails a monopolist acquiring information on every potential
customer’s elasticity of demand and preventing arbitrage between low-priced and high-
priced consumers. Second, while the costs that the monopolist incurs in acquiring and
segregating its market may be wasteful, if the monopolist produces more output under
price discrimination those costs may be outweighed by the benefits of the increased output.
Third, since some monopolies are efficient, expenditures to secure such monopolies are not
wasteful.

Even if one assumes the validity of the arguments for prohibiting domestic price
discrimination (although they are often contested), the case for prohibiting dumping is not
analogous. Domestic price discriminators and dumpers have different effects on the export
country. A seller only ‘dumps’ if it charges a lower price to its export market customers
than it charges to its home market customers.77 Therefore, while domestic price
discriminators create both a higher priced market and a lower priced market within the
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same country, dumpers create only a lower priced market in the country to which they are
exporting.

The importing country benefits from low import prices. The consumers in the importing
country enjoy more consumer surplus since they receive more output at a lower price per
unit. When the importing country imposes antidumping duties on low-priced imports, its
consumers lose these benefits. By increasing the price of dumped goods to the exporter’s
monopolistic home market price, antidumping duties impose supracompetitive prices on
consumers in the export market and force them to settle for an inefficiently low level of
output. Those consumers who remain in the market pay higher prices and enjoy less
consumer surplus, and some consumers are priced out of the market, generating a dead-
weight social cost.

In addition, when dumping occurs, the higher priced market is by definition located in the
dumper’s home country. The dumper’s home country thus bears the dumper’s costs of
identifying and segregating its markets, and any social costs associated with the dumper’s
monopoly profits. The efficiency losses associated with domestic price discrimination,
which drive the arguments for prohibiting price discrimination, are borne entirely by the
dumper’s home market. Hence, the arguments for prohibiting domestic price
discrimination do not justify a corresponding prohibition against dumping; dumping gives
the export country the benefit of the price discriminator’s low priced market without the
social costs of its high priced market. Even if the importing country were concerned about
the dumper’s home market abuses through some altruistic motive, forcing domestic
consumers to pay the dumper’s home market monopoly price seems a wholly ineffective
response. On this point, Trebilcock and Quinn note

Although equality of exploitation has a certain egalitarian ring to it, it seems a little
difficult to see any other virtue in replicating other people’s miseries, particularly
when in so doing we are in no way ameliorating the lot of our fellow sufferers.

Finally, while the potential reduction in output is an argument against price discrimination,
and whether total world output will rise or fall under international price discrimination is
an empirical question, in the case of dumping prices are by definition lower in the export
market, so the output available to the importing country is unambiguously higher with
dumping, rendering highly problematic the appropriateness of providing any remedy to
producers in the latter country on this account. The losses to consumers will almost always
outweigh any gain to producers who are thereby protected. This is borne out by the
empirical evidence.78

However, recent ‘revisionist’ literature by WTO officials79 attempts to provide an
economic rationalization for antidumping laws by drawing on the persistent and pervasive
influence of concepts of reciprocity in international trade relations. This literature argues
that international price discrimination is symptomatic of asymmetric market access and
economic distortions in exporters’ home markets that antidumping duties should properly
seek to redress. An illustrative case is the antidumping complaint brought in Canada by
General Motors and Ford against Hyundai for allegedly selling cars in Canada in the
mid-1980s at 36% less than it sold them for in South Korea.80 One might argue that it is
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unfair for domestic automobile manufacturers to have to face competition in the Canadian
market from Korean imports when these manufacturers lacked equivalent access to the
Korean market. (The price differential presumably reflected some form of protection of the
South Korean market from import competition.) Moreover, to the extent that the
imposition of antidumping duties might induce Hyundai to reduce its home market prices,
this would remove the economic distortion in the allocation of resources reflected in
overproduction for export markets and underproduction for the home market.

There are a number of responses to this line of argument. First, it is far from clear that
the imposition of antidumping duties will in fact in many cases remove the distortion in the
exporter’s home market—the exporter will have to weigh the loss of sales (and profits) in
export markets from the imposition of duties against the loss of profits entailed in
abandoning supracompetitive pricing in the home market. Second, it is far from clear in
most antidumping cases that the gravamen of domestic producers concerns about dumped
imports is denial of equivalent access to the exporter’s home markets; hence this seems a
curiously coincidental or indirect means of addressing market access problems in these
markets. Third, to the extent that differences in prices between home and export markets
are explained by export subsidies from the home country’s government, these are not
properly the domain of antidumping laws but countervailing duty laws. Fourth, to the
extent that the price differences between the two markets are explained by trade restrictions
(e.g. tariffs or quotas) in the home country’s market, then their legality should be addressed
directly. If the home country has high unbound or bound tariffs, it is entitled to maintain
these under the GATT/WTO pending mutual negotiations to reduce them. If it is utilizing
quotas, these may be objectionable under Article XI (quantitative restrictions). If it has
conferred a state-protected monopoly on the exporter, it is entitled to do so provided that
it satisfies the non-discrimination conditions of Article XVII (state trading enterprises). If it
is a developing country and is seeking to protect and promote an infant industry, it is
entitled to do so provided it meets the conditions of Article XVIII. If the home country’s
domestic competition laws are being applied to the exporter in a preferential way, then this
is likely to be challengeable under the National Treatment principle (Article III). Fifth,
operationalizing this focus on market access conditions in exporters’ home markets in
antidumping proceedings seems intractable. If a precondition to imposing antidumping
duties is a judgment by competition authorities in importing countries that conditions in
exporting countries’ markets would violate importing countries’ domestic competition
laws, this would seem a clearly unacceptable extraterritorial application of an importing
country’s domestic laws. If, on the other hand, this judgment is remitted to competition
authorities in exporting countries (many of which, however, do not have such authorities)
under a theory of positive comity, their judgments will often be viewed as non-credible and
self-serving in importing countries.81

In short, it is not and never has been a precondition to international trade that the
domestic policy environment in exporting and importing countries be in all respects the
same—an extreme version of level playing field or reciprocity concepts—subject to the
important explicit constraints on discrimination embodied in the above Articles of the
GATT.
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Predatory pricing

Predatory pricing is the second characterization of dumping that gives rise to an economic
rationale for antidumping laws. It consists of ‘systematically pricing below cost with a view
to intimidating and/or eliminating rivals in an effort to bring about a market price higher
than would otherwise prevail’.82

US antidumping laws were initially enacted out of a concern for predatory pricing by
foreign compedtors.83 Canadian, US and EU antidumping laws penalize predatory pricing in
addition to international price discrimination by authorizing the constructed-cost method of
calculating the normal value. This penalization of below-cost pricing suggests that predatory
pricing may be an additional rationale for current antidumping laws.

Canadian,84 US,85 and EU86 domestic antitrust laws prohibit predatory pricing. A seller
who engages in predatory pricing (the predator) ultimately harms competition by driving
other sellers from the market and acquiring market power. Once the predator gains market
power it restricts its output and captures monopoly profits. Predatory pricing is unlikely to
occur frequently.87 An extensive antitrust literature argues that predatory pricing is not
often an effective means of achieving market power,88 and economic theory suggests that
systematic below-cost pricing is infeasible and irrational unless certain structural conditions
are present. In order to compensate for the extensive losses suffered while selling at
artificially low prices, the predator must achieve a monopoly position by driving its
competitors from the market and preventing new competitors from entering. This will be
difficult: competitors will only leave the market if there are low barriers to exit, and low exit
barriers imply correspondingly low barriers to entry. Thus, even if the predator is successful
in driving out its current competitors, it may face competition from a new wave of
competitors, thus precluding recoupment of predatory losses incurred. As well, as
Hovenkamp89 and McGee90 argue, if the initial competitors are driven into bankruptcy,
other sellers may acquire their facilities at fire-sale prices and compete with the predator
while incurring lower fixed costs. Since it is unclear whether the predator will succeed in
creating a monopoly, the potential gains from predatory pricing are uncertain.

Predatory pricing allegations are also difficult to assess. As Areeda and Turner note:

[U]nhappy rivals may automatically assume predation when a competitor’s price is
below their costs, disregarding the possibility that the alleged predator’s cost is well
below theirs and more than covered by his price.91

In both Canada and the USA, prices below the seller’s marginal cost92 or average variable
cost93 tend to be presumed predatory, although courts have experienced some difficulty in
measuring those costs.94 Prices above average total cost (including fixed costs) are generally
presumed non-predatory. Prices between average variable cost and average total cost may or
may not be predatory, depending on the circumstances, such as proof of predatory intent or
ability to recoup short-run losses in the long run by raising prices without being under-cut
by remaining competitors or new entrants. The rejection of average total cost as an
invariable reference point is important because there are many instances in which a seller
may be forced to sell below cost. For example, in times of slack or declining demand, the
seller may not be able to sell enough output to cover all of its costs. As long as the seller
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prices its output above its variable costs, the revenue in excess of its variable costs will
defray a portion of its fixed costs. Thus, the seller suffers lower losses than it would by
halting production (in which case it would suffer losses equal to its full fixed costs). 

The gains from predatory pricing are even more uncertain in the international arena. For
a predator to achieve a monopoly in its export market it must not only drive out domestic
competitors from the export market, but other foreign competitors as well. Foreign
producers compete with each other just as vigorously as they compete with domestic
competitors in their export markets.95 Thus, the likelihood of one seller achieving a
worldwide monopoly is slim, and vigorous competition among foreign competitors implies
a small likelihood, in most markets, of successful oligopoly formation.96

Although true international predatory pricing (predatory dumping) may be expceted to
occur infrequently, where it does occur it harms competition in the export market. Indeed,
predatory dumping is more harmful than wholly domestic predatory pricing because
resulting monopoly profits are captured by the foreign exporter. On efficiency grounds,
antidumping laws are justifiable insofar as they prevent predatory dumping. However, the
current antidumping regimes of Canada, the USA and the EU penalize behaviour which may
be neither predatory nor prohibited by antitrust legislation. Indeed, Hutton and Trebilcock
conclude that of the thirty cases between 1984 and 1989 in which Canada imposed
antidumping duties, none could be supported on predatory pricing grounds.97 A recent
unpublished study for the OECD of a much larger sample of cases appar-ently reaches
similar conclusions.98 Currently, antidumping duties are imposed when ‘fully-allocated
costs’ exceed export market prices. As argued above, below-total-cost pricing need not be
predatory. Hence, antidumping laws penalize conduct by foreigners that is not penalized
when engaged in by domestic firms.

Moreover, even below-marginal-cost pricing by the exporter need not reflect an
underlying predatory intention. When the exporter makes its production decisions, it
estimates the price its output will eventually realize in the export market. As long as the
estimated export market price exceeds its marginal cost, it will produce output for sale in
the export market. If, owing for example to fluctuating exchange rates or changed market
conditions, the actual export market price turns out to be lower than estimated the
exporter will have no choice but to sell its output at the best available price. This price may
be lower than the ex ante marginal costs the exporter faced when it made its production
decision. However, the exporter will continue to sell in the export market because the
output has already been produced and it can recoup a portion of its sunk costs by selling its
output.99 Although the exporter is engaging in below-marginal-cost pricing, there is no
predatory intention. The exporter is doing what it can to minimize its losses in the face of
its inaccurate ex ante estimate of the market price. Hutton and Trebilcock find that
frustrated ex ante market price estimates accounted for below-marginal-cost pricing in four
antidumping actions initiated in Canada against US exporters.100

Finally, in some cases below-marginal-cost pricing may actually promote competition.
Depending on the product, sellers may engage in below-marginal-cost pricing to compete
for market share. Deardorff101 identifies two product characteristics, ‘experience’ and
‘learning by doing’, that make below-marginal-cost pricing likely for some goods.
Consumers may pay more for ‘experience’ goods after their first and subsequent purchases

174 ANTIDUMPING LAWS



than before their first purchase. This is because the quality of ‘experience’ goods is only
discernible after their first use. To induce consumers to sample their goods for the first
time, as a marketing strategy sellers may initially price their goods below their marginal
cost. Sellers will recoup their initial losses once consumers pay more for the goods on their
subsequent purchases.102 Sellers produce ‘learning by doing’ goods when they experiment
with new technology or new products. When they first enter the market with new goods,
sellers may be inefficient and suffer losses. At this point, marginal costs may exceed the sale
price. Sellers gradually reduce their costs as they ‘learn’ more about efficient production
methods. In the meantime, they gain a valuable toehold in the market.103

Below-marginal-cost pricing for ‘experience’ or ‘learning by doing’ goods is typical for
sellers expanding into new markets and cannot be viewed as predatory. In fact, it increases
consumer demand, competition, and productive efficiency, and sellers can recoup their
costs without acquiring market power. Many sellers, regardless of their degree of market
power, may increase their market share by selective below-marginal-cost pricing. These
legitimate roles for below-marginal-cost pricing suggest that antidumping laws should not
categorically penalize below-marginal cost pricing. Significantly, domestic antitrust laws do
not prohibit these kinds of activities in the case of domestic firms.104

Again, the recent ‘revisionist’ literature that seeks to provide an economic rationalization
for antidumping laws contests this analysis of the constructed cost aspect of antidumping
laws as inconsistent with notions of predation.105 It is argued that European Commission
decisions in domestic predation cases under EU competition laws have rejected pricing
above average variable cost as presumptively non-predatory and have in fact adopted an
average total cost test, which is close to the constructed cost test employed in antidumping
law, and that US courts have adopted divergent cost tests in domestic predation cases under
US antitrust law, some of which are consistent with the constructed cost test. It is then
argued that pricing below average total cost is irrational unless a firm plans to exit a market
or is doing so only on a temporary basis (e.g. because of depressed demand), or is engaged
in predatory behaviour towards its rivals.

Several responses are in order. First, while it is true that courts have taken different
positions on appropriate cost tests in domestic predation cases, they all nevertheless require
proof of some kind that the alleged predator’s behaviour is in fact predatory—that it is to
say that the intent or effect of its behaviour is likely to entrench or reinforce a dominant
market position, permitting it then to behave monopolistically. The constructed cost
inquiry in antidumping cases never views as relevant any of the evidence that in a domestic
predation case might be viewed as demonstrating predatory (monopolizing) intent or effect.
For example, is it seriously arguable that Hyundai was using supracompetitive profits
garnered in its protected South Korean market to finance below-cost exports to the North
American market with a view to predating (monopolizing) the latter market? Thus, the
argument that the constructed cost test is a close surrogate for predation tests in domestic
competition or antitrust cases is wholly unpersuasive. It bears repeating that in the OECD
and Canadian empirical studies of antidumping cases referred to above, few or no cases
were found to satisfy conventional economic conceptions of predation. Second, even
acknowledging room for debate about the appropriate tests to be applied under competition
or antitrust law in domestic predation cases, surely the National Treatment principle
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requires that whatever tests are applied to domestic producers should also equally be
applied to foreign producers. Manifestly, antidumping laws violate this precept by
according domestic producers much greater pricing latitude than that accorded to foreign
producers. Domestic firms are rarely found guilty of predation under domestic antitrust or
competition law regimes; foreign firms are frequently found guilty of dumping, suggesting
the extent of the discrepancy between the two regimes.

More transparently baseless economic rationalizations for antidumping laws are also
advanced in this literature.106 One is that exporters facing recessions in their home markets
may export these recessions to export markets by below full-cost pricing and thus
antidumping duties are a useful anti-cyclical policy. Given that it is at the same time claimed
that antidumping duties often affect only about 1 % of imports, (let alone GNP), it is difficult
to think of a more futile anti-cyclical policy. It is also argued that where importing countries
devalue their currency for balance of payment reasons, this objective may be defeated by
exporters into their markets adjusting their export prices downwards (below home market
prices) to offset the effect of the devaluation and thus to retain market share. Again, given
the very small percentage of imports said to be affected by antidumping duties and the large
and complex set of forces that determine exchange rates, it is difficult to believe that such a
strategy could have any discernible impact on the balance of payments. Moreover, domestic
producers who use imported inputs may be required to adopt the same strategy in order to
remain competitive, yet would not be penalized on that account.

Intermittent dumping

The final characterization of dumping that gives rise to an economic rationale for
antidumping laws is intermittent dumping. Jacob Viner defined intermittent dump-ing as
systematic dumping which lasts for several months or years at a time.107 Viner viewed this
form of dumping as objectionable because it lasts long enough to injure domestic producers
without providing consumers with a constant long-run supply of goods.108 A situation in which
intermittent dumping might occur is in the context of oversupply of perishables.
Agricultural producers often make planting decisions long before selling their produce.
Because of the cyclical nature of supply in agricultural markets, producers often find they
have excess produce and rather than allowing it to rot they sell at low prices. For these
agricultural producers, the relevant cost at the time of selling is the cost of packaging and
marketing. Hutton and Trebilcock109 find that the only Canadian antidumping cases that
exhibited any indication of intermittent dumping were agricultural cases. They argue that
the case of perishables is not a dumping problem and that agricultural price instability
should be addressed, if at all, through income stabilization programmes rather than
antidumping laws.110 

Non-predatory intermittent dumping cannot occur unless certain structural conditions
are present.111 First, exporters must be unable to compete with domestic producers under
normal market conditions. Otherwise, exporters would provide a permanent source of
supply instead of an intermittent one. Second, intermittent dumping must be so extensive
that it substantially disrupts domestic production. The losses incurred by selling below-cost
products into export markets makes it unlikely that the dumping will last long enough to
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disrupt domestic production. As well, disruption will only occur if domestic purchasers
substitute foreign goods for domestic goods. By substituting foreign goods for domestic
goods during the intermittent dumping period, domestic purchasers will disrupt domestic
production. As a result, when the intermittent dumping period is over domestic producers
will charge higher prices than before to recoup their post-intermittent-dumping
readjustment costs. Domestic purchasers can avoid the higher price by not substituting away
from domestic goods in the first place, although collective action problems may inhibit this
response.

The conditions necessary for non-predatory intermittent dumping to occur are unlikely
to arise. Moreover, the effect of non-predatory intermittent dumping on welfare is
ambiguous. When foreign exporters dump, domestic producers in the export market must
adjust to meet lower import prices. Some domestic producers may be forced out of the
market and if the dumping is only temporary domestic producers will then have to readjust
to fill the vacuum left by the departing dumper. The adjustment and readjustment costs
incurred by domestic producers unquestionably harm producer welfare.112 Corporate
resources which would go to skills training, expansion, or research and development are
diverted to maintaining the producer’s market share in the more competitive market.
Losses incurred during the dumping period may force some producers into bankruptcy.
Since domestic capital markets may be imperfect, the producers forced into bankruptcy
may not be the least efficient.113

Adjustment and readjustment costs associated with intermittent dumping may also be
passed on to consumers. Intermittent dumping harms consumers if they end up paying a
higher long-run average price for goods than they would pay if there were no dumping. If
intermittent dumping occurs with sufficient frequency that the domestic producer’s cost of
capital is higher over the long run (reflecting higher risk) than it would be in the absence of
intermittent dumping, this cost will be passed on to consumers. However, the dumping
margin may so depress prices during the period of dumping that, notwithstanding the
producers’ increased cost of capital, the consumer ends up paying lower long-run average
prices. The net effect of intermittent dumping on consumer welfare is thus uncertain.

Given both the uncertain effect of intermittent dumping on consumer welfare and the
low probability of the structural conditions for intermittent dumping being satisfied, it is
questionable whether antidumping laws should seek to prevent intermittent dumping. In
any event, the present antidumping laws of Canada and the United States are ill-adapted to
addressing problems of intermittent dumping. Antidumping investigations assess dumping
margins and material injury without regard to whether the dumping is temporary or
permanent. This conclusion is borne out by Hutton and Trebilcock’s finding that the
possibility of intermittent dumping concerns was present in only four of the thirty Canadian
cases they examined in which antidumping duties were imposed.114

Non-efficiency rationales for prohibiting dumping

The standard literature on dumping generally considers only economic or effi-ciency-based
rationales for prohibiting dumping.115 However, efficiency-based rationales may not tell the
whole dumping story. Typically, antidumping laws can be justified politically because they
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address the perceived ‘unfairness’ of low-priced foreign imports. A US Senate Committee
has called dumping ‘pernicious’,116 and American courts have characterized dumping as an
‘unfair trade practice’.117 The global increase in antidumping actions may therefore reflect
growing domestic political objections to the unfairness of low-priced foreign imports. The
previous section showed that the only economic justification for antidumping laws is the
prohibition of international predatory pricing, but notions of fairness may offer different
justifications.

Fairness is a difficult concept.118 Bhagwati characterizes the fairness terminology in
antidumping laws as ‘inherently vague’,119 and remarks that it is ‘reflective of the
psychological mood of a nation losing hegemony in the world economy’.120 The perceived
unfairness of non-predatory dumping may result from the disruptive impacts of low-priced
imports on domestic industry and work-forces. By increasing the net price of imports,
antidumping duties make domestic goods relatively more attractive to consumers and allow
domestic producers to avoid direct competition with foreign exporters. Direct competition
with low-cost suppliers may eventually force domestic producers to leave the market. This
exit is likely to result in domestic workers losing jobs and shareholders of affected
producers losing capital. Thus, while consumers would benefit from lower prices if
antidumping duties were abolished, domestic producers might suffer severe losses from low-
priced imports.121

Hutton and Trebilcock examine distributive justice and communitarian rationales for
antidumping laws.122 Antidumping laws would be justified on a distributive justice rationale
if they were to enhance the welfare of the least-advan-taged members of society.123 The
least-advantaged group would include immobile, unskilled, and low-income workers.124

Antidumping laws would be justified on a communitarian rationale where they minimized
the disruptive effect of imports on established communities and their corresponding
network of family and social relationships.125

However, both theoretically and empirically, antidumping laws cannot be sustained on
these non-economic rationales. First, there is no principled reason to distinguish between
the harm caused by non-predatory dumping and the harm caused by non-dumped low-
priced imports. Undeniably, low-priced imports inflict losses on domestic interests;
however, the severity of these losses does not depend on the home-market price of those
imports, which is what distinguishes dumped imports from other imports. 

Empirically, most Canadian cases in which antidumping duties are imposed do not reflect
distributive justice or communitarian rationales. Hutton and Trebilcock show that of the
thirty Canadian antidumping cases in which antidumping duties were imposed between 30
October 1984 and 3 February 1989, two cases could be justified by a distributive justice
rationale alone, five cases could be justified by a communitarian rationale alone, and four
cases could be justified by a combined distributive justice/communitarian rationale.
Nineteen of the thirty cases examined could not be justified on any normative rationale,
either economic or non-economic.126 Thus, not only do non-economic rationales fail to
justify a prohibition against dumping, but antidumping authorities appear to ignore these
rationales when they impose antidumping duties. Indeed, Hutton and Trebilcock find that
most Canadian antidumping cases benefit those workers and communities who are already
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better off than the majority of workers and communities in Canada,127 suggesting that the
current Canadian regime may actually violate distributive justice concerns.

A different line of non-economic rationalization of antidumping laws (and trade remedy
laws more generally) has recently been developed by Sykes in a politi-cal/Public Choice
analysis of these laws.128 He argues that rather than attempting to ascribe an economic logic
to them or to attempt to interpret, apply or refine them in economically rational ways, it is
more persuasive to view them as part of a grand and complex political compact amongst major
trading nations where in order to facilitate major trade liberalization concessions with
respect to border measures such as tariffs and quantitative restrictions, the Contracting
Parties by agreement reserved to themselves unilateral opt-out regimes against the
contingency that the discrete impacts of import competition in particular sectors would
prove politically unsustainable; in the absence of these opt-outs or safety valves,
governments would have been more reluctant to assume the political risks of trade
liberalization initiatives in the first place.

Sykes’ argument is a subtle and disconcerting one, in that it is inherently non-refutable
through any decisive a priori analysis. However, several reactions are in order. First, it
seems implicitly to rest on a notion that there is a fixed quotient of protectionism in the
world (and each of its trading partners) and that if protectionism is suppressed or curtailed
in some dimensions it will re-surface in others (like water finding its proper level). This
implicit assumption rests on murky theoretical foundations and empirically is sharply at
odds with the post-war experience which on any measure has entailed dramatic trade
liberalization (not only of border measures, but many other trade restricting measures).
Thus, whatever implicit political compact may have motivated the initial founders of the
GATT, this compact has surely not remained static and immune from new learning,
experience and changing preferences, but has evolved through time and over (many more)
countries. Adopting this more dynamic political perspective, there is no reason to believe
that trade remedy laws (any more than the host of other protectionist measures that have
been eliminated or liberalized) are part of some iron law of politics that is impervious to
change. The fact that antidumping laws have not been seriously reformed to date is no more
decisive against future prospects of reform than the fact that tariffs were high in 1947 (and
had been for many years) was not decisive against their subsequent reduction. This is not to
gainsay the continuing political salience of constituencies in importing countries whose
interests may be jeopardized by trade liberalization, but it does argue for searching for
better ways of accommodating these concerns that do least violence to the net welfare gains
from trade. Whether such ways can in fact be found is indeed a major challenge and must
await further discussion in later chapters, particularly the discussion of transition costs,
safeguard regimes and domestic adjustment policies in Chapter 9.

REFORMING ANTIDUMPING LAWS

Current antidumping regimes might seek to prevent international price discrimination,
international predatory pricing and intermittent dumping. However, only predatory pricing
gives rise to a legitimate economic rationale for prohibiting dumping: when dumping is
merely international price discrimination, the export market benefits. Intermittent

THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE 179



dumping can be expected to occur only rarely and its net welfare effects are ambiguous.129

Yet antidumping laws are ill-designed to identify and penalize true international predatory
pricing. Instead, they result in duties being levied upon goods priced at non-predatory
levels, thereby imposing costs on consumers in export markets through supracompetitive
prices and subjecting foreign firms to burdens that domestic competitors do not bear.

Non-economic rationales for antidumping laws, such as concerns over distributive justice
or communitarian impacts of low priced imports, are more appropriately dealt with under
safeguard regimes or, better still, under domestic adjustment assistance programmes. This
conclusion leads us to propose that antidumping laws should be replaced by either
supranational or harmonized domestic antitrust regimes which penalize international
predatory pricing without at the same time penalizing non-predatory international price
discrimination. Price discrimination laws should play no role in regulating cross-border
trade. Amongst Member States of the European Union, this solution has largely been
adopted, with the abolition of antidumping duties with respect to inter-member trade and
replacement with Union competition laws which bind Member States and their citizens.
However, EU competition laws constrain not only predatory pricing but also price
discrimination, including cross-border price discrimina-tion.130 Therefore, the European
model is more expansive than our analysis suggests is warranted.

Instead, the more modest goal of harmonizing domestic antitrust laws, ideally under the
aegis of the GATT, with respect to international predatory pricing seems a more
appropriate goal. In this respect, the 1988 Protocol between Australia and New Zealand,
pursuant to the Australian-New Zealand Closer Economic Relations Trade Agreement
(ANZCERTA) between the two countries is much more apposite. Both countries agreed
that as of July 1990, all antidumping actions between the two countries should cease and
that any antidumping duties then in place should be terminated. In their place have been
substituted harmonized provisions in both countries’ competition law pertaining to abuse of
dominant position. These provisions permit a complainant located in one country to
complain of abusive behaviour by a firm or firms located in the other country. The courts in
the first country are then authorized to hold hearings in the second country and to use the
second country’s courts to enforce subpoenas and other orders. The provisions on abuse of
dominant position clearly focus on cross-border predatory pricing, and not cross-border
price discrimination. Canada and Chile have adopted a similar regime under their Free Trade
Agreement. Warner has recently proposed a similar harmonized antitrust regime for
bilateral Canada-US trade.131 Here the political trade-offs seem promising. Between 1980
and 1988, US producers brought 22 antidumping actions against Canadian exporters, while
Canadian producers brought 50 actions against US exporters. Canada imposed duties in 23
of the 50 actions, while the US imposed duties in 14 of the 22 actions. In principle, such a
regime could also be implemented multilaterally, through a GATT cross-border predatory
pricing Code, which would require signatories to harmonize their domestic antitrust laws in
line with the Code, in very much the same way that at present domestic antidumping laws
must conform with the GATT Antidumping Agreement (or domestic intellectual property
laws must conform to the WTO TRIPS Agreement). A variant on this approach would be
to preserve antidumping regimes at a formal level but seek to agree on harmonization
requirements that would incorporate predation concepts explicitly into these regimes
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(including tests for predation or abuse of dominant position in export markets; definition of
relevant (not ‘like’) product (and geographic) markets; protection of competition, not
competitor s). The initial US Antidumping Act of 1916 in part exemplifies this approach.
This would, in effect, turn antidumping actions into private actions for cross-border
predation, with duties rather than damages as the available remedy. In moving in this
direction, one of the major forms of the ‘New Protectionism’ would be radically
constrained, while legitimate concerns about domestic impacts of surges in low-priced
imports would be dealt with through a well-conceived multilateral safeguards regime132 and
domestic adjustment assistance programmes.133 In this chapter, we have focused on one
area of potential convergence between trade policy and competition policy. Arguments for
harmonizing domestic competition policies to facilitate international trade and investment
in fact range much more broadly, and we take up these issues in a later chapter. 
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8
Subsidies, countervailing duties, and

government procurement

INTRODUCTION

Under Article VI of the GATT, countervailing duties can be levied by member countries on
imports that are causing harm to domestic industries due to subsidization by a foreign
government’1 After antidumping actions, countervailing duty actions are the most
frequently initiated trade-remedy actions, accounting for 18% of all import relief measures
initiated between 1979 and 1988.2 However, unlike antidumping actions, one country is
the main user: between 1979 and 1988 the United States initiated 371 actions while all
other countries initiated only 58.3 According to Messerlin: ‘To the United States, the
[GATT Subsidies] Code is an instrument to control subsidies. To the rest of the world, it is
an instrument to control US countervailing duties.’4 The predominance of the USA as a
user of countervailing duties illustrates the distinctive view of subsidies held by the USA,
and limited international agreement on the status of subsidies as policy instruments. In the
USA, subsidies are often viewed as illegitimate distortions of international trade, while in
other countries industrial subsidies have often been considered a legitimate instrument of
domestic policy. On some measures, rates of industrial subsidization more than doubled in
G7 countries between 1952 and 1985: from 1.03% of GDP to 2.13%, while in the US the
figure stood at 0.58% in 1985.5 Levels of subsidization have undoubtedly fallen more
recently, as many governments, in the face of recessionary conditions in the late 1980s and
early 1990s and rising budget deficits have cut public expenditures and committed
themselves to domestic policies of privatization and de-regulation.

Despite US concerns at the use of subsidies by other countries,6 there is a debate about
the incidence of subsidies in the United States itself, particularly at the state level where
subsidies (including tax incentives), including locational inducements for new plants, are
pervasive. Fry estimates that ‘at the end of the 1980s, the total annual tab for targeted
assistance at the subnational level was over $20 billion for non-agricultural businesses;
expenditures and lost revenues for the states approached $200 billion’.7 Moreover, many of
these state aids are highly visible, rather than being hidden in procurement policies, utility
rate rebates, etc.8

With respect to subsidies at the federal level, recent empirical work by Bence and Smith,
based upon data from the mid-to-late-1980s, concluded that, excluding the defence sector,
the average subsidy rate (subsidies as a percentage of the value of industry outputs) was



about 0.5% for the United States.9 However, once defence procurement in the United
States is taken into account, the US average rate of subsidies jumps to 2%. Bence and
Smith, however, do not explain the methodology used to discern the subsidy component in
defence procurement, and hence the 2% estimate should be regarded as speculative. At the
same time, it should be noted that neither estimate fully reflects off-budget items such as
loan guarantees and tax expenditures.10

Parties to the GATT are authorized to levy countervailing duties in response to injury
caused or threatened by subsidized imports.11 However, there are three situations in which
subsidies can distort trade, and in only one can countervailing duties be used directly to
address any resulting distortions. First, if country A sub-sidizes its exports to country B,
causing domestic producers in country B to be disadvantaged, country B can respond by
countervailing those imports. Second, if country A subsidizes its domestic production,
disadvantaging the exports of country B to country A, the only actions country B can take
are to respond with equivalent subsidies, or complain of nullification or impairment of prior
tariff concessions to a GATT dispute resolution panel.12 Finally, if country A subsidizes
exports to C, disadvantaging exports of country B into C’s market, again there is little that
country B can do unilaterally other than respond with equivalent subsi-dies.13 It is necessary
to consider both the rules on subsidies and those on countervailing duties in order to
address the problems raised in these three scenarios.

GATT PROVISIONS ON SUBSIDIES

Article VI

Article VI of the GATT contains general rules governing the application of antidumping and
countervailing duties. In section 3, countervailing duties are defined as ‘a special duty levied
for the purpose of offsetting any bounty or subsidy bestowed directly or indirectly upon the
manufacture, production or export of any merchandise’. The fact that countervailing duties
are linked with antidumping duties in this Article suggests that subsidies are actionable for
the same reason that dumping is: because they result in below-normal value pricing;14

however, subsidization is distinguished from dumping on the grounds that the former is a
distorting practice of government whereas the latter is a pricing policy of a private firm.15

Few rules are laid out in this Article. In order for a countervailing duty action to be
authorized, the effect of the subsidization must be to cause or threaten material injury to an
established domestic industry or to retard materially the establishment of a domestic
industry. Section 5 specifies that no product may be subject to both antidumping and
countervailing duties and that any countervailing duties should be no more than the
estimated bounty or subsidy determined to have been granted. Finally, two specific practices
are exempted from countervailing duty actions. First, the exemption of a product from
duties or taxes borne by that product (or a product like or competitive with that product)
when not destined for export (i.e. when destined for consumption in the country of origin)
is not a coun-tervailable subsidy.16 Second, the maintenance of price stabilization systems for
producers of primary commodities is not countervailable if such systems lead to both high
and low export prices and are not intended to stimulate exports or cause distortions.17
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Article XVI

Article XVI of the GATT contains general provisions on subsidies. At the time of the
formation of the GATT, Article XVI contained only one provision whose main purpose was
to encourage notification and consultation on the use of subsidies. Section A requires Parties
to notify the GATT of any subsidies that affect imports or exports, directly or indirectly,
and to consult with any Parties whose interests are threatened by or are suffering serious
prejudice from such subsidies. This provision of the GATT was: ‘something less than an
effective brake on the use of subsidies…[and] there is no record of any country ever having
limited a sub-sidizing practice as a result of consultations under Article XVI, paragraph 1’.18

In 1955, Article XVI was expanded to include a more specific provision on export
subsidies.19 The provision is relatively weak and in any event not all countries accepted it.20

Under section B, Parties were obliged to seek to avoid the use of subsidies on the export of
primary products. Any such subsidy should not be applied in such a way as to result in that
Contracting Party having a ‘more than equitable’ share of world export trade in the
subsidized product. With respect to non-primary products, Parties were to seek to avoid
the use of subsidies that would result in export sales of a product at prices below the
comparable price for the sale of the like good in the domestic market. The different
treatment of primary and non-primary products was interpreted by developing countries as
discrimination against their trade and they did not endorse this section of the Article.21 The
final amendment to Article XVI was made in 1960 when an illustrative list of export
subsidies was developed to aid Parties in interpreting the provisions.22

The Tokyo Round Subsidies Code

As was the case with antidumping, the presence of an injury requirement in Article VI of
the GATT did not affect the administration of countervailing duty laws in the USA. By
virtue of the Protocol of Provisional Acceptance, domestic laws that were in existence at
the time of the signing of the GATT took precedence over GATT obligations, leaving the
US government ‘free to countervail without demonstrable economic justification’.23 For
most nations, subsidies other than export subsidies were considered matters of national or
internal policy. Thus, the aim of the Tokyo Round negotiations on subsidies was to secure a
binding requirement that countervailing duties only be imposed on subsidized products that
were causing material injury to domestic producers. However, the USA, which felt strongly
about the unfairness of subsidies, insisted that rules on countervail should only be addressed
if an agreement to discipline subsidies more generally was reached.24 In essence, there was a
fundamental difference in approach to the issue of subsidies/countervailing measures.25 The
result of the conflict between the USA and other countries was the two-track approach laid
out in the Tokyo Round Code on Subsidies and Countervailing Duties. It should be noted
that the Code was a plurilateral, not multilateral, agreement and was in fact adopted mostly
by OECD countries and by a small number of the most advanced developing countries,
leaving non-signatories uncommitted to the disciplines and disentitled to its benefits.
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Track I

Track I of the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code dealt entirely with unilateral responses to
subsidies—i.e. the imposition of countervailing duties on subsidized imports causing injury
to a domestic industry. Signatories had the authority to impose countervailing duties
sufficient to counteract the foreign subsidy, or a lesser duty if this would be sufficient to
alleviate the injury.26 The procedural and substantive provisions are very similar to those on
antidumping. Article 2(1) requires that sufficient evidence of subsidization, injury and a
causal link between the imports and the injury be furnished before an investigation can be
launched. The main weakness in the Code was that there was no clear definition of a
countervailable subsidy. Because of the Code’s silence on this issue, countries were given a
great deal of latitude in defining ‘subsidy’ for countervailing duty purposes.27

Track II

Track II has been the multilateral route for addressing subsidies.28 It was primarily
concerned with obligations undertaken by signatories to reduce the incidence of trade-
distorting subsidies and for the most part was an elaboration of Article XVI of the GATT.
Countries agreed to notify the Contracting Parties of any subsidies that may impact on
exports or imports and undertook to avoid granting export subsidies29 on other than
primary products. Moreover, signatories were expected to avoid export subsidies on certain
primary products if they served to increase the signatory’s share of world trade beyond
what is equitable, account being taking of the share of the signatory in trade during a
previous representative period. If an export subsidy was being maintained in a manner
inconsistent with the Code, a signatory would request consultation with the offending
country under Article 12(1). The matter could be referred to conciliation and panel review
under Part VI of the Code if a mutually acceptable solution was not reached in thirty days.

Expanding on Article XVI of the GATT, the Code addressed domestic subsidies in
Article 11. Signatories recognized that domestic subsidies were important instruments for
the promotion of social and economic policy. The policy objectives recognized in the
Code30 were:

1 the elimination of industrial, economic and social disadvantages of specific regions;
2 to facilitate the restructuring, under socially acceptable conditions, of certain sectors,

especially where this has become necessary by reason of changes in trade and economic
policies, including international agreements resulting in lower barriers to trade;

3 generally to sustain employment and to encourage re-training and change in
employment;

4 to encourage research and development programmes, especially in the field of high-
technology industries;

5 the implementation of economic programmes and policies to promote the economic
and social development of developing countries;

6 redeployment of industry in order to avoid congestion and environmental problems.
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Furthermore, signatories ‘do not intend to restrict the right of signatories to use such subsidies
to achieve these and other important policy objectives which they consider desirable’.31

When adopting policies that involve the granting of subsidies, Parties shall ‘weigh, as far as
is practicable, taking account of the nature of the particular case, possible adverse effects on
trade’.32 While recognized as legitimate, domestic subsidies could be challenged if they
caused one of three effects:33

• injury to the domestic industry of another signatory;
• nullification or impairment of the benefits accruing to another signatory under the

General Agreement;
• serious prejudice to the interests of another signatory.34

Unlike the Track I procedure, Track II did not permit the complainant to impose duties
unilaterally to counteract an offensive subsidy, but did address all these basic subsidy
scenarios identified above. First, the complainant signatory was required to consult with the
country providing the subsidy. If no mutually acceptable solution to the matter was reached
then a panel would be formed by the Committee on Subsidies and Countervailing
Measures.35 After consideration of the panel’s report, the Committee would make
recommendations to the Parties to the dispute. If these recommendations were not
followed within a reasonable amount of time, the Committee could authorize
countermeasures—including the withdrawal of GATT concessions or obligations.

The Code also recognized the role of subsidies in the economic development policies of
developing countries and laid out somewhat stricter rules governing actions against them
under Track I. There were also restrictions on the rights of other signatories to take action
against them under Track II.

The Tokyo Round Subsidies Code proved only modestly effective, and contentious cases
involving EC subsidies on the export of wheat flour and pasta and on domestic oilseed
production were not satisfactorily resolved, precipitating further negotiations over subsidies
disciplines during the Uruguay Round.

There were, however, a number of less contentious cases satisfactorily resolved. In
1991, Brazil challenged a countervailing duty imposed by the United States on non-rubber
footwear from Brazil.36 Brazil argued that the United States had violated its most-favoured
nations obligations toward Brazil, by giving it less favourable treatment in the
administration of the Subsidies Code than it had accorded to other countries. More
specifically, the less favourable treatment was argued to be the failure on the part of the
United States automatically to backdate the revocation of countervailing duty orders issued
without an injury determination to the date on which the United States was obligated to
provide that determination. The panel accepted Brazil’s argument and ruled against the
United States, ostensibly expanding and refining the definition of most-favoured nation
treatment in this context. Another case before a GATT panel in 1991 involved a challenge
to countervailing duty determinations on the part of the United States.37 Here, Norway
argued that the United States had violated the Code on a number of counts by imposing
duties on Norwegian exports of salmon. The panel found that the United States had acted
consistently with its obligations under the Code. An important aspect of this case was the
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conclusion of the panel that ‘the imposition by the United States of countervailing duties in
respect of regional development programmes was not inconsistent with [its legal]
obligations.’38 The fact that Norway had been subsidizing its salmon industry as part of a
regional development programme was not relevant to the outcome of this case.39 Another
case involving Brazilian duties on milk and milk powder from the EC was also successfully
resolved. The EC challenged the duties on a number of procedural and substantive
provisions. Here they were bolstered by the third-party support of the United States who
sought to ensure that Brazil’s procedures were in conformity with the Code. The panel
ruled in favour of the EC and recommended that Brazil cease to apply countervailing duties.40

The Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement41

The new Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement, unlike the Toyko Round Code, is an
integral part of the GATT/WTO and binds all Member States. Agreement on tighter
constraints on subsidies was facilitated by recessionary conditions and rising government
deficits during the negotiations. Subsidies are for the first time defined. They will be
deemed to exist if there is a financial contribution by government or any public body where
the government practice involves a direct transfer of funds (e.g. grants, loans, and equity
infusion); potential direct transfers or liabilities (e.g. loan guarantees); government revenue
that is otherwise due but is forgone; government provision of goods or services other than
general infrastructure; government payments to a funding mechanism or direction to a
private body to carry out any of the foregoing functions (Article 1.1). A definition of
specificity is also adopted, which closely follows existing US countervailing duty law.
This definition includes subsidies that are on their face limited to an enterprise or industry
(or group of enterprises or industries), as well as subsidies that are de facto specific in terms
of how governments exercise their discretion in the administration of a subsidy programme
or who actually benefits from it.

Subsidies are classified as actionable, non-actionable, and prohibited. Non-action-able
subsidies include general (non-specific) subsidies such as spending on education or
infrastructure, as well as some specific subsidies (Article 8). First, specific assistance for
research activities conducted by firms or by higher education or research establishments on
a contract basis with firms is not actionable if the assistance covers not more than 50% of
the costs of basic industrial research or 25% of the costs of applied research.42 Second,
assistance to disadvantaged regions given pursuant to a general framework of regional
development, and non-specific within eligible regions, is not actionable subject to certain
conditions. Each disadvantaged region must be a clearly designated, continuous
geographical area with a definable economic and administrative identity. The region must
be considered as disadvantaged based on neutral and objective criteria, indicating that the
region’s difficulties arise out of more than temporary circumstances. The criteria include
some measure of economic development which shall be based on at least one of the
following factors (as measured over a three-year period): one of either income per capita or
household income per capita, or GDP per capita, which must not be above 85% of the
average for the country concerned; the unemployment rate which must be at least 110% of
the average for the country concerned. Even these two forms of specific subsidies may be
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objectionable if a signatory can demonstrate that they have resulted in serious adverse
effects to its domestic industry. Third, assistance to promote adaptation of existing facilities
to new environmental requirements is non-actionable provided it is a one-off measure, is
limited to 20% of the adaptation costs, does not cover the cost of replacing and operating
the assisted investment, is directly limited to planned reduction in a firm’s pollution and
does not cover any manufacturing cost savings, and is available to all firms that can adopt
the new equipment or processes. These three kinds of subsidies require notification to the
Committee on Subsidies and Countervailing Measures prior to implementation to ensure
compliance with the various conditions that attach them.

Two kinds of non-agricultural subsidies are prohibited per se: subsidies contingent in law
or in fact upon export performance (illustrated in an Annex to the Agreement), and
subsidies contingent upon use of domestic rather than imported inputs (Article 3). Subsidies
that are neither prohibited nor non-actionable are placed in the actionable category.
Actionable subsidies are defined as specific forms of government assistance to firms or
industries (Article 5). The list of legitimate grounds for domestic subsidies found in Article
11 of the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code has been dropped. Actionable subsidies may be
objectionable if they cause injury to the domestic industry of another country, if they entail
nullification or impairment of benefits accruing to another country under the GATT,
including the benefits of concessions bound under Article II of the GATT, or if they cause
serious prejudice to the interests of another country. Serious prejudice may arise where the
effect of the subsidy is to displace or impede the imports of like products into the market of
the subsidizing country; where the effect of the subsidy is to displace or impede the export
of a like product of another country from or to a third-country market; where the effect of
the subsidy is a significant price-under-cutting by the subsidized products as compared with
the price of a like product of another country in the same market; or where the effect of the
subsidy is an increase in the world market share of the subsidizing country in a particular
subsidized primary product or commodity as compared to the average share it had during
the previous period of three years (Article 6.3). Subsidization in excess of a threshold value
of 5% ad valorem is deemed to cause serious prejudice unless the subsidizing country can
prove otherwise. Prohibited (export) and actionable subsidies are subject to challenge under
either the multilateral dispute resolution track or the domestic countervailing duty track.
Non-actionable subsidies are immune from challenge under both tracks (Article 10, note 33),
although where a nonactionable subsidy is causing serious adverse effects to the domestic
industry of a Member State, the Subsidies Committee may recommend a modification to
the programme.

Part V of the Agreement sets out detailed rules governing countervailing duty actions. In
most respects they follow the Tokyo Round Code. However, countervailing duties may
only be imposed in respect of actionable or prohibited subsidies as defined in the
Agreement. Article 11.9 also contains a de minimis provision which requires an investigation
to be terminated if the amount of a subsidy is less than 1 % ad valorem or where the volume
of subsidized imports or the injury is negligible. Under Article 15.5, in determining
material injury from subsidized imports, injuries caused by factors unrelated to the
subsidized imports cannot be attributed to the imports; a number of these extraneous
factors are enumerated in the Article. Under Article 21.3, duties must be terminated within
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five years of their imposition unless renewed following a review by the relevant domestic
agency prior to that date.

With respect to institutional arrangements, the Subsidies Committee constituted under
the Agreement shall establish a permanent Group of five Experts to prepare opinions on the
existence of prohibited subsidies and to provide advisory opinions to the Committee on the
existence and nature of any subsidy. The Group of Experts may be consulted by any
signatory and give advisory opinions on the nature of any subsidy proposed to be introduced
or currently maintained by that signatory, although such advisory opinions may not be
invoked in proceedings before the Committee itself (Article 24). The consolidated dispute
resolution mechanisms provided elsewhere in the Uruguay Round Agreement empower the
Committee to constitute panels to review subsidy complaints, including, importantly,
application by domestic agencies of Member States of domestic countervailing duty laws at
variance with the terms of the Agreement (for example, the application of the specificity
test).

Under Part VII of the Agreement, substantially enhanced notification and surveillance
procedures with respect to subsidies are instituted, requiring signatories to report annually
to the Committee the existence of subsidies (as defined by the Agreement), and to provide
substantial detail on the nature and effects of the subsidies. The Committee itself is required
to engage in regular surveillance of these notifications.

With respect to developing countries, Part VIII provides some partial exemptions from
the strictures in the Agreement. The provisions on prohibited subsidies do not apply to least
developed countries, and other developing country signatories are provided with an eight-
year grace period to bring themselves into compliance with the prohibited subsidy
provisions. The presumptive rules, providing when actionable subsidies shall be deemed to
result in serious prejudice (Article 6(1)), do not apply to developing countries with respect
to whom such prejudice must be demonstrated by positive evidence. With respect to
actionable subsidies, the dispute resolution process may not be invoked unless the subsidy
entails nullification or impairment of tariff concessions or other obligations under the GATT
in such a way as to displace or impede imports of like products into the market of the
subsidizing country or unless injury to the domestic industry in the importing market of a
signatory occurs as defined in the Agreement. Moreover, countervailing duty actions shall
not proceed if a domestic agency determines that the overall level of subsidy granted by a
developing country upon the product in question is 2% or less of its value calculated on a
per unit basis, and that the volume of the subsidized imports represents less than 4% of the
total imports for the like product in the importing signatory. This exemption from
countervailing duties only applies where developing countries collectively account for no
more than 9% of the total imports for the like product in the importing country. The
comparable de minimis rule in the case of subsides originating in developed countries is 1 %
ad valorem (Article 11.9). In the case of countries in the process of transformation from a
centrally-planned to a market economy, prohibited subsidies must be phased out within a
period of seven years from the date of entry into force of the Agreement. Subsidy
programmes involving forgiveness of government debt and grants to cover debt repayment
are not actionable for the same period under the dispute resolution processes of the
Agreement. With respect to other actionable subsidies, the provisions applicable to
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developing countries, which require nullification or impairment of tariff concessions or
other obligations under the GATT, are adopted (Article 29).

Apart from the Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement, the Tokyo Round Agreement on
Trade in Civil Aircraft and a 1992 Agreement between the EU and the US constrain
subsidies in the civil aircraft industry. A 1994 Agreement among some OECD members
also constrains subsidies in the civil shipbuilding and repair industry.

More recently, the Appellate Body of the WTO has considered issues relating to
countervailing duties in a dispute between the Philippines and Brazil over desic-cated
coconut.43 Here the dispute was really about when the 1995 WTO Agreement entered into
force, an issue central to the outcome of the case. The original panel had ruled that the
Article VI of GATT 1994 did not apply in the present case, as the dispute concerned
countervailing duties which were imposed before the WTO Agreement came into force.
The Philippines appealed this point, arguing that the WTO Agreement was a legal tool
available to them as soon as it entered into force. Brazil also appealed the decision of the
panel citing a deficiency in the terms of reference. The Appellate Body upheld the decision
of the panel on the first issue and therefore found it unnecessary to rule on the second
question regarding the terms of reference.44

Protectionism in government procurement45

Government procurement policies pose a problem closely related to that of potentially
trade-distorting subsidies. In most countries, the government is the largest single purchaser
in the economy. In common law jurisdictions (like Canada), the government’s procurement
contracts are usually governed, in principle, by the same contract law that applies to private
transactions.46 The process of government procurement is, however, unlike private
contracting in that governments often use their large purchasing power as a tool to promote
various domestic political, social, and economic policies. These purposes of government
procurement contracting lead to the adoption of a wide range of measures that qualify the
objective of obtaining the best product or service for the lowest price.47 The three most
common areas for domestic preference in government procurement are: (1) to protect
employment in declining industries; (2) to protect the supply of ‘strategic’ defence goods;
and (3) to support emerging domestic high-tech industries.

Domestic preference in government procurement contracting is usually expressed in the
form of either official domestic preference policies (overt discrimination against foreign
suppliers) or exclusionary tactics ‘hidden’ as something else (less visible forms of
discrimination).48 Overtly discriminatory tactics include:

1 Price differentials applied against foreign bids (whereby foreign bids may be accepted
only if the lowest domestic bid is more than a certain percentage higher than the
foreign one).49

2 ‘Discounts’ for the domestic content of the bid.
3 Selective sourcing policies (whereby only domestic firms are invited to bid).50

4 Set-asides of certain procurements to specific domestic sectors.
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5 Assignments of certain procurements for domestic industries only (for example,
defence spending).

6 Requiring foreign contractors to procure from the local market as a condition of the
award of the contract.

Less visible forms of discrimination include:

1 Selective tendering procedures, employed to (unofficially) exclude foreign
competition.

2 Manipulating the time and method of giving notice of tender solicitations to favour
domestic suppliers.

3 Short deadlines for submitting bids, which foreign suppliers are unable to meet.
4 Product or service standards which are only readily met by domestic producers.

The GATT Tokyo Round Code on Government Procurement

The GATT initially refrained almost completely from regulating government procurement
policies: paragraph 8(a) of Article III makes government procurement an exception to the
National Treatment obligation. However, this issue was re-exam-ined during the Tokyo
Round, and it was decided that the eventual elimination of discriminatory procurement
practices was desirable.51 The result of the ensuing negotiations was the Agreement on
Government Procurement (the Code), a pluri-lateral Agreement with about twenty
signatories.52

The Tokyo Round Code on Government Procurement sought to achieve greater
liberalization of government procurement through the establishment of an agreed
framework with respect to regulations, procedures and practices regarding government
procurement. The Code established the obligation of National Treatment, and also set out
detailed rules for transparent procurement procedures that were to be followed in order to
ensure that foreign suppliers indeed receive fair treatment.

The Code was, however, quite limited in scope and coverage. It only applied to
contracts of a value of SDR 130,000 or more53 (about US$ 170,000). Service contracts
were not covered at all by the Code,54 and Article VIII provides for other exceptions,
notably in the area of defence spending. As well, the Code only applied to government
agencies that ‘contributed’ to the Code, as listed in Annex 1:13; signatories excluded
numerous departments from this list. State or municipal governments were also not
covered by the Code.

The Code’s provisions for National Treatment also raised several difficulties. First, these
provisions were only available to suppliers from other signatories to the Agreement, thus
requiring rules of origin.55 Second, these principles did not exempt foreign suppliers from
customs duties. Third, Article V:15(b) allowed governments to continue to demand offset
industrial benefits (such as local content, licensing of technology, investment requirements,
counter-trade or similar requirements) from potential foreign suppliers as a condition for
awarding a contract.
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The key mechanism of the Code was a set of detailed and transparent tendering
procedures. The preferred procedure under the Code was the ‘open’ tender, in which a
notice of each proposed purchase (NPP) is published in the designated publications,
containing all of the information necessary for the timely submission of both foreign and
domestic bids.56 ‘Selective’ tendering procedures were also allowed, either by the use of
previously established lists of suppliers, or by a qualification requirement as a precondition
for the submission of bids; however, such lists and qualifications were required to be
published, and not to be used as a means of excluding foreign suppliers.57 More problematic
is the use of ‘single’ tendering procedures, where the government only considers tenders
from a single source. In order to control the protectionist abuse of single tendering, the
Code required a justification to be published in an appropriate publication (as defined by the
Code) in the event of a single tendering.58

The Code required that a contract shall be awarded to the lowest tender, or to the
tender which in terms of the specific evaluation criteria set forth in the NPP is determined
to be the most advantageous.59 The use of technical specifications to refuse the award to a
foreign firm, a common device used by governments to exclude foreign suppliers from
tender competition, was regulated under Article IV:2 (a). Technical specifications
prescribed by procurement entities should be in terms of performance rather than design,
and should also be based on international standards if possible.

The Code provided for a system of enforcement and dispute resolution. The emphasis
has been on the settlement of disputes between the states involved, rather than the granting
of a private right of action to an aggrieved supplier: mechanisms for the hearing of private
complaints were left to the discretion of the procuring agency.60 Between governments,
Article VII of the Code envisaged a three-stage complaints proceeding: first, bilateral
consultations would be held; second, if these produced no result, the Committee on
Government Procurement would mediate; and third, if mediation failed, the Committee
would constitute an ad hoc panel to make recommendations. Panel decisions were non-
binding, but the Committee could recommend the authorization of the suspension of the
application of the Code vis-à-vis the suppliers of the non-complying Party.61

Under these provisions in 1991, the United States challenged a procurement on the part
of the government of Norway for electronic toll collection for the city of Trondheim.62 The
United States contended that Norway had violated its obligations under the Agreement on
Government Procurement in choosing a Norwegian supplier of electronic equipment. The
dispute primarily centred around the fact that ‘the Government of Norway had single
tendered the equipment from a Norwegian supplier, excluding viable and eager competition
from a capable United States’.63 Norway justified this classification on the basis that it was a
research and development contract and thus excluded from the disciplines of the
Agreement. The panel found that a single tendering of this procurement could not be
justified in the present case and accepted the argument of the United States.

The Uruguay Round Government Procurement Agreement64

The Toyko Round Government Procurement Code was substantially revised during the
Uruguay Round negotiations in an attempt to address some of the difficulties in the Code’s
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operation.65 These revisions have the effect of harmonizing the GATT Code with the
NAFTA Agreement on government procurement (see below). There are four key areas of
change in the revised GATT Agreement: first, the scope and coverage of the Agreement has
been expanded to include service and construction contracts; second, entitites covered have
been extended beyond central government entities to subnational government entities and
to public enterprises (e.g. public utilities)66 third, contracting entities are no longer able to
demand offsets as a condition for the awarding of contracts;67 and fourth, the Parties are
now required to establish effective bid challenge procedures.68

The establishment of mandatory bid challenge procedures, by which aggrieved foreign
suppliers may challenge alleged breaches of the Agreement directly, is potentially the most
important change in the Uruguay Round Agreement. Under this requirement, each Party to
the Agreement will have to establish impartial review bodies to adjudicate procurement
disputes in a timely fashion. However, as noted in Article XX:7(c), the compensation
provided to the aggrieved supplier may be limited to the costs for tender preparation or
protest, a sum which may be insufficient to deter governments from effectively breaching
their obligations under the Agreement.

An important new aspect of the Uruguay Round Agreement is the expansion of the scope
and coverage of the Agreement to include ‘sub-central government’ (state, provincial and
municipal) entities and public enterprises as well as central government entities. Each Party
is responsible for listing in Appendix I all entities within its jurisdiction to be covered by the
Agreement, and each Party may withdraw one of the listed entities at will (subject to
objections from other Parties, which are to be resolved in accordance with the procedures
on consultations and dispute settlement contained in Article XXII). If major changes to the
existing structure are requested by one of the Parties, such as transfers of entities between
categories within Appendix I, the Committee on Government Procurement (established by
Article XXI) will consider the proposed change and determine if compensatory adjustments
are necessary,

Unfortunately, the Uruguay Round Government Procurement Agreement (GPA), like
its Tokyo Round predecessor, is a plurilateral, not multilateral Agreement (with 23
signatories), and did not undergo the important status change of most of the Tokyo Round
Codes, which have now been fully integrated into the GATT/WTO and bind all Member
States—presumably a testament to the influence of powerful domestic constituencies who
benefit from preferential government procurement. This raises complex questions as to
when a procuring government is entitled to discriminate between GPA and non-GPA
signatories in awarding contracts, given that the GPA contains no explicit exemption from
the general MFN obligation in the GATT. Also, even among GPA Members, numerous
derogations and the adoption of a reciprocity rule mean that signatories often deny access to
procurements by categories of entities to suppliers from certain GPA signatories or deny
access to procurement for certain classes of goods or services where other signatories have
not made reciprocal commitments in these same areas. Differential treatment both between
signatories and non-signatories and among signatories is likely to raise formidable
complexities in identifying the origins of goods or services and also has the potential for
creating significant trade diversion.69 Thus, the Agreement can only be counted as modest
progress towards liberalizing government procurement markets around the world.
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Government procurement under the Canada-US FTA

As a result of the limited coverage of the Tokyo Round Government Procurement Code,
many Canadian and US firms were still subject to the protectionist procurement policies of
each other’s governments. In the USA, these measures included the Buy American Act,
which required that only domestic supplies be purchased for public use, subject to an
exception for ‘unreasonably’ priced domestic alternative products. The American
government also protects domestic concerns through various ‘set-aside’ provisions, notably
to benefit businesses owned by ‘socially or economically disadvantaged individuals’, a
category which automatically excludes foreign suppliers.

The Canadian procurement policies are not regulated by statute, but rather by
administrative directives. The most important of these is the Canadian Content Premium
Policy, under which the Department of Supply and Services will apply a premium of 10%
of the difference in foreign content on competing bids in favour of sources with greater
Canadian content. As well, when the value of a procurement exceeds $2 million, the
‘procurement review mechanism’ is triggered, with the purpose of ensuring that the
awarding of the contract will achieve the ‘maximum benefit to Canada’.70 These
administrative directives are only in effect for government contracts not covered by
international agreements, but before the implementation of the FTA they were an important
method of ensuring domestic preferment for contracts not covered by the GATT Code.

The FTA represented an attempt to liberalize government procurement that was not
covered under the GATT Code from the effects of these domestic preference policies.
However, Chapter 13 of the FTA actually changed little from the Code.71 The most
important changes it made were: first, to lower the threshold of eligibility from SDR 130,
000 to $US25,000; second, to enable eligible Canadian goods to be treated like US goods
(including ‘Buy American’ differentials);72 and, third, the establishment of a requirement for
domestic procurement review, available to aggrieved suppliers.

In Canada, the Procurement Review Board was established to fulfil this obligation.
Governed by both the procedures of the GATT Code and the ‘expanded’ obligations under
Article 1305 of the FTA, the board has the authority to order the government to postpone
the awarding of a contract pending the completion of the board’s investigation.

Government procurement under NAFTA

NAFTA’s Chapter 10 provides for considerably wider coverage than either the Tokyo
Round Government Procurement Code or the FTA, both in terms of enti-ties and types of
contracts covered. Not only does NAFTA extend the improvements available under the
FTA to Mexico, it also extends coverage to many federal government agencies not covered
by either the FTA or the Code, although not to subnational levels of government.73 NAFTA
also closed some pre-viously-existing exclusions in the earlier agreements, such as
construction and service contracts (which are now covered) and the imposition by
procurement entities of offset requirements (which are now prohibited).74

Threshold values were, however, raised under NAFTA to $US50,000 (this provision,
however, applies only to Mexico: for Canada and the USA, the FTA threshold of $US25,
000 still applies). For the newly-covered area of construction services, the threshold has
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been set at $US6.5 million. For ‘government enterprises’, as opposed to federal
government entities, the thresholds are higher still: $US250,000 for goods and services, and
$US8 million for construction services.

One major problem with the NAFTA procurement rules lies in the area of tendering
procedures. Article 1009 of NAFTA allows more restrictive ‘qualification procedures’ than
the FTA, which may be used to exclude foreign tenders.

The process of liberalizing North American government procurement markets under
NAFTA is still far from complete. Under Article 1024, the Parties have agreed to
commence further negotiations no later than 1998, with a view to further liberalization of
their respective government procurement markets. Prior to that date, the Parties have
agreed to attempt to obtain the voluntary acceptance, by state and provincial government
entities, of the principles contained in this chap-ter. As well, the Parties have also agreed to
increase their obligations and coverage under this chapter to a level at least commensurate
with the final version of the Uruguay Round Agreement.

Procurement markets in the European Union

The European Union has attempted to regulate the domestic preferment policies of its
Member States with regard to government procurement through a series of coordination
directives. The legal effect of these directives is that aggrieved suppliers can, at least in
principle, invoke the provisions of the procurement directives directly in the national courts
of the Member States.

The original directives issued by the commission were the Public Works directive and
the Public Supplies directive.75 These directives were based on three main principles: first,
community-wide advertising of contracts, in order to give equal opportunity to firms from
all Member States; second, the banning of ‘discriminatory’ technical specifications; and
third, the use of objective and non-discriminatory criteria in tendering and award
procedures.

The major problems with these directives were their limited coverage (the so-called
‘excluded sectors’ included energy, water, transportation and telecommunications), and
their high value thresholds (after amendment, ECU 5,000,000 for the Works directive, and
ECU 130,000 for the Supplies directive). Another major problem lay in the excessive
discretion given to awarding entities to choose their tendering procedures.

Under the coordination directives, three different tendering procedures are allowed:
‘open’ and ‘restrictive’ competitive tendering, and non-competitive ‘negotiated’ tendering.
In ‘restrictive’ tendering, the awarding authority advertises its intention to receive requests
to participate in the tender for a specific contract; the authority may then choose the
applicants to whom invitations to submit tenders will be sent. This system can obviously be
abused, although amendments to the directives now curtail the awarding authorities’
discretion somewhat (requiring, for example, justification for the use of ‘restrictive’
tendering procedures under the supplies directive, and the publication of the reasons for
both winning and losing bids under the works directive). An additional opportunity for
abuse was created by the fact that non-competitive tendering was originally allowed in
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exceptional circumstances, although the Member State’s use of these exceptions was
required to be reported.76

Experience with the operation of the coordination directives soon demonstrated that
redress for aggrieved suppliers in the offending nation’s national courts was uneven. To
remedy this situation, the Review directive was implemented.77 This directive requires
members to provide effective domestic review procedures with the power to suspend the
awarding of contracts, to set aside awarding entities decisions, and to award damages to
aggrieved suppliers.

The Commission also made an attempt to apply the Union procurement rules to the
traditionally excluded utilities sectors by implementing the Utilities directive.78 This
directive applies both to public authorities and to private firms operating on the basis of
‘special or exclusive rights’ granted by a Member State (to avoid the public/private
distinction in the legal status of the entities involved). Due to the ‘special nature’ of the
concerned undertakings, awarding entities were allowed considerable discretion in their
choice of tendering procedures, and were in addition allowed to use an unspecified
‘qualification system’ to screen potential tenders.

The Commission, recognizing the special status of the ‘excluded sectors’, also adopted a
Utilities Review directive applicable only to the Utilities directive.79 Like the regular
Review directive, it requires Member States to provide effective review procedures in
relation to all decisions taken by their contracting entities. As an alternative to this
mandatory remedy, the Utilities Review directive adopted two voluntary procedures: the
attestation system, in which the awarding entity submits to systematic review by attestors
(independent and objective witnesses to the entity’s conformity with the requirements);
and the conciliation procedure, in which aggrieved bidders and contracting entities settle
their disputes through a non-liti-gious process of negotiation mediated by a Commission-
appointed conciliator. In general, these review procedures allow the Member States wide
discretion in determining what procedures they will follow.

DOMESTIC ADMINISTRATION OF COUNTERVAILING
DUTY LAWS80

Institutional context

Because the USA is almost the exclusive user of countervailing duty laws, it is important to
understand the institutions and methodologies it employs to administer those laws. Four
institutions are involved in the administration of US countervailing duty laws: the
International Trade Administration of the Department of Commerce (DC), the
International Trade Commission (ITC), the Court of International Trade (CIT) and the
review panels initially established under Chapter 19 of the Canada-USA Free Trade
Agreement (FTA) and now NAFTA.

The International Trade Administration is the branch of the DC responsible for the
enforcement of antidumping and countervailing duty laws. It is responsible for conducting
antidumping and countervailing duty investigations and has the authority to initiate
investigations.81 In countervailing duty cases the DC determines whether the products under
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investigation are being unlawfully subsidized, and if so, calculates the margin of
subsidization and the appropriate duties. Further responsibilities include conducting
administrative reviews of outstanding countervailing duty orders and ensuring that these
orders are properly administered by customs officials.

The ITC is the body responsible for establishing the existence of actual or threatened
material injury due to subsidized imports. The CIT is the American court with competence
to review determinations of the DC and ITC (and thereafter the Court of Appeals for the
Federal District). Under Chapter 19 of the FTA and NAFTA, binational panels are
appointed to hear disputes arising out of countervailing duty determinations between the
Parties to the Agreement.

Substantive law

In the USA, laws dealing with unfair foreign subsidization date back to the Tariff Act of
1897. Current US legislation is found in the Trade Agreements Act of 1979 which amended
the Tariff Act of 1930. In a countervailing duty action, two central questions must be
answered: Is the foreign producer who is selling into the domestic market receiving an
actionable subsidy from its home government? Are domestic producers of products like or
competitive with those being subsidized suffering or being threatened with material injury
as a result of the subsidized imports?

Subsidies

According to the Tariff Act, a countervailing duty will be imposed on imported goods when
it is found that the country is directly or indirectly subsidizing the manufacture, production,
or exportation of goods imported into the USA.82 The application of this provision depends
on the meaning given to the word ‘subsidy’. Defined broadly, the term could include
everything from the provision of basic infrastructure to government-financed education and
regional development programmes. Such a definition would effectively undermine liberal
trade since virtually every product would benefit from these kinds of government
assistance83 and hence could be subject to a countervailing duty. The US legislation begins
its definition in §1677 (5) by making clear that the term ‘subsidy’ has the same meaning as
the phrase ‘bounty or grant’ and includes but is not limited to export subsidies and
domestic subsidies.

Export subsidies

As reflected in Track I of the Tokyo Round Code and the definition of prohibited subsidies
in the Uruguay Round Agreement, export subsidies are considered the most objectionable
form of government assistance. An export subsidy can be defined as government
programmes or practices that increase the profitability of export sales without similarly
increasing the profitability of domestic sales.84 The US legislation has no explicit definition
of this concept, and instead refers in §1677 (5) (A) to the illustrative list of export subsidies
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found in the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code (largely reproduced in Annex I to the Uruguay
Round Agreement). Some examples of the enumerated practices are:

• the provision by governments of direct subsidies to a firm or an industry contingent
upon export performance;

• currency retention schemes or any similar practices that involve a bonus on exports; and
• internal transport and freight charges on export shipments provided or mandated by

governments, on terms more favourable than for domestic shipments.

The DC has the authority to find that practices not on the list are export subsi-dies.85 Even
with the benefit of the list, it is often difficult to identify export subsidies.86 Because export
subsidies will generally result in assessment of larger duties than would be applicable to
domestic subsidies, the determination of whether a subsidy is an export or domestic subsidy
is important.87

Domestic subsidies: the Specificity Test

International rules are more lenient with respect to subsidies not targeted specifically at
exports. The hostility to pure export subsidies probably reflects the view that most
legitimate domestic policy rationales for subsidies would not differentiate between
production intended for domestic consumption and production intended for export. In
addition, export subsidies raise concerns over the prospect of mutually destructive
international export subsidy wars. However, in the countervailing duty provisions of the
Tokyo and Uruguay Subsidies Codes there is no differentiation between domestic or export
subsidies. In the USA, practices that cannot be characterized as export subsidies are
countervailable if they fall within the definition of domestic subsidies in §1677 (5) of the
Tariff Act. Countervailable domestic subsidies are defined as subsidies targeted to a specific
enterprise or industry, or group of enterprises or industries. In addition, the subsidies must
provide some opportunity or advantage to the targeted producers that would not otherwise
be available to them in the marketplace.88 The wording of this definition has given rise to
the Specificity Test for the assessment of the countervailability of domestic subsidies. This
test has developed over time into one that investigates not only de jure but also de facto
specificity. Under this test, where either the purpose or the effect of a government
programme is to benefit a specific enterprise or industry, or group of enterprises or
industries, the DC will find that a countervailable benefit has been conferred. Included in this
definition are forms of assistance such as capital, loans or loan guarantees on terms
inconsistent with commercial considerations, goods or services at preferential rates, funds or
forgiven debts to cover operating losses, and the assumption of costs or expenses of
manufacture, production or distribution. 

In the early 1980s, there was a significant degree of controversy in the USA over whether
the specificity test should be retained in its current form.89 The CIT, on review of DC
decisions, also created some confusion on this issue. In Carlisle Tire and Rubber Co. v. United
States,90 the Court upheld the DC’s decision in favour of Korean exporters benefiting from a
generally available accelerated depreciation programme. The court found that in order for a
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countervailable domestic subsidy to exist, there must be evidence of a regional or industry
preference. However, subsequent cases suggest that this interpretation of the specificity test
no longer obtains. For example, in Cabot Corp. v. United States,91 the CIT held that the
specificity test upheld in Carlisle is not the correct legal standard to apply; it would
erroneously allow the recipients of subsidies purportedly of general availability to avoid
countervailing duties even though the subsidies in fact only benefit specific industries or
enterprises.

The Cabot decision resulted in a change in DC methodology. It led to the articulation of
the DC’s current approach: the three-pronged specificity test.92 The DC now proceeds
through a series of steps in its investigation before being satisfied that the subsidy in question
is not countervailable. First, a de jure limitation on the availability of a subsidy is sufficient to
find specificity. Second, if the subsidy is generally available but few enterprises actually use
the programme, or if there are disproportionate or dominant users, the DC will find de facto
specificity. Third, if a foreign government is exercising its discretion in such a manner that a
de jure generally available programme is de facto specifically targeted, the DC will again find
de facto specificity. This formulation of the specificity test has increased the DC’s discretion
and thus reduced predictability for exporters in countervailing duty cases. This definition of
specificity is largely adopted in the Uruguay Round Agreement definition of actionable
subsidies.

There are a number of noteworthy aspects of US countervailing duty laws.93 First,
countervailing duty actions cannot be taken against non-market economies,94 although given
the recent transformation of many of the former command economies, there is considerable
room for ambiguity as to which countries presently are non-market economies. Second,
subsidies indirectly received by an exporter, such as through a subsidized input source, can
be countervailable. However, if it is alleged that an indirect subsidy was received by a company
via a subsidy given to another company upstream,95 the DC will not assume that benefits
conferred by the subsidy are passed on to the second company.96 In cases entailing
allegations of these ‘upstream subsidies’, it must be shown that there is an indirect subsidy
before countervailing duties will be assessed. In addition, the upstream subsidy must confer
a competitive benefit on the goods under investigation and have a significant effect on their
cost of production.97 It is also not sufficient to show that a subsidy programme exists; the
specific product being investigated must have been subsidized.98 Benefits conferred by
private individuals may be countervailable if the evidence indicates that the benefit was
conferred at the request of the government.99 Finally, countervailing duty petitions or
orders cannot be suspended or overturned by the executive for political reasons.100 

Calculation of countervailing duties

According to Article 19.4 of the Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement: ‘No countervailing
duty shall be levied on any imported product in excess of the amount of subsidy found to exist,
calculated in terms of subsidization per unit of the subsidized product and exported
product’ Article 19.4 provides that it is desirable that the duty should be less than the total
amount of the subsidy if such lesser duty would be adequate to remove the injury to the
domestic industry and that procedures should be established which would allow domestic
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authorities to take account of representations by domestic interests, including consumers,
who may be adversely affected by the imposition of duties.

The task of the DC is to determine the amount of the countervailing duty required to
protect US producers from the injury created by the subsidy.101 In order to achieve this, the
value of the subsidy is measured with reference to the benefit conferred upon the targeted
industry rather than the cost of the subsidy to the government.102 However, the DC does
not evaluate the effect of the subsidy on the cost of production, quantities produced, or
prices charged by the foreign exporting firm. As a result it is not clear that the methodology
accurately captures competitively salient benefits to the firm. The subsidy may not result in
lower costs or higher production; it may, for example, result in greater inefficiency on the
part of the producer. Alternatively, the subsidy may have no effect on the costs of
production because of the nature of the subsidy. For example, if the grant is to pay for the
decommissioning of an old plant, there would be no effect on the marginal costs of
production of the firm.103

The net subsidy is found by making certain adjustments to the subsidy amount conferred.104

The countervailing duty is found by dividing the net subsidy by the total sales of the
company receiving the subsidy. If the government practice is found to be an export subsidy
then the countervailing duty is calculated by dividing the net subsidy by the total exports of
the company receiving the subsidy; since total sales will typically be greater than exports,
export subsidies will generally result in higher duties.105 The DC will not impose duties
against subsidies that are de minimis, comprising less than 0.5% of the ad valorem value of the
merchandise (increased to 1 % under Article 11.9 of the Uruguay Round Agreement).

Injury106

Prior to the Tokyo Round, US law on countervailing (and antidumping) duties did not
contain an injury requirement; both forms of duties could be applied without any showing of
harm to domestic firms from the foreign action. The purpose of an injury test is to ensure
that duties are only imposed in cases in which a causal nexus is found between the unfair
foreign practice and harm suffered by the domestic industry. The injury requirement
adopted in the Tokyo and Uruguay Round Subsidies Codes is the same as that in the
Antidumping Code and antidumping and countervailing duty cases are treated in the same
way by the ITC.107 The subsidized imports must cause material injury or a threat of
material injury to a domestic industry, or material retardation to the establishment of a
domestic industry. There are three components to the injury test: (1) the definition of
domestic industry; (2) evidence of material injury; and (3) a causal nexus between that
injury and the subsidized imports.

Domestic industry

The injury proceeding before the ITC requires that the ITC first define the relevant US
industry. The Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement defines ‘domestic industry’ as
‘domestic producers as a whole of the like product or those of them whose collective
output of the products constitute a major proportion of the total domestic production of
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those products’.108 The US legislation adopts a similar def-inition.109 Under the Uruguay
Round Subsidies Agreement, no investigation may be initiated if the domestic producers
expressly supporting the application account for less than 25% of total production of the
product by the domestic industry (Article 11.4). In special circumstances the ITC can divide
the industry into separate geographical markets if two conditions are met: (1) the
companies in that region must sell all or almost all of their output of the like product in the
geographical region; and (2) demand in that region must not be substantially supplied by US
producers outside of the region.110 As is the case with antidumping investigations, a narrow
construction of the relevant domestic industry can make a finding of injury more likely.

The ‘like product’ is defined as ‘a product which is like, or in the absence of like, most
similar in characteristics and uses with ‘the product under investigation’. In analysing a
complaint, the ITC must focus on the narrowest range of products that includes the like
product, but in many cases must investigate a broader industry due to the unavailability of
data. In addition, there may be more than one like product.112

Material injury

There is no precise definition in the Uruguay Round Agreement of ‘material injury’ but the
Agreement directs authorities to examine a number of specific factors such as changes in
output, prices, employment or profitability in the domestic industry.113 In the USA, most
cases focus on actual or threatened material injury, which is defined as harm that is not
‘inconsequential, immaterial or unimpor-tant’.114 The injury test requires an analysis of
domestic industry conditions. The factors typically considered by the ITC in this
determination are the volume of subsidized imports, their effect on domestic prices of like
products, and their impact on domestic producers of like products. In its evaluation of the
volume of imports, the ITC considers both the absolute level of imports at the time of the
proceeding and whether the level is increasing either relatively or absolutely.115 With
respect to the effect on prices, the ITC considers any evidence of undercutting and
determines whether there is any indication that the effect of the subsidization has been to
depress domestic prices.116 The presence of certain negative factors such as plant closures
or unprofitability will often be sufficient to convince the ITC that the injury test has been
satisfied. In other cases the ITC will compare certain economic variables to their levels in
previous years, inferring from a decline in such variables the presence of injury.117 Such
variables might include capacity utilization, employment, or return on equity. If these
factors do not provide the ITC with evidence of material injury, the investigation will be
terminated and no duties will be assessed against the exporters. The ITC’s investigations are
divided into a preliminary and a final phase. In the preliminary phase the ITC must
determine if there is a reasonable indication of injury. Inconclusive or incomplete evidence
related to the key elements may support an affirmative preliminary finding of injury but not
be adequate to support a final determination of injury. In both cases, the ITC must make its
determination on the basis of all the evidence before it.
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Causation118

There is no precise definition in the Uruguay Round Agreement of ‘cause’, beyond a list of
factors that may be examined,119 leaving the appropriate standard to the discretion of the
investigating authorities. The ITC looks for a causal nexus between the subsidization and the
effects on the domestic industry. Factors that are typically considered in this context are the
presence of underselling, evidence of lost sales, and import trends in the industry.120 There
are a number of weaknesses with this approach to causation. First, these three factors do
not define a test capable of resolution: ‘the test mixes analysis of trend information
unrelated to dumping or subsidization with analysis of the effects of dumped or subsidized
imports’121 and the US legislation does not ‘identify a method of integrating these factors
into a cogent analytical structure’.122 Moreover, the assumption that declining performance
alone is evidence of harm caused by imports does not account for other factors that affect
performance, or the possibility that the harm is due to import competition and not
subsidization. Thus, because the ITC methodology focuses on the imports rather than the
subsidization, an affirmative finding might result when the harm is caused by reason of
comparative advantages that the imported goods might possess. Finally, the three criteria
usually considered—evidence of under-selling or lost sales and import trends—do not
serve to identify clearly the relationship between the subsidization and the harm. For example,
evidence of lost sales suffered by the domestic industry only provides relevant causal
information if it can be shown that those sales were gained by the subsidized importers by
reason of the subsidization. At present the ITC does not evaluate the kind of evidence or
perform the kind of counterfactual that would justify a determination of causation.

Rights of appeal

The Court of International Trade (CIT) is the US Court vested with jurisdiction to review
ITC and DC rulings. In practice, the CIT has been highly deferential to these administrative
bodies. Underlying this disposition is the view that administrative bodies have extensive
expertise and therefore have comparative competence in those matters that fall within their
jurisdiction. The CIT typically requires that the agency determination be supported by
substantial evidence on the record.123 The CIT also normally requires that the ITC and DC
provide the reasons supporting their determination. However, if those reasons allow the
CIT ‘reasonably to discern the agency’s path,’ a decision of ‘less than ideal clarity’ will be
upheld.124

Chapter 19 of the FTA and NAFTA provides for the establishment of binational panels to
review final agency determinations.125 Either Party may request review by the binational
panel and its determinations are final except in extraordinary circumstances. These panels
have authority to determine that there has been either an error of law by the administrative
agency or that the evidence on the record was insufficient to support the decision at that
level. While a panel cannot overturn the administrative decision, its remanding of the
decision to the appropriate agency generally forces compliance due to political
repercussions that would result if no action were taken. Evidence to date suggests that the
binational panel review process has led to significant improvements in the level of rigour
required of the ITA and ITC in countervailing and antidumping duty determinations.126
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The complexities and opaqueness of US countervailing duty law are well-exem-plified in
a long-running trade dispute between Canada and the US over Canadian softwood lumber
exports to the US.127

Three separate countervailing duty investigations have been undertaken by US authorities
(in 1982, 1986 and 1991) following allegations by US softwood lumber producers that low
stumpage rates (royalties) charged by Canadian federal and provincial governments for
harvesting lumber on Crown lands constituted a coun-tervailable subsidy that was injuring
US softwood lumber producers. In the first case, the ITA found no countervailable subsidy
on the grounds that any subsidy was non-specific. In the two later cases, it reversed itself
and found a specific coun-tervailable subsidy and the ITC subsequently found material
injury. The material injury determination was the subject of three remands by binational
panels under the FTA. The subsidy determination was subject to two remands by binational
panels—the second a 3–2 decision on national lines which the US government then
challenged before an Extraordinary Challenge Committee of judges under the FTA, which also
split 2–1 on national lines. Congress later enacted legislation vindicating the basis of the US
agencies’ determinations, ending a 15-year saga driven by private parties’ ability to invoke
(and re-invoke) US countervailing duty laws. Issues that proved contentious in these
proceedings included: (a) whether Canadian stumpage rates were ‘too low’ so as to
constitute a subsidy—relative to what?—private stumpage rates in the US, Canadian
governments’ costs of maintaining Crown lands, costs of reforestation, government
stumpage rates in other countries; (b) whether, assuming a subsidy, the subsidy was specific
—the US petitioners claimed that it benefited principally two industries, solid wood
products, and pulp and paper products, while the Canadian defendants claimed that it
benefited 3,600 firms distributed across 27 industries (as defined by output); (c) whether,
even assuming a subsidy and that the subsidy was specific, the subsidy was a cause of any
injury that US softwood lumber producers could demonstrate was attributable to it; and (d)
what standard of review binational panels should apply to domestic agency determinations
in terms of degree of deference.

This unbecoming subsidies imbroglio yields several lessons: first, the intractability or
indeterminacy of many of the key elements in US countervailing duty law; second, the fact
that US new home buyers were the principal beneficiaries of cheaper Canadian lumber
imports almost entirely disappeared from view in the process; third, privately-driven trade
remedy litigation is open to serious risks of protectionist abuse; and fourth, it may be
appropriate to re-evaluate fundamentally the Chapter 19 binational dispute resolution
regime (despite its qualified successes) and remit subsidy disputes instead to state-to-state
dispute resolution before demonstrably neutral GATT/WTO panels (and the Appellate
Body) under the Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement.128

RATIONALES FOR COUNTERVAILING DUTY LAWS

Traditionally, the legitimacy of countervailing duty laws has depended on the
characterization of subsidies as harmful in some way and on evidence that offsetting
countervailing duties repair that harm. Advocates of countervailing duty laws offer two
main characterizations of subsidies that give rise to an argument in favour of countervailing
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duties. First, subsidies are often characterized as inefficient and as introducing economic
distortions into world trade. Second, subsidies are characterized as being unfair and
disturbing the ‘level playing field’ of international trade.

Efficiency rationales

The traditional argument for countervailing duties is that subsidies distort comparative
advantage and hence lead to the inefficient allocation of global economic resources. While
this may often be true, a plausible characterization of many subsidies is that they correct or
compensate for market imperfections or externalities that would otherwise exist, and thus
enhance efficient resource allocation.129 In many cases subsidies serve to produce ‘a more
efficient resource allocation, that is, resource allocation more consonant with the actual
production possibilities and consumer preferences than that yielded by wholly private
transactions’.130 The task of evaluating whether subsidies contribute to or derogate from
efficient resource allocation is daunting. According to Schwartz and Harper, the exercise is
at best highly indeterminate because of three factors: (a) the pervasiveness of externalities
which subsidies may help internalize; (b) what the authors rather opaquely call potential
private-public intersectorial economies, which embrace the collective validation of all kinds
of preferences that may not be adequately captured in private market transactions (e.g.
protection of national security, preserving the family farm and rural lifestyles, promoting
regional development, etc.); and (c) the possibility that a positive government benefit to a
firm may be designed to offset some other burden that has been imposed by government
(e.g. high minimum wage laws, stringent occupational health and safety requirements, plant
closing or environmental obligations).

Even if subsidies are truly distortive of international trade, the question that remains is
whether countervailing duty laws improve resource allocation. It is clear from the previous
section that the methodology currently used by US agencies in the calculation of subsidy
margins does not serve to determine accurately the duties needed to offset the effects of
trade distortions. Moreover, it has now been convincingly demonstrated131 that in almost
every conceivable set of circumstances, countervailing duties reduce domestic social welfare
in the importing country, where social welfare is defined as the maximization of producer,
consumer and government surplus. Gains to domestic producers from the higher prices
induced by the duties are offset by losses to consumers who remain in the market and pay
the higher prices, while some consumers who would have purchased the product are priced
out of the market and suffer welfare losses. Even accounting for the increase in government
surplus in terms of increased revenue from duties, consumer losses outweigh all gains,
leaving total welfare lower. Thus, however ambiguous the welfare effects of a subsidy
either in the country providing it or globally, there is nothing ambiguous about the welfare
effects of the subsidy in the importing country. This analysis suggests that rather than
condemning foreign subsidies, importing countries should send expressions of their
gratitude to the subsidizing country, noting only their regret that the subsidies are not
larger and timeless.

A further efficiency argument that is sometimes directed against subsidies is that
government support in the form of export subsidies is intended or at least serves to assist
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firms in practising predatory pricing. It is argued that subsidies may enable a firm to sell at a
lower price in the foreign market in order to eliminate competition and thereafter reap
monopoly profits.132 Predation nationally or internationally is a practice that unambiguously
lowers economic welfare. However, in the previous chapter on antidumping laws, we
argued that there is little theoretical or empirical basis for allegations of predation in
international trade. Moreover, current countervailing duty laws do not consider factors that
would support a claim of predation, such as industry concentration and barriers to entry. As
in the case of antidumping, concerns over predation (potentially a valid reason for the
prevention of some forms of subsidization) do not justify existing countervailing duty laws.

Fairness rationales

The level playing field rationale

Some advocates of countervailing duties argue that subsidies constitute unfair trade and
disturb the ‘level-playing field’ in international trade. Professor Robert Hudec, a
distinguished international trade law scholar, provides a useful taxonomy of many of the
unfair trade claims that presently enjoy wide currency.133 He draws a basic distinction
between what he calls offensive ‘unfairness’ and defensive ‘unfairness’. With respect to
offensive unfairness, the claim is often made that domestic policies adopted by governments
in exporters’ countries of origin provide them with unfair advantages in competing in
importing country markets or in third-country markets. With respect to defensive
unfairness, the claim is often made that a country has adopted domestic policies that unfairly
favour its own products and unfairly penalize foreign producers who wish to sell into this
country’s market.

In the case of countervailing duty laws, the complaint of offensive unfairness focuses on
the fact that foreign firms are able to out-compete domestic firms in the latter’s market as a
result of some artificial advantage that the foreign firms enjoy by virtue of government
subsidies or other benefits conferred on them in their country of origin. This unfairness
claim is difficult both to unravel and to con-tain.134 At one level, even in the case of an
explicit export subsidy, one can reasonably argue that, as suggested above, consumers in the
export market are better off as a result of the foreign subsidy and that it should be viewed as
a form of foreign aid that on balance increases the welfare of citizens in the importing
country. At another level, the claim of unfairness relating to foreign governments’ actions has
no natural limits to it. Unless one is prepared to adopt a laissez-faire baseline as one’s
normative reference point, and to view every government deviation from this baseline as a
form of unfairness where it has some impact on the pattern of international trade, one is
quickly forced to accept that almost everything that modern governments do is likely,
either directly or indirectly, to affect the pattern of economic activities within a country and
therefore, by extension, the pattern of international trade flows to which that country
contributes. For example, such basic activities of governments as investments in physical
infrastructure, e.g. roads and communication systems, investments in public education and
basic research, investments in law and order, investments in health care systems, etc. all
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shape in one way or another a country’s comparative advantages or disadvantages in
international trade.

According to liberal trade theory, only if differing productive conditions exist across
countries can gains be derived from international trade; countries will specialize in the
production of the goods that they can produce relatively cheaply, and purchase from
abroad, at lower cost, goods in which they have a comparative disadvantage. If all countries
were to have identical productive conditions, then no country would have a comparative
advantage in the production of any good and there would be no gains from trade. Thus, if
subsidies disturb the ‘level playing field’ they serve to increase potential gains from trade.135

It is at least arguable that differing subsidization policies across countries, like different
education levels or different tax structures, are simply one of the factors that contribute to
different productive conditions across countries. Moreover, it is to point out the obvious
that, given an assumption of scarce resources, a country that chooses to subsidize one set of
activities cannot subsidize another set of activities, which some of its trading partners may,
as a matter of domestic policy priorities, choose to subsidize instead.

In recent debates where these kinds of claims of offensive unfairness are made, three new
areas have emerged.136 First, it is sometimes argued that the quiescent state of Japanese
competition/antitrust law permits Japanese firms, through acquisition of dominant market
positions or through collusive arrangements in Japan, to garner supra-normal profits in the
Japanese market and to use these to fund subsequent aggressive export initiatives. Second,
it is widely claimed that lax environmental laws in many countries constitute a form of
implicit subsidy that confer on firms originating in these countries an artificial advantage in
export markets. Third, it is often argued that weak labour laws pertaining to such matters
as minimum wages, hours of work, child labour, workplace safety conditions, again operate
as implicit subsidies to firms located in countries with such policies and confer on them an
artificial advantage in export markets. In all three cases, the policy choices for governments
in importing countries are either to attempt to persuade or induce the country of origin to
harmonize its laws up to the standards prevailing in the importing country; or for the
importing country to harmonize its laws down to the level of those prevailing in the
exporting country; or to harmonize to some agreed intermediate solution; or to impose
unilaterally some border measure, like a countervailing duty, designed to neutralize
whatever artificial advantages are claimed to be associated with these domestic policy
differences.

As Bhagwati points out,137 fairness arguments can be pushed to almost any lengths:

If Bangladesh has a current comparative advantage in textiles, due to lower wages,
we no longer need to worry about being scolded as protectionists when we reject
imports of Bangladeshi textiles as unfair trade caused by her ‘pauper labour’. After
all, the low Bangladeshi wages are a result of inadequate population control policies
and of inefficient economic policies that inhibit investment and growth and hence a
rise in real wages. In like manner, if the United States continues to produce textiles,
which rely heavily on immigrant labor, often illegal, this is unfair trade, since
American immigration policy encourages this outcome, and therefore a Structural
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Impediments Initiative demand for changed immigration policy needs to be made
against the United States simply to ensure level playing fields.

This is not to argue that claims of unfairness have no role at all in international trade law.
Debates within the European Union over a Social Protocol and the negotiation of side
accords to the North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA) on labour and
environmental standards highlight the importance that these issues have assumed. Issues
pertaining to recognition or harmonization of domestic environmental, labour and
competition policies are pursued in later chapters. Rather, it must be emphasized that
economists, lawyers and other trade policy analysts now face an urgent task in introducing a
substantial measure of coherence and discipline into these fairness claims, both at the
theoretical and operational level, so that they can be contained within defensible bounds. We
return to this question in the concluding chapter of this book.

Unfair impact rationales

Even if there are no efficiency or fair trade rationales that justify countervailing duty laws,
there are possible arguments for countervailing duty laws that take account of the disruptive
impact of imports on vulnerable members of society. In particular, it may be that
distributive justice or communitarian values can be vindicated through the use of this form
of protectionism. On distributive justice grounds, countervailing duty laws might be
justifiable to the extent that they improve the lot of the least-advantaged members of
society.138 However, countervailing duty laws are not designed to address these concerns.
As was suggested in the previous section, the application of countervailing duties focuses on
factors ill-suited to uncovering any injury suffered by an industry as a result of foreign
subsidies and factors even less well-suited to discovering the impact on the least advantaged
stake-holders in these industries. In addition, as noted in the previous chapter on
antidumping, it is clear that in practice distributive justice concerns have not been addressed
through antidumping cases; it is unlikely that the evidence is any different for countervailing
duty cases. Moreover, there is no principled reason to treat some of the least advantaged as
more deserving of protection because the threat to their welfare derives from subsidized
imports rather than unsubsidized imports, domestic competition, or other internal factors.

Similarly, the vindication of communitarian values would require that policies be adopted
that prevent the disruption of long-standing communities. However, countervailing duty
laws are also poorly suited to the achievement of this end. Current formulations of the
injury test inquire into the adverse impacts on the domestic industry without investigating
whether these impacts are being sustained by dependent communities. Finally it must be
emphasized that, in general, protectionist trade remedies such as countervailing duties are
not the most appropriate policy instruments for vindicating these values. Instead, as we
argue in the next chapter, labour adjustment assistance programmes, or short-term
safeguard relief where appropriate, more directly and effectively address transition costs
suffered by workers. Such an approach would be a non-discriminatory means of dealing
with disruptive impacts of competition from any source on the most vulnerable members of
our society without excessively burdening consumers with the costs of trade protectionism.
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REFORMING SUBSIDY LAWS139

There are two basic problems with countervailing duty laws: their unilateral nature serves
to increase international trade frictions and perhaps protectionist tendencies; and they fail to
distinguish between subsidies that are distortionary and those that are benign, Reform of the
laws on subsidies must address both these concerns. There has been some debate in the
recent literature about whether reform proposals should focus on the theoretically
defensible or the politically feasible;140 the approaches that follow are grouped into regimes
that represent varying degrees of trade liberalization and, correspondingly, varying degrees
of political realism. 

The US cash-flow approach: the status quo

There are substantial problems with the current administration of countervailing duty laws
by the USA. In an exhaustive critique of current and proposed DC practices in the
administration of US countervailing duty law, Diamond concludes:

The rules promulgated and proposed cannot be squared with any known purpose
which countervailing duty law may serve. Surrogates are chosen which have no
conceivable relationship to the effect which the foreign subsidy has on the ability of
the foreign firm to compete. Internal inconsistencies arise when [DC’s] intuitive
grasp of competitive effects causes it to over-ride the cash-flow principle which it has
adopted. Conceptual lacunae arise where [DC] can find no answer to questions
regarding implementation and can only declare that the necessary economic and
financial principles do not exist.141

The thrust of Professor Diamond’s critique of current and proposed DC practices is as
follows: in determining the existence of a countervailable subsidy, and in determining the
appropriate level of the countervailing duty, the cash-flow or ben-efit-oriented approach
adopted by the DC fails to make consistent distinctions between benefits accruing to a
foreign firm from a subsidy and competitive benefits accruing from a subsidy. Under the cash-
flow or benefit-oriented approach, government action confers a countervailable subsidy on
a foreign firm whenever such action allows the foreign firm to receive something of value
which it would not have received in a free market. The difference which occurs in the
firm’s cash flow as a result of the subsidy is prima facie the benefit which a countervailing
duty will be set to neutralize by pro-rating the value gained by the company (and hence the
countervailing duty) over the amount of merchandise produced. As Diamond points out,
this approach generates all sorts of largely intractable difficulties. It does not distinguish
between subsidies that alter a firm’s production costs and those that do not—a subsidy to
decommission a plant and under-write adjustment costs for displaced workers or to clean
up environmental damage is treated in the same way as a wage subsidy or output-related
subsidy. In the case of foreign firms with multiple product lines, pro-rating capital subsidies
over product lines is arbitrary. Determining the amount of the subsidy in the case of equity
infusions or loans is also arbitrary, as is the allocation of the benefit over time (when the subsidy
may in fact be received upfront). The issue of causation is also problematic: is it the impact
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of foreign imports, which happen to be subsidized, on domestic producers that is central,
irrespective of the competitive significance of the subsidy, or is it the latter? But if the
latter, this requires a prior determination of the competitive significance of the subsidy,
which the cash-flow or benefit-oriented approach explicitly eschews. Diamond’s description
of the contortions of the DC over time in adopt-ing, rejecting, revising, and re-adopting
various rules of thumb to address these issues reflects the inherent arbitrariness and, in a
conceptual sense, futility of this exercise. 

The entitlement approach

As a more coherent alternative to the cash-flow or benefit-oriented approach, Diamond
develops an entitlement theory of countervailing duties,142 building on an approach initially
proposed by Goetz, Granet and Schwartz.143 The entitlement theory is premised on the
notion that US producers should be entitled to an outcome which limits the direct impact of
the subsidized firm in the US market to what it would have been had the government
subsidy not been available. This entails an analysis of the impact of subsidies on foreign
exporters’ marginal costs of production. If the subsidy reduces marginal costs, leading a firm
to equate marginal revenues and marginal costs at higher levels of output to increase its
sales in the USA at the expense of US producers, the latters’ entitlement to ‘fair
competition’ has been violated and countervailing duties are prima facie in order.

This entitlement theory differs from the cash-flow or benefit-oriented approach currently
taken by the DC because of its focus not simply on benefits conferred by governments on
foreign firms that export into the USA, but on competitively salient benefits. Thus, causation
and injury requirements would emphasize the extent to which subsidies that reduce the
marginal costs of imports cause injury to domestic firms by reducing their market share.
The entitlement theory also differs from the economic distortion approach, which would
target countervailing duties on foreign subsidies that distort the globally efficient allocation
of resources.

Diamond proposes the entitlement theory as some form of potentially coherent and
tractable middle ground between the cash-flow or benefit-oriented approach on the one
hand, which he views as incoherent, and the economic distortion theory on the other, which
he rejects as indeterminate. However, his approach is also problematic at the operational
level. The entitlement approach, given the central role it assigns to the impact of a subsidy
on foreign firms’ marginal costs of production and the causal linkage between this and
alleged injury to domestic producers, is highly data intensive, which is likely to exacerbate
problems of data manipulation and lack of transparency in decision-making. Measuring
marginal costs is a notoriously difficult exercise, exacting in its data demands and inherently
error-prone. Firms do not record their costs in this fashion, and so one would likely quickly
be driven to the concept of average variable costs as a compromise. Even then, in multi-
product firms, problems of joint cost allocation are likely to be pervasive. Moreover, the
counterfactual with which the subsidy-impacted marginal cost function of a foreign firm
must be compared is likely to be highly speculative. Is it the status quo ante of the firm before
the conferral of the subsidy, or alternative courses of action that the firm might have taken
to reduce its production costs in the absence of a subsidy?

210 SUBSIDIES AND COUNTERVAILING DUTIES



Problems well known in antitrust law and public utility regulation144 suggest that in the
countervailing duty context these difficulties would be even more pronounced. Here one is
dealing with foreign firms, typically more than one, each with its own cost functions. Nor do
the problems stop with estimating marginal cost functions for foreign firms. Even where
subsidies are found to reduce the marginal costs of production of foreign firms with respect
to exports into the USA, it will still be necessary to address causation and injury issues, and
then to determine the correct level of duty. Diamond suggests that injury will largely be a
function of the elasticity of domestic demand for the product: the more elastic the demand
the less the injury. But again we know from antitrust experience in defining relevant
product and geographic markets that these elasticities are often highly speculative. Even in
cases where domestic demand is relatively inelastic so that increased sales by subsidized foreign
exporters prima facie will erode the market shares of domestic producers, it is easy to
envisage cases where loss of market share would occur absent the subsidy.145 Thus, again, a
counterfactual which is necessarily highly conjectural is required not only at the foreign firms’
end of the process, but also at the domestic end of the process. Moreover, these
comparisons presumably cannot be excessively static, but once a duty is imposed would
require constant review in the light of changing circumstances over time at either end of the
process. Finally, should foreign firms be able to argue that the subsidies they have received
are wholly or partially offset by subsidies received by domestic producers, and that only the
net subsidy advantage should qualify as a countervailable subsidy? Goetz, Granet and
Schwartz are frank enough to acknowledge these complexities:

Admittedly, the neutralization approach would often be difficult to implement
because of the empirical issues that it implicates… Experience with this approach
might well yield useful generalizations so that ‘rules of thumb’ could, in some
situations, effectively replace detailed case-by-case enquiry. This is not to suggest
that coherent implementation of the protectionist rationale will ever be anything but
a very costly and error-prone process… Facing the implications of mandating this
approach may also lead some legislators to become less certain of the desirability of
implementing the protectionist [entitlement] rationale. It is no doubt clear by now
that this is a result which would not be uncongenial to us.146

Taxonomizing subsidies

In the Tokyo Round, no agreement was reached regarding the classification of domestic
(non-export) subsidies as acceptable or unacceptable (countervailable). Thus, an approach
that has been pursued in the Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement is to spell out more
definitively the different categories of subsidies. Under a first-best regime, our preference
would be to abandon this approach. The development of a three-way taxonomy of subsidies
as benign (‘white’), prohibited (‘black’), and ambiguous (‘grey’) is, in many respects,
problematic. First, conventional understanding has it that pure export subsidies are the
most objectionable and trade-distorting forms of subsidies and provide the strongest case
for both international and domestic countervailing sanctions.147 This understanding is
reflected in the Tokyo and Uruguay Rounds Subsidies Codes. It may be that such subsidies
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represent a foolish misallocation of resources by the subsidizing state—in effect giving away
its goods to foreigners below cost—and may distort the efficient global allocation of
resources by squeezing out more efficient third-country producers from the importing
country’s market, who should perhaps be entitled to make a claim for nullification or
impairment under Article XXIII of the GATT. However, in terms of its own economic
welfare, the importing country has no grounds for objection. The general economic case for
countervailing duties in the case of pure export subsidies is as tenuous as the general
economic case against dumping.148 While we recognize the broader international risk of
‘Prisoners’ Dilemma’ type export subsidy wars, negotiated reductions of, or restrictions
on, such subsidies in given contexts, as reflected in the Uruguay Round Agreement on
Agriculture, the Tokyo Round Code on Trade in Civil Aircraft, and the OECD Agreement
on civil shipbuilding and repair seem an appropriate response to this problem. We also
recognize that pure export subsidies will typically be harder to justify in terms of non-trade-
related domestic policy objectives, most of which can be better served by subsidies or other
policy instruments that are not targeted exclusively on exports, but again it is not clear why
this should be of concern to the importing country.

Similarly, generally available subsidies under the Uruguay Round Agreement are not seen
as trade distorting with respect to either imports or exports, presumably because they do
not disproportionately influence the price of particular categories of goods. However, this
view reflects a rather static conception of comparative advantage; most modern
international trade theorists believe comparative advantage is a dynamic concept and is not
entirely exogenously determined.149 Clearly, many developed countries owe a significant
part of their international comparative advantage to social investments in health, education,
law and order, basic research and physical infrastructure. It may be the case that generally
available subsidies are more benign than selective subsidies because they are less likely to be
the product of rent seeking by special interest groups. It may also be the case that generally
available subsidies are reflected more fully in exchange rate adjustments than selective or
targeted subsidies. But in an international environment, where exchange rates are
determined increasingly by international capital flows rather than goods flows, it is not clear
how robust this assumption is, or when one can be confident that generally available
subsidies have induced appropriate exchange rate adjustments while more selective
subsidies have not.

Finally, in the context of countervailing duty law, there remain selective domestic
subsidies with export spillovers. In this case, the economic analysis is the same as that for
the case of pure export subsidies: the importing country receives lower priced goods and
increases its welfare. To the extent that such subsidies squeeze out a third-country’s
exports, then the third country should, as in the case of pure export subsidies, have a right
to bring a nullification and impairment claim before a GATT dispute resolution panel.

A first-best alternative to countervailing duty law:
negotiated reciprocity

The preceding analysis illustrates the normative incoherence as well as the technical
difficulties associated with current and proposed countervailing duty laws. Our first-best
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reform proposal would be to abandon the attempt to develop a taxonomy of subsidies and
to admit that ‘unfair’ subsidies are a largely incoherent idea. The protectionist tendencies that
drive countervailing duty actions should be disciplined by being subjected to the strictures of
a revamped Article XIX on Safeguards. To advocate the replacement of ‘unfair’ trade
remedy laws with a comprehensive safeguards regime is not to deny that global economic
welfare might be enhanced by the reduction of government subsidies to industry. Rather it
is the case for countervailing duties that makes no sense, not the case for reducing some
subsidies. Although it has been suggested that the appropriate use of countervail may
actually lead to a reduction in the use of subsidies, there is little empirical evidence to
suggest that the imposition or threat of contingent protection actually alters states’ domestic
policies.150

However, the GATT may have an appropriate role to play in facilitating agreement
among states to reduce subsidies. The GATT is more likely to achieve success, not through
a ban of some supposedly pernicious subclass of subsidies enforceable through unilateral
retaliation, but through facilitating negotiation of mutually advantageous concessions among
the Contracting Parties. It is through negotiated reciprocity that the GATT has achieved its
greatest success—the dramatic reduction in tariffs which were never classified as
prohibited, actionable, or non-actionable. The enhanced notification and surveillance
procedures in the Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement may indeed facilitate such an
approach to disciplining subsidies.

When subsidy wars threaten a tragedy of the commons, mutual agreement to halt or
constrain subsidization in a particular sector may be possible. In comparison, tariff
reductions did not occur because trading states suddenly recognized the cogency of the
economic arguments that tariffs distort global allocative efficiency. Similarly, the focus
regarding subsidies should be on facilitating, through the GATT, Pareto-superior bargains,
where subsidies are reduced reciprocally, or ‘traded’ against removal of other trade
restrictions.

A particularly forceful case for mutual reduction of subsidies exists where several states
are sustaining excess capacity in declining industries through constantly increasing
subsidization or are competing with each other in granting locational inducements to attract
new plants. At some point, the cost of matching the increases of every other state’s subsidy
becomes a negative sum game, thereby making negotiated restraints attractive. Such
restraints might, for example, involve an agreement to focus subsidy policies on orderly
reduction of capacity through severance pay settlements to older workers, other public
assistance for worker retraining and relocation, or regional subsidies to create jobs in other
sectors in the region concerned.

Although there are quite broad prohibitions on subsidies in the Treaty of Rome, from the
beginning the European Commission has not viewed the prohibitions on State Aid as
reflecting a laissez-faire paradigm of non-intervention in markets.151 Article 92 of the Treaty
of Rome prohibits ‘any aid granted by a Member State… which distorts competition’ by
favouring certain enterprises, provided that an effect on trade be demonstrated. The
Commission only began to intervene actively in the aid policies of Member States during the
sectoral crises of the 1970s and early 1980s when Union producers were faced with excess
capacity in a variety of sensitive sectors such as steel, autos, and textiles. In this context,
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subsidization appeared as a beggar-thy-neighbour attempt by each subsidizing country to
maximize its share of a declining world market for Community production as a whole. The
subsidizing countries then externalized onto other member countries the adjustment costs of
sectoral decline. Political norms of interstate cooperation, and the ‘race to the bottom’
effects of intra-Union subsidies wars, justified intervention. The intervention occurred
without the Commission having to decide on an appropriate normative base-line for
government intervention in mixed economies, i.e. how much intervention is compatible
with free competition, or the laissez-faire ideal. Moreover, in many cases, the Commission’s
response was to accept readjustment of the aid in question with a view to restructuring and
reducing capacity. The latter was aimed at alleviating the crisis of surplus capacity within
the Union as a whole.152 Finally, the Commission has taken a positive view of subsidies
aimed at development of new environmentally safer production processes, as well as
development of disadvantaged regions (as the Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement now
does). Nevertheless, the Commission has insisted on justification of the specific measures in
question, and has not sustained measures to prop up fail-ing firms just because they
happened to be located in underdeveloped regions. Instead, the Commission has sought
evidence that the aid in question will contribute to long-term development of the local
economy. Backed by technical expertise and capacity for on-going monitoring and scrutiny
of government policies, the Commission has been able to engage in a fruitful (although
occasionally tense) dialogue with aid-granting Member States about the relationship
between means and ends, in which the broader social goals behind government intervention
have been accepted at the outset as legitimate, as well as the principle that one Member
State should not impose on another the costs of attaining those goals within its own borders.
The Union jurisprudence on subsidies has, therefore, a much less laissez-faire tone than that
of US domestic trade tribunals applying American countervailing-duty law, which presume
the illegitimacy of any foreign subsidy that is not generally available.

Following the EU experience, the GATT/WTO requires better institutional machinery
for negotiation and supervision of these kinds of subsidy regimes. However, creating an
institutional framework to facilitate such regimes is a more appropriate task for the GATT/
WTO than the elusive search for a universal taxonomy of good and bad subsidies. A
transparency agency operating under the aegis of the GATT, now to an important extent
contemplated in the detailed notification and surveillance mechanisms of the Uruguay
Round Subsidies Agreement (Articles 25 and 26), could also play a positive role by
monitoring subsidy policies and calculating subsidies in tariff equivalents, or effective rates
of protection, thus providing a kind of common bargaining currency. For instance, in the
steel sector, the USA might agree to remove some existing voluntary export restraints or
contingent protection actions in return for EU commitments to use subsidies to reduce,
rather than sustain, excess capacity. Clearly, in order to make such commitments plausible,
some kind of independent surveillance mechanism is required to conduct verifications and
ensure against flagrant cheating. Current GATT machinery is not designed to handle this
verification function but were such machinery developed (perhaps through the new World
Trade Organization) we might see more agreements that address domestic subsidies. Thus,
the reduction of subsidies should be treated as has tariff-cutting in previous GATT rounds:
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the aim should be periodic global welfare enhancing bargains based on a broad balance of
concessions (negotiated reciprocity).

Second-best reforms

It must be acknowledged that at least in the short run it is unlikely that the first-best
solution of removing all a priori general constraints on subsidies and leaving their reduction
to negotiated reciprocity in particular contexts would be acceptable to the USA. The
second-best solution accepts the general taxonormic approach embodied in the Uruguay
Round Subsidies Agreement. However, on our preferred approach,153 the regime would
consist primarily of Track II, and unilateral application of countervailing duties (Track I)
would be restricted to a narrow class of prohibited pure export subsidies perhaps defined as
subsidies where at least 80% of the output of subsidized foreign firms is exported, provided
that the subsidies are competitively salient subsidies (as discussed above with respect to the
entitlement approach). Track II would be the exclusive avenue of recourse for addressing
actionable subsidies; no remedy of any kind would be available in the case of non-actionable
subsidies. If a subsidy has some trade effects, but is also serving legitimate non-trade related
domestic policy goals, remedial action should only be taken following investigation by a
multilateral panel. The panel would determine whether the subsidy is objectionable and the
Committee of Signatories to the Subsidies Agreement would mandate appropriate remedial
or retaliatory action. In formulating the standards to be applied by subsidies panels, the
experience of review panels established under Chapter 18 of the FTA may be helpful.154 In
cases involving disagreements about the legitimacy of government policies that influence
trade, the panels have adopted a least restrictive means test. For example, in the case, In the
Matter of Canada’s Landing Requirement for Pacific Coast Salmon and Herring (1989), it was
argued that a Canadian requirement that all catches of these fish be landed in Canada before
processing was an essential component of resource conservation which was exempted by
Article XX(g) from the GATT prohibition on export restrictions under Article IX.155

However, because the objectives of the policy could have been achieved through sampling
and other monitoring requirements less restrictive of trade, the policy was not sustained by
the panel.

The paradigmatic formulation of the least restrictive means test is found in the case law
under section 1 of the Canadian Charter of Rights and Freedoms.156 In order for a limit on a
Charter right to be sustained, the limit must have a valid objective, and the means chosen to
reach that objective must be rationally connected to the objective and must be the least
restrictive means, or the means that impairs minimally the right in question. This approach
should be adopted to deal with the indeterminate class of reviewable (actionable) subsidies:
if a subsidy is causing serious prejudice to other countries (in the sense employed in the
Uruguay Round Subsidies Agreement) in any of the three subsidy scenarios outlined at the
outset of this chapter (subsidized exports by A to B; subsidized exports by A to G,
displacing B’s exports to C; subsidized domestic production by A displacing B’s imports),
but is nevertheless rationally connected to a legitimate non-trade related policy objective
(such as those previously set out in Article 11 of the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code), and is
the least trade-restrictive policy instrument available to achieve that objective it should be
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sustained, but not otherwise. This test should encourage governments to seek out domestic
policy instruments that will minimize trade distortions.

In summary, we envision that an international subsidies regime could feasibly aspire to
define a category of subsidies that are immune from challenge either mul-tilaterally or
unilaterally, along the lines of ‘non-actionable subsidies’ in the Uruguay Round Subsidies
Agreement, and another category of subsidies (principally subsidies that are de jure or de
facto pure export subsidies) that are per se objectionable both multilaterally and unilaterally.
For the wide array of intermediate subsidies that do not fall into either of these two
categories, we envisage only a multilateral complaints route, with panels applying a least
trade-restrictive means test, and an adverse determination by a Subsidies panel being
required before retaliation can be undertaken. Invocation of domestic countervailing duty
regimes would not be possible unless and until such a determination had been made.157 This
would largely place all three subsidy scenarios on the same legal footing, subject to the same
substantive disciplines and the same multilateral review process. This proposed approach
also recognizes the complex welfare judgments entailed in evaluating the economic effects of
subsidies and is respectful of the domestic sovereignty of Member States to pursue a wide
range of non-trade related domestic policy objectives of their choosing without risking
unilateral punitive measures from other countries with divergent perspectives on the
wisdom of those policies, while at the same time constraining subsidy policies that are
gratuitously or disproportionately trade distorting. 
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9
Safeguard regimes and domestic adjustment

policies

THE GATT SAFEGUARD REGIME

Introduction

Article XIX of the GATT is widely known as the Escape Clause or Safeguard Provision. It
allows a GATT signatory in certain circumstances to avoid GATT obligations that cause
serious injury to domestic industries of a product like, or competitive with, one whose
importation is increasing.1 When the increase in imports is caused by unforeseen
developments and prior GATT obligations, a Contracting Party can modify or withdraw the
relevant trade concessions. Measures taken under Article XIX are intended to be temporary,
lasting only long enough to prevent or remedy the injury, and applied in a non-
discriminatory way to all Parties exporting the product. Finally, they can only be
undertaken when Parties with substantial interests have been consulted and agree to the
import restraint or receive proper compensation.2 A new Agreement on Safeguards was
negotiated during the Uruguay Round and is discussed throughout this chapter.

As of May 1993, 152 safeguard actions under Article XIX had been notified to the GATT.
As with antidumping, over 80% of the actions were taken by four main users: Australia, the
USA, Canada, and the EC. Almost a third of the measures have been imposed since the
conclusion of the Tokyo Round in 1979. Over this period, the EC has invoked Article XIX
18 times (of which 13 involved processed foodstuffs) and the USA 4 times.3 Compared with
other trade remedies, safeguard actions are infrequently initiated: from 1979 to 1988, 1,
833 antidump-ing actions and 429 countervailing actions were initiated,4 while in 1988,
261 export restraint arrangements (ERAs)—typically bilaterally negotiated restrictions on
exports—were known to be in existence.5 The predominance of antidumping and
countervailing actions may seem surprising since they respond to ‘unfair’ forms of trade and
would seem to carry a heavier burden of proof. Moreover, the number of ERAs is striking
and disconcerting; these actions are not legal under the GATT,6 but have been the preferred
form of safeguard action. Because they are often unofficial, secret and discriminatory, ERAs
are a serious threat to the integrity of the GATT multilateral trade regime, specifically
undermining the integrity of the safeguard regime. 



History and background

Article XIX is a direct derivative of the escape clause found in the 1943 Reciprocal Trade
Agreement between the USA and Mexico.7 Prior to 1943, escape clauses to protect against
specific risks had been contemplated by trade agreements, but never a general escape
clause.8 Then in 1947, responding to concerns in Congress over impending GATT trade
liberalization, a US executive order required that all trade agreements entered into by the
USA include a general escape clause similar to the one found in the Reciprocal Trade
Agreement.

Among the Contracting Parties, there was general agreement during the initial GATT
negotiations that an escape clause was desirable, but there was some controversy about its
scope.9 The rationale for the inclusion of a safeguard provision was twofold:10 to encourage
greater trade liberalization, and to increase the trade regime’s flexibility. The goal of the
GATT was to remove all trade barriers except customs duties (tariffs), and then to reduce
these duties through successive, binding multilateral negotiations. Safeguards were believed
to be necessary to protect against unforeseen economic difficulties that might result from
liberalization. It was thought that with the existence of a form of relief from obligations in
extreme circumstances, countries would be more likely to agree to broad reductions in
trade barriers in the first place. Second, it was believed that the flexibility provided by
safeguards would increase the long-term stability of the system. If nations were able to
protect their import-sensitive industries temporarily within the GATT regime then they
would be less likely to abandon the multilateral system in favour of protectionism or some
more discriminatory trading system.

Substantive requirements

The escape clause agreed upon in 1947 is ‘extraordinarily oblique, even for GATT
language’,11 resulting in difficulty in interpretation and uncertainty in application.12 Very
few rules define the required procedure for invocation of the safeguard. The safeguard user
must notify the Contracting Parties and afford those with a substantial interest an
opportunity for consultation with respect to the proposed action. A striking feature of the
regime is that the importing country is responsible for the substantive determinations, and
while notification to the GATT is mandatory there is no requirement of surveillance or
external confirmation. The lack of international involvement encourages informal, secret
negotiation since exporters feel their interests are inadequately protected by the formal
mechanism. In addition, actions that are taken under Article XIX must be taken by the
executive branch of the government of the Contracting Party and are thus political, not
administrative actions like antidumping and countervailing duty actions. The need for
executive approval forces an invoking government to justify the action to its constituents
and to foreign governments. In addition, it may be difficult if the action is prompted by a
genuine emergency to explain why it is necessary to pay compensation in terms of offsetting
tariff concessions. By creating greater political costs, the safeguard regime creates incentives
to substitute relief through less accountable mechanisms like ERAs. 
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Increased imports

According to Article XIX, the importing country must show that the imports in question
are increasing, either relatively13 or absolutely, due to unforeseen developments and GATT
obligations. While integral to the invocation of the safeguard provision, neither of the two
causative factors is defined in the Article. The increased importation of the product must be
affected by GATT obligations, but the kind of obligation is uncertain. The Article includes
more than simply tariff concessions—a large proportion of the actions involve quantitative
restrictions but there is a debate over whether the Most Favoured Nation (MFN) clause is
applicable. Some argue that the MFN requirement of the GATT may be the obligation
causing the injury,14 and so Parties should be able to restrain imports on a selective basis—
by suspending MFN treatment. However, others insist that it is unlikely that the MFN
obligation is responsible for the increased imports.15 Leaving aside the MFN issue, this
requirement is easily satisfied if all the safeguard user has to show is that but for GATT
obligations, protective measures would have been taken to prevent the increase in imports;
there is little evidence that this clause is more strictly construed.16

The second causality requirement is that the increased imports be caused by ‘unforeseen
developments’. This criterion is the least onerous aspect of the safeguard clause. Indeed,
according to some, interpretation has rendered this requirement a virtual nullity.17 In the
Hatter’s Fur Case in 1951, the USA alleged that imports of Czechoslovakian hatter’s fur were
causing injury to domestic producers. The change in the preferred style of women’s hats
was declared sufficiently ‘unforeseen’ to justify an Article XIX action; this conclusion was
supported by a GATT report on the case.18 Such interpretations suggest that almost
anything can be considered an unforeseen development:

Any increase in imports, even if through normal changes in international
competitiveness, could therefore be considered actionable under Article XIX.19

Serious injury

The increased imports must cause or threaten serious injury to domestic producers of like
or directly competitive products. There are three ambiguities in this requirement: (1) what
is needed to establish causation? (2) what constitutes serious injury? and (3) what qualifies as
a like or competitive product? First, serious injury is different from material injury (the
requirement for antidumping and countervailing actions) but whether it requires proof of
more or less harm than material injury has not been established. Second, the range of
producers that can be protected by a safeguard action are more diverse than those
contemplated by an antidumping action, extending to producers of competitive as well as
like products. But what kinds of competitive products are eligible for protection remains
unsettled. What has been established, in the Hatter’s Fur Case, is that the Party
invoking safeguard protection is entitled to the benefit of the doubt that serious injury has
been sustained or is threatened.
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Remedy and compensation

The GATT obligation that is causing or threatening the injury can be suspended or modified
‘to the extent and for such a time as may be necessary to prevent or remedy such injury’.
Some Contracting Parties, particularly the EU, have argued that GATT obligations can be
suspended selectively so that the concession is only withdrawn with respect to the particular
trading nations who are causing the injury. This argument is inconsistent with the Article
XIX interpretation developed during the Havana Charter negotiations,20 and with the
GATT’s apparent historical insistence on nondiscriminatory application of safeguard
actions.21 However, the right to restrain imports selectively has been at the centre of
debates over the reform of the safeguard clause and contributes to the greater attractiveness
of ERAs and other trade remedies like antidumping and countervailing duties, all of which are
selective.

The safeguard remedy seems designed for temporary relief but no precise requirements
are specified under Article XIX in this respect. Before taking action the Contracting Party
must consult with the Parties substantially affected to try to obtain agreement on the need
for such action. Ultimately, the safeguard provision can be invoked without agreement from
trading partners but, according to Article XIX(3), if the restrained Parties are dissatisfied
with the action they have the right to suspend concessions of substantially equivalent value
or other obligations. This aspect of the safeguard regime has been interpreted as establishing
a right to compensation. Compensation usually takes the form of other trade concessions by
the Party invoking the safeguard relief and requires negotiations between the injured
country and all exporting countries. Owing to the generally low level of tariffs, it is
becoming increasingly difficult for countries to compensate with equivalent concessions;
few tariffs are high enough for meaningful reductions except for products which are already
sensitive to imports.22 Thus, the requirement is often politically difficult to meet and it
increases pressure to find alternative escape routes. Sykes argues that the compensation
requirement reduces the likelihood that the safeguard provision will be used
inappropriately.23 However, it also reduces the chance that it will be used at all, as
countries instead negotiate ERAs or invoke other trade remedies.

Other escape clauses

Article XIX is not the only provision of the GATT that allows signatories to suspend their
obligations. Articles XII and XVIII(b) permit the imposition of import controls to relieve
temporary balance-of-payments pressures and economic development problems of less-
developed countries. In addition, Article XXVIII provides for the renegotiation of
concessions during specified renewal periods. 

Outside of the GATT there is a further safeguard regime worthy of note: Chapter 8 of
NAFTA, which slightly adapts Chapter 11 of the Canada-US Free Trade Agreement
(FTA).24 It differs from the GATT clause in a number of important ways. First, bilateral
emergency actions are only permissible within the ten-year transition period.25 Second,
these actions have several features distinguishing them from those allowed under the
GATT: they must be limited to three years; there is no right to renew; the increase in
imports causing the serious injury has to be absolute, so if the import’s share of the market
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increases due, for example, to a decline in purchases of domestic goods no action can be
taken; the increase in imports must constitute a substantial cause of serious injury the only
actions permitted under the clause are tariffs, which may be only raised to the lesser of the
MFN rate applicable when action is taken or the MFN rate applicable at the time NAFTA
came into force.26 In addition, in order to address the problem of ‘side-swiping’, the
Chapter provides for exemption of member countries from the impact of actions taken by
another member country under the GATT multilateral safeguard regime unless their
imports account for a substantial share of total imports or are contributing importantly to
the serious injury. This shall not normally be considered the case if a Party is not among the
top five suppliers of the good in question. As under Article XIX of the GATT, there are
notification and consultation requirements and an obligation to provide compensation or
risk retaliation.

Theoretical rationales for the safeguard regime

Trade liberalization

In 1970 Kenneth Dam observed that ‘the GATT escape clause is a useful safety valve for
protectionist pressures’.27 In his view, the clause, in addition to being a prerequisite for
essential US participation, encouraged trade liberalization more generally. According to
Dam, the GATT escape clause ‘encourages cautious countries to enter into a greater
number of tariff bindings than would otherwise be the case’.28 Sykes develops this
observation into the primary rationale for a safeguard regime.29 His thesis is not unlike the
traditional argument for the inclusion in the GATT of a safeguard regime: that broader
liberalization will be undertaken when there is an opportunity to suspend those obligations.
His approach is novel in its use of public choice theory to explain the role of this trade
remedy.

Public choice theory predicts that policy-makers will be more concerned about trade
impacts on producers than on consumers because the former are both better organized and
more influential than the latter. According to Sykes, the consequence of the self-interested
behaviour of policy-makers is that they may not liberalize trade even if the current
environment is favourable to such an action. Their reluctance will result from knowledge
that unanticipated changes in economic conditions may create circumstances in which
political rewards to an increase in protection (or the political costs of an irrevocable
commitment to reduce protection) are great.30 

The safeguard is therefore essential to any liberalizing scheme. This conclusion depends
on two important and challengeable assumptions: that adequate substitutes do not exist for
the formal safeguard regime, and that signatories feel bound by their obligations and will
generally not wish to abrogate them.31 In Sykes’ view, the ex ante nature of the safeguard
regime implies that it is different from bilateral negotiations over ERAs which occur ex post.
The increased use of grey-area and other contingent measures to avoid obligations,
combined with the infrequent use of Article XIX, challenges both these assumptions. By
modelling Article XIX, Sykes shows how the criteria for invoking the safeguard serve to
maximize political gains from protection. In addition, he argues that requirements such as
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compensation reduce illicit use of the escape clause. The optimal safeguard regime would
constrain protection to cases in which the gains to the importing country are greater than
any losses to other countries (typically where the importing country’s domestic industry is
declining, entailing job displacement, etc., while foreign suppliers may be expanding
industries where restraints will merely curtail future growth).

Economic adjustment

Jackson advances an economic adjustment rationale for safeguards:

Imports, particularly recently increasing imports, often cause harm to select groups
within an importing society, even though they may in the long term and in the
broader aggregate increase the welfare of that society. Competing firms will be
forced to ‘adjust’ to the imports…a temporary period of time of some relief from
imports will allow the domestic competing industry to take the necessary adjustment
measures.32

This rationale can be reformulated in different terms: the safeguard remedy provides an
opportunity for domestic industries to improve their competitiveness with imports.
Hufbauer and Rosen have studied the effectiveness of various programmes for facilitating
adjustment of US industries being impacted by import competition. Their study focuses on
three trade policies: special trade protection, such as exceptional restraints on imports that
go well beyond normal border or tariff restrictions; trade-related adjustment assistance to
labour in affected industries; and escape clause relief.33 Hufbauer and Rosen find that
among the various policies, the escape clause is the most effective at inducing adjustment. Of
the sixteen industries studied ten received tariff increases, two obtained orderly marketing
arrangements, and the other four received quota protection. The adjustment of these firms
was relatively successful since twelve no longer required protection:34 one of these adjusted
by expanding; the rest contracted either to a competitive core or out of the industry. The
relative success of escape clause relief results from three factors: the relief is temporary,
which gives firms a strong incentive to adjust quickly; labour adjustment programmes in the
USA are inadequate and incapable of effectively inducing or easing adjustment; and the
escape clause in the USA is administered by the International Trade Commission and while
the President authorizes the granting of relief, the primary mechanism is not political
lobbying as it is for special forms of trade protection.

The adjustment rationale does not, standing alone, support a role for safeguards. Its
inadequacy stems from the distinction that it draws between competitive impacts from
imports and from domestic sources. If there are social gains to be realized from facilitating
adjustment to economic changes why should not all firms experiencing competitive
pressures from whatever source receive such assistance? The answer is clearly that in
competition within domestic industries there are at least two sets of domestic producer
interests, differently affected, whereas foreign firms causing harm to domestic industries do
not have any political ‘allies’. There are few real political losses to be suffered from harming
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a foreign industry so that there are incentives to provide adjustment assistance to domestic
firms suffering from import competition through safeguard relief.

Non-economic rationales

There may be important non-economic rationales for the protection offered by the
safeguard regime. Despite the efficiency gains to be achieved through trade liberalization,
substantial losses resulting from unconstrained imports may justify protection of domestic
interests. Vulnerable domestic interests may include less well-endowed and immobile
workers and long-established communities whose viability substantially depends on
domestic industries that are facing contraction or collapse due to import competition.
Distributive justice and communitarian values would require sensitivity to these vulnerable
interests and justify policy initiatives to alleviate adverse impacts.

However, trade protection is a very costly way to vindicate these values. The cost to
consumers for each job saved by trade protection typically far outweighs the average
compensation per worker in the industry affected.35 To cite some examples, the cost to US
consumers of protection of the specialty steel industry was $1 million per year for each job
preserved when the annual compensation was less than $60,000 for those jobs. United
States consumers of automobiles paid $160,000 per year for each job saved through
protection when annual compensation in this industry was less than one quarter of this
figure.36 In Canada, the statistics are similar: consumers of footwear were ‘taxed’ through
trade protection between $53,668 and $69,460 per job saved, while compensation per year
for a worker in the industry was $7,145; consumers of textile and clothing were ‘taxed’
between $40,600 and $50,982 per year for each job saved when average earnings were $10,
000; and consumers of automobiles paid between $179,000 and $226,394 per year for each
job saved when average compensation in the industry was between $29,000 and $35,000.37

Given the substantial cost to domestic consumers of trade restrictions, it is likely that other
policy instruments can vindicate distributive justice and communitarian values at lower
cost. 

Reforming safeguard laws

As noted earlier, the frequency of the use of safeguard protection has been low.38 To some,
this evidence suggests that the safeguard regime is an effective part of a liberal regime: it
encourages broad liberalization without leading to substantial avoidance of obligations.39 On
this view, the principal challenge may be to make the regime stricter so that it contributes
more positively toward greater trade liberalization. However, this optimistic conclusion
requires the drawing of an artificial distinction between Article XIX actions and grey-area
measures such as ERAs. The distinction is drawn by Sykes on the grounds that if ex post
negotiations of import restraints were a perfect substitute for the safeguard regime then
there would be no need to have a formal regime at all; the very existence of Article XIX
shows that ex post negotiation is not a substitute for the safeguard regime. However, his
view is inconsistent with the marked tendency of countries to negotiate ERAs in response to
injurious import competition rather than resort to Article XIX.40
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Thus, the challenge for reform of the safeguard regime is a substantial one. On the one
hand it is necessary to restore the relevance of the safeguard regime by making it more
attractive than alternative escape actions such as ERAs.41 This can be accomplished by
relaxing the criteria for invocation of the safeguard regime and bringing grey-area measures
within the ambit of the GATT. On the other hand, if the regime is excessively relaxed then
it will no longer serve to lower the overall levels of trade protection. Thus, the challenge is
to balance these two objectives: to encourage the use of the safeguard regime rather than
illicit substitutes, but to maintain its positive, trade liberalizing influence.

Selectivity

The issue of selectivity in the application of safeguard remedies has been central to ongoing
debates over reform of the GATT safeguard regime. In 1947, there seemed to be consensus
on the importance of the application of safeguard remedies to all exporters on a non-
discriminatory basis. This position seems to have been confirmed in subsequent GATT
practice.42 According to Bronckers,43 the principle of non-discrimination in the context of
Article XIX of the GATT serves two principal purposes. First, it promotes economic
efficiency by minimizing the trade distortions associated with safeguard remedies. It
achieves this purpose by imposing a common burden on all exporters of the product found
to be causing serious injury to domestic producers. By not unduly burdening the most
efficient exporter with trade restrictions, distortions in the global allocation of resources are
minimized. Moreover, second-order distortionary effects such as trade diversion to
unconstrained third countries are avoided. Second, it is argued that the principle of non-
discrimination increases the number of adversely affected exporting countries, and their
combined pressures against the initial invocation of safeguard relief or for the removal of
existing safeguard measures or for the granting of compensation operates as a deterrent
against unwarranted or abusive exercise of the safeguard remedy. These pressures
coincidentally protect weaker or smaller exporting countries who might otherwise be
singled out for trade restrictions, whether their exports were or were not the principal
cause of injury to domestic producers in an importing country, and for whom demands for
compensation or the threat of retaliation may not be viewed as credible.

Despite these arguments for non-discrimination in the application of Article XIX, there
have been recurrent demands, particularly from some developed countries, for selective
application of import restraints under the safeguard regime. The case for selectivity was
first advanced when Japan acceded to the GATT in 1955. Some Contracting Parties took
the view that applying restraints against all exporters when Japanese exports were
principally causing the harm in question would lead to a destructive, overall increase in
trade protectionism. No change was made in the regime at that time, leaving the issue
unresolved. The case for selectivity can be shortly stated.44 First, if it is appropriate to
provide an exceptional form of relief to countries suffering serious injury from imports,
obviously the most effective form of relief will target the principal source of the imports,
rather than adopting a shotgun approach that restrains imports from all sources, whether or
not they are contributing importantly to the injury in question. Second, the increasing
invocation of ‘unfair’ trade remedy regimes, particularly antidumping and countervailing
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duty regimes, which impose duties selectively on particular sources of imports, and the
proliferation of various forms of ‘voluntary’ export restraints, which also impose restrictions
on imports by country of origin, implies a high degree of substitutability amongst these
various trade remedies. This suggests the futility of insisting on a principle of non-
discrimination under Article XIX.

It was clear prior to the Tokyo Round negotiations that countries were reluctant to use
the safeguard regime because it disrupted the trade of nations that was not causing significant
harm, and required complex negotiations and corapensation schemes. Instead, nations were
concluding ‘voluntary’ ERAs with the main sources of disruptive imports. This practice
mainly disadvantages NICs and developing countries who are vulnerable to pressure from
the larger economies; they agree to these arrangements in order to avoid more adverse
impacts that might result from resort to unilateral formal remedies. There are also benefits
to exporters from ERAs, especially the opportunity to reap monopoly rents from the
artificial scarci-ties induced by quotas, although this does not imply that they are necessarily
supported by exporting countries. There was a strong desire on the part of developing
countries to strengthen the GATT Safeguard regime, making grounds for invocation clearer
and stricter. Knowing what alternatives they faced in formal mechanisms, they would then
have greater bargaining power in bilateral negotiations. Essential to their view of the regime
was the incorporation of safeguards, and alternative escape actions, into a system of
nondiscriminatory application. To relax the discipline of Article XIX was thought likely to
encourage, rather than constrain the incidence of bilateral, managed trade arrangements,
which are antithetical to the founding premises of the multilateral system. An opposing view
was taken by the EU which advocated the right to apply Article XIX selectively. Selectivity
was believed necessary to enhance stability in international trade. As Winham observes: 

[D]eveloping countries are less well served by stability than by rapid changes in
traditional trading patterns…the effort to negotiate selective safeguards was
motivated by a desire to force developing-country exporters to adjust to a pace of
change that would not create dislocation in competing industries in the developed
countries.45

When safeguard negotiations began in 1978, near the end of the Tokyo Round, selectivity
was the focus of discussions but the developing countries and the EU could not reach
agreement.46 Developing countries were prepared to compromise on the issue of selectivity
in exchange for multilateral surveillance. This compromise was reflected in the Secretariat
Draft of April 1979, which specified that in cases where serious injury would result from
unusual (not just unforeseen) circumstances, restraints could be taken selectively, either
with the agreement of the exporting country or with the approval of a proposed
international safeguard committee. This compromise was acceptable to Canada, the USA,
Japan, and developing countries,47 but the EU was unable to accept such a system of
review: the administration of international trade laws in the EU is not very transparent, and
because of the competing interests in the Union public scrutiny may have caused political
difficulties. The right to make determinations of injury without being monitored by an
international agency became an issue of economic sovereignty and put an end to any chances
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of agreement. Ultimately, the only decision made at the Tokyo Round was that a
committee should meet to try to elaborate supplementary rules and procedures to provide
‘greater uniformity and certainty’48 in implementing the Safeguard Clause. Following the
negotiations, the committee collected data on safeguard use and met to discuss problems of
reform but no further progress was made toward a common approach to the matter.49

Developing countries, while committed to the issue of nondiscrimination, were willing
to compromise if selectivity was combined with other reforms advantageous to them. The
two major adjuncts to selectivity are surveillance and clearer criteria for invocation. One
such package that Wolff recommends would entrench very specific criteria for selective
restrictions, aimed at ensuring that the exporter being targeted is really the principal cause
of the injury and does not suffer excessive prejudice from the selective treatment.50 In
addition to the requirement that the supplying countries involved have increased their
market share, the products of these countries must ‘differ in terms of quantities, prices, or
kind from other imports not being restricted so that these products can reasonably be
determined to be the cause of the serious injury or threat thereof’.51 Further, other
countries’ imports must not be injurious and if a substantial advantage in terms of
acquisition of market share is being conferred on unrestricted suppliers there should be a
mechanism for the targeted suppliers to seek redress. Wolff’ ‘s reforms would also include
a provision for multilateral surveillance. This approach to selectivity is consistent with the
multilateral emergency provisions in the Canada—US Free Trade Agreement and now
NAFTA, in which exports that are ‘not contributing importantly to the serious injury’ are
exempted from restraints.

The Uruguay Round Agreement on Safeguards resolves the issue of selectivity as follows:
Under Article 5, safeguard measures shall be applied to a product being imported
irrespective of its source. Under Article 9, where a quota is employed, if agreement
amongst all affected Parties on the allocation of the shares of the quota is not feasible, shares
shall be allocated amongst exporters based on proportions of imports supplied during a
previous representative period. This rule may be departed from where: (a) imports from
certain Parties have increased disproportionately to the total increase in imports; (b) the
reasons for the departure are justified; and (c) the conditions of the departure are equitable
to all suppliers. Such a departure may not exceed four years in duration. In the case of
developing countries, safeguard measures may not be applied against their exports if in the
case of a given country exports do not exceed 3% of all imports of the product in question,
provided that developing countries with less than a 3% import share collectively do not
account for more than 9% of total imports (Article 19).

Injury

While the ultimate stumbling block to agreement on a new safeguards regime in the Tokyo
Round negotiations was the issue of selectivity, the determination of injury was also
controversial. The definition of injury in Article XIX is very imprecise and there was
disagreement on the appropriate test to adopt. Because of the conflict over selectivity, the
issue was not resolved. Approaches to the question vary dramatically. Some advocate a
substantial loosening of the criteria for invocation combined with a reduction in the number
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and scope of measures available.52 One improvement in this area would be to make
safeguard protection on proof of injury available to industries as of right, like protection
from dumping, rather than a matter of political discretion. Others advocate a tightening of
the requirements.53 Ways of achieving such a tightening vary. One possible system would
have two tiers: governments could negotiate agreements with other states undertaking to
satisfy stricter criteria before invoking safeguard relief and in return be relieved of the
obligation to pay compensation; those without such agreements would follow the less
restrictive criteria and pay normal compensation.54

Another proposal contemplates that an industry should only be protected if injury is
being suffered by ‘less-endowed and immobile workers or long-estab-lished and dependent
communities’.55 This injury test is more attractive than the status quo because the cost of
protection borne by consumers would be balanced against the gains by another vulnerable
group ‘able to make normatively defensible claims not vulnerable to a utilitarian social
welfare calculus’.56 In addition, the concept of worker and community interests as the only
legitimate interests justifying protection suggests a link between revenues from
protectionist measures and adjustment programmes which these revenues can help finance.
Along with the altered injury requirement could also be a condition that the country
invoking safeguard relief show that there are no less drastic (less trade distortive) policy
instruments available to vindicate these values.

The injury test adopted in the Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement is a modest
improvement over the ambiguities of Article XIX. Serious injury is defined in Article 6 as ‘a
significant overall impairment in the position of the domestic industry’. The factors to be
considered in this determination are specified: rate and amount of the increase in imports in
absolute and relative terms, the share of the domestic market taken by increased imports,
changes in the level of sales, production, productivity, capacity utilization, profits and
losses, and employment. However, the need for GATT obligations and unforeseen
developments to cause the increase in imports appears to have been removed or at least
rendered marginal; as long as there is an increase in imports that is causing injury, relief is
available.

Surveillance

While the developing countries were prepared to compromise on selectivity, the Tokyo
Round negotiations ultimately foundered on the issue of multilateral surveillance. The
Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement now provides for a Safeguards Committee which
will monitor the implementation of the Agreement and compliance with its procedural and
substantive requirements by Contracting Parties. All decisions to initiate or implement
safeguard actions must be notified to the Committee, along with evidence justifying the
measures. The Committee will also oversee the phasing out of grey-area measures and
report as appropriate to the Contracting Parties through the Council for Trade in Goods on
the operation of the Agreements. The general dispute resolution mechanisms of the GATT
will apply to the new Agreement (Article 38).
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Compensation

One of the problems with the Article XIX regime is the obligation of Parties to pay
compensation for invoking safeguard protection. As Tumlir states:

[I]t is destructive of the spirit of reciprocity for a country in an emergency to be
obliged to pay for taking bonafide temporary action, to negotiate such a payment and
to be threatened with retaliation if it does not offer enough.57

In addition to the fact that the compensation requirement forces concessions for bona fide
emergency actions, the requirement increases the burden of the safeguard regime and the
attractiveness of alternative escape routes. Rather than negotiate with a number of
exporters over the appropriate compensation for all or face retaliation, a country will find it
more attractive to conclude a bilateral arrangement. However, supporters of the
compensation requirement, like Sykes, insist that it discourages use of the regime in non-
emergencies or in circumstances in which the gains are insufficient to justify the real costs.
The Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement retains the obligation to compensate, but if the
escape measure lasts less than three years the right of exporters to suspend concessions of
equivalent value is withheld (Article 18), thus reducing their leverage in demanding
compensation. 

Duration

One of the most significant aspects of the Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement is the
introduction of provisions for limited duration and digressivity of relief. The Agreement
specifies that no action shall be maintained for longer than four years (Article 19). It may be
extended for up to an additional four years if there is evidence that the industry is adjusting
and the protection is shown still to be necessary to remedy serious injury (Articles 11 and
12). Any measure of more than a year in duration must be progressively liberalized so that
the amount of protection decreases over the duration of the measure (Article 13). In
addition, there are limits on the application of new restrictions to a product that has already
been subject to restraint: effectively, no new measure can be introduced for a period of
time equal to that during which the previous measure was in effect (Article 14). There is
some risk that being aware of the need to progressively remove the restraint, Parties will
impose initially tighter restraints than are necessary. The surveillance of the GATT
Safeguards Committee is designed to discourage any such overprotection.

Grey-area measures

As noted at the outset of this chapter, the integrity of the safeguard regime has been
undermined by measures taken outside the framework of the GATT. The obvious solution
would be to bring these other measures into the system and then restrict their use or ban
them. Some fear that to legalize other trade measures would be to encourage their use.58

Some proposals for reform have suggested that the other contingent trade remedies be
subject to some of the same criteria for invocation. This harmonization would imply, for

228 SAFEGUARDS AND ADJUSTMENT POLICIES



example, that the kind of injury required to sustain antidumping measures would be
similar, in order to prevent domestic producer interests from attempting to substitute one
form of contingent protection for another.59

The Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement makes substantial progress in constraining
grey-area measures as follows: Article 22 provides that a Contracting Party shall not seek,
take or maintain such arrangements nor encourage or support the adoption or maintenance
by public and private enterprises of equivalent nongovernmental measures. In addition,
those currently in existence shall be brought into conformity with the Safeguards Agreement
or be phased out within four years of the coming into force of the Agreement, with an
exception permitted for one specific measure per Contracting Party subject to review and
acceptance by the Safeguards Committee and subject to termination not later than 31
December 1999.

Conclusion

In many respects, the Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement is a substantial improvement
over Article XIX of the GATT: in bringing existing grey-area measures within its purview
and prohibiting further such measures; in establishing firm time limits; in achieving a
compromise on the issue of selectivity; and in improving multilateral notification and
surveillance. There are a number of other reforms that should be considered in future.
First, some relaxation of the principle of non-discrimination seems justified in order to
avoid pointless ‘side-swiping’ of exporters who are not contributing importantly to the
serious injury in question. Here, a de minimis provision along the lines of that to be found in
NAFTA would seem appropriate. Second, a radical reconceptualization of the injury test
also seems appropriate, so that while firms or industries may be able to petition for
safeguard relief, the success of such petitions should depend on a showing that imports are
causing serious injury to less well-endowed and immobile workers or long-established
communities, and that alternate remedies less distortive of trade are not available, in the
form of various domestic adjustment assistance policies, to redress such injury. Third, the
only forms that safeguard relief should be permitted to take should be either tariffs or
auctioned quotas, in part because these two forms of relief render the cost to domestic
consumers more transparent, and more impor-tantly, because they generate a source of
revenue out of which domestic assistance policies can be financed. Fourth, safeguard relief
should be available as a matter of administrative rather than political decision (like
antidumping and countervailing duties), so that incentives to substitute away from the
safeguard regime are reduced.

DOMESTIC ADJUSTMENT ASSISTANCE POLICIES

Each of the major industrialized nations has adopted its own policy approaches to the
challenge of economic adjustment, including adjustment to trade liberalization and shifts in
comparative advantage. We have reviewed these policies extensively elsewhere.60 We
confine ourselves to some brief comments on one class of such policies—industrial subsidies

THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE 229



—and offer a somewhat more extended set of comments on labour market adjustment
policies.

Industrial subsidies

In many industrialized countries, beginning in the early 1970s, sectors like shipbuilding, coal,
steel, textiles, clothing and footwear, and in some cases, automobiles, experienced substantial
competitive pressures from imports. Apart from trade restrictions, countries under import
pressure often had resort to various kinds of industrial subsidies. In general, these subsidy
policies have not been effective in avoiding the ultimate need for adjustment or moderating
its severity. Pure output related subsidies have been the least effective in this respect in that
they flatly deny the need for adjustment, and while they maintain output and employment
in an industry this typically can only be sustained if the subsidies are endless and often
increasing. Other forms of industrial subsidies have been designed to facilitate the
modernization of obsolete capital. Here it is argued that state assistance to facilitate capital
modernization may be necessary to make a distressed industry internationally competitive
again. However, obsolete plants are often the result, and not the cause, of the loss of
international competitiveness. Firms which are only able to cover variable costs are
constrained to allow their fixed assets to run down and with them their long-term capacity.
If an adequate return could be made on new fixed assets, presumably private capital
markets would provide the funds required to make the investment. A governmental
judgment that such an investment will yield long-run competitiveness and profitability will
typically be at variance with these private capital market judgments and should, for this
reason, be viewed with extreme scepticism.

Much less frequently, industrial subsidies have been provided to ease exit costs. Japan has
most prominently invoked industrial subsidies for this purpose in industries like coal mining
and steel. It is argued in this context that if there is some degree of indivisibility in plant or
firm size so that efficient industry adjustment to a decline in demand requires that firms exit
in some orderly temporal sequence, market forces may not produce this sequence. A case
may thus arise, so it is argued, for a governmental role in managing adjustment to the
contraction in demand, perhaps through recession cartels, active promotion of mergers, or
compensation for scrapping physical capacity. While Japanese policies seem to have
registered some successes in this context, there are reasons for caution in assigning a
proactive role to government in facilitating firm exit. First, this view assumes that
governments can economize on transaction costs in this context in ways not open to private
firms, through mergers, specialization agreements, and other means. Also, there are clear
dangers of bureaucratic involvement in detailed industrial restructuring in terms of relative
institutional competence, and also dangers of fostering anti-competitive forms of collusion
in seeking agreement on future industry structure.

More generally, the normative case for subsidies to firms in import-impacted sectors is
weak. Firms may be able to diversify away the risk of increased import competition through
their investment strategies. More importantly, shareholders in these firms can diversify
away this risk through portfolio diversification. This risk is no more serious or
unforeseeable than many of the risks which firms and shareholders routinely assume, e.g.
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technological change, shifts in consumer demand, which they are prepared to bear for an
appropriate risk-adjusted return.

Labour market adjustment policies

The case for active labour market adjustment policies is substantially more compelling.
Under conditions of close to full employment, there would be little reason to be concerned
about the dislocation effects of trade liberalization. The market, in effect, would soon
reabsorb the dislocated workers, although even here, from a number of ethical
perspectives, it might be appropriate for governments to bear some of the transition costs
faced by these workers.

If, more realistically, we assume that re-employment is likely to be far from automatic,
then the question arises as to what measures are required to facilitate it. The concept of
adjustment is complex. At one level, the adjustment problem may be understood as the
time lag between a worker being displaced from one job and finding another that is an
adequate replacement. From this perspective, provision of temporary income support and
search, counselling, and relocation assistance would seem obvious and appropriate to
address the problem.

However, the fact that employment is being created primarily in sectors other than those
where jobs are being lost raises serious questions about the adequacy of the unemployment
insurance model. It may be necessary to go far beyond this model, and provide training and
retraining of workers for new types of employment within the economy. This is well-
expressed in the Canadian de Grandpré Report, which contrasts the trampoline approach
(which emphasizes training and retraining), with the unemployment insurance model (the
‘safety net’ approach).61 The report suggests:

The ‘trampoline’ approach seeks to prepare Canadian workers to prosper in a world
of increasing technological change and international competition, in which Canada
must use its access to the larger North American market to achieve greater economies
of scale and higher productivity.62

In terms of economic efficiency (i.e. allocative efficiency), it may seem unclear why either
income support or a trampoline ought to be provided by the state to trade-dislocated
workers. Kaplow, for example, has argued strongly that from an efficiency perspective
compensation for regulatory change (of which trade liberalization is one example) makes no
sense absent convincing proof that markets are incapable of allocating the risks of such
changes.63

In fact, however, there are certain inherent limits to the efficient private ex ante allocation
of the risk of job loss from trade liberalization. It is very difficult to make sound ex ante
predictions as to the nature and extent of these risks.64 As a consequence, although worker
self-insurance through personal savings undoubtedly exists, such savings are very likely to
be too high or too low, given lack of good information about risk. With respect to private
insurance, one simply does not observe such markets. Their absence cannot be explained by
the presence of basic public unemployment insurance in most industrial democracies, since
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it is unclear why a market for supplemental benefits would not exist. After all, public
insurance benefits cover only a portion of income loss and in some countries only for
relatively short periods of time. An additional explanation for the absence of such private
insurance would be the arguably quite severe moral hazard problems involved. Full
insurance of the risk of dislocation due to trade liberalization would very likely lead some
workers and firms to take greater risks, or to underinvest in precautions against the risks in
question (e.g. skill diversification). It should be emphasized that these possible market
failures do not suggest that government will be any better at ex ante allocation of risks of job
loss from trade. However, the absence of viable private insurance markets may argue for
government intervention based upon the desirability of the existence of insurance that
would otherwise not be provided, a desirability to be established on independent normative
grounds.

A further possibility would be contractual allocation of risk between employer and
employee through bargaining of notice periods in the event of dislocation. While such
notice periods are the subject of contractual bargaining in some subset of cases, there is
empirical evidence that the existence and nature of such provisions are very poorly
correlated to the actual risk of dislocation in the industry and region in question.65 This
suggests that serious information failures may plague ex ante allocation of these risks through
contractual bargaining between employer and employee.66 In addition, it is often very
difficult for workers to address the risk of dislocation through ex ante diversification of their
skills. Indeed, powerful incentives exist for workers increasingly to specialize in firm-
specific knowledge and skills, as it is these investments that usually have larger pay-offs in
promotions and bonuses.

Naturally, firms themselves are likely to invest most heavily in those training
programmes that involve highly firm-specific skills. They have little incentive to train
workers to be able to move to other sectors or firms, and indeed, arguably, a disincentive
since the longer a worker stays with a particular firm, the greater will be that firm’s return
on the investment in that worker. Of course, if the firm is a conglomerate encompassing a
wide range of economic activities (i.e. highly diversified in its operations) it may have an
incentive to provide training that is not narrowly job specific, with a view to workers
moving between diverse activities within the firm. Yet, even in this case, it is far from clear
that in the absence of a long-term employment contract or implicit contract (such as
company loyalty in Japan) workers would not take the newly acquired skills and apply them
elsewhere.

A somewhat different economic efficiency rationale for adjustment policies stems from
the very real danger that, absent appropriate government intervention, trade-induced
worker dislocation may result in an erosion of human capital. Workers who lose their jobs
due to freer trade, or other structural changes, may out of desperation and in the absence of
retraining assistance, seek employment at lower wage levels, and in occupations of lower skill
and labour productivity. Empirical evidence suggests that a significant percentage of
dislocated workers end up in lower-wage, lower-skill occupations, and, in fact, never
regain the earnings levels of their previous employment.67 Worse still, a protracted period
of unemployment especially when uncushioned by adequate income support—may also
entail physical and mental illness, family break-up, alcoholism, and drug use, which in
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addition to creating added costs for various social safety nets, is almost certain to reduce the
productive capacity of workers and reduce the chances that they will return to the
workplace, leading instead to dependence on the social welfare system. All of these factors
are likely to be aggravated by the problem of ‘sour grapes'68 or adaptive preferences: the
longer workers are unemployed or underemployed in an occupation, the less likely they
will be to believe in their own inherent capabilities, and hence actively to seek better
opportunities.69 In sum, the human effects of dislocation on workers and their families may
well lead to long-term sub-optimal deployment of workers’ capacities, absent positive
adjustment measures.

Many of the most important, and most controversial, arguments about the justification
for trade-linked adjustment assistance measures centre around the notion that it is desirable
to compensate the losers from freer trade. In economic theory, the notion of Kaldor-Hicks
efficiency, applied to the analysis of policy change, suggests the desirability of a given policy
change where the benefits to the winners from this change outweigh the losses to the losers.
However, unless one adopts a very crude or extreme utilitarian position, the complete
sacrifice of particular groups in society for the sake of the common good is ethically
problematic.

There are important political and social reasons for attempting to spread across society
the costs of adopting particular measures to improve the general welfare. The attitudes of
particular groups towards the political process, and their sense of citizen solidarity with the
community as a whole, may be adversely affected by having to pay the largest part of the
price for a given improvement. The common good itself may be lost sight of as acrimonious
debates about who wins and loses increasingly dominate the political process. This range of
concerns has been evoked by Michelman in his discussion of demoralization and disaffection
costs,70 and is well-expressed by Calabresi:

A decision which recognizes the values on the losing side as real and significant tends
to keep us from becoming callous with respect to the moralisms and beliefs that lose
out…it tells the loser that, though they lost, they and their values do carry weight
and are recognized in our society, even when they don’t win out.71

Comparative experience with labour market policies in various industrialized countries
yields a very mixed record. Countries like the UK, France, Canada, the USA, and Australia
have tended to favour a safety net approach, rather than proactive labour market policies. In
contrast, Sweden, Japan, and to a lesser extent Germany, tend to favour much more
proactive labour market policies that provide generous assistance to workers for training,
retraining, and relocation. The empirical evidence generally suggests the superiority of the
latter class of policies in terms of facilitating adjustment, although designing effective job
training and retraining programmes, particularly for unemployed youths and older workers,
has proven a demanding challenge for governments and empirical evidence on their efficacy
is quite mixed.72

Another controversial issue relates to whether special labour market policies should be
adopted in trade-impacted sectors. For example, the US Trade Expansion Act of 1962 and
the 1974 Trade Act both sought to provide adjustment assistance to workers dislocated by
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import competition. The 1962 Act, with its very strict eligibility criteria (to be eligible for
assistance it was necessary to demonstrate that imports were a more important factor than all
others combined in causing injury and that tariff concessions and injury must have occurred
simultaneously), was largely unsuccessful as an instrument of assistance. From 1962 to
1974, only 54,000 workers were certified for assistance involving total expenditures of
$US85 million.73 Adjustment assistance grew substantially under the 1974 Trade Act,
under which the level of benefits was increased and the eligibility criteria were greatly
relaxed. Between 1977 and 1981, 1.2 million workers received benefits. Spending on TAA
in 1981 reached $US 1.5 billion, although subsequently the programme budget was
severely cut.74 However, for the most part assistance under the Trade Act turned out to be
an instrument of compensation for temporarily laid off workers rather than an instrument
to promote adjustment out of declining industries.75

These are not arguments against trade-related adjustment assistance programmes as such
—rather they suggest that policies should be designed to ensure that priority is placed on
job losses that are likely to be permanent, and that eligibility criteria are not tilted in favour
of sectors that are represented by powerful lobby groups.

A second, but related argument against linking adjustment assistance with trade
liberalization is that singling out trade-displaced workers from other displaced workers is
morally arbitrary and unfair. This kind of argument assumes that only trade-displaced workers
are being offered assistance beyond that provided by the general social safety net (including
unemployment insurance). However, when a variety of programmes exist that are targeted
at specific groups of workers, and with a range of eligibility requirements, it is much less
clear that providing a programme for trade-displaced workers is giving them an unfair
advantage.

The logic of targeting or disaggregating adjustment assistance is that workers displaced for
different reasons have different needs. Workers displaced by trade liberalization, for
example, may be more likely to require retraining than those who lose their jobs due to
cyclical downturns or the bankruptcy of a particular firm, since trade-induced dislocation may
reflect a need to restructure an entire industry or sector in response to enhanced import
competition. As Peter Morici suggests, in the wake of NAFTA:

In the United States and Canada, jobs in low- and medium-technology activities must
make way for jobs in high-technology activities. Generally this will entail the loss of
low-skill/wage jobs in industries such as consumer electronics and the gain of high-
skill/wage jobs in industries such as advanced telecommunications equipment.76

It might reasonably be argued that a worker’s right to adjustment assistance in the case of
trade induced displacement would, on both efficiency and ethical grounds, be a superior
alternative to the right to safeguard relief presently accorded to firms under import
pressure.77 One of us has suggested that such a right to worker adjustment should be
entrenched in a parallel accord to NAFTA.78 The right could be satisfied by governments
providing domestic adjustment assistance programmes that are generally available to all
displaced workers (unemployment insurance, retraining and reskilling benefits, job
counselling, etc.) or alternatively, by programmes more directly targeted at workers
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displaced by trade. Where workers believed that domestic policies of their own countries
did not satisfy the right to adjustment they (or their representatives) would, on this scheme,
be able to petition a Trinational Committee of Experts, which would examine and rule on
the adequacy of the adjustment programmes in the country concerned. Ideally, once a right
to adjustment was in place, a country would be permitted to invoke traditional safeguards
only if it could show that domestic adjustment policies that satisfied the right to adjustment
were nevertheless insufficient to cope with the nature or scale of the social and economic
disruption caused by import surges. 

Unfortunately, from a political perspective, incentives on the part of both demanders and
suppliers of public policies tend in the direction of a complete inversion of the policy
prescriptions implied by the analysis in this chapter. That is to say, in the face of trade-
related adjustment pressures, politicians will face strong pressures to maintain or increase
trade restrictions, in part because these entail off-budget expenditures and in part because
they simultaneously buy off investor, worker, and other dependent interests. As a second-
best policy, industrial subsidies will be favoured because while they, to a greater or lesser
extent, involve on-budget expenditures, they are responsive to demands not only by
workers but also by investors and other affected interests. As a distinctly third-best policy
option, labour market adjustment policies may be favoured, but even then with a bias
toward stay-oriented labour policies rather than exit-oriented labour policies. Most labour
market policies involve on-budget expenditures and are responsive only to the demands of
workers and not of investors and other affected interests; and stay (safety-net) oriented
labour policies avoid an acknowledgement by government that the sector cannot or will not
be preserved in its present form or on its current scale. The new constraints embodied in the
GATT/WTO Safeguards Agreement discussed earlier in this chapter may help tilt domestic
political forces more strongly in the direction of proactive labour market adjustment
policies, enhancing simultaneously domestic and global economic welfare.

The interrelationship between trade and labour policies extends, however, far beyond
the context of domestic adjustment assistance. Many critics of free trade have argued that it
is unfair that producers and their workers in the developed industrial world should have to
compete with imports from countries with very low wage rates and weak labour standards.
This is a sufficiently important and contentious issue that we take it up in a separate chapter.

CONCLUSION

The new Uruguay Round Safeguards Agreement, if supplemented with further reforms to
the regime along the lines discussed earlier in this chapter, and adequate domestic labour
market adjustment policies, should adequately address the adjustment costs associated with
trade liberalization or shifting patterns of comparative advantage. In particular, the
normative case for retaining broadly-cast domestic antidumping and countervailing duty
regimes, either to address the impact of growth of imports on domestic industries or to
address claims of ‘unfair trade’, will have been substantially negated. Empirical evidence
tends to suggest that rising levels of income inequality (particularly with respect to unskilled
workers) in North America and high levels of unemployment in many European countries,
while properly a matter of concern, are only attributable to a small extent to increased
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trade and are mainly attributable to other factors such as technological change.79 Seeking
trade-related responses to these problems is likely to aggravate rather than ameliorate
them. 
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10
Trade in agriculture

INTRODUCTION

Over the last two decades, trade in agriculture has become one of the most prominent and
acrimonious issues on the world trade agenda. A solution to some of these controversies,
particularly those surrounding agricultural export subsidies and related domestic measures
(such as price supports and production quotas) was crucial to the successful conclusion of
the Uruguay Round of GATT negotiations. Protectionism has been pervasive in the
agricultural sector in Canada, the United States, the EU and Japan. Prior to the Uruguay
Round Final Act, the GATT itself placed fewer strictures on agricultural protection than
was the case with most other sectors. Moreover, a number of the major exporting states
had come close to ignoring GATT requirements altogether, even to the point of refusing to
implement GATT panel decisions. The International Monetary Fund has estimated that the
costs of agricultural protection to taxpayers and consumers in the OECD countries alone
amounts to about $US300 billion each year. The IMF has also found that liberalization of
this sector, involving both trade and domestic policy reforms in these countries, would result
in gains to consumers and taxpayers far outweighing losses to agricultural producers.1

Despite the economic welfare case for liberalizing trade in agriculture, a number of
rationales are still often invoked for treating the agricultural sector as a special case. These
rationales include: supposedly exceptional price and income instability; the importance to
national security of agricultural self-sufficiency; and the cultural and social value of
preserving rural lifestyles. At the same time, liberalization—while leading to eventual
substantial net gains in welfare, both global and domestic—poses significant adjustment and
transitional equity issues.

In this chapter, we will consider the pre-Uruguay Round treatment of agriculture in
trade law and practice; the extent to which it is justifiable to treat agriculture as a special
case; and the liberalization achievements of the Uruguay Round Final Act, with particular
attention to managing the challenge of adjustment.

The issue of health and safety standards in agricultural trade, including the Uruguay
Round Sanitary and Phytosanitary Agreement, was considered in Chapter 6. 



TRADE IN AGRICULTURE AND THE PRE-URUGUAY
ROUND GATT

Historical origins of special treatment for agriculture

The special treatment of agriculture in the General Agreement was largely, if not
exclusively, a reflection of the power and influence of the United States at the end of the
Second World War. The negotiators of the GATT did not, generally speaking, see any need
for a special regime for agriculture. Import quotas and export subsidies were, however, an
integral feature of the American supply management system for agricultural products that
existed at the time, and as Dam suggests, ‘no treaty that impinged upon the U.S. Farm
program could receive the constitutionally required senatorial approval’.2 As will be
discussed in detail below, the special treatment of agriculture contained in the General
Agreement has led to a large number of disputes over the interpretation of the GATT.
Moreover, in this area— more so than in any other—Contracting Parties found it
impossible to live with GATT panel decisions limiting their capacity to engage in
agricultural protection. Thus, for the United States, the special treatment it won under the
General Agreement for import restrictions linked to domestic supply management proved
insufficient, leading the US Administration to seek a waiver of Article XI GATT obligations
as early as 1955, with respect to a variety of agricultural products, including sugar, peanuts
and dairy products.3 Similarly, the European Union has either blocked the adoption of, or
refused to implement, panel decisions that threaten elements of its Common Agricultural
Policy.

Quantitative restrictions

Article XI of the GATT prohibits quantitative restrictions on trade, subject to certain
exceptions. Several of the exceptions are of particular relevance to trade in agriculture.
First of all, Article XI:2(a) permits export ‘prohibitions or restrictions’ of a temporary
nature in order to address critical food shortages in the exporting country. Second, XI:2(b)
permits ‘import and export restrictions’4 necessary to the application of standards or
regulations for the classification, grading or marketing of commodities in international
trade. Third, and most importantly, XI:2(c) permits import restrictions on ‘any agricultural
or fisheries product’ where necessary to enforce domestic restrictions on the marketing or
production of a similar product or product substitute. Import restrictions are also permitted
where necessary to remove a temporary surplus of a domestic like product or product
substitute. Article XIII sets out detailed rules on the use of quantitative restrictions in cases
where one or more of these exceptions apply.

In theory, at least, an important constraint on the protectionist impact of these exceptions
to the ban on quantitative restrictions is that the import restrictions in question must be
accompanied by like domestic measures. Foreigners cannot be singled out or targeted—
hence, import restrictions must not reduce the total value of imports proportionate to
domestic production below that ‘which might reasonably be expected to rule between the
two in the absence of restrictions’ (Article XI:2). If this condition were applied rigorously,
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it would mean that domestic price supports could be operated in a manner consistent with
comparative advantage. If, for example, a Contracting Party placed a quota of ten million
chickens a year on domestic marketing of poultry, and chickens from another Contracting
Party would have had a 60% market share under unrestricted market conditions, then the other
Contracting Party would be entitled to a market share of six million chickens.

This, of course, involves a difficult counterfactual exercise—i.e. determining
comparative advantage in agriculture absent the price distortions created by domestic price
support policies in the import-restricting country. Nevertheless, in theory, it should make
quantitative restrictions a rather unattractive instrument of agricultural protection, since
foreigners end up with a market share equal to that which would exist in the absence of
protection.

Perhaps for this very reason this condition on the use of quantitative restrictions was
never effectively enforced. An attempt in the 1950s to enforce the even more general
condition that import restrictions be ‘necessary’ to enforce domestic marketing and
production limits resulted in a threat from the United States that it would leave the GATT.
A GATT Working Party found that US import restrictions on dairy products were not
accompanied by domestic restrictions on the production of the raw material for the
products (milk), and retaliation was authorized under Article XXIII when the United States
failed to remove the restrictions in question.5 In the face of the threat of US withdrawal
from GATT, the United States was granted a non-time-limited waiver from the strictures
of Article XI with respect to agricultural products. This exemption for the United States
may well have had the effect of dampening efforts to enforce strictly Article XI against other
Contracting Parties—given that the United States was granted a waiver, it might have been
difficult, on principled grounds, to have refused one to others.

Nevertheless, in several later panel decisions, a stricter view of the provisions of Article
XI was taken. For instance, in ruling on an American complaint concerning Japanese
quantitative restrictions on a wide variety of agricultural product groups, a GATT panel
held that Article XI:2(c)(i) should be construed narrowly, and, in particular, that there was
a burden of proof on the import-restricting state to show that it had granted to foreign
producers the market share that would exist if there were no restrictions.6 The panel
decision did not, however, establish a methodology or detailed guidelines for making such a
determination—the panel merely held that Japan had not attempted to discharge the burden
of proof. In another case, which concerned import restrictions imposed by the European
Union in the face of a surplus of apples, a panel held that the exemption in Article XI:2(c)
(ii) did not apply, because the surplus was not temporary, but rather a chronic side-effect of
the Union’s own agricultural price support policies.7 In a case that concerned Canadian
quantitative restrictions on imports of yoghurt and ice cream from the United States, Canada
argued before the panel that these restrictions were ‘necessary’ to render effective domestic
production restrictions on milk, in the sense that the higher cost of milk generated by these
restrictions made secondary products manufactured with the higher cost Canadian milk
vulnerable to imports. Therefore, Canada claimed, the requirements of Article XJ:2(c)(i)
had been met. The panel took a narrow view of the word ‘necessary’, finding that it did not
include import restrictions aimed at neutralizing the competitive disadvantage to other
domestic industries of higher domestic prices for agricultural inputs. In effect, without the
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restrictions, Canada would still be able to enforce domestic restrictions on milk production
and hence keep the price of milk high—albeit at some cost to Canadian yoghurt and ice
cream makers. This ruling is arguably quite important, since it prevents Article XI:2(c)(i)
from being used by Contracting Parties to shift the costs of their agricultural protectionism
from their own agrifood industries on to foreign competitors in these industries.

Export subsidies

Article XVI of the General Agreement prohibits export subsidies, subject to an exception for
‘primary products’. These are permitted, with the proviso that ‘they shall not be applied in
a manner which results in that Contracting Party having more than an equitable share of
world export trade in that product’. In defining what constitutes an equitable share, ‘shares
of the contracting parties in such trade in the product in a previous representative period’
are to be taken into account. This suggests that the essential issue is whether the export
subsidy has caused an increase in market share over that which prevailed in the period
before the subsidy was introduced. A ‘primary product’ is defined in an Interpretive Note
to Article XVI as ‘any product of farm, forest, or fishery at an early stage of processing’.

These provisions were incorporated into the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code (Article 10),
with minor variations. In particular, the expression ‘more than an equitable share of world
trade’ was defined to apply to those cases where ‘the effect of an export subsidy granted by
a signatory is to displace the exports of another signatory bearing in mind the developments
on world markets’ (Article 10(2)(a)). As well, the ‘previous representative period’ would
normally be ‘the three most recent calendar years in which normal market conditions
existed’ (Article 10(2)(c)).

Even with these criteria, it proved very difficult to interpret the concept of ‘an equitable
share of world trade’. In a 1958 case that concerned French subsidies on the export of
wheat flour, the panel ruled that the subsidies did not comply with the GATT because
France had attained more than an equitable share of the world market. Three considerations
formed the basis of this finding: (1) France’s exports of flour to the market in question
(Southeast Asia) had increased over a previous period; (2) the complainant’s (Australia’s)
exports to the same market declined; and (3) the subsidy was found to be a ‘substantial
cause’ of the displacement.8 In a more recent case,9 however, a panel found that European
Union subsidies on wheat flour were permissible under Article XVI, even though the Union’s
share of the world market had increased from 29% to 75% between 1962 and 1981, while
the complainant (the United States) had seen its share over the comparable period decline
from 25% to 9%. The panel noted the difficulty in determining whether, in fact, changes in
market share could be attributable to a particular export subsidy, as opposed to other
factors. It seemed to be suggesting that specific evidence of price undercutting in the
market in question would be required to establish that export subsidies were unambiguously
resulting in displacement—shifts in market share alone were insufficient, however dramatic.

The United States objected strongly to this approach, and vetoed adoption of the panel
report. However, the report is defensible on at least two grounds: (1) As Jackson notes, the
United States itself was selling its own wheat in the same market on non-commercial terms,
through a food aid programme,10 and therefore neither country’s market share could be
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considered over the period in question to have been based on undistorted market
conditions; and (2) although dramatic increases in market share had occurred, this had taken
place over a period of twenty years, whereas the text of the Subsidies Code itself suggested
that market share changes should be considered in terms of changes occurring within a
threeyear representative period. More generally, by the time of this dispute world trade in
agriculture had become so distorted by the domestic and export policies of the main
producers that the panel’s difficulty in finding a clear benchmark against which the
distorting effect of one particular subsidy could be measured was entirely understandable.

In the Pasta case, the United States argued that subsidies paid by the European
Community to exporters of pasta violated Article 9 of the GATT Subsidies Code, which
prohibits export subsidies on ‘non-primary’ products.11 The EU responded that the subsidy
should be viewed as a subsidy on primary product inputs into pasta production, in particular
European durum wheat. The effect of the subsidy, according to the EU, was simply to
compensate EU pasta exporters for the higher than world prices of EU flour, thereby
allowing them to be competitive on world markets despite purchasing wheat at higher
prices than foreign competitors. This argument was rejected by a majority of the panel,
which read Article 9 literally to include all subsidies paid to exporters of non-primary
products, without regard to whether the intended or actual effect was to subsidize
indirectly a primary product. One of the four panellists, however, wrote a dissenting
opinion, taking the view that in negotiating the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code, governments
had generally understood or assumed that subsidies on primary components of non-primary
products would not be prohibited by Article 9.

The EU blocked adoption of the majority ruling by the Subsidies Committee and eventually
reached a negotiated settlement with the United States of the dispute in question. But the
ultimate consequence was continued uncertainty about the legality under GATT of one of
the most pervasive and controversial features of the European Union’s Common
Agricultural Policy—export subsidies on products that use EU agricultural inputs.

Domestic subsidies and related domestic support measures

A more recent GATT ruling narrowed the scope for granting domestic subsidies to users of a
product rather than its producers. As discussed in Chapter 8, domestic subsidies were not
prohibited by the GATT, although, in accordance with the rules set out in the Subsidies
Agreement, they might be countervailable. However, in the Oilseeds12 case, a GATT panel
found that a subsidy paid to European Union users of oilseeds violated Article III, the
National Treatment principle of the GATT. Here, the panel took a quite literal approach to
the wording of Article III, which only exempts subsidies from the National Treatment
obligation if they are paid ‘exclusively’ to domestic producers of the subsidized product
(Article III:8(b)). The EU revised the form of assistance so that it appeared to comply with
the requirements of Article III. However, a subsequent panel found this new form of
assistance still constituted non-violation nullification or impairment of a benefit that the
United States could reasonably have expected from previous GATT concessions. Here, the
United States was able to point to an early GATT tariff binding on oilseeds by the EU,
which gave it reason to expect at least some level of access to the EU market.13 Bilateral
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negotiations between the EU and the USA concerning implementation of the panel’s ruling
were initially unsuccessful; the dispute was finally resolved within the framework of a
broader US/EU agreement on negotiating positions in the Uruguay Round (the Blair House
Agreement, discussed in a later section of this chapter).

THE CANADA-US FREE TRADE AGREEMENT (FTA) AND THE
NORTH AMERICAN FREE TRADE AGREEMENT (NAFTA)

Chapter Seven of the FTA deals with trade in agriculture. The main impact on agricultural
trade is the phased-in reduction and eventual elimination of tariffs on many agricultural
commodities. However, because the FTA contains few strictures with respect to domestic
support measures, its overall liberalizing effect is quite modest. Article 701 does, however,
prohibit export subsidies on agricultural goods moving from one FTA partner to the other.
It should be noted that this does not prohibit the use of export subsidies when Canada and
the USA are competing against each other in third-country markets. Instead, there is a weak
obligation to take into account the harmful effects of such subsidies of exports to third
countries on the other FTA partner (Article 701.4).

As well, although the FTA does not contain a general prohibition on non-tariff border
measures, such as quotas imposed to implement supply management schemes, the United
States was able to obtain from Canada minimum market access commitments under some
of these schemes. For instance, with respect to chicken and chicken products, the United
States is entitled to an import quota no less than 7.5% of the previous year’s domestic
production of chickens in Canada (Article 706). In addition, the Parties agree to work
towards harmonizing technical standards, and a number of technical working groups are
established for this purpose (Article 708).

In the case of NAFTA, there is, generally speaking, little substantial progress over the
FTA with respect to trilateral trade liberalization, due largely to Canadian intransigence
with respect to supply management schemes (which, of course, will now have to be
modified in light of the Agreement on Agriculture in the Uruguay Round Final Act).14

However, the NAFTA contains much more promising provisions with respect to US-
Mexico agricultural trade, including a waiver of GATT rights with respect to imposition of
quantitative restrictions connected to domestic supply management (Article XI:2(c) of
GATT). There is a complicated scheme for tariff reductions, with tariffs on some
commodities to be eliminated between all three countries immediately, whereas tariffs on
other commodities are to be phased out in either a five, ten, or fifteen-year period, again
depending upon the commitments each country has made with respect to that particular
commodity. Canada insisted on excluding poultry, milk and eggs from these commitments.
However, in some other areas, Canada has agreed to lift quantitative restrictions on imports
from Mexico, including cereals, meats, and margarine (with respect to the United States, US
rights of market access where Canada maintains quantitative restrictions remain governed
by the provisions of the FTA which have been substantially incorporated into the NAFTA).
NAFTA also contains provisions on technical barriers that resemble very closely those in the
Uruguay Round Final Act (to be discussed later in this chapter).
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An economic model of the effects of liberalization commitments in NAFTA with respect
to agricultural products predicts that, when NAFTA is fully implemented, agricultural trade
between the USA and Mexico will be 15% greater than it was in the 1988 base year.15 US
exports to Mexico are predicted to increase more rapidly than Mexican exports to the USA,
in part because Mexico’s pre-NAFTA level of border protection on these commodities was
substantially higher than that of the USA.16 A major shortcoming of this kind of model is, of
course, the difficulty of predicting other factors such as exchange rate movements, changes
in agricultural demand and supply in other countries, etc. that may affect the impact of the
NAFTA. Significantly, Canada was not treated in the model as a NAFTA partner, because
the impact of NAFTA on its agricultural trade was assumed to be minimal.

RATIONALES FOR DIFFERENTIAL TREATMENT OF THE
AGRICULTURAL SECTOR: A CRITICAL OVERVIEW

Although much agricultural protectionism can be attributed to the influence of powerful
farm lobbies in North America, Europe, and Japan, there are a number of long-standing
rationales for the justification of protection that are specific to this sector.

Self-sufficiency/national security

In the most literal sense, a nation’s survival can be said to depend upon access to food.
Famines have appeared periodically throughout history, and continue to do so in much of
the developing world, whether caused by war, pestilence, or drought. In times of shortage,
access to food from foreign imports may well dry up, as countries impose export restrictions
to ensure their own populace gets fed first. As we noted above, this kind of export control is
in fact explicitly authorized by the GATT. Under these circumstances, it is not surprising that
self-sufficiency is often cited as a rationale for agricultural protection, or more precisely, as
a rationale for measures that maintain agricultural production in a country where it would be
more efficient for most or all of its needs to be met from imports. A variant on the self-
sufficiency argument is the purported advantage of not having to rely on foreigners who
may be one’s enemies in war (or potential enemies) for the supply of food.

Exceptional price instability

Agricultural commodities are subject to price fluctuations often considerably greater than
many other goods that are traded, in significant part because supply is so susceptible to
unpredictable factors such as weather. As a consequence, farm-ers’ incomes are highly
volatile. On the other hand, their costs (debt service on land, equipment, etc.) are likely to
be fixed to a significant extent. In the end, it is argued, unless supply is restricted, or prices
stabilized by other means, a single bad year may well result in many farmers being put out of
business altogether, although in some sense they nevertheless have an on-going comparative
advantage in producing food. Although much of the agricultural industry in developed
countries is now constituted by large commercial producers, the image of the family losing
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its farm, and therewith a lifetime of work together, remains a powerful and poignant image
in popular culture.

Preservation of the rural way of life/environment

Over the last few decades, efficiency of agricultural production has increased enormously in
most developed countries. Therefore, even if a certain level of domestic food production
could be seen as necessary for self-sufficiency reasons, or even if price stabilization could be
justified as a means of making farm incomes less volatile, nevertheless there would still be a
long-run shift of both land and people away from agricultural production—one can simply
meet existing demand with less land and fewer people. Hence, in recent years an often
heard argument for agricultural protection has been that keeping land and people in farming
is a social good in itself. With respect to land, the implicit assumption is that, but for
agricultural usages, the countryside would be much more heavily burdened with ugly,
polluting industries, or simply replaced by industrial or commercial towns. A closely
related argument is that agriculture sustains rural communities, which would either disappear
or lose their distinctive character if economic activity in the countryside were shifted away
from agricultural production.

Wilson and Finkle suggest, writing primarily of the Canadian context:

Farmers enjoy an undercurrent of sympathy among urban voters which confers
political power on them quite out of proportion to their numbers ... most urbanites
are attracted to the idealized image of the countryside: the hard working farm family,
the noble virtues and traditional values which they imagine motivate their rustic
compatriots. It is not a lifestyle most urbanites would care to live themselves but
they are glad someone is doing it and they are willing to pay a bit to see it maintained.17

As well, Europeans in particular are fond of arguing that their countryside is a natural and
cultural treasure that would be fundamentally threatened if land were taken out of agricultural
production.

None of these three main kinds of rationales is entirely bogus, although assumptions that
the agricultural industry is largely composed of needy farm families or that modern farming
operations are more aesthetically or environmentally friendly than other kinds of
contemporary economic activity deserve critical scrutiny. The more fundamental issue is
whether any of these goals really necessitates measures that radically distort world trade and
cost non-farm households more than a $ 1,000 per year in both higher food prices and in
taxes that pay for farm subsidies. For example, with respect to the price instability of
agricultural products, the real issue is the stability of farmer’s incomes. Farmer’s incomes
could be stabilized directly, through income averaging techniques or income insurance,
rather than distorting domestic prices and limiting foreign competition in order to maintain
artificially high domestic prices. With respect to rural life-style values, careful regional
development plans seem a more finely-tuned instrument than agricultural protection to
ensure balanced economic activity in the countryside. As we shall argue below, much of the
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potential for reforming agricultural trade comes from this potential for ‘decoupling’ of
policy goals such as income stabilization from trade distortive policies.

INSTRUMENTS OF AGRICULTURAL PROTECTION

Domestic price control and supply management systems and
related trade measures

The European Union Common Agricultural Policy (CAP)

In theory, the Common Agricultural Policy (CAP) is based on the objectives in Article 39
of the Treaty of Rome, including market stabilization, increased agricultural productivity,
and reasonable agricultural prices for consumers. During the 1960s and 1970s, the CAP
developed into a complex web of price and sales guarantees, subsidies, and other support
measures that largely insulated farmer’s incomes from market forces. For most agricultural
products, a minimum price was set to apply to all sales within the EU. In order not to
undermine this price, it was essential that lower-priced imports be prohibited. This was
achieved by a Variable Import Levy—a charge on imported goods equivalent to whatever
difference exists at the time of entry between world price and the Union price. In effect,
through the levy, the Union was able to neutralize whatever price advantage a foreign
competitor might enjoy. 

As Martin has remarked, ‘European farmers have demonstrated beyond a shadow of a
doubt that they are economically rational.’18 Hence, in the face of guaranteed prices
considerably above world prices and no production controls, they expanded production. It
should be remembered that since the price was set so that the least efficient producers in
Europe could make a profit, it offered significant rents or supra-normal profits to the more
efficient producers. In addition, given that technological developments were increasing the
efficiency of all farmers, it is not surprising that enormous surpluses soon developed. Since
prices could not be lowered, there was no obvious way to dispose of the surplus in an
orderly fashion. In consequence, the Union came to make undertakings to farmers to
purchase their surplus at the high Union price. Enormous stockpiles of many commodities
soon developed, and by the 1980s close to 80% of the Union budget was spent on
agricultural programmes. Once again, farmers behaved entirely rationally, and now that
they had not only prices but also sales guaranteed, further invested to expand production.

It is in the context of these pressures that the Union established a rebate on export sales,
where in order to encourage disposal of the surpluses on world markets, the Union pays
exporters the difference between the high Union price and the world price. Although these
rebates have often been characterized, and condemned as export subsidies, in theory it should
be noted that they do not actually undercut the world price. However, critics of the CAP
have often charged that, in practice, rebates are given which exceed the difference between
the Union and the world price, because the EU authorities tend systematically to
underestimate world price in their calculation of the rebates. What is certainly true is that
the CAP went from a programme that affected trade by keeping foreign producers out of
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the EU market to one that, at the same time, because of the massive surpluses being
disposed of through the rebate scheme, made it increasingly difficult for foreign producers
to sell their agricultural products in third-country markets.

North America

Although Americans have tended to single out the CAP as the main villain in the
agricultural trade wars, it must be remembered that it was US agricultural protection that
led to weak GATT rules in agriculture in the first place. These have included price support
measures, coupled however with production restrictions. There is a legitimate argument
that these measures were less harmful than the CAP price support mechanism—since
production restrictions were in place, keeping prices high did not result in the generation of
massive surpluses. Also, since the mid-1980s, the United States has attempted permanently
to reduce production by paying farmers to take land out of service. As well, instead of
keeping the market price artificially high, for some commodities the United States now pays
to farm-ers the difference between the price they can get on the market and a target price
based on a formula that reflects the revenue farmers need to break even. Although
Americans often claim that US export subsidies are a competitive response to EU and other
foreign programmes, in fact such subsidies long predate the CAP. However, it is true that
during the 1960s and 1970s the United States’ use of export subsidies declined
considerably, until in 1985 a new set of aggressive subsidies was introduced in response to
the CAP.19

Canada maintains marketing and production restrictions on poultry and eggs, enforced
through domestic and import quotas. These import quotas have been justified under Article
XI:2(c) of the GATT, discussed earlier in this chapter.

In addition, Canada actively subsidizes the sale of wheat and other grains, often through
concessional financing by the Canadian Wheat Board, which actively tries to undercut
competitors’ in many export markets. However, Canada tends to view these subsidies as a
response to similar behaviour on the part of its competitors, particularly the European
Union, where a grain industry would be largely non-existent but for the CAP. In addition,
both Canada and the United States both provide a variety of forms of assistance to farmers
that, arguably, do not directly distort world or domestic prices, such as crop insurance and
low-interest loans and loan guarantees for purchase of land and equipment and generous tax
write-offs (the latter, in the case of Canada, have created a new class of ‘gentlemen-
farmers’). The arguments concerning whether such subsidies are objectionable as leading to
inefficient or unfair trade are much the same as for any other domestic subsidy.

Japan

Japan’s domestic market for agricultural products is one of the most protected in the world,
at least with respect to some commodities. A wide range of instruments is employed that
includes price stabilization, control of supply by state or quasi-state monopolies, coupled
with import quotas and extremely high tariffs. According to Gilson,20 in 1988, the Japanese
domestic price for wheat was eight times the world price. Rice is often estimated to cost ten
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or eleven times as much in Japan as on world markets and beef is heavily protected as well.
Japan, however, is not a major exporter of agricultural products, and therefore does not
participate in the export subsidy war between North America and the European Union.

Costs and benefits of agricultural protection

There have been many estimates in recent years of the costs and benefits of agricultural
protection, using different methodologies and different definitions of what constitutes
protection.21 With respect to costs, these include the expense to the taxpayers of on-budget
measures such as export and domestic subsidies, and commitments to purchase surpluses,
costs to consumers of more expensive food, and allocative cfficiency losses as resources are
misdirected to agricultural production where no comparative advantage exists in the farm
sector.

Figure 10.1, taken from a survey by The Economist22 magazine, contains estimates of the
per household per year costs of agricultural protection in the United States, Western
Europe and Japan (including both higher taxes and higher food prices). These costs, which
globally average around $ 1,400 per household per year for the countries concerned,
represent a considerable welfare loss. To these costs must be added the environmental costs
of over-farming due to incentives to increase production in the European Union, and the
deadweight loss of resources devoted to lobbying for protection. As well, the effect of
protection in the developed countries is to shut out to a large extent the developing
countries and the Newly Liberalizing Countries of Central and Eastern Europe from many
agricultural markets, thereby further retarding growth and adjustment (although some
developing countries may benefit, at least in the short run, from lower food prices due to

Figure 10.1 Cost of agricultural support per non-farm household

Source: Tyers and Anderson, Disarray in World Food Markets.
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subsidized food exports of developed countries).23 As well, developed countries such as
Australia and New Zealand, which have undertaken unilateral liberalization of their own
agricultural support policies, see themselves as having much to gain from more open
policies elsewhere, and have been leading forces behind the Cairns Group, which has
pressed for comprehensive agreement on agriculture as part of the Uruguay Round.24 The
effects of protection on farmers’ incomes in various countries, including industrialized and
developing countries, are displayed in Figure 10.2.

The gains to farmers in the EU and Japan are clearly very large. As The Economist notes,25

since the gains from protection are proportional to the amount produced, small or poor
farmers receive a small percentage of these gains, and highly efficient, large ‘industrial’ farms
capture the lion’s share. These gains, however, do not easily translate into the purported
rationales for or social benefits from agricultural protection discussed above. First of all, while
prices have been supported domestically, protection has led to increased instability in world
prices, as surpluses have rapidly developed in various commodities. This in turn has made
domestic price support increasingly costly. Second, even very high levels of protection have
not saved the family farm—the exodus to the cities continues, because increased efficiency
means that more can be produced with fewer farmers, and because small family farms often
do not have access to the capital needed to invest in the expansion of production and
particularly the technology that would allow them to capture major gains from protection.
Finally, agricultural protection does not appear to have prevented environmental and aesthetic
degradation in rural areas—indeed, as mentioned earlier, over-farming with intensive use
of fertilizers and other chemicals has begun to contribute significantly to environmental
degradation.

Figure 10.2 Effect on farmers’ income of rich countries’ policies

Source: The Economist.
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THE URUGUAY ROUND AGREEMENT ON AGRICULTURE

Given the extremely high costs and dubious benefits of agricultural protection— and
particularly the increasing cost of beggar-thy-neighbour subsidy wars—the case for
removing agricultural protection is a particularly strong one, and was accepted at the level
of principle by both the United States26 and the European Union as a basic goal of the
Uruguay Round negotiations. Indeed, as early as 1982, the OECD Ministerial Council had
adopted a declaration that ‘agricultural trade should be more fully integrated into and
within the open and multilateral trading system’, also agreeing that multilateral negotiations
should address ‘adjustments in domestic policies’.27 This ultimately resulted in a major
initiative on agricultural policy reform in the OECD, which culminated in a 1987 ministerial
agreement to undertake major reforms without delay. Such reforms were to include
‘measures which, by reducing guaranteed prices and other types of production incentives,…
will prevent an increase in excess supply’.28 Ministers also undertook to ‘refrain from
confrontational and destabilising trade practices’.29 Despite this apparent consensus within
the OECD on the need for and the direction of reform, agricultural issues proved to be
among the most contentious in the Round, and understanding the evolution of the
bargaining positions of the major actors—the USA and the EU—is of considerable
importance in appreciating the compromise on agriculture that finally permitted the
Uruguay Round to close in mid-December 1993.

At one level, the problem was clearly political. Agricultural lobbies exercise enormous
influence in the key countries concerned. This influence is usually quite disproportionate to
the percentage of the population at large engaged in agricultural production. In some
countries (Canada is an example) the boundaries of legislative districts have not changed in
such a way as to reflect fully the shift in population from rural to urban areas, thereby resulting
in the former being over-represented in legislatures. In some European countries, the
electoral politics are such that forming a governing coalition may be difficult, if not
impossible, if some rural-based Parties are not included. As well, in some countries, of
which Germany is a prime example, the shift away from agricultural production to other
economic activities as the major source of employment has not necessarily been
accompanied by a population shift of comparable magnitude from the rural areas to the cities,
and electoral boundaries are based on where people live not where they work. Philip notes:
‘[in the Western part of Germany] a majority of the population is still living in rural areas,
even though they don’t necessarily work there’.30

Just as the American agricultural lobby was adamant that US negotiators accept nothing
less than radical reductions in EU export subsidies, the European (and especially the
French) farm lobbies were equally adamant that the basic level of protection in the CAP be
preserved. However, even where they had the political will to resist the most extreme
demands of the farm lobbies, EU policy-makers had a series of legitimate concerns about
adjustment and the management of transitional costs during the shift to a more liberal regime
for agriculture.

Rapid removal of protection would lead to massive bankruptcies and significant job
losses, as farm revenues plummeted in those countries with the highest costs of production.
In addition, and perhaps most difficult of all, land values that now reflected rents from
protection would decline dramatically31—as would the market value of quotas in supply
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management systems such as that of Canada. Here there would be a transitional gains trap32

problem, because while older farmers who saw the value of their land go up as rents from
protection increased arguably have done very well from protection over the years and may
not be deserving of further compensation, there is a much greater difficulty in the case of
those who acquired quotas or land more recently, paying a price that reflected an expected
income stream based on the assumption of continued protection. The removal of protection
in these instances might be viewed as a ‘regulatory taking’ and therefore require extremely
costly compensation for the reduction in the value of land or quotas. Containment of
transitional costs generally implies an incremental approach to the removal or at least
restructuring of agricultural protection—a process that already had begun on a small scale
in the mid- to late 1980s in the United States but has been overshadowed by subsidies wars
that are a result of the excess capacity produced by past protectionist practices. An
incremental approach, however, has its own drawbacks. First of all, a basic principle of
equity suggests that each country should pull its own weight in the overall reduction in
protection, but the setting of targets is made more difficult by the diversity of policy
instruments employed by different countries. It is necessary to achieve consensus on a
methodology for reducing the protectionist impact of these instruments to a common
measure.33 There are a variety of alternative techniques for doing this, each of which has its
strengths and weaknesses.34 A related requirement is effective monitoring of a complex
variety of domestic policy changes to ensure that these changes are indeed being made in
such a way as to reduce each country’s common measure of protection by the targeted
amount.

These are some of the transitional issues that set the scene for a dispute between the
United States and the European Union over the approach to liberalization which lasted from
the intensification of the Uruguay Round negotiations towards the end of the 1980s until
the very last days of the Round in December 1993.

Although it showed rather early in the negotiations some flexibility with respect to its
opening position that all protection (including domestic support) be eliminated within a ten-
year period, the United States insisted that a major thrust of liberalization must be very
substantial reductions in one particular instrument of protection, export subsidies, over a
ten-year period. This intransigence was probably the result of a variety of factors, including
scepticism concerning the ability to monitor more complex domestic policy shifts35 and an
increasing sense of frustration at European unwillingness to comply with existing GATT
strictures (which reached a peak, as mentioned above, with the European refusal to
implement the 1991 Oilseeds ruling). In addition some of the negotiating positions of the EU
seemed almost calculated in their manner of presentation to raise the ire of the United States
—for instance, at one point the EU, while offering to reduce domestic support by 30%
over ten years (an apparently substantial concession) insisted that the offer be backdated to
1986, so the 30% target would be significantly met by reductions that had already
occurred.36

The European Union, although prepared to make some concessions with respect to
domestic support measures, insisted on the continuing capacity to subsidize exports, if only
because as long as the other measures were to be phased out gradually, incentives to over-
production would continue to exist, and there would be a continued need to use export
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subsidies to reduce surpluses. The European Union also insisted on the ability to pay income
support to farmers as a substitute for protection.37 From the European perspective any
move away from price- and trade-distorting policies would necessarily require adjustment
policies that would include a significant element of domestic support, even in the medium or
long term.38 The Union argued that adjustment-oriented measures such as income support
were not trade-distorting and therefore ought not to be disciplined under GATT. The USA
was sceptical; income support might nevertheless preserve incentives to farmers to continue
overproduction, thereby perpetuating the pressure to resort to directly distortive measures,
such as export subsidies, to reduce the resulting surpluses.

The 1991 ‘Dunkel Draft’ of a possible Uruguay Round Agreement attempted to set forth
a compromise aimed at breaking the impasse in negotiations between the USA and the EU.
The Draft proposed: reduction of domestic support measured in terms of a common
standard (the Aggregate Measure of Support or AMS) by 20% from 1993 to 1999 with
credit to be given for reductions that occurred since 1986; tariffication of border measures
other than tariffs (e.g. the import quotas used by Canada to sustain its supply-management
system); and reduction in export subsidies by 36% between 1993 and 1999 in terms of
outlays (aggregate expenditures) and by 24% in terms of quantities of output subsidized
(Part B, para. 11). The Dunkel Draft was ambiguous as to whether income support
payments to farmers, as conceived by the EU in the MacSharry Report on CAP Reform,39

would be viewed as exempt from domestic support reduction commitments.
Negotiations based on the Dunkel Draft made limited headway until, after intense

internal discussions, in May 1992, the European Council adopted a revised version of the
plan for agricultural reform contained in the MacSharry Report. This entailed a substantial
reduction in price support for cereals, accompanied by compensation in the form of income
support to farmers, in most instances conditional upon their willingness to ‘set aside’, or
take out of cereals production, a part of their land. In other areas, however (livestock and
particularly dairy) the agreed reforms were much less significant—reflecting a difficult
intra-European bargain (and above all, the compromises required to gain acceptance by
France). In November 1992, the USA and the EU reached a bilateral agreement concerning
the liberalization of agricultural trade, the so-called Blair House Agreement. Under the
Blair House Agreement, the USA and EU agreed to support the fol-lowing reductions as a basis
for a Uruguay Round Agreement: a 20% reduction in domestic support in terms of the
AMS, with 1986–8 as a base period; a 21% reduction in the volume of export subsidies and
a 36% reduction in the cash amount of export subsidies, with the base period as defined in
the Dunkel Draft; exemption of income support to farmers from domestic support
reduction commitments provided that these payments are made on only a limited part of
the total production of each farm (so as not to encourage future over-production).40 These
agreed terms for a Uruguay Round settlement on agriculture certainly represented very
substantial concessions by the United States to the European Union, at least in terms of
previous US negotiating positions. For instance, the USA ended up accepting a 1986
baseline for domestic support commitments—an element that it had rejected when it
appeared in earlier EU negotiating positions. In return, however, the USA received
satisfaction on a number of specific bilateral concerns, foremost among them the oilseeds
controversy. Here, the EU agreed to reduce subsidies on oilseeds once oilseed acreage
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reached a certain trigger level. The EU also agreed to facilitate market access for US corn to
Spain and Portugal. A mutually satisfactory resolution of bilateral disputes between the
Parties with respect to corn gluten feed and malted barley sprouts was also achieved.

The Blair House Agreement represented an important breakthrough, but the future of
the Uruguay Round was still clouded due to the unwillingness of the French to accept Blair
House as a definitive basis for CAP reform. Finally, an adjustment of the Blair House
Agreement was achieved through discussions between US Trade Representative Mickey
Kantor and EU External Affairs Commissioner Leon Brittan at a meeting in Brussels on 7
December 1993 -just a week before the final deadline for the Uruguay Round negotiations.
The major new US concession was to allow back-loading of commitments for reduction in
export subsidies, so that smaller reductions would be possible in the first few years of the
six-year transition period.41 A new feature was, however, added to what had been agreed
on at Blair House with respect to the basis for a Uruguay Round settlement on agriculture—
a commitment to a minimum level of market access for foreign producers equivalent to 3%
of domestic production, rising to 5% at the end of a six-year period.

Overview

In terms of general structure and basic principles, the key elements of the Agreement
reflect, in the first instance, the Dunkel Draft. With respect to specific commitments, the
Agreement is largely based upon the bilateral understandings between the United States and
the EU in the Blair House Agreement, as modified by the 7 December Kantor/Brittan meeting
(not surprisingly, some smaller countries, including developing countries, found it a source
of irritation at the end of the Round that the final Agreement should be closely modelled on
a bilateral deal between the USA and the EU). The key elements may be summarized as
follows:

1 Domestic support is to be quantified in terms of a common metric, the Aggregate
Measure of Support (AMS) (Article 1(a); Article 6; Annex 3) with mandatory
minimum reductions amounting to 20% over a six-year period, with 1986–8 as the
base period (i.e. at the end of six years from the entry into force of the Agreement on
Agriculture domestic support must be 20% lower than it was in the 1986–8 base
period). ‘Direct’ payments to farmers, when made under ‘production-limiting
programmes’ are not subject to reduction commitments, provided the payments are
based on fixed area and yields, or are made on 85% or less of the base level of
production, or (in the case of livestock) on a fixed number of head (Article 6.5(a)(i)-
(iii)). Where these payments also conform to the more specific exemption criteria
contained in Annex 2, they are also noncountervailable.42

2 Export subsidies are to be reduced over a six-year period by 21 % in terms of the volume
of agricultural products that receive such subsidies and 36% in terms of total cash
value. Except for certain permitted minor adjustments (Article 9.2), members
undertake not to expand export subsidies beyond the levels reached after the
achievement of their six-year reduction commitments. This in effect alters, with
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respect to agricultural products, the operation of Article XVI of the General
Agreement, which permits export subsidies on primary products.

3 Existing non-tariff border measures, such as import quotas, VERs, and the EC Variable
Import Levy are to be converted into tariffs (Article 4.2, footnote 1), and new measures
of this kind are to be prohibited (Article 4.2). This modifies Article XI:2(c) of the
General Agreement, which permits quantitative restrictions on agricultural and
fisheries products where necessary to the enforcement of the domestic marketing
scheme. In addition, existing nontariff border measures must be reduced to the extent
required to allow foreign producers a minimum of 3% market access in terms of total
domestic production of each product category, rising to 5% at the end of the six-year
phase-in period.

4 Tariffs (including existing non-tariff border measures that have been converted to
tariffs) are to be reduced by at least 36% overall by each Member over the six-year
phase-in period, with a minimum 15% reduction on each product category.

Operationalizing the commitment to liberalization; other
selected features of the Agreement on Agriculture

It is impossible in this chapter to do full justice to the complex definitional and
methodological framework which the Agreement on Agriculture establishes for the
operationalization of the reduction commitments sketched above. The Agreement contains
finely-crafted provisions that set out basic rules for the calculation of Aggregate Measure of
Support in the case of domestic support measures (Annex 3) and for the calculation of tariff
equivalents in the case of non-tariff border measures (Attachment to Annex 5). For instance,
with respect to domestic price support measures (characteristic of the CAP), these are
included in the AMS by calculating the difference between a ‘fixed external reference price’
(i.e. a world price) and the higher administratively-set domestic price, and multiplying this
difference by the volume of production to which the administered price applies (Annex 3,
Article 8). Annex 2 of the Agreement provides a very detailed set of criteria for
determining which domestic support measures are exempt from reduction commitments,
including income support measures for farmers. To be exempt, domestic support measures
must meet the ‘fundamental’ requirement that ‘they have no, or at most minimal, trade
distortion effects or effects on production’ (Annex 2, Article 1). Measures are considered to
have met this requirement where they conform to the following two criteria: (1) they are
provided through a publicly-funded government programme that does not involve transfers
from consumers; and (2) the measures in question do not have the effect of price support
(Annex 2, Article 1). Several pages of much more specific criteria and examples of exempt
measures follow, and these are based on the gen-eral concepts of Article 1 of the Annex.
Some of the exempt measures include: research and training programmes; inspection
services for health, safety, grading or standardization purposes; and various forms of
adjustment assistance to farmers, including income support, where the measures meet very
specific conditions aimed at ensuring that the effect is not to reward and thereby perpetuate
current levels of production. Article 13 of the Agreement stipulates that domestic support
measures that are exempt from reduction commitments by virtue of Annex 2, are to be
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noncountervailable (Article 13.1(a)). ‘Due restraint’ is also to be exercised in the initiation
of countervail investigations of measures exempt from reduction commitments under
Article 6.5 (‘direct’ payments to farmers in connection with a production-limiting
programme).

There is a special safeguard provision in the Agreement on Agriculture, which permits
imposition of an additional level of duty (but not reimposition of non-tariff measures) in the
case where imports of a particular product exceed a trigger level in a given year or where
the price of imports falls below a trigger price.

The trigger level for volume of imports varies between 125% and 105% as against the
quantity imported over the last three years, depending on the level of existing market
access opportunities for imports of the product in question. Thus, for example, where
existing market access opportunities for imports amounted to 10% or less of domestic
production, an additional ‘safeguard’ level of duty could only be imposed where imports of
the product increased by 25% in the year in question over the average annual quantity
imported for the previous three years. However, if existing market opportunities for
imports were above 30% of domestic production, a safeguard could be imposed if the
volume of imports of the product surged by only 5% over the average annual quantity
imported over the previous three years. Where the volume of domestic consumption has
changed, the volume of imports must exceed the sum of the trigger level and domestic
changes in consumption. This reflects the fact that increases in domestic consumption are
likely to mitigate the extent to which domestic producers are injured by import surges—
there is a larger domestic market to absorb the additional imports. On the other hand,
where imports surge at the same time as domestic consumption is decreasing, the injury to
domestic producers is likely to be aggravated.

The trigger price level is set at an average 1986 to 1988 reference price. Varying levels of
‘safeguard’ duties may be imposed depending upon the extent to which the price in a given
year falls below this trigger price level. For instance, where the price in a given year is 40%
less than the trigger price level, a 10% duty would be permitted. If, on the other hand the price
were 60% less than the trigger price level, a duty of 20% would be permitted. The
formulae for calculating these various rates of safeguard duty are contained in Article 5.5(a)-
(c) of the Agreement.

DISPUTE SETTLEMENT AND THE AGREEMENT ON
AGRICULTURE

The Agreement on Agriculture, and related provisions of other WTO Agreements, have
been considered by panels and/or the Appellate Body in several rulings, and in one case also
by a NAFTA Chapter 20 Dispute Settlement panel.

In the Desiccated Coconut case, the panel considered the applicability of provisions of the
Agreement on Agriculture countervailing duty investigations undertaken prior to entry into
force of the WTO Agreements. Among the arguments of the complainant, the Philippines,
was that pursuant to Article 13 of the Agreement on Agriculture Brazil was prohibited from
continuing countervailing duties against its exports of coconut, since the subsidies on
coconut fully complied with provisions of the Agreement on Agriculture concerning
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reduction of domestic support measures.43 The panel cited Note 4 to Article 13, which
provides that the countervailing duties referred to in the Article are those covered by
Article VI of GATT 1994 and Part V of the WTO Subsidies Agreement. Having already
determined that these countervailing duties, by virtue of being imposed on the basis of an
investigation prior to entry into force of the WTO Agreements, were not covered by
Article VI or the Subsidies Agreement, the panel likewise found that Article 13 did not
apply. The Philippines had argued that Article VI could apply independently of the Subsidies
Agreement, and therefore that the phase-in provisions of the latter should not be used to
exclude a claim exclusively based on Article VI— the panel noted that the reference to
Article VI and the Subsidies Agreement together in Article 13 in fact reinforced its prior
conclusion that an Article VI action was not available where the Subsidies Agreement itself
did not apply, because the measures were based on an investigation that pre-dated the entry
into force of the Agreement. The Philippines did not appeal the panel’s interpretation of the
Agreement on Agriculture, and the Appellate Body upheld the findings of the panel on the
broader issue concerning applicability of Article VI and the Subsidies Agreement.

The Bananas case concerned the allocation of tariff quotas for bananas by the European
Community pursuant to preferences granted under the Lomé Convention. Among the
arguments of the complainants (several Central American countries and the United States)
was that the allocation of tariff quota shares as between Members violated Article XIII of the
GATT, which provides for nondiscriminatory administration of quantitative restrictions.
The EC had claimed that the Agreement on Agriculture had the effect of exempting tariff-
quotas in its bound schedule from the requirements of Article XIII. In particular, the EC
pointed to Article 4.1 of the Agreement on Agriculture which states that ‘Market access
concessions contained in Schedules relate to bindings and reductions of tariffs, and to other
market access commitments as specified therein.’ The Appellate Body rejected the view
that, by virtue of this language, the concessions in the Schedules referred to was no longer
subject to Article XIII disciplines. The AB noted a number of explicit limitations to the
application of the GATT contained in the Agreement on Agriculture and concluded: ‘the
negotiators of the Agreement on Agriculture did not hesitate to specify such limitations
elsewhere in that agreement; had they intended to do so with respect to Article XIII of the
GATT 1994, they could, and presumably, would have done so.’44 Another inter-esting
feature of this case is that the AB took the view that provisions of the General Agreement on
Trade in Services (GATS) could apply to the allocation of import licences to banana
importers and distributors (‘operators’ within the meaning of the EC regulations). The AB
held that the activities of these intermediaries came within the classification ‘wholesale trade
services’ in respect of which the EC had taken a full commitment in its Schedule of Specific
Commitments. Thus, discriminatory allocation of such licences was in violation not only of
the GATS MFN provision (Article II) but the National Treatment obligation as well (Article
XVII), which applies only to activities bound in a Member’s Schedule of Specific
Commitments (paras 217–28). Where in fact wholesaling services have been bound in a
member’s schedule, this ruling may have significant implications for the operation of
various kinds of marketing licence and quota allocation schemes that continue to
characterize the agricultural sector in a number of countries.
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Most recently, in the Poultry case, a panel had occasion to interpret the special safeguard
regime in Article 5 of the Agreement on Agriculture. One of the claims of the complainant,
Brazil, was that the EC had not followed the procedures set out in Article 5.1 in its
imposition of a price-based special safeguards on imports of frozen meat. Article 5.1, as
discussed above, provides that safeguard may be imposed if the price of imports falls below
a certain trigger price, determined in relation to a 1986–8 reference price. The EC had
calculated the price of imports without adding in the bound duty amount—Brazil argued
that this was an incorrect application of Article 5.1. The panel referred to the fact that Article
5.1 stipulated that the price for purposes of comparison with the trigger price was that at
which ‘imports may enter the customs territory of the Member granting the concession’.
Since imports cannot ‘enter’ without duty having been paid, the correct price for purposes
of comparison with the trigger price would include the amount of duty to be paid.45 The
panel also noted that the ‘terms of Article 5.1(b) should be construed narrowly, so as not to
frustrate the attainment of the security and predictability in trade through the tariffs-only
regime in Article 4.2 (para. 280).’ One member of the panel dissented from this conclusion,
suggesting that there was some evidence that the drafters had considered but rejected explicit
language that would have referred to ‘duty paid c.i.f. import price’. According to this panel
member the fact that in several places Article 5 refers only to ‘c.i.f. import price’ without
any qualification suggests an unambiguous rejection of the notion that the price should be
calculated inclusive of duties. However, this might equally have been because negotiators
considered the language ‘may enter’ made it suffi-ciently clear that the price would be one
based on duty having been paid. The panel member made another, very obscure argument
that including duty in the price could in some cases result in the impossibility of imposing a
safeguard regardless of how low the pre-duty price had fallen, and that another result,
presumably unacceptable, would be that in some cases imports with lower pre-duty prices
but higher post-duty prices would not be eligible for safeguard protection, whereas some
other imports with higher pre-duty prices (but lower duties) would be eligible. In our
view, these results are not at all anomalous, but entirely consistent with the objective of
creating a ceiling on the amount of protection that imports can enjoy— the higher the
existing level of protection, the less room there should be for the imposition of additional
safeguards. The main purpose of the safeguards is after all to provide some leeway where
Members have taken a chance on reducing signifi-non-vio- their level of protection. On
appeal, however, the AB adopted the view of the dissent, referring to ‘customary usage in
international trade’ of the acronym ‘C.I.F’ which did not include customs duties, an
interpretation that ignores the context of this expression in 5.1(b). Nevertheless, the AB
found a violation of Art 5.5, which requires that only the C.I.F. price, and no other
methodology, be used to calculate safeguard duties. The EU regulation had provided for an
alternative method, where the importer did not require that the C.I.F. price be used or did
not meet certain conditions.

In the Agricultural Tariffication case a NAFTA panel considered the relationship between
Canada’s tariffication of domestic support measures in its Schedule pursuant to the WTO
Agreement on Agriculture and its tariff elimination obligations in the NAFTA.46 The United
States argued that by virtue of its obligation to eliminate tariffs on most of the products
concerned in NAFTA, Canada was prohibited from applying its tariff equivalents for
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quantitative restrictions with respect to US imports. Canada argued that the WTO
Agreement on Agriculture was an agreement later in time within the meaning of the Vienna
Convention and therefore prevails over the conflicting NAFTA provisions. Canada also relied
upon a provision of the FTA (Article 710), later incorporated into NAFTA, which stipulates
‘the Parties retain their rights and obligations with respect to agricultural, food, beverage
and certain related goods under the General Agreement on Tariffs and Trade (GATT) and
agreements negotiated under the GATT, including their rights and obligations under GATT
Article XI’. The United States’ view was that this provision applied only to such agreements
as were already in force at the time of the FTA, or alternatively, when this FTA provision was
incorporated into NAFTA, which would thereby exclude the WTO Agreement on
Agriculture—this view relied heavily on the use of the word ‘retain’ in the provision. The
panel found that, despite the word ‘retain’, Article 710 referred to an evolving system of
law, not a set of obligations frozen in the past. It noted that, elsewhere, when the Parties
had sought to incorporate only pre-existing obligations or rights, they had used expressions
such as ‘existing provisions’ or ‘existing obligations’. Perhaps more fundamentally, the
panel noted that a bizarre consequence would follow from the American interpretation of
710 as incorporated into NAFTA—the pre-Uruguay Round GATT right to adopt
quantitative restrictions pursuant to Article XI(2)(c) would be incorporated into NAFTA,
thereby creating with respect to Canada—US trade a less liberal regime (in as much as QRs
are regarded as more distortive of or threatening to free trade than tariffs) than prevailed
multilaterally. Thus, ‘to adopt the approach of the United States would be to endorse an
interpretation of Article 710 that does not further the NAFTA objective of trade
liberalization’ (para. 167).

There was a further issue of whether, even if Article 710 did apply prospectively, the
WTO Agreement on Agriculture actually established tariffication as a ‘right’ or ‘obligation’
within the meaning of 710. As noted earlier in this chapter, the final text of the Agreement
on Agriculture was produced following a last-minute compromise between the EU and the
United States; this required frantic drafting exercises. In the Agricultural Tariffication case,
the United States was able to show that, if one read the text of the Agreement very
carefully, in fact there was no clear language that established tariffication as a right or
obligation, despite the fact that (as noted above) tariffication of quantitative restrictions was
a crucial ele-ment in the overall deal, including from the perspective of the United
States itself! The panel made a careful examination of the travaux preparatoires for the
Agreement on Agriculture, including the Dunkel Draft and the Modalities Document that
had been the fundamental basis of negotiations, and came to the conclusion that

the arrangement under which agricultural non-tariff barriers were eliminated rested
on a simple bargain. States agreed to eliminate their non-tariff barriers as a quid pro
quo for the right to replace them with ‘tariff equivalents’. That is, they were
replacing protection in the form of quotas or other non-tariff barriers with protection
in the form of tariffs. This right to establish such tariffs was also subject to certain
reduction and volume commitments,…’ (para. 185).
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In a related finding, the panel held that the schedules annexed to the Marrakesh Protocol
‘crystallized the arrangement for eliminating non-tariff barriers’ (para. 189) and that by
accepting each others’ schedules as part of the ‘package’ Members had essentially consented
to the manner in which non-tariff barriers had been converted into tariffs by each country.
Thus, the United States could not now claim that some of Canada’s tariff equivalents were
not in fact based on prior nontariff measures but actually constituted new, additional
protection. While there is no legal reason why a WTO panel would have to defer to this
interpretation of the Agreement on Agriculture and related instruments, if such an approach
were followed, it would effectively preclude any challenges to a Member’s Members’
tariffication as not properly based on methodologies agreed in the negotiations. This
obviously has implications that go well beyond the interrelationship between NAFTA and
the Agreement on Agriculture. We are not entirely certain of the soundness of such an
approach, which implies that were a Member not to object to a Member’s tariff equivalents
between the publication of schedules in February 1994 and the signing of the Marrakesh
Protocol two months later, it would forever be stopped from invoking dispute settlement,
if it considered that a particular tariff equivalent did not reflect the terms of the
fundamental tariffication bargain. The panel’s position would have been stronger had it
actually adduced evidence that Members were aware of the need to examine schedules of
other Members for consistency with that bargain before the Protocol was signed, or at least
before the coming into force of the WTO Agreement on 1 January 1995.

CONCLUSION

The Uruguay Round Agreement on Agriculture marks a vital turning point with respect to
the regulation of trade in agricultural commodities. Implementing the Agreement, and
particularly its complex disciplines on domestic policies, will be a major challenge for the
WTO. It will be equally important, however, for political leaders to maintain the
courageous stance that ultimately allowed them to sign the Final Act, and to win domestic
legitimacy for freer trade in agriculture. This will entail carefully crafted adjustment
policies for affected farmers and their communities, as permitted by the Agreement on
Agriculture. It should also involve, however, a vigorous public defence of the justification
for liberalizing agricultural trade, including a clear explanation of the gains to domestic and
global economic welfare. Disappointingly, some governments have instead responded to the
farm lobbies’ predictable criticisms by pretending that little has changed.47 The extent to
which the Agreement realizes its promise, however, will be significantly affected by the
capacity of governments to obtain public support for liberalization, thereby permitting
specific commitments to liberalization that eventually exceed the rather modest minimum
reductions required by the Agreement itself. Some trade diplomats and policy analysts place
great hopes on the new institutional framework of the WTO as a means of sustaining and
intensifying the liberalization commitments of the Uruguay Round.48 Ultimately, however,
the full potential of the Agreement will only be realized if citizens view the Uruguay Round
liberalization of trade in agriculture, not as a damage control exercise or a concession to the
unreasonable demands of others, but rather as a promising new beginning. 
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11
Trade in services

INTRODUCTION

In the developed industrial countries, services now account for 50% to 60% of GNP1 and in
North America in particular are at present the largest source of new jobs in the economy.2

At the same time, trade in services is thought to account for only about 20% to 25% of
world trade.3 As comparative advantage in the production of many manufactured goods has
shifted to the Newly Industrializing Countries (NICs), the developed industrial countries
have become increasingly concerned with enhancement of trading opportunities in services,
particularly in areas such as financial services, insurance, telecommunications,
transportation, computer and professional services (e.g. architecture, engineering, law).

The pre-Uruguay Round GATT framework applies only to trade in goods, reflecting
traditional assumptions that services are not easily tradeable. These assumptions have come
into question for a variety of reasons. First of all, because of technological developments, it
is possible to effect many services transactions without physical proximity between the
provider and consumer of the service.4 For example, many international banking or
insurance transactions can be accomplished through electronic data transfers. Second, in
almost all countries through most of the post-war period, many important service industries
had been highly regulated, or maintained as state monopolies (telecommunications,
transportation). The regulatory reform trend during the 1970s and 1980s resulted in a
removal or loosening of prior substantial limits on domestic competition in these industries,5

thereby focusing new attention on the possibilities of international competition. It is of
significance that regulatory reform in a wide range of countries has led to (at least partial)
liberalization of markets in service industries such as telecommunications and transportation
that themselves provide the means to bring together providers and users of many other
services; for example, in many countries on-line computer services have become both more
feasible and less expensive as a result of regulatory reform in telecommunications.6 Third,
many services have traditionally been viewed as functions integral to the production of
goods, e.g. storage of customer or other data or engineering designs. The ‘splin-tering'7 of
services from goods, and the increasing use of external contracting to obtain service inputs
into the production of goods (or, indeed, inputs into other services) have created new
explicit markets. The logic of external contracting for services within a domestic economy
(i.e. that better contract terms can be had outside the firm) seems equally applicable to



external contracting with foreigners. Conversely, the globalization of production functions
within the multinational corporation (discussed in Chapter 13 on trade and investment), can
be extended to include international intra-firm trade in service inputs into production either
of goods or of other services. Sauvant notes the example of an American insurance company
that processes claims in Ireland: ‘Insurance claims collected in the United States are shipped
daily by air to Ireland, where they are processed. The claim information is then sent
through transnational computer communication systems back to the United States, where
checks are printed and explanations of benefits are mailed out.’8

In light of these various developments, all of which create increased potential for
international trade in services, the reduction or elimination of barriers to services trade
became a major priority of a number of developed countries in the Uruguay Round of
GATT negotiations.

In this chapter we will consider the characteristics of traded services and the nature of the
barriers to such trade. We will then examine provisions related to trade in services in a
range of international agreements, including the Canada-US Free Trade Agreement, the
North American Free Trade Agreement, the OECD Code on Invisibles and, most
importantly, the Uruguay Round General Agreement on Trade in Services (GATS). The
chapter will conclude with a consideration of the issues in trade in services in two sectors of
particular importance to the global economy—financial services and telecommunications.
Here, a major focus will be on the sector-specific provisions of the FTA, NAFTA, and
GATS, as well as the future prospects for negotiation of further commitments to
liberalization within the GATS/WTO framework.

THE NATURE OF SERVICES

There is a wide range of economic literature that attempts to define the nature of services,
the intrinsic differences between goods and services, and how these differences affect (if at
all) the application of the neo-classical theory of comparative advantage to trade in
services.9 At the level of general principle, there is no reason why the logic of gains from
specialization and trade should not apply to services. Nevertheless, the factors that
determine comparative advantage in services may often be rather different from those that
determine comparative advantage with respect to goods. For instance, ‘natural’ factor
endowments such as land and minerals will be of less importance than in the case of many
goods, while ‘man-made’ factors such as knowledge and skill will be of paramount
importance.10 Nevertheless, one should be wary of exaggerating these differences—for
example, countries with beautiful scenery may have an advantage in the export of tourist
services.

Traditionally, economists have attempted to define services largely by contrast with
goods. Therefore, definitions have emphasized the intangibility or invisibility of services,
their supposedly non-durable or transitory character, or the notion that, unlike with goods,
consumption and production occurs simultaneously.11 It is, however, possible to find
exceptions to each of these definitions. For example, is there anything intangible or invisible
about an architect’s drawing or a design for an integrated circuit? With respect to
transitoriness, as Nicolaides notes, ‘a lecture, or occasionally a bank transaction, is longer
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than the lifetime of an ice-cream’.12 Also, with respect to some services (e.g. most
television programmes) consumption and production are not simultaneous.
Understandably, given these kinds of anomalies, none of these definitions has attracted any
kind of consensus within the economic literature. It has sometimes been argued that
services that are inputs in the production of traded goods should not be viewed as traded at
all. The real trade transaction, it is claimed, occurs when the good itself, in which various
service inputs are embodied, crosses national boundaries. This view was taken by the
United States when it first sought to place the issue of services on the Uruguay Round
agenda. The United States argued that the negotiations should be limited to trade in
nonfactor services, i.e. services that could themselves be viewed as finished products, such
as financial services, thereby excluding services that could be viewed solely as inputs into
production (e.g. construction crews).13 This distinction rather transparently served US self-
interest: liberalization would occur with respect to knowledge- and technology-intensive
services in which the USA had a comparative advantage, but would not occur with respect
to labour-intensive services in which developing countries might have an advantage over the
United States.14

It is not difficult to appreciate the artificiality of the distinction between services as final
products and services as inputs. Most of the services often described as final products are
also important inputs into the production, marketing and distribution of goods, including
financial services that provide the capital required for production. At the same time, since
goods that are primarily inputs into the production of other goods are governed by trade
rules on goods, it seems illogical that services that are inputs into the production of goods
(or indeed other services) would not also be governed by trade rules that apply to services.

A particular conceptual difficulty exists with respect to services that are embodied in
goods as a medium for the delivery of the service. Literature and recorded music, for
instance, could plausibly be considered as services that are embodied in or transmitted to
the user through goods. However, trade in these services has been traditionally
conceptualized as trade in the goods which embody them. Would it be more appropriate to
subject the trade in question to rules on services?

These various definitional quagmires are largely avoidable, however, if instead of
attempting an abstract definition, one looks to the purpose of creating trade rules on
services in the first place. The purpose is to reduce or eliminate barriers to trade that are not
caught by existing rules, since those rules have been designed largely with a view to
liberalizing trade in goods. From the perspective of trade law and policy, what is most
important is to be able to identify a set of barriers that should be reduced or removed to
facilitate trade in services. Of course, the nature of these barriers arises from certain
identifiable characteristics shared by a significant number of service industries (such as a high
degree of domestic regulatory control or the importance of free movement of capital and
labour to trading opportunities) but some non-service industries may also possess some of
these characteristics. For this very reason, the knowledge of which traits of service
industries are important from the point of view of trade liberalization may not generate a
satisfactory abstract or conceptual definition of services, i.e. a definition that rigorously
delineates goods from services in an essentialist manner.
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BARRIERS TO TRADE IN SERVICES

Many barriers to trade in services relate to the modes of supply characteristic of service
industries. Thus, in many cases a commercial presence may be necessary or highly desirable
in order to provide services in another country—thus the liberalization of foreign direct
investment is directly related to the liberalization of trade in services. Another way in which
services are traded between providers of one country and consumers of another is through
movement of people. Here, immigration restrictions that prevent temporary entry for
purposes of providing a service, as well as restrictive licensing and certification
requirements, may constitute barriers to trade in services. Services may also be traded
through the movement of data and money across borders (insurance and accounting are
examples)—thus, exchange and capital movement controls, as well as regulation or
restriction of trans-boundary data flows may constitute barriers to trade in services. In
other cases trade in services occurs through access of the provider and/or consumer to a
network, either international or domestic or both—the terms of access or interconnection
with such networks may constitute barriers to trade in services. Where the network is
owned and operated by a dominant market player and/or former monopolist, competition
policy issues become intertwined with the removal of barriers to trade in services (as is the
case with telecommunications services).

The very fact that barriers to trade in services are so heterogeneous and difficult to
quantify makes a comprehensive approach to their discipline extremely difficult to
conceptualize. Some would clearly be caught by a National Treatment obligation, but many
others would not. As well, and perhaps more fundamentally, many of the barriers
(particularly those that are not discriminatory or directly targeted at foreign providers)
relate to fundamental domestic regulatory choices (such as between regulated monopoly or
competition in a particular sector) or quality regulation, for instance, requirements for
training and certification of professionals that allow for limited recognition of foreign
credentials but do not directly discriminate on the basis of the nationality of the provider as
opposed to the source of her training.

Ultimately, removal of these barriers would require harmonization of domestic
regulatory regimes or (as in the European Union blueprint for liberalization of financial
services) home country regulation, whereby a service provider is given the right to enter a
foreign market provided it complies with its home country’s regulatory requirements. In
the case of professional services, the equivalent to home country regulation is mutual
recognition of qualifications or licences, whether in accounting, engineering, law or
architecture (law is perhaps the most problematic of all these cases, since a country-specific
knowledge base may often be seen as a legitimate pre-condition for professional
competence).

Many advocates of liberalization of trade in services see the argument for free trade
internationally as linked to the purported benefits of deregulation domesti-cally.15 Yet
whether strict or liberal regulation (and these terms arguably conceal a much more subtle
set of instrument choices)16 maximizes domestic welfare depends on complex judgments
about market failures, and the costs and benefits of a particular regulatory approach in light
of the risk preferences of one’s own citizens. Three important and related observations
follow from this insight. First of all, the global gains from liberalization of trade in services
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should be conceptually separated from gains or losses to domestic welfare that may be
entailed by the regulatory changes required to produce a level playing field to sustain
liberalization. If we assume a beginning point where the regulatory choices of each member
state represent a social optimum that maximizes domestic welfare within that state, then
any changes in regulation needed to sustain liberalization in trade are likely to reduce
domestic welfare—the global gains from trade that are yielded by liberalization must be
then traded off against domestic welfare losses. Of course, if some countries’ domestic
regulatory regimes are sub-optimal from the perspective of domestic welfare, then
liberalization may yield gains in excess of those from liberal trade itself.

On the other hand, in the absence of a high but level playing field, free trade in services
may lead to spillovers that distort the global allocation of resources. For example, where lax
regulation of a bank in one country results in failure of financial institutions or prejudice to
depositors in another that have placed large deposits in that bank, significant costs will be
incurred by the public authorities in that other country. The possibility of free trade in
services allows countries to shift beyond their own borders some of the negative welfare
effects of their regulatory approaches, thus driving a wedge between domestic and global
welfare. Thus in the absence of agreed minimum regulatory standards, free trade in services
may actually result in a net reduction in aggregate global economic welfare—i.e. the gains
from free trade are more than outweighed by the reduction in global welfare due to the
opportunities for externalizing the costs of domestic regulatory approaches abroad that are
created by liberalization.

However, the existence of such spillovers has already led to considerable regulatory
cooperation in a number of highly significant service sectors. The world’s leading financial
powers have accepted guidelines for capital adequacy of banks under their regulatory control
(the Cooke Committee guidelines, negotiated under the auspices of the Bank for
International Settlements in Basel (BIS) although the Asian Crisis showed the need to go
much further in these respects);17 cooperation between domestic securities regulators has
become increasingly effective in containing contagion effects where instability or regulatory
failure in one market undermines market confidence elsewhere;18 and in
telecommunications and aviation, coordination of a wide variety of domestic regulatory
policies that have transboundary impacts occurs through a variety of bodies, including
the International Telecommunications Union (ITU) and the International Civil Aviation
Organization (ICAO).

It would be wrong to suggest that any of these fora or processes is leading or can lead in
the foreseeable future to a genuinely level playing field, or to a resolution of all important
conflicts over differences in domestic regulatory philosophy or regulatory interests. At the
same time, the evidence does indicate that, as markets in service sectors have become
increasingly globalized, cooperative mechanisms have emerged to manage regulatory
spillovers and constrain ‘beggar-thy-neighbour’ regulatory competition.
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INTERNATIONAL AGREEMENTS FOR THE
LIBERALIZATION OF TRADE IN SERVICES

The Canada-US Free Trade Agreement (FTA)

Article 1402.1 of the Canada-US FTA states a basic National Treatment obligation with
respect to services: ‘Each Party shall accord to persons of the other Party treatment no less
favourable than that accorded in like circumstances to its persons.’ This general obligation
applies to a wide range of measures, including the right of establishment, access to domestic
distribution systems, and generally any measure related to ‘the production, distribution,
sale, marketing and delivery of a covered service’. The National Treatment obligation
applies to a limited number of sectors listed in an Annex to these provisions. The sectors
range from construction to insurance to public relations.

The general National Treatment obligation is followed by a limitations clause, which
permits deviation from national treatment, where ‘the difference in treatment’ is ‘no
greater than that necessary for prudential, fiduciary, health and safety, or consumer
protection reasons’ (Article 1402(3)(a)). Such deviations must be ‘equivalent in effect to
the treatment accorded by the Party to its persons for such reasons’. Suppose, for instance,
a Canadian province was to require American construction service providers to post a bond
to assure that funds were available to pay occupational health and safety or workers’
compensation claims, but did not demand the same of local firms. The argument would first
of all be made that the differential treatment of Americans is due to the fact that they are
unlikely to have valuable assets in the jurisdiction that can readily be seized or attached in
case of non-payment of these claims. Equivalence in effect would be established by showing
that this required bond has much the same regulatory impact on American operators as
provisions permitting seizure and attachment in the case of local providers. On the other
hand, if it turned out that local laws did not provide means of securing judgment against
local firms for such payments, the American firm could argue that the regulatory impact
was not, indeed, equivalent in effect. Finally, prior notification of differential treatment
must be provided to the other Party, and the Party imposing the differential treatment must
bear the burden of justifying it.

The National Treatment obligation in the FTA is subject to grandfathering, i.e. it does
not apply to existing measures, or to continuation, ‘prompt renewal’, or amendment of
existing measures. In the case of amendment, however, the effect must not be to decrease
conformity with National Treatment. Obviously, the distinction between an amendment
and a new measure is one that has no self-evident legal meaning. New comprehensive
legislation would almost certainly be considered in the nature of a new measure, but the
case of alterations that are more than caretaking amendments but less than a basic policy
overhaul would be more difficult to classify.

The grandfathering provision may reflect in part expectations arising from the tendency
toward deregulation and regulatory reform that was among the most prominent policy
trends in both the United States and Canada—as well as in many other countries—during
the late 1980s.19 As these dynamics led to liberalizing reforms in both countries, the new
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measures, presumably more conducive to free trade in themselves, would then be caught by
the FTA, which would prohibit a future retreat to more restrictive approaches.

It should be noted that the National Treatment obligation in the FTA is not accompanied
by an MFN obligation. Therefore, a Party to the FTA is free to treat services provided by a
third country more favourably or less favourably than those provided by the other FTA
partner, where this treatment is also superior to that provided to its own nationals. Also,
there is a provision that serves the same function as do rules of origin in the case of trade in
goods, Hence, Article 1406.1 permits the other Party to deny the benefits of the National
Treatment obligation with respect to services where it can be established that ‘the covered
service is indirectly provided by a person of a third country’. Clearly, this is a very rough rule
of thumb—for instance, would a Japanese insurance company or architectural firm that
provides services to the US market through a Toronto office where both Japanese and
Canadian nationals are employed, be viewed as ‘a person of a third country’? Or what of a
Canadian engineering company that supplied advice on a particular project to an American
client, but on the basis of groundwork done by a multinational team of mining engineers?

In addition to the general National Treatment obligation, sectorally specific treatment is
given to telecommunications and financial services (to be discussed in detail in the final part
of this chapter). As well, there are provisions that mandate in some instances, and
encourage in others, the development of common standards in various professional
disciplines, e.g. architecture—enabling mutual recognition of some professional
qualifications and facilitating movement of some service providers (but not labour in
general) across the Canada-US border.

The North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA)

The NAFTA takes an approach to liberalization of trade in services that is similar to that of
the Canada-US FTA. However, one significant difference is that, unlike the FTA, the
NAFTA contains an MFN obligation that applies with respect to both Parties and non-Parties
(Article 1203). A second significant difference is that both the National Treatment (Article
1202) and MFN obligations in NAFTA are not limited to specific service sectors but are
applicable to services generally.20 Instead, a ‘negative list’ approach is adopted, whereby
reservations are noted with respect to particular service sectors or particular measures
within certain sectors to which a Party does not want these obligations to apply. The only
service industries excluded altogether from coverage by the Services Chapter of NAFTA are
those ‘associated with energy and basic petrochemical goods and air services’. However, the
reservations noted by Canada, the United States and particularly by Mexico in Annexes to
the NAFTA apply to a wide range of measures in various service industries. Very extensive
reservations apply for one or more of the NAFTA Parties with respect to transportation
(especially maritime shipping) and some professional services (especially law). In addition,
further Annexes are to contain reservations with respect to measures of sub-national
governments. These lists may well be quite lengthy, as in both Canada and the United States
provincial and state governments (respectively) are deeply involved in the regulation of
many services, particularly professional services.

THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE 265



In contrast to the FTA, existing services measures are not grandfathered in the NAFTA,
although there is to be a two-year delay with respect to state and provincial measures to
allow these governments adequate time to elaborate satisfactory lists of reservations (Article
1206). As in the FTA, the communications and financial services sectors are dealt with in
separate, sectorally-specific Chapters (Chapters 13 and 14), to be discussed in the final part
of this chapter.

In addition to the National Treatment and MFN obligations, which address direct and
facially discriminatory barriers to trade in services, the NAFTA provides a framework for
removal of other classes of barriers. For instance with respect to direct but facially neutral
barriers—defined in the NAFTA text as ‘nondiscriminatory measures relating to the cross-
boundary provision of a service’ (Article 1208)—Parties are invited to list specific
commitments in Annex VI of the NAFTA (to date, very few such commitments have been
made). As well, the NAFTA Parties are to engage in further negotiations with respect to
temporary licensing of engineers on the basis of mutual recognition of professional
credentials. These negotiations are to take place within a year of the entry into force of the
NAFTA itself (Annex 1210 (Professional Services) Section C).

The OECD Invisibles Code

The Invisibles Code21 requires OECD Members to eliminate between each other
‘restrictions on current invisible operations’ (Article 1). The expression ‘current invisible
operations’ refers to a wide variety of transboundary service transactions, listed in Annex A
of the Code. These include, inter alia, many forms of technical assistance to businesses,
including training, market research, and provision of plans and blueprints, construction and
maintenance services. As well, ‘current invisibles operations’ includes transactions that
facilitate transboundary services provision. Thus, transboundary movement of the salaries
and wages of non-resident workers is included in the list in Annex A.

Members are permitted to lodge reservations and (in some circumstances, such as a
domestic economic or financial crisis) derogations from the basic obligation to remove
restrictions on current invisible operations, but must indicate their reasons for doing so.
These reasons are periodically scrutinized by the Committee on Capital Movements and
Invisibles Transactions. The Committee may recommend to a Member that it remove a
reservation, but these recommendations do not have binding legal force. Reservations
appear to be lodged most frequently with respect to audio-visual, maritime transport and
insurance services.22

The Invisibles Code contains a general limitation clause that allows Members to take
measures that they consider necessary for reasons of public order, protection of public
health morals and safety, or for reasons of domestic or international peace and security
(Article 3).
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The General Agreement on Trade in Services (Uruguay
Round Final Act)

Background

It was largely due to the insistence of the United States that trade in services was placed on
the Uruguay Round agenda.23 This initiative generated much controversy and disagreement
among other Contracting Parties, especially (but not exclusively) developing countries.24

The reasons for this controversy can be traced to two interconnected factors. First of all, a
major motivation for the United States’ initiative was the belief that unlike many basic
manufacturing sectors where it was losing global markets as well as part of its domestic
market to NIC competitors, service sectors remained a strength of the United States,
especially sectors like financial services and telecommunications, considered to be highly
knowledge-and technology-intensive. Some developing countries responded to this logic,
and drew the conclusion that liberalized trade in services would result in their domestic
providers being out-competed by American firms. Moreover, most developing countries
could see little benefit accruing to them through access to the services markets of other
countries. It was argued that the comparative advantage that developed countries possessed
with respect to services was due to their overall higher level of economic and technological
development, and if liberalization of trade in services occurred under these conditions,
developing country providers would lose their domestic services markets before even
having had a chance to acquire comparative advantage in service sectors. This was, in
essence, a variant of the infant industry argument for protection that had often been invoked
by developing countries in previous GATT negotiations with respect to trade in goods.

Some economists, the most prominent among them Jagdish Bhagwati, challenged the
notion that developing countries possessed no comparative advantage in service sectors.25

They noted that a range of developing countries (e.g. India) possessed significant numbers
of highly-trained professionals such as engineers and accountants who were typically paid far
less than equivalent professionals in the developed industrial countries. Moreover, some
services (such as construction) were labour intensive, thereby potentially conferring a
comparative advantage on developing countries with abundant supplies of skilled or semi-
skilled labour. Finally, the NICs, which had already acquired the capacity to manufacture
medium- and some high-technology goods, could be expected to have some export
potential with respect to related services, such as computer software.

In fact, these claims seem to be borne out by recent statistics. Between 1980 and 1987, a
significant number of developing countries increased substantially the share of their total
exports accounted for by services (including Egypt, Chile, and the Philippines).26 Moreover,
in at least a dozen developing countries, in 1987 the percentage of total exports accounted
for by services approached, equalled or even exceeded that of many developed countries.27

Although at the level of general principle the United States espoused the idea that
negotiations on services should have a comprehensive scope, the US position on the
definition of services themselves had the effect of focusing the negotiations on those sectors
of most export interest to the United States and other developed countries (e.g. cross-
border transactions in sectors such as telecommunications and financial services), while
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excluding liberalization of factor movements, especially labour,28 where developing
countries might often have a comparative advantage (e.g. ship’s crews, construction gangs,
etc.).

A second, important concern shared by many countries as well was the aggressive
‘market access’ approach to an accord on services that appeared to be taken by the United
States. The United States appeared interested not only in the extension of the National
Treatment obligation to services, but also in negotiating whatever changes in countries’
domestic regulatory structures might be necessary to allow market access by foreigners.
Since, as we discussed in ‘Barriers to trade in services’ (this chapter) many of the barriers to
trade in services do indeed result from fundamental choices of regulatory instrument by
individual countries (e.g. state monopolies, licensing, or rate-setting), or from regulatory
diversity itself, there was some substantive justification for a market access approach.
However, the ultimate implications for domestic policy sovereignty would be profound.
While all international trade obligations involve some surrender of domestic sovereignty, it
was understandably far from clear to many Contracting Parties that the benefits of
liberalization would outweigh the costs of substantially constraining or altering their
domestic regulatory approaches. Since the Reagan Administration was firmly persuaded
that the domestic changes required to meet its market access demands (e.g. privatization
and deregulation) would also be of considerable benefit to the countries adopting these
changes, it did not see any profound conflict of domestic and global interests in trade in
services. Indeed, a range of countries (including some developing nations) had embarked
unilaterally on ambitious programmes of deregulation and privatization and it could be
argued that a GATT services agreement would be one means of attaining some reciprocal
trade benefit from these policy shifts. Nevertheless, contrary to crude ‘free market’
rhetoric, deregulation and privatization entail complex transitional issues and formidable
challenges of regulatory redesign.29 It is not surprising, therefore, that even countries with
short-or long-term intentions of liberalizing domestic competition in key service sectors did
not want their room to manoeuvre fundamentally constrained or pre-empted by a
multilateral market access agreement.30 As well, negotiated reciprocal market access could
easily turn into a market-sharing or managed trade arrangement, in tension with the general
principles and philosophy of the GATT. This would be especially true if the position of
some American experts were adopted31 and these market access commitments were
negotiated on a discriminatory non-MFN basis.

As the negotiations evolved, insistence on a non-MFN approach became an important
means of the US backtracking from its original ‘open borders’ rhetoric, as many US providers
became increasingly worried about having to compete with foreigners in their own market.
Where domestic US service providers were opposed to more competition at home, it
would always be possible to insist that commitments in the area in question should be
negotiated on a reciprocal basis, on the grounds that other countries were not prepared to
open up their markets suffi-ciently to justify free access for foreign producers to the US
market. The large degree of indeterminacy in assessing how much other countries’ specific
commitments to liberalization were worth in terms of reciprocal access to one’s own
markets actually permitted a wide scope to the United States for justifying on reciprocity
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grounds its increasing refusal to make broad multilateral commitments to liberalize access
to its own markets.

The negotiations, despite numerous impasses, were brought to at least a partial
resolution (i.e. agreement on a framework with negotiations in some sectors to continue)
on the basis of a number of carefully-negotiated compromises. First of all, it was agreed that
liberalization of trade in services would be negotiated under the ‘umbrella’ of the Uruguay
Round, but with a view to the conclusion of an accord that would be legally separate from
the GATT itself, i.e. a General Agreement on Trade in Services (GATS). Since agreement
was reached on the institutional framework for a World Trade Organization (WTO), it was
possible to maintain GATS (as well as the Agreement on TRIPs) as separate from GATT,
but to place GATS nevertheless within the overarching framework of the WTO. With
respect to the debate over MFN, however, the United States insisted to the very end on
being able to exclude almost entirely certain sectors (e.g. maritime services) from the
general framework of the GATS, and also on being able to negotiate on a reciprocal basis
market access commitments with specific countries, which would be excluded from MFN
treatment. With respect to financial services (to be discussed in the final section of this
chapter), it was necessary to provide a special accommodation for the United States with
respect to MFN exemptions in order to allow the Round to close at the mid-December
deadline.

Understanding the GATS

The GATS is a highly complex accord. The GATS contains an MFN obligation that applies
to services generally, subject to reservations taken by individual members within some
narrow exceptions. However, National Treatment and most other disciplines (including a
prohibition on quantitative restrictions of various kinds, known as ‘market access’) apply only
where Members have made specific commitments to such coverage in the Schedules—these
commitments may be either general in scope with respect to a given mode of delivery for a
service (e.g. local business presence) or they may apply to specific sectors; commitments
for a mode of delivery also may contain certain qualifications on National Treatment and
‘market access’. Thus, in a very real sense, the schedules of specific commitments
constitute the pith and substance of the GATS.

Parts I and II of the GATS provide a set of general rules and principles with respect to
liberalization of trade in services. Here, the GATS may be said to apply or adapt some of the
key concepts and principles of the GATT to trade in services. Parts III and IV provide a
framework for the negotiation of specific market access commitments to be bound in the
schedules of individual Members. Part V contains provisions concerning dispute settlement
and enforcement of obligations. Part VI deals with a variety of definitional issues in the
application of the GATS. There follow a series of Annexes on exemption from MFN
treatment, movement of persons, financial services, telecommunications, and air transport
services. In addition, there is a series of eight Decisions concerning various aspects of
implementation and interpretation of the GATS (ranging from financial services to dispute
settlement).
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The following discussion covers all of these various provisions and instruments, except
those specifically addressed to the financial services and telecommunications sectors, which
will be dealt with in the final part of this chapter.

Part I

The definitions in Part I evoke a very broad view of the meaning of trade in services,
without thereby attempting to define services themselves. Along these lines, the GATS is to
apply not only to ‘supply of a service…from the territory of one Member into the territory
of any other party’ (I.2(a)), but also to such ‘supply’ ‘in the territory of one Member to the
service consumer of any other Member’ (I.2(b)) and through ‘the presence of service
providing entities of one Party in the territory of any other Party’ (I.2(c)), as well as ‘by
natural persons of one Party in the territory of any other party’ (I.2(d)). Clearly, I.2(c)
directly bears upon the treatment of foreign investment, including the right of
establishment, and I.2(d) on the right to enter a state of which one is not a national. What
kind of measure would involve a restriction on the supply of a service on the territory of
one Party to the consumer of another may at first glance seem obscure. An example might
be a requirement that nationals of country A engage in certain banking or securities
transactions only within country A and not in other Contracting Parties. Here, what is being
restricted is not the flow of other Contracting Parties’ services into A but access of A’s
customers to services offered by providers of other Contracting Parties.

Article I.2(d), which refers to supply of services ‘through presence of natural persons of
a Member in the territory of any other Member’, would seem to imply that the scope of the
GATS extends to include liberalization of movement of persons. However, this is not an
area where, pursuant to Parts III and IV of GATS, Members are under any obligation to
negotiate specific commitments. This is reinforced by the Annex on Movement of Natural
Persons Supplying Services Under the Agreement, which states that ‘In accordance with
Parts III and IV of the Agreement, Members may negotiate specific commitments with
respect to movement of natural persons’ (emphasis added). The Annex also states that the
GATS does not apply in respect of ‘measures affecting natural persons seeking access to the
employment market of a Member, nor shall it apply to measures regarding citizenship,
residence or employment on a permanent basis’ (Article 2). However, a limited concession
to the concern of developing countries that the GATS extend to movement of people is to
be found in the Decision on Movement of Natural Persons, which provides that negotiations
on movement of persons are to continue beyond the Uruguay Round through the
establishment of a ‘negotiating group on movement of natural persons’. The negotiating
group is to conclude negotiations within six months of the entry into force of the Agreement
establishing the WTO and to present a final report to the Council on Trade in Services at
that time, when any commitments that result from the negotiations will be inscribed in
Members’ individual schedules.32

Article 1.3 sets out the entities to which GATS strictures on services will apply. This
includes not only three levels of government (described as ‘central’, ‘regional’, and ‘local’)
but also ‘non-governmental bodies in the exercise of powers delegated’ by these three
levels of government. This last inclusion represents an important departure from typical
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GATT practice of only seeking to bind governmental entities, whether directly in the case of
Members’ central governments or indirectly in the case of sub-national governments. The
departure reflects the fact that in some countries, various professional services are often self-
regulating in whole or in part (legal services, accounting, architecture and some health
services are typical examples). A rather different kind of example would be the Canadian
Radio and Television Commission—a public body created pursuant to statute but explicitly
intended to exercise public authority independent from the government of the day. An
important question will become whether a formal or functional definition of delegated
powers is to be employed in the interpretation of this sub-section. Some self-regulating
bodies (e.g. the Committee that promulgates the City rules that apply to London securities
houses) do not exercise directly delegated powers, but could be argued to perform a
function that in many other Contracting Parties would be given to a government agency (in
this case a Securities Commission like the US SEC). The formal perspective would be more
in keeping with the GATT tradition of relating disciplines only to direct government action,
but could result in an arbitrary asymmetry of obligations, with Members that choose a self-
regulating approach to certain sectors being subject to less discipline than those that adopt
more direct regulatory instruments, or at least structure self-regulation as explicitly
delegated regulatory power.

In any case Members (i.e. states) remain responsible for the compliance of these non-
governmental entities with GATT provisions. One view of such an obligation, that would
go hand in hand with a functional view of delegated powers, is that a positive obligation is
imposed on governments to curb the practices of these enti-ties that violate the GATS. The
notion that the GATS—as a liberalizing agreement—could involve an obligation to regulate
may seem, at first, odd. However, it should be noted that numerous provisions of the
Agreement on TRIPs (Trade-Related Intellectual Property Measures) impose requirements
of this kind with respect to protection of intellectual property rights.

Part II

MFN treatment

Article II: 1 requires that MFN treatment be accorded ‘immediately and unconditionally
to services and service providers of any other country’. Article 11:2 however, allows a
Member to maintain exemptions to MFN treatment, provided that the Member lists the
exempted measure in the Annex on Article II Exemptions, and provided that the conditions
listed in that Annex are complied with. The conditions include: that exemptions granted for
more than five years shall be reviewed by the Council for Trade in Services to determine
‘whether the conditions which created the need for the exemptions still prevail’ (Annex:
Articles 3, 4(a)); that exemptions should not last for more than ten years and must be
subject to negotiation in subsequent rounds of multilateral negotiations.

These provisions reflect a compromise between American insistence that, at least in
many key sectors, the USA should not be required to open up its markets to countries not
prepared to provide an adequate equivalent degree of market access, and the concerns of
many other Members that the GATS do not evolve into a tangled web of bilateral sectoral
deals, i.e. into a regime of sectoral managed trade at odds with basic GATT principles of
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rules-based multilateral liberalization. In essence, the USA and other countries that so wish
are permitted to continue to pursue liberalization arrangements based on reciprocity, but
the justification for refusing to extend these arrangements to other Members on an
unconditional MFN basis is subject to ongoing scrutiny within the framework of the WTO.

Article II: 3 exempts from the MFN requirement ‘advantages’ conferred on ‘adjacent
countries in order to facilitate exchanges limited to contiguous frontier zones of services that
are both locally produced and consumed’. Part II contains a range of substantive obligations
that are binding on all Members. Some of these obligations apply to trade in services
generally, while others apply only where a Member has made specific commitments to
market access in its schedule. Article III: 1 requires prompt publication of ‘all regulations of
general application, which pertain to or affect the operation’ of GATS, and Article III:3
requires, at a minimum, annual reporting to the Council for Trade in Services of any new
measures ‘which signifi-cantly affect trade in services’ covered by specific commitments in a
Member’s schedule. Article VI:1 provides that in sectors where specific commitments are
undertaken, each Member shall ensure that all measures of general application affecting
trade in services are administered in a ‘reasonable, objective and impartial manner’ and
Article VI:2 requires that administrative and/or judicial review of decisions that affect trade
in services be available, subject to any constraints that may arise due to a Member’s
constitution or the nature of its legal system. 

Among the most important substantive provisions of Part II is the framework for scrutiny
of technical barriers to trade in services set out in Articles VL4–5. The Council for Trade in
Services is to develop a set of disciplines on these barriers (including ‘qualification
requirements and procedures, technical standards and licensing requirements’) so as to
ensure that these measures do not ‘constitute unnecessary barriers to trade in services’.
This work is to occur under ‘appropriate bodies’ established by the Council. The resultant
disciplines will ensure that measures such as qualification requirements and technical
standards are, inter alia: ‘(a) based on objective and transparent criteria, such as
competence and the ability to supply the service; (b) not more burdensome than necessary
to ensure the quality of the service; (c) in the case of licensing procedures, not in
themselves a restriction on the supply of the service’ (Article VI:4). The Decision
Concerning Professional Services, which is part of the Uruguay Round Final Act provides
that ‘the work programme foreseen in Article V, paragraph 4…should be put into effect
immediately’. For these purposes a Working Party is to be established, which is to give priority
to the elaboration of multilateral disciplines with respect to regulation of the accounting
profession (Article VI:5(a) of GATS makes the criteria in Article VI:4 immediately and
directly33 applicable to domestic measures in a sector where a Member has already made
specific commitments in its schedule, at least where there is a possibility that the measures
in question may nullify or impair specific market access commitments in a Member’s
schedule).

Article VII is aimed at the multilateralization of existing arrangements for recognition of
educational and other credentials in the licensing or certification of service providers.
Whether such recognition is afforded to particular countries unilaterally or on the basis of
negotiated reciprocity (i.e. mutual recognition), other Members must be given the
opportunity of demonstrating that credentials, licensing or certification in their country are
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also worthy of recognition. Moreover, ‘a member shall not accord recognition in a manner
which would constitute a means of discrimination between countries in the application of its
standards or criteria for the authorization, licensing or certification of service suppliers, or a
disguised restriction on trade in services’ (Article VIL3).

Articles VIII and IX concern monopolies and restrictive business practices. Article VIII
requires that Members ensure that monopoly service suppliers act in a manner that is not
‘inconsistent’ with the Article II MFN obligation, or with specific commitments in the
Member’s schedule. Moreover, Members are required to prevent ‘abuse’ of monopoly
position, where a domestic monopolist is competing in the supply of a service over which it
does not have monopoly rights (Article VIII:2). An obvious example would be that of a
telecommunications concern that has a monopoly over local service but competes with
respect to long distance and other services. Article IX provides for mandatory consultations
where a service provider is believed to be restricting competition through business practices
other than those described in Article VIII.

Part II of the GATS contains safeguards provisions and a set of general exemptions to
GATS obligations. Article X of GATS provides that a permanent safeguards provision shall
be negotiated within a three-year period. In the interim, Members are free to modify or
withdraw specific commitments under the GATS provided that the Member justifies before
the GATT Council that its measures are urgently needed and must be taken before the end
of the three-year period contemplated for negotiation of a permanent safeguard instrument.
There is an additional provision that permits the reimposition of restrictions on trade in
services that would otherwise be inconsistent with a Member’s specific commitments,
where necessary to address serious balance-of-payments difficulties or other ‘external
financial difficulties’ (Article XII). Such restrictions must, inter alia, be applied on a non-
discriminatory basis and be consistent with the IMF Articles of Agreement.

Article XIII exempts government procurement from the MFN and National Treatment34

obligation of the GATS, subject to a requirement that negotiations on government
procurement of services take place within two years of the establishment of the WTO.
Articles XIV and XIV bis contain general exceptions to GATS obligations, modelled
respectively, on Articles XX and XXI of the GATT. Article XIV exempts from GATS
discipline measures ‘necessary to protect public morals or to maintain public order’ as well
as ‘human, animal or plant life or health’, provided these are not ‘a means of arbitrary or
unjustifiable discrimination between countries where like conditions prevail, or a disguised
restriction on trade and services’. In addition to these exceptions, virtually identical to
some of those in Article XX of the GATT, exceptions are also provided that reflect
particular concerns with respect to service sectors, for example privacy concerns with
respect to transborder data flow (Article XIV(c)(iii)). As well, Article XIV(d) exempts from
the National Treatment obligation differential tax measures for foreign service providers,
where these special measures are necessary, for example, to counter tax avoidance or
evasion. Article XIV bis provides an exception for measures taken for the ‘protection of
essential security interests’, and is for all relevant purposes, virtually identical to Article XXI
of the GATT. Finally, Article XV requires Members to enter into negotiations with a view
to multilateral disciplines on subsidies that affect trade in services, as well as on the issue of
countervailablility of subsidies to service providers. Currently only subsidies on goods are
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countervailable under domestic trade remedy laws of the major trading states, and the
GATT provisions on subsidies can be taken to authorize countervailing duty actions only
with respect to trade in goods. Subject to the future negotiations contemplated by Article
XV, GATS may be said to prohibit the imposition of countervailing duties in as much as
these would violate the general MFN obligation in Article II of GATS. Article XV also
provides that a Member that deems itself adversely affected by the subsidy of another
Member may request consultations with the other Member. Such requests for consultations
must be given sympathetic consideration.

Parts III and IV

Parts III and IV of the GATS apply with respect to specific market access commitments
provided by Members in their schedules. 

Scheduling of specific commitments

The methodology for scheduling of specific commitments is based on the four modes of
supply identified in Part I of the GATS: cross-border supply, consumption abroad,
commercial presence, and temporary entry of natural persons. With respect to each of
these modes of supply, Parties have made either horizontal commitments (across all sectors)
or specific commitments (with respect to a particular sector) or none (in which case the
Member lists itself as ‘unbound’ with respect to that mode of supply). Either horizontal or
specific commitments with respect to each mode of supply may be subject to conditions and
limitations on market access or conditions and qualifications on national treatment. Market
access refers to the obligations with respect to elimination of quantitative restrictions in
Article XVI(2). Specific commitments have been scheduled based upon a classification of
activities developed by the GATT Secretariat and based on the United Nations Central
Product Classification. Nevertheless, there is no legal obligation that Member’s use this list.
Each country’s schedule can be accessed through the WTO web site, which contains a useful
guide as to how to read a schedule (www.wto.org).

It is difficult to estimate what degree of liberalization has actually been achieved by the
specific commitments bound in the Uruguay Round. Hoekman35 has attempted to measure
these results in terms of the number of commitments bound, the number of sectors covered
by each Member, and the extent to which restrictions have been placed on market access
and National Treatment. With respect to the number of commitments bound the results are
summarized in Table 11.1. With respect to sectoral coverage, weighted by the economic
importance of the sector and the degree of restrictiveness (which determine together the
liberalizing value of commitments in a given sector), Hoekman’s findings are shown in
Table 11.2. With respect to the magnitude of commitments where no conditions or
qualifications are listed with respect to market access and/or National Treatment, Hoekman
remarks: ‘The figure for high income countries is 25 percent, for low- and middle-income
countries 7 percent. These numbers vividly illustrate how far away GATS members are
from attaining free trade in services, and the magnitude of the task that remains.’36 Sauve
suggests:
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Virtually all the commitments scheduled under the GATS—including by OECD
countries—represent a binding of the status quo rather than a rollback of existing
restrictions to trade and investment in services. Such a regulatory freeze, which in
many cases involves important qualifications and limitations (suggesting that some
Members may, in fact, have offered less than the status quo) in effect establishes the
liberalization frontier which successive rounds of negotiations will have as a central
objective to push back [footnote omitted] .37

Article XVI:1 reaffirms the application of the MFN principle to specific commitments. A
footnote to this article also specifies that where a Member makes a    particular market
access commitment, and where ‘cross-border movement of capital is an essential part of the
service itself’ the Member is thereby committed to liberalizing the movement of capital.
Article XVI:2 prohibits the imposition of quantitative restrictions on trade in services with
respect to those sectors where a Member has made specific commitments. The prohibited
quantitative restrictions include limitations on the number of service providers, on the total
value of service transactions, and limitations on the participation of foreign capital, either in
terms of a percentage limit on foreign shareholding or on the total value of foreign
investment, either in the aggregate or by a single entity.

Article XVII contains a National Treatment obligation with respect to sectors listed in a
Member’s schedule. ‘Formally different treatment’ of foreign suppliers may be consistent
with the National Treatment obligation—provided of course that such formally different
treatment nevertheless is ‘no less favourable’ in effect. However, this is very much a two-
edged sword—for ‘formally identical treatment’ may be deemed to violate the National
Treatment obligation where the measure in question nevertheless ‘modifies the conditions
of competition in favour of domestic service suppliers’. This approach to National
Treatment, which goes beyond a ban on intentionally discriminatory measures, reflects the
view that equal treatment implies adjustment of domestic regulatory regimes so that foreign
suppliers have substantively equal competitive opportunities. Article XVIII states explicitly
that Members may negotiate and bind within their schedules additional commitments
beyond those that Articles XVI and XVII require with respect to any sector listed in a
Member’s schedule of specific commitments. Thus, a ban on quantitative restrictions
(Article XVI) and National Treatment (Article XVII) may be said to constitute (subject to
any reservations that are lodged; see below) the minimum required content of liberalization
commitments with respect to any specific sector contained in a Member’s schedule.
However, it is anticipated that additional commitments to particular regulatory changes
(e.g. ‘qualifications, standards or licensing matters’) will also occur with respect to those
sectors on a Member’s schedule.

Further negotiations

Article XIX commits Members to enter into ‘successive rounds of negotiations… with a
view to achieving a progressively higher level of liberalization’. Liberalization is to occur ‘on
a mutually advantageous basis’ and should secure ‘an overall balance of rights and
obligations’. It is made explicit that what is involved is not merely the discipline of
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Table 11.1 GATS members: number of commitments scheduled

Note. The maximum number of commitments is 620–155 activities multiplied by 4 modes of
supply.
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measures that discriminate against foreign suppliers directly or intentionally, but more
generally ‘the reduction or elimination’ of measures which have ‘adverse effects on trade in
services’. This legitimizes the notion that Members should be prepared to put on the
bargaining table any domestic regulatory measure that has the effect of limiting market
access. The far-reaching implications of this provision for domestic policy sovereignty are
somewhat balanced by the statement in Article XIX:2 that ‘the process of liberalization shall
take place with due respect for national policy objectives and the level of development of
individual Members, both overall and in individual sectors’.

Developing countries

Article XIX:2 further specifies that ‘there shall be appropriate flexibility for individual
developing countries for opening fewer sectors, liberalizing fewer types of transactions,

Table 11.2 Sectoral coverage of specific commitments (%)

Source: Author’s calculations based on WTO and World Bank data.
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progressively extending market access in line with their development situation and, when
making access to their markets available to foreign service suppliers, attaching to it
conditions aimed at achieving the objectives referred to in Article IV, which include inter
alia the strengthening of developing countries’ capacity in service sectors as well as
liberalization in service sectors of export interest to these countries. Article XIX must be
read in conjunction with the delicate compromise concerning the MFN obligation in Article
II and in the Annex on Article II Exemptions. As discussed above, in light of US refusal to
proceed with certain sectoral negotiations on an MFN basis it was necessary to allow for
certain exemptions from MFN treatment for specific sectoral commitments. However, as
also noted above, these exemptions will be subject to ongoing scrutiny by the Council for
Trade in Services, which will ‘examine whether the conditions which created the need for
the exemptions still prevail’ (Annex on Article II Exemptions). Arguably, Article XIX
provides some significant guidelines to the Council in its examination of whether an
exemption from MFN treatment is needed. Article XIX:2 may be said to set reasonable
expectations with respect to the pace and extent of liberalization, particularly for
developing countries. If, on the whole, the specific commitments of such countries are
consistent with these reasonable expectations, an exemption from MFN treatment in the
schedule of a developed country should not be justifiable on the basis that developing
countries have not suffi-ciently opened up their own markets to allow for, in the words of
Article XIX:1, ‘an overall balance of rights and obligations’.

Safeguards

Article XXI provides that a Member may permanently withdraw or alter a specific
commitment in its schedule at any time after three years following the entry into force of the
Agreement. This is subject to a requirement of three years’ advance notice, and to prior
negotiation of a ‘compensatory adjustment’ where necessary. Such compensatory
adjustments are to be made on an MFN basis, and are aimed at maintaining ‘a general level
of mutually advantageous commitments not less favourable to trade than that provided for
in schedules of specific commitments prior to such negotiations’ (Article XXI:2(a)). This
provision makes it clear that modification or withdrawal of specific commitments by a
particular country or countries is not to be used as a pretext for a broader move by other
countries to narrow the scope of MFN-based liberalization. Where negotiations on
compensation fail, binding arbitration under WTO auspices shall decide what compensatory
adjustment, if any, is required.

The provisions of Article XXI clearly go beyond the traditional GATT ‘safeguards’
concept of temporary reneging on commitments. However, it should be emphasized that
much of what Members will be binding in their schedules will consist of specific domestic
regulations or regulatory changes. As technology, as well as social and economic conditions,
evolve it is essential that Members have some scope for adjusting their domestic regulatory
frameworks.
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Dispute settlement and institutions

Part V contains provisions that relate to the institutional framework of the Services
Agreement, and more specifically, to dispute settlement. The Council for Trade in Services
is to have a very broad mandate for implementing the Agreement. It ‘shall carry out such
functions as may be assigned to it to facilitate the operation of [the] Agreement and further
its objective’. The Council, and normally any subordinate body of the Council, is to be
open to participation by all Members. This makes it clear that failure to provide a given level
of specific liberalization commitments will not exclude any Member from participation in
the decision-making of the Council (including decision-making about where exceptions to
MFN treatment are justifiable). With respect to dispute settlement, the normal WTO
procedures apply to GATS (these are outlined in the Understanding on Rules and
Procedures Governing the Settlement of Disputes, which builds on Articles XXII and XXIII
of the GATT). One difference, however, is that with respect to GATS, the Dispute Settlement
Body (DSB) may only authorize suspension of concessions where ‘it considers the
circumstances are serious enough to justify such action’ (Article XXIII:2). Moreover, it is
only concessions under GATS that may be suspended—retaliation may not be authorized in
the form of suspension of concessions under any other Agreement in the WTO. By virtue
of Article XXIII: 3 the concept of non-violation nullification or impairment is extended to
GATS. The Decision on Certain Dispute Settlement Procedures for the General Agreement
on Trade in Services provides that a special roster of panellists is to be established for
purposes of settlement of disputes under GATS. These panellists are to have ‘experience in
issues related to the General Agreement on Trade in Services and/or trade in services,
including associated regulatory matters’ (Article 3). Moreover, ‘panels for disputes
regarding sectoral matters shall have the necessary expertise relevant to the specific service
sectors which the dispute concerns’ (Article 4).

Rules of origin

Part VI represents a very basic attempt to state rules of origin for services. Article XXVII
specifies that a Member may deny the benefit of the Agreement, where it establishes that
the ‘service is supplied from the territory of a non-Member’ or to a corporation that is not a
‘service supplier’ of another Member. Neither of these rules permits of straightforward
application. With respect to the first, the concept of ‘territory’ is very difficult to apply in
the case of multinational service provision. Take, for instance, the case of a multinational
law firm that provides legal services to nationals of a GATS Member with respect to a
business deal that involves a non-Member (e.g. Russia). Some of the work may be done in
the firm’s Moscow office, but many of the client contacts and even the negotiations may
take place on the territory of GATS Members. How, then, can one decide whether the
service in question is being provided from the territory of a nonMember? In the case of
rules of origin for trade in goods, this is dealt with by specifying a threshold percentage of
the value of the good that must be accounted for by economic activity within a Member
country. With respect to the second rule, it depends upon the determination of corporate
nationality, a very difficult issue in many service sectors where trade in services is
dominated by multinational enterprises that have no unambiguous national identity (unless
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one invokes purely formal criteria such as the place of incorporation of the parent company,
the head office location, etc.). 

FINANCIAL SERVICES

The OECD Code on Liberalisation of Capital Movements

The Capital Movements Code38 requires OECD Members to ‘progressively abolish
between one another, restrictions on movements of capital to the extent necessary for
effective economic cooperation’ (Article 1(a)). Annex D establishes a list of capital
movements to which the Code applies. This includes a very wide range of transactions
required for the transboundary supply of financial services, including banking, insurance,
and securities. Members may lodge reservations and (in some circumstances) derogations with
respect to the general obligation of progressive removal of restrictions. There is an MFN
obligation with respect to domestic regulation that affects providers of financial services
from other Member countries as well as an MFN obligation with respect to other OECD
Members. However, the Code also encourages, without requiring, Members to extend the
advantages of liberalizing provisions of the Codes to non-Members.

The European Union

Liberalization of trade in services within the European Union is stated as an objective in the
Treaty of Rome, and is a major aspect of the Europe 1992 programme, reflected in the Single
European Act (1986).39 In the financial services sector,40 the approach of the Union to
liberalization of trade is based on the closely related principles of mutual recognition, home
country rule, and minimum regulatory harmonization.41 Mutual recognition entails the
granting of market access to an institution from another EU Member State, based on the
institution’s compliance with regulatory requirements in its home country. The related
principle of home country rule stipulates that the regulatory authorities in the home country
retain responsibility for prudential supervision of the institution even where what is
involved is activities in other EU states. Hence, market access is not granted on terms of
compliance with the (non-discriminatory) regulation of the ‘importing’ country (as with
National Treatment) but on condition that the entity meet relevant regulatory requirements
in its own country.42 Unlike National Treatment-based approaches, mutual recognition and
home country rule, taken together, imply not only the elimination of direct and facially
discriminatory barriers to service provision by foreigners but also the removal of those
indirect and facially neutral barriers that exist where the foreign providers face costs in
adapting products or operations so as to meet the distinctive regulatory requirements of the
importing or host state.

However, since mutual recognition and home country rule necessarily entail reliance on
another state’s regulators and regulations to protect one’s own citizens, an essential quid pro
quo is a set of minimum standards sufficient to provide even the country with the strictest
regulatory requirements the needed confidence in the regulatory regimes of the others.
This is reflected in the third principle, minimum regulatory harmonization. 
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The minimum standards to which EU Member States’ regulatory regimes must conform
are set out in the 1989 Second Banking Directive.43 As Kim notes, these standards cover a
very wide range of regulatory requirements, including ‘initial capital requirements,
disclosure of a credit institution’s major shareholders, limitations on the size of participation
in nonfinancial undertakings, standard solvency ratios, and permissible activities’.44

‘Minimum’ regulatory harmonization thus entails, in fact, a very significant degree of
harmonization.

It is important to note that the European Union has a strong, permanent institutional
structure that allows for ongoing consultation and cooperation among the regulators of the
various Member States, and for further harmonization. This allows for ongoing adjustment
of common minimum standards in response to experience with liberalized trade in financial
services, and allows adaptation of harmonized requirements to changes in the industry, such
as the introduction of new products and the changing interrelationship between banking and
other financial services. It may be difficult to extend the EU approach to bilateral or regional
contexts where this kind of common institutional framework does not exist. As well, unless
the minimum common standards are in fact set quite high, the EU approach may lead to ‘unfair
trade’ complaints from domestic institutions who must now compete with foreign
providers who have lower regulatory costs because their home country’s regulatory
standards are laxer. In such a situation, an EU-style approach could create downward
pressures on the regulatory standards of the stricter countries. Where, however, it is the
stricter countries that have the bargaining power to ensure that the common minimum
standards remain high, or are moved upward, the end result may in fact be a higher
standard. It should be noted that, within the European Union, the two major powers,
France and Germany, have what are generally considered relatively strict, rather
conservative approaches to regulation of financial services (in comparison, say to Italy or the
UK). This may give an important clue as to why liberalization of trade in financial services
has not led to downwards harmonization.

The Canada-US Free Trade Agreement (FTA)

The Canada-US FTA takes a National Treatment approach to liberalization of trade in
financial services between the Parties. The failure to move to an approach based on regulatory
harmonization or mutual recognition reflects significant assymmetries in domestic
regulatory approaches in Canada and the United States prior to the FTA, especially with
respect to banking.45 In Canada, there are strict entry requirements for the banking sector,
but once a bank is chartered or licensed, it can engage in banking business, as well as in
securities business, throughout the country. The United States regime is characterized by ease
of entry into the banking business, but by continued prohibition, under the Glass-Steagall
Act, of bank participation in the securities business, as well as limits on inter-state banking.
Prior to the FTA, Canadian banks had already obtained important exemptions from the
limits on inter-state banking in domestic US regulation. Canadian banking laws prohibit
concentrated ownership of banks—no one shareholder may own more than 10% of a
Canadian chartered bank. In addition, strict limits are also imposed on foreign ownership—
the aggregate of foreign-held shares in a chartered bank may not exceed 25%. Given these
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limitations, a foreign-owned bank that wishes access to the Canadian market must establish
itself as a ‘Schedule IF bank, with limited powers to engage in branch banking, and also
limitations on assets. The aggregate assets of foreign ‘Schedule II’ banks may not constitute
more than 16% of the total assets of the Canadian banking system.

Under Article 1703 of the FTA, the United States is exempt from the main limitations
imposed on foreign ‘Schedule II’ banks in Canadian banking regulation, and from
discriminatory treatment under federal laws that apply with respect to non-bank financial
institutions such as trust companies (except the 10% limit on a single shareholder’s stake).
However, since most regulation in the non-bank financial sector in Canada is provincial, the
commitments are of less significance than with respect to banking. Canada also makes a
general commitment to go beyond National Treatment and to ‘liberalize further the rules
governing its markets’ (Article 1703.4).

While US institutions thus gain considerably enhanced access to the Canadian market,
Canadian institutions do not gain a comparable increase in access to the US market.
Canadian banks do preserve some of their existing rights and privileges under US law, such
as exemptions from restrictions on inter-state branching (1702.2) and the right to deal in
government securities (1702.1). As well, Canadian institutions are promised National
Treatment with respect to future changes to domestic US regulation, including the Glass-
Steagall Act (1702.3). However, unlike Canada, which commits itself to liberalize further
its domestic regulatory regime for financial institutions, the United States itself makes no
such commitment. Instead, the preservation of Canada’s existing access to the US market is
premised on further Canadian unilateral liberalization of regulations (1702.4). In the FTA,
the USA may thus be said to have succeeded in achieving a one-sided agreement on financial
services—obtaining considerably greater market access in Canada, while yielding no
immediate effective increase in access to its own markets. This success in the bilateral
context may be one underlying reason why the United States, as will be discussed below,
was so resistant to accepting a genuine multilateral approach to liberalization of trade in
financial services within the GATS.

The North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA)

Unlike the FTA, the NAFTA contains general MFN (Article 1406) and National Treatment
(1405) obligations with respect to financial services, as well as a Right of Establishment.
The Right of Establishment is, however, recognized only as a ‘principle’ and this principle is
subject to requirements that separate financial institutions deliver separate services (1403.2
(a)), thereby protecting the provisions of the US Glass-Steagall Act from scrutiny under
NAFTA. As well, although the Right of Establishment includes the right to ‘expand
geographically’ within the territory of another Party (1403.2(b)), compliance with the
principle of a Right of Establishment is only to be subject to review by the NAFTA Parties
once the United States has chosen of its own accord to lift domestic restrictions on
interstate banking activity by foreign institutions (1403.3).

The National Treatment obligation in Article 1405 is based not upon the notion of
facially non-discriminatory treatment, but rather of ‘equal competitive oppor-tunities’
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(Article 1405.5–7). This provides considerable scope for claims that neutral domestic
regulation nevertheless does not create a level playing field for competition.

Article 1407.1 provides that ‘each Party shall permit a financial institution of another Party
to provide any new financial service of a type similar to those services that the Party permits
its own financial institutions, in like circumstances, to provide under domestic law’, subject
to any non-discriminatory domestic regulatory control over the ‘the institutional and
juridical form through which the service shall be provided’. Article 1407.2 provides for free
transboundary flow of data between NAFTA Parties in connection with the provision of
financial services. Significantly, this is not subject to any obligations with respect to the
protection of personal privacy or commercial confidentiality. Pursuant to Article 1408,
Parties may make reservations with respect to their adhesion to the Right of Establishment,
National Treatment, MFN and other obligations set out in Articles 1403–1407. Mexico, in
particular, has filed a complex schedule for phasing in these obligations over a six-year
period (1994–2000), as well as a safeguard provision to apply between 2000 and 2007
(Annex VII(B)-Mexico). The schedule entails an expanding set of limits on the aggregate
market share of foreign institutions (whether from NAFTA Parties or nonParties), as well
as the individual market share of any one foreign institution. Separate limits apply with
respect to each individual part of the financial services sector (banking, securities,
insurance, etc.). For example, aggregate limits on banks will increase from 8–15% from
1994 to 2000, and may be frozen at 25% between 2000–7 under the safeguard provision. It
should be noted that the safeguard provision applies only with respect to aggregate limits on
market share; individual firm limits are to be phased out completely by the year 2000.46

Article 1410 exempts from the obligations contained in the NAFTA Chapter on Financial
Services, ‘reasonable measures [taken] for prudential reasons’. These will include measures
taken to protect investors and other market participants, as well as for purposes of
maintaining the ‘safety, soundness, integrity or financial responsibility’ of financial
institutions, or to ensure ‘the integrity and stability of a Party’s financial system’. There are
special provisions with respect to dispute settlement concerning the NAFTA financial
services chapter. Members of dispute panels are to be chosen from a special roster of
individuals with expertise in ‘financial services law or practice, which may include the
regulation of financial institutions’ (Article 1414.3(a)).

The Uruguay Round Services Agreement (GATS)

The GATS contains two Annexes on Financial Services as well as an Understanding on
Commitments in Financial Services and a Decision on Financial Services. These various
instruments reflect the incompleteness of the negotiations on financial services at the
closure of the Uruguay Round in December of 1993, as well as a compromise between
different views as to how the negotiations should be completed. The United States took the
view, during the final period of negotiations leading up to the December deadline, that
other countries had not offered sufficient sectoral liberalization commitments in financial
services to justify US adherence to a multilateral, MFN-based framework. The United
States therefore stated its intent to take an MFN exemption with respect to its own
commitments under a GATS agreement on financial services, and to proceed with bilateral
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and regional negotiations on liberalization of trade in financial services.47 This would, in
effect, amount to an opting out of the multilateral track towards liberalization. Through a
mechanism described in more detail below, a compromise was reached whereby the United
States would suspend its MFN exemption for a six-month period after the coming into force
of the Final Act in 1995, during which period a further attempt would be made at
multilateral negotiation of liberalization commitments within the GATS/WTO framework.
If this attempt succeeded, the USA would permanently withdraw its MFN exception. If
these further negotiations resulted in an impasse, the USA would be free to reinstate the
exception and proceed along bilateral and regional lines.

The Annex on Financial Services does not contain any specific liberalization
commitments with respect to trade in financial services, but rather concerns the application
of the GATS to the financial services sector. Article 2.1, for example, provides an
exemption from GATS strictures of measures taken ‘for prudential reasons, including for
the protection of investors, depositors, policy holders or persons to whom a fiduciary duty
is owed by a financial service supplier, or to ensure the integrity and stability of the financial
system’. This is, however, subject to the requirement that any such non-conforming
measures not be used to circumvent GATS obligations. Article 3 permits either unilateral
or mutual recognition of other countries’ ‘prudential measures’. This limited exception to
the MFN principle is subject to the requirement that, where recognition is accorded
through a negotiated agreement or arrangement, a Member must provide an opportunity
for other Members to accede to the agreement, or to negotiate a comparable deal (Article 3.
2).

In Article 5.1 of the Annex, the financial services sector is defined very broadly as
including ‘any service of a financial nature offered by a financial service supplier of a
member’. This is followed by a lengthy list of services that fall within this general
definition. The list includes a comprehensive range of insurance services, ‘traditional’
banking activities such as deposit-taking and lending, as well as underwriting of securities
and trading in virtually every existing form of security or negotiable instrument. In
addition, consulting and brokering services connected with these transactions are included
within the ambit of financial services. As is suggested by the wide-ranging character of this
summary of the list, the clear intent of Article 5.1 is to include as many activities as possible
under the rubric of financial services.

The Second Annex on Financial Services allows Members a period of six months
following the entry into force of the Agreement Establishing the WTO within which to
‘improve, modify or withdraw’ any specific commitments in their schedules with respect to
financial services, and also to finalize any MFN exemptions in their schedules. The Decision
on Financial Services stipulates that, until the expiration of this six-month period, Members
shall suspend the application of any MFN exemption already filed in their schedules. These
provisions were required in order to implement the crucial compromise discussed above,
whereby the United States agreed to extend provisionally its participation in multilateral
negotiations on financial services, without prejudice to its right to proceed on a bilateral or
regional basis if the negotiations were not to succeed within the agreed time period.

The Understanding on Commitments in Financial Services outlines a framework for
liberalization of trade in financial services which provides an alternative to that set out for
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services generally in Part III of the GATS. Members are free to choose to schedule specific
commitments in the financial sector either in accordance with Part III or in accordance with
the Understanding. The Understanding sets out a series of specific commitments that some,
but not all Members, have inscribed in their individual schedules, and which gain legal force
not from their inclusion in the Understanding but from their presence in the schedules. This contrasts
with the approach in Part III of the GATS, where Members are legally bound to inscribe
certain basic commitments within their schedules.

The commitments contained in the Understanding, taken together, represent a very
extensive degree of liberalization. Members are obligated to list in their schedules
monopoly rights with respect to financial services provision and to ‘endeavour to eliminate
them or reduce their scope’ (Article 1). Both National Treatment and MFN obligations are
to apply to government procurement of financial services (Article 2). Market access is to be
conferred on non-resident suppliers on a National Treatment basis in the areas of marine,
commercial aviation and space travel insurance (e.g. of satellites), as well as with respect to
financial data processing and transmission. A Right of Establishment is provided in Articles 5
and 6, including a right to establish a commercial presence in the territory of another
Member through acquisition of an existing enterprise. There is also a right of temporary
entry for certain classes of personnel from the financial services providers of other
Members, including senior management, specialists in financial services operations, and
certain other technical specialists (e.g. computer services personnel) (Article 9). Article 10
of the Understanding entails a commitment to ‘endeavour to remove’ a wide range of non-
discriminatory regulatory measures which are deemed to have an adverse effect on the
market access of financial services suppliers from another Member. A notable instance is
that of ‘non-discriminatory measures that limit the expansion of the activities of financial
services suppliers into the entire territory of the Member’, which would apply to limits on
inter-state branching in US domestic banking law. It is to be noted that the language
‘endeavour to remove’ stops short of formal legal commitment actually to eliminate the
measures in question. Furthermore, a Member may, as an alternative to endeavouring to
remove a measure, instead endeavour to limit its adverse effects on other Members (for
example, by not applying the measure to service providers of other Members or applying it
in a different manner). Finally, the Understanding requires that providers of other Members
be given access, on a National Treatment basis, to ‘payment and clearing systems operated
by public entities, and to official funding and refinancing facilities available in the normal
course of ordinary business’, with the exception of ‘lender of last resort’ facilities. As well,
the providers of other Members must be able to join any ‘self-regulatory body, securities or
futures exchange or market, clearing agency’ in a Member’s territory, on the same terms as
the Member’s own financial service providers. This applies whenever joining any such body
or institution is a requirement for providing financial services in the Member’s territory on
a National Treatment basis (Article 11.2).

Negotiations on commitments in financial services were in fact concluded in 1995,
although one month after the six-month period referred to in the Decision. Although 29
countries improved their schedule of commitments or reduced the scope of their MFN
exemptions, the United States was dissatisfied with the results, and in the end chose to take
a very broad MFN exemption for itself. In light of this outcome, it was decided to label the
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result of these negotiations an ‘interim agreement’, with further negotiations envisaged in
1997. These were concluded on 12 December 1997, agreement having been reached on an
additional set of improved commitments. These were such that the US was finally able to
withdraw its broad MFN exemption. The commitments are incorporated and bound in the
Fifth Protocol of the GATS, and should enter into force by March 1999. The Schedules of
Members can be accessed on the WTO web site, www.wto.org.

The WTO Secretariat summarizes the achievements of the 1997 negotiations with
respect to specific commitments as follows:

The new commitments contain inter alia significant improvements allowing
commercial presence of foreign financial service suppliers by eliminating or relaxing
limitations on foreign ownership of local financial institutions, limitations on the
juridical form of commercial presence (branches, subsidiaries, agencies,
representative offices, etc.) and limitations on the expansion of existing operations.
Important progress was also made in ‘grandfathering’ existing branches and
subsidiaries of foreign financial institutions that are wholly- or majority-owned by
foreigners. Improvements were made in all of the three major financial service
sectors—banking, securities and insurance, as well as in other services such as asset
management and provision and transfer of financial information.48

The WTO has also published a country-by-country summary of the specific commitments
agreed in December 1997.49 A total of 102 WTO members will have made specific
commitments on financial commitments once the Fifth Protocol comes into force in
1999.50

An important 1997 study by the WTO Secretariat identified the importance of appropriate
domestic policies and regulations, if financial services liberalization is to be undertaken
consistent with financial market stability, including stability-oriented monetary policies,
sound fiscal and exchange rate policies, and measures related to the prudential regulation
and supervision of financial institutions.51 The Asian financial markets crisis, which evolved
in 1997 and was a direct product of financial market openness in these countries, illustrates
the salience of such insights. In September 1997, the Basle Committee on Banking
Supervision of the Bank of International Settlements (BIS) released the Basle Core Principles
for Effective Banking Supervision: these 25 principles bear upon, inter alia, licensing, prudential
regulations and requirements, methods of on-going bank supervision, and cross-border
banking. The cross-border banking principles include the notion that banking supervisors
must practice supervision over all aspects of the world-wide operations of their internationally
active banking organizations, including contact and information exchange with host country
supervisory authorities. In the wake of the Asian crisis, a number of ambitious proposals
have developed for international sur-veillance of, and guidelines or rules on, the regulatory
oversight of financial institutions.52 At a meeting of G-8 finance ministers in early May
1998, Canadian finance minister Paul Martin Jr. put forth a plan for the creation of an
international body for financial surveillance, which would, inter alia, ‘provide a mechanism
for peer review of financial sector regulatory and supervisory regimes’ and ‘form part of the
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crisis response team in responding to Asian-style crises’. The Basle Core Principles would
inform the body’s surveillance of financial sector regulation in member countries.53

TELECOMMUNICATIONS

The Canada-US FTA

The FTA provides for the liberalization of trade only with respect to what are termed in the
Agreement as enhanced telecommunications services. The relevant provisions are contained
in an annex to the Services Chapter of the FTA (Chapter 14), entitled ‘Computer Services
and Telecommunications-Network-Based Enhanced Services’. Each Party is required to
maintain the existing access to the basic telecommunications network that it currently
provides to the other Party (Article 4). Moreover, where a Party maintains a monopoly
over basic services, it must insure that the monopoly does not abuse its power to compete
unfairly in the area of enhanced services. This means, inter alia, that a Party’s monopoly
must provide access to its basic network on terms that do not discriminate against enhanced
service suppliers of the other Party (Article 5).

As Globerman et al. observe, the significance of these provisions for liberalization of
trade in telecommunications services depends on how ‘basic’ services are defined in
contrast to ‘enhanced’ services.54 The definitions in the Annex itself are of limited
assistance. Basic telecommunications transport service ‘means any service as defined and
classified by measure of the regulator having jurisdiction that is limited to the offering of
transmission capacity for the movement of information’. Enhanced service is defined as ‘any
service offering over the basic telecommunications transport network that is more than a
basic telecommunications transport service as defined and classified by the regulator having
jurisdiction’. It seems clear enough that local and long distance telephone services fall
within the ‘basic’ category, and indeed at the time the FTA was negotiated these were
largely subject to monopoly provision in Canada. With respect to many other services,
however, it is unclear whether they should be viewed as offering ‘transmission capacity for
the movement of information’ or as providing something more. For example, there are
services that store or transform information, and thus from one perspective can be viewed
as ‘enhanced’, but which do so primarily to facilitate its movement or transmission, rather
than—as with computer services—to provide new or additional information (Store and
Forward Telex and Pager Services are two examples).

NAFTA

Chapter 13 of NAFTA is devoted to telecommunications, and embodies a rather more
extensive set of obligations than the FTA.

Article 1302 requires that a Party provide ‘persons of another Party’ access to its basic
telecommunications network ‘for the conduct of their business, on reasonable and non-
discriminatory terms’. This refers to private communications and data networks maintained
by firms for their internal use, and to the kind of enhanced services covered by the FTA. It
does not imply a right to sell or resell telecommunications capacity itself. Thus Article 1301.
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3(c) states that nothing in Chapter 13 prevents a Party ‘from prohibiting persons operating
private networks from using their networks to provide public telecommunications
transport networks or services to third persons’. Article 1302 contains a series of rather
technical provisions that define many of the elements of the right of access to the basic
network (for example, the right to attach one’s own equipment to the basic network). The
right of access may be limited where necessary, inter alia, to protect the privacy of basic
network subscribers or to protect the technical integrity of the public telecommunications
network (Articles 5–6).

Unlike the FTA, which refers to enhanced services, the NAFTA uses the expression
‘enhanced and value-added services’. This expression is defined with some precision in
Article 1310 as including services that ‘act on’ aspects of a customer’s information, provide
‘additional, different, or restructured information’; or ‘involve customer interaction with
stored information’. This is a very explicit and broad definition, which clearly encompasses
most services beyond the basic local and long distance telephone service. There is a
correspondingly narrow definition of public telecommunications transport service as a
service ‘required by a Party, explicitly or in effect, to be offered to the public generally,…
that typically involves the real-time transmission of customer-supplied information between
two or more points without any end-to-end change in the form or content of the
customer’s information’.

It should be noted that, unlike the FTA, the NAFTA confers on enhanced service
providers something more than a right to non-discriminatory access to the public
telecommunications network. Enhanced and value-added service suppliers are also to be
exempt from requirements that they cost-justify their rates or that they provide enhanced
services to the public generally (Article 1303.2(a)(b)). Finally, the NAFTA requires that the
Parties ‘consult with a view to determining the feasibility of further liberalizing trade in all
telecommunications services, including public telecommunications transport networks and
services’ (Article 1309.2).

The Uruguay Round Services Agreement (GATS)

The GATS contains an Annex on Telecommunications, which is very similar in its
substantive provisions and terminology to Chapter 13 of NAFTA. Thus, the Annex
establishes a right of access for persons of another Party to a Party’s public
telecommunications transport networks and services on ‘non-discriminatory and reasonable
terms’ (Article 5.1). However, the extent to which this right may be used by persons of a
non-Party to supply telecommunications services to others (including, presumably, what
are referred to in NAFTA as enhanced and value-added services) will depend on the specific
commitments inscribed in the schedules of individual Members (Article 2.3.1).

In addition to the GATS Annex on Telecommunications, the Uruguay Round Final Act
also contains the Decision on Negotiations on Basic Telecommunications. This Decision
entails the conduct of future negotiations ‘on a voluntary basis with a view to the
progressive liberalization of trade in telecommunications transport networks and services
within the framework of the General Agreement on Trade in Services’ (Article 1). These
negotiations are to be ‘comprehensive in scope, with no basic telecommunications excluded
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a priori’. Although the negotiations are to be open to all Members, initially only twelve
countries announced their intention to participate. Significantly all of these are developed
countries, except Mexico (which is obligated by NAFTA to undertake ‘consultations’ of a
similar nature in the NAFTA framework). The Decision provides for the establishment of a
Negotiating Group on Basic Telecommunications, which must conclude its negotiations and
make a final report by 30 April 1996.

Pursuant to the Decision, 69 countries eventually participated in the Negotiations on
Basic Telecommunications. However, on the 30 April 1996 deadline, the United States
walked out of the talks, dissatisfied with other countries’ liberalization offers, and particularly
concerned with respect to the treatment of satellite services and lack of discipline on anti-
competitive practices.55 The WTO Secretariat intervened and successfully proposed an
extension of the deadline into early 1997. One issue that threatened the extended talks was
the asymmetry between accounting pricing for telecommunication services to other
countries provided from the United States and the international rates or accounting and
settlement, which reflected inflated and unreal cost structures. Under these circumstances,
if a US carrier wished to provide service to the US from another country it would typically
have to price the service based on the international accounting and settlement practices;
however, a foreign carrier could enter the US and use the resale market to provide
international service to its home country at low US rates. Ultimately, a unilateral US
regulatory solution was achieved—a foreign carrier could only enter the US resale market
to provide service to its home country, if that carrier accepted a price cap on the accounting
rates for US carriers providing such service.

Finally, in mid-February 1997 the negotiations reached a successful conclusion. In general,
the United States was sufficiently satisfied with the offers of other countries that it was
prepared to make MFN commitments in most areas; however, Canada’s insistence on
continued protection for Teleglobe, its satellite provider, coupled with Canadian refusal to
lift foreign investment restrictions in the telecoms sector, may have contributed to a
decision by the United States to take an MFN exception with respect to digital-audio
satellite services.56 Because of the nature of basic telecommunications, the most important
commitments relate to market access (e.g. the number of service suppliers allowed),
National Treatment with respect to operations (e.g. licensing and the conditions for service
provision attached to licences or otherwise legally mandated) and foreign investment
(obviously related to the local presence required to compete in most, although not all,
sectors the basic telecoms market, for example as a primary long distance carrier for
residential users).

Commitments achieved in the February deal in these and other areas are bound in
Member’s schedules, and constitute the Fourth Protocol to the GATS, which entered into
force on January 1998. Bronckers and Larouche summarize the commitments as follows:

[sixty-one countries made] commitments to liberalize the provision of voice
telephony to some extent. Two countries only liberalize voice services to closed user
groups [footnote omitted]. International voice services are liberalized in forty-two
schedules (fifty-six countries), national long distance services in thirty-seven
schedules (forty-one countries), and local services in forty-one schedules (fifty-five
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countries). A large number of commitments (for twenty-five countries), however,
are phased-in beyond the entry into force of the Fourth Protocol… Forty-nine
schedules (sixty-three countries) include commitments on data transmission services,
forty-one schedules (fifty-five countries) on leased lines, forty-six schedules (sixty
countries) on cellular/mobile telephony services, forty-five schedules (fifty-nine
countries) on other types of mobile services (personal communication service (PCS),
mobile data, paging), thirty-seven schedules (fifty-one countries) on mobile satellite
services or transport capacity and thirty-six schedules (fifty countries) on fixed-
satellite services or transport capacity…forty-two…contain a commitment to
permit foreign ownership or control of all telecommunications services and facilities.57

In addition to these commitments, all but two countries (Ecuador and Tunisia) committed
to follow the regulatory principles in a Reference Paper negotiated simultaneously with the
other commitments. The Reference Paper requires the Members committed to it to
establish ‘appropriate measures’ to prevent anti-competitive practices by major suppliers,
which include ‘cross-subsidization’, ‘using information obtained from competitors with
anti-competitive results’ and ‘not making available to other services suppliers on a timely
basis technical information about essential facilities and commercially relevant information
which are necessary for them to provide services’ (1.1, 1.2). Interconnection with a major
supplier must be provided, inter alia, on a non-discriminatory basis (i.e. on as favourable
terms as those provided for the major carrier’s own like services and those non-affil-iated or
subsidiary suppliers) and in a timely fashion and on terms that are, inter alia, ‘transparent’
and ‘reasonable’ (2.2). There are a number of other provisions that relate to transparency
and the existence of independent regulation (including dispute settlement by independent
domestic regulatory tribunals with respect to interconnection).

After the Uruguay Round

With the completion of negotiations on Financial Services and Telecommunications under
the GATS, an important, outstanding element in the Uruguay Round is now in place. In
other areas, such as transportation, progress does not promise to be rapid, although the
gains from liberalization promise to be significant, in part because transportation costs affect
trade opportunities for many other sectors. Sauvé suggests:

The search for a new negotiating paradigm for transportation in the WTO could
usefully focus from a user perspective on the multi-modal, end-to-end, dimension of
the industry. Recognising the infrastructural dimension of trade in transportation
services, one idea could be to explore the degree to which a telecoms-like focus on
conditions of access to and use of transport infrastructures might help identify a range
of facilitation issues to which initial liberalisation efforts could be directed. Also, it
should be possible to concentrate scarce negotiating attention to those market
segments showing greater liberalisation prospects, e.g. courier services, air cargo
services.58
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With respect to professional services, in May 1997 the WTO Council for Trade in Services
adopted guidelines to facilitate negotiation of Mutual Recognition Agreements among
Members in the accountancy sector, pursuant to Article VII of the GATS.59 Increasingly,
electronic commerce is a means by which services are advertised, marketed, and sold in
international trade. Access to the infrastructure for electronic commerce (including the
Internet) and regulation of international transactions that occur in this medium. One
significant issue is whether certain kinds of digitalized information flows on the Internet
should be considered goods or services for purposes of determining which WTO Agreement
applies, GATT or GATS. A recent study by the WTO Secretariat suggests:

The goods approach might make sense when considering some of the products
[footnote omitted] that are deliverable as digitalized information over the Internet,
but which we are accustomed to thinking of as goods. An obvious example of this
would be a book, a product which is clearly identified in the customs classification
systems for goods. The contents of a book could be transmitted electronically from
one jurisdiction to another and then transformed into a book in the normal physical
sense…, but many digitalized information flows are not readily convertible into a
physical format that is recognizable as a good.'60

The relationship between GATT and GATS has, in fact, been considered in the two cases in
dispute settlement that have dealt with the GATS so far. In Periodicals, the United States
complained, inter alia, about an 80% tax that Canada imposed on advertisements in split-run
periodicals (which are periodicals with primarily foreign editorial content imported into
Canada in versions with advertising directed at the Canadian market). The purpose of this
tax was primarily to protect the advertising revenue of Canadian periodicals. Canada argued
that this tax was a measure with respect to advertising, a service, and therefore that the
provisions of the GATT did not apply. The panel noted that ‘overlaps between the subject
matter of disciplines in GATT 1994 and GATS are inevitable, and will further increase with
the progress of technology and the globalization of economic activities. We do not consider
that such overlaps will undermine the coherence of the WTO system.'61 One may doubt
whether, strictly speaking, in this case there was any overlap, since the tax did not
discriminate against American providers of advertising services, but the panel was surely
right that the GATT applied, since the tax in question resulted in (and indeed aimed to
result in) a denial of equal competitive opportunities as between Canadian and foreign
periodicals, which are a good. In the event, Canada did not seek to reverse this ruling in its
appeal to the Appellate Body.

In Bananas, the AB considered the issue of whether the GATS applied to measures that
purportedly discriminated against non EC and non-Lomé member country banana
distributor/importers (‘operators’) with respect to the allocation of import licences. The
EC claimed that the regulations in question were regulations with respect to the
importation, sale, and distribution of bananas, a good, and therefore that the GATS did not
apply. The AB noted the very broad language in Article 1:1 of the GATS, stating that it
applies to measures ‘affecting’ trade in services. Thus, there would be no reason to
conclude that simply because a measure regulated trade in goods it should be excluded from
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GATS disciplines, provided it affected trade in services.62 Further, the AB held that the
GATT and the GATS were not mutually exclusive agreements:

Certain measures could be found to fall exclusively within the scope of GATS when
they affect trade in goods as goods. Certain measures could be found to fall
exclusively within the scope of the GATT 1994, when they affect the supply of
services as services. There is yet a third category of measures that could be found to
fall within the scope of both the GATT 1994 and the GATS. These are measures that
involve a service relating to a particular good or a service supplied in conjunction
with a particular good.... However, while the same measure could be scrutinized
under both agreements ... [u]nder the GATT 1994, the focus is on how the measure
affects the goods involved. Under the GATS, the focus is on how the measure affects
the supply of the service or the service suppliers involved. Whether a certain
measure affecting the supply of a service related to a particular good is scrutinized
under the GATT 1994 or the GATS, or both, is a matter that can only be determined
on a case-by-case basis. (para. 221).

The AB also held that the MFN obligation in the GATS applies to de facto as well as de jure
discrimination.

CONCLUSION

Given the highly diverse nature of the barriers to trade in services, and the interconnection
of many of these barriers with a wide range of complex domestic regulations and policies,
liberalization of trade in services is not achievable through the general multilateral rules and
negotiated removal of border measures that have characterized the GATT’s approach to
liberalization of trade in goods. While some barriers are caught by a National Treatment
obligation, many others can only be addressed either through commitments to remove or
alter nondiscriminatory domestic regulations or to international regulatory harmonization
(at least with respect to minimum standards or qualifications).

The attempt to insert a process for negotiation of specific commitments to regulatory
change within a multilateral rule-based institutional and legal framework has been less than
entirely successful—as witnessed by the severe tensions between different Members
concerning the place of the MFN principle in this process. This has led to an incomplete
result, disappointing to those who had expected more significant commitments to market
access. There is a significant possibility that liberalization will in future be pursued further
either through the elaboration of bilateral or regional accords that already deal with services
(NAFTA and the OECD Codes, for instance), or through negotiations within the WTO
framework on a basis which is, in fact, not genuinely universal or multilateral. The danger is
that a set of liberalization commitments may emerge that closes off major markets for
services from countries unwilling or unable to make particular kinds of commitments to
deregulation of their own service industries. Of course, a convergence of approaches to
regulation and deregulation among an increasingly wide range of countries would
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significantly attenuate this problem, and make a multilateral approach more feasible and
attractive.

Such a convergence is arguably occurring, at least among a significant number of both
developed and developing countries,63 although not at a pace always satisfying those seeking
the fullest possible liberalization. It is important nonetheless to recognize that, in theory and
perhaps also in practice in at least some areas, important trade-offs may still exist between
the gains from liberalized trade in services on the one hand and, on the other, the resultant
sacrifice in regulatory diversity and innovation. Finally, if the initial, quite limited bargains
within the WTO on services are to be sustained over the long term, it will be quite
important that the WTO deliver on the promise of becoming a genuine supranational
organization, capable of facilitating ongoing negotiation and adjustment of commitments
with respect to trade in services, in light of technological and other changes that affect the
covered sectors and that present new or renewed regulatory challenges. 
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Trade-related intellectual property (TRIPs)

INTRODUCTION

Over the last two decades, a number of the most economically advanced industrialized
nations, including the United States and some members of the European Union, have faced
increasing competition in manufactured exports from Newly Industrializing Countries (NICs)
in Asia and Latin America. This increasing competition has focused attention on domestic
policies of these nations that may adversely or (as is often claimed) even unfairly
disadvantage American or European trading interests. It is in this manner that the issue of
intellectual property rights has become a prominent item on the trade agenda, as reflected
in the extensive provisions on intellectual property in both the Uruguay Round Final Act
and the North American Free Trade Agreement.

Two main concerns have dominated the debate. The first is that many developing
countries, including some NICs, have often afforded a shorter period of patent protection
(and in some cases more narrowly defined protection) to products such as pharmaceuticals
than do the United States and most European countries. The result is that domestic
imitations of these products often dominate developing country markets, with a resultant loss
of potential foreign sales by the original North American or European producer who
financed the innovation in the first place. In addition, the patent-granting process and the
enforcement of patent protection in many developing countries has been viewed as lacking
in transparency and legal security and certainty. The second concern is the tolerance of
some developing country governments (and lack of vigilance in some other states as well) with
respect to the production and sale of pirate sound recordings and videos, as well as the
‘theft’ or appropriation of trade marks and symbols (like ‘Rolex’ or ‘Pierre Cardin’) and
their attachment to cheap imitations that have no relationship to the original producer’s
own manufactures.

American business interests have estimated losses in the billions of dollars annually from
these kinds of supposed inadequacies in intellectual property protection, primarily in
developing countries. From a trade theory perspective, however, it is far from clear that all
countries should be required to maintain the same level of intellectual property protection.
Patent protection constitutes a form of monopoly rent to the innovator. This provides
incentives for innovation, but also may entail at least short-term consumer welfare losses
and may discourage imitation and adaptation by competitors, which themselves constitute



valuable economic activities. The level of intellectual property protection each country
decides to afford will thus be rationally related to whether its comparative advantage resides
more in innovation or imitation and adaptation of innovations made elsewhere, and the
relative weight it gives to the interests of consumers (including its own producers who are
consumers of inputs), imitators, and innovators.

Two kinds of justification for the protection of intellectual property dominate the debate
on TRIPs. The first centres on fairness or compensatory justice concerns, and the second on
arguments about the relationship between protection of intellectual property and domestic
and global economic welfare. The use of inventions or creative works of others without
their permission is often labelled as piracy or theft. Of course, unless the act in question is
defined in those terms in the positive law of the country concerned, or in international law,
such a characterization merely states a normative conclusion that inventors and creators
should have a proprietary entitlement to the fruits of their labour. One (Lockean) line of
argument to support this view is that persons are naturally owners of the fruits of their own
labour, and that the taking of these fruits represents an attack on the autonomy or even the
integrity—of the person.1 Pushed to its limits, this view would point to a perspective that
suggests that taxation—or any non-voluntary appropriation by society of some of the value
of an individual’s labour—is expropriation. While we cannot here explore all the
theoretical difficulties with such an understanding of property,2 it is worth mentioning one
problem that presents particular complications with respect to intellectual property. Society
provides the context in which creative activity takes place—few inventions or works of art
or literature spring fully grown from the inventor’s head. They usually depend on education
within society, and build on the work of many others. There is thus a limit to the extent
that creators can declare the work totally their own, and exclude any claim by society on
some of that value.

In fact, despite the rhetoric of natural rights or proprietary entitlements that is often
invoked to argue for strengthened protection of intellectual property, the debate centres
around whether protection should be limited, say, to 15 years for patents or extended to 20
or 25 years. It is hard to imagine a natural right that miraculously disappears after 20 or 25
years! Once we have established that the issue is actually the level of compensation to which
a creator is entitled, then it is dear that at least implic-itly the creator’s claims are being
balanced against other social interests.

A complete absence of compensation, or a social expropriation of all the benefit of an
individual’s creativity would, essentially, amount to slavery (with the one significant
difference being that the inventor or creator could presumably choose not to invent or
create, whereas the slave must work for another’s benefit). Proprietary entitlements over
one’s creative product are, however, not the only form in which such compensation may be
provided. For instance, in many countries, a large percentage of inventors or creators work
in government laboratories and universities, and even literary and artistic activity is
subsidized by the state. Invention and creation may be regarded as a salaried occupation like
any other. 

Once we view the relevant normative concern as that of compensation, a wide variety of
factors may well enter into the determination of what a fair level of intellectual property
protection would be. Just as inadequate compensation for valuable inventions may
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constitute exploitation, so could profiteering on the monopoly control over, for instance,
the formula for some life-saving drug.3

The economic argument for the protection of intellectual property rights is relatively
straightforward—unless invention or creation is compensated at its full social value there
will be sub-optimal incentives to undertake it. Central to this insight is the ‘free-rider’
problem—an individual or firm will be much less likely to make an investment if someone
else (the free rider) can capture or appropriate at little or no cost a significant part of the
economic returns from the investment in question. However, as is widely recognized in the
economic literature,4 this must be weighed against the economic effects of creating a
monopoly on knowledge, namely higher cost products and the exclusion from the market
of competitors who may be able to imitate or adapt the invention in such a way that its
social value is increased.

To take a simple example, let us suppose that currently in a given country, 15 years of
patent protection is extended to the development of new widget technologies. If protection
is extended to 20 years, incentives for innovation are increased, and some new valuable
widget technologies that otherwise might go undeveloped and unexploited would come into
being. However, lower cost products based on competitors’ imitations or adaptations of
existing widget technologies will take longer to get to market. Extending protection from
15 to 20 years will only make sense if the welfare gain from the added incentive to
innovation outweighs the welfare loss from deterring competition with respect to imitations
of the technology. In the abstract, we cannot tell which is more important to a given country
— cheaper widgets from existing technologies or more new widget technologies.

Before we introduce the implications of this basic insight for trade, it is important to note
that rarely will a single level of protection for all technologies or sectors maximize domestic
welfare. After all, the trade-off between the economic benefits of innovation and imitation
will vary quite considerably depending, say, upon whether we are dealing with computer
technologies or pharmaceuticals. Recent work in economics on patent protection suggests
the possibility that very strict protection could result in wasteful outlays on research and
development—due to the ‘winner takes all’ nature of such protection firms may compete
to be the first past the post with a patent in hand. This ‘patent racing’ argument points to
the social efficiency, in some contexts, of treating R&D as a public good.5 Third, it should
be noted that the gains from imitation and the corresponding losses from increased patent
protection may be of two kinds—first, higher costs to consumers from the monopoly
position that the patent confers on the holder and second, the loss with respect to imitation
industries, where revenues and employment will decline.

Similarly, the overall trade-offs between innovation and imitation may well differ from
country-to-country. A country where innovation is not a major source of economic activity
and growth is likely to choose, on balance, a less stringent intellectual property regime than
would a country whose economy is highly dependent on innovation. From this perspective,
there is nothing suspect or unreasonable with the preference of many developing countries
for a relatively lax system of intellectual property rights. These countries have much to
gain, in terms of consumer welfare, from countenancing cheap domestic imitations of
innovations made elsewhere, and perhaps little to lose if they are not at a stage of
development that makes domestic research and development an important ingredient in
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domestic welfare. From the point of view of at least some developing countries, then, an
agreement on TRIPs that raised intellectual property protection to developed-country
levels could rightly be seen as a welfare-reducing or Pareto-inferior bargain.

Several arguments have nevertheless been advanced to show that such a bargain could be
in the long-term self-interest of developing countries. The first is that these countries, like
all others, benefit from innovation which occurs outside their own borders, and that the
increased incentives to inventors due to increased global revenues from their innovations, will
yield greater amounts of innovation, and therefore new benefits in which developing countries
will share. Often, industry estimates of ‘forgone’ revenues from sub-standard intellectual
property protection in developing countries assume that if proper protection were
afforded, a quantity of original products would be consumed equal to that of the imitations
now being purchased. This, as is widely noted in more recent economic literature,6 may be
quite misleading since original products (i.e. patent as opposed to generic drugs) would likely
be much more expensive, one could expect a considerable decline in demand. Deardorff
questions whether the marginal benefit of extra protection, in terms of products that would
not have been invented but for the additional incentive from higher monopoly rents in
developing countries, is likely to outweigh the reduction in consumer welfare due to higher
prices.7 It is also possible that the optimal level of innovation has already been achieved or
exceeded in which case further protection of intellectual property might actually result in,
or even intensify, a misallocation of productive resources to research and development. At
the margin, would welfare be increased more by an extra dollar being spent on innovation
or on applications of existing inventions and technologies?

Another line of argument is that developing countries will attract greater amounts of
foreign investment and technology transfers if foreigners believe that products, processes,
and trade secrets will be adequately protected. Empirical evidence that this is the case is,
however, sketchy and anecdotal.8 In addition, the appropriate response might be to
negotiate specific guarantees with investors, rather than increasing intellectual property
protection across the board.9

TRADE THEORY AND INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY RIGHTS

In terms of neo-classical trade theory, whether a particular country will want stronger or
weaker intellectual property protection will depend on whether its comparative advantage
lies more in innovation or in the imitation and adaptation of others’ innovations. This is
simply an extension of the argument concerning the allocation of resources domestically
between imitation and innovation. More precisely still, a rational country would have
different levels of protection for different industries, representing different trade-offs
between innovation and imitation in each industry, depending upon where its comparative
advantage lies.

The United States traditionally has been a country with a significant comparative
advantage in innovation, reflected in the fact that a higher percentage of its exports contain
domestically-generated technologies than those of any other country, far exceeding even
Japan.10 Under these circumstances, a high level of protection for intellectual property
rights within the United States would seem to be well-justified. From the perspective of the
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national interest of countries that have a comparative advantage that lies more in imitative
than innovative activity, however, a lower level of protection would likely be optimal. This
argument, it should be stressed, does not apply only to developing countries. Much of
Japan’s dramatic economic growth in the 1960s and 1970s can be accounted for by its
success at imitation and adaptation of innovations developed elsewhere, aided by a strategic
use of intellectual property protection to stimulate imitation in some sectors and industries
and innovation in others.11 The strength of Canadian multinational enterprises has been
linked to their capacity to find and adapt technology from elsewhere.12 In sum, it is far from
clear that increased intellectual property protection would benefit even developed
countries with a strong advantage in imitation.

The conclusion that stronger intellectual property protection may benefit some countries
but not others suggests a fundamental difference between the theoretical case for trade
liberalization, as we developed it in Chapter 1, and the case for mandating high levels of
intellectual property protection throughout the world. In the former instance, the neo-
classical theory of trade suggests that further liberalization will, with certain defined
exceptions, be always beneficial both to the domestic economic welfare of the liberalizing
state, and to global economic welfare (defined in terms of global allocative efficiency and/or
the aggregate of the domestic welfare of all Member States).

With respect to intellectual property protection, however, the case cannot be stated in
these terms, for a requirement of strengthened protection, in the case of at least some
sectors, could increase economic welfare in some countries, while reducing it in others.
Mandated stronger protection for intellectual property rights is not necessarily, therefore,
Pareto-superior and must be justified instead as a fair bargain or trade-off between the
competing or conflicting economic interests of different states.

In addition, it is highly questionable whether increased protection is even Kaldor-Hicks
efficient, i.e. whether the gains to economic welfare to countries who benefit from stricter
protection outweigh the losses to those countries who lose by it. In a seminal and
provocative article, Allan Deardorff has argued that global aggregate welfare may well be
maximized if certain countries are exempted completely from requirements for intellectual
property protection. The reason is that, with respect to these poorer countries, the marginal
increased rents to the patent holder are unlikely to be substantial enough to constitute
significant incentives to further innovation. However, the losses to developing countries
from being forced out of imitation or buying imitations from elsewhere would probably be
more substantial.13 Additionally, if the effect of increased protection is to shift productive
resources from an activity in which a country has a comparative advantage (imitation) to
that in which it has less comparative advantage (innovation), then global allocative efficiency
would be reduced by increased protection.

Deardorff’s basic insight has been developed independently by Maskus as a formal model
of the global welfare effects of IP protection. His empirical studies using this model, which
are based upon United States International Trade Commission data with respect to impacts
of lower IP protection in other countries, yielded the result that ‘static global welfare would
suffer from the extension of IP protection by information-importing countries’ under most
assumptions about elasticities of supply and demand.14 Only under highly speculative dynamic
assumptions (i.e. that increased protection would create enough incentives for technology
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transfer to, and new R&D within, developing countries to create a comparative advantage in
innovation), could global welfare be predicted to rise. Work by Grossman and Helpman
also suggests that global welfare may be reduced by higher levels of intellectual property
protection in developing countries, since the effect may be to slow the process whereby
products invented in the North come to be imitated and manufactured in the South at lower
cost (i.e. more efficiently).15

THE PRE-URUGUAY ROUND INTERNATIONAL LEGAL
FRAMEWORK

Having considered the case for strengthening of intellectual property rights from a number
of perspectives, we now canvass the existing international rules on this subject. The
international legal and institutional framework for cooperation in the protection of
intellectual property rights that has emerged over the last hundred years, as we shall see,
falls short of elaborating a set of universal, harmonized standards for intellectual property
rights. Yet from the fairness, domestic and global welfare perspectives discussed above, the
case for such harmonization is, as we have seen, far from compelling. At the same time, the
existing framework reflects longstanding recognition by a wide range of states that
intellectual property rights are a legitimate subject of international legal discipline.

The GATT

By virtue of Article XX of the General Agreement, intellectual property has been largely
excluded from the ambit of GATT. Article XX states a number of exceptions to the basic
obligations of the GATT with respect to trade, and these include ‘measures . . . necessary
to secure compliance with laws or regulations which are not inconsistent with the
provisions of this Agreement, including those related to ... the protection of patents, trade-
marks and copyrights, and the prevention of deceptive practices’ (Article XX(d)). However
this exception, like all the others in Article XX, is subject to the following qualification:
such measures must not be ‘applied in a manner which would constitute a means of
arbitrary or unjustifiable discrimination between countries where the same conditions prevail,
or a disguised restriction on international trade’.

Students of the GATT have long been divided as to whether the meaning of this
qualification is that the principle of National Treatment as defined in Article III nevertheless
applies to Article XX exemptions, or whether the intent is to define an alternative, weaker,
national treatment standard applicable only to the matters listed in Article XX (the standard
would be weaker because of the qualifying words, ‘between countries where the same
conditions prevail’, which imply a ‘similarly situated’ test).16 To some extent, this issue has
been resolved in favour of the latter view in a GATT panel decision on the GATT-
consistency of s. 337 of the US Tariff Act.17 In that case, the panel held that, in some
circumstances, an Article XX(d) exception might be claimed for measures that, but for the
exception, would be in violation of the Article III National Treatment obligation. This, of
course, would be impossible if Article XX(d) itself were to imply the same National Treatment
standard as Article III.
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The Paris Convention

The Paris Convention18 is the principal instrument of international law with respect to
protection of patents and trademarks, described within the Convention by the general label
‘industrial property’. The Convention was established in 1883 and has 98 signatories whose
countries represented (in 1985) 88% of world trade in goods.19

The cornerstone of the Convention is the National Treatment principle, expressed in
Article 11(1), which provides that ‘Nationals of any country of the Union shall, as regards
the protection of industrial property, enjoy in all the other countries of the Union the
advantages that their respective laws now grant, or may hereafter grant to nationals.’

In addition to the same substantive protections, Article 11(1) also provides that nationals
of other members of the Union shall have ‘the same legal remedy against any infringement
of their rights, provided that the conditions and formalities imposed upon nationals are
complied with’. One important aspect of these obligations is that they apply to legal
instruments defined as ‘industrial property’ in Article 1(2) including patents, trade marks,
industrial designs and trade names. Thus, for instance, it is unclear whether the National
Treatment obligation would apply to new sui generis forms of intellectual property rights. In
the light of efforts by the United States to negotiate bilaterally with some countries special
agreements for protection of the intellectual property of its nationals, it is also important to
note that, on its face, the National Treatment obligation of the Paris Convention does not
include a Most Favoured Nation requirement.20 In addition to the National Treatment
obligation, the Convention sets some minimum standards with respect to both patent and
trademark protection. A priority registration system is created whereby if a patent is filed in
one member country nothing which occurs within a 12-month period that runs from the
first filing will affect the right to a patent in other Member countries (e.g. exploitation or
use of the invention within that twelve-month period in a country where a patent has not yet
been filed). The provision for trademarks is identical, except that the period is six months
(Articles 4A-4B).

With respect to trademarks and trade names, there is a further set of much more
rigorous obligations. Other countries are required to accept a trademark for registration and
to protect it fully, once the mark has been properly registered according to the laws of the
country of origin, subject to certain exceptions e.g. where third-party rights are violated or
where the marks are ‘contrary to morality or public order’ (Article 6). In addition,
Member States are obliged to seize, upon importation, all goods ‘unlawfully bearing’ a
trademark or trade name entitled to legal protection in the importing country (Article 9).

National Treatment clearly prohibits one kind of national strategy for intellectual
property that, as suggested above, may in fact be domestic welfare-maximizing for certain
kinds of countries, e.g. extending generous intellectual property protection to domestic
innovators (to provide an incentive for domestic innovation) while providing minimal
protection to foreigners (so as to maximize consumer welfare and provide incentives for
imitation and adaptation of foreign innovations). However, indirect pursuit of such a
strategy is possible within a literal reading of the Convention.

For instance, as Lesser suggests, ‘a member state may offer no patent protection for
certain product groups, provided that the absence of protection applies equally to nationals
and non-nationals’.21 This permits very significant de facto discrimination against foreigners
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to occur through selection of product groups. Countries can (and do) exempt from
protection products in whose innovation they themselves have no comparative advantage
(e.g. pharmaceuticals in the case of many developing countries). A fortiori, a country would
have little or no interest in protecting intellectual property rights in products of which it is
solely an imitator and intends to remain so—here the national interest is above all
consumer welfare, i.e. sourcing the product as cheaply as possible.

At what point differential protection for particular products, industries, or technologies
becomes a de facto violation of National Treatment is of course very difficult to determine.
Such differential treatment need not have a discriminatory intent; even assuming a country
did not trade at all, it might well provide varying levels of protection depending upon the
trade-offs between the benefits of encouraging innovation and those of encouraging
imitation that existed in a particular sector. Here, the National Treatment principle itself, if
it is to be effectively implemented, may point to some international minimum standards,
i.e. to some kind of determination in international rules as to which balances between
innovation and imitation are legitimate domestic policies and which constitute unfair trade
practices.

An additional difficulty that arises with respect to National Treatment concerns rules or
procedures that pertain to the granting and enforcement of intellectual property rights.
Some legal systems place a premium on the exercise of administrative discretion in the
determination of what intellectual property rights, if any, to grant to a particular innovation.
Borrus notes with respect to Japan, for example,

The exercise of discretion is enabled mightily by a lack of transparency in decision-
making. The JPO (Japanese Patent Office) rarely documents its reasoning…when
using the system to disadvantage foreign filings JPO examiners have been known to
fail to communicate in a penetrable way. The resulting speculative interpretation of
the examiner’s intent leads to misinterpretation and instant justification for hindering
or rejecting foreign filings.22

With respect to these kinds of complaints it is very difficult to know whether, in fact,
discrimination against foreigners is actually occurring, or whether they simply find it
burdensome working within a different legal and political environment. Despite the fact
that foreigners may incur special costs in seeking intellectual property protection in another
Member State (such as translation, hiring of local lawyers or patent experts able to guide
them through the system), the Paris Convention clearly states that to avail themselves of
National Treatment foreigners must ‘observe the formalities and conditions imposed upon
nationals’ (Article 2(1)).

Related complaints concern the enforcement of intellectual property rights. Particularly
with respect to developing countries, Primo Braga notes: ‘Problems often mentioned
include: the slowness of the enforcement process; discrimination against foreigners; biased
court decisions; inadequate civil and or criminal remedies; and corruption.'23 Not
surprisingly, much of the evidence of these difficulties is anecdotal. It is probably true that
foreigners are in some sense discriminated against in legal systems characterized by
corruption and bias, inasmuch as locals are likely to have access to ‘back channels’ that
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foreigners lack. Yet these are symptoms of broader social and political issues that may be
difficult to address in the rather specific context of international rules on intellectual
property rights. As well, in some cases, foreigners may incorrectly assume that outcomes
that appear unfamiliar, anomalous or unfavourable are the product of discrimination or
improper dealing. Even if they are based on ignorance of law and institutions in other
countries, such assumptions contribute powerfully to the notion that the National
Treatment principle, as elaborated in the Paris Convention, is inadequate to discipline
discriminatory practices.

The Berne Convention

The Berne Convention,24 established in 1885, sets certain minimum standards with respect
to authors’ rights, and also contains a National Treatment and a Most Favoured Nation
obligation.25 In general, the required minimum length of protection is the author’s life plus
fifty years (Article 7(1)). During this period, authors (or their estate) ‘enjoy the exclusive
right of authorizing’ any reproduction or communication of the works they have created
(Articles 9–14). These minimum standards are subject to certain limitations or exceptions,
such as for quotation and utilization of works in other publications or works (e.g. TV
broadcasts). These are exceptions not only to the minimum standard itself, but also to
National Treatment and MFN obligations; hence the Convention contemplates ‘special
agreements’ on these matters between particular Member States of the Berne Union
(Article 9(2)).

The Convention also contains special provisions applicable to developing countries,
permitting them to substitute compulsory licensing for the minimum standards of the
Convention. The (perhaps somewhat ‘imperialistic’) reasoning is that the dissemination of
literary and artistic works from abroad is crucial to the development needs of these
countries, and would often not be possible if the works had to be purchased as imports from
the developed world, or reproduced on the basis of the kinds of royalties or fees that might
be demanded in return for authorization by an author holding a copyright. The compulsory
licensing provisions only apply where, after five years (or in certain cases three or seven
years), the work has not been disseminated by the owner of the right of reproduction ‘at a
price reasonably related to that normally charged in the country for comparable works’
(Appendix, Article 111(2)). Thus the authors/owners retain the option of asserting their
rights, if they are prepared to authorize reproduction at a price that is comparable to
normal prices in the developing country in question. Moreover, for compulsory licensing to
apply, the intent must be to disseminate the work ‘for use in connection with systematic
instructional activities’ (Article III(2)(a)).

The language of the Convention clearly suggests an intent to cover virtually every kind of
creative work.26 However, with respect to certain kinds of scientific work or industrial and
architectural design, the question arises of whether patent rather than copyright protection
is more appropriate. This question has become of considerable importance as countries
grapple with the appropriate means of protecting creative rights in computer software.27
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The Berne Convention currently has more than 75 signatories. It is noteworthy that the
United States only joined the Convention in 1988, having previously chosen to rely upon
unilateral measures and bilateral reciprocity-based treaties to protect copyright.28

The World Intellectual Property Organization (WIPO)

WIPO was established in 196729 to administer multilateral agreements on intellectual
property rights, including the Paris and Berne Conventions, and since 1974 has had the
status of a specialized agency of the United Nations. WIPO does not embody a formal
court-like mechanism for the resolution of disputes under these agreements, but regularly
produces studies and reports on issues that arise in their implementation. As well, WIPO
has been active in assisting developing countries in establishing their own systems of
intellectual property protection, and has provided financial aid and technical advice for this
purpose. At the outset of the Uruguay Round, it was the position of most developing
countries that WIPO, not GATT, was the appropriate forum for evolving stronger
international rules on the protection of intellectual property rights. This position was
undoubtedly influenced by the perception that developing countries have traditionally had
more influence in the UN system than in the GATT. It could also be defended on the basis
that WIPO’s accumulated expertise and experience in the intellectual property field make
it a more appropriate forum for negotiations on TRIPs.30

After the Uruguay Round TRIPs Agreement, WIPO has moved to revitalize its central
role in the internationalization of intellectual property protection. New treaty instruments
were negotiated and adopted under WIPO on matters such as copyright and neighbouring
rights, performance rights, and the harmonization of trademark law procedures and
formalities. WIPO also adopted a dispute settlement mechanism. There is a cooperation
agreement between WIPO and the WTO, providing for exchange of information and
documents, but with little in the way of a formal legal structure for interaction of the two
organizations on TRIPs matters.

Other international agreements

Besides the Paris and Berne Conventions, a number of other international agreements exist
with respect to other forms of intellectual property rights, including the Rome
Convention31 (Performers’ Rights), and the International Convention for the Protection of
New Varieties of Plants (UPOV) (Plant Breeder’s Rights),32 and most recently (1989) the
Washington Treaty (Integrated Circuits).33 Although this last agreement addresses an
increasingly important form of intellectual property, its significance is greatly circumscribed
by the fact that the United States, Japan and the EU (i.e. the world’s leading producers of
these devices) have refused to sign the Treaty, apparently preferring to negotiate reciprocal
accords among themselves rather than accept the general National Treatment approach
embodied in the Treaty.34

In addition, agreements exist to facilitate cooperation between countries in the
administration of patent laws (e.g. The Patent Cooperation Treaty) and trade mark law (the
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Madrid Agreement and Protocol). These agreements vary considerably in importance and in
the number of countries that are signatories.35

AGGRESSIVE UNILATERALISM: US TRADE REMEDY LAW
AND THE EU NEW TRADE POLICY INSTRUMENT

United States trade remedy law has long provided for unilateral retaliatory trade action
against foreign products, based upon violations of intellectual property norms by the
producing countries. Section 337 of the US Tariff Act of 1930 as amended applies to
products imported into the United States, where the products in question have been
produced in such a way as to violate intellectual property rights that American individuals
or firms hold under domestic US law. There is no requirement of injury to the American
producer, and a positive finding results in the complete exclusion of the product from the
United States, unless the American holder of intellectual property rights and the foreign
producer enter into a voluntary settlement (usually a licensing agreement). Conceptually,
Section 337 can be considered either as a means of extra-territorial enforcement of
domestic American intellectual property or—more consistent with the overall framework
of American trade law—as a counter to an unfair advantage acquired by a foreign producer
in competition with domestic American producers for the American market. However, the
remedy provided by s. 337, a ban on the imports in question rather than a duty aimed at
neutralizing the supposed unfair advantage, com-ports more with the former interpretation
than the latter. Nevertheless, the scope of s. 337 is limited to products imported in the
United States, and does nothing to discourage use of American innovations in violation of
domestic US law with respect to home market sales or exports to third countries.

Where a developing country is determined to have ‘weak’ intellectual property
protection, tariff concessions extended to it under the Generalized System of Preferences
can be withdrawn, which has apparently occurred in the case of Korea, Mexico, Brazil and
Thailand. There is no requirement to prove injury to a particular American industry. Nor
need it be shown that the intellectual property laws of the country concerned discriminate
against American or other foreign holders of intellectual property rights or otherwise do
not meet international norms as set out, for example, in the Berne or Paris Conventions. It
should be noted that these provisions apply only to countries within the GSP; clearly, a
discriminatory withdrawal of other tariff concessions provided to a WTO member would
violate the MFN obligation of GATT and/or specific tariff bindings under the Agreement.

Broader in sweep still is the so-called Special 301 provision of the Omnibus Trade and
Competitiveness Act of 1988, which provides that trade sanctions may be taken against
countries named as engaging in ‘unfair’ trade practices.36 Such sanctions would likely be
contrary to the GATT MFN principle. To date, however, Special 301 has been used as a
weapon to extract from named countries specific policy changes desired by US interests, or
(it is also sometimes claimed) more sympathy for American positions in the Round
negotiations, including on intellectual property.37 The countries named to date under
Special 301 have included Japan, Brazil and India. The aggressively extra-territorial
dimension of Special 301 is highlighted by the fact that it does not refer to any set of norms
or principles in order to define adequate intellectual property protection among US trade
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partners—the implicit assumption being that any level of protection inferior to that
provided by US law is an unfair trade practice.

Section 337 of the Tariff Act has come under challenge in the GATT. A GATT panel held
in 1989 that the Section violated the GATT National Treatment obligation, since it entailed
a method of enforcement, through the office of the United States International Trade
Commission (USITC), that provided weaker procedural protection to foreigners than that
accorded to American firms and individuals accused of violating American intellectual
property laws.38 While (as mentioned earlier in this chapter) Article XX(d) provides, under
certain circumstances, exception from GATT strictures for measures ‘necessary’ to the
enforcement of domestic intellectual property laws, the panel found that measures provided
in s. 337 were not ‘necessary’ in this sense, since other countries had found it possible to
enforce adequately their intellectual property laws against foreign nationals by subjecting
the foreigner to the same legal processes as applied to domestic actors.

A further provision of US law, contained in the Process Patents Amendment Act of
1988, may also be vulnerable to challenge under GATT rules: the provision makes
importers or retailers who bring products made in violation of US intellectual property laws
into domestic US commerce liable to civil suit by the US holders of the violated intellectual
property rights.39 Since importers and retailers will often not have the knowledge to
determine whether a particular product has been made in contravention of intellectual
property rights, the result is arguably a ‘chilling’ effect where buyers simply avoid products
from countries with reputations for poor intellectual property protection, in order to
obviate the risk of civil liability. In the result, arguably, the National Treatment principle of
the GATT is violated since it is only to imported products that the risk of such liability is
attached.

An instructive contrast with the American law is to be found in the approach of the EU.
In 1984, the Union created what is called ‘the new trade policy instrument’. The instrument
allows the Union to engage in trade retaliation40 against ‘illicit commercial practices’ of non-
Union countries that affect EU economic interests. ‘Illicit commercial practices’ are defined
as violations of ‘international law or generally accepted rules’.41 According to the European
Commission Green Paper on copyright, ‘in the field of intellectual property, and copyright in
particular, the instrument could conceivably play a significant role in the future, particularly
as regards countries which practise a policy of more or less active connivance in the pirating
of goods and services developed elsewhere'.42 In the intellectual property area, the
instrument would be used primarily against countries in violation of existing treaty
obligations, under both the Paris and the Berne Conventions. However, Brueckmann notes
that pursuant to Article 113 of the Treaty of Rome, which gives the Union jurisdiction over
a common commercial policy, bilateral action has also been taken (in particular against
Korea) along the lines of the US Tariff Act, i.e. suspension of GSP conces-sions.43 The
background of this action was however rather unusual. Korea had agreed, as part of a
negotiated settlement of action under s. 301 of the Tariff Act, to provide intellectual
property protection for US innovations but did not extend such protection to other
countries. The EU claimed at least as favourable treatment, hence—although from one
perspective unilateralist—the Union’s action countered a discriminatory arrangement
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arguably in violation of provisions of the Berne Convention requiring equally favourable
treatment for all foreigners.

INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY PROVISIONS IN TRADE
AGREEMENTS

The Canada-USA FTA

Apart from a general commitment of the Parties to ‘cooperate in the Uruguay Round of
multilateral trade negotiations and in other international forums to improve the protection
of intellectual property’ (Article 2004), the only provisions on intellectual property rights
in the FTA concern retransmission of broadcasts. This reflects a long-standing complaint of
American broadcasters that Canadian cable companies rebroadcast their programming
without any compensation, and moreover often remove the original advertising and replace
it with advertising purchased from the Canadian cable company. Article 2006 of the FTA
provides for a scheme whereby the holder of the programme copyright must be
compensated for any retransmission. Furthermore, in the case of retransmission of pay TV
programmes—i.e. those ‘signals not intended in the original transmission for free, over-the-
air receptions by the general public’—such retransmission must be with the permission of
the original copyright holder. Finally, retransmission in altered form or non-simultaneous
retransmission shall only be allowed where permitted by the original copyright holder. This
last provision reflects the complaint that, where Canadian viewers are capable of receiving
the American signal directly (the case for a large part of the population), Canadian cable
companies are in direct competition with the American broadcasters for audience and hence
for advertising. There is thus a danger that Canadian cable companies will rebroadcast at a
time or in a format more congenial to Canadian viewers, and therefore take away audiences
from the original transmission.

The Uruguay Round and intellectual property rights

Background

Not surprisingly, it was the United States that spearheaded the movement to have
intellectual property rights included as an integral part of the Uruguay Round negotiations.
The overall American goal was clear from the outset: to obtain a set of international rules
that ensure that American innovators’ intellectual property rights are as extensive and as
effectively enforced abroad as in the United States itself. In general, Japan and the European
Union were supportive of the American approach, although at first they required some
prodding from high-technology industries and other domestic interests that stood to benefit
from high international standards for IP protection.

Developing countries, however, generally opposed the negotiation of intellectual
property rights within the GATT, arguing that WIPO was the more appropriate forum for
these discussions. Underlying this concern about the institutional appropriateness of the
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GATT was, however, a more fundamental substantive concern that the American
objectives, particularly with respect to patent protection and the curbing of compulsory
licensing, were contrary to the economic interest of developing countries. As suggested by
our analysis earlier in this chapter, this concern has a sound basis in economic theory.

The globalization of the American standard of patent protection was far from the only
objective of the United States in the Uruguay Round negotiations. The United States, like
some other developed countries, was also concerned that existing international obligations
under the Berne and Paris Conventions, were not enforced adequately by many developing
countries, and that WIPO did not provide a credible institutional framework for settlement
of disputes under these agreements.44 These were particularly acute concerns with respect
to the Berne Convention, whose provisions the United States saw routinely ignored in a
number of developing countries where piracy of American creative works was rampant. In
the case of the Paris Convention, the United States had a related concern—the supposed
difficulty that American patent-holders encountered in attempting to enforce their rights in
foreign legal systems. Unlike the case with copyright, where the focus was on the lack of
effective criminal or regulatory sanctions for piracy, in the patent context the emphasis was
on the supposed lack of expeditious due process in the civil courts of other countries. This
last concern, it should be noted, extended beyond the case of developing countries and
encompassed complaints about several aspects of the patent registration and enforcement
process in Japan. Developing countries, in particular, bristled at the notion that their
domestic legal systems, and the level of scarce administrative and enforcement resources
allocated to those systems, should have to pass muster according to American standards.
There was considerable merit in the developing country position. Operating a truly
effective patent system is a costly enterprise, given the high demand for patent registration,
and the substantial component of technical expertise required to make such a system work
properly.45 As well, the problems of administration of justice complained of by the United
States were often arguably of a general nature (slow courts, lack of written reasons for
decisions,46 and corruption) and not attributable either to an intention to disregard the
intellectual property rights of foreigners or a reckless disregard for these rights. Perhaps,
however, a ‘win-win’ or Pareto-optimal solution to this difference of perspectives would be
to link expectations for improvements in patent registration, administration and
enforcement in developing countries to the provision of technical assistance and funding to
those countries so as to enable these improvements to be made.

A further dimension of the American position in the Uruguay Round negotiations was to
ensure that developed country approaches to the provision of intellectual property
protection to new, technology-based forms of innovation would set the international
standard. In the biotechnology field, for instance, US industrial and scientific interests were
concerned that, as these technologies took on increasing economic importance, they be fully
protected by intellectual property rights.47 For many countries, however, the patenting of
life itself raises not only economic, but also important ethical issues.48 The Biodiversity
Convention, concluded at the Rio Environmental Summit, acknowledges the legitimacy of a
country extending intellectual property protection at least to the genetic material of plants,
but also states that individual countries have the sovereign right to determine on what terms
and conditions private interests should have access to biological resources.49
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The Uruguay Round Final Act

Despite these basic differences of perspective between the United States and some other
developed countries, and most of the developing world, the Uruguay Round was successful
in producing a comprehensive agreement on TRIPs. The TRIPs Agreement in the Uruguay
Round Final Act represents a complex balance between conflicting national perspectives and
interests with respect to the protection of intellectual property rights.

The Agreement consists of seven Parts: (1) a statement of general principles and of the
interaction of the Agreement with the Paris and Berne Conventions; (2) substantive norms
with respect to the protection of the various forms of intellectual property; (3) obligations
with respect to the domestic enforcement of intellectual property rights; (4) obligations
with respect to the facilitation in domestic legal systems of the acquisition and maintenance
of intellectual property rights; (5) dispute settlement; (6) transitional arrangements; and (7)
a WTO-based institutional framework for TRIPs.

General principles of intellectual property protection

Part I of the TRIPs Agreement sets out both National Treatment (Article 3) and MFN
obligations (Article 4) with respect to Intellectual Property Rights. The National Treatment
obligation is subject to the exceptions that already exist in the Paris, Berne and Rome
Conventions and the Washington Treaty. The MFN oblig-ation does not apply with respect
to rights and privileges conferred on a reciprocal basis to certain GATT Members through
bilateral or multilateral agreements in force prior to the Uruguay Round TRIPs Agreement.
An example would be the bilateral accords for microchip (semi-conductor) protection in
force between the USA, the EU and Japan. However, to be exempted from the MFN
requirement these agreements must not operate so as to ‘constitute an arbitrary or
unjustifiable discrimination against other Members’ (Article 4(d)). Similarly, where the
WIPO strikes new multilateral agreements with respect to ‘the acquisition or maintenance
of intellectual property rights’, the National Treatment and MFN obligations in the GATT
Agreement will not apply (Article 5). This allows for the evolution of ‘mutual recognition’
type regimes for the filing and registration of claims for intellectual property protection.

Part I also contains a statement of principles, which acknowledges that a balance of
legitimate (potentially competing interests) must be struck in determining the appropriate
level and kind of intellectual property protection guaranteed by the GATT. According to
Article 7, the protection and enforcement of intellectual property rights should contribute
to the promotion of technological innovation and to the transfer and dissemination of
technology, to the mutual advantage of producers and users of technological knowledge and
in a manner conducive to social and economic welfare, and to a balance of rights and
obligations.

Moreover, Article 8 states that ‘appropriate measures, provided that they are consistent
with the provisions of this Agreement, may be needed to prevent the abuse of intellectual
property rights by right holders through the resort to practices which unreasonably restrain
trade or adversely affect the international transfer of technology’.

A broad, purposive interpretation of Article 7 and Article 8 taken together would permit
GATT Members considerable scope to impose competition policy or investment policy-
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related measures on foreign patent-holders, provided the level of intellectual property
protection itself conforms to that provided in the TRIPs Agreement. It remains an open
question whether, for instance, a foreign patent holder who refused to comply with policy
measures aimed at facilitating technology transfer or preventing anti-competitive abuse of
patent protection could be legally denied the level of protection specified in the TRIPs
Agreement. In other words, are domestic policy measures that condition the granting of
rights under the TRIPs Agreement on compliance with the kinds of measures contemplated
in Articles 7 and 8 ‘consistent’ with the TRIPs Agreement? A further interpretative issue is
whether Articles 7 and 8 could be used as a ‘shield’ by developing or other countries against
unilateral US action in response to policies in conformity with the Uruguay Round TRIPs
Agreement but none the less considered ‘unfair’ by US trade authorities. Thus, arguably, in
the presence of such unilateral action a WTO member could make a complaint in the WTO
TRIPs dispute settlement forum that the United States was in violation of Article 7 and/or
Article 8 in prejudicing its ability to implement the kinds of intellectual property-related
domestic policies contemplated in these provisions. This would reinforce a more general
complaint that unilateral action violated other GATT provisions, such as Articles II, III, or
XI of the General Agreement itself (which would likely be the case if the action in question
consisted in trade sanctions or discriminatory treatment of the Member’s products under
domestic US law (see the discussion of the s. 337 GATT panel above).

Standards concerning the availability, scope and use of Intellectual Property
Rights

Copyright The basic obligations and rights contained in the Berne Convention50 are
incorporated into the TRIPs Agreement (Article 9). With respect to computer software,
the Agreement clearly specifies that ‘computer programs, whether in source or object
code’ shall be protected as ‘literary works’ under the Berne Convention (Article 10). This
entrenches an approach to software protection long-favoured by the United States, and
increasingly deployed in the developed world (despite initial interest by the EC and Japan in
the development of a sui generis form of protection).51 However, the extent of required
copyright protection for software may be significantly affected by the general proviso in
Article 9(2) that ‘copyright protection shall extend to expressions and not to ideas,
procedures, methods of operation or mathematical concepts as such’. Arguably, given this
pro-viso, copyright will protect the originality of a computer programme as a whole, but
will not extend to preventing use of ideas, functions, etc. in the development of new
programmes. Clearly, interpreting such a distinction on a case-by-case basis may involve
quite difficult technical judgments.

With respect to databases, if these merit the status of ‘intellectual creations’ by virtue of
the ‘selection or arrangement’ of their contents, they are to be afforded copyright
protection. However, this does not create any entitlement to the protection of the
underlying data or material out of which the database was generated. Moreover, where a
pre-existing copyright exists with respect to the data or material itself, any protection of the
database as an intellectual protection ‘shall be without prejudice’ to the subsisting copyright
on the material (Article 10(2)). With respect to rental of films and computer programmes,

310 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



authors are to be provided with ‘the right to authorize or to prohibit the commercial rental
to the public of originals or copies of their copyright works’ (Article 11). In the case of
films, however, a Member may exempt itself from this requirement, provided that rentals
have not resulted in widespread violation of authors’ rights through copying.

Article 12 establishes that the minimum term for copyright protection is fifty years from
the initial date of authorized publication, or alternately, fifty years from the making of the
work.

Trademarks The Agreement states that

the owner of a registered trademark shall have the exclusive right to prevent all third
parties not having his consent from using in the course of trade identical or similar
signs for goods or services which are identical or similar to those in respect of which
the trademark is registered where such use would result in a likelihood of confusion
(Article 16.1).

There is a requirement that all ‘signs’ with sufficient distinctiveness be accepted for
registration by the Parties. This is, however, subject to the right of Parties to deny
registration on other grounds (i.e. than lack of distinctiveness), provided that those grounds
are consistent with the provisions of the Paris Convention. It should be recalled that the
Paris Convention explicitly permits refusal to register, where the trademark is ‘contrary to
morality or public order’ (Article VI),52 where it is ‘of such a nature as to deceive the
public’ or where the mark’s use would constitute unfair competition.53 A further exemption
—specific to the TRIPS Agreement applies to ‘fair use of descriptive terms’. Thus, where a
trademark becomes a common expression applied generically to a particular process of
product (e.g. nylon), Parties may allow for its use by others without permission of the
owner of the mark, ‘provided that such exceptions take account of the legitimate interests of
the owner of the trademark and of third parties’. Parties are permitted to provide for
revocation of a registered trademark after an uninterrupted period of three years of non-use,
unless non-use can be shown to be due to certain kinds of obstacles presented to the holder,
e.g. import restrictions on the goods in question or other ‘government requirements’ that
may impede their use in the country concerned (Article 19).

An extensive set of provisions with respect to sound performances and recordings places
positive obligations on states to provide to performers the right to prevent unauthorized
recording of their performances, unauthorized reproduction of authorized recordings,
unauthorized broadcasting of any performance or recording, whether itself authorized or
not. However, only ‘broadcasts by wireless means’ are included, which may indicate an
intention to exclude cable re-broadcasts.54 With respect to sound performances and
recordings, the exemptions and limitations55 contained in the Rome Convention are
incorporated into the Agreement.

Patents The provisions with respect to patents reflect the largest modification of the
existing international regime, in that a substantive standard of protection is required of all
Members. That standard is twenty years from the filing date. Protection applies to both
product and process patents. With respect to process patents, however, the obligation to
protect from unauthorized use extends only to products ‘obtained directly’ from the
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patented process. This means that Members are not required to protect the rights of patent
holders where a process they own is merely the basis for production, i.e. where significant
alteration or innovation in a patented process is at issue as opposed to direct use (Article 28.
1).

Furthermore, patent rights must be ‘enjoyable without discrimination as to the place of
invention, the field of technology and whether products are imported or locally produced’
(Article 27(1)). At the same time, the Agreement acknowledges the concern of developing
countries, and some developed countries, to protect the scope for legitimate domestic
trade-offs of social and economic interests in the determination of patent rights. For
instance, Members are permitted to exclude from patentability ‘plants and animals other
than microorganisms, and essentially biological processes for the production of plants or
animals other than non-bio-logical and microbiological processes’ subject to providing some
protection for plant varieties, either through patenting or a sui generis system (Article 27(3)
(b)). However, this provision is to be reviewed every four years after the establishment of
the WTO, and during this time the USA can be expected to exercise pressure (perhaps
through unilateral trade instruments) for the inclusion of a requirement of patentability of
life within the Agreement on TRIPs.

Most importantly, from the perspective of those countries with concerns about negative
social and economic consequences from high levels of patent protection, the Agreement
permits compulsory licensing during the period of required patent protection, provided
certain conditions are fulfilled (Article 31). The proposed user must first have attempted to
obtain explicit authorization for use from the patent holder on ‘reasonable commercial terms’
and have been refused. Once this condition is met, compulsory licensing is permitted.
However, such licensing must be non-exclusive (i.e. anyone who applies must be granted a
licence on similar terms and conditions); production under licensing must be intended
primarily for the internal market of the licensing Party; and ‘adequate remuneration’ must
be paid to the patent holder, taking into account the ‘economic value’ of the patent (Article
31 (j)).

An important issue arises as to the role of WTO dispute settlement panels in considering
whether compulsory licensing provisions of Members’ domestic laws meet these various
criteria. Many interpretations might be advanced as to the kind of methodology required to
determine, for instance, ‘reasonable commercial terms’ and ‘adequate remuneration’. In
our view, some degree of deference is warranted to legitimate efforts by domestic policy-
makers to incorporate these conceptions in the detail of their laws, balancing the competing
policy interests at stake. Thus, it is not up to the panel to develop its own methodology that
represents the ideal implementation of these requirements and judge domestic law
accordingly. Rather, where the approach of a Member has been developed in an open policy
process, in which all stakeholders could participate, and does not reflect an attempt to
embed discrimination against other Members in its methodology, the main concern of
the panel should be simply whether the methodology reflects adequately the various,
diverse principles and public purposes reflected in the TRIPs Agreement itself. This is
consistent with Article 1.1 of the Agreement, which states in part, ‘[m]embers shall be free
to determine the appropriate method of implementing the provisions of this Agreement
within their own legal system and practice’ (emphasis added).
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In interpreting the expressions ‘reasonable commercial terms’ and ‘adequate
remuneration’, account should be taken not only of the claim of the patent holder to just
compensation, but also of the various social and economic interests stated in Part I of the
Agreement on TRIPs, including the ‘transfer and dissemination of technology to the mutual
advantage of producers and users of technological knowledge and in a manner conducive to
social and economic welfare’ (Article 7). In addition, the need ‘to prevent abuse of
intellectual property rights’ (Article 8) should also be considered in interpreting the
conditions of compulsory licensing in Article 31.

Other forms of intellectual property In addition to these three main types of
intellectual property rights, the Agreement also contains provisions on Industrial Designs,
Geographical Indications for Wines and Spirits, integrated circuits and protection of trade
secrets. In the case of Industrial Designs, Members are required to provide a minimum of
ten years protection to ‘independently created industrial designs that are new or original’,
subject to the right of Members, if they so choose, to protect other designs (Articles 25; 26
(3)). Furthermore, ‘members may provide that such protection shall not extend to designs
dictated essentially by technical or functional considerations’ (Article 25). This last
provision reflects a significant lobbying effort by US insurance companies, consumer
groups, and replacement parts manufacturers, all of whom sought language on industrial
designs that would not allow automobile manufacturers to protect the design of car parts,
thereby threatening the ‘generic’ replacement parts and potentially raising the costs of
replacement parts.56

The provisions on Geographical Indications, and particularly those that apply to Wines
and Spirits, address long-standing European concerns about the use of labels to describe
imitation products with no direct connection to the geographical area denoted by the label.
The main operative provision, Article 23(1), requires each Member to ‘provide the legal
means for interested parties to prevent use of a geographical indication identifying wines for
wines not originating in the place indicated by the geographical indication in question,…
even where the true origin of the goods is indicated or the geographical indication is used in
translation or accompanied by expressions such as “kind”, “type”, “style”, “imitations” or the
like’. This obligation applies identically to spirits. However, exceptions are provided with
respect to geographical appellations in use for at least ten years preceding the conclusion of
the Uruguay Round negotiations (Article 24(4)). In the case of geographical indications for
products other than wines and spirits, protection need only be provided by Members
against use of geographical indication ‘which misleads the public as to the geographical
origin of the good’ (Article 22(2)(a)).

With respect to Lay-out Designs (Topographies) of Integrated Circuits, the required
protection is more extensive than that provided in the Washington Treaty, to which, it will
be recalled, most developed countries had refused to adhere. Hence, the term of protection
is ten years as opposed to eight in the Washington Treaty, and compulsory licensing or
governmental use can only occur under the same conditions as those set out for compulsory
licensing in the TRIPs Agreement provisions on patents (Articles 38; 37(2)). It is significant
that among the main reasons that the United States and Japan refused to sign the
Washington Treaty was their opposition to the Treaty’s provisions on compulsory
licensing.57 However, the applicable provisions on compulsory licensing in the TRIPs
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Agreement are, in the end, very similar to those contained in the Washington Treaty. This
reflects at least some compromise with the concerns of developing countries.58

Enforcement, dispute settlement, and institutional design

Enforcement There is a wide range of obligations to provide other Members with access
to appropriate mechanisms to enforce intellectual property rights. These provisions
constitute a largely unprecedented degree of control by an international regime over
domestic civil and administrative procedures. It is required that enforcement procedures
‘not be unnecessarily complicated or costly, or entail unreasonable time-limits or
unwarranted delays’ (Article 41.2); decisions are ‘preferably’ to be in writing and to
contain reasons; and a right of judicial review is to be provided in the case of administrative
decisions, at least with respect to matters of law. These quite far-reaching obligations are
balanced by the qualification that they create no ‘obligation with respect to the distribution
of resources as between enforcement of intellectual property rights and the enforcement of
laws in general’ (Article 41.5).

With respect to remedies, the TRIPs Agreement requires that ‘judicial authorities’ be
empowered to issue injunctions (Article 44(1)); award damages and legal costs to successful
right holders (Article 45); and to dispose of goods tainted by infringements of intellectual
property rights ‘outside the ordinary channels of commerce’ (Article 46). In addition, the
judicial authorities are to be authorized to grant interim or provisional injunctions,
including in ex parte proceedings, ‘where any delay is likely to cause irreparable harm to the
right holder’ (Article 50(3)).

These requirements would seem, at first glance, to be a massive intrusion into domestic
legal systems, and especially the balance that those systems strike between the rights of
defendants and those of plaintiffs. In some systems, for instance, there may be
constitutional limitations on the capacity of courts to grant relief without hearing the other
Party, even for certain kinds of interim relief. However, it is to be noted that where any of
the remedies is ‘inconsistent with domestic law’, the domestic law is to prevail, subject to a
requirement that ‘declaratory judgments and adequate compensation’ be available (Article
44(2)). It should also be noted that while the Agreement provides that judicial authorities be
authorized to grant certain classes of remedies, the use of these remedies is not mandated by
the GATT Agreement. Judicial authorities are, therefore, free to use their discretion to
grant or deny a particular remedy, and to weigh plaintiffs’ and defendants’ rights in the
exercise of that discretion. 

A final important obligation with respect to enforcement relates to counterfeit or pirated
goods. Rights holders are to have access to a procedure whereby customs authorities
suspend ‘the release into free circulation’ of such goods, for example by seizure or by
turning them back (Article 51). This is subject to the right of the importer that such suspension
be promptly removed except where a judicial or administrative determination is made that,
in fact, the goods are counterfeit. Moreover, Members who have eliminated border
customs inspection as between themselves are not obligated to provide such a procedure
(e.g. the case of the European Union).
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Monitoring and dispute settlement A two-fold approach to monitoring and dispute
settlement is set out in the TRIPs Agreement. First of all, a new institution is to be created,
the Council on Trade Related Aspects of Intellectual Property Rights (TRIPs Council),
charged with the monitoring of domestic compliance with the Agreement. Members are
obliged to notify the Council of their domestic laws and regulations with respect to
intellectual property protection (Article 63(2)). The Council may also provide a forum for
consultations on intellectual property issues, and is ‘to provide any assistance requested by
them in the context of dispute settlement procedures’ (Article 68). This might include, for
example, a kind of mediation or the provision of advisory opinions concerning Members’
interpretations of the Agreement. Nevertheless, no special dispute set-tlement process is
established in connection with the Council instead the general GATT procedures are to
apply (Article 64).

With respect to settlement of disputes under the TRIPs Agreement the provisions in
Articles XXII and XXIII of the GATT are to apply, subject to suspension of the operation of
dispute settlement under Articles XIII:1(b) and XXIII:1(c) of the GATT for the period of
five years. This refers to complaints of non-violation nullification or impairment, which are
to be referred to the TRIPs Council and the Ministerial Conference during the five-year
period.

Developing countries

As discussed in an earlier section of this chapter, one of the main aims of the United States
in placing TRIPs on the Uruguay Round agenda was to address what it considered
ineffective protection of intellectual property rights in developing countries. It is not
surprising, therefore, that developing countries do not enjoy many special exemptions from
these obligations. They are entitled to a one-year delay with respect to implementing most
of the obligations of the Agreement and a further four-year delay upon application to the
Council. The further four-year delay does not apply, however, to the general requirements
of National Treatment and MFN treatment in Part I. A further five-year delay applies,
where a particular area of technology is currently unprotectable under the domestic law of a
developing country. This reflects the fact that extension of protection may result in loss of
entire industries in some developing countries (e.g. pharmaceuticals), with attendant
adjustment costs.59 Finally, few/-developed countries are exempted entirely from the
Agreement. 

The North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA)

The provisions on intellectual property rights in the NAFTA are, in most important
respects, largely identical to those in the Uruguay Round Agreement, discussed in detail in
the previous section. Unlike the Uruguay Round Agreement, the NAFTA does not contain
substantive provisions on performers’ rights. Performers’ rights would seem to be covered
by the National Treatment obligation with respect to intellectual property rights. An
exception to National Treatment is, however, that ‘a Party may limit rights of performers of
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another Party in respect of secondary uses of sound recordings to those rights its nationals
are accorded in the territory of such other Party’ (Article 1703.1).

The NAFTA also contains a provision on the decoding of encrypted satellite signals that is
not present in the Uruguay Round TRIPs Agreement. Under this provision each Party
would be required to make it a criminal offence to manufacture or sell any device used for
the purpose of decoding encrypted satellite signals, and a civil offence to decode or
improperly receive these signals. These provisions would appear to be primarily aimed at
protecting the rights of Pay-TV broadcasters. Finally, unlike the Uruguay Round TRIPs
Agreement, the NAFTA does not contain any special provisions on dispute resolution with
respect to intellectual property rights, suggesting that the general dispute resolution
mechanism in the NAFTA will apply to disputes under the intellectual property provisions
of the NAFTA.

The NAFTA represents a major victory for mostly US based multinational pharmaceutical
companies. Canada had a significantly shorter period of patent protection for pharmaceuticals
(ten years) after which compulsory licensing was provided under Canadian law.60 The
consequence was a wealth of low-cost generic drugs, with major cost savings to consumers,
as well as to government programmes that provide free or subsidized medications to the
elderly and the poor. In order to comply with NAFTA and a possible Uruguay Round
Agreement on TRIPs the previous Government in Canada changed the law to provide 20 years
of patent protection to patent pharmaceutical producers. However, under the letter of both
NAFTA and the Uruguay Round Agreement on TRIPs, compulsory licensing is still
permissible, provided reasonable compensation is offered to the patent-holder and some
other conditions are met. This suggests that there was some kind of informal understanding
between Canadian and American authorities that Canada’s approach to pharmaceuticals
must be dismantled if the spirit of NAFTA is to be respected. Perhaps also influential with
the Canadian authorities was a massive, high-profile lobbying effort on the part of patent
drug manufacturers stressing the amount of new R&D activity that would occur in Canada
with the adoption of these changes. In any case, despite these major changes in the Canadian
domestic regulatory regime to the advantage of American proprietary drug interests,
Canada failed completely to win any insulation from US aggressive unilateralism, including
actions under s. 337 of the Tariff Act.61 The current government in Canada is apparently
considering the reintroduction of measures to provide for the compulsory licensing of
pharmaceuticals, on terms consistent with NAFTA and the Uruguay Round TRIPs
Agreement. 

POST-URUGUAY ROUND DEVELOPMENTS

Implementation of the WTO TRIPs Agreement

Perhaps more than any other trade agreement in history, the WTO TRIPs Agreement
requires extensive changes to, and in the case of many countries additions to, domestic law
and regulations. Pursuant to its mandate under the Agreement, the WTO TRIPs Council
has established procedures for notifica-tion62 and examination63 of Member’s domestic
intellectual property laws and regulations. The review of national implementing legislation
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is now largely complete, with the exception of newly acceding Members and several
Members who joined the review process late.64 Pursuant to Article 67 of the TRIPs
Agreement, which contains an obligation that developed-country Members provide
technical assistance to developing countries with respect to the establishment and reform of
intellectual property regimes, as well as enforcement issues, the TRIPs Council has received
numerous notifications of their technical cooperation programmes from developed countries.
The WTO Secretariat has also begun to provide technical assistance to developing
countries, in some instances in cooperation with WIPO (such as joint workshops on
institutional capacity and other issues for developing countries).

To date, there have been only two decided dispute settlement cases based on the TRIPs
Agreement, the Indian Patents case and a related EU complaint. The United States
complained that India had not conformed with the transitional provisions of Article 70.8 of
the TRIPs Agreement, which require that where a developing country Member exercises its
right to delay full application of the Agreement with respect to patents on pharmaceutical
and agricultural chemical products, it must nevertheless make available a means for the
filing of patent applications and ensure that rights are not compromised, so that they can be
effectively exercised at the end of the transition period. As well, the United States claimed
that Article 70.9 of the Agreement, which deals with exclusive marketing rights, required
that a mechanism to provide such rights be in place from the date of entry into force of the
TRIPs Agreement. With respect to filing, the central issue.became whether certain
‘administrative instructions’ to the Indian Patent Office by the government were sufficient
to provide ‘a sound legal basis to preserve both the novelty of the inventions and the
priority of the applications as of the relevant filing and priority dates'.65 India had initially
sought to establish the filing system through a legislative amendment, which was subject to
considerable delays in its parliament. A temporary presidential ordinance was issued in lieu
of legislation but this expired, resulting in the resort to administrative instructions. This
suggested to the panel that in fact the Indian government itself initially viewed legislative
action as necessary to provide an adequate legal basis for the filing, and protection of
priority, of patent applications; as well, on the panel’s interpretation the administrative
orders contradicted certain mandatory provisions of the Patents Act, thereby suggesting
that the orders might be effectively challenged in court on administrative law grounds. India
argued in the Appellate Body that the panel should have been more deferential to India’s own
view of its legal system, and the effectiveness of administrative action to provide the
required legal security to patent holders. The Appellate Body, however, held that where
provisions of a WTO agreement required a determination of the compliance of a Member’s
domestic law with that agreement, a panel can appropriately engage in a detailed
examination of the domestic law in question.

In itself, this ruling seems appropriate, especially given the character of the TRIPs
agreement, which imposes very detailed requirements on domestic law and regulations. At
the same time, it is questionable whether the panel and AB should have interpreted Indian
law as if they were interpreting a WTO Agreement—i.e. without any real analysis or
consideration of expert views on the relationship between administrative orders and
legislation in the Indian constitutional and administrative law system. This is especially
troubling in light of Article 1.1 of the TRIPs Agreement, which provides, inter alia that
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‘Members shall be free to determine the appropriate method of implementing the provisions
of this Agreement within their own legal system and practice.’ At a minimum, this should
mean that there is if anything more than the normal burden of proof on the complainant to
show that the means chosen by a Member are inadequate for purposes of implementing the
TRIPs provisions in question. However, the Appellate Body seemed to consider it India’s
responsibility to make a persuasive case that its administrative instructions were an adequate
means of implementing its obligations in Article 70.8, once the United States had put forth
‘evidence and arguments’ concerning the inadequacy of the administrative instructions
(para. 74). In fact, the United States did not go much further than simply suggesting that the
fact that India initially proceeded with legislation and a presidential ordinance in lieu of
legislation, proved that the Indian government itself must have thought that legislative
action was necessary. However, some legal systems are very tolerant of administrative
action, even where in similar circumstances the matter might have been addressed by
legislation; the United States did not make out even a prima facie case that Indian
administrative or constitutional law were such as not to tolerate an administrative approach
to this problem, even if legislation would have been a neater solution. With respect to
exclusive marketing rights, as required by Article 70.9, the AB held that 70.8 and 70.9
operated in tandem, so that India was obligated to have in place upon the coming into force
of the TRIPs Agreement a mechanism for the granting of such rights, even if it could delay
making the rights effective until the end of the transition period (para. 82).

The United States also lodged a complaint against Pakistan concerning its compliance
with the same provisions that were at issue in the Indian case. The matter was settled prior
to panel proceedings, however, when Pakistan adopted in February 1997 an ordinance on
filing and exclusive rights with respect to pharmaceutical and agricultural chemical products
that was to the satisfaction of the US.66 There is a recent challenge by the European Union
to provisions of Canada’s pharmaceutical patent law which allow manufacture and stockpile
of patented products by a non-patent holder for a period of up to six months before expiry
of a patent for sale after the patent expires.67 The EU is also challenging a related provision
that permits experimentation and testing before the expiry of a patent so that marketing
approval can be obtained for an innovative medicine for market access immediately after
expiry. The EU’s argument is that these provisions violate Article 28 of the TRIPs
Agreement, which provide that a patent must confer a right on the patent holder to prevent
third parties from, inter alia, making and using the patented product during the lifetime of
the patent. In the recent Indonesian Autos case, discussed in the next chapter on Trade and
Investment, the United States claimed that a measure requiring that trade marks acquired in
respect of autos eligible for certain government incentives must be acquired by an
Indonesian company violated various provisions of the TRIPs Agreement. The panel found
that the United States had not demonstrated discriminatory treatment within the various
relevant senses provided in the TRIPs Agreement as it applies to trademarks. The panel
declined to apply a broad de facto discrimination concept in interpreting the TRIPs
Agreement.
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WIPO treaties on copyright and performance rights

The 1996 WIPO Copyright Treaty68 has as its main thrust the updating of the Berne
Convention in light of information technology and communications developments. Article 4
of the Treaty mirrors Article 10 of the TRIPs Agreement in establishing that computer
programs are to be protected as literary works within the meaning of the Berne
Convention. Article 11 confers on authors the right to control the dissemination of their
works through electronic means such as the Internet. The Treaty also requires Member
States to establish effective legal remedies against tampering with encoded information that
allows authors to track and control the making and distribution of digital copies of their
works. At the WIPO diplomatic conference at which the Copyright Treaty was negotiated
an initiative was put forward to provide intellectual property rights protection with respect
to data.69 This was rejected, although further examination of the issue of protecting
databases (as opposed to ‘raw’ data) was agreed. The notion of proprietizing facts raises
serious issues of individual freedom of expression, as well as the possibility of seriously
undermining the civic, democratic and educational potential of the Internet. Boyle notes
that the proposed

right would have been effectively permanent and would not have been restrained by
the traditional limitations of copyright law, such as fair use. This proposal, with its
potentially devastating effects on research and free speech, and its offer of a potent
new tool of private censorship, drew fire from the research establishment, civil
liberties groups and even—embarrassingly for its proponents—the database industry
it was designed to protect [footnote omitted].70

The WIPO Performances and Phonograms Treaty71 updates, in light of new (including
digital) technologies, the Rome Convention provisions on copyright protection to be
afforded with respect to performance of sound recordings, including for broadcast. The
Treaty also grants performers moral rights of attribution and integrity (Article 5.1). Rights
to royalties for performance of recordings are, however, subject to a reciprocity provision;
this provision is necessary because the United States only has very limited performance
rights in its domestic law (i.e. for digital performances only) and other Member States could
not accept a reservation by the US to the treaty provisions on these rights, unless they were
free to derogate from these provisions in respect of the rights of American performers.72

According to a study by the WTO Secretariat, the WIPO Copyright and Performances and
Phonograms Treaty, taken together, ‘will greatly facilitate the creation of a secure and
predictable legal environment that will foster the development of electronic commerce
involving on line distribution of protected materials’.73

Emerging issues

There are several important emerging issues that will likely need to be addressed in the near
future, either through dispute settlement under TRIPs or relevant WIPO conventions, or
through the creation of new laws. One issue is the continuing use by the United States of
unilateral trade action, particularly under s. 301 and Super 301, to deal with complaints
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about inadequate protection of intellectual property rights in developing countries, in some
instances simultaneously with the pursuit of dispute settlement in the WTO. It is arguable
that even if unilateral action does not violate any specific provision of the GATT or the
TRIPs Agreement (as it would not for instance in the case of withdrawal of voluntary GSP
preferences as was recently done in the case of Honduras),74 it may be in contravention of
Article 23 of the WTO Dispute Settlement Understanding. Article 23 provides that
Members ‘shall have recourse to the rules and procedures of this Understanding’, when
they seek redress of violations of WTO Agreements. The Article further provides that a
Member shall not ‘make a determination that a violation has occurred, that benefits have
been nullified or impaired or that the attainment of any objective of the covered agreements
has been impeded’ except through recourse to WTO dispute settlement. This would seem
to preclude unilateral action without reference to WTO dispute settlement, where the
subject matter is covered by the TRIPs Agreement.75 Another emerging issue of importance
is the relationship between trademarks and domain names on the Internet (domain names
constitute an essential part of a web address). As a study by the WTO Secretariat notes,

[o]ne of the questions that has arisen is under what circumstances and under which
jurisdiction(s) the use of a domain name that is identical to or similar to a trademark
may constitute a trademark infringement, and what remedies should be available for
the trademark holder. Further consideration is needed to determine whether the
above mentioned problems call for adaptations to the international protection of
trademarks.76

A third issue arises from the interaction of the emerging international environmental law
with respect to biodiversity and international intellectual property law. One dimension of
this issue that is not yet explicitly addressed by international legal rules is the use of
patentable technology that exploits genetic resources found in nature in developing
countries; there is a concern that these resources themselves be protected as intellectual
property, so that the contribution of farmers and local communities to their conservation
can be compensated. A report of the WTO Trade and Environment Committee appears to
take the view that nothing in the TRIPs Agreement would prevent a Member from
requiring that a user of these resources provide compensation for their use.77 Thus, while a
Member would normally have to grant a patent on an innovation based on use of genetic
resources in nature, it could decide to restrict access to the resources themselves in its
domestic law. Yet it is foreseeable that some kinds of restrictions (particularly onerous
ones) might be seen as a circumvention of TRIPs rights with respect to patent protection
itself. In general, however, we tend to support the Trade and Environmental Committee’s
reading of the TRIPs Agreement—a right to unrestricted access to genetic resources in
nature would amount to a claim to be able to patent, and use exclusively, the resources
themselves, which is clearly not provided under the TRIPs criteria for patentability.
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CONCLUSION

While trade theory provides little basis for mandating uniform standards of intellectual
property protection across all countries, intellectual property rights is an issue that is here
to stay on the international trade agenda. The Uruguay Round TRIPs Agreement, while at
the level of general principle promoting a uniform approach, in fact allows for a balance to
be struck between countries’ legitimate interests in limiting intellectual property rights for
consumer welfare and economic and social development reasons, and the interests of their
trading partners in sustaining adequate incentives for innovation. Maintaining this balance
through monitoring and dispute settlement will be a major challenge for the World Trade
Organization. 
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13
Trade and investment

INTRODUCTION

The last decade has seen a dramatic increase in foreign direct investment (FDI), defined as
ownership and (normally) control of a business or part of a business in another country.
Foreign direct investment is usually distinguished from portfolio investment, where a
foreign actor purchases securities in a domestic company solely to earn a financial return,
without any intent to own, control or manage the domestic firm.1 Foreign direct investment
generally takes one of ‘three forms: an infusion of new equity capital such as a new plant or
joint venture; reinvested corporate earnings; and net borrowing through the parent
company or affiliates’.2 According to UNCTAD,

The global FDI stock, a measure of the investment underlying international
production increased fourfold between 1982 and 1994; over the same period it
doubled as a percentage of world gross domestic product to 9 per cent. In 1996, the
global FDI stock was valued at $3.2 trillion. Its rate of growth over the past decade
(1986–96) was more than twice that of fixed capital formation, indicating an
increasing internationalization of production systems. The worldwide assets of
foreign affiliates, valued at $8.4 trillion in 1994 also increased more rapidly than world
gross fixed capital formation…. Unlike the two previous investment booms in 1979–
81 and 1987–90 (the first one being led by petroleum investments in oil producing
countries and the second one being concentrated in the developed world) the current
boom is characterized by considerable developing-country participation on the inflow
side, although it is driven primarily by investments originating in just two countries—
the United States and the United Kingdom.

(Investment Report, 1998)

While many developing countries have come in recent years to take a more positive view of
foreign investment and have moved to dismantle many explicit barriers and disincentives
(such as limits on the percentage of an enterprise that can be for-eign-owned and on
repatriation of profits), ownership by foreigners has become of increasing concern in certain
industrialized countries, particularly the United States, that traditionally complained about
illiberal attitudes elsewhere towards foreign investment.3 As well, increased interest in



foreign investment in Japan by nationals of other major industrialized countries, especially
the United States, has focused attention on a range of domestic policies and practices in
Japan that (including competition policies that provide few constraints on domestic cross-
ownership of enterprises) supposedly create obstacles to foreigners wishing to acquire
business assets there.4

The issue of foreign investment is closely linked to the role of multinational corporations
in the global political economy. Some see such corporations as powers unto themselves,
capable of buying or intimidating governments, or at least with the capacity to spread
production and other functions around the globe so as to exploit regulatory differences
between states—taking advantage of one country’s cheap labour, another’s tax haven, and
yet another’s favourable rules on intellectual property, and perhaps creating a race to the
bottom.5 Others view the multinational corporation as a logical and desirable extension of
the inherent logic of comparative advantage, combining the benefits of organizing
production within a single firm with the gains from free trade.6

Much of the contemporary controversy over foreign investment has surrounded
measures that aim not to exclude investment but to direct it in a manner that benefits the
economic development of the host country. In fact, measures aimed at channelling foreign
investment to benefit the economies of host countries actually challenge two of the major
assumptions that have traditionally underpinned hostility to foreign investment and the
multinational firm: first and most obviously that foreign ownership is necessarily harmful to
development; and second, that developing countries are powerless to determine the way in
which foreign firms exploit their productive resources.7 Also of significance are incentives
to attract foreign investment, such as tax holidays or subsidies.8 Indeed, incentives are often
used in conjunction with export performance or local sourcing requirements, and may have
the effect of offsetting some or all of the disincentive effects of such restrictions or
conditions on foreign investment.9

As will be described in the next section, in a world completely free of restrictions on the
movement of goods, services, and capital, any measure that distorts the global allocation of
productive resources would be world-welfare reducing from the perspective of neo-
classical economic theory.10 However, within the GATT, the focus of attention has been on
investment measures that have direct effects on trade in goods, such as measures that
require or encourage foreign-owned firms to discriminate between domestically produced
and imported inputs in production in the host country (local content requirements), as well
as measures that require that a certain percentage of the foreign firm’s output be
exported.11 The investment provisions of the Uruguay Round Final Act would subject some
investment measures with direct effects on trade to more explicit scrutiny against existing
GATT norms. These are relatively modest disciplines on investment disincentives and
incentives in comparison with those found in the Canada-US FTA and the NAFTA, both of
which include a National Treatment obligation with respect to foreign investors, as well as a
general right to invest (right of establishment) subject to certain limitations and exceptions.
Finally, the equivalent of a right to establishment is also entrenched in the OECD Code of
Liberalisation of Capital Movements (1991) and a National Treatment obligation with
respect to foreign investors is contained in the OECD 1976 Declaration on International
Investment and Multinational Enterprises.
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FOREIGN INVESTMENT AND TRADE THEORY

The theory of comparative advantage outlined in Chapter 1 shows the gains to both
domestic and global economic welfare from specialization of each country in the production
of those goods in which it has a comparative advantage. However, most goods—including
Ricardo’s classic examples of wine and cloth—can be understood as composites of other
goods and services. It is unlikely that a country that has an overall comparative advantage in
the production of a particular good also has a comparative advantage with respect to all the
inputs required to produce the good in question. To return to Ricardo’s example,
England’s comparative advantage in cloth may arise from the skill of its weavers, and in fact
Portugal may have a comparative advantage in the production of wool or cotton; similarly,
Portugal’s comparative advantage in wine may arise from the quality of its grapes, and
would not exclude English comparative advantage in the production of wine-making
technology. In such a case, it may still make sense for Portugal to make wine and trade it for
English-produced cloth, but it will also make sense for Portugal to export its cotton or
wool to England and for England to export wine-making technology to Portugal.

Such an outcome need not, of course, lead to any foreign investment. Wholly
Portuguese companies may make wine with technology produced by wholly British
companies. However, just as it may make sense to produce domestically a good through
internalizing different activities required for production within a given firm, rather than
through contracts between discrete individuals or firms, so too it could make sense for
Portuguese vineyard-owners to purchase British producers of wine technology, or for the
British producers to buy Portuguese vineyards. According to the modern theory of the
firm, production will be organized within a given firm where the agency costs of internal
contracting between the firm’s owners, agents, and employees are lower than the costs of
external contracting between independent producers or providers of each component or
element required to make the final product.12 The rapid growth in intra-firm trade over the
last few decades testifies to the economic logic of transboundary internal contracting.13

Increasingly, the production of complex goods may entail both cross-boundary internal
and external contracting. For instance, many of the activities required to produce an
automobile may be subsumed within a given auto-maker, which in turn will locate
production facilities globally in order to maximize comparative advan-tage, but other
important components will be obtained through external contracting with both domestic
and foreign firms.14

Nicolaides suggests that there may be some archetypal cases where cross-
boundary internal contracting will occur, rather than or in addition to external cross-
boundary contracting (trade): the multinational company (MNC) exists precisely because it
is not easy to trade intangible assets in open markets. It is difficult, for example, to write
contracts for experience and newly-developed technology which is in the process of being
adapted for commercial applications. The reasons that encourage corporate integration are
that production costs are reduced, information flows faster and actions of individual units
are more effectively coordinated.15 Some of the reasons for engaging in foreign investment
as opposed to or in addition to external contracting may be endemic to, or particularly
salient to, the international context. For instance, the greater difficulty in enforcing
external contracts across borders may lead to increased agency costs of contracting.16 As well,
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intellectual property and related laws in other countries may provide inadequate protection
of firm-specific innovations or knowledge, leading to a reluctance to transfer these to
domestic firms through arms-length external contracts (e.g. licensing arrangements or
direct sale of technology or processes).17

Dunning has analysed a vast literature on the theory of the multinational firm and the
globalization of production, and has developed what he calls an ‘eclectic’ theory, which
emphasizes a wide range of factors, including transportation and wage costs, greater
suitability of internal contracting to the development and dissemination of firm-specific
technology and processes, and hedging of the political risk of locating in a single country in
a volatile world environment.18 In many respects, this pluralistic approach is quite consistent
with contemporary views on the nature of comparative advantage in trade, which take into
account a wide variety of factors that may determine the comparative advantage or
disadvantage of a particular country, including dynamic factors that change with changes in
governments’ domestic policies, technologies, consumer preferences and other rapidly
evolving domestic and international realities.

ECONOMIC RATIONALES FOR GOVERNMENT INCENTIVES
AND DISINCENTIVES TO FOREIGN INVESTMENT

Do the combined insights of the neo-classical theory of free trade and the modern theory of
the firm suggest that economic welfare could actually be increased by government incentives
or disincentives with respect to foreign investment? In a world where (apart from
background rules of contracting) government action does not influence the allocation of
productive resources, markets themselves should generate optimal levels of foreign
investment. In such a world, government intervention would, almost by definition, distort
the allocation of productive resources, inasmuch as disincentives reduced the level of
investment below the market optimum, or incentives increased the level above that
optimum.

A number of important qualifications to this view have been proposed by trade scholars
and merit serious examination. 

For example, according to one prominent theory of industrial competitiveness— that of
Michael Porter and his associates—much economic development is attributable to the
creation of ‘clusters’ of industries in a given country or region. Clusters are groups of
industries that are interdependent or complementary.19 According to Porter, many
industries develop in response to the needs of other industries within a particular region or
country. Most firms form part of an industry cluster in their home base—they have
developed over time a complex web of relationships with suppliers and customers,
including suppliers who have incurred sunk costs in developing or adapting products and
services to the needs of the particular firm. When a firm establishes operations abroad, it or
its foreign subsidiary, is likely to continue to source many inputs from the firm’s ‘home
base’, thus failing to help build a cluster in the host country. On this view, local content or
sourcing requirements may have desirable domestic welfare effects, if they can effectively
counter the ‘home base’ bias identified by Porter, and lead to the development of
functioning clusters in the host country.
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In addition, host-country local content requirements, or local hiring and manufacturing
requirements, may offset the cumulative effects of subsidies or other governmental
measures in the ‘home base’ of the investing firm. The pressures to source in the ‘home
base’ may come less from the market than from government. These pressures may be
informal, as well as formal. Formal pressures would include subsidies linked to job creation
in the domestic economy and local content requirements in ‘home base’ government
procurement contracts. More informally, the perception that a firm is a good local ‘corporate
citizen’ may be viewed as important in effectively lobbying ‘home base’ governments on a
wide variety of regulatory matters of concern to the firm, whether environmental standards,
labour policies, or taxation issues. Often, the treatment a firm receives from its ‘home
base’ government may be linked to the perception and reality that the firm really ‘belongs’
to that country.

Finally, it may make sense to impose special burdens or requirements on foreign firms
where these firms are able to elude more general or neutral forms of redistributive
regulation. For instance, multinational corporations, especially those characterized by high
levels of intra-firm trade, may find it easy to manipulate transfer pricing20 so as to avoid
taxation on actual earnings in a foreign country. Many developing countries, in particular,
do not have the sophistication in the design and enforcement of corporate tax regimes
required to counter effectively this kind of conduct. As well, manipulation of transfer
pricing may allow a multinational corporation to ‘cheat’ on tariff restrictions by significantly
underpricing imports of inputs. Seen as a response to this kind of behaviour, local content
or sourcing requirements may be viewed as a substitute for ineffective tariff protection.

These various considerations do not, admittedly, add up to a decisive argument in favour
of local content and related requirements, which may have negative consumer welfare and
allocative efficiency effects within the host country. This does, however, weigh against any
kind of general assumption that trade would be undistorted, or less distorted, in the absence
of such requirements. 

Investment and trade protection

There is a complex interaction between foreign investment and trade protection. First of
all, foreign investment may occur as a means of jumping tariff walls or avoiding harassment
of imports under the trade remedy laws of the host country (so-called ‘cooperative
protectionism’). If much of its comparative advantage is portable, consisting of know-how,
processes and technology, a company may avoid border restrictions simply by
manufacturing within the domestic market. Enhanced access to host country markets
generally ranks high among the factors that industries cite as reasons for foreign investment.21

Protection-avoiding foreign investment has both opportunities and risks attached to it.
One such opportunity is the strategic use of tariffs or, more likely, administered protection,
to encourage foreign investment. Where a tariff (or other trade protection) induces a
foreign producer to relocate production facilities to the protecting state, new jobs in that
state are created, and in fact there is a possibility of shifting some of the foreign firm’s
comparative advantage itself to the host country. For instance, when Honda or Toyota sets
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up production in Canada or the United States, it brings with it the processes, know-how,
and so forth, that arguably constitute much of its comparative advantage.

It is important, however, to note that in one important sense consumers in the protecting
state will still be worse off than under conditions of liberal trade, because the foreign firm
that does relocate will be able to price up to tariff or other trade barriers (e.g. VERs),
thereby still charging consumers prices higher than would be the case without trade
restrictions.

A simple example will illustrate this point. A and B are both foreign car manufacturers
who have been exporting cars into C. A and B both produce a mid-sized car that would sell,
in the absence of protection, for £6,000 and C’s consumers are indifferent as between the
car produced by A and that produced by B. Assume that a tariff of 30% is imposed on
imports and an elasticity of demand for this kind of car that results in two-thirds of the tariff
being passed on to the consumer in higher prices. If A and B both export their cars to C,
C’s consumers will pay £7,200 per car. If A starts to produce the car in C, and comes inside
the tariff wall it may be able to underprice B while still earning more than the non-tariff
price per car. As long as consumers are indifferent between A’s car and B’s, A will be able
to outcompete B at any price below £7,200. The end result will be somewhat less of a
consumer welfare loss than if both A and B’s cars are imported and subject to tariffs, but
consumers will still be somewhat worse off than they would be if there were no protection.

At the same time, because some of the rents of protection have been shifted from
domestic firms to the foreign firm producing domestically, this may compensate in whole
or in part for additional costs incurred in shifting some production to the importing country,
including compliance with export performance, technology transfer or other requirements
imposed by the host-country government. A disturbing implication, especially for
consumer welfare, is that the higher the amount of protection, the more attractive the shift
of production is, because the rents from protection that accrue to the domestically-
producing foreign firm are correspondingly higher.22

The dynamic effects of foreign investment in protected
markets

In reality, when foreign firms have come within a tariff wall, they have often found it to be
something less than a safe haven. Domestic firms are apt to petition government for relief
from the increased competition, frequently arguing that the foreign plants are little more
than screwdriver operations aimed at circumventing tariffs or other border restrictions, and
that they create less employment per car sold, for instance, than domestic firms, which
source domestically to a greater degree and thus create jobs in a wider range of sectors that
produce inputs. As a consequence, once inside the tariff wall, foreign firms may well find
themselves confronted with new obstacles to exploitation of the domestic market. A
prominent example of this has been the effort of the European Union to limit the market
share of cars manufactured by Japanese producers within Europe, claiming that these are
not really European automobiles.23 Quite commonly, local content requirements are
imposed upon the foreign firm.
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At one level, such ex post adjustments of the ‘bargain’ between the protecting country
and the foreign firm could be viewed as opportunism—once it has sunk substantial costs in
the creation of factories or other production facilities, the foreign firm may have little
choice but to stay. On the other hand, it is arguable that domestic welfare is improved by
such measures—some of the rents from protection against competing foreign firms that
accrue to the investing firm are clawed back in the form of boosted sales for domestic
providers of inputs.

In theory, there are losses in allocative efficiency since otherwise uncompetitive
manufacturers of inputs are being kept in business. However, in the case of inputs for some
complex products, arguably the effect is to transfer comparative advantage to input
providers as well. Where a firm is unhappy with the quality of domestic inputs but must use
them to circumvent the tariff wall through foreign investment, it may still be in the firm’s
interest to produce locally but also to work with domestic input providers on quality control,
making their products genuinely competitive with imported inputs.

Alternatively (or additionally), the host country may find a way of increasing the rents
from protection to compensate the investing firm for the costs of complying with new local
content or local sourcing requirements. Quotas and VERs, because of their discriminatory
potential, are a simple way of increasing such rents. In return for local content
requirements, for instance, a foreign car manufacturer producing domestically could be
offered larger quotas on models that it continues to produce offshore. Consumers will
benefit from the increased quota (a larger supply will result in somewhat lower costs), but
will of course not benefit as much as when quotas on all imported cars in a similar category
or competing for the same market are increased or at the limit eliminated. Conversely, the
foreign firm with the increased quota benefits from greater sales, but at the same time
loses fewer of the scarcity rents than it would if the supply of its foreign competitors’
comparable products were also increased.

The dynamics of the relationship between trade protection and foreign investment
described above have broader implications that should dampen the enthusiasm of advocates
of strategic protection. First of all, a clear consequence is to reinforce the dominant position
of the strongest firms in a given industry, thereby reducing global competition. In order to
play the game, a firm must be large enough and have sufficient resources to expand
production globally, investing large amounts of capital in new production facilities. Second,
in the host country, a whole new set of jobs is created that, in effect, depends upon
continued protection. If comparative advantage has genuinely been transferred to the host
country, of course it may still make sense to continue production even after the removal, or
reduction, of protection. But the closing of American branch plants in Canada, and their
relocation to the United States, that has occurred in the wake of the Canada-US Free Trade
Agreement, is a powerful reminder that jumping the tariff wall may remain a decisive
consideration in a plant’s continuing operation in the host country. Arguably, as well, this
suggests that if protection is to be used to induce foreign investment, then it is important to
attach conditions that actually assure a real transfer of comparative advantage (such as
requirements for reinvestment and renewal of the plant, training of workers, and
technology transfer).24
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NON-ECONOMIC RATIONALES AND EFFECTS OF
INVESTMENT POLICIES: SOVEREIGNTY AND THE FOREIGN

FIRM

The discussion so far has focused exclusively on economic and trade policy dimensions of
foreign investment measures. Traditionally, however many of the reasons for which states
have imposed restrictions on foreign investment have been connected with political
arguments about sovereignty. These arguments concern a wide range of specific harms that
are believed to flow from ownership of a country’s productive resources by foreigners.
They include national security and defence considerations; the supposed difficulty of
subjecting foreign or multinational firms to domestic jurisdiction; concerns that foreign
investors or foreign firms will become a vehicle for inappropriate influence by their home
governments on poli-tics and society within the host country; and concerns about the
protection of cultural autonomy or distinctiveness.25 We will briefly consider several of
these preoccupations with the potential drawbacks of foreign investment.

Defence and national security

A traditional dictum of security policy, at least since Machiavelli,26 is that no state should
rely on others to furnish the weapons needed for its own defence. Nevertheless, the global
arms trade flourishes, and only a handful of relatively industrially advanced nations are
capable of manufacturing sophisticated weapons systems in any quantity.

The concern about having one’s own arms often extends to autarchy with respect to the
inputs necessary to produce those arms, whether steel or computer chips. For instance, as
Japan and some European countries have become world leaders in the development and
manufacture of products and technologies considered to have critical defence applications,
the United States has become increasingly concerned that it may be placing its vital security
interests in the hands of foreigners. This concern has been deployed as a rationale for trade
protection to sustain uncompetitive national industries considered vital to the security of
the United States. It has also resulted in measures intended to control foreign ownership of
productive assets in the United States. The United States has justified prohibitions or
restrictions on foreign investment in many sectors on national security or related grounds
(i.e. vital national interest). These sectors include: air transportation, coastal shipping,
commercial fisheries, communications, energy resources, and real property.27

In 1988, an amendment was added to the Omnibus Trade and Competitiveness Act (the
Exon-Florio Amendment, named after the US legislators who proposed the bill) providing
the President of the United States with the authority to block mergers or acquisitions involving
foreign firms on grounds that US national security interests would be impaired by the
resulting foreign ownership.28 The Committee on Foreign Investment in the United States
(made up of representatives of various agencies in the US government, including the State
Department, the Defense Department, the Commerce Department and the office of the
United States Trade Representative) is given the authority to conduct investigations of
mergers, acquisitions and takeovers that may threaten US national security. On the basis of
these investigations, the Committee makes recommendations to the President as to whether
national security interests justify blocking a transaction or altering its terms. Until recently,
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at least, there have been few investigations, and even fewer instances where the result has
been Presidential intervention in a trans-action.29 Nevertheless, the need to avert the threat
of such intervention may, in a wider range of cases, lead to various ‘voluntary’ undertakings
by the potential investor, making the terms of the investment more favourable to American
inter-ests.30 However, as Graham and Ebert note,31 there is strong pressure in Congress to
make investigation of proposed investments mandatory, at least with respect to some
sectors.

Does foreign ownership of strategically-sensitive enterprises really jeopardize security?
First of all, if in fact foreign producers do have a monopoly over products or processes that
are vital to a country’s security interests, the country in question is certainly better off
having those products or processes developed within its bor-ders. Dependency on imports
is much riskier since a foreign government can, in effect, control the export of the needed
materials. In a national emergency, by contrast, domestic production facilities (even though
foreign-owned) could be commandeered by the government, or made directly subject to its
orders.

What, however, of the case where there currently exist two suppliers of a
given technology or product, one domestic and one foreign, and where the foreign supplier
chooses to buy out the domestic supplier? Here, the acquisition may be motivated by the
desire to obtain a monopoly, and in fact could result in all production, or much of it, being
moved offshore. In such an instance, it may be quite justifiable to weigh carefully national
security implications within any overall review of the impact of such an acquisition.

In addition, foreign firms in the defence sector are likely to have particularly close
relationships with their home-country government—often reflected in the presence of
former politicians and senior bureaucrats on their board of directors, government subsidies,
procurement and R&D contracts, or partial government ownership. Where this is the case,
some concern that foreign powers will be able to exercise influence or control over the firm’s
strategy, and have privileged access to its products or research, may be warranted. Again,
however, this concern would be justified mainly where a merger or acquisition results in a
monopoly in a particular product or process.

In the instances just discussed, national security concerns may in fact be warranted with
respect to foreign investment. However, in the United States in particular, the national
security argument has been extended far beyond the case of very sensitive defence
industries to sectors that produce a wide variety of inputs into military products, or whose
production facilities might, in war time, need to be converted to military uses (steel, cars, civil
aircraft). In most of these instances, a variety of producers, domestic and foreign, currently
exist. Taken to its logical con-clusion the argument would end up justifying something close
to complete autarchy, since there are few sectors of civilian production that do not contribute
something of importance to the materiel needed, in the broadest sense, to sustain an all-out
war effort.

Furthermore, blocking a foreign takeover or merger will itself far from guarantee either
the continuation of a domestic source of supply for the products in question or protection
against foreign influence. For example, where the merger or acquisition is required to
rescue the domestic firm, or to ensure its continuing viability, the alternative may well be
bankruptcy, with the result that the foreign firm becomes the monopolist anyway but
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produces abroad, and hence the source of supply becomes even more insecure. Hence, in a
number of instances, one suspects that national security arguments against foreign acquisitions
are disguised attempts to attract a government supported bail-out at home, or more
protection. Once the firm is considered a domestic producer vital to national security, the
logical consequence is not just that foreigners should be prevented from acquiring it, but
that its survival as a domestic firm should be guaranteed by the state.

Inadequate regulatory or political control over the foreign
investor

The multinational firm is often described as a kind of power unto itself, able to slip through
the normal control of national jurisdictions through the global diffusion of its activities.
There are few inherent legal constraints on the application of domestic jurisdiction to the
activities that multinational corporations engage in within a particular country; however,
there may be significant practical constraints, where the bulk of the firm’s assets and much
of the information about its activities and deci-sion-making are located abroad. Of course,
while it is true that offshore activities and decisions of a foreign multinational may affect the
regulatory interests of its host country, so may the foreign activities and interests of the host
country’s own firms. Thus, the problem concerns both inward and outward foreign
investment.

In some sectors the regulatory issues may be particularly acute. In the case of financial
services, for instance, regulators may be concerned with the overall stability of an
institution, the quality of its investments, etc. Ultimately, domestic deposit holders are
dependent upon the stability of the overall institution, including the soundness of its lending
practices and other activities abroad. As is illustrated by the Bhopal disaster, regulatory
issues may also arise where multinationals are engaged in high-risk activities in a host
country, but where they retain elsewhere the assets necessary to satisfy potential liabilities
for these risks, or information about the risks.

These kinds of regulatory issues may justify some kinds of differential treatment of
foreign investors—the requirement to carry liability insurance, to maintain a minimum
level of assets within the host country, or to post a bond or a deposit to guarantee
regulatory compliance.

Extraterritoriality

Another set of concerns about foreign investment may be considered the ‘mirror image’ of
the concern about lack of domestic control of the foreign-owned company or subsidiary,
that is, the possibility that foreign ownership will result in the extraterritorial application of
the laws and regulatory authority of the firm’s home country to its activities in the host
country.32 Extraterritoriality has been particularly a concern raised by the explicit
extraterritorial sweep of a number of US regulatory regimes. One important example is
export controls. The United States has sought to prevent foreign subsidiaries of American
firms from exporting products to countries that are embargoed by United States law, such as
Cuba.33 From the perspective of the law of the GATT, this can rightly be seen as an
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interference with the trade relations of another Contracting Party. However, export controls
based upon national security considerations are explicitly exempted from normal GATT
rules by Article XXI,34 although, it is highly questionable whether even Article XXI
provides scope for a Contracting Party to interfere with exports and imports flowing
between another Contracting Party and a third state.

It bears emphasis that extraterritoriality is not a problem that is limited to the context of
foreign investment. Ownership by nationals is but one basis among many that the United
States, for instance, uses as a grounds for exercising jurisdiction beyond its borders. For
instance, US antitrust law is applied extraterritorially not just to American-owned
companies, but to any activity that materially affects United States commerce, including for
example participation of foreign-owned firms in cartels with US firms that restrict
competition in the US market.35 

The most promising avenue for resolving problems of extraterritoriality is not restrictions
on investment, but the evolution of multilateral processes to deal with particular cases of
conflicting exercise of jurisdiction, and eventually to evolve a set of detailed principles or
guidelines broadly consistent with international law norms on state sovereignty. In this
regard, it should be noted that a 1991 Decision of the OECD Council allows any Member
State of the OECD to refer to the Committee on International Investment ‘any problem
arising from the fact that multinational enterprises are made subject to conflicting
requirements’.36 With respect to extrater-ritorial application of antitrust laws, the OECD
has developed a separate process intended to address directly issues of restrictive business
practices and the multinational enterprise.37 A number of constructive approaches to inter-
jurisdictional conflict have been suggested, including harmonization of domestic
competition laws and designation of a lead jurisdiction for review of international
mergers.38

In addition to the matters discussed above, developing countries have traditionally had an
additional (although often overlapping) range of concerns about foreign investment, which
have been used to justify severe restrictions on the activity of foreign firms. These have
included concerns that foreign investors often will deploy technologies that are
inappropriate for exploitation of and development of local skills for best advantage, that
may aggravate or create balance of payments problems by heavy reliance on imported
inputs in the production process; and that foreign investors will perpetuate existing patterns
of Southern dependency in exploiting cheap, unskilled labour in developing countries
without transferring the skills and technologies required for economic development.39

On balance, the recent empirical evidence seems to suggest that foreign direct investment
has had a positive impact on growth and development in LDCs.40 In addition, it appears that
on a comparative basis developing countries with relatively restrictive policies towards
foreign investment have experienced much lower rates of economic growth over the last 30
years than those (e.g. Malaysia) with relatively open policies.41 However, it may be that
what distinguishes, at least in part, the countries with more open policies, is that instead of
placing general (and severe) restrictions on, for example, repatriation of earnings or the
right of establishment as such, these countries negotiated specific agreements on issues like
technology transfer and local employment with individual firms. Thus, instead of adopting
either a generally negative stance towards FDI, or a completely open attitude, they
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proceeded in a more selective fashion to impose requirements or conditions on some
foreign investors, where it was believed this would serve the interests of domestic
economic development. This case-by-case approach, however, is more transaction-cost
intensive and heightens the risk of corruption in the administration of foreign investment
policies.

This being said, in the aftermath of the LDC debt crisis (which has resulted in substantial
reduction of new debt financing available to many developing countries) and given what
many observers consider to be a world shortage of capital (considering, for instance, the
substantial needs of the Newly Liberalizing Countries in Central and Eastern Europe), many
developing countries have adopted a much more liberal attitude towards foreign
investment, and see the issue for governmental policy much more as that of attracting
foreign investment rather than restricting or limiting it. This led The Economist magazine to
remark, in a recent survey of multinationals, that

too many governments see foreign investment as a shortcut to prosperity, bringing in
skills, capital and technology to push their countries rapidly from the 1950s to the
1990s…. Those governments that rely too heavily on multi-nationals are likely to
look for a foreign scapegoat when inflation heads for triple figures, unemployment
fails to drop and demonstrators surround the ministry.42

The impact of the Mexican Peso crisis of 1994–5 and the crisis in Asian capital markets in
1997 on FDI suggests that this prediction of The Economist was overly pessimistic. These
crises involved massive outflows of portfolio equity investment, but neither crisis has led to a
devastating impact on FDI flows or the FDI climate in the affected countries. A joint report
of the International Chamber of Commerce and UNCTAD notes: ‘total portfolio
investment flows to Mexico fell from $12 billion in 1994 to $7.5 billion, with portfolio
equity investment flows falling from $4.5 billion to $0.5 billion in 1995. FDI inflows, in
contrast, which had more than doubled in 1994, fell by only 13% in 1995.'43 With respect
to the Asian crisis, the report notes: ‘The financial crisis in East and South-East Asia has
involved a sharp decrease in private external capital flow to some developing countries in
the region…. FDI flows in 1997 to the five most affected Asian countries as a group,
however, are estimated to have remained close to the level attained in 1996.’44 The report
entailed a survey of almost 200 major transnational corporations operating in the region
concerning how the crisis would affect their future plans; the vast majority responded that
their confidence in the region as an investment destination had remained unchanged. One
concern, however, is that in the wake of the crisis some countries might impose restrictions
on the ability of investors to purchase domestic company assets at ‘fire sale’ prices. In
general, however, the crisis has not resulted in a reversal or rethinking of the trend towards
liberalizing FDI regimes. In fact, in dramatically illustrating the dangers of reliance on
external bank lend-ing and portfolio equity investment to finance economic growth, the
crisis may actually reinforce positive attitudes towards FDI.
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ALTERNATIVE APPROACHES TO INTERNATIONAL
DISCIPLINE OF FOREIGN INVESTMENT MEASURES

The pre-Uruguay GATT

Investment measures and the General Agreement: an overview

Our discussion in ‘Foreign investment and trade theory’ and ‘Economic rationales’ (this
chapter) has emphasized the complexity of the relationship between foreign investment
measures, liberal trade and protectionism. The dramatic expansion in foreign investment in
recent years has depended heavily on liberal rules governing trade in goods, yet this
expansion has also provided new opportunities and incentives to exploit the rents from
protection, thus leading to new kinds of protectionist pressures. At the same time, the
interdependencies created by the globalization of production have brought into being new
interests that would lose enormously from a fundamental unravelling of the liberal trading
order.

As a matter of law, only a few of the investment measures that can be deployed
strategically along with trade protection arguably fall within the ambit of the GATT. The
most clear-cut example is that of local content or sourcing requirements, which explicitly
discriminate against imports and in favour of like domestic products, hence violating the
National Treatment obligation of the GATT (Article 111:4). Export requirements are a
somewhat more complicated case. As will be discussed below, a GATT panel decision with
respect to Canadian foreign investment measures held that export requirements did not per
se violate any provision of the General Agreement. However, as we will argue, export
requirements linked with a subsidy to the foreign investor may in some circumstances
constitute an export subsidy, the only kind of subsidy explicitly banned in the General
Agreement (Article XVI). Export requirements may also lead to dumping, inasmuch as they
lead to the product being exported below cost or at a price lower than that which applies in
the domestic market.

In addition to local content and export requirements, the law of the GATT may be
violated by trade balancing requirements, which typically limit the value of what a foreign
investor is allowed to import into the host country to the value of exports. Here, two sets of
provisions in the GATT are relevant. First of all, the limitation on imports might be
considered, like a domestic sourcing requirement, as a form of discrimination against
imported goods. However, it might be argued that this need not be the result, since with a
trade balancing requirement (unlike a direct local sourcing requirement) a foreign firm
wishing to import more inputs will be permitted to do so if this is balanced by an increase in
exports of finished products (and, as we have just mentioned, export requirements are not as
such illegal under GATT). A stronger case can be made that trade balancing restrictions
violate the Article XI ban on quantitative restrictions, as they place (albeit variable)
quantitative limits on imports. Because Article XI bans restrictions on exports as well as
imports, a prima facie violation of Article XI might also occur where the host country places
limits on the percentage or amount of production that it can export, i.e. requiring that a
portion of the production be set aside for the domestic market. Such a requirement might

TRADE AND INVESTMENT 335



be imposed where, perhaps for technology transfer reasons, a country wishes domestic
users to have access to what is being produced by the foreign firm. The requirement might
go hand in hand with an additional provision that the percentage of production in question
be made available to domestic users for local currency or at a lower than world market
price.

Additional investment measures that implicate GATT law are requirements that foreign
investors re-invest a percentage of earnings within the host country and, conversely,
limitations on the repatriation of profits in convertible currency. In the former communist
countries (of which several were long-standing GATT Members) such requirements were
commonplace, and they still exist today in many developing countries. Arguably, both re-
investment requirements and limitations on the repatriation of profits could constitute
violations of Article XV of the GATT, which requires Contracting Parties to adhere to IMF
rules with respect to balance of payments and exchange arrangements. However, as has
been discussed in detail in Chapter 3, these rules allow considerable scope for developing
countries to restrict foreign exchange, including exchange of local earnings into foreign
currency. In addition, it should be noted that trade-balancing requirements or other
investment measures that would otherwise be in violation of Article XI of the GATT may
nevertheless be saved by Article XII, which permits some, mainly non-discriminatory,
quantitative restrictions where necessary to address a balance of payments crisis. Although
the drafters clearly had temporary measures in mind, Article XII has been used to sustain
much longer-term restrictions. In addition, Article XVIIIB: 9 explicitly authorizes a broader
range of quantitative restrictions—including discriminatory quantitative restrictions—
where these are measures undertaken by developing countries to protect or enhance their
balance of payments.

The FIRA Panel Decision

The FIRA Panel Decision45 represents the only case where foreign investment measures
were the central focus of a panel prior to the WTO, and therefore deserves detailed
analysis. At issue were various undertakings obtained from foreign investors pursuant to
Canada’s Foreign Investment Review Act. The Act established a governmental agency, the
Foreign Investment Review Agency, to screen investment proposals by foreign interests.
The Agency was to review the proposals and either accept, reject, or modify them. The
essential criterion was whether the investment would be of significant benefit to Canada,
significant benefit being defined to include increases in employment and exports,
technology transfer, and advancement of ‘national industrial and economic policies’. Under
the Act, foreign investor applicants were able to make undertakings with respect to any
aspect of the operation of their business in Canada, with a view to more favourable
treatment of their application. Such undertakings were not, however, mandatory or a
formal prerequisite for the success of an application. Once an investment application was
approved, however, the undertakings were legally enforceable.

The United States argued that three kinds of undertakings violated provisions in the
GATT: local content, local manufacturing, and minimum export.
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Local content and local manufacturing requirements

With respect to local content requirements, the main argument was that these undertakings
violated Article 111:4 of the General Agreement (National Treatment). Given that the
undertakings were not formally required by the Canadian law, a threshold issue was whether
they could be considered, for purposes of Article III, as ‘laws, regulations, or
requirements’. The United States argued that such undertakings could not be viewed as
simply voluntary, since no firm would make them unless it would gain some advantage or
avoid some penalty by doing so. The panel, however, sidestepped the issue of voluntariness,
simply stating that ‘private contractual obligations entered into by investors should not
affect the rights which contracting parties, including contracting parties not involved in the
dispute, possess under Article 111:4’.

A second issue was raised by the Canadian argument that these undertakings merely
constituted predictions of what foreign investors intended to do based upon commercial
considerations.

The panel rejected this argument, pointing out that the specific content of some of the
undertakings showed that firms were expected to act in a manner not consistent with
commercial considerations or in explicitly discriminatory terms, for instance binding
themselves always to purchase a Canadian product when available on similar terms to an
import. The panel’s approach seems justified in light of the economic analysis developed
earlier in this chapter. Because the foreign firm producing domestically can capture rents
from protection by pricing up to the tariff, there are good reasons to believe that
commitments investors make about how much local sourcing they will undertake are not
simply in the order of a prediction about how they will behave in future in accordance with
market forces, but also reflect a ‘price’ investors are willing to pay to capture some of the
rents of protection.

A further important issue raised by the economic effects of local content or local
manufacturing undertakings is that of injury. The panel chose to sidestep this issue, noting
that ‘under standing GATT practice, a breach of a rule is presumed to have an adverse
impact on other contracting parties’ (para. 6.4). It is not obvious that foreign investors who
make undertakings are worse off under a scheme for screening foreign investment than
under circumstances where investment is unimpeded. As discussed earlier, the rents from
protection that a foreign investor gains from coming within the tariff wall (i.e. from being
able to price up to the tariff) may be substantial, and may more than compensate for the
costs of compliance with domestic content or other performance requirements. Also, such
requirements may in some situations be balanced with explicit subsidies or other incentives
to investment (such as tax holidays). There is clearly, however, a trade-related injury from
local content and local manufacturing requirements that is borne by producers and suppliers
of imported goods that would otherwise compete favourably with locally produced
imports. These producers may, of course, include the foreign investor itself, or other firms
from its ‘home base’ country—but they may be entirely from other countries.

Thus, it is incorrect to conceive of the debate over the trade effects of these measures as
simply a conflict between host country and home country interests. Even though developed
countries are more likely to be home than host countries, developing countries or other
countries that are not major sources of foreign investment still can lose significantly from
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investment restrictions in the nature of local content requirements, if the result is
discrimination against their exports. 

Export performance requirements

The FIRA panel also considered the legality of export performance requirements under the
GATT. The United States had argued that these requirements violated the obligation in
Article XVII:1 of the GATT for certain enterprises to act ‘in accordance with commercial
considerations’. The panel found that this obligation only applied to state-trading
enterprises as defined in the general provisions of Article XVII, and therefore was not
relevant to foreign investors. However, the panel also found that ‘there is no provision in
the General Agreement which forbids requirements to sell goods in foreign markets in
preference to domestic markets. In particular, the General Agreement does not impose on
contracting parties the obligation to prevent enterprises from dumping’ (para 5.18).

Here, the panel seems to have overlooked the spirit (although perhaps not the strict
letter) of the prohibition of export subsidies in Article XVI:2 B of the General Agreement.
The panel’s general position—that undertakings are not made gratuitously but in exchange
for a benefit that flows from the host country government to investor—would argue in
favour of the view that in fact export undertakings are likely to be subsidized, at the very
least by the rents from protection that the host government ‘grants’ to the investor in
authorizing the investment. Article XVI:4 B, furthermore, prohibits Contracting Parties
from granting ‘directly or indirectly any form of subsidy’ on exports, at least where the
result is a lower price for exports than the domestic price of the product.

The case for deeming export performance requirements as equivalent to an export
subsidy is, of course, particularly strong where an investor is attracted to the host country
by explicit financial incentives to establish operations there. However, at the same time, the
GATT rules on subsidies do not refer explicitly to investment incentives as such. Some such
incentives may constitute countervailable subsidies under the WTO Subsidies Agreement,
but only because domestic products are being subsidized, not because of the impact of such
subsidies on the location decisions of foreign firms.

The evolution of the GATT rules: TRIMs and the Uruguay
Round

Clearly, the GATT rules extend only to a relatively narrow range of investment measures with
direct and immediately identifiable impacts on trade. In the Uruguay Round of GATT
negotiations, the United States in particular sought a much more comprehensive GATT
code on investment based upon the principle of free access to foreign markets. On this free
access approach, the investment measures disciplined by the GATT would no longer be
limited to measures such as local content requirements that discriminate against imported
products, but would extend to a potentially vast range of domestic policies of Contracting
Parties that create barriers to in-bound foreign investment regardless of whether specific
trade impacts are present. The free access approach, it should be noted, gains some
normative weight from the allocative efficiency arguments for liberal investment policies

338 THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE



explored in ‘Foreign investment and trade theory’ (earlier in this chapter). These imply
that, in principle, almost any incentive or disincentive to investment can be regarded as a
distortion of the optimal global allocation of productive resources. However, under real
world conditions of imperfect competition and tariff and other trade restrictions, important
qualifications exist on these allocative efficiency arguments—qualifications explored earlier
in this chapter. In addition, the free access approach provides no obvious means of weighing
against allocative efficiency considerations the non-economic rationales for investment
restrictions discussed above in ‘Non-economic rationales’ (this chapter).

Unlike the United States, most other Contracting Parties were sceptical of the free access
approach, and saw the task of the Uruguay Round negotiations on TRIMs as that of
developing more detailed and explicit rules with respect to measures that appear
inconsistent with well-established GATT principles, such as National Treatment with
respect to products. This suggests a cautious extension of the kind of analysis undertaken by
the FIRA panel to a somewhat broader set of measures (such as trade balancing
requirements or export performance requirements) that directly affect trade flows. A
concrete example will elucidate how the much more comprehensive US view of what is
trade-distorting conflicts with the more text-bound view of other Contracting Parties. The
US views technology transfer requirements as distorting trade, in that a possible result is to
transfer to the host country the capacity to develop products and processes that it would
otherwise have to import from the home country.46 Other countries question whether this
impact is very well established: it might be the case, for instance, that absent such a
transfer, some developing countries would not be able to afford such products and
processes at all, and therefore that imports would be negligible.47

The Uruguay Round Final Act reflects a rather subtle compromise between these
differing perspectives.48 On the one hand, there is a binding obligation not to apply any
investment measures ‘inconsistent with the provisions of Article III or Article XI of the
General Agreement’ (Article 2(1)). There is thus a clear re-affir-mation of the principle that
existing GATT provisions do apply to some investment policies. Moreover, an ‘illustrative
list’ of such measures is provided, which includes local content, sourcing, and some trade
balancing requirements (which violate National Treatment) and import and export
restrictions (which violate the ban on Quantitative Restrictions, in Article XI of the General
Agreement).

On the other hand, the illustrative list does not contain any of the measures with more
indirect or questionable effects on trade for which United States negotiators had been
seeking explicit disciplines, such as technology transfer requirements. In addition, the
existing exceptions with respect to Article XI that apply to developing countries are re-
affirmed (Article 4). As well, developing countries are provided with substantial transition
periods (five years and seven years in the case of the least-developed countries) for
elimination of TRIMs that offend Article III and/or Article XI (Article 5).

However, it should also be noted that the illustrative list is just that—the text leaves it
open for GATT panels to find that measures not on the list violate the GATT, and in
addition, the fact that no list of ‘green light’ or explicitly non-GATTable measures is provided,
means that no further protection is extended to Contracting Parties against unilateral
retaliatory action by the United States on the basis of its market access approach. Indeed,

TRADE AND INVESTMENT 339



additional legitimacy could well be conferred on the US approach in that the Final Act
provides for a five-year review of the provisions on TRIMs, possibly with a view to
including new provisions on ‘investment policy and competition policy’ (Article 9). The
Final Act Agreement on Trade Related Investment Measures also calls for the creation of a
Committee on TRIMs whose functions are, inter alia, to ‘monitor the operation and
implementation of’ the Agreement. In the Indonesian Autos case (not appealed), the panel
held that the TRIMs Agreement has ‘an autonomous legal existence’ from the GATT (para.
14, 62). It also held that the Agreement could apply to performance requirements that were
a condition for receipt of subsidies, even if the subsidy measures themselves might be
covered by the Agreement on Subsidies and Countervailing Measures—(paras. 14.47–14.
55). The panel further found that the local content requirements could be covered by the
TRIMs Agreement, even if these requirements, or the advantages conditioned upon
meeting them, were not targeted at foreign investors, but rather generally applicable to
enterprises, whether domestically or foreign-owned (para. 14.73).

The NAFTA

Articles 1102 and 1103 of NAFTA, respectively, establish National Treatment and MFN
obligations with respect to investors and investments of other NAFTA Parties. National
Treatment is required with respect to establishment, acquisition, expansion, management,
conduct, operation, and sale or other disposition of investments. Thus, in effect, the National
Treatment obligation embodies a right of establishment. These obligations may be subject to
various reservations and exceptions, listed in various Annexes to the NAFTA (especially
Annexes I-III) and in the case of Mexico include measures related to the following sectors:
transportation, telecommunications, petrochemicals, the postal service, professional
services, and social services. Canada and the United States, however, have also included
reservations with respect to some of these sectors in Annex II, in some cases out of specific
policy concerns and in others simply to preserve reciprocity or symmetry between the
obligations of Mexico and its NAFTA partners.49 Where not reserved, existing non-
conforming measures must be eliminated within ten years.

In addition, there is a general provision in the introductory section of Chapter 11 stating
that nothing in this Chapter shall be construed to prevent a Party from providing a service
or performing a function such as law enforcement, correc-tional services, income security
or insurance, social welfare, public education, public training, health and child care in a
manner that is not inconsistent with this Chapter (Article 1101.4). This reflects Canadian as
well as Mexican concerns that some provisions of the Investment Chapter, particularly the
right of establishment, could be interpreted as providing to private investors of other
NAFTA partners a right to compete in areas that are characterized by complete or
substantial public sector provision in Mexico and Canada, but where some or all of delivery
is provided by the private sector in the United States. One may question, however, the
legal significance of this clause, since it protects only those measures that are in any case ‘not
inconsistent’ with the provisions of Chapter 11, and thus does not override the application
of Chapter 11 to public provision of essential services. In addition, on its terms, the clause
only seems to apply to direct governmental provision: thus, once a government begins
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contracting out some of these functions, even to the non-profit sector, it might be required
to permit a direct business presence in that sector by private interests in other NAFTA
countries, on a National Treatment basis. The effect may be to deter governments from
innovative experiments with delivery through non-governmental actors such as non-profit
community groups, for fear of losing adequate scope for regulatory control or being
required to allow competition on essentially commercial criteria.50

The NAFTA prohibits various kinds of performance requirements, including minimum
export, domestic content, domestic purchasing, and technology transfer requirements
(Article 1106(1)). The prohibition on technology transfer requirements is somewhat
qualified by the fact that requirements for the domestic conduct of Research and
Development and training of workers are explicitly permitted (1106(4)). The NAFTA does
not discipline investment incentives. From an allocative efficiency perspective, it is just as
undesirable to encourage a higher level of investment than would occur on the basis of
market forces alone, as to discourage investment that would occur on the basic of such
forces alone—thus the failure to discipline incentives is a major defect of the NAFTA
Investment Chapter. However, Article 1106(3) provides that some of the requirements
listed in Article 1106(1) cannot be stipulated as conditions for the receipt of subsidies, which
may discourage to some extent the use of investment incentives.

The NAFTA provides some protection for investors from non-NAFTA countries who
already have substantial business activities in the territory of one of the NAFTA Parties.
These investors from non-NAFTA Parties are to enjoy the full rights of NAFTA country
investors if they choose to expand their activities into the territory of another NAFTA Party
(Article 1113.2). Thus, for example, a German-owned company operating in Canada that
wishes to engage in business activities in the United States would be entitled to the same
benefits of the NAFTA as would be a Canadian-owned company operating in the United
States.

Article 1110 of NAFTA prohibits ‘direct or indirect’ expropriation of an investment
unless certain criteria are met. These are: that the expropriation be for a public purpose;
undertaken on a non-discriminatory basis; in accordance with due process; and with
payment of full compensation at market value. As Jon Johnson notes, the NAFTA lacks a
definition of ‘expropriation’.51 The American view of the meaning of expropriation is
deeply influenced by the ‘regulatory takings’ doctrine in US domestic law, under which, in
some circumstances, changes in general laws and regulations that affect the value of
property may be considered as ‘expropriation’, thus triggering some right of compensation,
even if title to property is in fact not taken.52 While as Johnson correctly notes, in
interpreting this Article of NAFTA ‘the relevant body of law is international law and not the
domestic law of any Party’,53 he also acknowledges that ‘international jurisprudence on the
subject of taking versus regulation is not nearly as well developed as Canadian or U.S.
jurisprudence.’54 In 1997, a challenge to a Canadian environmental law was launched by a
US investor under Article 1110 of NAFTA, claiming that a ban on the importation and
inter-provincial transport of a gasoline additive which is a neurotoxin and also interferes
with anti-pollution devices in automobiles (MMT). The investor, the Ethyl Corporation,
which manufactures MMT, claimed that the ban amounted to an ‘expropriation’ and sought
$350 million in damages but eventually settled the case for a lower amount.55
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Ethyl was able to take the Canadian government to arbitration due to what is arguably
the most innovative feature of the NAFTA investment provisions—the establishment of
investor-state dispute settlement processes based on arbitration according to international
arbitral rules, in particular those of ICSID, the International Convention on the Settlement
of Investment Disputes. The NAFTA Parties consent to submission to arbitration of
investment disputes under Chapter 11, at the request of the private investor itself. This
makes NAFTA the first comprehensive international trade treaty56 to provide to private
parties direct access to dispute settlement as of right.

The Codes of Conduct approach: negotiating the rights and
responsibilities of multinationals and sharing the costs and

benefits of foreign investment

A third approach to international discipline of foreign investment measures is embodied in
the various multilateral and bilateral Codes of Conduct that have been negotiated between
states as well as between states and multinational firms them-selves. The Codes of Conduct
generally aim at striking an explicit balance between concerns of investors (compensation
for expropriation, repatriation of earnings) and concerns of host countries about the conduct
of foreign firms (whether corruption and bribery, avoidance of domestic regulatory and tax
regimes, or unfair labour practices). In return for commitments of ‘fair treatment’ from the
host country the firm commits itself to behave there as a good corporate citizen. Reflective
of this approach are the 1976 OECD Guidelines for Multinational Enterprises57 and the
United Nations Draft Code on Transnational Corporations, as well as Guidelines for
Investment developed by international business groups such as the International Chamber of
Commerce for inclusion in negotiated agreements between multinational enterprises and
individual countries.58

One attractive feature of the Codes and Guidelines is their inherently pluralistic
character, involving an explicit balance of economic and a variety of political, ethical, and
social concerns in the regulation of foreign investment. Another, often cited advantage with
respect to some Codes and Guidelines is that they result from a multilateral process where
there is a relative equality of bargaining power between large and small countries, and
between the developed and developing world. This is particularly true of instruments
developed within the UN system, including the UN Draft Code on Transnational
Corporations.

Often, however, the language of these instruments reflects a high level of generality and
diplomatic vagueness. They therefore often provide very limited guidance for the resolution
of specific disputes or conflicts. For instance, an obligation to abstain from bribery is
specific enough, but what of the obligation on multinationals by the OECD Guidelines ‘To
take fully into account established general policy objectives of the Member States in which
they operate’? How would one go about determining whether this vague obligation had
been sufficiently complied with by a particular foreign investor? Despite their voluntary
character, and the vagueness of many of their prescriptions, the Guidelines have been
credited with improving channels of communication between multinational corporations
and host country governments (as well as local trade unions) in OECD countries.
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Implementation of the Guidelines is monitored by the OECD Committee on Investment
and Multinational Enterprises (CIME), which however does not serve the function of
settling specific disputes between multinationals and host governments. The CIME does
issue ‘clarifications’ of the Guidelines, and these ‘clarifications’ are usually triggered by
specific disputes which involve disagreement about the meaning of the Guidelines.59

In contrast to the Guidelines, two other OECD instruments contain strict substantive
commitments by OECD Member States with respect to liberalization of investment
measures. The OECD Code of Liberalisation of Capital Movements and the Code of
Liberalisation of Current Invisibles contain specific disciplines on measures that impede the
flow of capital between OECD Member States.60 Cumulatively, these disciplines are viewed
by the OECD as the equivalent of a right of establishment.61 The Codes of Conduct are legally
binding on OECD members. A commitment to National Treatment of foreign investors is
contained in Article II of the OECD Declaration on International Investment and
Multinational Enterprises (1976). Unlike the Codes, the Declaration is not binding in
international law. Subsequent Decisions of the OECD Council (which are binding) have,
however, required that Member States lodge with the OECD any exceptions to National
Treatment in their national policies. Such exceptions are to be examined by the CIME at
regular intervals (at least once every three years) with a view to ‘making suitable proposals
designed to assist Members to withdraw their exceptions’.62 In addition, any member
country ‘which considers that its interests may be adversely affected by significant official
incentives and disincentives to international direct investment’ by another member country
may demand consultations in the CIME ‘to examine the possibility of reducing such effects
to a minimum’.63 The National Treatment commitment in the Declaration is subject to
‘needs [of member states] to maintain public order, to protect their essential security
interests and to fulfil commitments relating to international peace and security’.64 Member
States are, nevertheless, required, for transparency purposes, to notify to the OECD
measures that may be justified on these terms.

In contrast to these OECD instruments, most multilateral investment codes, especially
those concerned with investment relations between developed and developing countries,
only become effective through explicit or implicit understandings between host countries
and individual multinational corporations. This is the case for example, with the UN Draft
Code on Transnational Corporations. Here, all the inherent difficulties of inequality of
bargaining power between developing and developed countries—supposedly redressed in
part through multilaterally-developed Codes—return as countries and firms bargain as to
what sub-set of rights and obligations will be adopted and complied with in these explicit or
implicit bilateral understandings.65 At the same time, some observers have noted that the
Codes of Conduct have succeeded in influencing the settlement of some investment
disputes through private litigation, due to the willingness of judges and arbitrators to invoke
them as interpretative aids or sources of guidance on matters of international economic
policy.66

An attempt to remedy the problem of inequality of bargaining power, at least in part, is
reflected in the Convention on the Settlement of Investment Disputes Between States and
Nationals of Other States (ICSID).67 ICSID provides a vehicle by which host countries, home
countries and multinationals can agree to submit investment disputes to third-Party
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arbitration. ICSID responds both to the concerns of developed country foreign investors
that they may not be fairly treated in the domestic legal processes of host countries and to
the parallel concerns of the developing countries about investment disputes being
adjudicated in, for example, American or British courts (as would often be provided in the
choice of forum clause of an investment agreement, at the insistence of the developed
country investor). While a variety of bilateral investment treaties and agreements between
host countries and multinationals provide for arbitration through the ICSID process, it has
rarely been resorted to in order to resolve investment disputes, for reasons that are not
entirely clear.68 ICSID’s future may now, however, be somewhat brighter by virtue of the
incorporation of the ICSID arbitration process into the dispute resolution provisions of the
NAFTA Chapter on investment. Finally, inasmuch as principles in the codes end up being
part of bilateral, reciprocal bargains that strike a balance of interests between investors and
host countries, they present the same kind of danger as any managed trade, bilateral
reciprocity-based approach to liberalization. The balance of interests struck may ignore
effects of investment measures on third countries (e.g. import substitution effects) with a
global welfare perspective being lost sight of entirely.

At the same time, these dangers may be somewhat attenuated through the development
of general norms of international law with respect to compensation for the expropriation of
the property of foreign nationals and extraterritoriality, as well as more specific regimes
that deal with inter-jurisdictional dimensions of corporate taxation or antitrust policies. As
discussed earlier in the chapter, these are matters that loom large in investment relations
between states, but overlap with other international and domestic regimes not specific to
the foreign investment context.

THE MULTILATERAL AGREEMENT ON INVESTMENT
(MAI)69

Background

As noted earlier in this chapter, negotiations on investment in the Uruguay Round failed to
yield a result even approaching a comprehensive set of rules on foreign direct investment,
the Uruguay Round TRIMs Agreement being little more than an affirmation and modest
strengthening of the status quo of the 1947 GATT, particularly as interpreted in the FIRA
panel ruling. This failure of the Uruguay Round (at least from liberal trade perspective) was
often attributed to the recalcitrance of developing countries. Not long after the completion
of the Round, thinking in Western trade policy circles began to turn to alternative venues
and mechanisms for achieving a set of comprehensive liberalizing commitments on
investment. This thinking suggested that among an increasing number of countries there
was (in the words of one advocate) ‘a convergence of attitudes’70 about the relationship of
investment policy to the interests of the regulatory state, i.e. in the direction of economic
liberalism. Among this expanding group of like-minded countries it would be easier to
achieve agreement on far-reaching investment rules, beginning with already developed
countries and soon extending to Newly Industrializing Countries, and then to others
competing for foreign investment, which would not be able to afford not to go along. In
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1995, thinking along these lines was reflected in an OECD Report to Ministers, which
proposed the negotiation of a Multilateral Agreement on Investment within the OECD
forum, but open to accession to non-OECD countries prepared to accept its strictures.71

The timing and venue could partly be justified on the rather benign grounds that the
existing OECD Liberalisation Codes (discussed earlier in this chapter) required renewal,
and one could build from these existing instruments towards a comprehensive agreement.
Various drafts were produced from 1996 through April 1997, all of them reflecting a
general architecture (including National Treatment, MFN, and Dispute Settlement) but all
of them also with gaps and alternative texts indicating important areas where consensus was
elusive. We have chosen to base our analytical overview of the initiative on the last draft
text, indicating its relationship to some of the earlier versions, and also where agreement
remains elusive, and so the text is bracketed or alternative wording are presented, neither or
none of which has yet attained a consensus. In early December 1998, the MAI negotiations
were formally halted.

An Introduction to the draft MAI text

The draft Multilateral Agreement on Investment72 has at its core the principle that
governments must not discriminate against, or among, foreign investors from countries that
have signed the Agreement—the obligations of National Treatment and Most Favoured
Nation, respectively (Article III, 1–3). These obligations are subject to certain general
exceptions, as well as reservations to be filed by individual signatories, which are in turn
governed by the principles of standstill and (possibly) rollback. Standstill signifies the notion
that any measures reserved may not be more restrictive of investment than existing
measures. Rollback connotes the idea that, over time, countries’ reservations will be
subject to an on-going process of scrutiny, and (hopefully) negotiated removal.

The rules on performance requirements in the draft MAI are quite similar to those in
NAFTA—minimum export, domestic content, and domestic sourcing requirements are all
prohibited (it will be recalled that these last two kinds of requirements were already found
to violate the GATT by the FIRA panel, an approach reinforced by the illustrative list in the
Uruguay Round TRIMs Agreement). More controversially, especially in light of the
potential adoption of this text by developing countries, the draft MAI contains a prohibition
on technology transfer requirements as well, except as a competition law remedy. Initially,
it was intended that the MAI would also cover, in addition to requirements, investment
incentives, which would have been a major advance over NAFTA. However, disagreement
on how to do this proved intractable, with some Parties objecting to any meaningful
disciplines. Therefore, the draft MAI text is silent on these measures.

In some areas, such as movement of key personnel, the MAI goes appreciably beyond
NAFTA in securing a liberal investment regime. In other areas, such as protection of
investments against ‘expropriation’ and dispute settlement, there are important issues to
resolve, issues which however are already present in the NAFTA in a not dissimilar form.
Finally, the interface between MAI obligations and legitimate domestic policies in areas such
as environment and culture—and the relationship between liberal investment and labour
rights—was not resolved.
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The movement of key personnel

One of the areas in which the MAI has made significant progress is with the movement of
key personnel. To support the globalization of production, it is important for multinational
enterprises be able freely to exchange managers and specialists between entities in different
countries for efficient deployment of human capital. While the notion of key personnel is
not always precisely defined, most OECD countries have national laws that contain special
provisions relating to the temporary entry of this category of foreign personnel. Regulations
affecting visas, residence and work permits remain part of the country’s immigration
policy, which is strongly influenced by the country’s national political and economic
considerations. However, a recent OECD survey points out that despite any potential
immigration problems that may arise, most members recognize that the ‘ability to quickly
and easily move key personnel between countries is an important element of investment
decisions, technology transfers as well as research and development activities of MNCs’.73

Nevertheless, key employees are still put through tests and procedures which may adversely
affect firms’ competitiveness or investment flows. There have been some attempts—in
other investment instruments—to address the issue of key personnel. For example, the
NAFTA sets out commitments by its three members to facilitate on a reciprocal basis,
temporary entry into their respective territories of business persons who are citizens of
Canada, Mexico or the United States. As noted elsewhere in this book, each NAFTA
country maintains its rights to protect the permanent employment base of its domestic
labour force, to implement its own immigration policies and to protect the security of its
own bor-ders.74 The NAFTA categories are rather broad—business visitors, traders, intra-
company transferees and certain categories of professionals—which provides NAFTA
members with a great degree of flexibility. Thus, NAFTA has in many ways been able to
strike the difficult balance of broadening the category of key personnel while maintaining
sovereignty in the area of immigration. For example, the United States and Mexico have
agreed to an annual numerical limit of 5,500 Mexican professionals being allowed to enter
the United States.75 While the provisions of this agreement are quite innovative and far
reaching, the obvious limitation of this treaty is the number of its members. In devising the
MAI, the OECD has borrowed ideas from this treaty and extended its breadth to encompass
all of its members.

The MAI reflects a ‘wider’ and ‘deeper’ conception of the notion of key personnel. First,
this agreement will apply to all of the Contracting Parties of the MAL76 Although, each
Contracting Party has made a number of reservations,77 there is an overall consensus on the
importance and necessity of such a provision in the treaty. The agreement demonstrates
respect for state sovereignty in that the key personnel provisions remain subject to ‘the
application of Contracting Parties’ national laws, regulations and procedures affecting the
entry, stay and work of natural persons’.78 At the same, time, however, this agreement has
broad application, with its scope extending to groups such as investors seeking to provide
essential technical services to the operation of an enterprise to which the investor has
committed,79 employees working in the capacity of an executive, manger or specialist,80

and spouses and minor children of these ‘key personnel’.81
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Investment protection

The OECD subcommittee studying the broad issue of investment protection, concluded
quite early on in the negotiating process, that additional protection under an MAI may be of
limited interest to MNCs unless it goes beyond the parameters established in existing
instruments and domestic laws.82 This includes finding a definition of investment
expropriation that is as broad as possible, namely, ‘all measures adopted by a state whether
direct or indirect that have the effect of depriving the investor of its investment’.83

A major concern with this broad approach to expropriation is that it could conceivably
lead to investor claims against signatory states where regulatory changes, whether in
environment, safety, other areas, negatively affect the value of the investment. This could
make regulatory reform extremely costly, but is an interpretation of the meaning of
expropriation quite common in US domestic takings jurisprudence. As noted above, under
a similar provision in NAFTA, a US investor obtained a multi-million dollar damages on the
grounds that a ban on international and interprovincial trade in a substance that it produces
in Canada constitutes ‘expropriation’.84 Language was apparently agreed, subsequent to the
publication of the most recent working draft, to deal with this issue. Thus, it was proposed
to include the following qualification in the Investor Protection provisions of the MAI: ‘the
MAI will not inhibit the exercise of the normal regulatory powers of government and the
exercise of such powers will not amount to expropriation.’ 

Dispute settlement

The 24 April 1998 Draft of the MAI contains provisions on both state-to-state and investor-
state dispute settlement (earlier versions had dealt only with investor-state processes).

In the case of state-to-state dispute settlement, the procedures are clearly modelled on
the kind of dispute settlement reflected in trade agreements such as the WTO and NAFTA.
If a Party has failed to resolve its dispute with another Party by consultations, after a 60-day
period it may request the establishment of an arbitral panel, which is to be appointed by
agreement between the Parties to the dispute within 30 days of a request for consultations.
In the absence of agreement between the Parties, the Secretary General of the OECD may
intervene to name the panellists. Other Member States (‘third Parties’) may make oral or
written submissions to the panel, and are entitled to access to documents pertaining to the
proceedings, with the exception of designated ‘confidential and proprietary information’.
The panels may also consult technical and scientific experts. Unlike the case with the
WTO, arbitral panels are to be given explicit authority to grant pecuniary compensation or
even restitution in kind (this last remedy being subject to the consent of the Party against
which it is made). A right of appeal to another panel is also contemplated, on grounds such
as corruption, that the panel mani-festly exceeded its jurisdiction, or that ‘the award has
failed to state the reasons on which it is based’.

With respect to investor-state dispute settlement, MAI provides investors with a right to
arbitration in accordance with various international commercial arbitration regimes,
including ICSID (on which NAFTA investor-state dispute settlement is based),
UNCITRAL, and the International Chamber of Commerce rules.
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The arbitration rules that apply to investor-state dispute settlement under the MAI
contemplate a secret process, where neither the pleadings, nor the hearing before the
arbitrator, nor the reasons for decision are public unless permitted by both Parties. This
practice might be entirely appropriate in the kind of commercial disputes between private
Parties for which arbitration was originally designed, or even in investor-state contexts
where what is at issue is, for example, the interpretation of a contract between the state and
an enterprise. None the less, it seems highly questionable where arbitration is being used to
interpret public international law, in whose meaning many Parties have a stake. Also, many
of the issues surrounding interpretation of the MAI are likely to pertain to the relationship of
investor rights to domestic public policies—thus there are important democratic concerns
about the absence of publicity and transparency. The 24 April draft attempts to address this
in several ways. First of all, third Party rights of intervention are created for investor-state
dispute settlement—the arbitral tribunal is required to notify the Parties Group (the
institution overseeing the MAI compromised of all its Member States) of its formation, and
‘may give to any Contracting Party requesting it an opportunity to submit written views on
the legal issues in dispute, provided that the proceedings are not unduly delayed thereby’. This
being said, there is no requirement that such an opportunity be provided, and the
Parties Group take into account the views of the Parties to the dispute in deciding whether
to grant it. Second, the arbitral award itself (which must contain reasons) is to be a publicly
available document.

With respect to environmental and labour standards, the 24 April version of the MAI
contains several alternative NAFTA-like provisions, both of which would commit the Parties
to the MAI not to lower or derogate from environmental or labour standards in order to
attract or retain foreign investment. The weakest versions would state the commitment in
less than legally imperative language (‘should’ rather than ‘shall’) and would limit remedial
action to consultations, as opposed to binding dispute settlement.

The General Exceptions are limited to national security and to monetary and foreign
exchange policy-related measures. As will be discussed below, the fact that there is no
general exception for legitimate health, safety, and environmental measures has been an
important basis of the criticism of the draft MAI by various groups. In the 24 April draft,
there is, however, with respect to the constraints on performance requirements, an
environmental and health and safety exception modelled on Article XX(b) and (g) of the
GATT (the text of these GATT provisions and the interpretation of them in dispute
settlement is extensively discussed in Chapter 15 on trade and the environment). Finally, there
is a limited Exception for taxation measures.

Public controversy over the MAI and the fate of the
negotiations

On 28 April 1998, a decision was taken at the OECD Ministerial to suspend efforts to
conclude the MAI as a binding investment treaty within a specific time frame: instead,
OECD Ministers called for a period ‘of assessment and further consultation between the
negotiating Parties and with interested parts of their societies’.85 For many observers, this
signified the death of the MAI initiative, particularly given that May 1998 had been often
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cited as a target for actual approval by Ministers of a final text. It was decided subsequently
to terminate negotiations and pursue the issue in the WTO forum.

By May 1997, agreement had been reached between the negotiators on many elements
of the basic architecture of the MAI, including MFN and National Treatment. However,
important differences of view between countries were surfacing with respect to the
relationship of the MAI to environmental and labour standards and cultural policies.86 As
well, considerable disagreement existed concerning whether and how investment incentives
should be disciplined (as noted above, the result is that incentives are simply not dealt with
in the 24 April draft). At the same time, however, a vigorous public debate was beginning
in OECD countries such as Canada, the United States and Australia concerning the impact of
the MAI on the democratic regulatory state in general, and on environment, labour rights,
and cultural protection more specifically. Canadian activist groups were at the forefront of
bringing the MAI negotiations into public view. In January 1997, when no public version of
the negotiating text was available, Canadian activists obtained a confidential version, and
began circulating it to like-minded groups, using the Internet as an effective dissemination
tool. In April 1997, accounts of the MAI began to appear in the popular press, and
governments were placed on the defensive to justify their negotiating positions to the public
at large.87 Some of the groups in question had unsuccessfully challenged the Canada-US FTA
and the NAFTA, often making grossly exaggerated and hypothetical claims about the
damage likely to flow from these agreements to the social welfare state. With the MAI,
their approach was shrewder and more careful. They linked a more general critique of
globalization driven by corporate interests with a highly plausible analysis of specific
provisions of the draft MAI, or omissions from it, as well as a critique of the way it was
negotiated. While many groups took different and overlapping positions, the thrust of the
overall attack is well expressed by Tony Clarke and Maude Barlow:

We do not wish to leave the impression that we reject the idea of a global investment
treaty. We are well aware that transnational investment flows have been accelerating
at a rapid pace and that there is a need to establish some global rules. But the basic
premise on which the draft versions of the MAI have been crafted is, in our view,
largely flawed and one-sided. It expands the rights and powers of transnational
corporations without imposing any corresponding obligations. Instead, the draft
treaty places obligations squarely on the shoulders of governments,… Meanwhile the
MAI says nothing about the rules that transnational corporations must follow to
respect the economic, social, cultural, and environmental rights of citizens.88

However much the rhetorical tone of this attack may reflect an unjustified conspiratorial or
even paranoid view of transnational corporations, its substance could be defended on the
basis of concrete features of the negotiating texts (especially the earlier versions). While, as
discussed in an earlier part of this chapter, the OECD had promulgated voluntary guidelines
for the conduct of multinational enterprises, the MAI allowed such enterprises to sue
governments, but not to be sued in kind based upon the breach of behavioural norms
contained in the Guidelines. The secrecy surrounding the negotiations and the usual cloak
and dagger behaviour by foreign ministries when faced by early enquiries about the course of
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the negotiations, gave prima-facie credence to a conspiratorial view of the whole
undertaking. The fact, noted above, that the draft MAI did not contain an environmental or
health and safety exception even comparable to that existing in the 1947 GATT lent
credibility to the notion that only the interests of capital were reflected in the Agreement.
With respect to the provisions on investor protection, a powerful legal case could be made
that the definition of expropriation might extend to regulatory changes that affected the
value of an investor’s assets, thereby holding legitimate regulatory activity of national
governments hostage to huge compensation payments to foreign investors.89 The fact,
noted above, that just such a claim had been made in the Ethyl case with respect to
environmental regulations under a comparable provision of the Investment Chapter of
NAFTA, lent an air of reality to this legal interpretation. The secrecy of investor-state dispute
settlement (partly addressed, as noted above, in the very latest draft), combined with the
secrecy of the process itself and the failure to provide any democratic control on corporate
activity to make the case that there was a serious democratic deficit.

In the wake of this public controversy, a number of governments responded by indicating
that their final approval of any MAI text would be conditional on the Agreement addressing
concerns of this nature. In a valiant effort to preserve or regain momentum in the
negotiations, the Chair of the negotiating group succeeded in putting together a package of
proposed amendments on labour and environment, which has been annexed to the 24 April
draft.90 It is claimed that a ‘large majority’ of the negotiating Parties ‘expressed support for
the overall approach and believed that it could be a basis for future work’ (footnote 1).
Among the proposals is a provision that states: ‘A Contracting Party may adopt, maintain or
enforce any measure that it considers appropriate to ensure that investment activity is
undertaken in a manner sensitive to health, safety or environmental concerns, provided
such measures are consistent with this agreement’ (Para. 3). This is a highly unsatisfactory
provision, since the main issue is in fact that of exempting measures that would otherwise be
inconsistent with the Agreement—it is useless to state that Parties may take environmental
measures consistent with the Agreement, since any measure consistent with the Agreement
is in any case ipso facto permissible. A similar proposal with respect to labour rights or
standards suffers from the same fundamental defect. With respect to expropriation, the
language is slightly more satisfactory, stating that the MAI does not establish ‘a new
requirement that Parties pay compensation for losses which an investor or investment may
incur through regulation, revenue-raising and normal activity in the public interest
undertaken by governments’ (para. 5). Even here, however, the qualification ‘new’ creates
a difficulty—it refers to the existing international law baseline concerning expropriation,
which is far from clear, and therefore does not shut the door to arguments that existing
international law requires compensation for ‘regulatory takings’.

While activist groups have recently been given credit or blamed (depending on the
perspective of the observer) for ‘killing’ the MAI, informed sources close to the
negotiations had been predicting failure long before a public debate on the draft MAI was
provoked. As noted, the initiative to proceed with evolving investment rules in the OECD
was based on the premise (often unstated) that developing countries had been the main
obstacle to the achievement of a comprehensive TRIMs agreement in the Uruguay Round,
and that without them consensus would be much easier to reach. In fact, before public
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controversy became intense, differences of views among OECD countries about culture and
labour rights were already surfacing. As well, concern about the Helms-Burton legislation,
led to a number of proposals concerning extraterritoriality and conflicting requirements,
which would have surely met with total rejection by the United States. Further, the
removal of investment incentives from the coverage of the Agreement represented a major
disappointment for some negotiating Parties. The MAI negotiations are, in fact, an
illustration of the fallacy that agreement is likely to be easier when negotiations are limited
to a smaller group of countries, with supposedly more comparable economic systems,
discussed in Chapter 5 of this book.

Of course part of the MAI strategy—an essential part—was that developing countries
would be invited to accede to the MAI, and that those who were seeking to attract FDI would
find themselves unable to afford not to. However, the rapid growth in FDI, including and
especially inflows to developing countries, cited earlier in this chapter shows that investor
confidence is not dependent upon adhesion to this kind of agreement. Moreover, the notion
of simply signing up these countries betrays a naïve view of the accession process, as is well
illustrated by attempts to ‘extend’ NAFTA to other countries in Central and Latin America.
In any Agreement such as the MAI, any accession is likely to involve country-specific
reservations, that will potentially change the balance of concessions in the overall
agreement. Also, the proposed accession of a country to this kind of agreement is unlikely
to take place without affected economic and other interests raising issues about the
commercial policy as well as environmental and labour rights performance of the country in
question.

Another major difficulty with the MAI as a self-standing treaty, noted even by some of
the more insightful and cautious supporters of global investment rules, such as Pierre Sauve
and Ed Graham, is the relationship of such a Treaty to overlapping existing multilateral
rules as reflected in the GATT, and the WTO TRIMs, Services, and Intellectual Property
Agreements. This raises serious issues concerning the respective jurisdiction of MAI and
WTO (and perhaps NAFTA) dispute-settlement bodies, in addition to substantive and
temporal issues with respect to the applicability of provisions of the various Agreements and
their interaction. Effort is made in the draft MAI text to be sensitive to these problems, but
they are far from being resolved. In fact, at the outset an MAI separate from multilateral
rules would create considerable uncertainty.

Against the drawbacks of the MAI, supporting governments have had few decisive
arguments to make on the positive side. First of all, in an environment where, as already
noted, FDI is growing at a rapid pace (much more rapidly than average global economic
growth generally) the idea that the gains from FDI crucially depend on a new agreement
would seem hard to sustain. Second, since most of the OECD countries already conform in
large measure to the main disciplines of the MAI (and since in sensitive areas they will
continue to reserve many measures) the specific market-opening benefits of the Agreement,
absent developing countries accession, are quite limited. Those developing countries likely
to accede have already signifi-cantly liberalized their investment regimes, at least to the
extent necessary to attract investment and/or satisfy the demands of the IMF and World
Bank.
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CONCLUSION

In light of all these considerations, in our view, it makes sense to place the evolution of
investment rules squarely in the WTO forum, as an issue for the next negotiating ‘round’.
The MAI text can be simply regarded as useful preliminary work for a genuinely multilateral
negotiation—here, as noted in Chapters 10 and 11 on these subjects in this book,
agriculture and services are precedents to bear in mind; in both cases much preliminary
conceptual and technical work was done at the OECD, which then was channelled into the
Uruguay Round negotiations. We think that the starting point for such negotiations might
be agreement on the following:

1 The basic architecture of an investment agreement must include MFN, National
Treatment, and Transparency obligations (the MAI process produced a broad
consensus on this), subject to appropriate exceptions and limitations to protect
legitimate regulatory interests, including labour and the environment.

2 Disciplines on incentives as well as performance requirements should be subject to
negotiation, but the aim should be a balanced set of constraints, that reflects legitimate
arguments that some kinds of measures may be appropriate for the situations of some
countries, including measures to promote technology transfer.

3 As among the OECD countries, those provisions of the draft MAI text that have now
attracted consensus should be applied as ‘soft law’, the equivalent of a non-binding
code (as Daniel Schwanen of Canada’s C.D. Howe Institute has recently suggested).

4 In any future agreement, if private investors are to have the benefit of dispute
settlement through binding arbitration, they should have to agree to abide by the
investor conduct rules of the OECD Guidelines on Multinational Enterprises or some
other instrument of this character; this reflects the principle of reciprocal rights and
responsibilities for transnational corporations of so much concern to critics of the
MAI. On the other hand, a corporation would remain free not to accept these
responsibilities, as long as it did not wish a direct right of action, and was willing to
rely on traditional state-to-state dispute settlement to protect its interests under a
WTO investment agreement.

It is inevitable that differences between nations will remain about the balance between
values of economic efficiency, and competing or sometimes competing, considerations in
some sensitive sectors, like cultural industries. A policy dialogue should begin now, before
any negotiations, on the alternatives to investment restrictions that are available to
governments to vindicate these considerations, and the relative desirability of various policy
instruments. In the end, some countries may still consider it necessary to reserve investment
measures in this area, but a sense that there are often better ways of achieving these
legitimate public goals could better inform debate on these issues in many countries. 
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14
Trade and developing countries

INTRODUCTION

Developing countries1 currently account for about a quarter of world exports, and about
the same percentage of world imports.2 Although some developing countries were included
within GATT from the outset,3 they had a marginal influence on the original Bretton
Woods negotiations.4 By the 1960s, developing countries had come to predominate
numerically in the GATT, and during the 1960s and 1970s their share of world trade, and
particularly of exports grew rapidly, although in this respect the performance of some
developing countries was vastly superior to that of others,5 Indeed, there is substantial
heterogeneity amongst developing countries including differences in size, levels of
development, levels of indebtedness, composition of trade, degree of concentration of
trading relationships, etc.6 Throughout this period, developing countries complained that
their influence on the design and functioning of the GATT rules remained marginal, and
increasingly pressed demands for more preferential treatment within GATT, as well as
attempting to evolve other fora for the creation of rules on trade (particularly, UNCTAD—
the United Nations Conference on Trade and Development) where they could wield
greater influence.

While some developing countries continued through the 1970s to experience
considerable growth, particularly those with more open or outward-oriented trade policies,
the strategy that was adopted by most LDCs and that predominated in the development
literature at the time—import substitution and protection of infant industries—yielded
disappointing results.7 The conclusion most often drawn was that the rules of the game of
international trade and finance were so heavily skewed to the disadvantage of the LDCs that
a radically new strategy was necessary, based upon a fundamental redistribution of wealth
and opportunities between North and South. Developed in UN fora such as UNCTAD, the
strategy was termed the New International Economic Order (NIEO).8 While the NIEO
remained at the level of ideology or at most the ‘soft law’ of UN resolutions, the developed
countries did, at a practical level, respond to these pressures by granting further tariff
preferences to developing countries on a non-reciprocal but also a non-binding basis (the
Generalized System of Preferences). At the same time the availability of recycled petrodollars
promised to give the strategy of protected, state-assisted rapid industrialization a new lease
on life. 



The further failure of this strategy, combined with the second oil shock and recession in
the developed world (which produced high interest rates and low demand for developing
country exports), led to the debt crisis of the early 1980s. The rescheduling of loans to
developing countries was premised upon the undertaking of domestic reforms, including
price liberalization, movement towards convertible currency, and unilateral trade
liberalization. Thus, many developing countries moved towards an outward-oriented,
export-driven approach to development and growth.9 While these policy shifts can be in
part understood as imposed from the outside through institutions like the IMF as a price for
cooperation by the North in solving the debt crisis, they also reflect increasing recognition
of the extraordinary success enjoyed by the Asian NICs (newly industrializing countries)
through an export-oriented, as opposed to import-substitution-based, strategy for growth.
They also may reflect, or at least be reinforced by, the intellectual and political decline of
Marxism, which in its Leninist/centralist and neo-Marxist variants was an important
ideological source of resistance to economic liberalism.10

The treatment of developing countries in the GATT that emerged during the first few
decades after the General Agreement came into force reflects what Bela Balassa has aptly
termed a ‘Faustian bargain’ between the North and the South.'' On the one hand,
developing countries were granted significant exemptions from GATT disciplines, so as to
allow them considerable scope to adopt import-substi-tution, infant-industry-protection
strategies of development. Eventually, as well, developing countries were granted
preferential tariff concessions or complete removal of tariffs on a non-binding basis, with
respect particularly to raw materials. On the other hand, with respect to exports that could
immediately figure in an export-led growth strategy, such as textiles, light manufactures,
and processed agricultural products, developed countries maintained extremely high trade
barriers, including high tariff rates, and also in the case of textiles, quantitative restrictions
under a special GATT-exempt arrangement that came to be known as the Multi-Fibre
Arrangement. Thus, although it is fashionable to blame leftist theories of development
economics and the influence of Soviet bloc central planning approaches for the protectionist
follies of the developing world in this epoch, the treatment of developing countries in the
Western-dominated global trading order made inward-oriented policies easy, while it set up
obstacles to export-led growth.

We now proceed to examine in some detail the nature of this treatment.

THE LEGAL AND INSTITUTIONAL FRAMEWORK FOR
DEVELOPING COUNTRY TRADE

The pre-Uruguay Round GATT

Article I

Article I, which establishes the MFN (Most Favoured Nation) principle, nevertheless allows
for the continuation of preferential tariff rates—i.e. tariffs below the bound MFN rate
negotiated within the framework of the GATT—between coun-tries that shared a common
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sovereignty before the Second World War, and also between countries that formed part of
the Ottoman Empire until the settlement at Versailles that ended the First World War.
Under the first category, preferences given by (ex-colonial) powers such as Britain, France,
and Spain to their former colonies are permitted, and this would have included a substantial
part of trade between developed and developing countries at the time the GATT was
created. The margin of preference, however, cannot exceed that which existed between the
MFN rates and the preferential rates in question at the time of entry into force of the GATT
(1947). Thus, further preferential treatment has required an explicit GATT waiver from
the MFN obligations of Article I.

Quantitative restrictions (Articles Xl, XII, XIII, XVIII)

As discussed in earlier chapters, Article XI of the General Agreement contains a general
prohibition on quantitative restrictions on imports and exports, subject to a range of
exceptions. The balance of payments exceptions defined in Articles XII and XIII were not
especially aimed at the needs of developing countries—at the beginning of the post-war era,
very few of the developed countries possessed stable, or even convertible currencies.12

Nevertheless, Article XII does contemplate that a Contracting Party may assert an exception
to Article XI on balance of payments grounds, where its balance of payments difficulties are
due to ‘domestic policies directed towards the achievement and maintenance of full and
productive employment or towards the development of economic resources’ (XII: 3(d)).
This has the effect of immunizing a developing country from the claim that, since its balance
of payments crisis is induced or prolonged by its own illiberal or distortive domestic
policies, the appropriate solution is to change those policies rather than to increase trade
protection.

Article XVIII, in the form that emerged after the 1954–5 review of the General
Agreement, contains much more explicit recognition for development-based exceptions
from GATT strictures. Article XVIII begins with a lengthy preamble that states the
agreement of the Contracting Parties that developing countries13

should enjoy additional facilities to enable them (a) to maintain sufficient flexibility in
their tariff structure to be able to grant the tariff protection required for the
establishment of a particular industry and (b) to apply quantitative restrictions for
balance of payments purposes which take full account of the continued high level of
demand for imports likely to be generated by their programmes of economic
development’ (XVIII:2).

This statement is notable for its incorporation within the terms of the GATT itself of the
infant industry protection view of economic development—the notion that the goal of
‘establishment of a particular industry’ is an appropriate rationale for protection where
pursued by a developing country.

The preamble to Article XVIII is followed by Sections A, B and C, which set out the
specifics of the ‘additional facilities’ to be granted to developing countries. Section A
provides that a developing country may, where it wishes ‘to promote the establishment of a
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particular industry’, reopen negotiations on bound tariffs with any Contracting Party ‘with
which such concession was initially negotiated’ (A 7(a)). It is foreseen that the developing
country would offer compensation for the withdrawal or modification of a concession,
perhaps in the form of a reduction of tariffs on other products. If, despite an offer of
adequate compensation, the developed Contracting Party or Parties in question refuse(s) to
allow the concession to be withdrawn or modified, the developing country can apply to the
GATT Council for the right to proceed unilaterally. Section B reiterates but also expands the
balance of payments exceptions to Article XI strictures already contained in Article XII. For
instance, developing countries may impose quantitative restrictions for balance of payments
purposes on a discriminatory basis, i.e. ‘in such a way as to give priority to the importation
of those products which are more essential in the light of its policy of economic
development’ (XVIII(B):10).

Section C applies where a developing country ‘finds that governmental assistance is
required to promote the establishment of a particular industry with a view to raising the
standard of living of its people’ (XVIII(C):13). If the developing country is experiencing
difficulties in the achievement of this goal, it may notify the GATT Council of the
difficulties and any GATT-inconsistent measure with respect to imports that may be
indicated. Upon notification, the GATT Council may, within 30 days, either request
consultations with the developing country in question, or allow it to proceed with measures
that would otherwise be in contravention of provisions of the General Agreement. There
are two limits on this relief from GATT strictures: first, where the measures in question
affect products for which there are already tariff bindings, the developing country must first
consult with, and seek the consent of, the Contracting Party with whom the initial
concession was negotiated; second, no deviation from Articles I, II and XIII of the General
Agreement is permitted under Section C. Hence, whatever import-restricting measures are
adopted pursuant to Section C must be implemented on a non-discriminatory basis.

In practice, as is described in detail by Hudec,14 Article XVIII provided a basis for the
granting of sweeping exemptions from GATT strictures to many developing countries,
usually with a view to import substitution and protection of infant industries. The GATT
Council routinely accepted such deviations from the general provisions of the GATT, and
without insisting on the consultation requirements and other formal criteria embodied in
Article XVIII. The explanation for this laxity is to be found less in development theory than
in the fact that developed countries simply did not feel threatened by infant industries in
developing countries. These industries posed little threat to developed country dominance
in the sectors concerned, both in home markets and third-country markets. In more recent
years, there has been increased pressure for scrutiny of developing country trade practices,
in part because a number of the larger and relatively more prosperous developing countries
have come to be seen as significant potential markets for developed country exports,
whether goods, services, or technology. This has been reflected to a large extent in US
pressure to include disciplines on services and intellectual property in the Uruguay Round
(the implications for developing countries are discussed below) but also in demands that
developing countries’ Article XVIII exemptions be re-examined and eliminated wherever
not justified, or no longer justified, by the wording of the GATT.15
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Part IV

Part IV of the General Agreement, entitled ‘Trade and Development’, was added in 1965,
in response to the increasingly insistent demands of developing countries as they emerged
through UNCTAD, which had been formally established in 1964.16 Unlike Article XVIII,
which had as its focus the relaxation of GATT strictures to enable developing countries to
pursue inward-looking growth policies based on protection and promotion of infant
industries, Part IV concerns the access of developing countries to developed country
markets, and therefore appears to at least implicitly endorse the theory of export-led
growth. Hence, the preambular section of Part IV states (in part): ‘the export earnings of
the less-developed contracting parties can play a vital part in their economic development’
(Part IV: Article XXXVI:1(b)).

Nevertheless, the persistence of the inward-looking approach is reflected in the
statement that ‘the developed contracting parties do not expect reciprocity for
commitments made by them in trade negotiations to reduce or remove tariffs and other
barriers to the trade of less-developed countries’ (Part IV: Article XXXVI:8). This principle
of non-reciprocity, along with special dispensations for import substitution policies, are
often referred to as ‘special and differential status’ for developing countries. The clear
implication is that export-led growth is consistent with, and indeed should go hand in hand
with, protection of developing countries’ domestic markets—a mercantilist view in
profound tension with the neo-classical perspective that protectionism which distorts
domestic price mechanisms and insu-lates industries from international competition is likely
to frustrate the development of viable export industries.17

A pervasive characteristic of the substantive provisions of Part IV is that they lack the
clearly binding or obligatory character of most provisions of the General Agreement. Thus
the developed countries ‘shall to the fullest extent possible—that is, except when
compelling reasons, which may include legal reasons, make it impossible—give effect’ to
commitments to reduce and eliminate trade barriers with respect to ‘products currently or
potentially of particular export interest to less-developed countries’ (Part IV: Article
XXXVII:1(a)). In other instances, developed countries are ‘to make every effort’ to, inter
alia, ‘give active consideration to the adoption of other measures designed to provide
greater scope for the development of imports from less-developed countries’ (Part IV:
Article XXXVII:3(b)). The only remedy specified in Part IV where developed countries are
not living up to these loosely-worded commitments is the possibility of a developing
country requesting consultations either with individual developed countries or in the GATT
Council (Part IV: Article XXXVII:2). 

Other GATT provisions

The Tokyo Round Codes

Serious tensions arose between developed and developing countries in the GATT due to the
refusal of the United States to grant the benefit of the Tokyo Round GATT Subsidies and
Antidumping Codes to countries that had not signed the Codes, which included most

TRADE AND DEVELOPING COUNTRIES 357



developing countries. In the 1960s, India had obtained a legal ruling from the GATT
Secretariat that MFN obligations applied to the Kennedy Round Antidumping Code,
thereby obliging the United States to provide the benefits of the Code to non-signatories.18

In the Tokyo Round, the United States pressed for an explicit conditional MFN approach to
the revised Antidumping Code and the new Subsidies Code. The resultant Codes, on their
face, required that benefits only be extended to signatories. However, the Codes did
provide some special treatment for developing countries. In the case of the Antidumping
Code this only amounted to a general provision (Article 13) requiring Parties to explore
‘possibilities of constructive remedies provided for by this Code [i.e. price undertakings]’
before ‘applying antidumping duties where they would affect the essential interests of
developing countries’. This supposed special consideration for developing countries has not
been translated into concrete provisions in the domestic trade remedy law of major developed
nations. In the case of the Subsidies Code, developing countries were exempted from the
general ban on export subsidies, provided that these subsidies are not ‘used in a manner
which causes serious prejudice to the trade or production of another signatory’ (Part III:
Article 14(2)(3)). It was, however, an open legal question whether this exemption only
applied to the export subsidies provisions of the Code (Article 9) itself, or whether it
extended by implication to the restrictions on export subsidies in Article XVI of the
General Agreement. The latter view seems to be more plausible, since the entire Subsidies
Code could be seen as an elaboration and detailed application of the subsidies provisions of
the General Agreement.

In addition, the Code stated that with respect to my subsidy granted by a developing
country signatory (i.e. either export or domestic) no action may be taken under the dispute
resolution provisions of the Code, unless the subsidy had nullified or impaired a tariff
concession ‘or other obligations under the General Agreement’ (Article 14(7)).
Nullification and impairment was defined narrowly as displacement of imports into the
subsidizing country or ‘injury to domestic industry in the importing market of a signatory’.
However, this provision was of little practical significance, since it only applied to subsidies
actions under the multilateral dispute resolution process provided for in the Code, and did
not constrain the unilateral application of countervailing duties.

Dispute settlement

The dispute settlement procedures of the GATT have rarely been invoked either by or
against developing countries. From 1947 to 1986 only 12.5% of GATT complaints were
initiated by LDCs and LDCs were respondents in only 15% of the cases.19 One reason for
this state of affairs may be the consequences (perceived or real) of power imbalances
between developed and developing countries. The GATT enforcement mechanism is
ultimately based on retaliation as the sanction of last resort—a sanction that most
developing countries would be hard-put to apply to developed countries. Since few
developing countries represent, individually, major export markets for developed
countries, withdrawal of concessions would not normally be a very powerful sanction. On
the other hand, where developed countries wish to induce developing countries to comply
with trade rules, they possess very effective leverage, including development aid and GSP
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preferences. In addition, because of the power imbalance, unilateral measures can often be
applied to developing countries with relative impunity. Significantly, as developing
countries acquire greater political and economic power and influence they do tend
increasingly to be taken to the GATT; hence, in the last few years NICs such as Korea and
Chile have been the subject of GATT complaints.20

The Generalized System of Preferences and the Lomé
Convention

Despite the absence of self-contained and self-activating ‘hard’ legal obligations in Part IV,
it set the scene for the granting of non-reciprocal trade preferences to developing countries
through mechanisms outside the GATT. The two main mechanisms are the Generalized
System of Preferences and the Lomé Convention. The GSP was initiated under the auspices
of UNCTAD in 1968. The intent was to build on existing colonial preferences which (as
discussed above) had been grandfathered in the GATT MFN requirement—no longer
would only the ex-colonial powers grant such preferences and the ex-colonies be their only
recipients (hence the expression ‘generalized’). Each developed country would be free to
grant or not grant such preferences as it chose. And the preferences are not ‘bound’ in the
GATT—therefore they may be removed or modified at any time. A ‘waiver’ - pursuant to
Article XXV of the GATT—was granted in 1971 to permit the derogation from Article 1
MFN obligations that would be needed to introduce new preferences. However, the GATT
waiver did require that each Contracting Party’s GSP programme benefit developing
countries generally—a potential constraint on open-ended discrimination between
developing countries and the use of the GSP to strike bilateral side-deals with particular
developing countries.21

In the case of the European Union, preferences have been embodied in the Lomé
Convention which first came into force in 1975, and has been renewed and revised several
times since.22 While containing non-reciprocal tariff preferences, these agreements also
deal with a wide-ranging agenda for commercial cooperation between the EU and some 65
developing countries (almost all of them ex-colonies of Britain or France).23 Since the
preferences contained therein do not benefit all developing countries, it might be argued
that in principle they do not conform with the terms of the GATT waiver. However, it has
been suggested that the Lomé system could be viewed as a free trade area or customs union,
and therefore consistent with the GATT even absent a waiver, provided that it conforms to
the provisions of Article XXIV:5.

A recent WTO Appellate Body decision ‘dealt a severe blow to the European Union’s
system for regulating the import of bananas in a way that restricts access for Latin American
bananas in favour of fruit from its Member States’ former colonies’.24 The complaint,
initiated by a coalition of Latin American countries and the United States, alleged that the
EU’s regime for the import, sale and distribution of bananas was inconsistent with a number
of GATT provisions, as well as the Import Licensing Agreement, the Agreement on
Agriculture, the TRIMs Agreement and the GATS.25 In May 1997 the panel ruled in favour
of the coalition, finding aspects of the EU regime inconsistent with the GATT. The EU
subsequently appealed the decision. The Appellate Body largely upheld the findings of the
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panel, but tightened ‘the original ruling in…ways that strengthened the hand of the
opponents of the EU regime.’26 The Appellate Body found that the Lomé waiver did not
allow the EU to derogate from its obligations of nondiscrimination in the administration of
quantitative restrictions under Article XIII or to expand historical deviations from Article I
(MFN) obligations. Thus, in the case of bananas at least, the Lomé waiver had limited
protective effect on the EU’s preferential trading arrangements.

In contrast to the European Union, the United States and other developed countries such
as Canada and Australia have embodied trade preferences for developing countries in
domestic customs legislation rather than in agreements with the developing countries
themselves. Given the importance of the United States as a market for developing country
exports, the American GSP system has loomed large in debates about the desirability of the
GSP approach to promoting export-led growth in developing countries. The United States
initially opposed the granting of preferences to developing countries, but finally established
its own GSP system in the mid-1970s.27

The present version of this system is found in the Trade Act of 1974, as amended in
1984. The Act contains a number of provisions that open the door to discrimination
between different developing countries, and to use of the threat of withdrawing GSP status
as a political and economic weapon. For instance, the Act gives the US President authority
to waive GSP status if the country in question fails to provide ‘reasonable access to its
markets and to its commodities’ and if it does not afford ‘adequate and effective protection
of intellectual property rights’.28 In addition, the Act provides for ‘graduation’ of
developing countries from GSP status once they reach a certain level of per capita GDP ($US8,
500 in 1984, indexed to a formula based on half the annual US growth rate).29 This
threshold is relatively high, but some of the most prosperous NICs are now beginning to
pass it.30 As well, detailed rules exist for removal of preferences on particular products,
even where a country does not meet the threshold for complete graduation. A preference will
be removed when a developing country has become a major world exporter of a product—
arguably a highly perverse approach that punishes the most successful LDC exporters (i.e.
those who are most competitive in developed country markets).31 This partial graduation
has occurred with respect to particular exports of more than a dozen LDCs. 

Aside from the issue of graduation, and the obvious drawbacks of trade preferences that
are non-binding and that can be used as political and commercial leverage by developed
countries, there is a more general question to be raised about whether, in fact, the kinds of
preferences actually granted have done much to assist export growth in the developing
world. As Balassa suggests, the GSP itself excludes ‘product groups of principal interest to
developing countries such as steel, textiles,32 clothing, and shoes’.33 In addition, trade
remedy laws (countervail and antidumping) have frequently been used against developing
countries, thereby clawing back much (and in some cases, all) of the benefits provided by
tariff preferences—in recent years, for instance, the number of antidumping cases initiated
by the United States and the European Union against developing countries has often
equalled or even exceeded the number of cases against developed country exporters.34

Furthermore, preferences do not appear to have responded adequately to developing
countries’ concerns about ‘tariff escalation’. Tariff escalation denotes the tendency for
developed countries to impose very low tariffs on imports of raw materials and much higher
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tariff rates on processed or finished products that are made from those raw materials. This
practice makes it very easy for developing countries to export raw materials in an
unprocessed state and much more difficult to export products that have a significant value-
added component. The escalation effect occurs because while developed country producers
of the processed or finished products have access to raw materials at almost the same price
as developing country producers (due to the low tariffs on the raw materials), they also have
a protected market against the developing country producers by virtue of the significant
tariff imposed on the processed or finished products in question. The end result is to
discourage export-driven strategies of moving up the value chain from the extraction of raw
materials to increasingly sophisticated processing industries. Balassa found that, even on the
basis of GSP and Lomé preferences, effective protection afforded against higher value-added
products from developing countries due to tariff escalation ranged from three to almost
nine times the applicable nominal tariffs.35

More generally, as MFN tariff rates have fallen in successive rounds of GATT negotiations
the value of the GSP to developing countries has inevitably eroded. As well, GSP
arrangements have often contained ‘safeguard’ provisions, allowing re-imposition of higher
tariffs or other import restrictions where a surge of developing country imports threatens
developed-country domestic producers.

The Multi-Fibre Arrangement (MFA)

The MFA is an agreement between nine importing developed country signatories (including
the EU) and 31 exporting developing countries. It provides a framework for Voluntary
Export Restraints (VERs), primarily quotas, limiting developing country exports of textiles
and clothing to the nine developed country signatories. The MFA was formally established
in 1974. It superseded two earlier agreements, the Short- and Long-term Arrangements,
that applied to a far narrower range of developing country exports.36 

The Short-term Arrangement on cotton textiles was in force from 1961 to 1962, and had
been negotiated at the initiative of the Kennedy Administration. It was replaced in 1962
with the Long-term Arrangement Regarding International Trade in Cotton Textiles. It is
important to note that these Arrangements did not initiate restrictive trade practices with
respect to these sectors, which had existed since the end of the Second World War,
particularly in the Western European countries.37 Indeed, at the beginning these
Arrangements held the promise of an orderly codification of restrictions with a view to
their eventual phase-out, as developed country producers adjusted to new competitive
realities through technological innovation and gradual labour shedding.38

In the 1970s, however, competitive pressure from the NICs in particular became much
more intense than had previously been experienced, and the MFA became a convenient
vehicle to respond to these pressures through further restricting trade in these sectors with
the use of special safeguards, VERs and quotas.39 In addition, the incorporation of
protectionism in a formal interstate agreement disguised to some extent the GATT-
inconsistency of most of the measures in question, which were discriminatory quantitative
restrictions, in violation of both Articles I and XI of the General Agreement. Jackson goes
so far as to suggest that ‘the countries who have accepted the textile or multifibre
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arrangements have arguably partially “waived” their GATT rights’.40 In our view, this claim
is highly suspect, because (as Jackson himself acknowledges) developing countries have
accepted these arrangements only under the threat of even more restrictive GATT-
inconsistent measures.

It is sometimes argued that developing countries are nevertheless protected by the MFA
because the right to impose import restrictions is limited to cases where ‘real risks of market
disruption’ exist in the import-restricting country (Article 4), and also because the MFA
provides for gradual expansion of quotas, as well as exemptions for new entrants in the
market and small suppliers. However, as Dao remarks, despite the existence of a
monitoring mechanism (the Textiles Surveillance Body or TSB), ‘importing countries are
reluctant to adhere to the Arrangement and often take additional restrictive measures
beyond the Arrangement’.41

The fundamental reality is that developing countries suffer very large losses from import
restrictions imposed by developed countries in these sectors. It has been estimated that if all
trade restrictions on LDC textile and clothing imports were lifted by the EU, Japan and the
United States, the gains to LDCs ‘would be no less than 50.8 per cent of total possible gains
related to all trade’.42 It has been further estimated that if all import restrictions were
removed, developing country textile exports would increase by about 50% and clothing
exports by 128.9%.43

The last extension of the MFA, which occurred in 1986, further sanctified the increasing
restrictiveness of developing country measures. Thus, coverage was extended to include
new types of fibres and developed countries gained new rights to take unilateral measures
against developing country imports. Developing countries gained very little, save a
statement that the final objective of the Parties was eventual submission of trade in textiles
to GATT strictures and some strengthening of the (in any case little used and little heeded)
TSB.44

The Uruguay Round Final Act contains an ambitious plan for sweeping reform and the
eventual phasing out of the MFA, which is described in detail in a later section of this
chapter.

UNCTAD (The United Nations Conference on Trade and
Development)

UNCTAD was founded in 1964 as a periodic conference of all UN members, with an
ongoing institutional framework (the Secretariat). The intent was to establish a forum on
trade where developing countries would find themselves less marginalized in the decision-
making process than was thought to be the case with the GATT.45 Under the stewardship of
Raoul Prebisch, an Argentinian economist, UNCTAD became a leading forum for the
elaboration of the ‘import-substitution’, protectionist view of economic development in the
Third World.

According to Krueger,46 this view of development was predicated on the fol-lowing
premises: First, developing economies production structures were heavily oriented towards
primary commodity production and many observers attributed the low living standards in
developing countries to dependence on primary commodity production and export. Second,
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if developing countries were to adopt policies of free trade, their comparative advantage
would forever lie in primary commodity production. Third, both the global income and
price elasticities of demand for primary commodities was low, so that expansion of primary
commodity production would simply depress prices (‘immiserizing growth’). Fourth, the
labour force in developing countries, predominantly engaged in agricultural activities, had a
marginal product of labour that was negligible, zero, or even negative. Thus, it was
explicitly or implicitly assumed that labour was a free good while capital was the scarce
factor of production. Fifth, capital accumulation was crucial for growth and in early stages of
development this occurs only with the importation of capital goods. Since it was expected
that the demand for capital goods imports and imports of other products used in the
production process would grow rapidly while foreign exchange earnings would not, it
appeared that growth could follow only if domestic production of import-competing goods
could expand rapidly. Sixth, there was very little response to price incentives in developing
countries, especially in the agricultural sector: peasants were traditional in their behaviour
and there were structural problems within the economy. Thus, most developing countries
chose to maintain high fixed nominal exchange rates which reflected the perception that
there was little response to prices and that maintaining such exchange rates taxed
agricultural exports while simultaneously subsidizing capital goods imports.

At times, the developing countries appeared to be prepared to withdraw from GATT and
to utilize UNCTAD as a forum for evolving an alternative legal order for world trade.47

However, this threat never materialized, and instead UNCTAD became an instrument for
applying pressure on developed countries to liberalize trade unilaterally with developing
countries (while permitting developing countries themselves wide exemptions from GATT
strictures in order to sustain import-sub-stitution-based growth policies, such as protection
of infant industries). The main product of UNCTAD has been the non-law or at most ‘soft
law’ of UN Resolutions. In the 1970s and early 1980s, UNCTAD sought to develop a New
International Economic Order, a grandiose project aimed at a fundamental restructuring of
North-South relations. In fact, the NIEO was largely a recasting of the old demands for
unilateral developed country trade liberalization in a new ideological language—that of the
moral imperative of redistribution of wealth from developed to developing countries.48

The Global System of Trade Preferences

A much more concrete initiative of UNCTAD is the Global System of Trade Preferences
(GSTP). Unlike the GSP, this is a system of preferences negotiated between, and applicable
to, trade among developing countries themselves. It reflects UNCTAD’s enthusiasm for the
promotion of South-South trade as a response to supposed developed country domination
of the rules and terms of North-South trade. In fact, however, South—South trade
continues to account for a very small percentage of world trade (about 7%, holding
constant through much of the 1980s).49

The GSTP developed from the 1971 GATT ‘Protocol Relating to Trade Negotiations
Among Developing Countries’, which obtained an explicit Article XXV waiver to allow
preferences in contravention of the Article I MFN require-ment.50 Despite official
UNCTAD ideology that South-South preferences should reflect the relative economic
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development needs of the various developing countries, it appears that GATT-type
reciprocity or trading of concessions on the basis of mutual self-interest dominated the most
recent (1988) negotiations on GSTP preferences. The resulting agreement embodies 1,300
tariff concessions, and has been signed by 46 developing countries.51

With some exceptions, the GSTP provides for an MFN principle to apply with respect to
concessions negotiated between the signatories. It appears, however, that the legal text of
the GSTP permits the signatories, if they so desire, to confer the same preferences, or even
more preferential treatment on nan-signatories, even where this may erode the value of
concessions to signatories. This latitude was made necessary by the overlapping of the GSTP
with various South-South regional trade agreements and customs unions.52

The GSTP contains a provision that obligates signatories not to undermine concessions
negotiated in the GSTP through the application of any charge or measure restricting
commerce other than those existing prior thereto, with exceptions for countervailing and
antidumping duties, border tax adjustments, and balance of payments measures (Article
10). 

International Commodity Agreements and export earnings
stabilization

Given the prominence of concerns about deteriorating terms of trade (particularly as related
to primary commodities) in the UNCTAD view of trade and development, it is not
surprising that a major thrust of UNCTAD’s work has been in the area of commodity price
stabilization. Under the auspices of UNCTAD’s Integrated Programme for Commodities,
established in 1976, numerous International Commodity Agreements (ICAs) were struck,
including cocoa, coffee, copper, cotton, and tin, among other commodities. These
Agreements are in essence producers’ cartels. Each producer country that is a member of
the Agreement is assigned an export quota, with the global total of such quotas determined
in such a way as to sustain world prices at a level acceptable to the membership. Some of
the ICAs also provide for Stabilization Funds that purchase surplus production at times of
oversupply with a view to selling when there are shortages.

The ICAs have not been particularly successful at sustaining commodity prices at the
desired levels. The core difficulty is that which is endemic to many forms of cartelization:
the tendency of individual members to ‘cheat’ on the supply con-straints.53 As well, a cartel
can only function effectively if all or almost all the producers of the commodity in question
are members, and this has not been the case with a number of the ICAs.54

In addition to ICAs, UNCTAD has also sought to establish a system of export earnings
compensation, which would involve loans or grants to developing countries when their
export earnings decline below a certain level due to supply and price fluctuations with
respect to primary commodities. A limited facility for export earnings compensation, called
the STABEX, exists under the Lomé Convention but applies only to exports of a limited
number of agricultural commodities to the EU.

The UNCTAD scheme involved the creation of a Common Fund that would apparently
finance both the Stabilization Funds of individual ICAs (i.e. funds for purchase of buffer
stocks or surpluses) as well as export earnings compensation. However, although first
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proposed in 1976, the Common Fund has yet to become a reality. The United States has
consistently refused to participate, and a number of other developed countries (while
agreed in principle on the idea) have failed to ratify the Agreement to create the Fund.55

TRADE AND DEVELOPMENT: THEORY AND POLICY

Having reviewed the legal rules and institutions that apply to developing country trade we
now proceed to examine the evolving theoretical and policy stances with respect to the
relationship between trade and development that have influenced the evolution of these
rules and institutions over the last 40 years. 

The theory of comparative advantage and economic
development: the limits of neo-classical theory

Despite the intense interest of their eighteenth- and nineteenth-century predecessors—
particularly Smith, Hume, and Mill—in the causes of wealth and poverty among nations,
modern neo-classical trade economists have until recently not devoted a great deal of
attention to articulating a rigorous theory of the linkage between trade and economic
development.56 As discussed in Chapter 1, neoclassical theory can explain why a country
will experience welfare gains when it specializes in those products in which, given existing
factor endowments, it possesses a comparative advantage. Comparative advantage has often
taken to be revealed comparative advantage, leading to a static perspective that largely
ignores the issue of how nations actually come to acquire comparative advantage in
particular products in the first place. Today, of course, it is widely recognized that much
more goes into the determination of comparative advantage than fixed, ‘natural’ factors like
endowments of natural resources, and there is an important and expanding economic
literature on the causes of and constraints on economic growth and development.57

Quite early in the post-war period, however, the creation of comparative advantage
became a persistent concern of development theory and for a quite straightforward reason—
the existing specialization of economic activity in developing countries seemed to provide
no guarantee of generating sustained economic growth. On the basis of the example of the
developed world (and the early experience of Soviet Bloc industrialization), specialization in
large-scale manufacturing industries was viewed as the key to growth. In addition, the
existing specialization patterns of many developing countries could with justification be
viewed as the historically contingent product of colonialism—developing countries served
as ready sources of raw materials on the one hand, and as markets for the finished products
of the colonial powers, on the other. This suggested not only the artificiality of existing
comparative advantage in developing countries, but also its foundation in fundamentally
unjust power relationships.58
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Trade and development in the import-substitution theories
of the 1950s and 1960s

Although sometimes its intellectual success is blamed on the popularity of Marxist or neo-
Marxist views of political economy, import-substitution-based development theory rapidly
gained acceptance as an orthodox policy prescription for developing countries even among
the developed, ‘capitalist’ countries and among liberal policy analysts. The simple fact is that
neo-classical liberal economists did not possess an alternative theory of growth and
development, based on liberal trade, with which to launch an effective response.

Perhaps the one significant exception was Raymond Vernon’s ‘product cycle’ theory.59

Vernon’s key argument is well-summarized by Grossman and Helpman: 

Most new goods…are developed in the industrialized North and manufactured there
until their designs have been perfected and production techniques standardized. Then
the innovating firms move the locus of production to the less developed South where
wage rates and perhaps materials prices are lower. In a final stage of the product’s
life, new and superior goods may impinge upon this market share and ultimately
render it obsolete.60

Vernon’s approach did provide a plausible strategy for developing countries to acquire
comparative advantage in increasingly sophisticated manufactured products through foreign
investment-based technology transfer. However, from the developing country perspective,
the theory had a number of unattractive features. First of all, it supposed, and accepted,
that developing countries would never actually ‘catch up’ with the North, but would always
remain a stage or two behind in the product cycle. Second, it was premised upon the
acceptability of foreign ownership and investment, and was therefore susceptible to the
critique that developing countries themselves (as opposed to foreign investors and
multinational corporations) would realize few of the gains from their place in the product
cycle, and would become subject to a new kind of economic colonialism.

In any event, the predominance of the import-substitution view is reflected in the wide
range of exemptions from GATT strictures afforded to developing countries, which we
have outlined above, as well as the approaches and initiatives of UNCTAD. The many
developing countries that adopted import-substitution policies typically erected extremely
high tariff and non-tariff barriers to imports, maintained artificially high exchange rates and
stringent exchange controls, and in many cases domestic price controls (for instance, the
prices of agricultural products were often controlled in order to contain the cost of living of
industrial workers in the cities).61

Dependency theory and the beginnings of a neoclassical
response to import-substitution approaches

It quickly became apparent that import-substitution policies were producing disappointing,
or even disastrous, results in the many developing countries that had attempted them.
According to Krueger,62 once the easy opportunities for import substitution were largely
exhausted, the new candidates normally had higher capital to labour ratios than the old,
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while many of the goods were items demanded by only the few in the upper income groups
in poor countries. This meant that higher capital labour ratios required a higher rate of
saving and investment to maintain the rate of economic growth while for those industries
with fixed costs and a minimum efficient scale of production the cost disadvantages of
producing in developing countries with small domestic markets were significant. Moreover,
domestic import substituting producers were provided with monopoly positions in the
sheltered domestic market and the incentives were such that few producers found it
worthwhile to enter markets, particularly export markets, in which they were likely to face
competition. Moreover, periodic balance of payments crises arose in reaction to over-
valued exchange rates, increased indebtedness, and the failure of export earnings to grow,
leading to stop-go policy cycles.

These policy failures yielded two diametrically opposed responses in development
theory. Many of those who advocated import-substitution approaches turned to dependency
theory to explain the continued failure to generate adequate economic growth in developing
countries. According to dependency theory, these countries remained economically and
socially backward due to complicity between the local power élites and the forces of
developed-country capitalism. Early efforts at industrialization could easily be exploited by
multinational corporations, who with the support of corrupt and avaricious local élites—
would build branch plant facilities in developing countries, but without contributing to
development through significant technology transfer or training of local workforces.63 The
policy implications were a general continuation of import-substitution policies but with a
new emphasis on control of the multinational corporation, support for democratization
movements, and guarantees that developed countries would not interfere with the
sovereignty of developing nations.64

While many of those who had from the beginning supported import-substitution
approaches resorted to dependency theory to explain the early failure of these approaches,
neo-classical trade economists began to reflect on the interesting fact that those few
developing countries, mainly in East Asia, that had eschewed import-substitution for
outward-oriented strategies were experiencing high levels of economic growth.65

According to Balassa, the share of Korea, Singapore and Taiwan in total LDC manufactured
exports increased from 6% in 1963 to 42% in 1984. Over the same period, per capita real
incomes quadrupled in these three countries, while they increased at a much slower pace in
inward-oriented LDCs such as India, Argentina, and Mexico.66

In reflecting on the empirical evidence of export-led growth, some neo-classical
economists began to sketch a liberal alternative to import-substitution-oriented
development theory. The flavour of this alternative is captured by the following passage
from an essay by Bela Belassa, one of the leading exponents of liberal development theory:

At the early stages of development, countries will generally benefit from specializing
in natural resource products. In the process of industrialization, it will be
advantageous to concentrate first on products utilizing mainly unskilled labour, with
subsequent upgrading in the product composition of exports as the country
accumulates physical and human capital.67
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The theory thus emphasizes how developing countries can move up the ‘value chain’ beginning
from a pre-existing comparative advantage in the least value-added exports (unprocessed
raw materials). It thereby directly counters the claims of the import-substitution-oriented
theorists that absent the creation of protected industries by the state, developing countries
will be fated to remain ‘hewers of wood and drawers of water’ under constantly
deteriorating terms of trade.

A further focus of the liberal theory is the negative consequence for economic growth of
‘the chaotic nature of differential incentives among diverse activities in IS (import
substitution) regimes’.68 The effect of this chaos is largely to destroy the market signals that
would normally lead to efficient resource allocation. In addition, the pervasive government
‘rigging’ of economic activity diverts considerable resources to ‘directly unproductive
profit-seeking activities’, i.e. rent seeking, bribery of government officials, corruption,
etc.69 Finally, a liberal import policy can provide a substitute for domestic rivals which may
be few or non-existent in many developing countries, thereby inducing competitive
pressures to increase productivity.70

The direct policy implications of the liberal theory of trade and development are the
liberalization of both developed and developing country trade policies. Liberalization of the
former gives developing countries new opportunities to achieve growth through export
expansion, allowing these countries to move their exports up the ‘value chain’. And
liberalization of developing country trade policies bring the gains from more efficient
resource allocation that we have just described, with a corresponding increase in the
competitiveness of developing country products on world markets.

However attractive to proponents of liberal trade (such as ourselves), the theory and
evidence of export-led growth still leave much to be explained and debated concerning the
relationship between trade liberalization and development. It has been pointed out that
those developing countries characterized by significant export-led growth did not simply
replace import-restrictive policies with a laissez-faire approach. While reducing tariffs and
other barriers to trade and reforming exchange rate regimes, these countries also initiated
or activated a wide range of alternative government policies aimed at encouraging exports,
including significant subsidies and loans to export-oriented industries.71 A study by the
World Bank of growth in East Asian economies concluded that while targeted industrial
policies (e.g. subsidies to specific firms) made little positive contribution to the so-called
Asian economic miracle, more generally available export subsidies and other export
incentives had a modest but significant impact on the extraordinary economic success of
these countries.72 Moreover, the economic difficulties that are currently being experienced
by a number of the East Asian economies suggest that a number of firms may have over-
expanded capacity through access to cheap debt capital provided in part by domestic
financial institutions subject to weak capital market disciplines and excessive political
interference in capital allocation decisions (‘crony capitalism’). Thus, even in its own
terms, there remain unresolved questions as to the sustainability of the East Asian successes.
In addition, there are further questions as to the generalizability of the East Asian
experience to other contexts, such as whether the dynamic Asian economies display certain
‘exceptionalist’ institutional, social, or cultural characteristics that explain in large part the
success of the export-led model of development, including: a relatively pragmatic, ‘this-
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worldly’ orientation in the mainstream culture; superior human resources (higher education
levels among the general population); high savings rates; and a bureaucracy that is
meritocratic and relatively ‘autonomous’ from patrimonial politics. 

The LDC debt crisis

The debt crisis arguably marks a crucial watershed in the evolution of approaches to LDC
economic development. Owing to the Petrodollar surplus of the 1970s, major American,
European and Japanese commercial banks found themselves with unprecedented amounts
of money to lend on world markets. The banks became increasingly interested in lending to
developing country governments. They often presumed that since a sovereign could not go
bankrupt, the very fact that the debtor was a government would provide adequate security
for the loans. For developing country governments, these loans represented an opportunity
for another attempt at import-substitution-based industrial development. The loans were
particularly attractive since they offered the capital needed for industrialization, but without
the strings attached to foreign direct investment or multinational corporate activities.
Developing country governments would have direct control of the money, and full rights to
distribute or reinvest domestically the profits from successful investments. In the event,
commercial banks lent to developing country sovereigns an average of over $US40 billion
per year between 1977 and 1982.73

By the early 1980s, a number of developing country debtors were having increasing
difficulty in paying off these loans. First of all, once again import-substitution-based
industrialization failed to yield high rates of growth. Second, the recession in the developed
world had considerably dampened demand for developing country exports, while at the
same time leading to increased protection against those exports even where demand
continued to be strong. At the same time, interest rates increased as the United States and
other Western countries adopted an anti-inflationary monetary policy. Since the developing
country loans were based on floating rates, this meant that just at a time when their foreign
currency earnings from exports were declining, developing country debtors were faced
with very substantial increases in the cost of servicing their loans.74 Finally, in 1982 Mexico
announced that it could not continue to pay its creditors according to schedule, and a
number of other LDC debtors soon followed suit.75

The initial response of the creditor nations was that of debt rescheduling. Repayment of
loans would be stretched out over a much longer period, without any debt reduction. The
debtors would be required to have the rescheduling backed by an IMF stand-by credit,
which in turn would be conditional on domestic policy reforms to provide some assurance
that the countries in question would attain the balance of payments stability required to
repay on the rescheduled terms. The reforms in question included anti-inflationary policies,
currency devaluation, and also liberalization of prices and (to some extent) foreign trade.
Not only did some of the policy conditions of rescheduling cause severe human hardship in
LDCs (for instance rapid increases in food costs due to removal of price controls) but
frequently, at the outset, the policy prescriptions were internally contradictory (for
instance, tight money policies to fight inflation alongside inflation-inducing currency
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devaluations and price liberalization), although eventually IMF officials paid greater
attention to the interaction and sequencing of the various policy reforms.

During the 1970s, even despite the disappointing results from import-
substitution policies, many of these LDCs nevertheless continued to experience strong, albeit
far from adequate, export growth, and increases in GDP. The effect of the debt crisis was to
halt this growth almost entirely, as the debtor countries’ foreign exchange earnings were
eaten up by debt servicing requirements and they were unable to make investments in
industrial production. In consequence, developing country imports from the developed
world declined significantly, further worsening the recession. This led to the fundamental
recognition by the Reagan Administration of the dependency of world economic recovery
on the renewal of growth in developing countries, and a sense of urgency to finding a
solution to the LDC debt crisis that would permit such a renewal of growth.

The Baker Plan (named after the then US Treasury Secretary, James Baker) was the first
such effort. Launched in 1985, it involved a proposal that commercial banks loan fresh
money for investment in economic renewal to a select group of LDC debtors who were
prepared to make major structural economic reforms, to be backed by structural
adjustment lending by the World Bank and the IMF.76 While it appears that some new loans
were made pursuant to this Plan, the overall level of lending by commercial banks to LDC
debtors actually declined from 1985 to 1987, and per capita income in debtor countries
continued to fall.77

While the Baker Plan did not provide for debt reduction, some LDC debtors were,
towards the end of the 1980s, beginning to have some success with debt reduction, through
repurchase of debt on the secondary market at discounted rates and also through debt/
equity swaps. The swaps were most successful in the case of countries such as Chile and
Mexico, who eventually were able to make credible commitments to provide an attractive
climate for foreign investment to be purchased with debt. At the same time, in part due to
pressure from domestic regulatory authorities, many developed country creditor banks
were increasing reserves on LDC loans, and their ability to do so lessened the sense of fear
or panic that eventual debtor default could bring down the international financial system.

It was in this context that the United States proposed the Brady Plan in 1989. It would
involve the commercial banks for the first time accepting debt reduction, but in return for a
degree of backing for repayment of the remaining debt through various kinds of securities,
with active participation in this backing by the US Treasury. After an (albeit somewhat
shaky) beginning in Mexico the Brady approach came to play an important role in debt
restructuring in the Philippines, Venezuela, Uruguay, Costa Rica and Nigeria.78 Mexico,
Chile and the Philippines in particular have recognized the potential for credible domestic
policy reforms to induce significant influxes of capital, both foreign investment and (often
more importantly) funds taken out of the country by its own nationals in order to avoid
onerous taxation.

Trade policy reform at the end of the 1980s

The lessons that have emerged from the debt crisis, along with the collapse of central
planning in the Soviet Bloc, and the general decline of Marxist-inspired development
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ideology, as well as the dramatic successes of more liberal trade policies in the Asian NICs,
have led a variety of developing countries to move towards liberalization of their trade and
related domestic policies even without the pressure of strict IMF conditionality. It has been
estimated that, since the mid-1980s some 36 LDCs have undertaken significant trade policy
reforms, and 17 of these have undertaken comprehensive reforms of distortionary policies,
including exchange rate, price and wage policies.79 Frequently, these reforms have been
supported by lending facilities from the World Bank and the IMF.

Two issues that loom large with respect to these reforms are adjustment and sequencing.
Lifting of trade restrictions can lead to the rapid decline of protected industries that would
never have existed but for government intervention and isolation from global competitive
forces. The result is often widespread labour dislocation, because of a lag before the positive
growth effects of more liberal policies are felt. Moreover, because liberalization is
unilateral, increased competition from abroad is not immediately offset by greater access
for developing country products in global markets. While they have undertaken very
substantial lending to assist in the stabilization of the balance of payments during
macroeconomic and related reforms, the international financial institutions have been very
reluctant to engage in lending to facilitate labour adjustment. Worker adjustment is
narrowly conceptualized as a distributional issue, and there is often suspicion that displaced
workers may not be the most deserving beneficiaries of assistance. A World Bank paper
suggests, for instance, that ‘workers displaced from protected industries are not among the
poorest groups in society’.80 This is arguably a short-sighted view, as unemployment among
relatively advantaged segments of the population gluts the labour market in general and
reduces consumer demand, therefore indirectly inflicting hardship on other, possibly less-
advantaged segments of the population.81 A further difficulty is that, in some developing
countries, particularly those with poor tax collection systems, tariff revenues may
constitute an important source of revenue, and removal of tariffs therefore actually reduces
the income stream which the government has at its disposal to fund labour adjustment
programmes.

A second issue is that of sequencing: should import controls be removed before
macroeconomic and other domestic reforms are already in place? There is a strong argument
that until distortions in domestic prices and wages (inputs into production) are removed,
and exchange rates become more realistic, it is unlikely that import competition will send
the appropriate signals to domestic producers. It has been found that trade policy reforms
can be effective when introduced either simultaneously with other reforms or shortly
thereafter.82

POLICY OPTIONS AND PROSPECTS FOR THE FUTURE

Unilateral trade liberalization

This option, which has just been described from the perspective of structural policy reform,
has the obvious limitation that the adjustment process is not facilitated through any
additional access to developed country markets. However, in many developing countries
the costs of distortive policies to productivity and growth may have become so high as to
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justify not delaying liberalization until reciprocal trade liberalization can take place. Balassa
suggests that in these instances developing countries should proceed with liberalization, and
that in eventual negotiations on the basis of reciprocity they can credibly demand
concessions for making liberalization that has already taken place binding and irreversible.83

This depends on the credibility of the implicit threat that such liberalization would be
reversed in the future—the fact that many of the original protectionist policies are now seen
as fundamentally pernicious to the developing countries themselves reduces the credibility
of the threat considerably.

South-South trade liberalization

Despite the increasing activity with respect to South-South trading arrangements, and the
implementation of the GSTP, South-South trade remains, as we have noted, a very small
percentage of global trade. However, in the wake of structural domestic reforms,
particularly those directed towards currency convertibility, this may change somewhat. In
the past, trade between developing countries rarely took place in convertible currency and
therefore was less attractive than trade with developed countries. Moreover a pattern is
already discernible whereby the more developed LDCs, particularly the Asian NICs,
relocate some of the production processes for their exports to lesser-developed LDCs with
lower wages and less skilled workforces.

Regional trading arrangements between developed and
developing countries

This option is most clearly reflected in the possibility of a North American Free Trade
Agreement encompassing Canada, the United States and Mexico, with future extension to
other Latin American LDCs. Unlike multilateral liberalization, liberalization through a
regional arrangement may bring with it adjustment and technical assistance from the more
developed members of the grouping. On the other hand, there is the possibility that the
developed country or countries in the grouping will exercise overwhelming power and
influence over the way in which the arrangement is implemented.

Multilateral liberalization: developing countries and the
Uruguay Round result

The Uruguay Round provides a number of attractive trade-offs for (at least some)
developing countries. On the one hand, many developing countries have been (particularly
at the outset of the negotiations) resistant to American demands that their domestic policies
with respect to regulation of service industries, foreign investment, and intellectual
property become subjects of negotiation in the GATT. On the other hand, the prospect of
substantial reduction in agricultural protection and the phasing out of a significant part of
textiles and clothing protection offers the prospect of real gains for many developing
countries. In previous chapters on trade in services, intellectual property and investment, we
have discussed in greater detail the issues that these Uruguay Round agenda items raised for
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many LDCs. However, as we note in these chapters, the Uruguay Round Final Act reflects
a number of compromises between developed country demands and the concerns of
developing countries. For instance, in the case of TRIPs, compulsory licensing of patented
inventions is permitted subject to certain conditions being met, including compen-sation to
the patent holder. This reflects a significant compromise of the American view, shared to a
large extent by the EU and Japan, that no compulsory licensing should be permitted within
the twenty-year period of required patent protection. In the case of TRIMs, the Final Act
stops short of characterizing, for instance, technology transfer requirements as violations of
trade rules, and leaves considerable scope for investment measures aimed at ensuring that
foreign enterprises further the developing goals of host countries—again, the United States
in particular, had pushed hard for a much more restrictive approach to investment
measures.

While the general provisions of the Final Act thus reflect developing country concerns in
a number of areas, the tendency has not been to grant developing countries broad
exceptions to compliance with GATT rules. In some instances, developing countries may be
given a somewhat longer period of time to phase in domestic compliance with the new
rules, but the Uruguay Round result reflects, in large measure, a rejection of the view that
developing countries should not be required to make reciprocal commitments to trade
liberalization. The following brief survey of the Final Act canvasses many of the specific
references to developing countries as well as issues such as the MFA of direct, specific
relevance to developing country trade. It is intended to be illustrative, not exhaustive.84

Manufactureds Trade Liberalization

Significant tariff reductions on manufactured imports were achieved in the Round.
Developing countries actively participated in these negotiations and bindings on imported
industrial products rose from 13 to 61%. While developed countries’ tariffs on imports
from other developed countries were reduced by an average of 40%, tariffs on imports from
developing countries were reduced by only 28%. Cuts by LDCs in protection of
mechanized trade are estimated to increase real incomes in developing countries between US
$60 and $100 billion at 1992 prices, despite cautious commitments made by many
developing countries.85

Understanding on the Balance of Payments Provisions of the
GATT

This Understanding, discussed in detail in Chapter 4, reflects concern by the United States
and some other developed countries about insufficiently rigorous application of the
conditions or criteria established in Articles XII and XVIII:B of the GATT to justify trade
measures taken for balance-of-payments reasons. This mostly concerns, in contemporary
circumstances, measures taken by developing countries. 
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Agreement on Agriculture

The Agreement allows developing countries the flexibility to implement their
commitments to reduction of protection and domestic support over a ten-year period
(Article 15; the normal implementation period for developed countries is six years). The
least-developed country Members are not required to make reduction commitments.

The existing system of agricultural support in developed countries is widely viewed as
having depressed world prices for temperate zone agricultural com-modities.86 The effects
on developing countries of the liberalization process set out in the Agreement on
Agriculture are, therefore, mixed. As Winters suggests: ‘Exporters of the temperate
products whose prices are most affected by agricultural liberalisation—for example,
Argentina and Thailand—have strong and direct interests in the dismantling of protection;
their revenues and income would increase significantly. On the other hand chronic food
importers—for example, Bangladesh—would undoubtedly suffer.’87 The fact that
developed country liberalization of trade in agriculture may harm this latter group of
countries is taken into account in the Decision on Measures Concerning the Possible
Negative Effects of the Reform Programme on Least-Developed and Net Food-Importing
Developing Countries.

The Decision commits Trade Ministers of GATT Members to review levels of food aid
provided to developing countries to ensure that they are sufficient to meet the legitimate
needs of developing countries during the reform programme (Article 3(i)); to increase the
proportion of food aid provided to developing countries as aid or on concessional terms
(Article 3(ii)); and to give ‘full consideration’ to developing country requests for technical
assistance to develop their domestic agricultural sectors (Article 3(iii)). As well, it is
accepted that difficulties in financing imports of food on commercial terms may be a basis
for assistance from international financial institutions (Article 5).

Agreement on Textiles and Clothing

Of major importance to many developing countries will be the gradual liberalization of
protection pursuant to the MFA, as provided for in the Uruguay Round Agreement on
Textiles and Clothing.88 Under the Agreement, all restrictions provided for in bilateral
agreements and under the MFA are to be notified to the Textiles Monitoring Body (TMB),
and removed according to a graduated schedule. Thus, upon entry into force of the
Agreement, Members are to remove all MFAbased or bilaterally-agreed restrictions on
products accounting for at least 16% of the total volume of their imports in 1990 in the
following product groups: tops and yarns, fabrics, made-up textile products, and clothing (a
detailed annex listing the individual product classes according to the Harmonized System of
Classification is attached to the Agreement on Textiles and Clothing). With respect to
restrictions that remain after this initial phase of liberalization, within three years, members
must remove restrictions on products accounting for a further 17% of the total volume of
imports in 1990 terms. Removal of restrictions on products accounting for at least another
18% of import volume is required after seven years. All further restrictions are to be
eliminated within ten years of the entry into force of the Agreement. During the transition
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period, quotas are to be expanded on imports that have not yet been completely
derestricted.

It is to be emphasized that the above liberalization commitments apply only to restrictions
imposed based upon the MFA or bilateral agreements outside the GATT legal framework.
In the case of many of the products in question, the bound MFN tariff rates remain quite
high, and are in themselves unaffected by these liberalization commitments. Tariff
reductions achieved in the Uruguay Round, while substantial, will nevertheless leave in
place tariffs on many textile and apparel items that are much higher than the average for
industrial products generally.

It should be noted, as well, that special safeguard provisions apply with respect to the
liberalization of MFA-based and bilaterally-negotiated restrictions. A Member may take
safeguard action when ‘it is demonstrated that a particular product is being imported into
its territory in such increased quantities as to cause serious damage, or actual threat thereof,
to the domestic industry producing like and/or directly competitive products’ (Article 6
(2)). It is specified that ‘serious damage or actual threat thereof must demonstrably be
caused by such increased quantities in total imports [of the product in question] and not by
such other factors as technological changes or changes in consumer preference’. Safeguard
protection is to be temporary (a maximum of three years with no right of renewal) and
must in any event cease when, pursuant to the liberalization commitments discussed above,
all past MFA-based or bilaterally-based restrictions are to have been removed from the
product. The level of restraint under the safeguard ‘shall be fixed at a level not lower than
the actual level of exports or imports from the Member concerned during the twelve-
month period terminating two months preceding’ the request for safeguard protection
(Article 6(8)). An importing Member seeking to take safeguard action must first attempt a
voluntary agreement with the exporting Member before acting unilaterally. However, any
such voluntary agreement must be reported to the TMB, which is to determine its
consistency with the safeguard provisions of the Agreement on Textiles and Clothing.
Finally, safeguards are to be applied on a Member-by-Member basis, rather than to all
Members exporting the product in question. Therefore, a determination must be made that
serious damage or threat thereof is attributable to each Member to whom safeguard action is
to be applied (Article 6(4)).

Fearing serious damage to its domestic underwear industry, the United States relied on
the Agreement on Textiles and Clothing to restrict Costa Rican imports of underwear.
Costa Rica challenged this measure, alleging that it violated a number of provisions of the
Agreement on Textiles and Clothing. In November 1996, a panel ruled largely in favour of
Costa Rica, because, inter alia, the United States had not ‘demonstrated that serious damage
or actual threat thereof was caused by such imports to the United States’ domestic
industry.’89 Costa Rica appealed, however, on a technical point regarding the legality of the
retroactive application of apparel quotas which it had lost. This appeal was allowed, thereby
strengthening Costa Rica’s victory. A similar case involved the consideration of US
restrictions on imported wool shirts and blouses from India.90 The primary issue was
whether the TMB is required to endorse safeguard actions taken by Members. India argued
that TMB endorsement was necessary, while the United States argued that there was no
such requirement. Here the panel found a middle ground, ruling that ‘members imposing
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safeguards are required to refer the matter to the TMB and then endeavour to accept’91 the
resulting recommendations of the TMB. Thus the US restrictions were found to be in
violation of the Agreement. India appealed the ruling on a number of technical points
regarding the burden of proof, the findings on the TMB and the panel’s use of judicial
economy.92 The Appellate Body did not accept India’s arguments and left the original panel
decision intact.

Finally, Article 8 of the Agreement on Textiles and Clothing sets out the procedures for
establishment and operation of the TMB. The TMB is to consist of a Chairman and ten
Members. The membership ‘shall be balanced and broadly representative of the Members
and provide for rotation of its Members at appropriate intervals’ (Article 8(1)). The
membership of the TMB is to be selected by Members of the WTO designated by the
Council for Trade in Goods to serve on the TMB, voting in their personal capacity and not
as representatives of their governments. The TMB is charged with a range of monitoring
functions, including a major review of the liberalization process, to be conducted after the
end of each of the stages (i.e. 3, 6 and 10 years).

Agreement on Technical Barriers to Trade

The Agreement stipulates that developing country Members shall be provided, upon
request, with technical assistance and advice from other Members in order to facilitate the
process of standardizing technical requirements both through national standardizing bodies,
and participation in international standardization exercises (Articles 11(2), 11(4), 11(5)).
Such assistance and advice is to occur on ‘mutually agreed terms and conditions’. Generally
speaking, Article 12, although entitled Special and Differential Treatment of Developing
Country Members, does not exempt developing countries from the obligations of the
Technical Barriers Agreement with respect to harmonization, standardization, or mutual
recognition of technical requirements. Rather, most of the provisions of Article 12 merely
require that various special needs of developing countries be taken into account in the
interpretation and implementation of the Agreement. However, Article 12(4) seems to go
further towards an actual modification (or at least, a qualification) of substantive
obligations, in stipulating that ‘developing country Members should not be expected to use
international standards as a basis for their technical regulations or standards, including test
methods, which are not appropriate to their development, financial and trade needs’. 

Agreement on Implementation of Article VI of the GATT
(Dumping)

Article 15 states that ‘special regard’ is to be given by developed country Members to the
‘special situation’ of developing countries when considering the imposition of antidumping
duties. Members are required to explore the possibility of constructive remedies (i.e. price
undertakings) before imposing duties where these would ‘affect the essential interests of
developing country members’. This provision is essentially identical to Article 13 of the
Tokyo Round Dumping Code.
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Agreement on Subsidies and Countervailing Measures

The ban on export subsidies in Article 3 (1))(a) in Article 3 does not apply to least-
developed country Members, and will apply to other developing country Members only
after a transition period of eight years (Article 27(1)). The ban on subsidies ‘contingent…
upon the use of domestic over imported goods’ shall not apply to developed countries in
general for five years and to the less-developed countries for eight years (Article 27(2)).
However, once a developing country has achieved ‘export competitiveness’ in a given
product, it is required to phase out export subsidies over a period of two years (Article 27
(4)), unless it is one of a listed group of least-developed countries, in which case the phase-
out period is extended to eight years (Article 27(4)). ‘Export competitiveness’ is deemed to
have been achieved where the exports of the developing country in question have reached at
least 3.25% of world trade for two consecutive years (Article 27(5)). Finally, the
Agreement on Subsidies and Countervailing Measures contains special de minimis
exemptions from countervailability for developing countries. Thus a countervailing duty
investigation is to be terminated when it is determined that a subsidy accounts for less than
2% of value on a per-unit basis or where the volume of subsidized imports accounts for less
than 4% of the total imports of like products (unless imports of like products from
developing countries, taken together, amount to more than 9% of total imports of like
products into the importing country) (Article 27(9)).

Understanding on Rules and Procedures Governing the
Settlement of Disputes

The Dispute Settlement Understanding contains several provisions that arguably seek to
address long-standing complaints that developing countries have been marginalized or
disadvantaged in the GATT dispute settlement process. Article 8(2) includes ‘a sufficiently
diverse background’ as one of the criteria for composition of dispute panels, and—much
more specifically—Article 8(10) stipulates that ‘when a dispute is between a developing
country Member and a developed country Member the panel shall, if the developing
country Member so requests, include at least one panellist from a developing country
Member’. Within the general time limits established by the Dispute Settlement
Understanding, a panel examining a complaint against a developing country Member is to
‘accord sufficient time for the developing country Member to prepare and present its
argumentation’ (Article 12(10)). Furthermore, where a developing country Member is
Party to a dispute, the panel must explicitly address in its report the applicability of any
special GATT provisions with respect to developing countries, where these provisions have
been invoked by the developing country Member that is a Party to the dispute (Article 12
(10)).

In the case of least-developed country Members, particular consideration is to be given to
the ‘special situation’ of these Members throughout the dispute settlement process.
Members are required to ‘exercise due restraint’ in making complaints against least-
developed country Members under the WTO dispute set-tlement procedures. A special
role is contemplated for the Director-General of the WTO or the Chairman of the Dispute
Settlement Body (DSB) with respect to facilitating consultations in the event of a dispute
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involving a least-developed country Member (Article 24(1), 24(2)). Finally, the Secretariat
of the WTO is charged with the provision of legal advice and assistance to developing
country Members with respect to dispute settlement (Article 27(2)).

Decision on Measures in Favour of Least-developed Countries

The Decision reflects what remains of the non-reciprocal approach to trade liberalization
with developing countries, applied only to the least developed countries ‘as long as they remain
in that category’. With respect to specific commitments and concessions as opposed to
compliance with the general rules of the Final Act and its various agreements, least-
developed country Members will ‘only be required to undertake commitments and
concessions to the extent consistent with their individual development, financial and trade
needs, or their administrative and institutional capabilities’ (Article 1). Thus MFN tariff and
non-tariff concessions ‘on products of export interest to the least-developed countries may
be imple-mented autonomously, in advance and without staging’—i.e. without being tied
to reciprocal concessions from these countries.

The above survey of the provisions of the Final Act and related Agreements and
Decisions that apply to developing countries clearly suggests that the overall approach is one
of full integration of all but the least-developed countries into the GATT/WTO, with some
special allowance made for special difficulties that developing countries may experience
with respect to full integration, e.g. through longer phase-in periods for compliance with
GATT/WTO obligations. Even with respect to the least-developed countries, ‘special and
differential treatment’ falls far short of outright exemption from the main general rules of
the GATT/WTO. Overall, the Uruguay Round outcome represents a wager by developing
countries in favour of an approach to trade and development premised upon openness and
export-led growth. Whether this wager will be won depends significantly on the will of
developed countries to offer tariff concession on products of export interest to developing
countries. It also depends on the willingness to prevent (sometimes legitimate) concerns
about ‘fair trade’—e.g. labour and environmental standards from releasing a new wave of
protectionism against developing countries.93

CONCLUSION

The empirical evidence to date suggests that liberal trade policies are more conducive to
economic development than import-substitution policies. However, at least three caveats
are in order. First, liberal trade policies may be a necessary condition for economic
development but they are far from a sufficient condition. Domestic policies relating to
investments in education, infrastructure, health care, and the quality of a country’s legal
system and bureaucracy clearly also matter. More generally, the quality of a country’s
institutional capital seems to be an important determinant of development.94 While economic
liberalization tends to advance the long-term process of political liberalization and
democratization, some authoritarian political regimes have co-existed with market
economies for long periods of time, in limiting cases pursuing predatory and welfare-
reducing policies towards their citizenry. Second, while it has become conventional wisdom
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amongst trade economists to be critical of the import-substitution policies pursued by many
developing countries in the post-war decades, it is important that this criticism be tempered
with an acknowledgment that many developed countries also pursued such policies for
extended periods of time earlier in their development, e.g. the US, Canada, Germany, and
arguably more recently Japan, raising questions as to whether these policies were equally
mistaken, or whether the circumstances of these countries were different in some relevant
respects from those of more recent developing countries. Third, there remain unresolved
questions as to whether a state-promoted export-led growth strategy is a superior strategy
for developing countries, given questions about the sustainability and generalizability of the
East Asian experience and severe limits on institutional capacity in many developing
countries. This might argue instead for agnosticism on the part of the state to any particular
industrial or trade strategy leaving sectoral judgments (other than reciprocal trade
liberalization) to competitive private capital markets and instead focusing collective
resources more sharply on developing general background endowments such as human
capital, infrastructure, health care, law and order, and well-functioning legal and public
sector institutions. Multilateral and bilateral foreign aid policies might focus on a similar set
of priorities. 
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15
Trade and the environment

INTRODUCTION

In the last three decades, we have witnessed a remarkable increase in support for
environmentalism among citizens of liberal democratic regimes throughout the world.
Environmentalism is a very broad concept, extending from concern about traditional forms
of pollution, such as emissions of dangerous substances into the air and the water, to the
protection of endangered species and the aesthetic purity and integrity of natural
landscapes. It has been increasingly recognized that envi-ronmental problems cross national
boundaries, and that many of the most pressing challenges cannot be addressed adequately
without international cooperation and international rules—saving the world’s ozone layer
from further damage is an obvious and important example.

The relationship between international trade and the environment has only recently
attained a prominent place on the trade agenda, although it has been a concern of
environmentalists for some time. Much of the debate on this issue is highly emotive and
polarized. Often, environmentalists tend to identify liberal trade with environmentally-
destructive unrestrained economic growth. Many free traders, on the other hand, are
largely dismissive of the environmentalists’ concerns as either disguised protectionism or
irrational fanaticism.1

The links between trade and environment are complex and multi-faceted. In this
chapter, we attempt to clearly separate and define the issues, examine existing international
trade law that affects environmental concerns, and explore prospects for reform.

In our view there are several crucial distinctions that must be made in order to clarify and
better focus the debate. The first is between the use of trade restrictions to protect the
domestic environment of the importing state and the use of such restrictions as a response
to the environmental policies of other states. However, within this second category, several
further distinctions must be drawn. Among the most important is between environmental
and competitiveness aims of environ-mentally-based trade restrictions.

Some international environmental treaties, such as the Convention on International
Traffic in Endangered Species (CITES), use control of trade as a direct means of achieving
an environmental purpose. Even where there is no such direct relationship between trade
restrictions and environmental regulation, environmentalists may view trade restrictions as
appropriate sanctions for non-compliance with international environmental standards, as a



means of imposing such standards where there are none, or a response to the failure of
particular nations to engage in negotiations to develop or adopt such standards. Whether
trade measures are an appropriate or effective means of achieving these ends raises a wide
variety of normative and empirical issues. Environmentalists, in addition to this concern
about international standards, are also concerned about the so-called ‘race to the bottom’—
the possibility that, in response to the competitive advantage that is gained from lower
environmental standards in some industries, a greater share of jobs and trade in those
industries will shift to countries with lower domestic environmental standards. This, it is
feared, will put downward pressure on environmental standards in countries that presently
have higher levels of protection. Here, environmentalists are not necessarily seeking
adoption by all countries of the same domestic environmental standards but are simply
concerned that such standards continue to be sustainable in countries that have already
decided to adopt them. Although some free traders are largely dismissive of the problem posed
by the ‘race to the bottom’, our own view is that this problem is real but that there will
usually be a better alternative response to increased competitive pressures than the lowering
of environmental standards—including better instrument choices in environmental
regulation that achieve the same or improved results while imposing lower costs on
industrial production, investment in technologies that promise to reduce the cost of
complying with higher environmental standards, and adoption of adjustment and exit-
oriented measures that shift resources from sectors where comparative advantage continues
to depend on lower environmental standards to those where it does not.

By contrast with environmentalists, ‘fair traders’ are concerned with the impact on
trade, not on the environment as such, of other countries’ lower environmental standards.
They consider it ‘unfair’ that a country can gain an advantage in trade from lower
environmental standards. Unlike the claims of environmentalists, we view these claims of fair
traders with great scepticism. First of all, the claims implicitly assume that the importing
state’s environmental standards are optimal from both a domestic and a global perspective.
But absent some defensible international norm or benchmark for environmental standards,
this assumption merely reflects the bias of the importing country towards its own regulatory
approach. Second, higher environmental standards may actually confer a competitive
advantage in some sectors, where these standards may create incentives for the
development of environmental technologies that can then be exported to other countries as
their demand for environmental protection increases. Third, environmental standards and
costs must be distinguished. ‘Fair traders’ are really concerned with differential costs to
industry of environmental standards, yet even if standards were harmonized, different
countries for technological, climatic, other geographical and demographic reasons, could
still face vastly different costs of meeting these harmonized standards. Here the arguments
of fair traders exhibit the same kind of incoherence that is evident with respect to
countervailing duty law, which we have discussed at length in Chapter 8. Briefly, for
unfairness to have a normatively defensible meaning it must entail the violation of some
neutral, objective baseline for the balance of benefits and burdens that governments create
for industries.

In this chapter, we review the existing trade law and jurisprudence that affects
environmentally-based trade measures, and attempt a clarification of the concepts and
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arguments at stake in the trade and environment debate. We pay particular attention to
jurisprudence of the GATT and the FTA that has applied a number of key legal norms and
principles of international trade law in environ-mentally-related contexts. As well, we
consider the environmental provisions of the NAFTA, including the environmental side-
agreement.2

THE GATT

The General Agreement (especially Articles I, II, and XI) prohibits border restrictions on
the exportation and importation of goods, subject to a narrow range of exceptions. In
addition, the GATT prohibits certain internal measures that discriminate against foreign
imports (Article III). Clearly, the vast majority of domestic environmental policies fall into
neither of these categories, and hence no potential or real conflict with the GATT is likely
to emerge except in a relatively small number of cases.3 Nevertheless, the number and
importance of these cases is growing as many Contracting Parties place increasing priority
on protection of the environment. In the case of the FTA, the relevant provisions are closely
similar or identical to those of the GATT, including the provisions on National Treatment
with respect to trade in goods and the prohibition of quantitative restrictions.

Article XX: a GATT environmental charter?

Given that many of the border measures connected with environmental goals are on their
face violations of Article XI, much of the jurisprudence has centred on whether such
measures can be saved by virtue of any of the exceptions listed in Article XX of the GATT.
Article XX exempts certain classes of measures from the strictures of other GATT articles,
provided that ‘such measures are not applied in a manner which would constitute a means
of arbitrary or unjustifiable discrimination between countries where the same conditions
prevail, or a disguised restriction on international trade’. Among the classes of measures
listed are those ‘necessary to protect human, animal or plant life or health’ (XX(b)); and
‘relating to the conservation of exhaustible natural resources if such measures are made
effective in conjunction with restrictions on domestic production or consumption’ (XX(g)).

The word ‘environment’ is not mentioned explicitly in either paragraph. Commentators
are divided on whether, nevertheless, these provisions were intended by the drafters to
apply to the environment in the broadest sense (including moral and aesthetic concerns) or,
alternatively, to a much narrower range of policy concerns. Shrybman, for instance, argues
for the latter point of view.4 It is possible to understand Article XX(b), for example, as
intended to cover measures designed either to protect public health against diseases (e.g.
from contaminated meat) or to protect animal or health life for commercial reasons (e.g.
the economic consequences of crop pestilences). With respect to Article XX(g), its purpose
might be to allow a country to protect ‘exhaustible natural resources’ such as minerals or
petroleum that are considered as essential to its economic well-being. In a detailed analysis
of the negotiations that produced the General Agreement, Charnovitz has shown, however,
that the drafters had at least conservation goals in mind, as well as economic or public health
and safety concerns. He argues that the drafters were aware of existing inter-national
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conventions on conservation, and probably did not include a more explicit environmental
exemption precisely because they thought that Articles XX(b) and (g) would suffice for this
purpose and the Turtles appeal to the AB found that Art. XX(g) could encompass measures
to protect living resources, in this case endangered species. This ruling was based on a
consideration of developments in international environmental law and policy subsequent to
the 1947 GATT, thus employing methods of treaty interpretation required under Art 31 of
the Vienna Convention, as well as a reading of the preamble to the WTO Agreement.5

Throughout much of the history of the GATT, the main issues raised by Article XX
concerned the potential for protectionism to be disguised as measures taken for health and
other goals stated in the Article. For example, phytosanitary measures with respect to
livestock were often cited as indirect protectionist measures, as well as other technical
barriers such as idiosyncratic product standards or inspection requirements. The explicit
language of Article XX presupposes that it is possible to detect instances where measures
are in fact ‘disguised restrictions on trade’. In practice this has proven far from
straightforward in the presence of conflicting scientific evidence as to the non-protectionist
justification of particular measures, and also due to the fact that much of the claimed
protectionism might be embedded in the manner in which a measure that did have a
genuine non-protectionist basis was administered.

The WTO Agreement on Technical Barriers to Trade and Sanitory and Phytosanitary
Agreement attempt to address the task of distinguishing genuine nonprotectionist measures
from disguised trade protection through a multi-faceted approach, including the
encouragement of the use of international standards. These agreements are discussed in
detail in Chapter 6, on health and safety standards. Significantly, the Agreement on
Technical Barriers to Trade permits ‘technical reg-ulations and standards’ which are ‘for the
protection of human health or safety, animal or plant life or health or the environment’
(Article 2(2)). Here the addition of ‘the environment’ to language that otherwise duplicates
the wording of Article XX(b), may suggest an explicit acknowledgement that the Article XX
exemptions are to be interpreted broadly to include measures taken for environmental
purposes.6

The jurisprudence of the GATT (including interpretation of
GATT provisions by Canada-USA FTA panels)

In several GATT/WTO and FTA panel decisions during the 1980s and 1990s, and in one
WTO Appelate Body decision, the consistency of environmental measures with Articles III
and XI of the GATT was addressed, as well as the application of Article XX to the environment.

Herring and Salmon

The application of Article XX to trade restricting measures to protect the restricting
country’s own environment was addressed in the Herring and Salmon case.7 Here, the United
States was the complainant, arguing that Canadian requirements that salmon and herring
caught in Canadian waters be processed in Canada before export violated Article XI of the
GATT. Among Canada’s arguments in response was that these restrictions were an integral
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part of its overall scheme for management of West Coast fisheries resources, and therefore
‘related to’ the ‘conservation of exhaustible natural resources’ within the meaning of
Article XX(g).8 According to Canada, the export restrictions functioned in the following two
ways to support its conservation scheme. First of all, the vulnerability of the species
required an extremely accurate catch control system, and the only way of having precise
data on the catch was to limit its destination to Canadian fish plants, which were subject to
rigorous reporting requirements. Second, because of the cyclical nature of the catch for
both species, making the unprocessed fish available exclusively to Canadian plants was the
only means of balancing the conservation objective with the goal of sustaining a viable domestic
fish processing industry. The implication of this latter claim was that unless Canadian fish
plants were assured of the entire Canadian catch, the Canadian government would be faced
with the choice of either accepting the demise of the industry or permitting overfishing
when the catch was good.

The United States replied that the Canadian requirements were ‘neither necessary nor
particularly useful’ for the purpose of ensuring an accurate estimate of the Canadian catch,
since in the case where unprocessed fish was exported to the United States, ‘United States
authorities routinely provided to Canada, upon request and for use in the Canadian
conservation programme, full data on United States landings of unprocessed fish’.9 The
United States also objected to the broad view of ‘conservation’ suggested by the notion that
conservation measures included measures that balanced conservation goals with
socioeconomic concerns such as the preservation of a domestic processing industry—in any
case, Canada’s domestic processing industry would have access to fish imports to make up
any shortfall resulting from the combined impact of conservation measures and the cyclical
nature of the industry.

Finally, the United States presented evidence that the Canadian government itself had
described the export ban as a means of protecting Canadian jobs in its own official literature,
and therefore that the measure should be viewed as a disguised restriction on trade.

The GATT panel interpreted the Article XX(g) requirement that measures be ‘related
to’ conservation of exhaustible natural resources as meaning ‘primarily aimed at’ such
conservation,10 but it viewed this as weaker than the requirement of ‘necessity’ imposed by
Article XX(b). Among the main factors that led the panel to find that the Canadian export ban
was not ‘primarily aimed’ at conservation was that accurate statistical data could be
collected without such a ban, as was done for other species that were subject to
conservation measures but whose export in an unprocessed state was not banned. The panel
thus adopted an objective test to determine primary intent, i.e. instead of examining the
legislative history of the measure to determine whether its primary aim was protection of
the domestic Canadian processing industry, it considered whether other means less
restrictive of trade could equally serve the stated conservation purpose. An important
clarification of the meaning of ‘necessary’ in Article XX(b) occurred in the non-environmental
Thai Cigarette case.11 In that case, the United States challenged a ban on imports of cigarettes
into Thailand as a violation of Article XI of the GATT. Thailand defended the ban, under
Article XX(b), as ‘necessary’ for the protection of public health. While no comparable ban
existed on domestic Thai cigarettes, the Thai government claimed that American imports
were more likely to induce women and young persons to take up smoking, because of
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sophisticated advertising directed at these groups. Thailand also argued that American
cigarettes were somehow more addictive or more likely to be consumed in larger quantities
than comparable Thai cigarettes, due to their chemical composition (this claim was largely
unsupported, however, by scientific evidence). The panel ruled that an import ban would
only be ‘necessary’ for public health reasons, within the meaning of Article XX(b), if
alternative non-trade restricting measures could not be used to achieve the public health
objectives in question. The panel considered that restrictions or bans on advertising and
labelling and content requirements that applied on a non-discriminatory basis to both
domestic cigarettes and imports would be satisfactory alternatives to an import ban, and
therefore the ban could not be justified under Article XX(b) as ‘necessary’ for reasons of
public health. In coming to this decision, the panel simply ignored the possibility that the
alternative measures might involve high regulatory and compliance costs, or might be
impracticable to implement effectively in a developing country.

Salmon and Herring Landing Requirements

In the Salmon and Herring Landing Requirements12 case, an FTA panel considered the scope of
the Article XX(g) exception with respect to measures ‘primarily aimed at conservation of an
exhaustible natural resource’. In that case, the United States challenged provisions of a
Canadian law that required that salmon and herring caught on Canada’s West Coast be
landed and unloaded in Canada before processing. The landing requirement was imposed
after Canada’s domestic processing requirement had been found in violation of Article XI by a
GATT panel, as discussed above.13 Unlike the measure impugned in the earlier case, the
landing requirement did not explicitly prohibit or restrict exports of the unprocessed fish.
Nevertheless, its effect was to disadvantage American processors, because in the case of fish
destined to US processing plants, they would have to be both landed and unloaded in
Canada (due to the law) and then repacked, and unloaded again in the United States before
processing. The United States claimed that the measure was, in effect, a restriction on
‘exportation or sale for export’ (i.e. of unprocessed Canadian fish to the United States) and
therefore in violation of Article XI of the GATT. Canada argued that even if the landing
requirements were in violation of Article XI, the Article XX(g) exception applied, because
landing of the fish was necessary for accurate monitoring of the catch pursuant to Canadian
conservation programmes. The panel found that other means less restrictive of trade existed
to achieve Canada’s objectives of monitoring and compliance with its conservation schemes,
including cooperation with US authorities and on-board inspection of catches and cargo, and
that (at least implicitly) Canada had adopted more restrictive means for protectionist reasons.
The panel was also prepared to accept that landing of part of the catch might be necessary
for sampling in order to achieve Canadian monitoring and compliance objectives, but
considered that a requirement that 100% of the catch be landed went farther than was
reasonably necessary for these purposes. In consequence, conservation could not be
considered the ‘primary purpose’ of the landing requirements and therefore Article XX(g)
did not apply.

In our view, where a panel employs a least-restrictive means test in its application of
Article XX, it should do so in a manner that reflects sensitivity to the fact that
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environmental policy-makers have limited resources, and often operate under broad
background constraints imposed by the political and legal system in their country. The
availability of a hypothetically less restrictive means of achieving the same goals should not
necessarily mean that the measures under scrutiny fail the least-restrictive means test. The
panel should be open to arguments that the hypothetical alternative is not truly available at a
reasonable cost to the Contracting Party that has enacted the trade-restricting
environmental measure. For instance, in some countries with weakly developed regulatory
and legal systems, border controls may be among the few effective ways of addressing some
environmental hazards, even if they seem a rather blunt or crude instrument from the
perspective of ‘state of the art’ regulatory theory and practice. To return to the Thai
Cigarette case, in the abstract, it would have undoubtedly have been possible for the Thai
government to have adopted some of the alternative, less trade-restricting means suggested
by the panel, such as consumer warnings, public information campaigns, and so forth. But
this simply ignores the issue of whether the kinds of sophisticated techniques of persuasion
and psychological manipulation employed by Western cigarette manufacturers could be
matched, at reasonable cost (or any cost), by the informational resources available to a
developing country government. In the environmental area, a more contextually sensitive
application of the least-restrictive means test would arguably require panels to draw upon
evidence from the broader environmental policy community as to the available regulatory
alternatives and their strengths and limitations in a given set of circumstances. Here again,
the Thai Cigarette decision sets a bad precedent—the panel simply chose to ignore a report of
the World Health Organization suggesting that the Thai government’s approach was a
reasonable instrument choice under the circumstances.

In its recent ruling in Reformulated Gasoline, discussed below at pp. 413–16, the WTO
Appellate Body rejected the view that the apparently less stringent language of XX(g),
referring to measures ‘relating to’ the conservation of exhaustible natural resources, should
be interpreted in the the same way as the expression ‘necessary to’ in Article XX(b),
contrary to the approach taken by the FTA panel in Salmon and Herring Landing Requirements.
Significantly, in Reformulated Gasoline, the Appellate Body breathed life into the criteria in
the ‘chapeau’ of Article XX as a means of preventing protectionist misuse of the exceptions
in the Article—thus, the AB considered it an important dimension of any Article XX
analysis to enquire into whether measures are ‘a disguised restriction on international trade’
or ‘a means of arbitary or unjustifiable discrimination between countries’. The meaning
given by the AB to these provisions will be discussed later in this chapter; it is appropriate to
note at this juncture that, to the extent that the ‘chapeau’ provides a set of legal tests to
weed out protectionist misuse, a more contextually sensitive and flexible interpretation of
‘necessary’ in XX(b) and, a fortiori, ‘relating to’ in XX(g) may be possible without major
risk to the integrity of the multilateral trading order.

Lobsters

The Lobsters case raised a vexing issue, on which the GATT jurisprudence is far from clear:
how to distinguish between border bans that are part of an internal regulatory scheme
aimed at both domestic and imported products (permitted by GATT subject only to the Article
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III National Treatment obligation) and prohibitions or restrictions on imports within the
meaning of Article XI (banned by GATT unless strictly justified under Article XX). In the
Lobsters case,14 a Canada-US FTA panel considered whether application of a domestic US
minimum size requirement to imports of Canadian lobster should be considered as an
Article XI prohibition on imports (i.e. the effect of the measure being the exclusion of all
Canadian lobsters beneath a certain size) or as part of an internal regulatory scheme within
the meaning of Article III.

The minimum size requirement, as it applied to American lobster, was unquestionably a
reasonable conservation measure: the intent was to conserve the stock by ensuring that
young lobster would not be taken before they could breed. However, because Canada has
colder waters, its mature lobster are in general of smaller size, and accordingly Canada had
a lower minimum size requirement, which arguably served in the Canadian context the
conservation objective as well as did the higher American size requirement in the US
context.

The evidence suggests that imposition of the same minimum size requirement on imports
of Canadian lobster was largely in response to complaints by American fishermen that the
domestic US requirement put them at a competitive disadvantage with Canadian fishermen.
In its argument to the panel, however, the US government attempted to justify the
application of its minimum-size requirement to Canadian lobster as necessary to the
enforcement of the requirement with respect to American lobster. Since lobsters do not
carry passports, it would be costly to determine whether a given lobster was Canadian or
American once it had entered the stream of commerce. This difficulty was entirely obviated
through application of the size requirement to all lobster in the market, whether Canadian
or American. 

In considering whether to view the extension of the size requirement to Canadian lobster
as the application at the border of an internal US regulation, or as a prohibition or
restriction on imports within the meaning of Article XI, the majority panel judgment
reviewed a variety of GATT panel decisions. The majority rejected the view that trade-
restricting impacts should be the decisive consideration in classifying a measure as an Article
XI measure. This seems in direct contradiction with another FTA panel’s ruling in the
Salmon and Herring Landing Requirement case, where (as discussed above) the panel found that
the measure in question, while not taking the legal form of a prohibition or restriction on
exports or sale for export, had this effect, and should therefore be considered a prima-facie
violation of Article XI.15 Nor did the Lobster panel consider it of paramount importance
whether the measure was to be enforced at the border by customs officials or through
internal inspections once the product entered the domestic stream of commerce. Instead,
the panel’s majority decision seems to rest upon its acceptance of the United States’s
position that the import ban was genuinely an integral part of an internal regulatory regime
applicable to both foreign and domestic product. As pointed out in the vigorous dissenting
judgment by one expert on the panel, this was precisely how Canada had characterized its
landing requirement measure in the Salmon and Herring Landing Requirement case, i.e. as
connected to the monitoring requirements of its internal conservation regime, and yet in
Salmon and Herring Landing Requirement the measures were nevertheless categorized as
Article XI restrictions or prohibitions on exports.16 In Lobsters the panel did not go on to
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consider whether, in fact, the scheme violated Art. III, since this issue had been excluded
from its terms of reference.

Of course, even where the measures in question are classified as internal regulations
under Article III, complex issues may be implicated in determining whether in fact foreign
products are being treated equally. A particularly difficult issue is whether only facially
discriminatory measures should be considered in violation of Article III, or whether
measures with a ‘disparate impact’ on foreign producers also, in some circumstances,
violate the National Treatment obligation. For instance, a country may impose on both
domestic products and imports a requirement of environmentally-safe (e.g. biodegradable)
packaging, in circumstances where most domestic producers are already using such
packaging. Foreign producers, unlike their domestic equivalents, would be required at
considerable cost to change packaging methods and materials in order to sell their goods
within one particular foreign market. The more specific and idiosyncratic the requirements,
the more likely that any foreign producer who does not possess a large market share in the
country concerned will simply find that the costs of adapting the product are prohibitive,
and will effectively be excluded from the market. Situations of this kind have led to
considerable trade frictions within the European Union, despite the existence of
institutional mechanisms for harmonization of national environmental standards.

The issue was addressed somewhat indirectly by a GATT panel considering the
application of Article III to a variety of measures affecting the importation of beer into
several Canadian provinces.17 Among these measures was a tax on beer containers applied
to both domestic and imported beer. However, the tax was refundable where a system of
collection of the containers for re-bottling and recycling was used. Such a system was
readily available to domestic beer producers, as they were permitted to sell their beer
through privately owned retail stores that had such a system in place. Imported beer, by
contrast, could only be sold at provincial monopoly liquor outlets where no such system for
return of containers was in place. As a result, the only way a foreign producer could comply
with the conditions for refund of the tax was to set up its own independent system for
collection, re-bot-tling and recycling of beer containers, which would involve considerable
if not prohibitive expense. Since the tax applied equally on its face to both domestic and
imported beer, the United States argument amounted to a claim that disparate impact of a
facially neutral internal measure could constitute a violation of Article III. The panel found
that the container tax as it applied to imported beer did not violate Article III. In significant
part, its reasoning was that the disparate impact in question was really due to another,
explicitly discriminatory practice that was in itself a violation of Article III i.e. the effective
prohibition of foreign beer producers from sale of their beer through private retail oudets.18

At a minimum, this finding may be interpreted to mean that a mere disparate impact on
imports does not render facially neutral internal environmental measures in contravention of
the GATT.

Superfund

The Superfund case concerned US taxes on imports of certain petroleum and chemical
products, the revenues from which were to go to a fund dedicated to environmental
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protection purposes.19 In the case of petroleum products, an excise tax for environmental
purposes was applied to both domestic and foreign petroleum. The tax on imports was,
however, higher than that on domestic products (11.7 cents as opposed to 8.2 cents per
barrel). The United States gave no justification for this discrimination, other than that there
was no ‘nullification and impairment’ of a GATT concession because the difference was so
small as not to create a competitive disadvantage for foreign suppliers. The panel had little
diffi-culty concluding that there was nevertheless a prima-facie nullification and
impairment, and that the discriminatory tax violated the National Treatment obligation of
Article III.

The panel treated quite differently, however, the tax on imported chemicals. The United
States argued that this tax was no greater than the tax that would be levied on similar
substances when used by American producers to make the same chemicals. Therefore, the
USA claimed, the tax met the conditions for an exemption from the National Treatment
obligation in Article II:2(a), being ‘equivalent to an internal tax…in respect of an article
from which the imported product has been manufactured in whole or in part’.

The panel accepted this claim despite the complainants’ objection that the environmental
harm from the use of the substances in question in the production of imported chemicals
occurred not in the United States but in the jurisdiction of manufacture, and thus that the
tax represented a United States tax on pollution that was occurring outside its borders. The
panel responded to this objection by stating that the General Agreement provisions on tax
adjustment ‘do not distinguish between taxes for different policy purposes’.20 This outcome
suggests that one clear means by which Contracting Parties can sanction environmentally
harmful conduct outside their borders is through environmental taxes that apply to
imported products—provided, of course, that equivalent taxes also apply domestically.

Canadian Tuna

The 1979 Canadian Tuna case concerned an American import ban on Canadian tuna,
imposed under the US Fishery Conservation and Management Act. The ban followed the
seizure by Canadian authorities of 19 US fishing boats within the Canadian 200 mile
territorial limit. The United States argued that, although in violation of Article XI of the
GATT, the tuna ban represented an essential element of the American approach to the
conservation of the species. The interests of conservation required that Canada stop
unilaterally enforcing its territorial limit against American fishermen and instead negotiate
with the United States jointly-agreed catch limits on this essentially shared fisheries
resource: ‘it was fruitless [according to the American representative] for one coastal state to
limit the catch when a school of tuna was in its waters, if the school would be overfished in
another State’s waters or the high seas’.21 The tuna ban was a sanction aimed at inducing
Canada to end its unilateral actions against American fishermen and instead to accept a
cooperative approach to management of the resource, and therefore could be justified on
the basis of Article XX(g) as ‘related to the conservation of an exhaustible natural resource’.
In reply, Canada claimed that the American action was a direct retaliation for the act of
seizure and not a response to more general concerns about Canadian non-acceptance of US
approaches to management of tuna stocks. The United States did not deny this, but argued
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that the wording ‘related to’ in Article XX(g) did not require conservation objectives to be
the sole or even primary cause of the measure in question.22 A final issue related to the
requirement of Article XX(g) that the measures in question be ‘made effective in
conjunction with domestic restrictions on consumption and production’. Although the
United States had domestic production quotas with respect to tuna, these did not apply to
at least one of the specific species whose importation from Canada had been banned (i.e.
albacore tuna). In its decision, the panel began by considering an additional argument, i.e.
that the import ban might be justified under Article XI:2, which permits quantitative
restrictions where necessary to sustain a system of domestic supply management for
primary products (the intent of this provision was arguably to exempt from GATT
strictures the border measures required to enforce price and quantity restrictions in
domestic agricultural marketing schemes).23

The panel rejected the application of Article XI:2 on two largely technical grounds: (1)
domestic restrictions were not consistently in force with respect to species covered by the
import ban; (2) the language of Article XI:2(c) was explic-itly limited to ‘restrictions’ on
imports and therefore this sub-paragraph could not be used as a basis for a total ban. 

With respect to Article XX(g), the panel found that this exception did not apply, also for
the rather narrow, technical reason that some species of tuna covered by the import ban
were not covered by the domestic US restrictions on production. The panel sidestepped
entirely the two extremely fundamental jurisprudential issues raised by the case: first, in
what circumstances can unilateral action aimed at inducing another state to accept one’s
own approach to management of a joint resource be considered a GATT-consistent
conservation measure; and second, how closely connected to the purpose of conservation
the specific measure adopted must be for Article XX(g) to apply. (The panel did note that
inasmuch as the American action was solely a retaliation for the seizure of American ships,
it would not be covered by Article XX, but failed to comment on the application of this
observation to the facts at hand.) Moreover, the panel did find that the import ban on
Canadian tuna was not a ‘disguised restriction on international trade’ within the meaning of
Article XX, because it ‘had been taken as a trade measure and publicly announced as
such’.24 This interpretation of ‘disguised restriction’ must now be reconsidered in light of
the more complex meaning given to this notion by the Appellate Body in Reformulated
Gasoline, as discussed below at pp. 413–16.

Tuna/Dolphin I

In the Tuna/Dolphin case,25 Mexico complained that an American embargo of its tuna
exports violated, inter alia, Article XI of the GATT. The embargo was imposed because
Mexico had failed to satisfy US authorities that its tuna was caught in a manner that did not
risk the destruction of dolphins. The United States argued that because its restrictions on
the manner in which tuna was caught applied to American tuna as well, the import ban should
be treated as the enforcement of ‘laws, regulations and requirements affecting (the) internal
sale, offering for sale, purchase, transportation, distribution or use’ of imported products
within the meaning of Article III, and not as quantitative trade restrictions. Here, the
United States relied specifically on an Interpretive Note annexed to Article III, which states
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that ‘any internal law, regulation or requirement of the kind referred to in [Article III: 1]
which applies to an imported product and the like domestic product and is collected or
enforced in the case of the imported product at the time or point of importation’
nevertheless is to be treated as an internal measure within the meaning of Article III: 1. As
discussed earlier in this chapter, the view of Article III suggested by this Interpretative Note
has led to considerable disagreement on whether a given measure should be classified as a
restriction or prohibition on imports and exports within the meaning of Article XI, or as an
internal measure merely enforced through a border ban (in which case the Article III National
Treatment obligation alone would apply, and if non-discriminatory the measure would be
found to be GATT-consistent).

Here, the panel rejected the view that Article III, rather than Article XI was applicable,
on the grounds that what was being regulated was not the actual imported product (tuna)
but the manner in which it had been produced, and that Article III concerned measures that
applied to and affected the nature of products themselves. The panel suggested: ‘Regulations
governing the taking of dolphins incidental to the taking of tuna could not possibly affect
tuna as a product.’26 The panel thus went on to characterize the import ban as a quantitative
restriction within the meaning of Article XI, the issue thus becoming whether either Article
XX(b) or Article XX(g) could apply to exempt the ban from Article XI strictures. With
respect to Article XX(b), the panel simply excluded the possibility that it could apply to the
protection of animal life outside the jurisdiction of the Contracting Party taking the
measure. Two grounds were provided for this interpretation, neither of which has any
textual basis in the General Agreement itself. The first was that the drafting history of
Article XX(b) suggested that the essential purpose was to permit sanitary measures to
protect human animal and plant health in the importing country. The second ground was
that if the broader interpretation of Article XX(b) were accepted, each Contracting Party
could unilaterally determine the life or health protection policies from which other
Contracting Parties could not deviate without jeopardizing their legal rights under the General
Agreement. The General Agreement would then no longer constitute a multilateral
framework for trade among all Contracting Parties but would provide legal security only in
respect of trade between a limited number of Contracting Parties with identical internal
regulations.27

Although this finding itself sufficed to make Article XX(b) inapplicable to the US import
ban, the panel went out of its way to further narrow the Article’s scope. The panel claimed
that the language of ‘necessity’ in Article XX(b) meant the United States would have to
show that it had exhausted all options less restrictive of trade before resorting to import
restrictions. The panel noted that the possibility of international cooperation with respect to
dolphin conservation was an option that the United States had not exhausted.

With respect to Article XX(g), the panel suggested that, like Article XX(b), it could only
be invoked to justify measures aimed at protecting the trade-restricting state’s own
environment. The panel based this view, in part, on the notion that Article XX(g) requires
that import restrictions be imposed in tandem with internal measures to control production
or consumption of the resource. The panel noted: ‘a country can effectively control the
production or consumption of an exhaustible natural resource only to the extent that the
production or consumption is under its jurisdiction’.
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The panel also suggested that since, at a given moment, Mexico could not know how
many dolphins had been killed by American fishermen, it could not know whether it was
complying with American law, and therefore whether it could avoid an export ban. In the
panel’s view, ‘a limitation on trade based on such unpredictable conditions could not be
regarded as primarily aimed at conservation.’

The panel also considered a quite different American measure concerned with the
protection of dolphins, the Dolphin Protection Consumer Information Act, which
permitted producers to market tuna in the United States with a ‘Dolphin-Safe’ label,
provided US authorities could be satisfied that the tuna were indeed caught in a manner that
did not unnecessarily endanger the lives of dolphins. Mexico argued that this law violated
Article 1:1 of the GATT, the Most Favoured Nation provision, since documentary evidence
on the manner in which tuna were harvested was only required when the tuna came from
the Eastern Tropical Pacific; thus, less than the full benefit of the label was conferred on tuna
producers from countries such as Mexico that fished in the Eastern Tropical Pacific. The
panel rejected this argument, finding that the requirement of documentation would apply
equally to any country that wished to fish in the Eastern Tropical Pacific.

The Tuna/Dolphin decision has been widely criticized by environmentalists, but
vigorously defended by the GATT Secretariat28 and some trade lawyers.29 There are many
aspects of the decision that are difficult to justify—including the notion that measures that
apply to the production process for a product cannot be regarded as internal measures for
the purposes of Article III, which would mean that measures that apply equally to domestic
products and imports would nevertheless be GATT-illegal, being considered as quantitative
restrictions under Article XI.

The forced reading of the General Agreement that characterizes some aspects of the panel’s
decision must be considered, however, in light of its overall interpretation of the normative
structure of the GATT, and it is this interpretation that must be the basis of any fundamental
critique of the decision. The panel’s view of the GATT is revealed most clearly in the
concluding remarks of the panel:

The panel wished to note the fact, made evident during its consideration of this case,
that the provisions of the General Agreement impose few constraints on a
Contracting Party’s implementation of domestic environmental policies…. As a
corollary to these rights, a Contracting Party may not restrict imports of a product
merely because it originates in a country with environmental policies different from
its own. It seemed evident to the panel that, if the CONTRACTING PARTIES were
to permit import restrictions in response to differences in environmental policies
under the General Agreement, they would need to impose limits on the range of
policy differences justifying such responses and to develop criteria so as to prevent
abuse.30

The fundamental dividing line that the panel sees is between environmental policies for the
sake of protecting one’s own environment, and policies that somehow dictate to another
Contracting Party how it should protect its own environment. This seems a
mischaracterization of the problem. First of all, the United States was not aiming
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paternalistically, as it were, to dictate to Mexico how it should regulate a purely domestic
environmental problem. The measure was aimed at the preservation of dolphins as a species
surviving in the world’s oceans, i.e. of the global environmental commons. There was no
domestic Mexican jurisdiction over dolphins that was being encroached upon. Second, the
American legislation was not interfering with any specific obligations or rights assigned to
Mexican fishermen under Mexican law. Despite the adoption of extraterritoriality language
by the panel, the American dolphin protection measures did not impose any obligations on
Mexican fishermen that were in actual conflict with environmental laws or policies of the
Mexican government. The Mexican government did not have an environmental policy
forcing Mexican consumers to eat dolphin-destructive tuna, for instance, or enjoining
Mexican fishermen to kill dolphins when fishing for tuna. Nor was the lifting of the import
ban on the tuna necessarily conditional upon the Mexican government adopting identical
legislation to the American dolphin protection legislation. Mexico was free to permit access
to its own market for dolphin-destructive tuna, whether caught by Mexican or foreign
fishermen. As long as Mexican fishermen did not use fishing technology that threatened the
lives of dolphins, their tuna was free to enter the United States. It is true that in order for
Mexican fishermen to use dolphin-threatening technology and for their tuna nevertheless to
be admitted to the United States, the Mexican government would be required to adopt
similar rules to those in force in the United States. But this is far from the massive intrusion
on Mexican legal sovereignty evoked by the panel’s suggestion that the American measures
virtually forced the Mexicans either to adopt identical environmental protection laws to
those of the United States or give up their legal rights under the GATT.

By making access to the US market depend upon either an American-like regulatory
scheme or adoption of different technology by Mexican fishermen, the US measures did
place a commercial disadvantage or burden on Mexican fishermen, in that if their
government failed to act the only way they could get access to the US market was to acquire
and use a different fishing technology, presumably less efficient or in any event more costly.

However, the panel also was prepared to accept that these kinds of commercial
disadvantages might be permissible under Article XX(b) if ‘necessary’ to protect the United
States’ own environment. What is most questionable is the panel’s view that where the
preferences of the trade-restricting state are for protection of the global commons rather
than for protection of its own domestic environment, Articles XX(b) and XX(g) can never
be relied on.

This view seems based upon several different arguments, some of which are more
explicit than others in the panel’s reasoning. The first is that the drafting history suggests
that Article XX(b) was only intended to apply to protection of animal or plant life or health
within one’s own boundaries. This view of the drafting history is contradicted by evidence
that the drafters were likely aware that at the time the GATT was negotiated there were
various international conventions and agreements as well as some unilateral legislation that
involved import and export restrictions linked to global conservation goals (e.g. for
endangered species).31 In not restricting the wording of XX(b) explicitly to domestic
animal and plant life, the drafters may well have intended to make room in the GATT for
these pre-existing conservation-related restrictions.
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Moreover, other provisions of Article XX suggest that its purpose was not to be limited
to exempting measures to protect domestic interests within the trade-restricting state. The
clearest example is the exemption for products made with prison labour—clearly what is at
issue here is preferences concerning the morality of prison labour in the exporting country,
not simply in one’s own country. Similarly, the general view of Article XX(f) which refers
to the ‘protection of national treasures of artistic, historic or archaeological value’ is that it
permits not only restrictions on the export of a Contracting Party’s own national treasures,
but import and export restrictions on national treasures of other Contracting Parties as
well.32 A final view, also implicit in the panel’s report, reads into the legal order of the
GATT a prohibition on unilateral action to protect the environment beyond one’s borders.
Undoubtedly, certain kinds of unilateral action that are extraterri-torial violate particular
rules of international law, both treaty law (e.g. the Law of the Sea Convention) and
customary international law.33 These include direct assertion of control over activity in
international waters through the use or threat of military force. Yet apart from the risk
described above of increased cheating on trade concessions, it is hard to understand why a
sui generis rule on non-intervention for environmental purposes should be read into an
international regime concerned with preserving and enhancing international commercial
exchanges. There is a considerable body of public international law on the issues of non-
intervention and the use of economic sanctions against other states. But—at least in its
current form—the GATT dispute settlement mechanism has, arguably, neither the
institutional competence nor the legitimacy, to interpret and develop these public
international law rules. In any event, there is no general public international rule against
unilateral action to protect the environment as long as such action does not result in illegal
assertion of jurisdiction over international waters or territory or usurpation of the
territorial jurisdiction of another state.34 Clearly, it would be inappropriate to be simply
dismissive of the important sovereignty concerns that underpin the panel’s ruling. In our
estimation, however, these concerns were more appropriately addressed in the panel’s
observation that the United States had not pursued with sufficient vigour international
cooperation as a means of protecting the dolphin population (either bilaterally with Mexico
or on a multilateral basis), and therefore that the adoption of unilateral trade restrictions
was precipitous and hence not clearly ‘necessary’ within the meaning of Article XX(b).

The Tuna/Dolphin I ruling was never adopted by the GATT Council, Mexico and the
United States having agreed to resolve the dispute through diplomatic negotiation. This
ultimately led to the conclusion of a multilateral agreement on the protection of dolphins in
the Eastern Tropical Pacific Ocean—the Agreement for the Reduction of Dolphin Mortality in the
Eastern Pacific Ocean, which took effect in January 1993, and to which nine countries
including Mexico are signatories.35 However, even as amended in 1992, the US legislation
did not fully exempt from the embargo countries that had signed the Agreement, although it
did provide for a ‘fast track’ avenue for getting an exemption, if one accepted monitoring
under the Agreement of one’s commitment to reduce dolphin mortality rates.
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Tuna/Dolphin II

In Tuna/Dolphin II,36 the European Union challenged provisions for a secondary embargo in
the US tuna legislation. Ostensibly aimed at ‘leakage’ from the primary embargo by
transhipment of dolphin-unfriendly tuna through a third country, these provisions were,
however, interpreted by a US court to extend to all cases where the exporting country did
not have a primary embargo of its own, regardless of whether the tuna it was exporting to
the United States had in fact been caught in a dolphin-unfriendly manner. Interpreted in this
way, the secondary embargo clearly went beyond what was necessary to prevent
circumvention of the primary embargo through shipment of dolphin-unfriendly tuna
through third countries.

In considering the EU complaint that the measures violated Article XI of the GATT and
could not be saved by any of the exceptions in Article XX, the panel reconsidered the approach
of the Tuna/Dolphin/panel to Article XX. It forcefully rejected the view expressed in Tuna/
Dolphin I that Articles XX(b) and (g) could apply only to save environmental measures taken
to protect the domestic environment. The panel noted that neither the GATT nor ‘general
international law’ prohibits in principle measures related to things or matters located
outside a country’s own territory. Moreover, in addressing itself to the original intent
argument of the Tuna/Dolphin /panel, the Tuna/Dolphin II panel, pursuant to the relevant
Vienna Convention provisions, considered evidence from the travaux preparatoires of the 1947
GATT, coming to the conclusion that it was far from clear that the framers had intended to
exclude global environmental measures from the Ambit of Articles XX(b) and (g).

The Tuna/Dolphin II panel went on, however, to invent a new kind of limit on the scope
of XX(b) and (g). It suggested that the exemptions stated in these paragraphs could not be
applied to measures the sole environmental impact of which is through inducing other
countries to change their policies. The panel stated: ‘If…Article XX were interpreted to
permit Contracting Parties to take trade measures so as to force other Contracting Parties
to change their policies within their jurisdiction, including their conservation policies, the
balance of rights among Contracting Parties, in particular the right of access to markets,
would be seriously impaired’ (para. 5.26). This reasoning seems based on a
misunderstanding of Article XX—this Article does not create or destroy any acquired, legal
rights of Contracting Parties, but rather permits on a case-by-case basis exemptions from
other GATT strictures, if a set of strict criteria are met. In order for Contracting Parties to
have a ‘right’ not to have their market access disrupted by sanctions-type measures even
where such measures could be justified under Article XX, this ‘right’ must be embodied in
a legal rule or norm. No such legal rule or norm exists in the text of the GATT itself. And,
as the ICJ held in the Nicaragua case37 there is no general customary rule of international law
that prohibits economic sanctions.

In dicta, the Tuna/Dolphin II panel took the view that not only the secondary embargo,
but the primary embargo, could not be justified under Article XX, suggesting that it viewed
the environmental impact of the primary embargo as well solely in terms of inducing policy
changes in other countries. This assumption reveals an ignorance of economics. Quite aside
from its impact on policies abroad, the embargo has the direct result of eliminating demand
for dolphin-unfriendly tuna in the US; all things being equal, if fewer dolphin-unfriendly
tuna are demanded, fewer such tuna will be caught, and fewer dolphins will be killed.38
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Thus, there will be an environmental impact, irrespective of any changes to other
countries’ policies. Moreover, apart from whatever impact it might have on the policies of
any foreign government, the primary embargo places incentives on tuna fishers to adopt the
methods necessary to avoid killing excessive quantities of dolphins.

Taxes on Automobiles

In Taxes on Automobiles,39 the European Community challenged, under Article III of the
GATT, taxes and related measures of the United States, some of which were aimed at
reducing air pollution caused by automobile emissions. The ‘gas guzzler’ tax, enacted by
Congress in 1978 and doubled in 1990, was imposed on the sale of automobiles that did not
meet mandated fuel economy requirements. The EC argued that the tax violated the
National Treatment requirement with respect to domestic taxation in Article 111(2). Much
along the lines of the view taken by the panels in Tuna/Dolphin/and II concerning the
National Treatment requirement in Article 111(4), the EC claimed that distinctions based
on other than physical characteristics of a product (in this case its fuel economy) could not
satisfy the National Treatment standard. Thus, domestic automobiles meeting the fuel
economy standard, were for Article III purposes, to be regarded as identical products to
imported automobiles not meeting the standard. In deciding this issue the panel in Taxes on
Automobiles took a very different approach from the Tuna/Dolphin panels. It held that the
distinction in question had a legitimate non-protectionist objective—the conservation of
fossil fuels—and therefore that imported cars that did not meet the standard did not have to
be treated as ‘like products’ to domestic cars that did; distinctions, if non-protectionist, did
not necessarily have to be based on physical characteristics of a product, as long as they
were based on objective criteria related to a genuine non-protectionist policy objective. The
panel also noted that the fuel economy threshold itself had been set at a level such that many
domestic as well as imported vehicles did not meet it at present, therefore suggesting the
scheme had not been designed in a protectionist fashion.

The EC also argued that the Corporate Average Fuel Economy (CAFE) provisions
violated Article III. GAFE stipulated that for purposes of determining whether the vehicle
of a particular manufacturer met the fuel economy threshold, an average would be used that
would allow manufacturers to offset large low-fuel economy vehicles against domestically-
produced small high-fuel economy vehicles (the major policy goal here being to encourage
domestic manufacturers to produce more small cars). The panel held that this measure fell
within Article III (4), which applies to laws, regulations, and requirements, even though it
was related to the taxation measures already discussed. The panel did not see the distinction
in question—between cars whose manufacturers have achieved a given overall level of fuel
economy in their fleets and those that have not—as inherently discriminatory, even though
the distinction did not apply to the individual products as such but rather to the behaviour
of their manufacturers. It did, however, find an element of discrimination, because foreign
manufacturers were less likely to have domestic production against which to offset the
lower fuel economy of their imported products.40 

Clearly, in Taxes on Automobiles the panel did not accept the idea developed in the Tuna/
Dolphin cases that measures on products as such are to be sharply distinguished from other
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measures, such as Production and Process Methods (PPMs). If products can be distinguished
on the basis of how well their manufacturers perform in advancing the objective of fuel
conservation, then they can equally well be distinguished on how well their producers
achieve the equally legitimate policy objective of dolphin conservation. Yet despite the
divergent approaches of these unadopted panels, the trade policy elite has simply accepted
the notion of a sharp divergence between measures on products and PPMs as if such a
distinction had been written into the GATT all along and not simply invented in the Tuna/
Dolphin case.

The matter has been further confused by the introduction into the WTO Technical
Barriers Agreement of the concept of product-related PPMs. Thus in Annex 1 of the TBT
Agreement, a technical regulation is defined as a ‘document that lays down product
characteristics or their related processes and production methods’. Here, the mainstream
interpretation would be that this excludes those PPMs that go to aspects of processes and
production methods that have effects aside from those on physical characteristics of a
product, such as the import ban on dolphin-unfriendly tuna.41 However, the language of the
TBT Agreement simply begs the question of what can, or cannot, be considered a
characteristic of a product. Along the lines of the Taxes on Automobiles panel, we believe that
relevant characteristics must be determined in light of the regulatory context of the measure
in question, and need not be limited to physical characteristics. This is consistent with the
view of the Appellate Body in the Japanese Alcoholic Beverages case, which with respect to the
interpretation of the expression ‘like’ products for purposes of Article 111(2), affirmed the
appropriateness of a case-by-case approach, which may employ criteria for likeness that fit
the particular regulatory context, including criteria both related and unrelated to physical
product characteristics.42 The Appellate Body noted that the concept of ‘like’ products should
be ‘construed narrowly so as not to condemn measures that its strict terms are not meant to
condemn’.43 Of course the structure of Article 111(2) is not the same as that of 111(4), in
that 111(2) requires not only similar treatment of like products but of the more expansive
category of ‘directly competitive’ products. However, this does not render a similar logic
applicable to the interpretation of characteristics of a product for purposes of determining
likeness under Article 111(4).

Reformulated Gasoline

In Reformulated Gasoline,44 Brazil and Venezuela challenged requirements of US
environmental legislation that conventional and reformulated gasoline sold in the United
States conform to a minimum level of ‘cleanness’, set in terms of a 1990 baseline for
emissions. This baseline was determined either on a refinery-specific, ‘individual’ basis, or
on the basis of average 1990 US gasoline quality. Which kind of baseline would apply
depended upon whether an entity was a domestic refiner, importer or foreign refiner.
While individual baselines (with some qualifications) were used for domestic refiners and
importers, calculated on the gasoline actually sold or imported by the entity in question in
1990, foreign refiners were regulated exclusively on the basis of the constructed (average
1990 US quality) baseline. The panel accepted the arguments of Venezuela and Brazil that
this differential treatment constituted a violation of the National Treatment obligation in
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Article 111(4). The panel then considered the US claim that, even if a violation of 111(4),
the differential treatment was justified as a measure ‘necessary’ to protect life and health
under XX(b) or as ‘relating to’ the conservation of natural resources under Article XX(g).
With respect to XX(b), the panel found that the United States had not demonstrated that
the method of calculation imposed on foreign producers was the least-trade-restrictive
means of achieving its environmental objectives. Thus, the panel rejected US arguments
that verification and compliance would be very difficult to execute with respect to
individual baselines for foreign refineries, given the way that gasoline is shipped as a fungible
commodity, and the lack of US regulatory control over foreign refineries. Also, the US
could have achieved its clean air goals equally well by simply applying the statutory or
constructed baseline to both domestic and imported gasoline. In the case of XX(g). While
accepting that clean air was an ‘exhaustible natural resource’ for purposes of this provision,
the panel applied a stringent interpretation of ‘relating to’, much along the lines of the
Herring and Salmon case, as meaning ‘primarily aimed at’. Then, in the manner of Salmon and
Herring Landing Requirements, it viewed this meaning as implying a least-restrictive means
test, and came to the conclusion that the measures in question were not ‘primarily aimed
at’ conservation of exhaustible natural resources because there were many options available
to the United States for attaining the desired air quality without discriminating against
imported gasoline.

Having found that the US measures could satisfy the requirements of neither XX(b) nor
XX(g), the panel considered it unnecessary to examine whether, under the ‘chapeau’, the
measures constituted ‘a disguised restriction on trade’ or ‘a means of arbitrary and
unjustifiable discrimination between countries’.

The Appellate Body rejected the reading of a least-restrictive means test into Article XX
(g), finding that the panel had failed to interpret the provision in question in accordance
with Vienna Convention rules for the interpretation of treaties, which required that the ‘ordinary
meaning’ be given to the words of a treaty. The expressions ‘necessary to’ and ‘relating to’
on their ordinary meaning did not imply the ‘same kind or degree of connection between
the measure under appraisal and the state interest or policy to be promoted or realized’ (p.
17). However, given that none of the Parties in the appeal had challenged the notion that
‘relating to’ implied the idea of being ‘primarily aimed at’ the AB refused explicitly to
overrule the Herring and Salmon panel on this occasion. It did, note, none the less:
“‘primarily aimed at” is not itself treaty language and was not designed as a simple litmus
test for inclusion or exclusion from Article XX(g)’ (p. 18). In any case, the AB—having
rejected a least-restrictive-means approach to XX(g)—found that the measures in question
were indeed, in the relevant sense, primarily aimed at conservation of exhaustible natural
resources: 

The baseline establishment rules, whether individual or statutory, were designed to
permit scrutiny and monitoring of the level of compliance of refiners, importers and
blenders with the ‘non-degradation’ requirements. Without baselines of some kind,
such scrutiny would not be possible and the Gasoline Rule’s objective of stabilizing
and preventing further deterioration of the level of air pollution prevailing in 1990,
would be substantially frustrated (p. 19).
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It is important to note that, unlike the panel, the AB found that in applying XX(g) it was
important to consider whether the measures as a whole, and not simply the otherwise
GATT-illegal (in this case discriminatory) element, are aimed at conservation.

The AB went on, however, to make a very significant finding concerning the importance
of the ‘chapeau’ (preambular paragraph) of Article XX in a determination of whether
otherwise GATT-illegal measures can be justified under the Article. Thus, Article XX
analysis must proceed in two steps: (1) provisional characterization of the measure as falling
within one (or more) of the specific exceptions in paragraphs XX(a)-(j); (2) ‘further
appraisal of the same measure’ under the criteria of the ‘chapeau’ (p. 22).

The AB interpreted the ‘chapeau’ as being aimed at the prevention of protectionist
‘abuse’ of the exceptions in Article XX:

The chapeau is animated by the principle that while the exceptions of Article XX may
be invoked as a matter of legal right, they should not be applied so as to frustrate or
defeat the legal obligations of the holder of the right under the substantive rules of
the General Agreement. If those exceptions are not to be abused or misused, in other
words, the measures falling within the particular exceptions must be applied
reasonably, with due regard both to the legal duties of the party claiming the
exception and the legal rights of the other parties concerned (p. 22).

The AB chose to read the three concepts in the ‘chapeau’ together, such that ‘arbitrary
discrimination’, ‘unjustifiable discrimination’ and ‘disguised restriction’ all went in
interrelated and overlapping ways to the question of whether there was ‘abuse or
illegitimate use’ of the exceptions available in Article XX. It held that the United States had
not explained why its concerns about verification and compliance in the case of foreign
refineries could not be resolved by cooperation with foreign authorities, and that the record
had not included any evidence that the United States had attempted to enter into such
cooperation. Also, in imposing the statutory requirement on imported gasoline, the US had
not attempted to obviate imposing costs on foreign refiners that it had clearly thought
important to relieve in the case of domestic entities. The first omission of the United States,
its nonpursuit of cooperation, showed that the discrimination was ‘unjustified’; the second
omission, a willingness to alleviate certain costs for domestic but not foreign enti-ties,
pointed to a ‘disguised restriction on international trade’. 

The Appellate Body ruling in Reformulated Gasoline is an important advance towards the
development of a principled jurisprudence on environmentally-based trade measures. The
AB found in the text of Article XX itself a mechanism for ensuring that the exceptions in XX
(b) and (g) do not lead to protectionist abuse and therewith pose a threat to the integrity of
the trading system; it therefore pointed to at least one way in which this latter goal could be
furthered without the results-based manipulation involved in the Tuna/Dolphin panels,
where an admittedly genuine concern for the avoidance of abuse and the integrity of the
system led to the invention of legal distinctions without a textual basis, and the resultant
removal of entire classes of measures from possible justification under Article XX. In the
subsequent Turtles case, a WTO panel misapplied (or wilfully ignored) these jurisprudential
advances, producing a decision as defective and disingenuous as the Tuna/Dolphin rulings.
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(As this book went to press, the AB reversed several major elements in the panel’s legal
reasoning, however.)

Turtles

In Turtles,45 several Asian Members challenged a trade embargo pursuant to a domestic US
scheme aimed at preventing shrimp fishing techniques that produce high mortality rates of
sea-turtles, an endangered species included in Annex I of the CITES. The scheme permitted
unrestricted entry into the United States of shrimp from any country, provided that it was
not harvested with technology that endangered sea-turtles. However, where foreign
shrimpers chose to employ methods that could endanger the turtles, the access of their
shrimp to the United States would depend upon the harvesting country having a regulatory
programme similar to that of the United States, aimed at controlling incidental turtle
deaths, or a determination that the harvesting environment of the country was such as not
to pose any concern about incidental sea-turtle deaths. Pursuant to State Department
guidelines, where shrimpers used Turtle Excluding Devices (TED) of the kind required in
the United States, they were eligible to export their shrimp to the United States, even if their
home government did not have in place a regulatory programme requiring the regulation of
shrimping for turtle protection purposes. However, a decision of the US Court of
International Trade interpreted the legislation as requiring that the ban be extended to all
shrimp imported from countries without the requisite regulatory programmes, even if
caught with TEDequipped trawlers.

The complainants, basing their claims on the approach of the Tuna/Dolphin panels,
argued that the ban was a violation of Article XI, even if part of a scheme that imposed
similar turtle conservation methods on US shrimpers. Interestingly, the United States chose
not to ‘dispute” the claim of an Article XI violation; the panel made a finding of Article XI
violation which it said was independent of whether this statement by the US amounted in
legal terms to a concession. The panel came to this conclusion in a summary and unreasoned
fashion, pointing to the word ‘prohibited’ in the legislation, and previous panel reports,
presumably the unadopted Tuna/Dolphin reports. However, the fact that a measure is
worded in terms of a prohibition on trade is in itself no proof that, taken in its overall
regulatory context, it should be regarded as an Article XI measure and not simply a means of
enforcing at the border a domestic regulatory scheme and therefore be considered under
Article III (recall the discussion of Lobsters above). As for previous panel decisions, the
Turtles panel did not even bother to consider whether the treatment of Article III in the
Japanese Alcoholic Beverages and Periodicals cases46 might alter the weight to be attached to the
exclusion of so-called PPMs from consideration as measures on ‘products’ within the
meaning of Article III on grounds that they do not go to physical characteristics of the
products themselves. (Indeed there would be no reason not to give equal weight to the
interpretation of ‘like’ products in the unadopted Taxes on Automobiles panel as to the
invention of PPMs in the also unadopted Tuna/Dolphin panels.)

The most serious defect in the panel ruling, however, is its approach to Article XX.
Apparently relying on the emphasis on the ‘chapeau’ in Article XX in the Reformulated
Gasoline AB decision, the panel held that measures such as the shrimp embargo were as such
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outside of the ambit of Article XX by virtue of the general risk they posed to the integrity of
the multilateral trading order. The panel never even considered whether the measures might
fall within (b) or XX(g), holding them to be simply excluded in light of the overall purpose
and intent disclosed in the ‘chapeau’ of preventing damage to the integrity of the trading
system. According to the panel,

In our view, if an interpretation of the chapeau of Article XX were followed which
would allow a Member to adopt measures conditioning access to its market for a
given product upon the adoption by exporting Members of certain policies, including
conservation policies, GATT 1994 and the WTO Agreement could no longer serve
as a multilateral framework for trade among Members as security and predictability
of trade relations under those Agreements would be threatened. This follows because
if one WTO Member were allowed to adopt such measures, then other Members
would also have the right to adopt similar measures on the same subject but with
differing, or even conflicting, policy requirements. Indeed, as each of these
requirements would necessitate the adoption of a policy applicable not only to
export production... but also domestic production, it would be impossible for a
country to adopt one of those policies without the risk of breaching other Members’
conflicting policy requirements for the same product and being refused access to
these other markets (para. 7.44).

In this discussion, we can only briefly note the numerous jurisprudential errors that the
Panel made in its approach to Article XX. First of all, whereas the AB in Reformulated
Gasoline had stated that the application of Article XX is a two-step process, involving first of
all a determination of whether the measures fall within a particular exception, and second,
whether they meet the criteria in the chapeau, the panel instead began with the chapeau and
never in fact got to the issue of whether the measures fell within XX(b) or (g). Second, and
relatedly, in Reformulated Gasoline, the AB had distinguished between the first step, the
determination of whether a measure falls within a particular exception, and the second step,
that of ascertaining whether the manner of application (p. 22) of measures is reasonable or
abusive; the panel in Turtles, however, got this backwards—it invoked the chapeau not to
examine the manner of application of the US measures, but rather to exclude an entire
general class of measures from Article XX justification altogether. Fourth, in Reformulated
Gasoline and also in Japanese Alcoholic Beverages and Beef Hormones, the AB underlined that a
purposive interpretation of an agreement as a whole cannot be a basis for ignoring or not
applying its explicit language to the case at hand. Yet the Turtles panel used an emphasis on
general purposes to ignore the actual legal tests in the chapeau with respect to ‘arbitrary’
and ‘unjustified’ discrimination and ‘disguised restriction of international trade’. In
suggesting that measures that discriminate on the basis of the country of origin of products
are inherently unjustifiable under Article XX given the purposes of the Article and the
GATT as a whole, the panel essentially rendered meaningless the words ‘arbitrary’ and
‘unjustifiable’. If it had been the intent to render all measures that discriminate ‘between
countries where the same conditions prevail’ unsustainable under Article XX, then the
qualifiers ‘arbitrary’ and ‘unjustifiable’ would have been entirely superfluous. Indeed, the
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panel’s approach also has the implication of rendering the language ‘where the same
conditions prevail’ superfluous, as it suggests that, on the basis of general purposes of the
GATT, measures may not be justified under Article XX regardless of any consideration as to
whether the discrimination is in fact due to the same conditions not prevailing in the
Members subject to differential treatment (as the US claimed in this case). As the AB held in
Reformulated Gasoline, ‘interpretation must give meaning and effect to all the terms of a
treaty. An interpreter is not free to adopt a reading that would result in reducing whole
clauses or paragraphs of a treaty to a nullity’ (p. 23).

Further, there is nothing in the chapeau that suggests the notion that an entire class of
measures is simply excluded from possible justification under Article XX, regardless of
whether, in the particular case at hand, they are found to constitute ‘arbitrary’ or
‘unjustified discrimination’ or a ‘disguised restriction on international trade’. In fact, far
from viewing Article XX as operating to exclude in principle general classes of measures, in
Reformulated Gasoline, the AB made the significant observation that ‘The relationship
between the affirmative commitments set out in, e.g., Articles I, III, and XI can be given
meaning within the framework of the General Agreement and its object and purpose by a
treaty interpreter only on a case-to-case basis, by careful scrutiny of the factual and legal
context in a given dispute, without disregarding the words actually used by the WTO
Members to express their intent and purpose’ (p. 18). The Turtles panel did just the
opposite: it failed to apply the words of the ‘chapeau’, while at the same time substituting a
case-specific analysis with the judgment that ‘we must determine not only whether the
measure on its own undermines the WTO multilateral trading system, but also whether such
type of measure, if it were to be adopted by other Members, would threaten the security
and predictability of the multilateral trading system’ (para. 7.43). 

This approach, aside from ignoring the characterization of Article XX analysis as a case-
by-case determination, applying the specific wording of the Article including the ‘chapeau’
may actually be in serious tension with the role of a panel under the Dispute Settlement
Understanding. As the AB emphasized in Japanese Alcoholic Beverages, whatever the
precedential value panel rulings may have in subsequent disputes, the central role of the
panel is to decide the dispute between the Parties, not to establish an ‘authoritative
interpretation’ of the GATT; in considering whether other, similar measures adopted by
other Members not Parties to the dispute would threaten the integrity of the multilateral
trading system, the Turtles panel purported to affect the future legal rights and obligations of
other Members in respect of measures, which were not only not the subject of a complaint
pur-suant to the DSU, but largely not yet in existence.

Despite all these errors, it is important also to consider the central claim of the panel that
measures such as the shrimp embargo do in fact have the impact of imposing conflicting
requirements of a kind inherently in tension with the multilateral trading order. The notion
that the shrimp regime would result in conflicting requirements seems far-fetched—this
would only be the case if foreign shrimpers were required by some other legal system to use
a technology that actually did result in harm to turtles, or were prohibited from using
devices aimed at conserving them
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This being said, there is a sense in which the possibility of conflicting requirements is
inherent in the balance between guarantees of market access and respect for regulatory
diversity embodied in the existing multilateral trading system.

While intended to encourage increasing use of and compliance with international
standards, the Technical Barriers Agreement and the SPS Agreement clearly affirm the right
of Members to maintain differential levels of protection, including for environmental
purposes, subject to various justificatory requirements. This deference to diverse regulatory
approaches entails the possibility that a producer in country A will find themselves having to
satisfy quite different technical regulations when exporting to country B than domestically,
and even as between country B and country C to which they may also be exporting. The
need to satisfy multiple and diverse requirements imposed by different Members
undoubtedly imposes a cost on Members seeking to exercise their trading rights in these
circumstances, but this is a necessary cost if regulatory diversity is to be preserved to the
extent permitted under the current multilateral system. It is simply arbitrary to associate
this kind of cost with measures aimed at protecting the global environment, rather than a
Member’s domestic environment, or measures that go to processes and production
methods, as opposed to physical characteristics of products.

Of course, if one were to properly apply the chapeau, i.e. in accordance with the
approach in Reformulated Gasoline, discrimination on the basis of processes or production
methods might still be found ‘unjustifiable’, if in the circumstances it was not apparently
necessary in order to achieve the environmental objectives in question. Thus, for example,
if foreign shrimpers had found a technology other than TEDs that produced as good or
better an environmental performance, and yet use of TEDs remained a precondition for
exemption from the ban, then the PPM in question might well constitute ‘unjustified
discrimination’. If the TED requirement also favoured shrimpers in the United States, who
had already adopted this particular technology due to domestic requirements, then it could
be considered as well ‘a disguised restriction on international trade’. This is one illustration
of why the appropriate route to preventing abuse of Article XX that threatens the
multilateral trading system is through careful case-by-case application of its language, not
through arbitrary and textually unfounded distinctions between entire classes of measures,
as were drawn in the Tuna/Dolphin rulings and, now, in the Turtle ruling as well. In Turtles,
upon appeal, the AB rejected the panel’s approach to the chapeau as inconsistent with the
two-step test in Reformulated Gasoline. The AB made the important ruling that ‘[i]t is not
necessary to assume that requiring from exporting countries compliance with, or adopting
certain policies (although covered in principle by one or other of the exceptions) prescribed
by the importing country, renders a measure a priori incapable of justification under Article
XX. Such an interpretation renders most, if not all, of the specific exceptions of Article XX
inutile, a result abhorrent to the principles we are bound to apply’ (para. 121). The AB
found the US scheme justified under Art. XX(9), but held there were elements of
unjustified and arbitrary discrimination in the manner in which it was applied. For instance
the US had not made the same offer for a negotiated agreement to the appellees as it had
made to some other countries, and had only allowed imports where countries had adopted
policies identical to those of the US, regardless of their different circumstances. (The scheme
itself allowed flexibility in this regard.)
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The WTO Trade and Environment Committee

It was in part dissatisfaction with the pre-Uruguay Round treatment of trade and
environment issues in dispute settlement that led to insistence by some Members,
particularly the United States, that trade and environment be recognized as an official part of
the WTO agenda. This resulted in the Marrakesh Decision on Trade and Environment,
directing the establishment of a WTO Trade and Environment Committee. The Committee
is charged with examining, inter alia, trade measures for environmental purposes including
those taken pursuant to multilateral agreements, the relationship between multilateral
trading norms and environmental taxes and charges, ecolabelling, and exports of
domestically prohibited goods. In its first two years of work, a number of promising
proposals were put before the Committee, including several (by the EC, New Zealand, and
Switzerland) that relate to the negotiation of an Understanding that would clarify the
relationship of the GATT Article XX to trade measures taken pursuant to the multilateral
environmental agreements. The EC proposal, in its most far-reaching form, is for an
Understanding that would explicitly permit under Article XX measures taken pursuant to a
multilateral environmental agreement, either where specifcally mandated by the agreement
or where otherwise necessary to protect the environment, provided the criteria in the
‘chapeau’ of Article XX are met. ‘The WTO would not judge the legitimacy of the
environmental objectives or the necessity of the mea sures taken to achieve these objective
because the multilateral character of the trade measures would be the best guarantee against
abuse’47 provided that the multilateral agreement was ‘open to participation by all parties
concerned with the environmental objectives of the MEA, and reflected through adequate
participation, their interests, including significant trade and economic interests’. Another
proposal, by New Zealand, would explicitly legalize measures taken pursuant to a
multilateral environmental agreement against parties to the agreement, even when not
specifically mandated by the text, as well as mandated measures against non-parties
provided the agreement reflected a genuine multilateral consensus. A WTO panel would
determine the existence of such a consensus on the basis of the fol-lowing conditions:’ (i)
negotiation of and participation in an MEA to be open on equitable terms to all interested
countries; (ii) broad participation of interested countries in both geographical terms and
representing varying levels of development; and (iii) adequate representation of consumer
and producer nations of the products covered by the MEA.’48 In addition, the trade
measures would have to meet a proportionality and least-restrictive means test.

Proposals of this kind, and on other issues that are controversial (such as ecola-belling), have
failed to advance beyond the discussion stage in the Trade and Environment Committee, a
reflection of basic lack of consensus within the Committee.

Managing the risks of environmental protectionism

To us, this lack of consensus is hardly surprising, given the incoherence of the jurisprudence
and the lack of analytical clarity in much of the general debate on trade and environment.
As we have seen, the panels merely assert that global envi-ronment-based trade measures
are in tension with liberal trade policy, without any kind of analytical inquiry into the
grounds or welfare effects of such measures. However important it is to point out the
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defects in the jurisprudence in these cases, the future treatment of global environmental
measures in international trade law and policy can only be adequately debated on the basis of
an analytical enquiry into the rationales and costs and benefits, both domestic and global, of
environmentally-based trade measures.

The question is whether there is some reason, intrinsic to the GATT, for viewing
preferences for protection of one’s domestic environment as a superior justification for
limits on GATT strictures to preferences for global environmental protection.

In understanding this issue, it is crucial to draw a distinction between claims that trade
measures should be used to attain a specific non-trade goal or vindicate a specific non-trade
value, and arguments for a ‘level’ competitive playing field, evening the odds, or establishing
‘fair’ rules of the game that are internal to the trading system. The first kind of claim relates
to the measures such as the trade sanctions at issue in cases like Tuna/Dolphin; the second
produces demands for countervailing duty-type measures aimed at protecting domestic
producers against the supposed advantage that foreigner producers possess due to lower
environmental standards in their home countries.

Environmentally-based trade sanctions

With respect to the first kind of claim, there are important and legitimate policy rationales
for why countries may have to intervene with respect to the policies and practices of other
countries that affect the environment. These are:

Externalities

In certain circumstances, a country may be able to externalize some of the environmental
costs of economic activity within its borders to the nationals of other countries. The classic
example is pollution which flows from country A into the territory of country B through
common air or water bodies. These spillovers can be of major significance—for example, a
significant portion of the acid rain that affects Canada can be attributed to emissions in the
United States.

The global environmental commons

The commons may be defined as ‘physical or biological systems that lie wholly or largely
outside the jurisdiction of any of the individual members of society but that are valued
resources for many members of society. International commons of current interest include
Antarctica, the high seas, deep seabed minerals, the electromagnetic spectrum, the
geostationary orbit, the stratospheric ozone layer, the global climate system and outer
space.’49 Protection of endangered species might be added to this list. Where unconstrained
and uncoordinated, exploitation of these physical and biological systems by nationals of each
individual jurisdiction may produce what is widely referred to as the ‘tragedy of the
commons’.50
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Shared natural resources

‘Shared natural resources are physical or biological systems that extend into or across the
jurisdictions of two or more members of international society. They may involve non-
renewable resources (for example, pools of oil that underlie areas subject to the jurisdiction
of adjacent or opposite states), renewable resources (for example, straddling stocks of fish
or migratory stocks of wild animals), or complex ecosystems that transcend the boundaries
of national jurisdiction.’51 Property rights to these shared resources cannot easily be
assigned on a purely territorial basis, and therefore each sharing state has an interest in the
practices and policies of each other sharing state with respect to these resources.

There is not much evidence on the effectiveness of environmental trade sanctions in
particular, to achieve these rationales; however empirical work has been undertaken with a
view to measuring the impact of economic sanctions more generally on state behaviour. To
our knowledge, the most comprehensive work on this ques tion remains the study by
Hufbauer, Schott and Elliott,52 which examines 115 instances of the use of economic
sanctions over a period of about 40 years. The authors conclude that these sanctions had an
overall success rate of about 34% in achieving an alteration of the conduct of the targeting
country in the desired direction.53 Not surprisingly, they found sanctions were more likely
to succeed in changing behaviour where the policy changes in question were relatively
modest, and where the sanctions-imposing country was larger and more powerful than the
targeted country.54 Another important observation in this study is that sanctions are least
likely to succeed against intransigent, hostile regimes as opposed to countries that are
relatively friendly to the sanctions-imposing state.

Relative to many of the sanctions studied by Hufbauer, Schott and Elliott, most
environmental trade sanctions would certainly count as aimed at only modest policy
changes,55 in comparison with sanctions that seek to topple an entire regime, or the removal
of a pervasive form of social ordering (e.g. apartheid in South Africa). Moreover, Hufbauer,
Schott and Elliott’s general observations on the importance of the relative size of the
sanction-imposing and the targeted country, and about friends and enemies, seem
consonant with recent evidence about the effectiveness of some environmental and labour
rights sanctions. The threat of trade sanctions by the United States has, for instance, been
credited with altering fishing practices that harmed endangered species in countries such as
Japan, South Korea, Chile, Taiwan and Peru—all of which could be described as relatively
‘friendly’ states from the US point of view, and all (with the possible exception of Japan)
significantly smaller and less powerful than the US.56 By contrast, US threats to deny MFN
status to China, a totalitarian quasi-superpower with a hostile ideological system, has made
little impact in terms of human rights, including labour rights compliance.

Overall, the evidence suggests that trade sanctions are of limited but real effectiveness,
and in this respect they are no different from other, more extreme forms of coercive action
such as military force where the record of effectiveness is also extremely mixed (e.g.
Lebanon, Bosnia, Somalia, Rwanda, Haiti and Vietnam). On the other hand, a systematic
strategy of isolationism, appeasement, or acquiescence would largely resign us to accept
grotesque human rights abuses or indeed attempted genocide without external opposition.

An issue closely related to the effectiveness of economic sanctions is the relative
desirability of sanctions as opposed to other instruments for influencing the behaviour of
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other countries and their producers. For instance, the GATT Secretariat advocated the use
of financial inducements as an alternative means to sanctions for influencing countries to
adopt higher environmental standards.57 This proposal has the virtue of attaching a price to
the invocation of such sanctions and thus providing some assurance that these higher
standards are truly valued for their own sake in the country desiring the changes, especially
in cases of ostensible ad hoc paternalism or altruism, while trade sanctions, lacking such an
explicit price (beyond price effects on consumers), may be easily subverted by
protectionists. Chang argues, however, that subsidies, as opposed to sanctions, create a
perverse incentive for foreign countries to engage in, or intensify, the offensive behaviour
(or make credible threats to this effect) in order to maximize the payments being offered.58

A recent study of the effects of both carrots and sticks on political change in South Africa
supports Chang’s scepticism about carrots; it concludes that ‘political strategies that rely on
inducements rather than commands are limited in what they can accomplish’.59 Moreover,
in cases of transboundary externalities, the global environmental commons, and shared
natural resources (in contrast to exchanges of tariff concessions), a principle that victims (or
their supporters) should always pay (‘bribe’) violators to achieve compliance would seem
impossible to defend either ethically or politically. However, in some cases financial
assistance to enable poor Third World countries to meet higher environmental standards
may be warranted on distributive justice grounds.

Another alternative60 to trade restrictions is environmental labelling (so called
ecolabelling), which allows individuals as consumers to express their moral preferences for
environmental protection.61 Products that are produced in a manner that meets a given set
of environmental standards would be entitled to bear a distinctive logo or statement that
informs consumers of this fact. While labelling may enable individual consumers to avoid
the moral ‘taint’ of consuming the product in question themselves, if most consumers have
a preference for terminating production altogether (rather than merely reducing
consumption and production) by changing a foreign country’s domestic policies, then a
collective action problem arises as in any approach to influencing behaviour that depends
upon coordinating action among large numbers of agents. Unless she can be sure that most
other consumers will do likewise, the individual consumer may well not consider it rational
to avoid buying the product in question.62

In sum, neither financial inducements nor labelling programmes are self-evi-dently
superior policy instruments to sanctions for influencing other countries’ environmental
practices. Each has its own drawbacks. However, it must be admitted that little concrete
empirical evidence exists that would allow a rigorous comparison of these alternative
instruments with sanctions. In addition, the greatest effectiveness might actually be achieved
by a combination of more than one of these instruments. Again, in the absence of empirical
work, it is difficult to make out a clear-cut case for excluding the use of trade sanctions as an
instrument for influencing.

Competitiveness-based environmental trade measures

Unlike the arguments for trade restrictions on environmental grounds that we have been
discussing up to this point, which have a normative reference point external to the trading
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system itself, competitiveness-based ‘fair-trade’ claims focus largely on the effects on
domestic producers and workers of other countries’ environmental policies and not per se on
the effects of those policies on the environment and on workers elsewhere.
Competitiveness claims are, in principle, indifferent to the improvement of environmental
practices in other countries. Hence, in the case of competitiveness claims, trade measures
that protect the domestic market or ‘equalize’ comparative advantage related to
environmental standards are a completely acceptable substitute for other countries raising
their standards.

Competitiveness claims usually refer to one of two kinds of supposed unfairness (and, it
is often argued as well, welfare losses) that stem from trade competition with countries that
have lower environmental standards:

1 It is unfair (and/or inefficient) that our own firms and workers should bear the ‘costs’
of higher environmental standards through loss of market share to for-eign producers
who have lower costs due to laxer environmental standards in their own country.

2 It is unfair that downward pressure should be placed on our own environmental standards
through trading with countries that have lower standards.

Both these arguments are, in our view, largely incoherent and in fact in tension with the
basic theory of comparative advantage in trade. Assuming there is nothing wrongful with
another country’s environmental policies along the lines discussed in the first part of this
chapter, then why should a cost advantage attributable to these divergent policies not be
treated like any other cost advantage, i.e. as part and parcel of comparative advantage? In
fact, even if all countries had the same level of environmental consciousness, or even the
same general environmental standards, approaches to instrument choice as well as the
choice of risks on which to concentrate would still differ widely, due to differing climatic
and other geographical or demographic conditions. For these reasons, even in a world
where all citizens shared the same environmental preferences, environmental laws and
regulations would still be likely to differ substantially between countries, and even where
they were the same, the costs to industry of complying with those laws and regulations
would still likely differ substantially from country to country.

Precisely because the implicit benchmark of fairness is so illusory, i.e. a world where
governmentally-imposed environmental protection costs are completely equalized among
producers of like products in all countries, trade measures based upon this kind of fairness
claim are likely to be highly manipulable by protectionist interests. Since, of course,
protectionists are really interested in obtaining trade protection, not in promoting
environmental standards, the fact that the competitive fairness claim in question does not
generate a viable and principled benchmark for alteration of other countries’ policies is a
strength not a weakness—for it virtually guarantees that justifications for protection will
always be available, even if the targeted country improves its environmental standards.

As for the argument concerning downward pressure on one’s own standards, shifting the
competitiveness costs of these standards to workers in other countries seems distributively
perverse. No matter how high an intrinsic or instrumentalist value we may wish to put on
high environmental standards in our own country, there is simply an unsupportable leap of
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logic in the conclusion that someone else should be paying the price for them. First of all,
workers in other countries do not even usually directly benefit from these higher standards,
whereas workers in one’s own country do. Second, most competitiveness-based fair trade
claims are targeted against countries which are poorer than the trade-restricting country,
often with lower per capita incomes, higher levels of unemployment, and weaker social
welfare nets (in some instances, the revenue from trading products may be essential to
obtaining foreign exchange to buy essential goods such as medicines and foods). Moreover,
we do not believe that, generally speaking, lowering environmental standards is an
appropriate response to competitive pressures. There is, in fact, a wide range of
alternatives, such as better regulation which reduces compliance costs without lowering
standards63 and investment in technologies that are likely to reduce the costs of compliance
with environmental standards.

Of course, it is arguable (although there is not much hard empirical evidence on the
matter) that governments and/or firms are in fact responding by lowering standards, rather
than through these arguably superior policy alternatives. However, these sub-optimal policy
responses surely represent a political and social problem within countries that are lowering
standards in response to competitive pressures. Again, it seems hardly fair that workers (or
firms for that matter) in other countries should bear the burden of avoiding choices in
another country that are ultimately attributable to a flawed policy process in that country.

A variation of the claim about the effect of competitiveness pressures on domestic
environmental standards suggests the possibility of a form of beggar-thy-neighbour
behaviour that may, admittedly, leave all countries worse off. This is the ‘race to the
bottom’, whereby countries competitively lower their environmental standards in an effort
to capture a relatively greater share of a fixed volume of trade or investment.64 Much like
the beggar-thy-neighbour subsidies wars that characterized agricultural trade among the
Canada, the US and the EU and other countries during the 1980s, it is not difficult, using
the model of a Prisoner’s Dilemma game, to show that competitive reduction in
environmental standards will typically result in a negative sum outcome,65 as long as one
assumes that before entering the race each country’s environmental standards represent an
optimal domestic policy outcome for that country.

The ‘race to the bottom’ claim has a different normative basis from the other
competitiveness-based claims discussed above. Those claims relate to the proper
distribution of the competitiveness costs of maintaining higher environmental standards than
one’s trading partners. The normative basis for concern over the race to the bottom, by
contrast, sounds in the language of efficiency: the race ends, literally, at the bottom, with
each country adopting sub-optimal domestic policies, but no country in the end capturing a
larger share of the gains from trade.

Frequently, beggar-thy-neighbour regulatory competition is able to flourish much more
easily where it is possible to reduce on a selective basis environmental standards to attract a
particular investment or support a particular industry or firm. It is more difficult and more
costly to engage in these activities where the formal statutory framework of environmental
regulation must be altered across-the-board.

Accepting, however, that cooperation is the ultimate solution to the ‘race to the
bottom’, a further difficult question remains as to the appropriateness of trade restrictions
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as a sanction to induce a cooperative outcome. Here, there is important further work to be
done in applying the insights of game theory to beggar-thy-neighbour trade conflicts such
as, for instance, the agricultural subsidies wars: did trade retaliation facilitate or frustrate a
cooperative solution, i.e. the Uruguay Round Agreement on Agriculture? The role of
unilateral sanctions in inducing rules-based, cooperative solutions to conflict is a complex
one. Sophisticated advocates of unilateralism or aggressive reciprocity, such as Laura
Tyson66 and Carolyn Rhodes,67 argue for trade measures as a means of inducing a rules-
based cooperative equilibrium, not as a long-term strategy of non-cooperative behaviour.
The problem, as has been articulated by Bhagwati and others, is that these trade restrictions
usually constitute deviations from existing cooperative outcomes (pre-existing multilateral rules).
Therefore, depending on one’s standpoint such restrictions may resemble cheating on an
existing cooperative equilibrium, rather than inducement to create a new one. One
response of the unilateralists and reciprocitarians might be that the ‘race to the bottom’ or
‘beggar-thy-neighbour’ conduct of one’s trading partners has, in fact, already put in danger
the pre-existing cooperative equilibrium, and that no return to a rules-based approach is
possible unless new rules are adopted to deal with the ‘race to the bottom’. However, free
traders might well respond that an approach to inducing a new equilibrium based upon the
use of technically illegal trade measures as a sanction to bring about negotiation of new rules
is likely to undermine countries’ overall confidence in the rule of law, and therefore
actually to complicate the future prospects for rules-based solutions to trade conflict.

In the GATT, there is arguably already a kind of implicit response to this dilemma, to be
found in the concept of non-violation nullification and impairment in Article XXIII. In some
circumstances, a GATT panel may find that a Contracting Party’s practices, even if not in
technical violation of the General Agreement, nevertheless undermine reasonable
expectations of another Party as to the benefit that it would receive from GATT
concessions. In this situation, trade sanctions may ultimately be authorized, even if the
targeted country did not engage in a technical violation of the GATT rules. Where a
Contracting Party views the ‘beggar-thy-neighbour’ but technically GATT-legal conduct of
another Party as undermining the existing cooperative equilibrium of GATT rules and
concessions, it may seek GATT approval of ultimate recourse to unilateral trade measures
through making a case that non-violation nullification or impairment has occurred. This
procedure prevents each Party being judge in its own cause, and thereby obviates the
consequent potentially negative implications for overall confidence in the rule of law.
Through this means, trade sanctions or the threat of sanctions, may be used as a legitimate
instrument for inducing one’s trading partners to bargain towards new or reformed rules to
end a ‘race to the bottom’. Thus, even where it could be shown that trade restrictions are
appropriate as a means of inducing a cooperative solution, we do not see a justification for
taking such measures outside the existing jurisprudential framework of the WTO, or for
making the framework more amenable to unilateral actions in which Members are judges in
their own cause as to whether the existing cooperative equilibrium has been undermined by
purported ‘beggar-thy-neighbour’ conduct of other Members.
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The ‘systemic threat’ argument

Even in the presence of indeterminate welfare effects, free traders might still reject
environmental trade measures on the basis that such measures, if widely permitted or
entertained, would significantly erode the coherence and sustainability of rule-based liberal
trade. We ourselves, in earlier chapters, have argued that competitiveness-based or level
playing field ‘fair trade’ measures, such as countervailing and antidumping duties, already
pose such a threat. This is based on the notion that the legal order of international trade is
best understood as a set of rules and norms aimed at sustaining a long-term cooperative
equilibrium, in the face of on-going pressures to cheat on this equilibrium, given that the
short-term political pay-offs from cheating may be quite high (depending, of course, on the
character and influence of protectionist interests within a particular country, the availability
of alternative policies to deal with adjustment costs etc.).68 In the presence of fundamental
normative dissensus as to what constitutes ‘cheating’ on the one hand, and the punishment
of others’ cheating on the other, confidence in the rules themselves could be fundamentally
undermined, and the system destabilized.

With respect to the systemic threat from environmental trade measures, it is important
to distinguish between purely unilateral measures, and those that have a multilateral
dimension. The former measures are based upon an environmental or labour-rights concern
or norm that is specific to the sanctioning country or countries. Here, there is a real risk of
dissolving a clear distinction between protectionist ‘cheating’ and genuine sanctions to
further non-trade values—the sanctioning country may well be able to define or redefine its
environmental causes so as to serve protectionist interests. Measures with a multilateral
dimension, by contrast, will be based upon the targeted country’s violation of some
multilateral or internationally recognized norm, principle, or agreement—for instance, a
provision in an accord to protect endangered species. These norms, principles, or
agreements are typically not the product of protectionist forces in particular countries, nor
are they easily captured by such forces (although the example of the Multi-Fibre
Arrangement suggests that this is not invariably the case). It is a similar logic that informs
the favourable view of technical requirements based on international standards in the WTO
Technical Barriers Code.

It should be possible to build into Article XX of the GATT a series of limits or criteria
that are likely to minimize the protectionist abuse of environmental rights69 trade sanctions,
and the corresponding risk of a loss of coherence and integrity in the GATT legal
framework. In developing such criteria, we believe it is important to distinguish four
contexts in which environmental trade sanctions may be employed: (1) where trade
measures are explicitly contemplated in an international treaty that establishes
environmental standards; (2) where trade measures are not contemplated in the treaty or
agreement, but where an independent body, such as a supranational dispute settlement
panel, commission, or monitoring authority, has found the targeted country in violation of
international environmental stan dards; (3) where the sanctions-imposing country or
countries themselves have determined that the targeted country is in violation of an
international norm or standard, in the absence of an independent ruling by a neutral third-
party (e.g. international institution); (4) where the sanctions-imposing country merely
asserts a norm or standard of environmental protection as appropriate, in the absence of an
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internationally recognized norm or standard. Obviously, trade sanctions involved to
promote environmental protection are much more readily justified in categories (1) and (2)
than categories (3) and (4).

We now consider how an Article XX analysis in dispute settlement might adequately
address the ‘systemic threat’ potentially present in the use of each of these classes of
measures.

Earlier in this chapter, we alluded to the existence of international environmental
agreements that explicitly provide for trade restrictions as a means of enforcing the
agreement or of achieving its environmental objectives. The most obvious example is the
CITES Convention,70 restricting trade in endangered species. Lucrative export markets are
often a major incentive for hunters to violate domestic regulations with respect to the
protection of endangered species. Domestic monitoring and enforcement of limits or
prohibitions on the killing of such species are often of limited effectiveness. Effective border
measures may well be an attractive alternative or supplement.71 Here, the environmental
agreement itself embodies an explicit choice for trade restrictions as an instrument of
environmental regulation (not merely a sanction). The agreement does not merely permit,
but requires such restrictions. Such is the case, as well, with the Basel Hazardous Wastes
Convention and the Nuclear Non-Proliferation Treaty.

In these kinds of instances, trade measures taken against signatories of the international
environmental agreement posed no real legal issue for the GATT 1947, since most such
agreements came into force subsequent to the relevant GATT provisions. This is due to the
public international law principle that, in the event of a conflict, the provisions of a later
treaty take precedence over those of an earlier one.72 However, the GATT 1994 is legally
distinct from the GATT 1947,73 and therefore for purposes of the relevant Vienna Convention
provisions, most of these environmental agreements would no longer be treaties later in
time with respect to the GATT 1947 obligations incorporated into the GATT 1994. Hudec
suggests, that none the less, as between signatories of both the GATT 1994 and the
environmental agreements, the latter may take precedence on lex specialis grounds:
‘environmental agreeements are clearly more specific than GATT in terms of their subject
matter. Under the principle of lex specialis, it is normally presumed that the more specific of
two agreements is meant to control, even when the more general agreement happens to be
later in time.'74 However, the concept of lex specialis more ordinarily applies where the
more specific agreement is an elaboration of the more general one, rather than in the case
of two independent legal regimes.

With respect to trade measures taken against non-signatories of the environmental
agreement who are Members of GATT/WTO, a legal issue does arise. Even if the
Members are non-signatories of the environmental agreement, we see no compelling reason
why such measures should not be justified under Article XX. There is a lesser risk of
countries actually negotiating international environmental agreements for the purpose of
cheating on their trade commitments, and so here the concern with protectionist ‘cheating’
does not justify particularly rigorous scrutiny of the trade measures in question. As well, the
trade measures are closely bound up with the structure and purpose of the agreements
themselves; the closeness of the interrelationship will, in these instances, often reflect
important rationales for choosing trade controls as an environmental instrument, thereby
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addressing the concern that trade not be unnecessarily or gratuitously restricted for
environmental purposes. There is a more general international law issue of whether the use
of trade measures against a country based on an agreement that it has not signed represents
an unwarranted interference with that state’s sovereignty. However, the bounds of state
sovereignty (and the very meaning of the concept) are in flux in a number of areas of
international law.75

Even where an international environmental agreement or an international legal norm
does not justify or require trade measures for its enforcement, a country may decide to use
trade measures as a sanction against another country or countries that it deems in violation
of the agreement or norm. Here, serious risks of cheating on trade liberalization
commitments do in fact exist. This is especially true where trade measures are imposed
based on a unilateral determination that some relatively general or even controversial norm
of international environmental law has been violated. As well, there is a genuine concern
that trade restrictions do not become the instrument of choice for dealing with disputes
about international environmental law, just because they constitute a relatively easy and
certainly in many instances a visceral response to such disputes. For both these reasons, such
measures should only be exempted from GATT strictures where they pass a rigorous
‘screen’ for protectionism. As discussed above, in Reformulated Gasoline and Turtles the
Appellate Body determined that, with respect to how a scheme is applied, the appropriate
vehicle for such scrutiny was the ‘chapeau’ or Article XX, with the Member invoking
Article XX having the burden showing that the application of the measure in question does
not constitute ‘arbitrary’ or ‘unjustifiable’ discrimination, or a ‘disguised restriction on
international trade’.76 In addition, under Art. XX(b), measures must be ‘necessary’, which
has been interpreted to mean the least trade-restrictive available to achieve the goal in
question. Art. XX(g) has its own ‘screen’ for protectionism—the measures must have been
taken in conjunction with constraints on domestic production or consumption. Under XX
(b), it will be important to enquire whether alternative avenues of dispute settlement exist,
either under international agreements or within international environmental institutions,
whether an attempt has been made to resolve the disagreement through consultations or
arbitration aided by international environmental institutions, and whether it is the view of
international environmental institutions or authorities77 that a violation of an international
agreement or norm has, indeed, occurred. To facilitate a determination on this last point,
panels should bear in mind Article 13.2 of the Dispute Settlement Understanding, which
gives panels the right to consult experts, and obtain ‘an advisory report in writing from an
expert review group’. This clearly permits consultation with international environmental
institutions or authorities. While such consultation should generally concern factual issues,
with respect to the determination of whether a measure constitutes a disguished restriction
on international trade, whether in truth an international norm or environmental agreement
has been violated is a factual issue, which goes to the probability that the trade measure
constitutes protectionism as opposed to legitimate (albeit unilateral) enforcement of
environmental norms.

A final case is that of trade measures that are taken against a country in the absence of any
alleged violation of an international agreement or norm, merely on the basis that the
citizens of the country in question find the environmental practices or policies of the
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affected state to be repugnant and/or they seek to change those policies. Here, trade
measures are being used in the first instance as sanctions to support the domestic values of
the trade-restricting state. Since there is no external benchmark of any kind to assist in
distinguishing, on an objective basis, these sanctions from disguised ‘cheating’ on trade
liberalization commitments, the scrutiny of these measures should entail special vigilance in
the application of the least-restrictive means test. There are a number of factors that a
dispute panel should consider in determining whether an environmental exemption from
GATT strictures is warranted. Foremost among these is why a multilateral approach has not
succeeded in the evolution of international agreements or norms. Have attempts at
international cooperation been defeated by free-rider problems? Is the state against which
the trade restricting measures are directed a hold-out that is frustrating bona fide attempts
by other states, including the trade-restricting state, to secure a multilateral solution? Here
it is important to consider the extent to which the non-adherence of some states to a
multilateral approach will undermine the efforts of others to address a global environmental
problem.78 A second factor that should, arguably, always be taken into account is whether
the trade-restricting state has exhausted all avenues of bilateral negotiation and cooperation
as a solution to the problem. In the Reformulated Gasoline case, it will be recalled, the
Appellate Body considered that the enforcement and verification issues that the US had cited
in justification of not permitting foreign refiners to use individual baselines could have been
solved by cooperation with authorities of gasoline-exporting states, and it viewed the measure
in question as unjustifiable discrimination in large part because the US had not made a
serious attempt at a solution based on cooperation, or had not shown evidence of such an
attempt. Of course, it is fundamental to a determination as to whether all reasonable efforts
have been made for an international cooperative solution—either bilateral or multilateral—
to know whether the trade restricting state’s term for such a settlement are themselves
reasonable. This goes to one of the main concerns of developing countries with respect to
international environmental law—the costs to these countries of international solutions to
global environmental problems. Here (as the AB would suggest in Turtles), international
environmental agreements that contain obligations that are variable according to the
circumstances of individual countries79 may provide a benchmark for determining the
reasonableness of the terms on offer for a cooperative solution. This is certainly a matter on
which it would be appropriate for a GATT/WTO dispute panel to seek an advisory opinion
from international environmental institutions and authorities, as well as international
institutions and authorities concerned with the situation of developing countries. In some
circumstances, a reasonable offer for a cooperative solution may be deemed to include
economic assistance to defray some of the costs of implementing domestically such a
solution. Again, to return to the AB ruling in Reformulated Gasoline, where a measure
imposes differentially greater costs on foreign producers, and the Member taking the
measure has not made reasonable efforts to mitigate these costs in a manner consistent with
its regulatory objectives, a conclusion may well be possible that the measure is a ‘disguised
restriction on international trade’.
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THE NORTH AMERICAN FREE TRADE AGREEMENT

The North American Free Trade Agreement (NAFTA) is the first comprehensive trade
treaty that deals explicitly with the relationship between trade and environmental
protection. Nevertheless, the key NAFTA provisions on environment are unlikely to play
any significant role in sustaining or enhancing levels of environmental protection in the
Member countries, and in the case of the provisions on technical standards, may actually
threaten high environmental standards. The NAFTA environmental side-agreement, the
North American Agreement on Environmental Cooperation, does not establish any
substantive transnational environmental norms or standards. However, it does establish an
institutional framework from which such norms or standards may eventually emerge. As
well, the side-agreement binds the Parties to effective enforcement of their own domestic
environmental laws, and provides for dispute settlement and, ultimately, sanctions where a
NAFTA Party persistently fails to enforce these laws.

Article 104: Environmental and Conservation Agreements

Article 104 states that in the event of an ‘inconsistency’ between the NAFTA and the trade
provisions of several major environmental treaties, including the Convention on International
Trade and Endangered Species (CITES), the provisions of the environmental treaty shall
prevail ‘to the extent of the inconsistency’. The kinds of trade obligations in question are,
generally speaking, export and/or import bans, which would normally run afoul of Article
309 of the NAFTA. Article 309 incorporates into the NAFTA the GATT Article XI
prohibition on both export and import restrictions and prohibitions.

Since any measure saved by Article 104 is, therefore, likely also to constitute a violation
of Article XI of the GATT, will Article 104 have any real significance in enabling the
implementation of environmental treaties? This will depend on whether Article 104 applies
to the Parties’ pre-existing GATT obligations as well as to the provisions of NAFTA. Article
103(1) of the NAFTA states that ‘The Parties affirm their existing rights and obligations
with respect to each other under the General Agreement on Tariffs and Trade and other
agreements to which the Parties are party’. Article 103(2) then goes on to state: ‘In the
event of any inconsistency between the provisions of this Agreement and such other
agreements, the provisions of this Agreement shall prevail to the extent of the inconsistency,
except if otherwise provided in this Agreement’.

Does the expression ‘other agreements’ in 103(2) mean any agreement besides the
NAFTA to which the Parties are signatories, including GATT, or does it refer to ‘other
agreements’ as defined in Article 103(1)—i.e. agreements other than the GATT and
NAFTA? If the second interpretation is correct (i.e. that NAFTA does not take precedence
over GATT although it does over agreements other than GATT), then Article 104 is likely
to have very little effect. The one case where Article 104 would still have an impact is if, in
the future, an otherwise GATTinconsistent environmental treaty received a waiver under
Article XXV:5 of the General Agreement. In that case, while the treaty would no longer
entail violation of the NAFTA Parties’ GATT obligations (i.e. due to the waiver), it could
still be in violation of their NAFTA obligations. Here, Article 104 would apply to resolve the
inconsistency in favour of the environmental treaty. Finally, it is to be noted that any
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dispute between NAFTA Members concerning a treaty listed under Article 104 is to be
referred to the NAFTA dispute settlement process rather than to the GATT (Article 2005.
3).

Article 1114: Environmental Measures

Article 1114(2) states in part that ‘The Parties recognize that it is inappropriate to
encourage investment by relaxing domestic health, safety, or environmental measures.
Accordingly, a Party should not waive or otherwise derogate from, or offer to waive or
otherwise derogate from, such measures as an encouragement for the establishment,
acquisition, expansion, or retention in its territory of an investor’. This provision is the
most innovative of the NAFTA provisions on environment, in that it does recognize
explicitly the danger of an environmental ‘race to the bottom’, where investors are
attracted to the NAFTA jurisdiction with the lowest environmental standards—thereby
possibly exerting downward pressure on standards elsewhere as the Parties compete for the
jobs that come with investment. However, the actual provisions of Article 1114 may be
inadequate to its purpose. First of all, and of greatest significance, the language ‘a Party
should not waive’ connotes something less than a full legal obligation—generally, NAFTA
obligations are expressed by the more clearly imperative word ‘shall’.

One drawback in adopting existing environmental measures as the baseline is that
removal or relaxation of some existing environmental measures may actually be justified,
from an environmentalist perspective, in light of changes in technology as well as shifts in
the choice of environmental instrument, for instance from ‘command and control’ type
regulations to taxes and charges. For example, if Canada implements a new reforestation
management system that results in much more rapid reforestation, why should Canada not
be able to exploit any competitive advantage that comes from being able to provide
producers located in Canada with more liberal quotas for timber than a less effective
conservation system in the United States would permit?

Finally, the proposed dispute settlement process with respect to Article 1114(2) does
not appear to lend itself to the kind of in-depth investigation that would be required to
determine if a Party was under-enforcing its own laws in order to encourage investment.
Thus, Article 1114(2) states: ‘If a Party considers that another Party has offered such an
encouragement, it may request consultations with the other Party and the two Parties shall
consult with a view to avoiding any such encouragement’. Is this process of ‘consultations’
intended to exclude further recourse to the normal NAFTA dispute resolution mechanism
that allows for in-depth investigation and the assessment of expert opinion? While the normal
dispute resolution mechanism applies to all the provisions of NAFTA, it does so ‘(e)xcept as
otherwise provided in this Agreement’ (Article 2004). It is unclear whether the provision
for consultations in Article 1114 would constitute one of these exceptions to the application
of the Chapter Twenty dispute settlement mechanism. It could be argued that the Chapter
Twenty mechanism still applies, since elsewhere in the NAFTA when the Parties have
wished to exclude recourse to Chapter Twenty procedures, they have done so through an
explicit exclusionary clause (see Annex 1137.2 Exclusions from Dispute Settlement).
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The NAFTA provisions on environment fall far short of an effective environmental
charter, especially if one balances the strict scrutiny of a Party’s differentially higher trade-
impacting environmental standards provided for in Chapter Nine against the rather weak
limits on investment-impacting downward movement in a Party’s standards stipulated in
Article 1114(2). It is perhaps not surprising, therefore, that the Clinton Administration
would insist on the negotiation of supplemental provisions in a parallel accord. It is to this
side-agreement that we shall now turn our attention.

The North American Agreement on Environmental
Cooperation

The NAAEC, often referred to as the NAFTA environmental side-agreement, states a set of
general objectives that include fostering ‘the protection and improvement of the
environment in the territories of the Parties’, increased ‘cooperation…to better conserve,
protect and enhance the environment’ and the avoidance of ‘trade distortions and new trade
barriers’ (Article I). The NAAEC also contains a set of ‘general commitments’, which
include public reporting and education about environmental matters, assessment of
environmental impacts where appropriate, and the promotion of economic instruments of
environmental regulation (Article II). In addition, Article III stipulates that ‘each Party shall
ensure that its laws and regulations provide for high levels of environmental protection and
shall strive to continue to improve those laws and regulations’. However, Article III also
recognizes ‘the right of each Party to establish its own levels of domestic environmental
protection’. It is difficult, but not impossible to reconcile these two aspects of Article III.
One approach would be to argue that Article III permits a Party to set its own levels of
protection, as long as those levels are ‘high’ by some objective standard. An alternative
interpretation, which would greatly attenuate the significance of Article III, is that each
Party must set a level of environmental protection that is ‘high’, but that the meaning of a
‘high’ level of environmental protection is to be determined by each Party’s domestic
values and priorities.

Article 5 requires that ‘each Party shall effectively enforce its environmental laws and
regulations through appropriate government action’ and gives a list of examples of such
actions, ranging from the use of licences and permits to contractual and voluntary
arrangements for environmental compliance. Article 6 requires that ‘interested persons’ be
able to request a Party’s regulatory authorities to investigate possible violations of domestic
environmental laws and regulations. Since the NAAEC does not contain a definition of
‘interested persons’, whether this includes, for example, environmental NGOs will depend
on the standing rules in each Party’s domestic legal system.

Of all these obligations, only a Party’s obligation to enforce effectively its own
environmental law can be regarded as ‘hard’ trade law, for only this obligation carries with
it the possibility of binding dispute settlement and, ultimately, sanctions for non-
compliance. Thus, where there is a complaint that ‘there has been a persistent pattern of
failure [of a NAFTA Party] to enforce its environmental law’, Part V of the NAAEC
provides for a dispute settlement process that closely parallels the general NAFTA dispute
settlement process set out in Chapter 20. A rather significant difference is that a request for
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a panel must be approved by a two-thirds vote of the Parties. This means that where, for
instance, Canada requested a panel to investigate an alleged persistent failure of Mexico to
enforce its environmental laws, it would have to obtain the agreement of either Mexico or
the United States in order for dispute settlement to proceed (Article 24(1)).

If, in its final report, a panel concludes that in fact, a persistent failure of enforcement has
occurred, the Parties to the dispute ‘may agree on a mutually satisfactory action plan, which
normally shall conform with the determinations and recommendations of the panel’ (Article
33). If no such action plan is agreed upon, then, after 60 days (but within 120 days) of the
final report, the complaining Party may request that the panel reconvene and determine an
appropriate action plan and/or a monetary assessment against the offending Party. If the
panel subsequently determines that an action plan (either mutually agreed upon or
stipulated by the panel itself) is not being implemented it may impose monetary assessments
against the offending Party (Article 34(5)(b)). Where the offending Party fails to pay a
monetary assessment within 180 days after it is imposed, the complaining Party may
suspend concessions under the NAFTA itself ‘in an amount no greater than that sufficient to
collect the monetary enforcement assessment’. Annex 34 states, inter alia, the limits on
monetary assessments ‘For the first year after entry into force of the NAAEC, these shall not
exceed $20 million US. Thereafter, an assessment may not exceed 0.007% of total trade in
goods between the Parties during the most recent year for which data are available’ (Annex
34, Article 1). Here, ‘between the Parties’ most logically refers to the total trade between
all three NAFTA Parties. not that between the two Parties to the dis pute.80 The latter
interpretation would create the arbitrary result that a monetary assessment arising out of
exactly the same violation would vary enormously depending, for instance, on whether
Canada or the United States was the com-plainant. Here, it should be stressed that
monetary assessments are not intended as compensation for injury to the complaining
Party’s trade from persistent violation of the Agreement, but rather as an enforcement
measure or sanction—they are not paid to the complaining Party but rather are paid into a
fund to be spent at the direction of the NAFTA Parties for improving or enhancing
environmental protection in the territory of the offending Party (Annex 34, Article 3). In
the case of a monetary assessment against Canada, a rather disingenuous procedure replaces
withdrawal of trade concessions as the sanction of last resort where the assessment remains
unpaid. The panel decision imposing the monetary assessment is to be registered in a
domestic Canadian court and to be subject to an enforcement order of that court, just as a
foreign civil judgment might be enforced according to principles of conflict of laws (private
international law). The ultimate effect is really the same as with the withdrawal of trade
concessions, but the insertion of this separate procedure allowed the Canadian government
of the day to make the (rather empty if literally true) public claim that it had succeeded in
adhering to its position that no trade sanctions should be attached to the violation of
environmental obligations.

If only Article 5 obligations are genuinely enforceable through dispute settlement and
sanctions, what is the real significance of the various other, more general obligations and
commitments in the NAAEC? The answer to this question will lie in the effectiveness of the
institutional mechanisms that are aimed at fulfilling the broader promise of the NAAEC
through on-going cooperative efforts concerning environmental regulation and standards.
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The NAAEC provides for the estabishment of four institutions for environmental
cooperation: the Commission, the Council, the Secretariat, and the Joint Public Advisory
Committee. The Commission is the umbrella organization that encompasses the other three
institutions (Article 8). The Council comprises minis-terial-level representatives of the
Parties who are required to meet at least once a year. The Council may make
recommendations with respect to a wide variety of environmental matters, including
‘transboundary and border environmental issues, such as the long-range transport of air and
marine pollutants’ and the ‘protection of endangered and threatened species’ and ‘eco-
labelling’. Perhaps most significantly, the Council, ‘without reducing levels of
environmental protection’, may establish a process for developing recommendations on the
‘greater compatibility of environmental technical regulations, standards and conformity
assessment procedures’. This, in effect, gives the Council a mandate for the development of
harmonized minimum environmental standards. In carrying out these various responsibilities
the Council may establish committees, working groups or expert groups, and seek the
advice of NGOs (Article 5). It should be noted that recommendations of the Council are to
be made by consensus (Article 6), and that a Contracting Party’s obligation is merely to
‘consider’ such recommendations, not to implement them. 

The Secretariat consists of a permanent professional staff which provides administrative
and technical support to the Council, headed by an Executive Director appointed for a
(once renewable) three-year term (Article 11(1))- In addition to this general support
function, the Secretariat is charged with preparing an annual report of the Commission,
based upon instructions from the Council (Article 12(1)). The report is to contain, inter alia,
data on each Party’s compliance with its obligations under the agreement (Article 12(2)(c))
and ‘relevant views and information submitted by non-governmental organizations and
persons’ (Article 12(2)(d)).

Finally, Articles 14 and 15 establish a procedure where a non-governmental organization
may bring a submission before the Secretariat asserting that a Party is failing to enforce
effectively its own environmental law. Upon approval by a two-thirds vote of the Council
(i.e. by two of the three Parties) the Secretariat may prepare a ‘factual record’ concerning
the NGO’s claims, based upon the NGO’s submissions as well as any ‘relevant technical,
scientific or other information’, including submissions by the Party that is the object of the
complaint. The Council may decide, by a two-thirds vote, to make the factual record
public. It is to be emphasized that no formal dispute settlement or sanctions ensue in
consequence of an adverse factual record. However, such a record would provide a strong
eviden-tiary basis for a complaint against the offending Party should either of the other
Parties choose to lodge one in accordance with the separate Part V dispute settlement
procedures. Once made public, an adverse factual record would also assist environmental
NGOs in bringing public pressure to bear upon the other NAFTA Parties to lodge such a
complaint.

The Joint Public Advisory Committee consists of 15 members, 5 of which are appointed
by each Party (Article 16(91)). The Committee may participate in the process of developing
a factual record in accordance with Article 15. The Secretariat must also provide the
Committee, inter alia, with the draft annual report, presumably for comment before its
final adoption.
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In assessing the significance of the NAAEC, at least as much emphasis should be placed on
the broader institutional framework it establishes as on the rather limited enforceable legal
obligations that it contains. This framework holds the promise of setting in motion a process
for the evolution of genuine regional environmental norms, linked (albeit indirectly) to
evolution of deeper economic integration among the NAFTA Parties. Although the NAAEC
does not, by any means, transcend the state-centric paradigm of traditional international
law81 (i.e. only Parties have direct access to dispute settlement), it does acknowledge in
important ways the legitimate stake that NGOs have in the process of monitoring and
enforcing NAAEC legal obligations, i.e. that environmental protection is not just a matter
between governments, but is of direct concern to individuals throughout the NAFTA
region. Although there is yet to be a formal complaint or dispute panel under the legal
obligations established by NAAEC, it does seem to have given birth to a set of active, if only
partly effective, institutions. The Secretariat has, for example, developed a concrete work
programme of cooperation in areas such as ecological mapping to determine pollution flows
across North America, the devel opment of consistent laboratory procedures for assessing
environmental risk, assessment of environmental training needs, and cooperation in
conservation of biodiversity and forest ecosystems.82 These kinds of initiatives represent
forms of win-win cooperation that raise few of the sovereignty concerns entailed in
enforcing the legal obligations of the NAAEC. However, this being said, the work
programme of the Secretariat is badly underfunded.83 The Commission now proposes to
create a North American Environmental Fund, that would provide grants to NGOs to
pursue environmental projects related to the NAAEC, but the total proposed funding for
this is US$2 million.84 Another achievement of the Commission is an agreement on the
phase-out or reduction of certain toxic substances throughout North America—PCBs,
DDT, clordane and mercury. However, specific action plans on these substances are yet to
be developed, so the agreement is really a resolution or agreement in principle.85

At the time this book went to press (late 1998) the Secretariat had received 15
submissions from NGOs concerning possible violations of the obligation of a NAFTA Party
to enforce its own environmental laws. A number of the early submissions were rejected as
falling outside the terms of the NAAEC. The first submission, filed in June 1995, by among
other NGOs the Biodiversity Legal Foundation, alleged that fiscal restraint legislation in the
US that prohibited the Fish and Wildlife Service from making final determinations for
species or critical habitat designations for the remainder of fiscal year 1995 and cutting its
budget had the effect of a failure to enforce the US Endangered Species Act.86 In its reply to
this submission, the Secretariat refused to take the matter further, finding that ‘the alleged
failure to enforce environmental law results from competing legislative mandates, and not
from other action or inaction taken by agencies or officials'.87 This establishes a fundamental
limitation on the obligation of each country to enforce its own environmental law—such an
obligation does not extend to a requirement that non-environmental legislation not
frustrate such enforcement. Other submissions have not been taken further by the
Secretariat because they complained of non-enforcement that had occurred in the past (an
environmental assessment on a particular project) or because parallel actions were being
pursued in domestic courts, therefore making a judgment that a country was not enforcing
its own laws premature. One complaint made to the Commission, by the Sierra Club,
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concerned a ‘rider’ on a US budget-cutting statute that essentially eliminated the possibility
of review of salvage timber sales for environmental effects.88 This complaint was not taken
further by the Secretariat on the same basis as it invoked with respect to the first complaint,
i.e. that ‘The Secretariat cannot… characterize the application of a new legal regime as a
failure to enforce an old one.’89 In this second determination the Secretariat also stressed
the importance of a factual record showing that non-enforcement was actually occurring,
thereby suggesting that even if the ‘rider’ had been in regulation not legislation, it would
have been essential to show that it resulted in an actual pattern of non-enforcement of the
relevant environmental framework law.

The first (and only) submission so far to give rise to a determination by the Secretariat
that a full factual record should be developed was filed by Mexican NGOs with respect to
non-enforcement of Mexican environmental law.90 This complaint alleged that during the
evaluation of a project for a cruise terminal on Cozumel Island a range of Mexican
environmental laws had not been effectively enforced, and that two coral reefs were being
endangered by the project. A Factual Record was prepared and submitted to the Council in
April 1997, and a final version publicly released later that year.91 It is clear from the Record
that the Mexican government vigorously and completely denied the claims of the
petitioners. The Factual Record presents intricate and arcane arguments on both sides
concerning whether extensions of environmental authorizations were granted in accordance
with Mexican law, and whether and for what elements of the project a comprehensive de
novo environmental assessment might have been required, as well as the applicability of
various wildlife preservation provisions in respect of the location of the pier in proximity to
coral reefs. However, while the dispute was being dealt with by the NAAEC Secretariat and
before the Factual Record was provided to the Council, the Mexican authorities appear to
have placed a number of conditions on the donation of federal lands required to realize the
project.92 One may speculate that the prospect of a full Factual Record being published thus
had some impact on the Mexican government, despite its complete rejection of the claim
that it had not previously been enforcing its own environmental laws.

Finally, under the NAAEC NGOs may also make submissions on matters not directly
related to the issue of a NAFTA Party’s enforcement of its environmental law. One such
submission has actually become the subject of a Secretariat Report. The submission
concerned the death of migratory birds at the Silva Reservoir in Mexico. The Secretariat
struck a panel of scientific experts to investigate the matter, which found that the death of
the birds was related to high levels of toxins in the area.93 The Secretariat suggested a
number of options for dealing with the problem, including that the reservoir be monitored
for waterbird mortality, that the reservoir be drained if there is evidence of a waterbird
mortality problem, that birds be kept off the reservoir, or that the topography of the
reservoir be altered to make it less susceptible to these problems. However, in terms of
formal recommendations that the Council would make to Mexico, these were limited
essentially to the recommendation that the Mexican government conduct a comprehensive
evaluation of the problem and the possible solutions to it. The panel of scientific experts
had, by contrast, some very specific suggestions as to the environmental measures needed to
remedy the route source of the problem, including proper treatment of raw-discharge
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municipal wastes, and large industrial waste sources. These suggestions are now being
pursued with the support of the Secretariat.

The positive results attained by the NAAEC and its institutions belie the scepticism of
many environmentalists about the significance of the side-agreement. However, there is an
issue as to the extent to which this activism was due to the leadership of the first director of
the Commission for Environmental Cooperation, the Mexican Victor Lichtinger.
Lichtinger’s forced resignation from this position in February 1998 has been linked by
informed observers to NAFTA government dis satisfaction with the Commission’s activist
role.94 Thus, the future effectiveness of NAFTA’s environmental institutions remains in
question.

CONCLUSION

The existing jurisprudence on trade and environment in the GATT displays a lack of
coherence and consistency. Especially given the increasing number of trade conflicts related
to environmental matters, the present state of GATT law as just described is far from
satisfactory. The uncertainty and incoherence that characterize the existing jurisprudence
only serve to undermine the legitimacy of GATT strictures that affect environmental
protection, thereby fuelling increased demands for aggressive unilateralism. As the very
limited progress of the WTO Trade and Environment Committee suggests, addressing this
situation through new rules or understandings agreed among Members is likely to be an
insurmountable task, at least before a new ‘round’. However, the creation of an Appellate
Body, and the determination of this body, quite evident in its first rulings, to bring greater
order and coherence to the jurisprudence, suggest that much can be done even without
formal changes to the WTO Agreements, or other new legal instruments. In the
Reformulated Gasoline case, the Appellate Body went some distance in demonstrating how a
careful, textually-orientated application of the existing GATT text can address in a
legitimate and principled manner the trade/environment interface. As the Turtles appeal
decision illustrates, this approach can easily be applied in the case of disputes concerning
global environmental measures, the prejudice of the trade policy establishment that such
measures are inherently at odds with a liberal trading order, or threatening to its integrity,
needs to be reversed. In this chapter we have attempted to show how a conceptual
clarification and global and domestic welfare analysis of trade and environment claims can
help reverse the prejudice. 
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16
Trade and labour rights

INTRODUCTION

The interrelationship between trade policy and labour rights is among the most contentious
issues that the world trading system faces today. Many critics of free trade have argued that
it is unfair that producers in the developed industrial world should have to compete with
imports from countries with very low wage rates and poor labour standards. Advocates of
free trade, by contrast, often view differences in countries’ labour standards as a legitimate
source of comparative advantage or disadvantage. They argue that low-wage competition
benefits workers in developing countries themselves, and is in many instances an important
element in the economic growth that is needed to improve living standards and ultimately
distributive justice in those countries. Concern about labour policies in other countries,
particularly developing countries, has also been characterized as inappropriately
paternalistic or culturally patronising. At the same time, increasing international attention
has been focused on the challenge of obtaining compliance with certain minimum labour
standards, so-called ‘core’ labour rights, which reflect widely-accepted international human
rights norms. In these instances, where what is at issue is violent suppression of collective
bargaining, gender discrimination, forced or slave labour, or exploitative child labour, trade
measures appear less like a protectionist attempt to level the playing field, and resemble the
kinds of sanctions against gross human rights violations that have been imposed by the world
community (or at least the major Western powers) in cases such as South Africa under
apartheid and, more recently, Serbia. At the same time, resistance within the World Trade
Organization to any real linkage between trade and core international labour rights remains
powerful, as is reflected in the declaration on this issue that emerged from the 1996
Singapore ministerial, suggesting that this issue is a matter, above all, for the International
Labour Organization (ILO). Where some progress has been made, due to the profile of this
issue, is in creating greater focus within the ILO itself on the central challenge of
compliance with core standards, including the adoption in June 1998 of an ILO Declaration
on fundamental labour rights. As well, the OECD—an organization with an institutional
orientation towards economic liberalism—has shown greater openness and subtlety in its
approach to the debate concerning trade and labour rights, suggesting in a recent study that
non-compliance with core labour standards is unlikely to be beneficial, and may actual be
harmful, to a country’s overall economic growth and development prospects. The NAFTA



labour side-agreement, the North American Agreement on Labour Cooperation (NAALC),
has produced some limited but useful transnational dialogue about the enforcement of
labour rights in North America and, despite its weak institutional structure, has proven
somewhat effective in creating pressure, through publicity, to resolve some especially
egregious cases of non-enforcement.

This chapter considers these various trends, on the basis of a conceptual framework for
understanding the debate over trade and labour rights which attempts to take into account
in a more subtle way than the typical ‘equity vs. efficiency’ notion both the economic
welfare and human rights dimensions of this issue (and the relationship between the two).

A CONCEPTUAL FRAMEWORK FOR UNDERSTANDING THE
TRADE AND LABOUR RIGHTS DEBATE1

Sanctions as a means of inducing other states to alter their
labour practices

Trade sanctions may be advocated as a means of inducing recalcitrant governments and/or
firms to meet a given set of labour standards.2 This may involve trade restrictions being
imposed in the case of a country violating labour agreements that it has already signed (such
as conventions of the International Labour Organization), or to induce a country to adopt a
standard or norm that it has not yet accepted as binding, even in principle. As we suggested
in our discussion of environmentally-based sanctions in Chapter 15 on trade and the
environment, in this sense the trade measures at issue are little different from the kind of
response that states have had to practices such as apartheid in South Africa and genocide in
the former Yugoslavia. The embargo of Iraq is a further recent example of the use of
economic sanctions in support of non-trade policy goals.

The non-trade related rationales for labour sanctions

An initial issue is whether the ultimate goals of such sanctions can be justified. Here it is
useful to identify the main reasons why concerns about labour laws and practices may
legitimately extend beyond national borders.

Human rights

Human rights are frequently and increasingly regarded as inalienable rights that belong to
individuals regardless of their national affiliation, simply by virtue of being human. Such an
understanding of rights is implicit in the Kantian understanding of human autonomy that has
profoundly influenced contemporary liberal theory. Certain labour rights or standards have
come to be widely regarded as basic human rights with a universal character. These include:
the right to collective bargaining and freedom of association; the right not to be enslaved;
the abolition of child labour; and equality of opportunity in employment for men and
women.3 These rights are reflected in the Conventions of the International Labour
Organization (ILO). Some of the Conventions have been ratified by a large number of
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countries; others by far fewer countries. They are also now affirmed in the June 1998 ILO
Declaration on fundamental labour rights.

While labour rights are conceived of as universal in the ILO Conventions, they are not
viewed as absolute. Thus, for example, in the case of the prohibition on child labour, the
minimum age of 15 years applies in most circumstances, but in many developing country
contexts, the applicable age may be 12 years; as well, child labour in agricultural contexts is
generally permitted.4 Respect for the universal normative content of international labour
rights does not usually entail identical labour policies or standards. Precisely because universal
human rights have important contextual dimensions, even these labour rights elicit quite
different views as to their exact scope and meaning. For example, the extent to which
collective bargaining and freedom of association rights should entail a right to strike, and in
what circumstances, may be a matter of considerable controversy even among individuals who
have a strong commitment to the idea of rights. At the same time, there are certain
practices that would be unacceptable on any reasonable interpretation of such rights,
whatever the balance between negative and positive liberty one happens to subscribe to—
for instance, the use of violence and intimidation to prevent workers from organizing into
an independent trade union. The fact that existing international labour law has been drafted
such that these practices are not singled out and proscribed as ‘obvious’ violations of rights
may be a reason why some of the Labour Conventions of the ILO have not been ratified by a
much larger group of countries; in other words, this uneven ratification record may
understate the degree of existing or emerging normative consensus in the international
community concerning a core minimum content or scope to core labour rights.5

International political and economic spillovers

Some human rights abuses and some labour practices, particularly violent suppression of
workers’ rights to organize or associate, may lead to the kind of acute social conflict that
gives rise to general political and economic instability. Such instability may spill over
national boundaries, and affect global security. Increasingly (as the cases of the former
Yugoslavia, Rwanda and Somalia illustrate), ‘internal’ conflicts are capable of raising
regional or global security, economic or social (e.g. immigration and refugee) issues.

Altruistic or paternalistic concerns

Even if they are not directly affected in any of the ways described above, citizens of one
country may find the purely domestic labour practices or policies of another country to be
misguided or morally wrong. Similarly, citizens of one country may believe that workers in
another country would be better off if protected by higher labour standards. Such a belief may
or may not be warranted. For instance, higher minimum wages or other improvements in
standards that raise labour costs, may in some circumstances do more harm than good, if the
result is a significant increase in unemployment. Proponents of external intervention make
the strong assumption that citizens in one country are better able to make these welfare
judgments than governments in another country, which seems unlikely to be systematically
true, even where the government in the latter country is not democratically elected or
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accountable. However, the provision of foreign aid, often with major conditions attached as
to recipients’ domestic policies, by international agencies such as the World Bank and the
IMF, suggests that a welfare presumption against paternalism should be rebuttable. One
version of the anti-paternalism argument draws on the notions of cultural relativism or
cultural autonomy. Thus, for instance, Bhagwati suggests that the ‘equation between
culture-specific labour standards and universal human rights cannot survive deeper
scrutiny'.6 This, on its own terms, however, is a very selective kind of argument for
cultural autonomy, since it entails an admission that some rights are genuinely universal, but
just not labour rights. Yet Bhagwati gives no rigorous explanation of why labour rights in
particular lie on one side of the line between the universal and the culturally specific (the
idea that, for instance minimum wages are appropriately set relative to a country’s level of
wealth and economic development has nothing to do with cultural specificity; it emanates
from a perspective on economic regulation that is purportedly universal). Martha Nussbaum
has criticized the simplistic and opportunistic manner in which the idea of cultural
determinism or autonomy has been invoked to force closure on transcultural dialogue about
the relationship between the universal and contextual dimensions of rights.7 Another
fallacious but frequently heard notion is that rights are a luxury good, in which poor people
in developing countries themselves have little interest: however, examining human rights
struggles in a number of poor Asian nations, Amartya Sen concludes: ‘To the extent that
there has been any testing of the proposition that the poor Asians do not care about civil and
political rights, the evidence is entirely against that claim.’8

Given that there are several legitimate rationales for making the compliance with core
labour rights a matter for international concern and action, trade sanctions are one
instrument among many that may be used to advance this goal. Although the strongest
rationales for protecting core labour rights may be grounded deon-tologically in a
conception of autonomy, and do not necessarily sound in claims about welfare, this need
not be a reason to be indifferent to the welfare effects of alternative instruments for
vindicating these rationales. Of course, there is a coherent, if limited point of view that
suggests that once we characterize the practices in questions as violations of human rights
any truck or trade with the products or services produced through such violations is
intrinsically immoral—from this perspective, sanctions are an indicated policy, regardless
of their welfare impacts more generally, or even whether as an empirical matter they are
likely or unlikely to result in reduction or elimination of the offending practices. Thus, on
this understanding, for example, even if it were provable that sanctions against child labour
actually made the children in question worse off, reducing them to starvation or illegal activity,
the moral imperative to maintain sanctions would be unaffected. In practice, however, this
sort of extreme, results-blind moralism is rare—international human rights activists usually
are concerned about the real world situation of those whom rights are meant to protect, and
even if the foundation of rights is not welfarist, their effective realization implies a concern
with the actual conditions of people. Thus, if it were systematically true, as many free
traders tend to suggest or assume, that trade sanctions for labour rights noncompliance
reduce global or domestic welfare (in the sanctioned state), this should not be a matter of
indifference to rights activists in the real world, even it might be for some Kantian ethicists.
Thus, from the perspective of the debate on the relationship between labour rights and
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trade policy, it is important to clarify the welfare effects that are at issue. In the following
discussion we attempt to identify the kinds of potential welfare effects, both positive and
negative, that would need to be considered in any analysis of labour-rights based trade
sanctions.

Scenario #1: trade sanctions or the threat of sanctions succeed in
inducing higher labour standards

The first scenario is that the country or countries targeted by sanctions, or at least some
firms within those countries, change their domestic practices and adhere to or accept the
minimum standards.

Welfare effects in targeted country

With respect to the domestic welfare of the country or countries that change policies, if the status
quo prior to the alteration of the policies is welfare-maximizing (either in the Pareto or
Kaldor-Hicks sense) then conforming to higher standards will reduce domestic welfare

With respect to labour rights abuses, some of the practices that have been singled out as
justifying trade sanctions—slave labour camps in China, for instance would be difficult to
characterize as the product of political or regulatory processes likely to maximize welfare
based on the revealed preferences of individuals. Since the countries concerned are not
genuine democracies, the domestic political process is simply not designed to take into
account the preferences of all citizens. Indeed, in a Marxist totalitarian state like China,
individual preferences—except for those of the ruling elites—may well count for very
little. In the end, to know whether higher labour standards will result in an improvement in
domestic welfare, defined either in Pareto or Kaldor-Hicks terms, would entail judgments
and analysis that go far beyond the disciplinary expertise of trade economists and trade
policy experts.9

In general, the domestic welfare gains from improved labour standards are most likely to
exist where, in the first place, there is a strong case for regulation to correct specific
instances of market failure10 (e.g. information asymmetries in the case of occupational
health and safety”), or where markets fail more radically due, for instance, to the presence
of coercion (slave labour, child labour, the use of violence to intimidate workers, etc.).
Some recent empirical studies suggest that domestic welfare gains may well result from the
enforcement of core labour rights, especially in a context where trade liberalization and
improved labour rights performance occur simultaneously. For example a recent OECD
study came to the conclusion that ‘the clearest and most reliable finding is in favour of a
mutually supportive relationship between successfully sustained trade reforms and
improvements in association and bargaining rights’.12 This particular finding has special
significance for the trade and labour rights debate, since it tends to refute the notion that
non-compliance with core labour rights is an important source of comparative advantage for
poorer countries.

In understanding the welfare impacts of compliance with core labour standards it is
important to bear in mind a fundamental distortion in world labour markets restrictive
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immigration policies that prevent most people from moving to locations where employment
conditions and related government labour policies maximize their preferences.13 In a world
where labour was as mobile a factor of production as capital or technology, regulatory
competition between jurisdictions might well ensure a close to optimal domestic policy
equilibrium with respect to labour rights, given that transboundary externalities are not
nearly as pervasive in this area as for example is the case with the environment. Where
workers cannot move, however, and where they are disempowered domestically as well,
labour rights policy outcomes may well not accurately reflect their preferences.14

Welfare effects in sanction-imposing country

Depending on elasticities of supply and demand, where foreign producers are faced with
higher costs due to higher labour standards, they may be able to pass on some of these costs
to consumers in the country that imposed the trade sanctions. However, it may be the case
that compliance with core labour rights will not result in significantly higher prices to
consumers, where some producers in the targeted country are already in compliance within
existing cost structures. Where, for instance, a producer is located in a part of the country
where political and social conditions have allowed trade unions to survive, it may already
have had to measure up to basic levels of labour rights protection. Such a producer may
have learned to be competitive with other producers who have not been meeting minimum
standards, through increasing the productivity of labour, better employment of technology,
etc.15 In fact, there is empirical evidence that many of the more successful export-oriented
developing country enterprises do comply with core labour rights.16 However, it must be
acknowledged that, making the conventional economic assumption that supply curves are
never infinitely elastic, some adverse price effects on consumers in the sanction-imposing
country seem likely, although in many cases these may be small.

In very many instances, the next-lowest-cost producer complying with minimum labour
standards is likely not to be a domestic firm in the sanctions-imposing country, but a firm in
another country. For this reason, compliance with core labour rights will often not confer
substantial benefits on producer interests in the country which has imposed sanctions,
although there are always likely to be some protective price effects (depending on supply
elasticities).

Scenario #2: the case where trade sanctions fail to induce higher
standards

Welfare effects in the targeted country

There are several studies that have attempted to model the economic impacts of trade
sanctions against states that are not enforcing compliance with core labour standards. These
suggest the complexity of the possible welfare effects from sanctions, particularly where
these do not lead to the desired behavioural changes in either firms or governments. In the
case of child labour for example an impact of a sanction (a tariff in this case) imposed on a
particular import produced with child labour may be to increase the supply of child labour
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to sectors producing goods for domestic consumption, where output cannot be affected by
sanctions. As Maskus notes, depending on elasticities of supply and demand and certain
other assumptions, the impact could be an actual increase in the number of children
working under-age, and perhaps also a decline in the wages of the children actually work-
ing.17 In the case of gender discrimination, according to Maskus, the effects on women of a
sanction against the exports of a particular country, in the absence of any policy change being
induced, will differ depending on whether the export sector is male- or female-labour
intensive relative to the import-competing sector:

In the case where exports are intensive in female labor, [women workers] would be
harmed by reducing wages even further [than has already occurred due to
discrimination] and exacerbating the output effects. In the case where exports are
intensive in male labor, the tariff would raise demand for female labor, causing
female wages to place upward pressure on the female maximum wage. In this case,
firms might prefer to relax the discrimination to some degree.18

This effect occurs on the assumption that, with the decline in export competitiveness due to
the tariff sanction, productive resources will be shifted from the export sector to the
import-competitive sector, with demand for labour shifting as well. Maskus’s overall
conclusion is that ‘the impacts of trade restrictions taken by foreign countries depend on the
circumstances…. Much depends on issues such as whether the sector with weak rights is
labour-intensive, whether it is the exportable sector, and what linkages there are to the
informal or residual employment sectors.’19

Global welfare effects

Even where sanctions fail to induce any policy change in the targeted country, there may be
some positive effect on global welfare where sanctions result in a decline in the global sales
of products that are manufactured in a fashion that entail labour rights abuses. If the country
imposing the sanctions, or the group of countries imposing them, constitute a major market
for the products in question, then global demand will now be met through production that
complies with the standards in question. But for this to happen, sanctions should be imposed
consistently, i.e. against all producers or countries world-wide that do not comply with the
rights in question. Otherwise, production may simply be shifted from one firm that is
responsible for abuses in question to another.

Just as with domestic welfare, trade sanctions that are not carefully targeted against only
those industries, sectors or (ideally) firms that actually do not comply with core labour
rights, in theory, could result in significant global welfare losses, shifting production away
from least-cost producers in the targeted country to higher-cost producers elsewhere.
However, many product areas are characterized by the existence of a variety of rival
producers in different countries, often with closely comparable cost structures. In such a
case, and assuming that some of these companies will be in compliance with the labour
rights in question, global welfare losses may not in the end be significant. Rivals in
compliance with international minimum standards will simply expand their market share.
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However, there are likely to be some price increases, assuming supply is not infinitely
elastic.

With respect to the welfare effects of sanctions that fail to change government policy on
those with pro-labour rights preferences, these are still likely to be positive for three
reasons. Two of the reasons will be evident from the above analysis. First, if the sanctions
are properly targeted at firms they may induce higher levels of labour rights protection even
in the absence of a change in government policy. Second, sanctions, because they reduce
world demand for products made in ways that abuse workers’ rights, will reduce the levels
of these harmful activities. Third, sanctions will provide the moral satisfaction of resisting
government policies or practices that violate human rights norms, even if the government
does not change its policies. However, even those with pro-labour rights preferences may
have some of these utility gains offset from utility losses due to the knowledge that sanctions
may well cause harm to ‘innocent’ victims of the government’s intransigence in the face of
sanctions, i.e. workers who lose their jobs, persons who suffer from a country’s reduced
ability to purchase essential supplies given a reduction in its convertible currency earnings,
etc.

Finally, there may be possible longer-term impacts of the reduction in oppressive labour
practices that would have positive impacts on global welfare, and which are hard to quantify
or study through the examination of short-term impact. These might include accelerated
political liberalization as workers become less intimi-dated, better organized, and generally
more capable of asserting their rights.20 Increasing liberalization of domestic political
regimes was linked early on by the philosopher Immanuel Kant21 and much more recently
in empirical work by Michael Doyle,22 to a reduced threat of global conflict, including a
reduced likelihood of war. Resort to practices such as forced labour, child labour (which
often amounts to the same thing since generally children in such regimes have little say in
whether they work or not), and violent suppression of independent trade unions (e.g. the
Solidarity movement in Poland) provides a means of resistance to pressures for political and
economic reforms—reforms which, it has been suggested, may well in the medium or
longer run produce regimes that are significantly less likely to threaten international peace
and security.

Welfare effects in the sanctions-imposing country

Welfare effects on consumers and producers in the sanctions-imposing country are likely to
be similar to those in Scenario 1.

Summary

The above analysis has taken into account, for the most part, only the static effects of
sanctions. A dynamic perspective could alter the analysis significantly. Restrictions on the
use of child labour may, as with the Factory Acts enacted in Britain in the first half of the
nineteenth century, lead to political demands for enhanced access to public education, in
which case the possible short-term negative impact of higher standards—greater
impoverishment of some children—may be offset by the longer-term dynamic impact.
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The very general analysis of labour rights-based trade sanctions outlined above suggests
that little can be said, in the abstract, about the likely effects of such sanctions on aggregate
domestic welfare in either the targeting or sanction-imposing country, or on global welfare.
This clearly distinguishes trade measures of this kind from conventional protectionist trade
restrictions, where formal analysis suggests overall net welfare losses, both domestic and
global, when one considers the welfare effects of trade restrictions on consumers as well as
workers and firms.23

When are sanctions likely to be effective?

Clearly, as the above analysis suggests, the welfare effects of sanctions will differ
considerably depending on whether or not sanctions are actually able to change policies or
practices in the targeted country. This underscores the importance of examining whether
and when sanctions are likely to be effective in achieving such policy changes.

There is limited formal evidence on the effectiveness of labour rights trade sanctions in
particular. Dufour suggests there is some evidence that withdrawal of GSP trade
preferences by the United States, or the threat thereof, has led to changes in labour law in
Malaysia and Ghile.24 A similar threat, combined with activism by indigenous labour rights
groups may have led to the lifting of legal restrictions on collective bargaining in the
Dominican Republic.25 The OECD suggests that in most cases where a petition was made
under US trade law for withdrawal of GSP preferences on grounds of non-compliance with
international labour rights, '[p]rogress in raising core standards has been made’.26 Moreover,
the threat of withdrawal of preferences was usually sufficient to procure the result, without
sanctions having to be put in place (which means that the gains in compliance were not
mitigated by the kinds of negative welfare effects from the actual implementation of
sanctions discussed above). As the OECD also suggests, ‘its effectiveness is clearly related to
the fact that the US market is the largest for most of the GSP beneficiaries.’ As noted in
Chapter 15 on trade and the environment, significant empirical work has been undertaken
with a view to measuring the impact of economic sanctions more generally on state
behaviour. As we noted in that chapter, the most comprehensive work on this question
remains the study by Hufbauer, Schott and Elliott,27 which examines 115 instances of the
use of economic sanctions over a period of about 40 years. The authors conclude that these
sanctions had an overall success rate of about 34% in achieving an alteration of the conduct
of the targeting country in the desired direction.28

An issue closely related to the effectiveness of economic sanctions is the relative
desirability of sanctions as opposed to other instruments for influencing the behaviour of
other countries and their producers. Several economic studies of the issue have advocated
the use of financial compensation as an alternative to trade sanc-tions.29 This proposal has
the virtue of attaching a price to the invocation of such sanctions and thus providing some
assurance that these higher standards are truly valued for their own sake in the country
desiring the changes, especially in cases of ostensible ad hoc paternalism or altruism, while
trade sanctions, lacking such an explicit price (beyond price effects on consumers), may be
easily subverted by pro-tectionists. Compensation-based approaches have, however, their
own complexities and drawbacks. Maskus, for example, who considers the use of
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compensation in the case of child labour as ‘in principle an effective route to reducing child
labor employment’, notes that there may be difficulty in raising the funds for compensation
in developed countries because

consumers in both the exporter and [the rest of the world] are likely to free ride on
these gains [from higher labour standards], suggesting that revealing their preferences
for higher standards could be problematic. Thus, extracting these compensatory
taxes could be impossible. Moreover, costless transfer of the payments may not be
possible; political failures and transactions costs in both countries could inefficiently
absorb some or all of the revenues, with little impact on labor demands.30

Discussing the issue of carrots vs. sticks in the environmental context, Chang argues that
subsidies, as opposed to sanctions, create a perverse incentive for foreign countries to
engage in, or intensify, the offensive behaviour (or make credible threats to this effect) in
order to maximize the payments being offered.31

From a deontological perspective on core labour rights, a principle that victims (or their
supporters) should always pay (‘bribe’) violators to achieve compliance would seem
impossible to defend either ethically or politically. However, in some cases financial
assistance to enable poor Third World countries to meet higher labour standards may be
warranted on distributive justice grounds. It is sometimes suggested that aid transfers, for
instance, could alleviate the poverty that is supposed to be the root cause of non-compliance
with core labour rights.32 Certainly, in the case of child labour, poverty is a crucial part of
the picture in explaining why very young children go to work. But not all poor countries
lack protections against exploitation of child labour,33 and not all poor countries are in
violation of core labour rights. Again, this is consistent with the OECD conclusions cited
above that not only can poor countries ‘afford’ compliance with core labour rights, but that
such compliance interacts positively with a trade-driven open market-based growth strategy.

A further alternative34 to trade restrictions is social labelling, which allows individuals as
consumers to express their moral preferences for labour rights protection.35 Products that
are produced in a manner that meet core labour standards would be entitled to bear a
distinctive logo or statement that informs consumers of this fact. While labelling may enable
individual consumers to avoid the moral ‘taint’ of consuming the product in question
themselves, if most consumers have a preference for terminating production altogether
(rather than merely reducing consumption and production) by changing a foreign country’s
domestic policies, then a collective action problem arises as in any approach to influencing
behaviour that depends upon coordinating action among large numbers of agents. Unless he
or she can be sure that most other consumers will do likewise, the individual consumer may
well not consider it rational to avoid buying the product in question.36 A key issue with
respect to labelling programmes is that of credible monitoring to ensure that claims made in
association with the label are not fraudulent. This problem is acute with respect to self-
labelling by multinational corporations who have made public undertakings to abide by
voluntary codes of conduct. One promising development in this respect is the possibility
that, with the consent of the regimes in question, the ILO itself would play a role in
monitoring the credibility of social labelling. Thus, the 1997 ILO Director General’s
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Report makes the following suggestion (which, however, has subsequently not attracted
substantial support from the membership):

As far as the ILO is concerned, labelling should…aim…at promoting law and
practice which meets the demands of fundamental standards (thus also benefiting
workers whose products are not identifiable or exported) But if these labels are to
have any credibility at all, they must guarantee that legislation has been complied
with in actual practice. However, neither spontaneous initiatives nor the present
procedures of the ILO can provide such a guarantee because there is no way of
carrying out an international inspection on the spot which is reliable and legally
independent. But it would be perfectly feasible to provide for such a system of
inspection under an international labour Convention which, because of its voluntary
nature, would allow each State to decide freely whether to give an overall social
label to all goods produced on its territory—provided that it accepts the obligations
inherent in the Convention and agrees to have monitoring on the spot.37

In sum, neither financial inducements nor labelling programmes are self-evidently superior
policy instruments to sanctions for influencing other countries’ environmental and labour
practices. Each has its own drawbacks. However, it must be admitted that little concrete
empirical evidence exists that would allow a rigorous comparison of these alternative
instruments with sanctions. In addition, the greatest effectiveness might actually be achieved
by a combination of more than one of these instruments. At a minimum, and given the
apparently positive results of the threat of unilateral sanctions (withdrawal of GSP
preferences) by the United States, it is difficult to make out a clear-cut case for excluding the
use of trade sanctions as an instrument for influencing the behaviour of other countries’
governments or firms.

The ‘systemic’ threat to a liberal trading order

Even in the presence of indeterminate welfare effects many free traders have still rejected
labour rights-based trade measures on the basis that such measures, if widely permitted or
entertained, would significantly erode the coherence and sustainability of rule-based liberal
trade. We ourselves, in earlier work, have argued that competitiveness-based or level
playing field ‘fair trade’ measures, such as countervailing and antidumping duties, already
pose such a threat. This is based on the notion that the legal order of international trade is
best understood as a set of rules and norms aimed at sustaining a long-term cooperative
equilibrium, in the face of on-going pressures to cheat on this equilibrium, given that the
short-term political pay-offs from cheating may be quite high (depending, of course, on the
character and influence of protectionist interests within a particular country, the availability
of alternative policies to deal with adjustment costs, etc.).38 In the presence of fundamental
normative dissensus as to what constitutes ‘cheating’ on the one hand, and the punishment
of others’ cheating on the other, confidence in the rules themselves could be fundamentally
undermined, and the system destabilized.
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With respect to the systemic threat from labour rights-related trade measures, it is
important to distinguish between purely unilateral measures, and those that have a
multilateral dimension. The former measures are based upon a labour rights concern or
norm that is specific to the sanctioning country or countries. Here, there is a real risk of
dissolving a clear distinction between protectionist ‘cheating’ and genuine sanctions to
further non-trade values—the sanctioning country may well be able to define its labour
rights causes so as to serve protectionist interests. Measures with a multilateral dimension,
by contrast, will be based upon the targeted country’s violation of some multilateral or
internationally recognized norm, principle, or agreement—which is clearly the case with
respect to core labour rights in general. It is true that protectionist interests will always be
attracted by the possibility of sanctions for non-trade purposes—self-interested lobbying
that invokes high-minded purposes is an endemic feature of any vigorous liberal democratic
polity. As Langille observes: ‘Self-interested and opportunistic behaviour will colour all
arguments where a question of distribution between capital and labour is involved.’39 But
the real issue is whether such behaviour will necessarily subvert the integrity of the sanctions
decision-making process. In this respect, it should be recalled from the welfare effects
analysis above that very often the next least-cost producer will be another low-wage
country not subject to sanctions, rather than a producer from the sanctions-imposing
country; therefore apart from perhaps some scarcity rents due to the temporary contraction
of overall supply, domestic interests will often have little to gain from such sanctions.

If, for example, Article XX of the GATT 1994 were interpreted 40 to include violations
of labour rights as a basis for ‘saving’ otherwise GATT inconsistent measures, the sanctions
imposing country would nevertheless still bear the burden of showing that the sanctions
were undertaken in a manner consistent with the requirements of the ‘chapeau’ in Article
XX, i.e. that they do not constitute ‘arbitrary’ or ‘unjustified’ discrimination, or a
‘disguised restriction on international trade’.41

A number of factors could be relevant to a determination as to whether the requirements
of the ‘chapeau’ have been met. Alternatively, these factors could be incorporated into a
new provision of Article XX that deals explicitly with labour rights. Among the factors
relevant would be: (1) the extent of international consensus on the unacceptability of the
practices, as evidenced by international agreements, conventions, and customary
international law; (2) the extent to which the sanctions-imposing country is consistent in its
application of sanctions to all countries that engage in a similar scale of violations of core
labour rights; (3) the extent to which the country concerned has been identified as a
violator by independent international organs; (4) the extent to which attempts at solving the
problem through cooperation, either bilateral, or through the International Labour
Organization or regional institutions such as the North American Agreement on Labour
Cooperation have been made and have failed. The fact that the ILO is now coming to grips
with the task of identifying a broad overlapping consensus on certain core labour rights, and
monitoring and reporting with respect to these,42 weakens the force of criticisms that the
notion of core labour rights is so manipulable and debatable as to preclude objective
benchmarks that allow for screening against protectionist abuse.
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Competitiveness-based arguments for labour rights-based
trade measures

Unlike the arguments for trade restrictions on labour rights grounds that we have been
discussing up to this point, which have a normative reference point external to the trading
system itself, competitiveness-based ‘fair-trade’ claims focus largely on the effects on
domestic producers and workers of other countries’ labour policies, and not per se on the
effects of those policies on workers elsewhere. Competitiveness claims are, in principle,
indifferent to the improvement of labour practices in other countries, and extend to
differences in competitive conditions, such as wage rates, that do not reflect violations of
widely-recognized core labour rights. Hence, in the case of competitiveness claims, trade
measures that protect the domestic market or ‘equalize’ comparative advantage related to
labour standards are a completely acceptable substitute for other countries raising their
standards. 

Competitiveness claims usually refer to one of two kinds of supposed unfairness (and, it
is often argued as well, welfare losses) that stem from trade competition with countries that
have lower labour standards:

1 It is unfair (and/or inefficient) that our firms and workers should bear the ‘costs’ of
higher labour standards through loss of market share to foreign producers who have
lower costs due to laxer labour standards in their own country.

2 It is unfair that downward pressure should be placed on our labour standards by virtue
of the impact of trade competition with countries with lower standards.

Competitive fairness claim #1

The first kind of claim is, in our view, largely incoherent and in fact in tension with the
basic theory of comparative advantage in trade. Assuming there is nothing wrongful with
another country’s labour policies along the lines discussed in the first part of this chapter,
then why should a cost advantage attributable to these divergent policies not be treated like
any other cost advantage, i.e. as part and parcel of comparative advantage?

Precisely because the implicit benchmark of fairness is so illusory, i.e. a world where
governmentally-imposed labour protection costs are completely equalized among producers
of like products in all countries, trade measures based upon this kind of fairness claim are
likely to be highly manipulable by protectionist interests. Since, of course, protectionists
are really interested in obtaining trade protection, not in promoting labour rights, the fact
that the competitive fairness claim in question does not generate a viable and principled
benchmark for alteration of other countries’ policies is a strength not a weakness—for it
virtually guarantees that justifications for protection will always be available, even if the
targeted country improves its environmental or labour standards.
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Welfare effects of trade restrictions aimed at equalizing
comparative advantage

Trade restrictions will lead to reduced exports, with consequent welfare losses to firms and
workers in the targeted country. Since every foreign producer whose labour rights
compliance costs are less than those of domestic producers will be vulnerable to trade
action, trade restrictions based on equalization of comparative advantage are likely to affect
imports, potentially quite dramatically, from a wide range of countries. Firms and workers
engaged in the manufacture of like products to those imports targeted by trade restrictions
will benefit where the restrictions in question make imports relatively more expensive than
domestic substitutes, thereby shifting demand from imports to domestic production.
Consumers will pay more, probably substantially more, as domestic producers will price up
to the duty imposed by the trade restriction. Here, the welfare effects essentially
resemble those from the imposition of a tariff or countervailing duty. Inasmuch as
production is shifted from lower to higher cost producers, there is also some loss of global
allocative efficiency.

Clearly, overall, these welfare effects entail a shift in wealth to firms and workers in the
trade-restricting country from firms and workers in the targeted country as well as
consumers in the trade-restricting country. In our view, it is difficult to construct a theory
of distributive justice to support the fairness of these transfers.

Competitive fairness claim #2

Whereas competitiveness claim # 1 presumes that governments will not respond to the
competitive implications of higher labour standards, and simply allow domestic firms to
become uncompetitive, the second competitive fairness claim assumes just the opposite—
that governments will respond by lowering domestic standards below the optimal level.

We do not believe that, generally speaking, lowering labour standards is an appropriate
response to competitive pressures. There is, in fact, a wide range of alternatives—such as
better regulation which reduces compliance costs without lowering standards, or investment
in training, technology, etc. to increase the productivity of labour.43

Where governments and/or firms are in fact responding by lowering standards, rather
than through these arguably superior policy alternatives, these sub-optimal policy responses
may represent a political and social problem within countries that are lowering standards in
response to competitive pressures.

A variation of the claim about the effect of competitiveness pressures on domestic labour
standards suggests the possibility of a form of beggar-thy-neighbour behaviour that may,
admittedly, leave all countries worse off. This is the ‘race to the bottom’, whereby countries
competitively lower their labour standards, in an effort to capture a relatively greater share
of a fixed volume of trade or investment.44 Much like the beggar-thy-neighbour subsidies
wars that characterized agricultural trade among the Canada, the US and the EU and other
countries during the 1980s, it is not difficult, using the model of a Prisoner’s Dilemma
game, to show that competitive reduction in environmental or labour standards will
typically result in a negative sum outcome,45 as long as one assumes that before entering the
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race each country’s labour standards represent an optimal domestic policy outcome for that
country.

The ‘race to the bottom’ claim has a different normative basis from the other
competitiveness-based claims discussed above. Those claims relate to the proper
distribution of the competitiveness costs of maintaining higher labour standards than one’s
trading partners. The normative basis for concern over the race to the bottom, by contrast,
sounds in the language of Pareto efficiency: the race ends, literally, at the bottom, with each
country adopting sub-optimal domestic policies, but no country in the end capturing a
larger share of the gains from trade.

Frequently, beggar-thy-neighbour regulatory competition is able to flourish much more
easily where it is possible to reduce on a selective basis labour standards to attract a
particular investment or support a particular industry or firm. It is more difficult and more
costly to engage in these activities where the formal statutory framework of labour
regulation must be altered across-the-board. Here, some of the provisions in the NAFTA
Labour Side Agreement may create disincentives to beggar-thy-neighbour competition in as
much as they oblige the signatories to enforce effectively those labour rights laws that are
formally on the books. At the same time, it must be acknowledged that effectively
monitoring whether a country is fully enforcing its own laws is not an easy task, especially
for outsiders.

Finally, it is possible simply to ban by international agreement beggar-thy-neigh-bour
competition. As noted in Chapter 13 on trade and investment the draft Multilateral
Agreement on Investment is intended to contain a provision that would commit Member
States not to reduce or abrogate labour rights protections in order to attract or retain
foreign investment.

THE EXISTING AND EVOLVING LEGAL AND
INSTITUTIONAL FRAMEWORK

The World Trade Organization

In the Havana Charter, which was to be the blueprint for the failed International Trade
Organization (ITO), there was a stipulation that Members were to take measures against
‘unfair labour conditions’.46 The GATT contains no explicit provision either permitting or
requiring trade action against labour rights violations. Article XX(e), however, permits
otherwise GATT-inconsistent measures ‘relating to the products of prison labour’. The
possibility has been raised that that Article XX(a), which permits otherwise GATT-
inconsistent measures ‘necessary to protect public morals’, might be invoked to justify
trade sanctions against products that involve the use of child labour or the denial or basic
workers’ rights.47 There is no GATT or WTO jurisprudence on the interpretation of XX
(a), and the reference to prison labour in XX(e), as well as the fact that explicit language on
labour rights was in the failed Havana Charter, arguably suggests that if the GATT Article
XX had been designed to encompass sanctions with respect to labour rights, explicit
language would have been used to articulate such an exception. This being said, the
interpretation of public morals should not be frozen in time, and with the evolution of
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human rights as a core element in public morality in many post-war societies and at the
international level the content of public morals should extend to universal human rights,
including labour rights. This is consistent with a dynamic interpretation of Art. XX of the
kind which the AB gave to Art. XX(g) in the Turtles case, discussed earlier in the Trade and
Environment chapter. Feddersen has suggested that provisions of Article XX, other than XX
(e), do not encompass measures with respect to process and production methods (PPMs):
‘the fact that Article XX(e) is the only provision explicitly addressing production methods
strongly indicates that the other Article XX sections were not intended to include measures
based on production methods.’48 This reasoning is obscure if not perverse—the fact that XX
(e) was included leads to just the opposite inference, i.e. that there is nothing about
the basic purpose or structure of Article XX that renders it inapplicable to PPMs, provided
the PPMs in question fall under one of the heads, such as ‘public morals’. Again, as
discussed in the Trade and Environment chapter, the AB in Turtles held that the exceptions
in Art. XX could include measures that condition imports on the policies adopted by the
exporting country.

Insistence by the United States that the possibility of a WTO ‘social clause’ be put on the
post-Uruguay Round multilateral trade agenda led to an extremely tense Singapore WTO
Ministerial in December 1996. In a notorious incident, an invitation to the Director-
General of the ILO to address the Ministerial was withdrawn by the WTO, in response to
pressure from developing countries.49 The communique which issued from the meeting
reflected some abatement of the visceral hostility in the WTO even to engaging in discourse
on the link between trade and labour rights. Thus, according to the Ministerial Declaration,
Ministers ‘renew [their] commitment to the observance of internationally recognized core
labor standards’. At the same time, the ILO ‘is the competent body to set and deal with
these standards’. The use of labour standards for ‘protectionist purposes’ is rejected, which
implies some openness to trade measures that are demonstrated to have non-protectionist
purposes, i.e. not aimed at neutralizing the comparative advantage of developing countries,
but rather at insuring compliance with core standards. There is also a statement that
suggests the WTO and ILO Secretariats should ‘continue their existing collaboration’. The
incident at Singapore, however, suggests that what would be needed is not a continuation of
existing collaboration, but far stronger and more cooperative relations.

In discussions concerning a possible role for the WTO in addressing the links between
trade and labour rights there is frequently considerable confusion or uncertainty about
exactly what kind of role is at issue. One possibility would be for the WTO, through a
discrete legal instrument or possibly an amendment to the GATT and/or GATS, to involve
itself in the taking of multilateral sanctions where a Member has failed to comply with core
labour rights. Such action might be made contingent on a judgment of the ILO that a
Member that is also a signatory to some relevant ILO instrument or Convention is in non-
conformity or has refused to cooperate with ILO organs in addressing the problem.50 One
difficulty that we see with options that entail the taking of sanctions, or other action, by the
WTO itself in connection with labour rights violations, is that the fundamental legal
mandate of the WTO is to police trade; such an approach might then give rise to the
implication that the practices in question are somehow unfair trade practices, a claim that
we reject and as argued above has real potential to lead to protectionist abuse. The more
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coherent approach would be to envisage the role of the WTO as vetting for protectionism
trade sanctions imposed by Members, either unilaterally or multilaterally. Thus, Article XX
of the GATT, or other relevant provisions, would be amended or made subject to an
interpretative understanding that would allow trade sanctions where necessary for purposes
of addressing non-compliance with core labour rights, subject—at a minimum—to the
requirements of the cha-peau of Article XX, i.e. the measures in question must not
constitute ‘arbitrary’ or ‘unjustified’ discrimination, or a ‘disguised restriction on
international trade’. We have suggested above, in the discussion concerning the ‘systemic
threat’, what factors might be taken into consideration in applying the requirements of the
chapeau to measures related to labour rights compliance. A possibility consistent with such
a reform of the WTO system would be that the ILO would become implicated in the
authorization and indeed the mandating of trade sanctions for violations of core labour
rights, as suggested by Charnovitz.51 Such an approach would certainly be diametrically
opposed to the ILO tradition, which emphasizes diplomacy and consensualism, and in fact
does not even encompass binding dispute settlement, let alone enforcement action. A
recent report by ILO research staff notes that discussions in the ILO Working Party on
social dimensions of world trade indicate very strong resistance to any approach that
contemplates the possibility of trade sanctions to enforce compliance with core labour
rights, with the Workers’ group of the Governing body having chosen to ‘suspend’ its
demand for an approach that includes sanctions.52 One alternative approach that has been
suggested, including within the ILO, would be to make compliance with a set of core
labour rights a condition of membership, and subject to enhanced surveillance. This would
almost certainly require amendments to the Conventions, or new legal instruments, as the
existing Conventions that articulate core rights have features that make them inconsistent
with the labour law even of some countries that generally respect workers’ basic rights (for
example many liberal democracies place limits on the right to strike of certain essential
workers). As well, for some countries such as Canada, there have been some difficulties in
ratifying Conventions that relate to the internal division of powers (with sub-national
governments having primary jurisdiction over labour matters). The 1998 ILO Convention
on labour rights is an important step towards a solution to this problem. Alternatively, as
our colleague Brian Langille has sometimes suggested, a list could be created of practices
which all members of the ILO must prohibit, representing an overlapping consensus of the
irreducible minimum content of core workers’ rights.

Internal trade law of the United States and the European
Union

US trade law provides for withdrawal of trade concessions with respect to countries that fail
to respect international workers’ rights. For example, s. 301 of the US Trade and Tariff Act
of 1974 as amended in 1988,53 provides the United States Trade Representative (USTR)
with discretionary authority to recommend a wide variety of trade sanctions against
countries which, inter alia, engage in acts, policies, and practices that ‘constitute a persistent
pattern of conduct denying internationally recognized worker rights’.54 In addition, with
respect to developing countries in particular, trade preferences granted under the GSP55 are
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denied to a country that is determined not to be ‘taking steps’ to implement internationally
recognized workers’ rights.56 These are defined as: the right of association; the right to
organize and bargain collectively; freedom from any kind of forced or compulsory labour; a
minimum age for the employment of children; and acceptable conditions of employment
with respect to minimum wages, hours of work, and occupational safety and health.57

Although application of trade sanctions against unfair labour practices involves a unilateral
judgment by the US authorities about the domestic policies of other countries, the language
of the US statute does suggest as a reference point certain widely accepted international
norms, as reflected in the Conventions of the International Labour Organization.58 In other
words, although the process is unilateral, it refers to rights recognized in international
instruments. Because, as is explained in greater detail in Chapter 14 on trade and
development, the GSP preferences are voluntary commitments, and not bound in any trade
agreement, they may freely be withdrawn without provoking any violation of international
law. S. 301 measures, however, could include withdrawal of trade concessions bound in
WTO schedules, and would therefore result in a conflict with WTO obligations as they
currently stand (subject to justification under Article XX(a), which as discussed above
would entail the rather difficult claim that the measures are necessary to protect ‘public
morals’).

In fact, while GSP preferences have been withdrawn numerous times, s. 301 action has
yet to be taken on the basis of consistent non-compliance with international labour rights. The
relevant legislation with respect to GSP preferences allows interested parties to bring a
petition before the GSP Subcommittee, an interagency group of US trade officials,
requesting review of the labour rights performance of a country with, or seeking, GSP status.
The review may result in a recommendation to the President that a country’s GSP status be
withdrawn. The OECD notes:

In reviewing workers’ rights petitions, the GSP Subcommittee undertakes a thorough
investigation in order to obtain a balanced view using information from a variety of
sources. The Subcommittee looks in particular for evidence of progress in the
country’s legislation and in its practices, and relies on ILO Conventions and
Recommendations as benchmarks for interpreting progress.59

The OECD further notes that the pressure created by public exposure and scrutiny of
labour practices in such reviews may have an impact on performance, even apart from the
threat of actual sanctions through GSP withdrawal. According to the OECD as well, '[from]
1984 through 1995, 40 countries have been named in petitions citing labour rights abuses
according to GSP law’, with fewer than half these cases being pursued by the Subcommittee
to the stage of a formal review.60 According to Dufour, among the countries that have had
their GSP status withdrawn by virtue of a recommendation of the Subcommittee are: the
Central African Republic, Chile, Liberia, Myanmar, Nicaragua, Paraguay, Romania and the
Sudan.61

Finally, there is now legislation pending in the United States that would prohibit
importation of products produced with child labour (the draft Child Labor Deterrence Act); in
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mid-1997 the proposed bill was referred to committees of the House of Representatives and
Senate for comment.

In 1995, the European Union amended its GSP programme so as to condition the
granting of a margin of preferentiality in excess of a base rate upon, inter alia, respect for
certain core labour rights; the relevant EU regulations refer explicitly to the ILO
Conventions concerning freedom of association and collective bargaining, as well as child
labour. This provision came into force in 1998. In addition, GSP status may be withdrawn
altogether where a country permits any form of slavery or the exportation of products made
with prison labour.62

NAFTA and the North American Agreement on Labor
Cooperation (NAALC)

In the context of NAFTA, US concerns in particular about Mexican labour practices led to
the negotiation of a parallel accord on labour standards. Mexican labour laws do provide for
most of the workers rights contained in the ILO Conventions, but are widely believed to be
un- or under-enforced.63 Some proponents of NAFTA attribute this un- or under-
enforcement to a shortage of labour inspectors.64 However, the problem is likely much
more deeply rooted reflecting widespread corruption of politicians or public officials
(especially at the regional or local level), and the use of intimidation and violence to keep
workers from organizing in some parts of Mexico, such as the economically important
Maquiladora zone. Furthermore, as Morici suggests, there may be collusion between the
Mexican government and the official Mexican trade union movement to keep workers
unorganized in the Maquiladoras so as to attract more foreign investment into Mexico.65

The North American Agreement on Labor Cooperation, usually referred to as the
NAFTA Labor Side-Agreement or side-deal, has two major components. The first is a hard
legal obligation on the part of NAFTA Parties to enforce adequately their own domestic
labour laws, particularly with respect to occupational safety and health, child labour and
minimum wage standards (Articles 3,27). This obligation may be described as hard, in that
a binding dispute settlement process may, where there is ‘persistent failure’ to enforce
these labour laws, lead to a monetary judgment against the offending Party. In the case of a
successful action against Canada, the monetary judgment can be enforced through an order
of a Canadian domestic court; in the case of the US and Mexico, it may be enforced through
withdrawal of concessions under NAFTA. Another substantive obligation of the Side-
Agreement is that ‘each Party shall ensure that its labor laws and regulations provide for
high labor standards consistent with high quality and productivity workforces, and shall
continue to strive to improve those standards in that light’ (Article 2). However, this
obligation is hedged by the qualifying language that it is subject to ‘the right of each Party to
establish its own domestic labor standards’, and—unlike the Article 3 obligation—no
means of legal enforcement is contemplated for this obligation.

A Commission for Labor Cooperation is provided for, comprised of a Council and a
Secretariat (Article 8), charged with, inter alia, promoting the collection and dissemination
of data on labour issues, the production and publication of reports and studies, and the
facilitation of consultation between the Parties on labour matters (Article 10). Article 11
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provides a list of specific matters regarding which the Council ‘shall promote cooperative
activities between the Parties, as appropriate’. NAALC Annex 1 states that the Parties are
‘committed to promote’ a range of labour principles, including freedom of association and
the right to organize, prohibition of forced labour, ‘labor protections for children and
young persons’, and elimination of employment discrimination (the commitment to these
and the other principles is subject to the important qualification that no minimum standards
are being set for domestic law).

The primary avenue for complaints by interested Parties that a NAFTA Party is not
enforcing its labour laws is through the National Administrative Office of one of the other
two NAFTA Parties. Thus, the US National Administrative Office (NAO) typically receives
complaints about under-enforcement, or non-enforce-ment of Mexican labour law. The
NAO may accept or reject the complaint for review, and in the case of rejection must
furnish written reasons to the com-plainant. Such a review produces a report, which may or
may not recommend ministerial consultations. The sole avenue through which enforcement
action may eventually be taken against a NAFTA Party is, however, through panel dispute
settlement, and two of the three NAFTA Parties must consent to the striking of a panel. To
date, 12 complaints have been accepted for review by NAOs, with Mexico named as the
offending Party in all but one (which complained of US practices). Several of the
submissions have resulted in Ministerial Consultations. In almost all cases, the complaints
have concerned failure to enforce the right of free association and the right to organize. An
important exception is a recent complaint concerning pregnancy-based discrimination by
Maquiladora employers (submission US 9701). It has been claimed that the publicity effects
of these complaints, and the reports and consultations in which they have resulted, have led
to some positive adjustments in labour law enforcement;66 however the Mexican and in one
case the United States authorities have not surprisingly left unacknowledged the role of the
NAALC in altering their dispositions on the matters at issue. Many of the cases have
involved anti-union activity by major multinational corporations or their local affiliates,
including General Electric, Honeywell and Sprint: in these kinds of cases, an NAO report may
have a positive impact on the practices of the corporation, even if it does not result in the
government itself improving its enforcement of labour laws. In no case has a matter been
taken to an arbitral panel. Because of the role of the provinces in labour matters under the
Canadian constitution, Canada’s full participation in the NAALC process was subject to a
minimum threshold of voluntary provincial involvement. In 1997 the threshold specified in
the NAALC was crossed, with the federal government and three provinces (Manitoba,
Quebec and Alberta) having decided to participate. Finally, there is an additional mechanism
in the NAALC, as yet unused, which contemplates the striking of Evaluation Committees of
Experts, which may be requested by a Party under certain conditions: a Committee may
deal with ‘technical standards’ in eight areas, which include, inter alia, prohibition of forced
labour, labour protection for children and young persons, and elimination of employment
discrimination. 
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CONCLUSION

Increasingly, discussion in the international policy community on the relationship between
liberal trade and labour rights has focused on the issue of compliance with core universal
rights, which have a close relationship to the rights contained in general international human
rights instruments such as the UN Declaration and the UN Covenant on Civil and Political
Rights. Competitiveness-based claims about ‘social dumping’ have become less prominent,
and the notion that the objective should be to obtain some kind of ‘level playing field’
between developed and developing countries is now less and less heard, even from labour
rights advocates on the left of the political spectrum. Complaints under the NAFTA labour
side-agreement, as well as cases where GSP preferences have been unilaterally withdrawn,
or threatened to be withdrawn by the United States, are all cases where the labour practices
or policies have amounted to documented, egregious violations of human rights, often
involving the use of intimidation and violence to impede freedom of association, or even
explicit legal restrictions on the right to organize. In some instances, one may suspect that
the motivations for such practices are the perpetuation of social and political oppression as
opposed to any strategy to promote competitiveness through keeping wage costs low. In
sum, contrary to the picture still painted by some free traders, the claim for a trade and
labour rights link is not some fanatical or protectionist adventure to attempt harmonization
of conditions of work across the world, regardless of different economic and cultural
conditions.

Of course, the overall effects of globalization on the fate of workers continue to be a
subject of intense debate and controversy—in particular, there is the issue of whether freer
trade, along with liberalization of investment and capital flows, has led to greater income
inequality and more precarious conditions of work in the developed world, an issue closely
related to the concerns with respect to adjustment and adjustment policies that we have
discussed in Chapter 9 on safeguards and adjustment and some of the more general critiques
of globalization that we will address in the Conclusion.

Such empirical evidence as is available suggests little relationship between comparative
advantage and compliance with core labour rights. Insistence on compliance with these
rights is thus unlikely to damage the trade prospects of developing countries, and may have
positive dynamic effects, supporting political and social evolution that leads to the kinds of
institutions able to sustain economic growth over time, as well as a more productive
workforce.

The use of trade sanctions to address non-compliance with core labour rights remains
highly controversial, even if there is much greater understanding of what these rights are,
and renewed impetus at the ILO to define more precisely their irreducible content (as
reflected in the June 1998 ILO Declaration), as well as more effective mechanisms for
monitoring and reporting. The main impact of this lack of agreement is that some of the most
powerful developed countries will continue to impose their own sanctions through the
withdrawal of GSP preferences—measures that are perfectly legal under existing
multilateral trading rules. By failing to respond to the demand for a social clause within the
WTO, the Organization has simply created an incentive for developed countries to make
fewer offers for tariff cuts on an MFN basis in future rounds of negotiations (especially on
products of interest to developing countries), so as to preserve the impact that comes from
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being able to grant—and withdraw—GSP treatment. This is a consequence that free
traders who are dogmatic opponents of a place within the WTO for permissible trade
sanctions should consider more carefully. 
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17
Trade and competition policy

THE BASIC ECONOMIC FUNCTION OF COMPETITION
LAWS

In exploring the relationship between trade policy and competition policy, it is useful at the
outset to review briefly the underlying economic theory on the welfare implications of
monopoly, so that similarities and differences in the welfare frameworks that conventionally
animate both trade policy and competition policy can be clearly kept in focus.1 The concept
of ‘market power’ or ‘monopoly power’—these terms will be used interchangeably—
drives most aspects of modern competition laws. Whether one is concerned with a single
firm monopoly, competitors colluding with a view to acting as if they were a monopoly, a
firm seeking to predate on existing or potential rivals in order to exclude them from the
market, restrictive vertical distribution arrangements, or a merger that may lead to a dominant
position, in every case the focus is on the social welfare implications of excessive market
power. In economic terms, market power basically means the ability to increase prices
profitably above (or reduce non-price dimensions of competition below) competitive levels
by a non-trivial amount for an extended period of time. In order to establish whether any of
the foregoing arrangements involve excessive market power, it is obviously necessary to
define one or more relevant product and geographic markets in which the firms in question
are alleged to be exercising market power, which largely turns on demand-side and supply-
side substitution possibilities—an exercise that is central and problematic in most antitrust
cases.2 Whether market power in a market, once defined, can in fact be effectively
exercised turns on factors such as whether incumbents’ market shares indicate a likelihood
of unilateral abuse of dominance or explicit or tacit collusion and the scale of barriers to
entry (including regulatory barriers, trade barriers, incumbents’ intellectual property
rights, minimum viable scale of entry and the extent of entrants’ sunk costs, access to
critical inputs and distribution channels, and customers’ switching costs).

The traditional economic analysis of monopoly has a structural and static focus. It
examines the welfare implications of a firm being a monopolist. Although most laws relating
to monopolization or abuse of dominant position deal with conduct entailed in attempting to
acquire, defend or enlarge a monopoly position, the static analysis provides the foundation
for legal concerns that have a more dynamic or conduct-oriented focus. Thus, we begin
with this conventional static analysis, which is shown in Figure 17.1.



In a ‘perfectly competitive’ market, firms would price at PC (where the marginal cost
curve intersects the industry demand curve), and would produce QC of output. Aside from
transitory effects, there are no ‘economic profits’ to be made. The monopolist, in contrast,
will maximize its profits by restricting output to QM the point at which its marginal cost
and marginal revenue curves intersect.3 It therefore prices at PM.4

As can be observed from Figure 17.1, there are several undesirable consequences of
monopoly relative to a competitive market. First, quantity is lower (by QC-QM). Second,
price is higher (by PM-PC). Third, consumers on the demand curve between PC and PM
are priced out of the market even though the resource costs entailed in serving them (as
represented by MC1) are lower than the prices that they are willing to pay. Compelling
them to reallocate their expenditures to less preferred forms of consumption creates the so-
called ‘dead-weight-loss’ triangle designated as DWL in the diagram (allocative
inefficiency). Fourth, consumers who remain in the market (i.e. those consumers on the
demand curve above PM) are required to transfer part of the ‘consumer surplus’ that they
would have realized under competitive conditions (with price at PC) to the monopolist (as
reflected in the hatched rectangle). Although such wealth transfers in themselves have
purely distributional effects and are not a misallocation of resources, political opposition to
monopolies often focuses on this factor. Moreover, it may often be the case that the lure of
monopoly profits will induce socially wasteful investments in rent-seeking activities,
rendering at least part of the rectangle indirectly an additional measure of resource
misallocation.5 Finally, some lines of objection to monopoly are non-economic in nature,
such as populist concerns that large concentrations of economic power carry the potential
for undue political influence.6 

The model of monopoly depicted in Figure 17.1 assumes a single monopoly price.
However, a monopolist may be able to do even better than this if it is able to price
discriminate by raising the price to highly inelastic customers on the demand curve above
PM and/or lowering the price to more elastic customers on the demand curve between PM

Figure 17.1 Welfare effects of monopoly
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and PC. At the limit, a perfectly discriminating monopolist would charge every consumer
on the demand curve his or her reservation price and appropriate the entire consumer
surplus under the demand curve and above PC. While this strategy would exacerbate the
wealth transfer implications of monopoly noted above, it would also raise the monopolist’s
output to the competitive level (QC) by ensuring that all consumers prepared to pay more
than the resource costs of producing a unit of output are in fact served, thus eliminating the
dead-weight-loss triangle (or allocative inefficiency). In the real world, however, perfect
price discrimination is almost never feasible because it would entail a monopolist having
both perfect information about each customer’s reservation price (i.e. elasticity of demand)
and the ability to prevent arbitrage between low price and high price purchasers. Thus, one
is more likely to observe attempts to segment customers into several broad groups (e.g.
business and leisure travellers, adult and children cinema-goers, etc.), who are charged
different prices reflecting general differences in their elasticities of demand. In such cases it
is not possible, as a matter of a priori analysis, to deduce whether total industry output is
likely to rise or fall relative to the single monopoly price scenario (although typically it will
rise).7

There is an important additional implication of monopoly to be noted from Figure 17.1.
Suppose that in moving from a competitive to a monopolized industry the monopolist is
able to reduce its cost of production from MC1 to MC2 through various economies of scale
and/or scope, thus releasing resources for more productive use elsewhere in the economy.
Two opposing welfare (as opposed to distributional) effects result. The negative welfare
(i.e. misallocation) implications of the dead-weight-loss associated with monopoly remain,
but there are now also productive efficiency gains from the savings in resources. As
Williamson demonstrated in a seminal article with respect to mergers, depending on the
elasticity of demand (and therefore the size of the dead-weight-loss triangle), if monopoly
results in a reduction in average costs in the order of 5–10%, the merger must give rise to price
increases in excess of 20% (with an elasticity of 0.2) and in excess of 40% (with an elasticity
of 0.05) for the net allocative effects to be negative.8 This raises difficult questions as to
whether some form of efficiency defence should be available to firms achieving monopoly
power.9 In effect, this would entail the adoption of a total welfare rather than consumer
welfare criterion, i.e. maximization of the sum of producer and consumer surplus.

It should be noted that some analysts worry about the opposite phenomenon.
Undisciplined by competition, a monopolist may be able to enjoy ‘the quiet life’ which,
through excessive management perks and general organizational slack, results in its costs
rising above or rates of innovation falling below the level which would prevail in a
competitive market (‘X or dynamic inefficiency’). Other commentators discount this
possibility by arguing that even monopolists (or their shareholders) have an incentive to
maximize rather than dissipate monopoly rents (although this may not be as likely in the
case of state-owned monopolies where monitoring incentives are often weak).

An important point to emphasize from this brief review of the basic economics of
monopoly is that economic concerns over the effects of monopoly (or market power) focus
primarily on its adverse effects on consumers. Competition policy is thus primarily
concerned with protecting consumer welfare, not preserving some given state of competition
or number of competitors. Conceived of as consumer protection legislation, competition
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laws should not be encumbered with other policy objectives such as protecting small
businesses, or industrial policy concerns such as promoting ‘national champions’, or
populist political objectives. This view of the purposes of competition policy has now won
wide acceptance amongst antitrust scholars and enforcement authorities in the United
States, Canada, the EU and many other industrialized countries (while recognizing that this
still leaves room for much debate as to the effects on consumer welfare of particular
practices in particular cases). This has been an important advance over earlier and widely
divergent understandings as to the purposes of competition policy. It also provides a
normative framework consistent with liberal trade policies for assessing the global welfare
effects of both public and private restrictions on competition.

INTERNATIONAL DIMENSIONS OF COMPETITION LAWS10

The nature of the concerns

The US and Canada have possessed domestic competition laws for more than a century. For
many other industrialized countries and the European Union, competition laws are a much
more recent phenomenon (mostly adopted after the Second World War). Almost half the
members of the GATT/WTO have no competition laws at all and may, in many cases, lack
the institutional capacity to implement and administer an effective domestic competition law
regime. Amongst Member countries with such laws, there are significant substantive,
institutional and procedural differences.11 These differences or divergences in domestic
antitrust or competition regimes have led to increasing calls for harmonization or
integration much like the impetus for harmonizing domestic Intellectual Property regimes
that led to the Uruguay Round TRIPS agreement. Dr Sylvia Ostry argues12 that, as tariffs
and other border measures have been eliminated or reduced, the new arena for international
policy cooperation is moving beyond the border to domestic policies. The basic reason for
this shift lies in changes in the extent and nature of the international linkages among
countries, which have produced a new type of friction which she calls ‘system friction’.
Ostry argues that a globalizing world has a low tolerance for system divergence. In
particular, different traditions of government involvement in domestic economies and
different industrial organization traditions have rendered increasingly contentious public-
private distinctions in international trade law where trade regimes have traditionally focused
on governmentally-induced impediments to trade but not private restrictions on
competition (including foreign competition). This view often argues for broad international
commitments to ensuring effective market access or contestability, whatever the source of
existing constraints thereon.

In this chapter we ask how domestic competition policies (or their absence or ineffective
or selective enforcement of them) may improperly constrain international trade and
investment.13 It is now widely argued that as firms attempt to improve or maintain their
competitive position in an increasingly more open economic environment, they may take
actions aimed at effectively locking competing imports or foreign investors out of their
domestic market. A dominant firm or a colluding group may engage in predatory
behaviour, such as price cutting, to fend off the efforts of a foreign rival trying to get access
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to its market. Some forms of price discrimination, such as loyalty bonuses, rebates and
discounts accorded to local purchasers may deter them from dealing with foreign firms. A
group of firms may engage in horizontal exclusionary behaviour by collectively practising
predatory pricing or by collectively boycotting distributors who deal with foreign firms
seeking to gain access or suppliers who deal with foreign firms trying to establish a
presence. Import cartels may seek to exercise monopsony power against foreign suppliers.
The operation of trade associations may also be anti-competitive if they provide a forum to
organize industry cartels with exclusionary effects on foreign competitors or are used to
discriminate against foreign controlled domestic companies by limiting their rights to
participate in association activities, including access to product or service certification
regimes, thus impairing their competitiveness. Vertical restraints may also be a vehicle to
impede market access and presence. If incumbent manufacturers have tied up all
distributors or retailers through exclusive dealing arrangements or through full vertical
integration, a foreign entrant will have to overcome barriers created by the larger amount of
capital required and risks entailed in setting up its own distribution network. Alternatively,
a producer which controls all distribution outlets may charge foreign rivals a higher price in
order to allow access to the market, thus limiting their competitiveness. Global
rationalization through mergers and acquisitions can promote monopoly, oligopoly or
oligopsony in domestic markets. Strategic alliances, which are becoming increasingly
common in high technology sectors where R&D costs are often substantial, may be
efficiency enhancing but may also provide a vehicle to segment markets or to achieve a
dominant posi-tion.14 State-owned or protected monopolies may foreclose competitive
foreign entry and distort competitive conditions in upstream or downstream competitive
markets in which these domestic entities are also active. Firms given protected home
market positions may be able to use their supracompetitive profits to engage in ‘strategic’
(predatory) dumping in export markets. Alternatively, monopolies or mergers leading to
dominant positions may be permitted by domestic antitrust authorities if most of their
output is sold in foreign markets where rents can be realized by supracompetitive prices at
the expense of reductions in foreign consumer welfare; similarly, in the case of export cartels
or domestic cartels that sell most of their output in foreign markets. 

Past efforts at international coordination of domestic
competition policies

This section provides a brief historical review of efforts at international
coordination of domestic competition policies.

Multilateral fora

In the 1940s the precursor to the GATT—the Havana Charter and the International Trade
Organization that it contemplated—envisaged multilateral regulation and review of
restrictive business practices (Chapter V). These provisions would have obliged the
Members of the proposed ITO to take appropriate measures to prevent private commercial
enterprises that had effective control of trade from restraining competition, limiting access
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to markets, or fostering monopolistic control in international trade. Member nations would
have been entitled to complain about prohibited restraints to the ITO. The ITO would have
been authorized to investigate and to demand information in the course of its investigation,
and to recommend remedial action to the governments of Member nations. Upon finding a
complaint valid, the ITO would have been required to publish its findings and request full
reports from the offending Member State about the progress of its remedial measures.
However, the Charter could not withstand opposition in the US Congress motivated by
concerns over institutional incursions into US domestic political sovereignty.15

In 1953 the United States, Canada and others, through the Economic and Social Council
of the United Nations, prepared a draft agreement envisaging the formation of an
international coordinating agency which would receive, investigate and recommend
remedial action relating to complaints about restrictive business practices in international
trade. Five years later, at the instance of Norway, the GATT struck a committee to study
the extent to which, and how, the GATT should undertake to deal with such practices.
These early attempts to reach international agreements yielded no practical results:
differences in national policies at the time were too great to move beyond general
recommendations.16

In 1980, the United Nations Conference on Trade and Development (UNCTAD)
adopted a Code on Restrictive Business Practices.17 However, the Code takes the form of
recommendations which lack binding legal force, and it has had negligible impact. Similarly,
the UN Commission on Transnational Corporations has encountered severe difficulties in
attracting legal endorsement by industrialized countries of a proposed Code of Conduct for
TNCs, which would include provisions on restrictive business practices similar to those
contained in the UNCTAD Code.18 In both cases, developing countries promoted provisions
designed to control and regulate the conduct of multinational enterprises that were widely
perceived in less-developed countries as abusive and rapacious, while developed countries
sought to apply strong competition principles to state-owned as well as private enterprises.
These differences in perspective resulted in often vague and largely exhortatory
provisions.19 The OECD Agreement on Restrictive Practices Affecting International Trade
of 1986 (which has a lineage dating back to more modest OECD initiatives beginning in
1959) is endorsed by all OECD Members but imposes only modest obligations, i.e.
Member States commit themselves to notifying other Member States where enforcement
action is contemplated that may affect important interests of the latter and to providing an
opportunity for consultations.20 Conciliation provisions, including use of the good offices of
the OECD Committee on Competition Law and Policy, in the event of Members being
unable to resolve conflicts, have rarely—if ever—been invoked.

An important recent development has been the incorporation of competition-related
provisions in various GATT/WTO Agreements.21 These include:

1 The Agreement on Technical Barriers to Trade contains detailed rules regulating the
adoption of technical regulations and conformity assessment procedures by non-
governmental bodies to ensure that they are not more trade restrictive than necessary.

2 The Understanding on the Interpretation of Articles XVII of the GATT provides for
increased surveillance of state trading enterprises.
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3 The Agreement on Safeguards requires Member States not to encourage or support the
adoption or maintenance by public and private enterprises of equivalent non-
governmental measures to voluntary exports restraints.

4 The General Agreement on Trade in Services includes rules designed to ensure that
monopolies and exclusive service suppliers do not nullify or impair obligations and
commitments under the GATS, particularly where monopolies are also active in
related competitive market segments. The 1997 Plurilateral Agreement on Basic
Telecommunications Service incorporates regulatory principles aimed at preventing
anti-competitive practices by major suppliers (such as anti-competitive cross-
subsidization, use of information obtained from competitors, and withholding
technical and commercial information) and ensuring that the interconnection practices
of such suppliers do not impede market access and meet non-discrimination
requirements.

5 The TRIPS Agreement permits the application of competition policy to abuse of
intellectual property rights, including compulsory licensing.

6 The Agreement on Government Procurement regulates tendering procedures so as to
ensure optimum effective international competition and addresses certain competition
problems such as collusive tendering.

7 The TRIMS Agreement requires the WTO Council on Trade in Goods to consider
whether the Agreement should be complemented with provisions on investment
policy and competition policy.

8 The Draft Multilateral Agreement on Investment being negotiated under the auspices
of the OECD also contemplates the possibility of including commitments to prevent
abuses of dominant position by public or private monopolies.

9 At the first WTO Ministerial in December 1996 in Singapore, Members agreed to
constitute a WTO Working Group to study more broadly the interaction between
trade policy and competition policy.

Bilateral agreements22

The United States has negotiated formal, bilateral, competition-law enforcement Protocols
with Canada23 (recently re-negotiated and expanded),24 Australia,25 Germany,26 and the
EU.27 While important variations exist among these Protocols, all are roughly patterned on
a model of cooperation recommended by the OEGD and now promoted by the US
International Antitrust Enforcement Assistance Act of 1994.28 They do not extend, for the most
part, beyond requiring the Parties to notify each other of pending enforcement actions that
may have an impact on important interests of the other Party, and to take account of the
views of the latter in deciding whether to proceed.29 The Canada—US Mutual Legal
Assistance Treaty goes somewhat further in requiring assistance from the Parties in criminal
matters (including criminal aspects of competition policy), extending to the use of formal
investigative powers where suspected criminal conduct has occurred in one country but the
Parties involved in the conduct reside in the other country. The recent US-EU Protocol and
the renegotiated Canada-US Agreement go somewhat further again in identifying a set of both
negative and positive comity principles by which the Parties will be guided in deciding
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whether to forgo or exercise jurisdiction. Positive comity principles require a country to
give sympathetic consideration to taking enforcement action against conduct on its territory
that is allegedly causing harm to interests in another country. Negative comity principles, in
contrast, require a country not to take enforcement action that may affect another country’s
nationals before consulting the latter country’s government.

Regional trading blocs

Under Articles 85 and 86 of the Treaty of Rome, the EU has been successful in adopting a
unified competition policy for all Member States with respect to transactions that have a
Community dimension. Moreover, with respect to transactions covered by the Treaty,
enforcement is unified in the European Commission, and ultimate adjudicative authority
resides with the European Court of Justice.30

NAFTA contains a short chapter (Chapter 15) on Competition Policy, Monopolies and
State Enterprises. Under this chapter, each Party commits itself to adopting and maintaining
measures to proscribe anti-competitive business conduct and to take appropriate action with
respect thereto. Pursuant to this commitment, Mexico recently enacted a comprehensive
competition law.31 The Parties also commit themselves to cooperating on issues of
competition-law enforcement policy, including mutual legal assistance, notification,
consultation and exchange of information relating to the enforcement of competition laws
in the free trade area. However, no Party may have recourse to dispute settlement under
the Agreement in the foregoing matters. In the case of monopolies and state enterprises,
each Party commits itself to ensuring that state-sanctioned monopolies will minimize or
eliminate any nullification or impairment of benefits anticipated under the Agreement.
Moreover, in the case of both privately owned and government-owned monopolies, they
are committed to act solely in accordance with commercial considerations in the purchase
or sale of goods or services in the relevant market, and to provide non-discriminatory
treatment to investments of investors, and to goods and service providers, of another Party.32

With respect to services generally, Article 1201 contains several obligations aimed at
ensuring that licensing and certification measures of Parties do not ‘constitute an
unnecessary barrier to trade’. The telecommunications chapter (Chapter 13) provides that
where a monopolist competes in a segment of the market that is open to competition, a
Party must ensure ‘that the monopoly does not use its monopoly to engage in anti-
competitive conduct’, including discriminatory network access requirements. Under the
intellectual property chapter (Chapter 17), Parties may limit the intellectual property rights
they are otherwise obligated to recognize where licensing practices or conditions ‘constitute
abuses of intellectual property rights having an adverse effect on competition in the relevant
market’. In the case of patents, compulsory licensing is explicitly contemplated as a
potential remedy.

This brief historical sketch of efforts to date, either to harmonize domestic competition
laws or to create some form of supranational review process for anti-competitive or
restrictive business practices, suggests modest progress over the past four decades (with the
notable exception of the European Union).
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A framework for evaluating future international initiatives

In considering future reform strategies, the ‘system frictions’ thesis advanced by Ostry is not
especially helpful as an analytical guide. In a world of nation states, system frictions are
everywhere. If the whole world spoke the same language, there would be fewer system
frictions (e.g. in facilitating foreign investment). If everybody in the world drove on the
same side of the road, there would again be fewer system frictions (e.g. in exporting
automobiles). If preferences and priorities regarding education and credentialling policies,
labour policies, environmental policies, culture, health care, law and order and the rule of
law, property rights, and almost every other area of domestic policymaking one could
identify were the same the world over, there would be fewer system frictions. However, in
her otherwise magisterial Handler Lecture on the evolution of competition policy,
Professor Eleanor Fox speaks repeatedly of her vision of ‘one world’ and the inspiration
afforded to the rest of the world in this context by the evolution of the European Union.33

Reflecting this perspective, the Draft International Antitrust Code34 (the Munich Code)
published by the International Antitrust Working Group (primarily a group of German
competition scholars), proposes a complete mandatory World Competition Code. This
Code sets out minimum standards to be incorporated into the GATT, and enforceable in
domestic jurisdictions by an International Antitrust Authority operating under the auspices
of the new World Trade Organization (WTO), with disputes being adjudicated by a
permanent International Antitrust Panel operating as part of the new GATT dispute
resolution regime.35 In some respects, this proposal is a more ambitious form of the
Uruguay Round GATT Agreement on Intellectual Property, which provides for common
minimum substantive and procedural standards to be applied by domestic administrative
and judicial authorities, subject to international dispute resolution mechanisms. The
difficulties and controversies engendered in negotiating this more modest multilateral
harmonization regime should be salutary.36

This general captivation with the European Union model seems to be seriously misguided
in the present context. In few, if any, other parts of the world do the special geo-political
circumstances which led to the evolution of the European Union exist, and the prospects
for creating the supranational institutions which have been central to the integration project
of the European Union are close to non-existent. In a multilateral context such as the
GATT/WTO, agreement amongst the more than 130 Member States on both the substance
and enforcement of domestic competition laws would seem remote.

In our view, it is difficult to approach the case for harmonizing domestic competition laws
in a substantially different way from that of harmonizing any number of other domestic laws
or policies that may create ‘system frictions’. In thinking about harmonization issues
generally, and competition policy issues specifically, in either a regional or multilateral
context, it is useful to bear in mind the distinction often drawn in the economic integration
literature between negative and positive integration.37 Negative integration essentially tells
countries what policies they may not adopt, while positive integration tells countries which
policies they must adopt. It is obviously true that harmonized domestic laws and policies are
likely to reduce the administrative (compliance) costs of firms operating across a wide range
of jurisdictions, which would have to undertake compliance with only one set of rules. In this
respect, harmonization can facilitate freer movement of goods, services and capital. Second,
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differential or distinctive regulatory requirements can constitute a barrier to entry to a
foreign market, where a foreign producer is required to adapt its products to distinctive
requirements of the importing jurisdiction. Third, common regulatory standards across a
range of jurisdictions may enable economies of scale in production and distribution to be
realized. However, as David Leebron suggests, ‘if the optimal policies for national
populations do differ, then harmonization requires that some measure of local welfare be
sacri-ficed.’38 These welfare losses are unlikely to be completely captured in measured
income estimates. It is true that in many contexts, domestic policies may not reflect the
true preferences of a majority of the population, perhaps because the government is
undemocratic or even predatory. In other cases, policy differences may largely reflect the
contingencies of history and no longer reflect current social objectives or at least the most
appropriate means of realizing them (but rather simply policy inertia). In these cases, policy
harmonization carries few, if any, costs, and potentially significant benefits. But in a wide
range of other cases Leebron’s observation presumably holds true. Indeed, many pro-free
trade economists, who have generally supported harmonization efforts within the European
Union and elsewhere, have at least implicitly recognized this in their rejection of fair trade
and related harmonization claims in the labour and environmental areas.39

Professor Fox herself, in a paper with Professor Ordover, recognizes
these considerations in identifying as ‘the aspiration and guiding light world welfare,
appropriate sovereignty, and national autonomy’, or ‘the one-world-with-appropriate-
autonomy vision’,40 but rather like Ostry’s ‘system friction’ thesis, this ‘guiding light’
provides very little purchase, in itself (like the elusive concept of ‘subsidiarity’ in the EU),
on how to strike the appropriate balance. In other papers,41 she spells out in more detail
this more cautious vision—what she describes as ‘a targeted constitutional approach’, in
contrast to a ‘comprehensive’ approach, on the one hand, or a ‘minimalist’ approach, on
the other. A somewhat similar approach has recently been proposed by an EC Expert
Group42 in the form of a plurilateral agreement containing (1) procedural rules relating to
notification, cooperation, and negative and positive comity obligations; (2) minimum
substantive rules for cross-border cases to be embodied in domestic competition laws of
signatories; and (3) an international institutional structure to perform monitoring and
dispute resolution functions.

We believe that a cautious approach is warranted to proposals for radical harmonization
of domestic laws and policies, including competition policies. In adopting this more
cautious approach, we return to the negative and positive integration distinction noted above.
International trade treaties such as the GATT have traditionally emphasized negative
integration, i.e. what kinds of policies countries may not adopt, and in particular, have
prohibited the adoption of domestic policies that either explicitly or implicitly discriminate
either between foreign trading powers (the Most Favoured Nation principle) or that
discriminate between domestic producers and foreign producers (the National Treatment
principle), at least beyond certain clearly identified exceptions such as bound tariffs and
health and safety and related exceptions set out in Article XX of the GATT, and national
security exceptions set out in Article XXI of the GATT. In a competition policy context,
Bacchetta, Horn and Mavroidis43 usefully distinguish between ‘spillovers’ and ‘distortions’
from domestic competition policy. A negative spillover may occur where a competition
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policy decision taken in one country has adverse effects on Parties in another. For example,
an efficiency enhancing merger permitted in country A may disadvantage competitors in
country B, or a price fixing prosecution in country A may disadvantage conspirators located
in country B but trading into country A’s market, but in neither case is there necessarily a
distortion from a global perspective. This would entail evaluating whether the decision
reduces global welfare, defined as the maximization of global consumer and producer
surplus. Only when a domestic competition policy decision, while perhaps maximizing
domestic welfare, reduces global welfare is there presumptively the kind of distortion that
causes a tension in the interface between competition policy and trade policy.

APPLICATION OF FRAMEWORK TO SPECIFIC ASPECTS OF
COMPETITION POLICY

In developing a tractable agenda for reconciling domestic competition policies and
international trade policies, this approach enables us to develop a useful purchase on a
number of problems. First, exemption from, or non-enforcement of, competition laws for
export or import cartels are clearly discriminatory, in that they explicitly treat either
domestic producers or domestic consumers differently from foreign producers or foreign
consumers.44 While dispensations for export or import cartels may enhance national
income (at least in the case of export cartels) in the short run, they are myopic in that they
encourage a downward spiral or beggar-thy-neighbour dynamic through reciprocal
measures that in the long run reduce both national and global welfare (much as with reciprocal
tariffs).45 These are easy cases. These dispensations should be removed and appropriate
procedural mechanisms adopted for ensuring non-discriminatory enforcement of anti-
collusion laws. With respect to these procedural mechanisms, Professor Fox has developed
some useful proposals. She suggests that, at least with respect to export market access, the
home (importing) nation where the internal market conduct has occurred should have the
primary right to take enforcement measures. A harmed nation may request a home nation
to take enforcement action against an apparent violation, and the home nation should be
obliged to give sympathetic regard to this request. If recourse cannot be had through action
by home nation authorities or otherwise in home nation courts, the harmed nation should
be entitled to assert enforcement jurisdiction over the subject matter of the controversy, but
at the option of the defendant the court should apply the substantive principles of the
defendant nation's law.46 Assertion of jurisdiction by the harmed nation will, of course, be
of little value if the injurers maintain no presence in the form of personnel or assets in the
harmed country's territory. Thus, an additional step would be to build on the Chapter 19
binational panel experience under the FTA and NAFTA, relating to the application of
domestic trade remedy laws,47 by providing a WTO or NAFTA panel procedure whereby
aggrieved foreign Parties (states or firms) could complain to a supranational panel in cases
where it is alleged that Member States are not faithfully interpreting or enforcing their own
domestic competition laws in a non-discriminatory manner.

There also appear to be easy cases at the other end of the spectrum. Foreign producers
trading into the United States market who collude to fix prices in the United States market
should not be permitted to complain of the relatively stringent United States price fixing
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laws, on the grounds that in their home jurisdiction price fixing laws are lax or non-
existent. Thus, we see no objection to the United States asserting jurisdiction in such cases,
as the majority of the United States Supreme Court held in Hartford Fire Insurance Co. v.
California.48 In Hartford, where United States insurers were alleged to have conspired with
UK re-insurers to curtail the availability of certain forms of liability insurance coverage in
the United States market, to have treated local insurers as subject to domestic price fixing
laws while exempting foreign re-insurers on grounds of extraterritoriality would have
entailed discrimination in favour of foreign firms relative to domestic firms. On the other
hand, to the extent that domestic insurers were able to claim the insurance exemption
under the McCarran-Ferguson Act from United States antitrust laws, then to hold the foreign
re-insurers liable would have entailed discrimination against them relative to domestic
insurers.

Conversely, United States producers trading into or investing in jurisdictions with lax or
non-existent anti-collusion laws (that for example may affect the price or supply of inputs)
equally have no basis for complaint, provided that these policies are applied in a non-
discriminatory manner. This observation would extend to permissive provisions on joint
research and production ventures, research consor-tia and other forms of strategic alliances,
provided again that the provisions are not framed or applied in a discriminatory manner.
We are thus sceptical of the case for the United States asserting jurisdiction against
Pilkington Glass49 in a recent suit, alleging restrictive distribution arrangements impeding
effective market access by United States competitors to other markets around the world.50

Equally, United States or other producers trading into or operating in the European market
have no basis for complaint because the abuse of dominant position provisions of Article 86
of the Treaty of Rome are applied somewhat more stringently than the monopolization
provisions in Section 2 of the Sherman Act. Similarly, if the European Union should choose
to take account of industrial policy considerations, and not only consumer welfare
considerations, in the administration of its merger law, or conversely some other country
should apply its merger law in a more populist fashion designed to prevent concentrations
of economic power, foreign firms operating in these markets, notwithstanding sharp
differences from competition laws obtaining in their home market, should accept the local
rules of the game (whether perceived to be well-conceived or not), provided that these rules
are applied in a non-discriminatory fashion to both domestic and foreign firms. Again, if one
country chooses to create or maintain state-owned or sanctioned monopolies in some
sectors, foreign producers should have no right of complaint about being excluded from
these markets, given that other domestic producers face similar exclusion, although
discrimination by such monopolies in sales or purchasing decisions against foreign firms
would be objectionable (as both the GATT and NAFTA presently provide).51

Other cases are admittedly more difficult. One controversial case relates to the relatively
quiescent state of Japanese competition law as it applies to both vertical and horizontal
keiretsu. Vertical production and distribution keiretsu and other exclusive dealing arrangements
are often alleged to prevent foreign firms from gaining ready access to Japanese
manufacturing, retail and distribution networks. These issues figured prominently in an
important (1998) GATT/WTO panel proceeding involving a complaint by the US on
behalf of Eastman Kodak that Fuji, with government support enjoyed access to an exclusive
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wholesale and retail distribution system in Japan for consumer film to which Kodak (and
other foreign film producers) could not gain access.52 The US alleged under Article XXIII(1)
(b) of the GATT that various Japanese government measures constituted non-violation
nullification and impairment of benefits reasonably anticipated by the US under tariff
concessions on consumer film made by Japan during the Kennedy, Tokyo and Uruguay
Rounds. These measures covered (1) distribution measures which allegedly encouraged and
facilitated the creation of a market structure in consumer film in which imports are
excluded from traditional distribution channels; (2) restrictions on large retail stores, which
allegedly restrict the growth of an alternative distribution channel for imported film; and
(3) promotion restrictions which allegedly disadvantage imports by restricting the use of
sales promotion techniques that foreign suppliers might wish to deploy in expanding their
presence in the Japanese market. In the alternative, the US argued that many of these
practices were a violation of the National Treatment principle contained in Article 111(4)
of the GATT.

The WTO panel rejected all of the US allegations. As to non-violation nullification and
impairment, the panel held that the US bore the burden of adducing ‘a detailed justification’
for its allegations, recognizing the exceptional nature of this ground of complaint. This
justification would need to address three issues: (1) whether the practices in question were
government ‘measures’; (2) if so, whether the measure in question related to a benefit
reasonably anticipated to accrue from prior tariff concessions by upsetting the competitive
relationship between imports and domestic products; and (3) whether the benefit accruing
to the complainant state had in fact been nullified or impaired by the measure in question
(causality).

The panel affirmed that purely private rather than governmental measures were not
reviewable under the GATT, and that purely advisory reports or recommendations to
government by specialist committees and task forces were not government measures,
unless clearly adopted or acted on by government. However, the panel was prepared to
accept that many traditional forms of ‘administrative guidance’ engaged in by the Japanese
government constituted government measures, even though informal and lacking explicit
sanctions, provided that such guidance entailed implicit incentives or disincentives to
comply.

With respect to the requirement that a challenged measure relate to a reasonably
anticipated benefit from prior tariff concessions, the panel held that many of the disputed
measures were in force prior to the concessions in question and imputed knowledge of them
to the US government, rejecting the latter’s claim of opaque-ness or unpredictability in
administration.

With respect to the requirement that the measures in question cause the nullification or
impairment of a benefit reasonably anticipated from the prior tariff concessions, the panel
found that none of the measures were de jure or de facto discriminatory and applied equally
to domestic and foreign suppliers. For similar reasons, the panel rejected US claims of
violation of the National Treatment principle.

In the wake of this decision, the US government announced an inter-agency monitoring
committee whereby Japanese government assurances to the WTO panel on non-
discriminatory access to Japan’s distribution channels, on large retail stores and on non-
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restrictive application of promotions laws, so as to permit free competition with respect to
pricing and quality, are viewed as ‘commitments’ potentially attracting s. 301 trade
sanctions if not lived up to.

Horizontal keiretsu, because of the prominent role played by lead banks and because of
cross-shareholdings, are alleged to prevent foreign investors from readily acquiring Japanese
firms as a means of lower cost and more efficient entry into the Japanese market than
greenfield entry. Data indicate a dramatically lower level of foreign investment stock in
Japan than most other industrialized economies, and notwithstanding the major growth in
foreign direct investment flows in the 1980s, dramatically lower levels of inflows into Japan.53

It is true, of course, that Japanese competition laws on these matters are facially neutral as
between the ability of domestic and foreign firms to challenge these arrangements, although
one should not be so naïve as to terminate the analysis there. If, as in the case of import
cartels, the evidence disclosed discrimination in the application and enforcement of these
laws depending on whether the complainant was a domestic firm or a foreign firm, this would
constitute a form of discrimination for our purposes. Moreover, even if the laws were both
framed and enforced in a neutral fashion, one would still want to ask (as many GATT
decisions under Article III (National Treatment) and Article XX (exceptions to GATT
obligations)) have done, whether these laws are a form of disguised protectionism or
discrimination. This question is not always easily answered, because it may be the case that
Japanese competition laws do have a disparate impact on foreign exporters or investors
relative to domestic producers. However, this is equally true (as argued above) of different
language laws, driving laws, etc., so that mere demonstration of disparate impact is not
sufficient unless disparate impact is also indicative of a disguised attempt at discrimination.
In the case of the Japanese keiretsu, given the central role that they have traditionally played
in corporate governance and organizational structures in Japan,54 it is difficult to believe
that the primary purpose for their adoption has been to differentially disadvantage foreign
producers, even though that may be a consequence. An ironic feature of current United
States concerns over Japanese vertical arrangements and lack of antitrust scrutiny of them is
that much recent thinking amongst United States antitrust scholars (reflected increasingly in
United States case-law) has rejected sinister (anti-competitive) explanations of vertical
restraints and views many such restraints as benign (efficiency-enhancing).55

Even if domestic competition policy is not applied in a discriminatory fashion to private
restrictions, more fundamental objections to such restrictions, and indeed other domestic
policies of foreign countries, such as the maintenance of state-owned or sanctioned
monopolies in given sectors, invoke instead a notion of reciprocity. Here the argument is
made that even if these restrictions or policies satisfy the National Treatment Principle, if
one country has adopted much more liberal policies in these respects while another country
has adopted much more restrictive policies, for example if the United States has adopted
much more assertive antitrust policies on vertical restraints and has privatized and/or
deregulated state-owned or sanctioned monopolies, while Japan has adopted much more
permissive policies on vertical restraints and allows much greater scope for state-owned or
sanctioned monopolies, Japanese firms have much more favourable access to United States
markets, both as exporters and investors, than United States exporters and investors with
respect to Japanese markets. This claim may well be true. It is also true that the notion of
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reciprocity has long played a central role in international trade policy, for example, in tariff
negotiations under the GATT and various regional trading arrangements. However, if this
broad notion of reciprocity, or functional equality of access, were to become the normative
touchstone rather than the National Treatment Principle in addressing divergences in
domestic competition and related policies, the ability of countries to maintain any diversity
or distinctiveness in a whole range of domestic policies would largely be forfeited, with
serious implications for notions of political sovereignty. Countries which have chosen
unilaterally to adopt more assertive domestic antitrust policies, for example with respect to
vertical restrictions, or have chosen to privatize and/or deregulate state-owned or
sanctioned monopolies, have presumably done so for what were conceived to be good
domestic reasons, taking fully into account the implications for foreign trade and
investment inter alia. That other countries have chosen to pursue different policies in this
respect, provided that they are non-discriminatory, should provide no basis for complaint
by the first country, otherwise the latter would be in a position to ‘export’ its domestic
policies to every foreign market in which it has present or prospective trade or investment
interests, dramatically expanding notions of extraterritoriality beyond any scope hitherto
considered defensible. This is not, of course, to foreclose the possibility of international
negotiations over such policies (by way of analogy with tariff negotiations), but it is to argue
for a highly restrained role for unilateral action by one country with respect to another
country’s domestic policies, or indeed agreements on modifications to these policies
extracted under threat of unilateral action.

Another problematic case is transnational mergers.56 Some cases are easier than others. If
two firms which are based in country A but sell most of their output in country B, merge
and acquire a dominant position in country B’s market, monopoly rents will be realized in
country A but consumer welfare losses will be sustained primarily in country B. This may
induce the competition authorities in country A to approve the merger. In our view, this is
a form of disguised discrimination against consumers in country B. The competition
authorities in country A would have reached a different and adverse conclusion if all the
affected producers and consumers had been located within their own jurisdiction. In other
words, this is to discriminate against consumers in country B and, as with export cartels or
tariffs, is myopic in the longer run.57 Thus, in our view, competition authorities in country
B are entitled to object to this merger, as the US Federal Trade Commission did in the
Institut Merieux/Connaught case,58 despite being widely criticized for doing so. This kind of
case is not conceptually different from the export cartel case, except that the discrimination
is implicit.

Other cases are not so straightforward. One such example is the widely discussed
decision of the European Commission59 prohibiting the acquisition of de Havilland, a
Canadian-based commuter aircraft producer (owned by an American firm, Boeing) by a
European joint venture, ATR (whose parents were, respectively, owned by French and
Italian interests), on the grounds that the merger would give the merged entity excessive
market power in the European (and global) market (ATR was the leading producer of
commuter aircraft in the EU and global markets), despite the fact that the merger was not
opposed by the Canadian competition authorities. On a charitable view of the facts, we
assume that the Canadian competition authorities had approved the merger pursuant to the
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efficiencies defence under section 96 of the Canadian Competition Act (a provision unique to
Canadian competition law), despite some enhanced ability of the merged entity to raise
prices in its output markets (primarily outside of Canada), and not simply because of
a desire to save Canadian jobs or to appropriate monopoly rents from foreigners. In this
case, we may have a genuine problem of interjurisdictional conflict. That is to say, assuming
the Canadian authorities would have made the same decision if all of the merged entities’
output had been sold in the Canadian market, it would no longer be possible to impute
discrimination against foreign customers, but rather the source of the conflicting
determinations would genuinely reside in differences in the domestic competition law
regimes applied to the transaction. Conversely, of course, one would want to be reassured
that the EU competition authorities would have reached the same decision had the acquired
firm been located not in Canada but in the EU, and the claimed efficiency gains from the
merger would have been fully realized within the EU and not Canada.60 Given any reasonable
understanding of the ‘effects’ test adopted in the US and the EU for exercising
extraterritorial jurisdiction, both jurisdictions could legitimately lay claim to jurisdiction in
this case, and on the facts assumed neither could be shown to have discriminated either
against foreign producers or foreign consumers. The EU could claim that the consumer
welfare test that it applied enjoys wide currency in other countries’ competition law
regimes (in particular the United States) and in much respected academic literature. On the
other hand, the Canadian authorities could reasonably claim that the total welfare test
applied by them, while perhaps less justiciable and more speculative, actually accords better
with pure economic theory. Short of a meta-choice, presumably through international
agreement, by affected jurisdictions between these two welfare tests in this class of case,
such cases of interjurisdictional conflict are not easily resolved. In making such a meta-
choice, on balance the consumer welfare test is probably to be preferred, in part because it
reflects the predominant test applied in United States and EU competition law and in part
because it is more straightforwardly reflective of the consumer (rather than the producer)
protection rationale for competition law.61

Another difficult case is one where two firms merge and the relevant geographic market
is either the global market or at least a regional market (e.g. North America). The recent
merger between Boeing and McDonnell Douglas presented this scenario in the global large
passenger aircraft manufacturing market, leading to conflicts between US and EU
competition authorities that were finally resolved by an undertaking by Boeing to restrict its
use of long-term exclusive supply contracts with major airlines. In such cases, in principle
even applying a consumer and not a total welfare test, in the first case every competition
authority in the world could legitimately assert jurisdiction, invoking a reasonable
interpretation of the ‘effects’ test, and in the second case every competition authority
within the regional market could properly assert jurisdiction. In some cases, the merger
may be able to be addressed by requiring divestiture of subsidiaries or assets in particular
sub-markets within the regional market, but in other cases the entire market may be served
by single companies. It may be possible to envisage negotiating an international agreement
by which a lead jurisdiction is designated by reference to a ‘primary effects’ test, perhaps
operationalized by identifying the market where the largest percentage of the merged
entity’s output is likely to be sold.62 In a regional context, this will mostly be the United
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States, and this will also often be the case in global markets, given the size of the United
States economy. In addition, one might need to contemplate the creation of a supranational
authority in which jurisdiction is vested to determine the lead jurisdiction in the event of
disputes over whether the relevant market is supranational or where the largest proportion
of the merged entity’s output is likely to be sold.63 It should be emphasized that in these last
two examples the problem is not necessarily a problem of discrimination but rather a
problem of conflict of laws where a choice of law (and forum) rule is required in order to
resolve the potential for interjurisdictional conflict. It should also be acknowledged that
these problems of interjurisdictional conflict would obviously be drastically reduced or
eliminated if all countries could agree on a common set of competition laws and credibly
commit to a consistent enforcement policy, but for reasons noted above this would forfeit
the value of policy diversity for both purely domestic and supranational transactions while
agreement on a choice of law and forum rule would much more narrowly target the area of
required agreement on the latter class of cases only.

Beyond these difficult substantive issues, a range of procedural harmonization measures
are much more likely to be resolved in that they appear to represent pos-itive-sum
strategies for most countries and their constituents. In this respect, the American Bar
Association’s NAFTA Task Force offers a number of extremely useful suggestions for
enhancing cooperation between domestic competition authorities, and thus minimizing
duplicate investigative efforts (public transaction costs), and for minimizing the direct
transaction costs faced by private parties in meeting divergent information requirements and
decision timetables under existing domestic competition law regimes.64 Bilateral
agreements between the United States and the EU, the United States and Canada, the
United States and Australia, and New Zealand and Australia, already go some distance
towards providing for inter-agency cooperation in competition law enforcement (but could
be usefully expanded).65

TRADE POLICY IMPLICATIONS

In contrast to ‘one world’ (or ‘flat earth’) visions of competition as a global organizing
economic principle, ‘system frictions’, or inappropriate EU analogies applied to the
multilateral or trilateral context, which are politically quite unrealistic and indeed at the limit
normatively uncongenial in their implications for political sovereignty and democratic
accountability (concerns that are increasingly manifest even in Europe over more ambitious
integration proposals), a series of more modest multilateral or regional initiatives might
usefully be contemplated. These initiatives would focus on several distinct problems: (a)
minimizing the scope for explicit or implicit discrimination in the formulation or
enforcement of domestic competition laws; (b) minimizing the potential for
interjurisdictional conflict and hence risk and uncertainty in transactions affecting
supranational geographic markets through international agreements on choice of law and
forum rules and supranational mechanisms to oversee their application; (c) minimizing
public and private transaction costs in the administration of competition laws
through harmonized information requirements, decision timetables, and exchange of
information and cooperation amongst enforcement authorities; (d) maximizing
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transparency in the administration of domestic competition law regimes and hence
minimizing the arbitrary and non-accountable exercise of administrative discretion (and
unpredictability).

To advance these objectives, Member States of the new World Trade Organization (or
NAFTA) should agree to ensure that their domestic competition laws adopt prohibitions
against both export and import cartels and adopt complementary procedural mechanisms to
ensure effective enforcement. With respect to merger law as this might impact on
international mergers, various forms of procedural harmonization might be contemplated
pertaining to information requirements, decision timetables, and information sharing
among competition authorities. With respect to substantive harmonization, Member States
with merger laws might commit themselves, in the interests of transparency, to publishing a
set of non-binding merger enforcement guidelines that indicate how these merger laws are
likely to be enforced with respect to a common checklist of issues that the guidelines would
be required to address (but without a commitment to a common position on these issues).
In the case of transnational mergers impacting on supranational geographic markets,
international negotiations need to be contemplated over choice of law and forum rules such
as a ‘primary effects’ test designed to identify a lead jurisdiction for evaluating such mergers
with a possible role for a supranational authority to resolve disputed issues of jurisdiction.
With respect to the contentious issue of vertical foreclosure of effective access to foreign
markets, controversy here is likely to be particularly intense given widely differing industrial
organization and antitrust traditions in different countries, and substantial theoretical
controversies as to the appropriate form that laws should take with respect to vertical
restrictions.66 In this area, it is difficult to contemplate ready multilateral consensus on an
appropriate set of legal norms. Perhaps the most that might be hoped for is that member
countries would agree that, as a baseline, vertical restrictions should be included in
domestic competition laws as discrete reviewable practices or as reviewable practices within
a more general abuse of dominant position provision, without sectoral or similar exemptions,
but without any common commitment to the legal norms governing the review process.67

Again, as with merger review, it may be possible to reach agreement on a commitment for
each member state to publish a set of non-binding vertical restraint enforcement guidelines
that address a common checklist of issues. By way of analogy with the Chapter 19 binational
dispute resolution panels provided for under NAFTA in domestic antidumping or
countervailing duty determinations, one might go further by providing a WTO or NAFTA
panel procedure whereby aggrieved foreign parties (states or firms) could complain to a
supranational panel in cases where it is alleged that Member States are not faithfully
interpreting or enforcing their own domestic competition laws in a non-discriminatory
manner. Providing a broader mandate for multilateral or supranational adjudication of
competition law issues is likely to raise a host of difficult institutional and procedural issues
relating to standing, information-gathering, expertise, and remedies.68 It may also be useful
for the OEGD Competition Law and Policy Committee to convene a group of
internationally recognized apolitical competition law experts to work on a non-binding
model competition code69 that, over time, may exert an exemplary or exhortatory
influence over the evolution of domestic competition law regimes (rather like the United
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States Restatements).70 This might usefully build on the Report of the OEGD Committee on
Competition Law and Policy, ‘Interim Report on Convergence of Competition Policies’.71

Beyond these competition policy innovations, we should return to the historical origins of
the tension between competition law and international trade policy in North America that
consigned the former to a deep second-best policy role and attend to the remaining
protectionist elements in international trade policy, particularly trade remedy regimes such
as antidumping and countervailing duty regimes (residual elements of the ‘political fraud’
that is sometimes alleged to have characterized the initial enactment of competition laws in
North America at the same time as the adoption of high tariffs),72 and set seriously about the
task of exorcising these elements of mercantilism that constrain the operation of
international competitive forces far more than do any aspect of current domestic
competition policy regimes.73 Because trade remedy laws apply pricing constraints to
foreign firms that do not apply to domestic firms, they are inherently discriminatory (and
are inconsistent with the National Treatment principle). In this respect, the outlines of a
political deal may be discernible: in return for LDCs and NICs adopting basic competition
law measures of the kind outlined above, industrialized countries would agree to substantial
curtailment of their trade remedy laws and some supranational oversight in their application
—a deal which Mexico in effect accepted under NAFTA by agreeing to enact an effective
domestic competition law regime. As outlined in Chapter 7 on antidumping laws, more
radical proposals, which we favour, would entail the complete repeal of antidumping laws
and their replacement with non-discriminatory harmonized cross-border predatory pricing
laws, along the lines of the regime adopted by Australia and New Zealand in 1990 under
ANZCERTA.74 This distinctive role for harmonized competition laws surely warrants a
high priority. 

THE REGULATION OF INTERNATIONAL TRADE 465



466



18
The international movement of people1

INTRODUCTION

Classical free trade theory assumed that goods could often readily be traded across national
borders but that the factors of production employed to produce those goods (land, capital
and labour) were fixed and immobile. In the contemporary world, largely due to
technological changes, this has become dramatically untrue of capital, and much less true of
labour. However, the frequent political resistance to international mobility of goods is often
dramatically intensified in the case of the international mobility of people. Here we move
from the domain of international trade policy to the domain of immigration policy. The
most critical linkage between the two relates to international trade in services, especially
services which require physical proximity between service supplier and service user. As
international trade in services of various kinds continues to grow, the line between trade in
services and migration of people becomes increasingly blurred.2 Of the economic
integration regimes reviewed in this book, only the EU to date has committed itself to free
internal movement of people, subject to substantial efforts at harmonization of minimum
professional and vocational qualifications and without any automatic entitlement to national
citizenship of Member States. NAFTA (Chapter 16) contains a much more limited set of
provisions for issuance of temporary entry visas for business, professional and technical
personnel in connection with international business activities.

This chapter addresses a question that has confronted all individuals and groups of
individuals who, throughout history, have chosen to live in a state of civil society with one
another and for whom social, political, and economic relationships are integral to the self-
definition of each individual in the community of which they are a part. How does one
define and justify the conditions of membership in the community? In the context of the
modern nation state, this primarily directs our attention to the substance and procedures of
our immigration policies; who may become citizens and who must remain strangers, for
nations imply boundaries and boundaries at some point imply closure.

As of the late 1980s, approximately 100 million people were resident outside their
nations of current citizenship. Roughly 35 million were in sub-Saharan Africa alone and
approximately 13–15 million each in the prosperous regions of Western Europe and North
America. Another 15 million or so were in the Middle East or Asia.3 The United Nations
estimates that over 60 million people, or 1.2% of the world’s population, now reside in a



country where they were not born.4 Although most immigrants choose a traditional
destination (over one-half go to the United States, Canada or Australia), many other
countries are also receiving relatively large immigrant flows, including Germany,
Switzerland, France and the United Kingdom. Of the total number of immigrants, as of
1993, about 18 million were refugees, most of whom were located in Africa and Asia, up
from 8 million in 1980 and 2.5 million in 1970.5 Table 18.1 describes immigrants as a
percentage of the population for most OECD countries in 1981 and 1991. 

Table 18.1 obscures locational concentrations of immigrants within countries: for
example, 21.7% of the population of California is foreign-born;6 almost one-quarter of the
populations of Ontario and British Columbia in 1991 were immigrants, including 38% of
the population of Toronto and 30% of the population of Vancouver.7

A number of features of contemporary immigration trends have precipitated major
political controversies in host countries around the world, including the US, Canada,
Australia, New Zealand, and Western Europe. These features include the sheer scale of
immigration; the changing composition of source countries; and the dramatic increase in the
number of refugees, all of which have focused attention in receiving countries on the impact
of immigrants on native participants in domestic labour markets, the impact on social
programme expenditures, and the impact on social and cultural homogeneity and
cohesiveness. 

Table 18.1 Immigrants as a percentage of the total population

Source: OECD (1994).
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IMMIGRATION POLICY IN HISTORICAL PERSPEGTIVE

In the US, the first great migration wave occurred between 1881 and 1924 when almost 26
million people entered the country. Reacting to the increase in immigration and to the
widespread perception that the new immigrants differed from the old, Congress closed the
floodgates in the 1920s by enacting the National Origins Quota System that allocated entry
visas according to the ethnic composition of the US population in the 1920s. During the
1930s, only 0.5 million immigrants entered the US. Since then, the number of legal
immigrants has increased at about the rate of one million per decade and by 1993, nearly
800,000 people were being admitted annually.8 The number of illegal immigrants has also
steadily increased and is now estimated at between 200,000–300,000 per year. The illegal
immigrant population was estimated at around 3.4 million in 1992 (equal to 1.3% of the US
population). About 40% of the illegal immigrants have come to the US from Mexico.9

Amendments in 1965 to the Immigration and Nationality Act repealed the national origins
restrictions and made family ties to US residents the key factor that determines whether
immigrants are admitted into the country. Partly as a result of these changes, the
composition of source countries of immigrants to the US has changed dramatically in recent
decades. In the 1950s over half of all immigrants to the US came from Europe. Currently
fewer than one in five immigrants is European. Almost 40% of recent immigrants are from
Asia (especially South East Asia) and a roughly equal number originate in Mexico, the
Caribbean and Latin America.10

Canadian immigration policy for much of the past century has been similar to that of the
US: a major influx of immigrants between 1890 and the late 1920s, minimal immigration
through the depression and Second World War years, and a steady increase in immigration
levels thereafter, with current levels running at about 200,000 per year. For much of this
period, Canada explicitly excluded most immigrants from non-European source countries.
Beginning in 1963 and formalized through the adoption of a point system in 1967, Canada
abandoned selection criteria based on country of origin and admitted immigrants on the
basis of family ties and in the case of independent immigrants assessments of various factors,
including education and occupational skills considered likely to influence the ability of
immigrants to resettle successfully in Canada. Initially the point system applied to about
50% of immigrants. Since the 1980s the family sponsorship class has come to dominate
independent entrants assessed under the point system.11 A total of 90% of immigrants who
arrived in Canada before 1961 were born in Europe. This proportion fell to 69% for those
who arrived between 1961 and 1970; 36% for those who immigrated between 1971 and
1980; and one-quarter for those who arrived between 1981 and 1991. At the same time the
proportion of immigrants born in Asia and other non-European countries has increased.
People born in Asia and the Middle East made up almost one-half of immigrants who came
to Canada between 1981 and 1991, but only 3% of those who came before 1961.12

European immigration since the Second World War falls into four phases.13 The period
of war adjustment and decolonization covers the period between 1945 until the early
1960s. The number of people displaced by the war was estimated at about 20 million. For
instance, 12 million Germans had to leave Eastern Europe by 1950 with about 8 million
going to West Germany. Great Britain, France, Belgium and The Netherlands were affected
by return migration of European colonists and the inflow from workers from former overseas
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territories. The second period 1955 to 1973—reflected considerable labour migration.
Labour shortages in some countries induced openness and sometimes active recruitment
policies. Germany and some other Western European countries established guest worker
systems. Net immigration to the north from the Mediterranean countries was about 5
million. The third period—from 1974 to 1988—was one of restrained immigration
throughout Western Europe reflecting recessionary conditions after the first oil price
shock. Labour recruitment ceased, although it proved difficult to induce return migration
by foreign workers. Family and political migration dominated migration patterns during this
period. The last period from 1988 to the present day reflect the dissolution of Communist
and Socialist regimes in Eastern and Central Europe which has dramatically increased the
flow of east-west immigrants, predominantly to Germany. The migration potential from
Eastern Europe is estimated in the range of 5–50 million, mostly over a period of 10–15
years. One estimate suggests a potential immigration flow of 3% of the current population
size in Eastern Europe for the next 15 years, which implies a migration inflow of about 3
million ethnic Germans and 10 million others.14 Additional immigration pressures are likely
to be caused by south-north migration, particularly from Turkey, Egypt, and other countries
in Northern Africa.15

THE VALUES

Liberty

At the heart of debates in all Western democracies over immigration policy now, and in the
past, lie two core values which stand in some irreducible degree in opposition to one
another: liberty and community. Theories of liberty and community each present
themselves with almost endless variations, but for our purposes, the essence of the two values,
in the context of immigration policy, can be fairly readily captured. As Carens points out:

[All liberal] theories begin with some kind of assumption about the equal moral
worth of individuals. In one way or another, all treat the individual as prior to the
community. Such foundations provide little basis for drawing fundamental
distinctions between citizens and aliens who seek to become citizens.16

Carens goes on to review three contemporary approaches to liberal theory: libertarianism,
social contractarianism, and utilitarianism. From the libertarian perspective, exemplified by
scholars such as Nozick, individual property rights play a central role.17 In a state of nature,
individuals have rights to acquire and use property and to alienate it voluntarily. The
existence of the state is only justified to the extent that it is required to protect property
rights and facilitate their voluntary transfer. On this view, if aliens wish to move to Canada
or the USA they should be free to do so, provided they do not violate anyone else’s rights.
To the extent that citizens choose to enter into contracts of employment with them, or sell
them land, homes, or businesses, the rights of both citizens and aliens would be violated by
externally imposed constraints thereon. From a social contractarian perspective, as
exemplified most prominently by the writings of John Rawls,18 an ideal social constitution
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would be constructed behind a veil of ignorance, where individuals know nothing about
their own particularities such as class, race, sex, natural talents, religious beliefs, individuals
goals, values and talents, etc. The purpose of the veil of ignorance is ‘to nullify the effect of
specific contingencies which put men at odds’, because natural and social contingencies are
‘arbitrary from a moral point of view’, and therefore are factors which ought not to
influence the choice of principles of justice.

As Carens points out, whether one is a citizen of a rich nation or a poor nation, whether
one is already a citizen of a particular state or an alien who wishes to become a citizen, are
the kinds of specific contingencies that could set people at odds, and a fair procedure for
choosing principles of justice should therefore exclude knowledge of these circumstances,
just as it excludes knowledge of one’s race, sex or social class. We should therefore take a
global, not a national, view of the original position (the ‘universal brotherhood of man’).19

Behind this global veil of ignorance, and considering possible restrictions on freedom, we
should adopt the perspective of those who would be most disadvantaged by the restrictions,
in this case often the perspective of the alien who wants to immigrate. From this
perspective, very few restrictions on immigration can be morally justified. Rawls would
recognize that liberty may be restricted for the sake of liberty, in the sense that all liberties
depend on the existence of public order and security. To cite a metaphor used by Carens, it
does no one any good to take so many people into a lifeboat that it is swamped and
everyone drowns.20 But short of a reasonable, as opposed to a hypothetical expectation of
this prospect, largely unconstrained immigration would seem implied by Rawls’ social
contract theory.

From a utilitarian perspective, the utilities or disutilities experienced by both aliens and
citizens would be entered in the utilitarian calculus.21 Some citizens would gain from being
able to enter into contractual relationships with immigrants; others might lose if wages are
depressed through the additional competition they bring to labour markets; taxpayers may
lose if they are required to support financially dependent immigrants; yet other citizens as
consumers might benefit from access to cheaper goods or services. Against these costs and
benefits accruing to citizens must be set whatever costs and benefits accrue to aliens by
being permitted entry—in most cases one assumes that the benefits substantially outweigh
the costs otherwise they would presumably not have chosen to resettle in another land.
Moreover, to the extent that many aliens will have made the wrenching decision to resettle
because of economic privation or religious or political oppression or persecution in their
homelands, the gains to them from being permitted to join a new and more congenial
community may be very substantial. Thus, from a utilitarian perspective, while perhaps
providing more scope for restrictions on immigration than either the libertarian or social
contractarian perspective, relatively open borders would in general be dictated.

Community

In opposition to these liberal values stand the core values of community. Here, it is
asserted, in the context of immigration policy, that control over who may enter is a
powerful expression of a nation’s identity and autonomy—in other words its sovereignty.
Sovereignty entails the unlimited power of a nation, like that of a free individual, to decide
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whether, under what conditions, and with what effect it will consent to enter into a
relationship with a stranger.22 One of the most prominent contemporary proponents of this
view is Michael Walzer.23 In justifying this view, he draws analogies between
neighbourhoods, clubs, and families. While it is true that in the case of neighbourhoods,
people are free, in general, to enter and exit as they please, he argues that to analogize
nations to neighbourhoods, permitting unconstrained entry by aliens in any number from
anywhere in the world would destroy the concept of neighbourhood. He argues that it is
only the nationalization of welfare (or the nationalization of culture and politics) that opens
the neighbourhood communities to whoever chooses to come in. Neighbourhoods can be
open only if countries are at least potentially closed. Only if the state makes a selection
among would-be members and guarantees the loyalty, security, and welfare of the
individuals it selects, can local communities take shape as ‘different’ associations determined
solely by personal preference and market capacity. Walzer claims that if states ever become
large neighbourhoods, it is likely that neighbourhoods would become little states. Their
members would organize to defend the local politics and culture against strangers.
Historically, it is claimed, neighbourhoods have turned into closed or parochial communities
whenever the state was open. Thus, Walzer rejects the analogy of states to neighbourhoods
and rather analogizes states with clubs and families, where members are free to determine
the conditions of membership. Walzer concludes:

The distribution of membership is not pervasively subject to the constraints of justice.
Across a considerable range of the decisions that are made, states are simply free to
take in strangers (or not)—much as they are free, leaving aside the claims of the
needy, to share their wealth with foreign friends, to honor the achievements of
foreign artists, scholars, and scientists, to choose their trading partners, and to enter
into collective security arrangements with foreign states. But the right to choose an
admissions policy is more basic than any of these, for it is not merely a matter of
acting in the world, exercising sovereignty, and pursuing national interests. At stake
here is the shape of the community that acts in the world, exercises sovereignty, and
so on. Admission and exclusion are at the core of communal independence. They
suggest the deepest meaning of self-determination. Without them, there could not
be communities of character, historically stable, ongoing associations of men and women
with some special commitment to one another and some special sense of their
common life.24

Unlike the liberal theories, which imply no or very few limitations on entry, Walzer’s
theory, at least without further qualification, appears to permit almost any limitations on entry
that a state should choose to impose, including admission policies that are overtly racist. Two
controversial features of his theory are the notion that political sovereignty is a near-
absolute value—a view increasingly challenged by the evolution of international human rights
norms—and that the only communities of character are those that reflect ethnic, religious or
cultural commonalities—a view many liberals would challenge on the grounds that
common commitments to liberal civic institutions and mutual tolerance of intermediate
subcommunities of interest can sustain communities of character. In any event, these two
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core values of liberty and community clearly frame the major issues that must be confronted
in the design of any country’s immigration policies.

The issue of the size of the intake of immigrants cannot readily be separated from the
composition of the intake, in terms of deducing what kinds of demands the immigrants are
likely to make on our community. However, to the extent that the two issues can be
separated, regardless of the composition of the intake, it can probably be accepted that no
country could accept and absorb millions of immigrants a year without critical features of
infrastructure collapsing and congestion externalities being created on all sides. One might,
of course, argue that a natural equilibrium is likely to establish itself before this happens—if
the intake threatens these conditions, some would-be immigrants will abandon an interest
in resettling. However, collective action problems may prevent such an equilibrium
emerging at all or at any event quickly or smoothly, and it is not obvious that Rawls’ ‘public
order’ qualification on the right of entry tells us anything very helpful about when
congestion externalities have reached the point where the lifeboat metaphor can
appropriately be invoked. This concern is somewhat reminiscent of the concerns raised by
Thomas Malthus in 1798 in his famous essay on the Principle of Population as it Affects the
Future Improvement of Society. As Heilbroner states the Malthusian thesis:

[The essay on population claimed] that there was a tendency in nature for population
to outstrip all possible means of subsistence. Far from ascending to an ever higher
level, society was caught in a hopeless trap in which the human reproductive urge
would inevitably shove humanity to the sheer brink of the precipice of existence.
Instead of being headed for Utopia, the human lot was forever condemned to a losing
struggle between ravenous and multiplying mouths and the eternally insufficient
stock of Nature’s cupboard, however diligently that cupboard might be searched.25

In Malthus’ view, land, unlike people, cannot be multiplied—land does not breed.
Malthus’ fears were subsequently proven to be greatly exaggerated, and most dramatically
refuted by the settlement of the New World, where increased population through
immigration, in terms of increased labour and capital on the supply-side and increased
aggregate demand on the demand-side, made possible the realization of enormous
economies of scale and the technological advances that accompanied them. However, as
birth rates and destitution levels in many impoverished Third World countries exemplify
today, Malthus’ concerns were not entirely without foundation, and a totally unrestricted
immigration policy may legitimately implicate those concerns. Once some restriction on
total intake is recognized as necessary, then the composition of that restricted intake must
be addressed.

In particular selection policies will need to address the following classes of immigrants:

1 Claimants who pose a national security risk or who have past histories of criminality or
suspected criminality, associations with illiberal or oppressive political regimes, or a
personal history of illness or disability;

2 refugee or asylum claimants;
3 economically necessitous aliens;
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4 family members;
5 culturally homogeneous aliens;
6 better-endowed and less well-endowed aliens;
7 guest workers;
8 illegal immigrants.

While the welfare effects of immigration policy have not traditionally received anything like
the attention that has been devoted to other aspects of international economics, fortunately
recent theoretical and empirical work26 has begun to yield a fairly clear consensus on the
effects of immigration, despite the fact that this consensus is sharply at variance, in many
respects, with widely held popular perceptions.

THE WELFARE IMPLICATIONS OF IMMIGRATION

The welfare implications of immigration pose many complex issues. One threshold issue is
the perspective to be adopted in evaluating these implications, particularly whether the
perspective should focus only on the impact of immigration on domestic welfare in a
receiving country; or whether a more global perspective should be adopted including the
impact of immigration on the welfare of immigrants themselves; and the impact of
immigration on the welfare of residents of sending countries who remain behind. Another
threshold question is whether a narrowly economic conception of welfare should be
adopted or whether the welfare calculus should include non-economic factors such as
humanitarian, social, cultural, and distributional concerns.

From the perspective of immigrants themselves, it seems obvious that in most cases
immigration is likely to enhance their welfare, either economically or psychically (in cases
where they are escaping political, religious, or ethnic persecution in their home countries),
otherwise they are unlikely to incur the economic and emotional costs of uprooting
themselves and moving to a foreign country. From a global economic perspective, it seems
equally clear, applying standard international trade theory paradigms, that global welfare is
enhanced by relatively unrestricted migration. For example, Hamilton and Whalley provide
estimates from 1977 that the gains from removing all restrictions on international
immigration could exceed world-wide GNP in that year. More qualified estimates would
still yield gains constituting a significant proportion of world GNP and exceeding gains from
removing all trade restrictions.27The premise behind these estimates is that open
immigration encourages human resources to move to their most productive uses, whatever
the localized impact in countries of emigration or immigration. The most important
qualification to this proposition is fiscally induced migration driven by a desire to access non-
contributory entitlement systems such as social welfare and public health care systems in
other countries. Obviously, migration undertaken for these reasons may not entail a
redeployment or relocation of human resources to more productive uses.28

The effects of emigration on the welfare of citizens in sending countries is far from clear.
Arguably, owners of capital receive a reduced return (and consumers may pay higher
prices) if wage rates among workers who remain increase (although these workers are to
that extent better off). Negative externalities from population density may be reduced, but
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some advantages from population density and size (e.g. ease of communication and
transportation) may also be reduced. While the brain drain from source countries has often
elicited concern, this requires the assumption that highly skilled professionals, business
people, or workers are not capturing in their returns the full value of their marginal
product, but are creating positive externalities that will be lost when they leave (e.g.
imparting skills or knowledge to younger individuals). To the extent that their education
has been financed by their home governments, their departure may entail a loss of this
investment, but on the other hand taxes paid by parents, may, on average, reflect these
costs. To the extent that emigrants are younger and more productive than the home
population on average, the sending country loses their taxes with which to finance social
programmes for older citizens and children.29 Largely mitigating or even offsetting many of
these costs to sending countries are substantial remittances sent home by immigrants—
estimated at about US 66 billion dollars world-wide in 1989.30

Most of the theoretical and empirical research undertaken to date on the welfare
implications of immigration has focused on the impact of immigration on the welfare of the
native population in receiving countries. This research has focused principally on economic
impacts. An assessment that included non-economic impacts of immigration would need to
take account of, on the one hand, humanitarian considerations that may favour generous family
reunification and refugee policies, and on the other hand, concerns over erosion of cultural
and social homogeneity and cohesiveness.31 The principal findings of research that has
focused on the economic impacts of immigration on the welfare of native populations in
receiving countries is briefly reviewed below.

Economic research in the early 1980s reached highly optimistic findings regarding the
impact of immigration on native economic welfare. For example, Chiswick in an analysis of
the 1970 census found that at the time of arrival, immigrants earn about 17% less than the
natives. However, immigrant earnings overtake native earnings within 15 years after
arrival. After 30 years in the US the typical immigrant earned about 11 % more than the
comparable native workers.32 Simon’s influential book, The Economic Consequences of
Immigration33 substantially extended these findings, and not only concluded that immigrants
out-perform comparable native workers in the long run but that immigrants have little or
no effect on wage and employment levels of the native population, including unskilled
native workers, and that they contribute substantially more in taxes than the costs they
impose on social programmes (and indeed that their net fiscal contribution on average was
greater than the native population). The ‘catch-up’ and overtaking effect was largely
attributed to initial challenges in overcoming language and skill deficits and the greater drive
and ambition of immigrants who had decided to incur the wrenching costs of leaving their
home countries and re-settling in a foreign country (a self-selection effect).

While Borjas in a 1990 book reached many similar findings, he also found that recent
immigrants were under-performing previous generations of immigrants and in some cases
the native population.34 In subsequent writings, he has elaborated on this theme.35 For
example, in 1970, the typical immigrant who had just arrived in the US had 11.1 years of
schooling, as compared to 11.5 years for the typical native worker. By 1990, the typical
immigrant who had just arrived in the US had 11.9 years of schooling, as compared to 13.2
years for natives. The most recent arrivals enumerated in the 1970 census earned 16.6%
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less than natives. By 1990, the wage disadvantage between the most recent immigrant wave
and natives had grown to 31.7 percent. In 1970 immigrants were less likely than natives to
receive public assistance. By 1990, the welfare participation rate of immigration households
had risen to 9.1 percent, or 1.7 percentage points higher than the participation rate for
native households.36 According to Borjas, the changing national origin mix of immigrants
explains over 90% of the decline in educational attainment and relative wages across
successive waves of immigrants between 1960 and 1980.37

In evaluating the impact of immigrants on native participants in US labour markets,
Borjas estimates the impact of immigrant workers on native worker wage levels and
compares this loss to gains by employers and indirectly consumers from lower input costs.
He estimates that currently native workers lose about 1.9% of GDP, or $133 billion in a $7
trillion economy, while native employers and consumers gain about 2% of GDP, or $140
billion, yielding an immigration surplus of $7 billion. This implies a sizable redistribution of
wealth from native workers to the users of immigrant labour, and implies in turn that
debates in receiving countries over immigration policy are likely to focus more on these
distributional impacts than on the relatively small efficiency gains entailed.38 Borjas,
analogizing to theories of the effects of international trade liberalization, argues that ‘no
pain, no gain’, so that studies that find no or minimal impacts of immigrants on labour
markets in receiving countries imply that immigrants capture all the returns from
immigration and the native population in receiving countries none. This in fact would not
be true if immigrants are pure complements to the native labour force. Borjas argues that
greater selectivity in immigration that focuses on screening out unskilled immigrants and
admitting mostly skilled immigrants would raise the immigration surplus substantially,
reflecting the fact that factor prices for skilled labour appear to be more elastic than for
unskilled labour and that complementarities between skilled labour and capital in
production are greater than complementarities between skilled and unskilled labour or
between unskilled labour and capital, particularly in an advanced economy like that of the US.
With respect to the fiscal impacts of immigration in the US (sometimes discussed in terms of
the dependency ratio), estimates vary dramatically, with some estimates reporting net
annual fiscal benefits from immigration of $27 billion and other estimates reporting fiscal
losses of over $40 billion. These estimates are highly speculative, because beyond estimating
the impact of immigrants on social welfare programmes, it is difficult to estimate the
marginal impact on the vast array of other public services that they utilize.39 Again, skilled
immigrants are less likely to be unemployed than unskilled immigrants and hence are less
likely to become dependent on social welfare programmes.

Despite these recent research findings on the deteriorating performance of recent waves
of immigrants to the US, the consensus position among researchers remains that the impact
of immigration on the labour market outcomes of natives is small, both in terms of
employment and wage levels.40 Evidence from other receiving countries supports this view.
Canadian researchers have concluded that immigrants have a minimal impact on
employment or wage levels of native workers41 and that immigrant households, including
recent immigrants, pay more in taxes than they receive in benefits and that their
contribution exceeds the average Canadian-born household lifetime contribution42,
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although the net fiscal contributions of recent immigrants, while still positive, have been
declining significantly.

As to whether the performance of more recent immigrants to Canada has deteriorated
more generally relative to earlier immigrants and relative to the native born population of
Canada, an extensive analysis by the Economic Council of Canada reaches cautious
conclusions.43 The proportion of persons with only elementary education has slightly
increased amongst recent immigrants, but the latter also include a higher proportion of
university-educated persons than the native population. Knowledge of the English language
has also declined with recent waves of immigrants. The Council found no evidence that
immigrants from the new source countries have consistently lower labour force
participation rates than those from traditional source countries, although there has been a
decline in the general participation rate for immigrants arriving in the 1980s. While
unemployment rates are generally lower for immigrants than natives (8.2% compared to
10.8%), for immigrants arriving between 1978 and 1983 the rate has been slightly higher:
11.2% compared to 10.8% for natives, and for immigrants arriving in the period 1983 to
1986, the unemployment rate was 16%. However, the Council was unable to find any
significant changes in the characteristics of the most recent immigrants relative to those who
had arrived between 1978 and 1982, and was therefore not prepared to attribute changes in
labour force participation rates to changing immigrant characteristics. With respect to
participation in welfare programmes, 12.5% of immigrants who came during the period
1981 to 1986 received welfare compared to 1.7% of immigrants who came between 1976
and 1980 and 13.8% of the native born population. Contrary to Borjas’ findings in the US,
refugees do not seem to perform markedly less well than other immigrants or the native
born population.

A recent study by Statistics Canada44 analysing data from the 1991 Census largely
confirms the Economic Council’s findings. In 1991, the overall dependency ratio for
immigrants was 29.8 while that for the Canadian-born was 52.9; thus immigrants have a
higher proportion of people of working age than do the Canadian-born. Immigrants were
also more likely to have higher levels of education than the Canadian-born—about 16% of
immigrants aged 15 and over had university degrees compared to 11 % of the Canadian-
born, although a higher proportion of immigrants (19%) than the Canadian-born (13%) had
less than Grade 9 education. Of immigrants who came between 1981 and 1991, 17% had a
university degree, compared with 9% of immigrants who arrived before 1961. For those
aged 25 and over, the difference is even more pronounced: 21% of recent immigrants had a
university education, compared with 9% of immigrants who came before 1961. In 1991,
the overall labour force participation rate of immigrants was 65.2%, slightly higher than in
1984 (64.7%) and only slightly lower than the Canadian-born (68.7%). However, 71% of
immigrants who came to Canada between 1981 and 1991 reported a mother tongue other
than English or French, compared with 59% of those who came before 1961.

With respect to the European experience, research on the impact of immigration on
native participants in labour markets in receiving countries seems broadly consistent with
the US and Canadian evidence, finding minimal impact on wage and employment levels,
despite higher unemployment levels in Europe and less flexible labour markets (often
reflecting the role of centralized unions and more generous social safety nets).45
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It should be noted with respect to most of the foregoing studies on the impacts of
immigration on native workers in labour markets in receiving countries that they assume
constant returns to scale. It might be argued that countries with a larger and more rapidly
growing population will be able to sustain some industries and some social infrastructure
which would not be viable at smaller population sizes. Apart from scale effects per se, dynamic
effects, such as broader diffusion of technological and other ideas, and greater possibilities
for learning by doing, may generate significant positive effects on average native incomes
from a larger popu-lation.46 These arguments are not especially convincing, particularly in a
country the size of the US, or even in the case of smaller countries, given a liberal
international economic environment where scale effects, especially in capital rather than
labour intensive industries, can often be captured by trading into foreign markets and do
not require a large local employment or consumer base.47

IMPLICATIONS FOR IMMIGRATION POLICY

Commentators concerned with the deteriorating performance of recent immigrants to
receiving countries and the diminishing domestic returns to immigration associated
therewith typically argue that immigration policy should focus more on screening for skilled
immigrants.48 This proposed policy reorientation raises a number of difficult issues. With
respect to refugee claimants, most receiving countries are signatories to the UN Convention
on Refugees, which entails commitments to admit refugees who satisfy the UN Convention
definition. While there appears to be high variability from one country to the other in how
this commitment is interpreted and applied, it nevertheless implies a limited latitude to
alter radically refugee intake policies, at least with respect to inland refugee claimants,
although a good deal more latitude with respect to admission or sponsorship of offshore
refugees. With respect to the family sponsorship category, proposals to limit entry in this
category entail either narrowing the class of eligible relatives to immediate family members;
treating this category as the residual category within overall immigration quotas after
independent immigrants have been screened for skills; or requiring family sponsors to
assume financial responsibility for sponsored relatives by for example purchasing surety
bonds against the risk of sponsored relatives becoming dependent on social welfare
programmes.49 None of these measures is likely to prove uncontentious in receiving
countries. With respect to independent immigrants who are screened for skills, two
problems arise. The first is that receiving countries do not unilaterally determine the skill set
of immigrants seeking entry. This is in significant part determined by conditions in sending
countries. Both ‘push’ and ‘pull’ factors are relevant. Sending countries that are generally
impoverished are likely to send mostly unskilled immigrants. Sending countries with high
degrees of inequality of wealth are again likely to send mostly unskilled immigrants, with
skilled residents for the most part facing few inducements to emigrate. Only skilled
workers from countries that ‘tax’ directly or indirectly the earnings and opportunities of
high performing skilled workers, where receiving countries permit higher dispersions in
returns to human capital, are likely to find it attractive to emigrate. This may be a relatively
small applicant pool. If receiving countries were to confine themselves exclusively or
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almost exclusively to this pool, this may entail substantial curtailment of total current levels
of immigration.

A second problem relates to how skilled workers are selected by receiving countries.
Even assuming a substantial skilled applicant pool, presumably not all skills are in equal
demand in receiving countries. The challenge then becomes of screening amongst various
classes of skilled prospective immigrants. The Canadian experience with the point system
that was implemented in 1967 suggests that attempts at fine-tuning screening criteria by
occupation or class of skill imply an accuracy in manpower forecasting that is mostly
unwarranted, and they have been of limited efficacy.50 Screening on some very basic
variables such as age, health, language skills, and level of education may be as far as
screening criteria can usefully go.

In response to the limitations and deficiencies of bureaucratically administered entry
policies, many economists see virtues in an auction system for quotas, assuming entry is to
be limited.51 It is argued that the immigrants who purchase these quotas will be those who
value the opportunity to emigrate most highly, principally because they are confident that
the employment or business opportunities available to them in the country of immigration
will warrant the investment in the quota, reflecting the higher value that residents place on
their potential contributions. One can also view an auction system as a means of extracting
monopsony rents from immigrants analogous to the optimal tariff in trade theory.52

However, there seem compelling reasons in principle why an auctioned quota system cannot
be assigned a central role in allocating entry positions to immigrants. Assuming that there
are good humanitarian and compassionate reasons for preserving a significant role for family
reunification policies, there would seem to be no role here for an auctioned quota system.
Equally, it is obviously untenable to screen refugees on this basis. With respect to
independent immigrants, an auction system seems both inefficient and unfair: inefficient
because given the well-known difficulties of borrowing money against future employment
income or human capital (which is the rationale for most student assistance programmes,
for example), many efficient relocation decisions may not be made; and unfair simply
because it penalizes those with few present resources, whatever the future contributions
they may make to the country of immigration. Business or investor-class immigrants may be
more amenable to an auctioned quota system. At present, Canada admits a small number of
immigrants in this category (about 2 to 3% of the annual immigration flow) by requiring as
a condition of entry the investment of several hundred thousand dollars in approved
Canadian projects, which resembles an auctioned quota system.53

The category of temporary workers warrants brief comment. Here there is a compelling
argument that foreign students in receiving countries on student visas, on successful
completion of their studies, should be entitled to apply for permanent residence status,
fairly much of right.54 This would clearly seem to be in the domestic interest of the
receiving country. Whether it is welfare enhancing from the global perspective entails the
somewhat indeterminate debates about the effect of the brain drain on developing
countries. But given that this is also entailed in a number of the other long established
immigrant categories, it is not clear why this is a particular objection to providing successful
students with the opportunity to become permanent residents. To the extent that they
receive financial assistance with their studies from their countries of origin, presumably
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these countries can demand bonds or security from the student or his or her family to
ensure reim-bursement of this assistance. With respect to other temporary workers, there
are serious difficulties in designing and administering programmes providing for legal,
unskilled, temporary immigrants. While it is true that temporary workers often contribute
positively to the dependency ratio, partly because of their age, and partly because they are
often not entitled to non-contributory forms of public assistance, the European experience
suggests that it is very difficult to send these people home if they have been temporary
workers for a number of years and they and their families have established roots in the
community. Simon suggests various financial bonding arrangements to ensure departure on
the expiration of temporary work visas,55 and Sykes sees such a programme as a strong
substitute for illegal or undocumented immigration.56 However, many temporary workers
may simply go ‘underground’ upon the expiration of their visas and become illegal or
undocumented aliens. With a transient population such as is often involved with unskilled
guest worker programmes, it is not clear how easy it would be to design and enforce the
bonding arrangements that Simon proposes. In any event, both efficiency and humanitarian
considerations seem to dictate that if a guest worker has worked productively in the country
of immigration for any significant period of time, he or she should be entitled to apply for
permanent resident status, treating his or her work experience as a substitute for other forms
of education, training, or financial assets.

One last aspect of immigration policy requires comment. In making initial eligibility
determinations (health, criminality, national security risk), inland refugee determinations,
family sponsorship entitlements, and deportation decisions, designing legal processes that,
on the one hand, accord immigrants some basic measure of due process, and, on the other
hand, avoid miring the administration of immigration policy in costly and protracted legal
processes has proved a daunting challenge for many countries, with the appropriate balance
between the two sets of considerations often the subject of on-going and unresolved
debates.

CONCLUSION

In moderating the strains currently being experienced by immigration policy in many
countries, it is crucial to identify key linkages between immigration policies and other
classes of international and domestic policies and in so doing not to impose on immigration
policies and the social and political consensus surrounding them more weight than they can
reasonably bear. In this respect, it is clear that the level of demand for resettlement would
be substantially diminished if developed countries, through appropriate forms of
international cooperation, took stronger and more effective policy stances towards human
rights violations and political or religious oppression in many countries of origin. In
addition, much more liberal trade policies towards developing country exports, the
provision of more generous foreign aid in cases of natural disasters, and more effective
developmental aid in forms, or with conditions attached, designed to address (and, if
necessary) discipline governmental incompetence and corruption that is often pervasive in
many developing and former command economies, are clearly important substitutes for
immigration. For foreign aid to be fully effective, developing and former command economies
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need to be encouraged to adopt domestic policies that promote high levels of economic
growth at home. A key element in such policies is outward-looking trade policies that assign
substantial weight to export-led growth, and concomitant reduction in reliance on trade and
currency restrictions designed to foster often inefficient import-substituting domestic
industries. Unfortunately, in this respect, reflecting a massive exercise in hypocrisy on the
part of many Western countries, the costs of protectionist policies imposed by developed
countries on developing countries exports currently exceed the entire value of foreign aid
provided to these countries.57

In short, all other things being equal, it seems clear that most refugees or displaced
persons would prefer to return to their homelands, but the policies of most developed
countries do not reflect this priority. Instead, the consequences of displacement are seen
primarily as an immigration problem, where effective policy responses are highly
circumscribed or at any event intensely controversial. It needs to be added that while
growth-oriented development policies are likely to reduce migration rates over the long
term, evidence suggests that in the shorter term, the disruptive impacts of rapid
development on traditional social and economic structures in developing countries (e.g.
rural-urban migration and saturated urban labour markets) may actually increase
international migration.58 This said, however, the insights from recent empirical work on
immigration tell us that, perhaps within some broad parameters that most developed
countries presently seem well inside, they could benefit modestly and potential immigrants
very substantially from a much higher level of immigration than most developed countries
are presently committed to. Just as with trade policy, the facts (as opposed to the
prejudices) suggest that national and cosmopolitan perspectives on immigration policy do
not diverge as sharply as is often supposed. 
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Conclusion

The future of the global trading system

INTRODUCTION

In this concluding chapter, we discuss several of the most pressing challenges facing the
world trading system. In our judgment, these challenges create a formidable, but not
unmanageable, post-Uruguay Round agenda for students and practitioners of the law and
policy of international trade. The three major challenges are: (1) managing the interface
between trade liberalization and the domestic regulatory state; (2) strengthening the legal
and institutional foundations of open markets in developing countries; and (3) addressing
the dangers that regionalism poses to the coherence and sustainability of the global trading
order.

TRADE LIBERALIZATION AND THE REGULATORY STATE:
MANAGING THE INTERFACE1

There has been a dramatic expansion over the past three decades or so of domestic
regulations pertaining to health, safety, consumer protection, the environment and labour
markets. As trade liberalization, at least with respect to border measures, has continued to
advance, these ‘within the border’ regulatory measures are increasingly seen by many liberal
trade proponents as the most prominent and arguably the most costly form of non-tariff
barriers to trade (NTBs), requiring new disciplines under international trade rules,
particularly in a globalizing economy which, it is argued, has a low tolerance for ‘system
frictions’.2 As Miles Kahler puts it: The decades-long process of lowering trade barriers
resembles the draining of a lake that reveals mountain peaks formerly concealed or (more
pessimistically) the peeling of an onion that reveals innumerable layers of barriers.’3

The relatively recent focus on these forms of domestic regulation as potential NTBs has
substantially heightened both domestic and international political conflicts as trade policy
linkages have increasingly been drawn with broad sweeps of domestic policy domains
previously largely thought to lie outside the arena of trade policy. As Vogel notes, 

Free trade advocates want to limit the use of regulations as barriers to trade, while
environmentalists and consumer advocates want to prevent trade agreements from
serving as barriers to regulation. While the trade community worries about an



upsurge of ‘eco-protectionism’—the justification of trade barriers on environmental
grounds—consumer and environmental organizations fear that trade liberalization
will weaken both their own country’s regulatory standards and those of their nation’s
trading partners.’4

Vogel well describes the implications for international trade of these two positions, at least
if taken to extremes:

If all regulations that disadvantaged importers were classified as non-tariff barriers,
then virtually all regulations could be considered protectionist. For example, the
United States could not require that all product labels be printed in English, since
this requirement clearly imposes additional costs upon foreign producers (or at least
those from non-English speaking countries). Likewise, Singapore would be forced to
rescind its ban on the sale of chewing gum, since this regulation clearly serves as a
barrier to the import of Wrigley’s products. In short, defining NTBs very broadly
would have the effect of subjecting virtually all national regulatory standards to those
of the least stringent exporting country. At the same time, it would probably
significantly expand international trade.

The consequences of defining non-tariff barriers very narrowly are equally
significant. A nation could demand that all imported products be produced according
to the same standards to which domestic producers are required to adhere. Thus the
United States could refuse to permit the imports of any cars, steel, or chemicals
produced in facilities that violated American standards for factory emissions, land-use
controls, or, for that matter, family-leave policies. If such a regulation was not
considered a non-tariff barrier, and was widely adopted, international trade would
decline significantly.5

These conflicts over NTBs have drawn new domestic political constituencies into debates
over trade policies in the form of consumer and environmental groups or other non-
governmental organizations (NGOs) who seek to resist the imposition of constraints on
domestic political sovereignty by international trade agreements.

In responding to these diverse pressures, Alan Sykes (amongst others) notes that a wide
array of remedial options is available.6 At one end of the continuum lies complete deference
to national sovereigns. At the other end of the continuum lies total harmonization. In
between the extremes lie many alternatives that impose greater or fewer constraints on
national sovereigns while still affording some opportunity for variations across nations.
Many of these alternatives involve ‘policed decentralization’, whereby national authorities
are largely free to pursue their own policy objectives but must do so subject to a set of
broadly applicable legal constraints. The options here include non-discrimination principles,
the sham principle, transparency requirements, generality requirements,
presumptive deference to negotiated international standards with specified procedures for
deviation, mutual recognition, and benefit/burden balancing tests.

As is reflected in the chapters in this book on matters such as trade related intellectual
property rights, services, environment and labour rights we often are sceptical of the case
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for domestic policy harmonization or convergence and thus for a position closer to the first
end of Sykes’ spectrum. This general orientation is influenced by at least four basic
premises. First, as Sykes also notes, the analysis of regulatory barriers to trade is
complicated by both theoretical and empirical uncertainty in many cases about their effects
on social welfare (given the wide array of values and concerns that domestic policies are
designed to serve) and in this respect stand in sharp contrast to traditional impediments to
trade, such as tariffs and quotas, which can be shown both theoretically and empirically to
be welfare-reducing in almost all cases from both a global and domestic perspective.7 Thus,
it is emphatically not the case that international harmonization of domestic policies will
always increase domestic and global welfare—indeed often, depending upon how
harmonization is induced, it will have the opposite effect.8

Second, we believe that proponents of more sweeping or extreme forms of international
harmonization in domestic policies in the interests of creating more open and competitive
international markets in goods and services severely discount the importance of what our
colleague at the University of Toronto, Albert Breton, calls in an important book
‘competitive governments’.9 In contrast to a view of government as a monolith or
monopoly, whose policies are typically viewed by Public Choice theorists as the product of
rent-seeking behaviour by special interest groups that have captured Leviathan, Breton
argues that governments in most democracies are intensely competitive in a wide variety of
dimensions: opposing parties compete for political office (competition for the market in
Demsetz’ terms),10 agencies within government compete with each other over policy
priorities and claims on resources; lower houses compete with upper houses and both
compete with constitutional courts; central governments compete with subnational levels
of government and with non-profit organizations; subnational levels of government
compete amongst each other; and national governments compete with other national
governments. In Breton’s thesis, these competitive features of government serve a crucial
demand revelation function, and yield a more benign view of public or collective provision
of goods, services or public policies than that taken by Public Choice theorists by
establishing linkages between revenue and expenditure decisions of the kind that
economists like Wicksell and Lindahl earlier in this century viewed as a precondition to
efficient public policies.11 A final premise that motivates our relatively conservative
orientation to the trade policy-based case for international harmonization is that whatever
view one takes of the European experience, the crucial shift that occurred in Europe with
the enactment of the Single European Act of 1986 from an emphasis on negative integration
(rules proscribing what domestic policy measures countries may not adopt) to positive
integration (supranational regulations and directives prescribing what domestic policies
Member States must adopt) is simply not feasible in most other institutional contexts. As we
have argued earlier in this book,12 deep economic integration amongst nation states is
typically predicated either on the existence of a hegemonic power with the ability to
impress its will on other smaller and weaker states (the US in the immediate post-war
years), or willingness amongst Member States to cede substantial aspects of their domestic
political sovereignty to supranational political institutions—a willingness that for the most
part is likely to be conditional on a reasonably egalitarian distribution of political influence
and a common interest in overarching political objectives (in the case of Europe, the mitigation
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of conflicts that had devastated the continent militarily and economically over the first half
of this century). Neither of these conditions is likely to apply in the foreseeable future
outside of the European context either with respect to other regional trading blocs or with
respect to the multilateral system at large. For example, under NAFTA, it is inconceivable
that Canada and Mexico would be prepared to cede to the US a major hegemonic role in
imposing its own domestic macro-economic and microeconomic policies on them.
Conversely, it is equally inconceivable that the US would accept the creation of
supranational political institutions with substantial legislative authority over major aspects
of macro- and micro-economic policies in the three countries, on the basis of a relatively
egalitarian sharing of political influence in these institutions. These impediments to deep
economic integration are likely to be compounded several times over at the multilateral
level. Thus, it is not surprising, as we have suggested elsewhere,13 that despite a dazzling
range of harmonization-related norms and initiatives contained in the FTA and especially in
the NAFTA, in areas as diverse as competition policy, environment and trucking regulation
very little harmonizing activity has in fact resulted.

This suggests to us that in these other institutional contexts the focus of attention on
domestic policies that may constitute non-tariff barriers to trade should relate principally to
two objectives: first, elaborating on the principles of negative integration that have
historically characterized the approach of the GATT to these issues, i.e. the application of
the National Treatment principle in Article III of the GATT to domestic policy measures of
Member States (requiring that products of foreign countries receive no less favourable
treatment than that accorded to like products of national origin), and elaborating the
criteria presently contained in Article XX of the GATT that justify exceptions to this basic
obligation of non-dis-crimination and the constraints thereon, in particular constraints on
disguised or unjustified forms of discrimination (the sham principle and the least trade-
restric-tive means or proportionality principle); and second, to structure the ground rules
pursuant to which mutually beneficial agreements between Member States can be reached
over policy harmonization or convergence that are both non-coercive and non-
discriminatory vis-à-vis other trading partners (i.e. respect the Most Favoured Nation
principle). In short, we would be in much less haste than other commentators14 to abandon
well-established principles of non-discrimination in international trade law as the primary
analytical concept for addressing the consequences for international trade of domestic
regulatory diversity.

Having said this, we do not want to be understood as being opposed to consensual forms
of harmonization where mutual benefits are to be derived from policy convergence by
reducing these costs of divergence.15 However, it is worthwhile emphasizing the ways in
which these specialized harmonization processes preserve, unlike trade law prescriptions for
uniformity, significant elements of desirable regulatory competition. First of all, where such
processes are driven not by trade diplomacy but by experts and affected interests, they can
engender a lively competition among different national regulators as to which country or
countries’ regulatory approach will become the model for international standards or
regulatory norms. While government or industry representatives may well argue for the
adoption of a given approach for strategic reasons such as that their own national producers
gain an advantage from their products or services already conforming to that standard, the
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net effect is to increase scrutiny and debate as well as information about national regulatory
approaches. Second, the fact that regulatory norms or standards have had to be accepted in
a multilateral process, implicating coalitions of interests from a wide range of countries,
may act as a counterweight to the tendency of many purely domestic regulations to reflect
the interests of narrow concentrated constituencies, or rent seeking and rent provision by
government. Third, competition may exist between international voluntary standards bodies
and intergovernmental organizations for predominance in international standard and norm-
setting. For example, ISO, a non-governmental organization, may end up competing with
the ILO in terms of the setting of certain international norms in areas of worker protection,
such as occupational health and safety. Fourth, effective regulatory competition implies the
possibility of informed evaluation of different approaches to regulation; inasmuch as
multilateral processes increase such knowledge, by requiring transparency with respect to
regulation, or through the establishment of general principles concerning regulatory
inputs,16 such as that regulation must be based upon the analysis of certain kinds of
factors,17 they may lead to more real regulatory competition at both the domestic and
international level. Moreover, a consensual approach to regulatory harmonization can have
significant room for regulatory competition, by focusing primarily on regulatory ends,
leaving scope for diversity in regulatory means. As John Braithwaite argues, in evoking a
concept of regulatory cooperation consistent with efficient regulatory competition,
‘Consumers need to be provided with the resources to watch out for their collective
interests and call regulators to account when they are captured by producer interests.'18

Fifth, voluntary international approaches may facilitate a genuinely competitive consumer
market in standards—consumers can decide whether to buy products, manufactured goods
or services with the ISO label, or in the case of environmental protection, whether they are
willing to pay more or go out of their way to find tuna labelled as dolphin-friendly. The ILO
is now considering the potential for labelling in the labour rights context.19 And in this last
case, the ILO will find itself competing with various NGOs who have sought to negotiate
codes of conduct on labour practices directly with multinational corporations, resulting in
labelling based upon a purely non-governmental process. Finally, an aspect of many of these
processes or institutions is technical assistance or support for the improvement of regulatory
capacity, particularly in developing countries, including the training of regulatory decision-
makers and the dissemination of appropriate scientific knowledge and techniques as well as
best regulatory practices. This, if anything, generates more not less regulatory competition,
because it promises to put more countries in the game, so to speak. This is not an
unimportant point—a significant amount of regulatory diversity, including the kind of
diversity that leads to trade complaints, may in fact be generated by inadequate or corrupt
legal and regulatory infrastructures in poorer countries. Dealing with these kinds of
shortcomings directly has the advantage, unlike the use of the trade ‘club’, of potentially
increasing, and at a minimum, not reducing regulatory competition.

Much regulatory harmonization is likely to occur as a result of private initiatives either at
the firm or industry level. Firms have private incentives in many contexts to minimize
product incompatibilities if they wish to maximize access to export markets. Private or
public—private standardizing organizations, national and international, can often promote
standards that avoid pointless incompatibilities. However, in some cases, incompatibilities
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are an unavoidable, indeed desirable, byproduct of product innovation and differentiation.
In other cases, both firms and national governments may face incentives to promote
strategic standard-setting, e.g. technical interfaces in network industries, in order to realize
first-mover advantages and possibly monopoly profits, in which cases international
standardizing bodies are likely to encounter difficulties in achieving a voluntary consensus
on appropriate standards.20

However, even inter-governmental harmonization efforts, outside the context of the
EU, must necessarily be consensual in nature. Evidence from the early history of the EU and
elsewhere suggests that such state-to-state negotiations will often be slow and limited, at
least where they occur between countries with roughly symmetric bargaining power.
Negotiations pursuant to the new General Agreement on Trade in Services (GATS) will
provide a further important test of the scope and limits of multilateral negotiations over NTBs
and the extent to which the Most-Favoured Nation Principle will be respected in these
negotiations.21 More generally, the relationship between harmonization initiatives
undertaken within regional trading blocs and the multilateral system creates additional
tensions in that arrangements concluded within the former are almost necessarily
discriminatory vis-à-vis non-Member States. Nevertheless, it is important to recall that it was
the concept of reciprocity—carrots, not sticks—that facilitated tariff reductions (the GATT’s
greatest achievement) by changing the domestic political dynamics surrounding trade
protectionism and more closely aligning them with the economics of trade liberalization by
enlisting a new political constituency in favour of trade liberalization (exporters).22 Tariff
reductions were not achieved, by and large, by legal fiat or by threats of unilateral trade
sanctions but by providing acceptable quid pro quos for other countries’ tariff concessions. In
the NTB context, countries may well be prepared to make similar concessions to reduce the
costs to them of policy divergences, increase competition and innovation in their domestic
markets and increase access to foreign markets, even if these gains require some
compromise of legitimate policy objectives previously served by the policy measures being
modified. Within the EU this bargaining has been facilitated through EU supranational
institutions and the adoption of qualified majority rules that mitigate the strategic hold-out
problem while still respecting reasonable equality of influence of Member States. Outside
the EU, in the absence of supranational institutions with paramount legislative authority, a
more purely consensual approach is likely to dominate, although to the extent that greater
reliance is placed on standards generated by international standard setting bodies like ISO
and the Codex Commission the decision-making processes of these institutions, which often
do not involve direct government-to-government negotiations, will attract greater scrutiny
in terms of the relative influence of various stake-holders, public transparency and
democratic legitimacy.

Where negotiations over alleged NTBs occur between countries with asymmetric
bargaining power, as arguably exemplified by the Strategic Impediments Initiative between
the US and Japan, they carry the serious risk of gross overreaching into the domestic policy
affairs of one country by another (e.g. domestic savings rates, public investment policy, land
costs), and moreover are likely to result in managed trade arrangements that are antithetical
to a non-discriminatory multilateral trading system. Out of frustration with the prospects of
achieving extensive harmonization, some commentators (principally so-called American
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revisionists) argue for ‘black boxing’ domestic systems by relying on managed trade (results-
ori-ented or ‘crowbar’ based trade policy) to achieve more balanced economic relations,
even at the risk of some international disintegration.23 However, this both flatly denies
fundamental elements of the theory of comparative advantage and often constitutes a gross
interference in the domestic affairs of countries who are parties to such arrangements,
whose governments are required to orchestrate domestic economic activities in
extraordinary detail in order to meet these targets, while at the same time typically
discriminating against other Member States (as exemplified by the Semi-Conductor
Agreement between Japan and the US). On the other hand, liberal traders who find
themselves unattracted by the concept of managed trade and who feel frustrated at the
likely pace of international policy harmonization and who propose instead that a central role
be assigned to a relatively unqualified principle of Mutual Recognition24 (at least where not
complemented by negotiated harmonization of minimum standards) fail to acknowledge
that such a principle would confer major forms of extraterritorial jurisdiction on countries
of origin in exporting goods or services (and their policies with them to other countries
which may well have legitimate reasons for maintaining distinctive policies of their own,
provided that they meet basic principles of non-discrimination.25

Thus, at the end of the day we believe that trade regimes and institutions should largely
confine themselves to a more fully elaborated principle of nondiscrimination with well-
defined exceptions thereto—that is, a concept of negative rather than positive integration.26

The principle of effective equality of opportunity (not outcome) lies at the heart of the
National Treatment principle, and exceptions to it should require a demonstration that
policy measures that have a substantial disparate impact on foreign trade (a) genuinely serve
some legitimate (non-trade related) domestic policy objective and are not merely a
disguised form of discrimination (the sham principle) and (b) are not an unjustified means
of attaining those objectives (the least trade restrictive or proportionality principle). Thus,
the policy objective should be genuine and the means of attaining it proportionate. These
principles have the additional virtue of enjoying wide familiarity in many domestic
constitutional contexts and in EU constitutional law with respect to the protection of
human and other constitutional rights from state encroachment.

In designing institutional processes in an international context in which these concepts
can be rendered justiciable and operational, more attention needs to be given than hitherto
to relative burdens of proof. As a tentative proposition, we would argue that a complainant
should bear the burden of proving that a domestic policy measure of another country has a
disparate and substantial impact on international trade. If this can be proven, it seems to us
that the burden of proof should then shift to the respondent country to demonstrate that
notwithstanding this, the policy measure both genuinely engages a legitimate policy
objective—the sham principle (and here we would contemplate a much longer list of
legitimate policy objectives than is presently embodied in Article XX, reflecting in part, for
example, the legitimate policy objectives for domestic subsidies formerly contained in
Article 11 of the Tokyo Round Subsidies Code)—and that the discriminatory trade effects of
the policy instrument are closely related to vindicating the objectives in question—here,
some combination of juridical techniques such as proportionality and least-restrictive means
tests may be appropriate. This is much along the lines of the approach of the Appellate Body
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to Article XX in the Reformulated Gasoline case (discussed in Chapter 15 on trade and the
environment) in applying the requirements of the chapeau of Article XX that measures
justified under the Article not constitute ‘arbitrary’ or ‘unjustified’ ‘discrimination’ and not
be a ‘disguised restriction on international trade’.

However, as to what constitutes adequate discharge of the burden of proof on these
latter issues, there is an important consequential issue of the standard of judicial or panel
review to be applied. This has been a bitterly contentious issue in a somewhat analogous
context with respect to FTA and NAFTA binational panel reviews of ITA and ITC
determinations in the US in antidumping and countervailing duty cases.27 One view
(reflecting a ‘correctness’ standard) would require that the respondent country bear the
burden of adducing substantial evidence on the record that the challenged policy is
necessary for the attainment of a legitimate policy objective and that no less trade restrictive
means is available to achieve this purpose (arguably a difficult negative to prove). An
alternative view (reflecting a ‘patently unreasonable’ standard) would be substantially more
deferential to the country whose domestic policies are under challenge and would simply
require that the evidence adduced be sufficient to suggest that the policy choice is not
patently unreasonable or a grossly disproportionate adaptation of means to ends, or put
otherwise is a plausible means of attempting to achieve the legitimate policy objective in
question,’ even if the reviewing body could itself imagine superior instruments. We favour
something close to the latter approach (perhaps a ‘clearly unreasonable’ standard) because it
seems to us more respectful of domestic political sovereignty and policy autonomy than the
former view which invites supranational panels to second-guess the domestic policy choices
of democratically elected, accountable, and competitive governments by applying a strict de
novo cost-benefit analysis of their own. Moreover, by substantially limiting the ability of one
country to challenge the domestic policy choices of another in quasi-judicial fora, the
‘threat point’ of the former in political negotiations over possible policy convergence is
sharply reduced, thus also reducing the risk of coerced forms of harmonization reflecting
asymmetric bargaining power, or worse, coerced forms of discriminatory managed trade
arrangements.

In adopting approaches that rely upon negative Commerce Clause type jurisprudence in
the United States, or European Court jurisprudence, trade panels must remember a key
difference between the WTO and these regimes—the latter provide institutional
mechanisms for positive harmonization which can be availed of where negative integration
through judicial or quasi-judicial enforcement proves inadequate, or does undue damage to
non-trade policy objectives. There are no equivalent political or regulatory institutions
available to provide a safety valve within the WTO. This may suggest, on the basis of
institutional considerations, a greater degree of deference to domestic policy outcomes. For
example, regulatory options less restrictive of trade that may be available to developed
countries with sophisticated regulatory systems, may not be currently available to
developing countries, who rely heavily on border controls or inspections. In designing a
regulatory measure, a country may need to attract the support of a variety of diverse
constituencies—what if the less restrictive alternative measure is unable to command such a
consensus in a particular political or cultural context? Or consider the case where there is a
divergence of technical or scientific opinion, with some experts believing a less-restrictive
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measure is possible while others question its feasibility in practice. The attitude of trade
panels to these problems so far is not encouraging, a prime example being the Thai Cigarette
ruling,28 where the panel relied entirely on its own axiomatic reasoning that alternatives
less restrictive than banning imported cigarettes would be available to achieve the health
objectives of the Thai government, without considering the various constraints, including
institutional and fiscal, on implementation of the less restrictive alternatives, such as
regulation of advertising and marketing.

Finally, the issue of the use of trade sanctions to promote non-trade goals such as
environmental protection and respect for core labour rights have often been mis-stated in
terms of the issue of harmonization of domestic policies, including by GATT and WTO
panels in cases such as the recent Turtles case. These are instances, where, however, the
existence of important externalities (environment) or the salience of widely-recognized
international human rights norms, raise quite specific arguments about justified constraints
on the domestic policy autonomy of states. At the same time, these arguments—if made
with precision—do not amount to a case for eliminating regulatory diversity as such, but
rather for observance of some kind of minimum standards that relate to the transnational
dimension of the issue.

These considerations also suggest that, to the extent to which harmonization is justified
or inevitable, it is crucial to address the consequences for democracy of domestic policy
outcomes being significantly determined, or pre-empted, by transnational processes. As
Anne-Marie Slaughter argues, the strength of transnational policy networks and institutions

as a world order ideal will ultimately depend on their accountability to the world’s
peoples. To many, the prospect of transnational government by judges and
bureaucrats looks more like technocracy than democracy. Critics content that
government institutions engaged in policy coordination with their foreign
counterparts will be barely visible, still less accountable to voters still largely tied to
national territory.29

World democracy is, of course, a practical impossibility, and the effort to create a
transnational representative democracy in Europe, through the European Parliament, has
generally not been viewed as successful in dealing with the democratic deficit even within
Europe.

We believe a different approach is necessary, which reflects the increasing recognition of
the role of global civil society—non-governmental organizations and associations of various
kinds and even transnational networks of interested individuals linked by the Internet and
email—in mediating between the supranational level and domestic and local polities.30 As
Kingsbury suggests:

The system of rule-making and dispute settlement by narrowly-based state
representatives—who may have more in common with each other than with many of
the societal interests they ‘represent’ is increasingly controversial…. The insufficient
involvement of interest groups, civic organizations, legislatures, and other elements
outside the executive branch—the ‘democratic deficit’—has been a difficult problem
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for most international organizations…. Much of the WTO dispute-settlement
process remains closed to non-state involvement and secretive n hearings and
documentation—… In extreme cases, these and other problems of representation
and accountability in rule-making and dispute settlement may lead in the long run to
the marginalization of international institutions.31

This approach would emphasize much greater avenues for participation of such stakeholders
in international regulatory processes, as well as international trade dispute settlement where
it relates to domestic and global non-trade policy outcomes. This entails an attitudinal
change in organizations that have traditionally identified populism with protectionism, and
have been steeped in traditions of cloak and dagger diplomacy where anything other than a
press release was typically given a restricted security classification. Some of the measures
that are required include:

1 extensive derestriction of classified documents, so that stakeholders can follow directly
supranational policy processes that affect their interests;

2 to the extent practicable, NGO participation in meetings and conferences of
international regulatory organizations and regimes, and the WTO; 

3 the right for NGOs to participate in dispute settlement at the WTO through
intervention briefs;

4 availability on the Internet of important documents and proposals that relate to
transnational regulation and trade policies and laws that affect domestic regulation.
Some progress has already been made on certain of these fronts. At the WTO, under
pressure from the United States, a decision has been taken to unrestrict substantial
numbers of documents, many of which are now instantly accessible on the Internet.
Other organizations such as the World Intellectual Property Organization have
developed extensive web sites, with detailed accounts of their meetings and
conferences. The NAFTA environmental side-agreement institutions are an excellent
example of extensive NGO participation in the study and investigation of North
American environmental problems. As with the side-agreement on Labour as well,
NGOs can actually petition at least for a study or report behaviour they believe
violates these agreements. Secrecy surrounding the negotiations was a major element
in the widespread opposition by grassroots groups to the Multilateral Agreement on
Investment, negotiated at the OEGD. Having learnt from this lesson (although perhaps
a little too late), the OECD is now placing on its web site the current negotiating draft
of the MAI, as well as background papers that explain the underlying reasoning and
positions on which many aspects of the draft Agreement are based. This being said, in
many respects the WTO remains one of the most closed organizations to meaningful
NGO involvement, despite some experiments with greater participation in the Trade
and Environment Committee. For instance, the recent Turtles panel summarily refused
even to examine NGO submissions on the environmental measures at issue, despite no
textual basis in WTO dispute settlement rules and procedures for this rejection.
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An aspect of the debate about harmonization, which—like the issue of sanctions for non-
trade purposes—is not really about the relationship between harmonization and the overall
welfare effects of trade, is that of the role of reciprocity and balanced concessions in trading
relations. Many ‘fair trade’ advocates are perfectly prepared to accept domestic regulatory
diversity, provided that it does not create undue asymmetries in the extent to which
different countries can benefit from liberal trading rules. This is a concern about dividing
the pie globally, not the size of the pie.

Reciprocity and the gains from trade

In its broadest sense, the principle of reciprocity has pervaded both multilateral and
regional efforts at trade liberalization in the post-war period, even though—as we have
discussed at various points in this book—it is at odds with the logic of the economic theory
of the gains from trade, which suggests the rationality of unilateral liberalization, i.e. the
removal of trade barriers even in the absence of reciprocal concessions by trading partners.
Nevertheless, reciprocity is in a certain sense rational, for it may be entirely rational to
insist on being paid for doing something that it is in one’s own interests to do anyhow.

However, the reciprocity demanded by ‘fair traders’ amounts to requiring concessions
that have in fact never been negotiated for. There is nothing wrong with the USA demanding
negotiations on, say, Japanese competition policies—what is wrong is to require these
concessions on the threat of reneging on existing concessions for which the Japanese have
already ‘paid’.

Once trade agreements are conceptualized as mutually advantageous exchanges, then it is
inevitable that issues of fairness or morality of exchange enter the picture. In fact, contract
theorists have long struggled with the difficulties presented by situations where, due to
changes in circumstances, one of the parties to a long-term contract or bargain no longer
benefits from it. In such cases, should modifications in the terms in the initial bargain be
enforceable, even where the modification has been exacted by one party’s implicit or
explicit threat to renege on the initial bargain if the revised terms are not accepted? Making
such modifications enforceable where no additional advantage or payment accrues to the
Party made worse off by the change in terms may well imply acceptance of the legitimacy in
some circumstances of exacting more advantageous contractual terms through exercising
commercial pressure on the other Party or Parties to a bargain.32 The fact is, however, that
the United States, by any meaningful measure, has benefited enormously from liberalized
trade, even if it no longer enjoys the predominance that it did in global markets at the
outset of the GATT era.33

Diffuse reciprocity

For this reason, the more sophisticated reciprocity-based ‘fair trade’ claims focus on how
the gains from liberalized trade are shared or divided, rather than on the argument that the
liberal multilateral trade order has actually become a Pareto-inferior bargain, at least from
the perspective of some countries. This variant in the argument is concerned with relative
gains from, or equality in, exchange. Proponents of the realist school of international
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relations theory identify the concern with relative gains as at its core a concern about power
—each state is not only concerned with whether a change in its relationship with other
states will increase its domestic welfare, but also about the effects of this change on its
relative power vis-à-vis other states. This leads to a fundamental disagreement between
realists and neo-liberals or liberal internationalists. Neo-liberals believe that Pareto-superior
bargains or agreements between states can be struck and sustained in the long run provided
transaction costs can be managed and appropriate institutions and rules put into place to
constrain cheating (the latter exercise may require, at the outset, a hegemon with strong
interests in the creation of such institutions and rules).34 Realists are sceptical of the
capacity of states either to create or sustain international agreements or rules for
international cooperation, because they believe that states will never voluntarily agree to,
or at least continue to adhere to, rules that result in their relative power in the international
system being weakened, even if in domestic welfare terms, they benefit from the
agreements or rules in question.35 If the realist interpretation of the concern with relative
gains is correct, then the increasing sense that the United States faces a relative loss of
power from open rules of trade bodes ill indeed for the sustainability of a liberal trading order
in the long run. The realist view, in fact, strikes at the very heart of liberal political
economy, for it suggests that enlightened economic self-interest remains secondary in
international economic relations to the primordial struggle for relative power among nations.

An alternative interpretation, however, is possible of the concern about relative gains
from exchange. This alternative interpretation is based in a normative theory of fairness or
equality in exchange, rather than a power-based understanding of state behaviour. On this
view, the long-term legitimacy and indeed sustainability of an exchange depends upon the
maintenance of a fair distribution of benefits and burdens among the Parties. Pareto-
superiority, on this view, is a necessary but not sufficient criterion for the fairness of an
exchange or bargain.36 Unlike pre-liberal ‘just price’ theorists, contemporary advocates of
equality in exchange tend to emphasize the importance of balance and the avoidance of one-
sidedness in contractual obligations, rather than the imposition of a requirement of strict
equivalence in values exchanged (which would constitute a paternalistic destruction of the
freedom of contract ideal). Unlike the power-based perspective of the realists, this
perspective suggests that long-term bargains between countries can be sustained much like
long-term contracts between individuals, provided that the agreements themselves contain
the flexibility required to prevent one-sidedness or imbalance as circumstances change, or
alternatively as long as there is a set of general or meta-norms that permit Parties to insist
on occasional readjustment of the initial bargain in order to correct emerging imbalances or
inequities in rights and responsibilities.

It is important to note that the post-war economic order, of which the GATT is an
integral part, contained a mechanism for precisely such rebalancing. The mechanism in
question was the Bretton Woods system of exchange rates and payments, characterized by
fixed exchange rates backed by gold. If a country’s exports substantially exceeded its
imports, eventually demand for its currency would exceed its gold reserves. Its currency
would then need to be revalued in order to reflect this scarcity. The revaluation would
increase imports and reduce exports, thereby correcting the trade imbalance. Similarly,
where a country was unable to cover the foreign currency needed to pay for imports with
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foreign currency it received for its exports, it would have to sell gold to make up the
difference. Where its gold reserves began to run out, the country would have to devalue its
currency (to increase exports and reduce imports) and maintain its liquidity and
convertibility obligations under the IMF Articles. The Bretton Woods system also entailed
both explicit and implicit responsibilities of countries to adopt or alter domestic policies so
as to avoid payments problems and thereby obviate the need for frequent changes in
exchange rates, which would undermine a system of fixed rates by creating constant
speculation on markets as to when revaluations and devaluations would occur. In a previous
chapter we have described the breakdown of the Bretton Woods system of exchange rates
and payments and the largely unsuccessful effort to attempt rebalancing under floating rates
through macroeconomic policy coordination among the major economic powers.

Under the rebalancing through the exchange rates and payment systems envisaged by
Bretton Woods, a supranational authority, the IMF, was to bear the primary responsibility
for determining which countries’ domestic policies required what adjustments in order to
preserve exchange rate stability and to clear trade and payments imbalances—on the basis,
of course, of the Keynesian policy science of macroeconomics. But under contemporary
circumstances, there is no supranational authority with the normative legitimacy to decide
which, for example, American and/or Japanese policies should change in order to achieve
rebalancing through trade. Unlike the realists, we believe that rebalancing can, in theory, be
accommodated within long-term bargains and actually serve the goal of sustaining those
bargains as circumstances change over time. But there is an important concern that the
existing institutions and normative framework of the GATT—built on the assumption that
rebalancing would occur through another part of the system—are not adequate to the task
of adjudicating or arbitrating claims for rebalancing, and particularly of distinguishing
legitimate claims from unjustified cheating, or strategic games of ‘up the ante’. A sustained
dissensus about what is cheating and what is not could pose a significant long-run threat to
the sustainability of the liberal trading system, at least on a neo-liberal or liberal
internationalist perspective that views the sustainability of a cooperative equilibrium as
dependent on effective means of identifying and sanctioning defection. However, in the
short run, the most effective avenue for addressing diffuse reciprocity concerns may be
through increasing the range of issues subject to future multilateral negotiations. The
Uruguay Round itself is an example of this approach, with the addition of services,
investment, and intellectual property rights reflecting, in part, a concession to the American
concern about rebalancing of benefits and burdens within the liberal multilateral trading
order.

Specific reciprocity

The diffuse reciprocity concerns described above usually do not stand on their own but go hand
in hand with concerns about reciprocity within specific sectors or with respect to particular
products. While the Bretton Woods system as originally conceived seemed to encompass a
concept of rebalancing that corresponds to concerns about diffuse reciprocity, it certainly
did not contemplate any mechanism for balancing or rebalancing trade within specific
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sectors or in specific products. Indeed, this would seem tantamount to attempting to
suppress comparative advantage itself.

The counterargument from fair traders is that domestic policies in certain highly
competitive sectors, like microelectronics, can fundamentally distort comparative advantage
or rig the competitive game. Where both global and domestic market share are crucial to
survival, if I can arrange my domestic policies (e.g. competition rules, technical standards)
in such a way that your producers have little access to my domestic market, while my
producers have largely unimpeded access to yours, I may be able to force you out of
business. Free trade advocates are likely to reply that most of the domestic policies in
question are not intended to rig the game, but are general ‘background’ policies that should
be considered as a normal part of comparative advantage, rather than a distortion of it.
Nevertheless, at the limit, some range of domestic policies may be correctly characterized
as targeted efforts at capturing market share from foreign competitors—subsidies in the
case of civil aircraft are a case in point. As well, while some policies may constitute an
integral part of a country’s underlying social and economic arrangements, and thus are
unlikely to be adaptable to meet fair trade concerns, others may indeed be alterable, at least
with respect to their application to specific sectors.

While the demand for sectoral reciprocity, or reciprocal market access in particular
sectors, runs the risk of generating a thicket of discriminatory managed trade arrangements
in the absence of complete harmonization of domestic policies (a highly unrealistic
possibility), in one sense the demand for sectoral reciprocity is more manageable than that
for diffuse reciprocity. Because one is dealing with a limited number of domestic policies of
a few countries that are major players in specific sectors it is possible to engage in some kind
of focused dialogue about the effects of domestic policies on trade reciprocity. Concerns of
diffuse reciprocity are more difficult to handle, absent a supranational authority or judge,
simply because the value judgments are so open-ended. The Japanese argue that the US
budget deficit and debt is the problem, driving up interest rates and the value of the US
dollar. Some fair traders will reply that the size of the US debt and deficit are partially
attributable to America’s global defence responsibilities, from which Japan has actually
benefited substantially.

In the case of specific reciprocity, a range of trade-offs concerning domestic policy
constraints may be possible by applying certain normative criteria or tests to a limited
number of policies. For example, Bhagwati has suggested that principles of proportionality,
intentionality, selectivity and proximity can be invoked to evaluate claims that particular
domestic policies distort trade unfairly within a specific sector. The proportionality
principle would eliminate from scrutiny domestic policies determined to have a minimal
impact on trade. The intentionality principle would limit offensive domestic policies to
those intended to rig the game. The selectivity principle would limit scrutiny of domestic
policies to those targeted to the specific sectors in question. Finally, the proximity principle
would limit fair trade claims to those domestic policies that directly affect comparative
advantage.37 Bhagwati himself characterizes these principles as ‘pragmatic’ in the sense that
the distinctions they draw between distortive and non-distortive domestic policies have no
real basis in the theory of liberal trade. Applied by domestic trade authorities and tribunals
with respect to an indeterminate range of foreigners’ policies in the context of unilateral
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trade actions driven by protectionist demands, these kinds of principles would prove highly
manipulable (consider the fate of the injury and specificity tests with respect to
countervailing duty actions under domestic US trade law). By contrast, they might function
quite well as lignes directrices for a structured multilateral negotiation on trade-impacting
domestic policies within certain sectors. 

These kinds of principles, as well, are not without some normative foundation even
within the pre-Uruguay Round GATT. First of all, the jurisprudence of the GATT suggests
a willingness to submit to scrutiny domestic policies that may have discriminatory or
harmful impacts on trade even where on their face the domestic policies in question do not
single out imported products for discriminatory treatment. GATT panels as well as FTA
panels interpreting the GATT have been prepared to consider the possibility that facially
neutral policies mask a discriminatory protectionist intent, or even to take an effects-based
approach to key GATT provisions such as Articles III and XI,38 subjecting to GATT scrutiny
some measures that while not forming barriers to trade in products or discriminatory
domestic policies, nevertheless appear to have a particularly harmful impact on trade and
whose domestic benefits seem disproportionately small relative to the harm they do to the
interests of trading partners. Along similar lines, the WTO Technical Barriers Agreement
places Contracting Parties under a general obligation to minimize the negative trade effects
of distinctive national standards or regulatory requirements with respect to trade in goods,
and to adopt internationally recognized standards or norms wherever available and not
prejudicial to domestic interests. Finally, supported by some GATT jurisprudence, there is
plausibility to the view that, on its terms, Article XXIII of the General Agreement includes
a right to relief from ‘nullification and impairment’ of GATT concessions, even where the
actions leading to nullification and impairment do not involve a formal violation of GATT
rules.

There thus seems to be some (albeit rather general) normative basis for multilateral
sectoral bargaining on trade-impacting domestic policies. This, combined with sound
empirical work on the trade impacts of domestic policies, the domestic goals and functions
of the policies, and possible alternative policies with fewer negative trade impacts, may
allow for sectoral agreements that are widely viewed as legitimate rather than simply as a
capitulation to unilateralism. Such agreements are certainly vastly superior to achieving
specific reciprocity through discriminatory managed trade arrangements, such as bilateral
VERs, the Auto Pact, the Multi-Fibre Arrangement (MFA), and the US-Japan Semi-
Conductor Agreement. In this sense, the demand that trade-impacting domestic policies be
put on the bargaining table may be inherently less threatening to the normative order of the
GATT than traditional managed trade arrangements, which the GATT has been rather
ineffective in preventing in the past (witness the tremendous expansion of managed trade in
textiles from the 1960s to the 1970s and of VERs in steel and autos during the late 1970s
and 1980s39), as long as claims of unfairness can be defined, evaluated and constrained
within an appropriate normative and institutional framework.

In our view, it would be appropriate to encourage sectoral bargaining with respect to
domestic policies in sensitive industries under the auspices of the WTO, along the lines
(broadly speaking) of the Civil Aircraft Code, and to establish certain rules for such
bargaining. These might involve an obligation to include in negotiations all countries
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involved in global competition in the sector; a prohibition on explicit agreements with
respect to quotas and market shares (i.e. an anti-cartelization rule); a requirement that all
market access commitments in the form of adjustment of domestic policies as they apply to
foreign producers be offered to all countries party to the agreement (conditional MFN); a
general proviso that the agreements not be more restrictive of trade than existing rules; and
an obligation to consider interests of non-signatories (both consumer interests and those of
potential entrants to the market).

STRENGTHENING THE LEGAL AND INSTITUTIONAL
FOUNDATIONS OF OPEN MARKETS40

The Asian crisis of 1997–8, in both its economic and political dimensions, offers a dramatic
illustration that durable outward-oriented development strategies depend on more than free
trade or the right economic formulas for domestic policy. The crisis, and other events in Russia
and elsewhere, should teach economic liberals, and especially free traders, that the values
they endorse also depend on political liberalism, including the rule of law and democracy.
Particularly with the collapse of communism, as well as the fashionability (now tarnished)
of the thesis of an authoritarian Asian alternative to Western political liberalism (compatible
with and indeed supportive of free markets), some economists saw a rapid route to
economic liberalization that did not pass through the messy process of indigenously-driven
political, social and legal development. In fact, although this simplistic approach has led to
criticisms of the ‘ideology’ of free trade as such, it must be remembered that the classical
political economists, from Smith through Ricardo and Hume to J.S. Mill, regarded the
political, legal and indeed moral conditions for liberal trade as of singular intellectual
interest, as well as cardinal policy importance. We must seek to recover something of the
broad-ness of their vision. In the contemporary language this often expresses itself as a call
for a focus on governance. According to Leila Frischtak, governance has become the key
variable in explaining the adjustment performance of developing countries during the 1980s
and early 1990s.41 Governance is defined expansively by the World Bank in its 1992 Report
on Governance and Development as ‘the manner in which power is exercised in the management
of a country’s economic and social resources for development’.42 After surveying more than
100 years of comparative development experience in 40 LDCs, Reynolds concludes that
‘the single most important explanatory variable is political organization and the
administrative competence of government’.43 According to Arturo Talavera, a distinguished
Chilean political philosopher, ‘Good institutions are the best capital that a society can have,
and they are precisely what most poor countries lack.’44 An important empirical study by
Barro of around 100 countries from 1960–90 finds that for a starting level of real per capita
GDP, the economic growth rate is enhanced by higher school and life expectancy, lower
fertility, lower government consumption, better maintenance of the rule of law and
improvements in the terms of trade.45

As Naim points out: 

Discovering the market and abandoning over-reliance on the state has done wonders
for Latin America. But the discovery of the market will soon force Latin American
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countries to re-discover the state…the process of dismantling the state and limiting
its scope of intervention is still far from finished. At the same time, however, the
more difficult task of creating or rehabilitating indispensable public sector
institutions lags far behind the requiremcnts of a new economic strategy. Bringing
the state back in ways that support and reinforce recent progress—without restoring
the state’s previously displayed penchant for inflicting economic, social and moral
havoc—will be the central challenge facing governments throughout the region.46

Robert Putnam’s celebrated study of civic traditions in modern Italy demonstrates that civic
organizations play an important role in ensuring the accountability of public sector
organizations and often appear to promote economic growth.47 According to Naim, Latin
America’s real public sector wages fell 30 percent between 1980 and 1989, more than
triple the drop experienced in the private sector. Peruvian teachers lost 75 percent of their
real wages between 1980 and 1989 causing trained instructors to flee the field for less hard
hit sectors. As a result, the proportion of uncertified teachers doubled to 50 percent by
1990.48 Reorienting the public sector so that it employs far fewer people in aggregate,
reducing employment in activities where the state has no comparative advantage, perhaps
increasing employment in sectors (such as education, agricultural extension, and health care)
where it has a comparative advantage, and much more generously compensating those that
it does employ are widely identified by development analysts as crucial priorities. Sectors
such as education, health, and agricultural support services, are particularly relevant to the
alleviation of poverty and to rural development. These sectors have typically attracted
fewer, less well qualified and less well remunerated personnel than high specificity, highly
competitive sectors (e.g. engineering functions), where employee performance can be
more readily measured and where both employees and recipients of the services may have
readier alternatives.

While decentralization of personnel and other functions to departments or agencies
within one level of government or more fundamentally to lower levels of government may
make sense in principle, given the scarcity of managerial capacity in most developing countries
there are also serious risks that, at least in the short run, more delegation and
decentralization may in fact impair the quality and integrity of public sector management.
According to the World Bank’s Report on Governance and Development, micro-level
accountability has become more important as the role of the state has expanded and made it
impossible to apply broad accountability norms to all the myriad actions of modern
government. However, the effectiveness of local voice will often turn on the existence of
intermediate organizations that provide a means of mobilizing local constituents or clients
and many authoritarian regimes have been hostile to encouraging the emergence of such
intermediate organizations because of a fear that they may become countervailing political
centres of power or threats to the incumbent regime.49 Even where these mobilization
problems can be overcome, there is then a risk that agencies will become captive to
parochial interests and lose sight of a broader set of public interests. Intermediate
organizations are not necessarily conducive to economic development if they reinforce
sectional, ethnic or religious differences or reflect narrow special interests. More broadly
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based civic organizations or other organizations with substantial overlapping memberships
may be more conducive to broader perspectives on economic development.

As with the relationship between bureaucracy and development, the relationship
between legal systems and development has been less extensively analyzed and empirically
studied than the relationship between democracy and development. However, Barro in his
recent empirical study finds that better maintenance of the rule of law significantly
influences growth rates.50 In the Bank’s Governance and Development study, serious
deficiencies are reported to afflict the legal systems in many developing countries, all of
which in one respect or another increase transaction and information costs and levels of risk
and uncertainty. These deficiencies afflict the law-making process, the public administration
and enforcement of laws, and the judicial interpretation and enforcement of laws. First, laws
and regulations that are enacted or promulgated are often not published—indeed in a number
of countries the World Bank notes that public gazetting of laws was running several years
behind their enactment—and in any event often were not widely accessible or intelligible to
the general public. Second, laws and regulations are often unstable, and changed or replaced
frequently, engendering high levels of uncertainty for private economic agents
contemplating long-term investment decisions in part in reliance on the stability of these
laws. Third, even when new laws or regulations are enacted or promulgated, often they are
not followed and applied by other agencies or levels of government—a particularly acute
problem in a number of the former communist countries in Eastern and Central Europe.
More generally, the application and enforcement of the laws is often highly inconsistent or
non-existent, i.e. they are only laws on the books—often state-of-the-art laws—but they
have little or no effect on actual behaviour. Fourth, laws or regulatory regimes are often
adopted without any serious attention given to alternative and more efficient ways of
achieving the policy objective in question (through a fuller canvassing of alternative
governing instruments). Many new laws and regulations are adopted with minimal public or
political debate or scrutiny so that information and feedback loops on possible policy errors
are highly attenuated, exacerbating problems of non-transparency in the legislative process.
Fifth, inadequate attention is typically devoted to designing public administration systems
that will ensure that the laws are competently and efficiently administered.51 Deficiencies in
a country’s legal capital are likely to become even more of a constraint on development
with greater reliance on the private sector and markets as a major driving force in economic
development.

The paramount institutional challenge with respect to bureaucratic and legal reform seems
to require much more imaginative thinking on the relationship between institutional
autonomy and accountability. It is simply neither possible nor desirable to completely
‘neuter’ politics by taking all important public functions out of the political domain—
otherwise the case for democratic political regimes would be at an end and the case for
authoritarianism substantially strengthened. Thus, at the limit, in the case of incorrigibly
predatory rather than developmental states, it is difficult to be optimistic about the
prospects of significantly enhancing the institutional performance of the bureaucracy and
legal system. However, short of these limiting cases, striking a new balance between
institutional autonomy and accountability represents a major new policy challenge. In
particular, devising accountability mechanisms (to whom? for what?) that do not run
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directly to the political regime, and either stop there or run on weakly and in a diffused way
to an often ill-informed and unorganized general public, but rather entail wider
participation in more open decision-making processes by intermediate organizations or
communities of interest to which these public sector agencies or institutions are accountable
on a meritocratic basis for their performance, or in some cases supra-majority bipartisan
legislative approval of key public sector appointments, seems to be a productive area of
further research calling for much more imagination than the existing literature reflects. To
emphasize institutional insulation and autonomy exclusively is unlikely to be an appropriate
long-term prescription, because without some set of effective mechanisms for
accountability, most of these institutions in the long run are likely to degenerate into
autocratic fiefdoms in their own right. This seems a worthy and realistic long-term
aspiration.

MULTILATERALISM VERSUS REGIONALISM

As discussed earlier in this book,52 the rise of regional trading blocs poses a special challenge
to the multilateral system. The principle of non-discrimination that lies at the heart of the
multilateral system is potentially put at serious risk by regional trading blocs which, by
definition, extend more favourable trading rules to members than non-members. The
principle of non-discrimination enshrined in the GATT (in the form of the Most Favoured
Nation and National Treatment principles) has important economic and political rationales.
From an economic perspective, regional trading blocs always entail some degree of trade
diversion as well as trade expansion and thus carry the potential for distorting global trade
and reducing global economic welfare. From a political perspective, the principle of non-
discrimination is designed to discourage countries from playing favourites with other
countries, and inducing the kind of mutually self-destructive forms of factionalism that led
to the collapse of the open trading system in the inter-war years.

We believe that both the economic and political rationales for the principle of non-
discrimination seen as central to the GATT by its founders remain of paramount
importance. In order to preserve these values, consideration should be given to tightening
the conditions under which free trade areas or customs unions can be authorized under the
GATT. More specifically, several key conditions contained in Article XXIV need to be
interpreted and applied more stringently than they often have been in the past. First, the
requirement that when a free trade or customs union is formed, substantially all trade
between or among Member countries must be liberalized should be interpreted to mean
exactly what it says, so as to exclude various kinds of bilateral, sectoral, managed trade
arrangements. While sectoral agreements with reciprocal market access commitments may
be liberalizing (e.g. the chapter on financial services in the NAFTA), these agreements also
have considerable potential to reinforce restrictive managed trade arrangements, whether
directly through measures such as quotas or indirectly, for example, through complex re-
adjustment of the rules of origin for particular products or sectors. In sensitive sectors such
as textiles, autos and agriculture, the NAFTA seems to take on the character of a managed
trade arrangement rather than a free trade arrangement.
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Second, the requirement that external duties imposed by Member countries of free trade
areas or customs unions should not be higher on average than those prevailing before the
formation of such an arrangement should be amended to require that such external duties
imposed following the formation of regional trading arrangements should not exceed the
lowest external duties imposed by any Member country prior to the formation of the
arrangement, thus minimizing the amount of trade diversion likely to be induced. Such a
requirement would also reduce the need for complex rules of origin.

To ensure that trade diversion is minimized, it is not sufficient to scrutinize only the
external duties imposed following the establishment of regional arrangements. Rules of origin
and rules with respect to the extent to which partially or wholly for-eign-owned or
controlled firms operating within the free trade area can benefit from liberalization
commitments on investment or services also have a considerable impact on the extent to
which regional arrangements are trade diverting. In the case of rules of origin, the trade
diverting effects may be quite dramatic. The rules determine, with respect to each product
grouping, what percentage of value of the finished product must have been added within the
free trade area in order to qual-ify for preferential or duty-free admission into other
countries within the area. They can easily be fine-tuned so as to affect significantly the
market share of nonMembers of the free trade area for certain products. To take a
hypothetical example, suppose that prior to the existence of a free trade area, producers of
wid-gets in country A have been using an input manufactured in Japan that constitutes 40%
of the value of the finished product. If the rule of origin is now set at over 60%, in order to
be able to export duty-free the finished product within the free trade area, the producer
will have to substitute for the Japanese input one produced within the area. Therefore,
assuming that the price advantage of the Japanese input is less than the advantage in terms of
lower duties that comes from meeting the rules of origin by selecting an input manufactured
within the free trade area, Japanese producers will lose market share. In sum, there is a
clear need for scrutiny of the effects of a range of rules in regional arrangements on the
trade of nonMembers.

Mutual Recognition Agreements with respect to product and service standards, such as
the MRA recently concluded between the United States and the European Union, raise
important trade diversion issues when they are negotiated on a regional or plurilateral basis;
the consistency of such agreements with MFN obligations should be closely scrutinized at
the WTO.53 The recent promulgation by WTO of guidelines for MRAs with respect to
accountancy (mentioned in Chapter 11 on trade in services) suggests a salutary awareness of
the stake that the multilateral trading system has in ensuring that these arrangements do not
create closed trading blocks, discriminating against non-Members.

Third, there is also much to be said for the view that in order for regional trading
arrangements to be authorized under the GATT an additional condition should be satisfied—
that membership of such an arrangement is open to any country prepared to accept the
obligations to which existing Members have committed themselves. That is to say, these
arrangements should be required to be open to application by new Members, through an
obligatory accession provision, along the lines of the accession provisions in the GATT
(Article XXXIII), and building on the accession provisions contained in NAFTA (Article
2205). Even where (because of particular characteristics of the country concerned or its

502 THE FUTURE OF THE GLOBAL TRADING SYSTEM



stage of social and economic development) a country may not be prepared automatically to
accept all the obligations of the existing arrangement, there should be a duty at least to
enter into negotiations in good faith with a view to admission on terms and conditions that
are mutually acceptable. As well, in specific areas such as services, investment and
intellectual property rights, Members of a regional arrangement should be encouraged to
extend the rights provided by the arrangement to non-Members who are prepared to accept
regional obligations in these areas even if they are not Members of the region itself, or if for
other reasons it would be inappropriate for them to become full Members of the regional
arrangement. Here, a precedent exists with respect to the agreements that existed between
the EFTA countries and the European Union prior to their decision to join the EU. While
both WTO and NAFTA accession provisions contemplate a process of negotiation and
approval by existing Members, where a country seeking membership of a regional trading
arrangement is able to demonstrate a willingness to accept all the obligations that existing
Members are subject to, some right of review by a WTO Working Group or Committee of
a negative decision by Members would seem to be an important check on arbitrary or
discriminatory exclusions. While the findings and recommendations of such a Working
Group might not realistically bind existing Members, they would improve the transparency
and legitimacy of the decision-making process, and provide applicants for membership in
regional trading arrangements with additional political leverage.

Quite apart from the potential for increasing the tendency towards managed trade and
discrimination, a proliferation of regional arrangements and regional dispute settlement
processes for trade disagreements poses a threat to clarity and certainty in trade rules.
Overlap between WTO and regional obligations, the latter often stated in similar but not
identical terms to those in the WTO, can create confusion with respect to the appropriate
interpretation of both sets of rules. Furthermore, free trade areas (as opposed to customs
unions, where matters are simplified by a common external policy) increase the regulatory
knowledge and burden that trading partners require to engage in effective commercial
relations—they must still take account of the trade policies of each individual country and
the WTO rules, while also being aware of the meaning and implications of the regional
rules as well, and the evolving jurisprudence surrounding those rules. In the pre-Uruguay
Round environment, the problem was less pronounced because regional arrangements built
on the GATT, and created rules in areas such as intellectual property, services and
investment, where the GATT had few or none. However, there are now both WTO and
overlapping regional rules in all these areas. Cowhey and Aronson, who are favourably
disposed towards regional arrangements, nevertheless see a need eventually to
‘multilateralize’ these arrange-ments.54 In our view, multilateralization would ideally
implicate a Working Group of the WTO in the task of harmonizing regional and multilateral
rules to the extent possible, as well as addressing on an ad hoc basis conflicts that occur with
respect to the interaction of regional and multilateral rules, or important divergences in the
jurisprudential approaches of different dispute settlement fora.

In sum, in order to minimize the potential threat that regional trading blocs pose to the
multilateral system, we consider that some significant rethinking and reworking of the
conditions for approval of such arrangements under Article XXIV of the GATT should be an
important priority on the future international trade policy agenda. 
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